PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO L.S.D.
REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS (RFP'S) FOR COMPUTERS, LAPTOPS, SERVERS,
MICROSOFT LICENSING AND FINANCIAL SOLUTION # 18-19-070
RFP OPENING: JULY 1, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

Bid Request Number # 18-19-070 Addendum 1 Organization PSJA ISD Ebids
Title Request for Proposals (RFP'S) for Computers, Laptops, Servers, Bid Creator Emily Garza
Microsoft Licensing & Financial Solution Email emily.garza@psjaisd.us
Description Phone
Bid Type RFP Fax
Issue Date 6/3/2019 09:42:46 AM (CT)
Close Date 7/1/2019 02:30:00 PM (CT)
Awarded Suppliers
[Name [City [State [Classifications Lines Awarded Award Total Award Reason
CDW Government LLC Vernon Hills IL 7 $183,765.00
Dell Marketing, L.P. Round Rock TX 4 $28,728.48
Reyna Enterprises Inc  McAllen X 15 $3,732,410.00
Recommendation: That the Board of Education award the Request for Proposals (RFP's) for Computers, Laptops, Servers, Microsoft Licensing and Financial

Solution # 18-19-070 to the lowest proposer as indicated below:
ITEM: PROPOSERS: TOTALS:

1,2,3,8,9,10,11, 12, Reyna Enterpises Inc. (CRC) $3,732,410.00
13, 23, 24 and 25

4,5,6,7,14,15and 16 CDW Government LLC $183,765.00
17, 18,19 and 20 Dell Marketing, L.P. $28,728.48
TOTAL: $3,944,903.48

Emily Garza, Director of Purchasing

Charge Budgeted Account Numbers:  Various budgeted account numbers district wide

One hundred eighty one (181) invitations were emailed to vendors
Thirteen (13) Vendors viewed Bid Specifications

Four (4) Submitted Bid

Three (3) Unsubmitted Bid

Nineteen (19) No Bid
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.

REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS (RFP'S) FOR COMPUTERS, LAPTOPS, SERVERS,
MICROSOFT LICENSING AND FINANCIAL SOLUTION # 18-19-070

RFP OPENING: JULY 1, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

Line Qty UOM Description Award Award Awarded Supplier Award Reason
Response Qty

1 1 EA Student All-In-One Computer, HP ProOne 600 G4 21.5 inch FHD $732.00 1 Reyna Enterprises Inc  Reyna Enterprises Inc. met all specifications as identified in the
Non-Touch All-in-One Business PC RFP with no deviations and had the highest score on the RFP

rubric.

2 1 EA Staff/Secondary All-In-One Computer, HP ProOne 600 G4 21.5 inch $789.00 1 Reyna Enterprises Inc  Reyna Enterprises Inc. met all specifications as identified in the
FHD Non-Touch All-in-One Business PC RFP with no deviations and had the highest score on the RFP

rubric.

3 1 EA 72 Mini System for High-End Applications, HP ProOne 600 G4 21.5 $1,479.00 1 Reyna Enterprises Inc  Reyna Enterprises Inc. met all specifications as identified in the
inch FHD Non-Touch All-in-One Business PC RFP with no deviations and had the highest score on the RFP

rubric.

4 1 EA Stream Pro 11 G5, HP IDS UMA Celeron N4000 4GB 64GB eMMC $261.10 1 CDW Government LLC Low Bid
11 G5 Base NB PC

5 1 EA ProBook x360 11 G1 DD, HP IDS UMA Celeron N3350 4GB 64GB $335.10 1 CDW Government LLC Low Bid
eMMC x360 11 G1 Base NB PC

6 1 EA Chromebook x360 11 G2 EE, HP IDS UMA Celeron N4100 8GB $326.90 1 CDW Government LLC Low Bid
64GB eMMC x360 11 G2 Base NB PC

7 1 EA Chromebook 11 G7, HP IDS UMA Celeron N4000 4GB 32GB eMMC $269.90 1 CDW Government LLC Low Bid
11 G7 Base NB PC

8 1 EA Probook 450 15", HP IDS UMA i7-8565U 450 G6 Base NB PC $795.00 1 Reyna Enterprises Inc  Reyna Enterprises Inc. met all product and service specifications
as specified in the RFP with no deviations and received the
highest score on the RFP rubric for this category.

9 1 EA  Probook 840R NON-Touch 14", HP IDS UMA i5-8250U 840r G4 $849.00 1 Reyna Enterprises Inc  Reyna Enterprises Inc. met all product and service specifications

BNBPC as specified in the RFP with no deviations and received the
highest score on the RFP rubric for this category.

10 1 EA  Probook 840R Touch 14", HP IDS UMA i5-8250U 840r G4 BNBPC $899.00 1 Reyna Enterprises Inc  Reyna Enterprises Inc. met all product and service specifications
as specified in the RFP with no deviations and received the
highest score on the RFP rubric for this category.

1 1 EA HP Elite x2 1012 G2, HP Elite x2 1012 G2 - 12.3" - Core i5 7200U $1,572.00 1 Reyna Enterprises Inc  Reyna Enterprises Inc. met all product and service specifications
as specified in the RFP with no deviations and received the
highest score on the RFP rubric for this category.

12 1 EA HP Elite x360 1030 G2, HP EliteBook x360 1030 G2 - 13.3" $1,156.00 1 Reyna Enterprises Inc  Reyna Enterprises Inc. met all product and service specifications
as specified in the RFP with no deviations and received the
highest score on the RFP rubric for this category.

13 1 EA HP Display 27" Monitor $209.00 1 Reyna Enterprises Inc  Reyna Enterprises Inc. met all specifications as identified in the
RFP with no deviations and had the highest score on the RFP
rubric.

14 1 EA Intellegent Charging and Storage Cart for Winbooks $689.00 1 CDW Government LLC Low Bid

15 1 EA Intellegent Charging and Storage Cart for Chromebooks $689.00 1 CDW Government LLC Low Bid

16 1 EA Intellegent Charging and Storage Cart for Chromebooks $181,194.00 1 CDW Government LLC CDW Government LLC was the only vendor that responded to
the correct specifications.

17 1 EA Campus Server, DL380 Gen10 2u $4,045.21 1 Dell Marketing, L.P. Low Bid

18 1 EA Campus Server, DL380 Gen10 2u $5,900.66 1 Dell Marketing, L.P. Low Bid

19 1 EA High-End Server, DL580 Gen10 4u $12,941.55 1 Dell Marketing, L.P. Low Bid

20 1 EA Video Recording Server, DL380 GEN10 LFF SVR $5,841.06 1 Dell Marketing, L.P. Low Bid

23 1 EA 3 Year Purchase - Item #1 - Student All-In-One Computer - HP $1,647,000.00 1 Reyna Enterprises Inc  Reyna Enterprises Inc. met all specifications as identified in the
ProOne 600 G4 21.5 inch FHD Non-Touch All-in-One Business PC RFP with no deviations and had the highest score on the RFP

rubric.
23.1 750 EA Year One (1) - Student All-In-One Computer - HP ProOne 600 G4 $732.00 750 Reyna Enterprisesinc Reyna Enterprises Inc. met all specifications as identified in the
21.5 inch FHD Non-Touch All-in-One Business PC RFP with no deviations and had the highest score on the RFP
rubric.
23.2 750 EA Year Two (2) - Student All-In-One Computer - HP ProOne 600 G4 $732.00 750 Reyna EnterprisesInc Reyna Enterprises Inc. met all specifications as identified in the
21.5 inch FHD Non-Touch All-in-One Business PC RFP with no deviations and had the highest score on the RFP
23.3 750 EA Year Three (3) - Student All-In-One Computer - HP ProOne 600 G4 $732.00 750 Reyna Enterprisesinc Reyna Enterprises Inc. met all specifications as identified in the
21.5 inch FHD Non-Touch All-in-One Business PC RFP with no deviations and had the highest score on the RFP
rubric.

24 1 EA 3 Year Purchase - Item #2 - Staff/Secondary All-In-One Computer - = $1,633,230.00 1 Reyna Enterprises Inc  Reyna Enterprises Inc. met all specifications as identified in the
HP ProOne 600 G4 21.5 inch FHD Non-Touch All-in-One Business RFP with no deviations and had the highest score on the RFP
PC rubric.

24.1 690 EA Year One (1) - Staff/Secondary All-In-One Computer - HP ProOne $789.00 690 Reyna EnterprisesInc Reyna Enterprises Inc. met all specifications as identified in the
600 G4 21.5 inch FHD Non-Touch All-in-One Business PC RFP with no deviations and had the highest score on the RFP
rubric.
24.2 690 EA Year Two (2) - Staff/Secondary All-In-One Computer - HP ProOne $789.00 690 Reyna Enterprises Inc  Reyna Enterprises Inc. met all specifications as identified in the
600 G4 21.5 inch FHD Non-Touch All-in-One Business PC RFP with no deviations and had the highest score on the RFP
rubric.
243 690 EA Year Three (3) - Staff/Secondary All-In-One Computer - HP ProOne $789.00 690 Reyna EnterprisesInc Reyna Enterprises Inc. met all specifications as identified in the
600 G4 21.5 inch FHD Non-Touch All-in-One Business PC RFP with no deviations and had the highest score on the RFP
rubric.

25 300 EA One Year Guaranteed Purchase - Item # 3 - CTE Computer Lab - 72 $1,479.00 300 ReynaEnterprisesInc Reyna Enterprises Inc. met all specifications as identified in the
Mini System for High-End Applications - HP ProOne 600 G4 21.5 RFP with no deviations and had the highest score on the RFP
inch FHD Non-Touch All-in-One Business PC rubric.
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO |.S.D.
REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS (RFP'S) FOR COMPUTERS, LAPTOPS, SERVERS,
MICROSOFT LICENSING AND FINANCIAL SOLUTION # 18-19-070

RFP OPENING: JULY 1, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

1 Student All-In-One Computer, HP ProOne 600 G4 21.5 inch FHD Non-Touch All-in-One Business PC

Supplier

CDW Government LLC

Virtucom, Inc.
Dell Marketing, L.P.

QTY UOM Estimated Price
AWARDED Reyna Enterprises Inc (CRC (Con 1

1

1
1

EA
EA

EA
EA

$732.00
$745.60

$765.00
$790.00

Extended  Supplier Notes

$732.00

$745.60 **Bidding Lenovo ThinkCentre M820z All-in-One, specs match exact request and product is a direct equivalent
of the requested HP product**

$765.00

5790.00 Dell's proposed solution is the Optiplex 5270 All In One. Dell has included a product specification sheet as well
as the detailed quote with our submission.

2 |Staff/Secondary All-In-One Computer, HP ProOne 600 G4 21.5 inch FHD Non-Touch All-in-One Business PC

Supplier
CDW Government LLC

AWARDED Reyna Enterprises Inc (CRC (Con1

Virtucom, Inc.
Dell Marketing, L.P.

QTY UOM Estimated Price

1 EA $780.60
EA $789.00

1 EA $831.00

1 EA $841.00

Extended  Supplier Notes

$780.60 **Bidding Lenovo ThinkCentre M820z All-in-One, specs match exact request and product is a direct equivalent
of the requested HP product**

$789.00

$831.00
5841.00 Dell's proposed solution is the Optiplex 5270 All In One. Dell has included a product specification sheet as well
as the detailed quote with our submission.

3 Z2 Mini System for High-End Applications, HP ProOne 600 G4 21.5 inch FHD Non-Touch All-in-One Business PC

Supplier
CDW Government LLC

Dell Marketing, L.P.

QTY UOM Estimated Price
1 EA $1,275.60
1 EA $1,454.00

AWARDED Reyna Enterprises Inc (CRC (Con 1

Virtucom, Inc.

1

EA
EA

$1,479.00
$1,559.00

Extended  Supplier Notes
$1,275.60 **Bidding Lenovo ThinkStation P330 Tiny, specs match exact request and product is a direct equivalent of the

requested HP product**

$1 454.00 Dell's proposed solution is the Precision 3431. Attached is our professional P2719H 27” monitor, Logitech
. .

C930e HD webcam, and small form factor all in one stand. Dell's second monitor proposed for this solution will
be the P2418HZM, which is a 24” monitor with built in HD camera and speakers. Dell has included a product
specification sheet as well as the detailed quote with our submission.

$1,479.00
$11559~00 Camera is integrated into Monitor - EliteDisplay 27”

4 Stream Pro 11 G5, HP IDS UMA Celeron N4000 4GB 64GB eMMC 11 G5 Base NB PC

Supplier
AWARDED CDW Government LLC

Reyna Enterprises Inc (CRC (Com 1

Virtucom, Inc.
Dell Marketing, L.P.

QTY UOM Estimated Price

1 EA $261.10
EA $279.00

1 EA $287.00

1 EA $294.00

Extended  Supplier Notes

$261.10 **Bidding Lenovo 100e, specs match exact request and product is a direct equivalent of the requested HP
product**Lenovo 100e - $1743 Year Onsite Warranty - $30.60Absolute Data & Device Security Professional
for Education 3 Years - $38.00

$279.00

$287.00

$294.00 Dell's proposed solution is the Latitude 3190. Dell has included a product specification sheet as well as the
detailed quote with our submission.

5 ProBook x360 11 G1 DD, HP IDS UMA Celeron N3350 4GB 64GB eMMC x360 11 G1 Base NB PC

Supplier
AWARDED CDW Government LLC

Dell Marketing, L.P.

Reyna Enterprises Inc (CRC (Con 1

Virtucom, Inc.

QTY UOM Estimated Price

1 EA $335.10

1 EA $360.00
EA $379.00

1 EA $385.00

Extended  Supplier Notes

$335.10 **Bidding Lenovo 300e, specs match exact request and product is a direct equivalent of the requested HP
product**Lenovo 300e - $2483 Year Onsite Warranty - $30.60Absolute Data & Device Security Professional
for Education 3 Years - $38.00

5360.00 Dell's proposed solution is the Latitude 3190 2 in 1. Dell has included a product specification sheet as well as
the detailed quote with our submission.

$379.00
$385.00

6 Chromebook x360 11 G2 EE , HP IDS UMA Celeron N4100 8GB 64GB eMMC x360 11 G2 Base NB PC

Supplier
AWARDED CDW Government LLC

Reyna Enterprises Inc (CRC (Com 1

Dell Marketing, L.P.
Virtucom, Inc.

QTY UOM Estimated Price

1 EA $326.90
EA $399.00

1 EA $429.00

1 EA $451.00

Extended  Supplier Notes

$326.90 **Bidding Lenovo 300e Chromebook, specs are listed below. The product is a dire
$399.00
$429.00 Dell's proposed solution is the Chromebook 3100 2 in 1.The Chromebook 3100 2 in
$451.00

7 Chromebook 11 G7, HP IDS UMA Celeron N4000 4GB 32GB eMMC 11 G7 Base NB PC

Supplier

AWARDED CDW Government LLC

Virtucom, Inc.
Dell Marketing, L.P.

QTY UOM Estimated Price
Reyna Enterprises Inc (CRC (Con 1

1

EA
EA

EA
EA

$269.00
$269.90

$294.00
$332.00

Extended  Supplier Notes

$269.00

$269.90 **Bidding Lenovo 100e Chromebook, specs match exact request aside from having a MediaTek processor and
product is a direct equivalent of the requested HP product**Lenovo 100e Chromebook - $167.00Google
Chrome Management Console - $22.903 Year Onsite Warranty - $30.60Absolute Data & Device Security
Professional for Education 3 Years - $38.00

$294.00

$332.00 Dell's proposed solution is the Chromebook 3100. Dell has included a product specification sheet as well as the
detailed quote with our submission.
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO |.S.D.
REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS (RFP'S) FOR COMPUTERS, LAPTOPS, SERVERS,
MICROSOFT LICENSING AND FINANCIAL SOLUTION # 18-19-070
RFP OPENING: JULY 1, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

8 Probook 450 15", HP IDS UMA i7-8565U 450 G6 Base NB PC
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended  Supplier Notes
AWARDED Reyna Enterprises Inc (CRC (Con1 EA $795.00 $795.00
Virtucom, Inc. 1 EA $798.00 $798.00
CDW Government LLC 1 EA $813.50 $813.50 **Bidding Lenovo ThinkPad E590, specs match exact request and product is a direct equivalent of the
requested HP product**Lenovo ThinkPad E590 - $784.00Absolute Data & Device Security Professional for
Education 3 Years - $38.00Lenovo Casual Toploader T210 Notebook Case (GX40Q17231) - $10.99
Dell Marketing, L.P. 1 EA $834.00 $834.00 Dell's proposed solution is the Latitude 3500 and is offered in Dark Gray. The carrying case offered is the Dell
Pro Sleeve 15. Dell has included a product specification sheet as well as the detailed quote with our
submission.
9 Probook 840R NON-Touch 14", HP IDS UMA i5-8250U 840r G4 BNBPC
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended  Supplier Notes
CDW Government LLC 1 EA $765'50 $765.50 **Bidding Lenovo ThinkPad L490, specs match exact request and product is a direct equivalent of the
requested HP product**Lenovo ThinkPad L490 - $699Absolute Data & Device Security Professional for
Education 3 Years - $38.00Lenovo Casual Toploader T210 Notebook Case (GX40Q17231) - $10.99
Dell Marketing, L.P. 1 EA $766.01 $766.01 Dell's proposed solution is the Latitude 5400. The carrying case offered is the Dell Pro Sleeve 14. Dell has
included a product specification sheet as well as the detailed quote with our submission.
AWARDED Reyna Enterprises Inc (CRC (Con1 EA $849.00 $849.00
Virtucom, Inc. 1 EA $856.00 $856.00
10 Probook 840R Touch 14", HP IDS UMA i5-8250U 840r G4 BNBPC
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended  Supplier Notes
Dell Marketing, L.P. 1 EA $865'01 $865.01 Dell's proposed solution is the Latitude 5400 touch screen. The carrying case offered is the Dell Pro Sleeve 14.
Dell has included a product specification sheet as well as the detailed quote with our submission.
CDW Government LLC 1 EA $878.50 $878.50 **Bidding Lenovo ThinkPad L390 Yoga, specs match exact request aside from being a flip design notebook and
product is a direct equivalent of the requested HP product**Lenovo ThinkPad L390 Yoga - $900Absolute Data
& Device Security Professional for Education 3 Years - $38.00Lenovo Casual Toploader T210 Notebook Case
(GXx40Q17231) - $10.99
AWARDED Reyna Enterprises Inc (CRC (Con1 EA $899.00 $899.00
Virtucom, Inc. 1 EA $919.00 $919.00
11 HP Elite x2 1012 G2, HP Elite x2 1012 G2 - 12.3" - Core i5 7200U
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended  Supplier Notes
Dell Marketing, L.P. 1 EA $11405-00 $11405~00 Dell's proposed solution is the Latitude 7200 2 in 1. For the detachable keyboard and active pen we have
proposed Dell Latitude 7200 2 in 1 Keyboard, and Dell Active Pen - PN557W. Dell has included a product
specification sheet as well as the detailed quote with our submission.
Virtucom, Inc. 1 EA $1,540'00 $11540~00 Attribute # 3: Intel Core™ i7-8550U processor with Intel UHD graphics 620 (1.8 GHz base frequency, up to 4 GHz
with Intel Turbo Boost Technology, 8 MB cacheAttribute # 9: Intel 8265 ac 2x2 nvP +BT 4.2 MOW 2
AntennaProposed Model-HP Elite x2 1013 13.3
AWARDED Reyna Enterprises Inc (CRC (Con1 EA $1,572.00 $1,572.00
CDW Government LLC 1 EA $1,593'50 $1,593.50 **Bidding Lenovo X1 Tablet, specs match exact and product is a direct equivalent of the requested HP
product**
12 HP Elite x360 1030 G2, HP EliteBook x360 1030 G2 - 13.3"
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended  Supplier Notes
CDW Government LLC 1 EA No Bid
Dell Marketing, L.P. 1 EA 5875.00 5875.00 Dell's proposed solution is the Latitude 5300 2 in 1. Dell has included a product specification sheet as well as
the detailed quote with our submission.
AWARDED Reyna Enterprises Inc (CRC (Con1 EA $1,156.00 $1,156.00
Virtucom, Inc. 1 EA $1,177'00 $1,177~00 Attribute # 3: Intel Core™ i5-8250U with Intel UHD Graphics 620 (1.6 GHz base frequency, up to 3.4 GHz with
Intel Turbo Boost, 6MB Cache, 4 cores)Attribute # 5: 256GB PCle NVMe Value SSDAttribute # 9: Intel 8265 ac
2x2 nvP +BT 4.2 WW 2 AntennaHP Elite x360 1040 G3- 14”- 256GB SSD
13  |HP Display 27" Monitor
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended  Supplier Notes
CDW Government LLC 1 EA $135'00 5135.00 Acer V276HL - LED monitor - Full HD (1080p) - 27” *UM.HV6AA.CO5)
Virtucom, Inc. 1 EA $152.00 $152.00 HP VH27 Monitor
Dell Marketing, L.P. 1 EA $160.00 $160.00 Dell's proposed solution is the P2719H 27” monitor. Dell has included a product specification sheet as well as
the detailed quote with our submission.
AWARDED Reyna Enterprises Inc (CRC (Con1  EA $209.00 $209.00 E273M 27" (webcam and speakers) § 269.00
14 |Intellegent Charging and Storage Cart for Winbooks
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended  Supplier Notes
AWARDED CDW Government LLC 1 EA $689.00 $689.00 Anywhere Cart Lite - Secure Charging Cart - 30 Units (AC-LITE)
Dell Marketing, L.P. 1 EA $1,136.00 $1,136.00 Dell's proposed solution is the Dell Mobile Computing Cart Unmanaged CMPCT36. Dell has included a product
specification sheet as well as the detailed quote with our submission.
Reyna Enterprises Inc (CRC (Corr 1 EA $1,379.00 $1,379.00
Virtucom, Inc. 1 EA $2,774.00 $2,774.00 HP Managed Charging Cart
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO |.S.D.
REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS (RFP'S) FOR COMPUTERS, LAPTOPS, SERVERS,
MICROSOFT LICENSING AND FINANCIAL SOLUTION # 18-19-070

RFP OPENING: JULY 1, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

15 |Intellegent Charging and Storage Cart for Chromebooks
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended  Supplier Notes
AWARDED CDW Government LLC 1 EA $689.00 $689.00 Anywhere Cart Lite - Secure Charging Cart - 30 Units (AC-LITE)
Dell Marketing, L.P. 1 EA $l,136.00 $1,136.00 Dell's proposed solution is the Dell Mobile Computing Cart Unmanaged CMPCT36. Dell has included a product
specification sheet as well as the detailed quote with our submission.
Virtucom, Inc. 1 EA 511335.00 51,335_00 HP Essential Charging Cart for Chromebooks
Reyna Enterprises Inc (CRC (Corr 1 EA $1,379.00 $1,379.00
16 |Intellegent Charging and Storage Cart for Chromebooks
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended  Supplier Notes
Dell Marketing, L.P. 1 EA $11135.00 $1,136.00 Dell's proposed solution is the Dell Mobile Computing Cart Unmanaged CMPCT36. Dell has included a product
specification sheet as well as the detailed quote with our submission.
Virtucom, Inc. 1 EA $1,335'00 $1,335.00 HP Essential Charging Cart for Chromebooks
Reyna Enterprises Inc (CRC (Cor 1 EA $1,379.00 $1,379.00
AWARDED CDW Government LLC 1 EA 5181,194.00 $181,194.00 Microsoft 365 A3 - subscription license - 3300 users (AAA-73004-12MO) - $52.18 / Per User Microsoft Azure
Active Directory Premium - subscription license - 1500 Users (3R3-00001-12MO) - $6.00 / Per User
17 Campus Server, DL380 Gen10 2u
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended  Supplier Notes
Virtucom, Inc. 1 EA No Bid
CDW Government LLC 1 EA No Bid
AWARDED pel| Marketing, L.P. 1 EA $4'045_21 $4’045'21 Dell's proposed solution, the PowerEdge 740, include dual 1100 W Power Supply with Power Cord. Dell has
included a product specification sheet as well as the detailed quote with our submission.
Reyna Enterprises Inc (CRC (Corr 1 EA $6,500.00 $6,500.00
18 Campus Server, DL380 Gen10 2u
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended  Supplier Notes
Virtucom, Inc. 1 EA No Bid
CDW Government LLC 1 EA No Bid
AWARDED pel| Marketing, L.P. 1 EA $5,900.66 $5,900.66 Dell's proposed solution, the PowerEdge 740, includes dual 1100 W Power Supply with Power Cord. The 740
also includes a Broadcom 57412 Dual Port 10GbE SFP+ & 5720 Dual Port 1GbE Base-T Network Daughter
Card. Dell has included a product specification sheet as well as the detailed quote with our submission.
Reyna Enterprises Inc (CRC (Corr 1 EA $10,925.00 $10,925.00
19 High-End Server, DL580 Gen10 4u
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended  Supplier Notes
Virtucom, Inc. 1 EA No Bid
CDW Government LLC 1 EA No Bid
AWARDED pel| Marketing, L.P. 1 EA $12'941_55 $12,941'55 Dell's proposed solution, the PowerEdge 940, includes dual 1100 W Power Supply with Power Cord. The 940
also includes a Broadcom 57412 Dual Port 10GbE SFP+ & 5720 Dual Port 1GbE Base-T Network Daughter
Card. Dell has included a product specification sheet as well as the detailed quote with our submission.
Reyna Enterprises Inc (CRC (Con 1 EA $20,500'00 SZO,SO0.00 Included 2 Mezzanine Board Kit Needed for 4 processor configuration
20 |Video Recording Server, DL380 GEN10 LFF SVR
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended  Supplier Notes
Virtucom, Inc. 1 EA No Bid
CDW Government LLC 1 EA No Bid
AWARDED pel| Marketing, L.P. 1 EA $5,841.06 $5,841.06 Dell's proposed solution, the PowerEdge 740, includes dual 1100 W Power Supply with Power Cord. The 740
also includes a Broadcom 57412 Dual Port 10GbE SFP+ & 5720 Dual Port 1GbE Base-T Network Daughter
Card. The 740 includes 8TB 7.2K RPM NLSAS 12Gbps 4Kn 3.5in Hot-Plug Hard Drive, quantity 4. Dell has
included a product specification sheet as well as the detailed quote with our submission.
Reyna Enterprises Inc (CRC (Corr 1 EA $12,900.00 $12,900.00
23 |3 Year Purchase - Item #1 - Student All-In-One Computer - HP ProOne 600 G4 21.5 inch FHD Non-Touch All-in-One Business PC
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended  Supplier Notes
AWARDED Reyna Enterprises Inc (CRC (Con1 EA $1,647,000.00 $1,647,000.00
CDW Government LLC 1 EA $1,677,600.00 $1,677,600.00
Virtucom, Inc. 1 EA $1,761,750.00 $1,761,750.00
Dell Marketing, L.P. 1 EA $1,777,500.00 $1,777,500.00
23.1 (Year One (1) - Student All-In-One Computer - HP ProOne 600 G4 21.5 inch FHD Non-Touch All-in-One Business PC
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended  Supplier Notes
AWARDED Reyna Enterprises Inc (CRC (Con750 EA $732.00 $549,000.00
CDW Government LLC 750 EA $745.60 $559,200.00
Virtucom, Inc. 750 EA $783.00 $587,250.00
Dell Marketing, L.P. 750 EA $790.00 $592,500.00
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO |.S.D.
REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS (RFP'S) FOR COMPUTERS, LAPTOPS, SERVERS,
MICROSOFT LICENSING AND FINANCIAL SOLUTION # 18-19-070
RFP OPENING: JULY 1, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

23.2 |Year Two (2) - Student All-In-One Computer - HP ProOne 600 G4 21.5 inch FHD Non-Touch All-in-One Business PC

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended  Supplier Notes
AWARDED Reyna Enterprises Inc (CRC (Con750 EA $732.00 $549,000.00

CDW Government LLC 750 EA $745.60  $559,200.00

Virtucom, Inc. 750 EA $783.00  $587,250.00

Dell Marketing, L.P. 750 EA $790.00 $592,500.00

23.3 |Year Three (3) - Student All-In-One Computer - HP ProOne 600 G4 21.5 inch FHD Non-Touch All-in-One Business PC

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended  Supplier Notes
AWARDED Reyna Enterprises Inc (CRC (Con750 EA $732.00 $549,000.00

CDW Government LLC 750 EA $745.60  $559,200.00

Virtucom, Inc. 750 EA $783.00  $587,250.00

Dell Marketing, L.P. 750 EA $790.00 $592,500.00

24 (3 Year Purchase - Item #2 - Staff/Secondary All-In-One Computer - HP ProOne 600 G4 21.5 inch FHD Non-Touch All-in-One Business PC

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended  Supplier Notes
CDW Government LLC 1 EA $1,615,842.00 $1,615,842.00
AWARDED Reyna Enterprises Inc (CRC (Con 1 EA $1,633,230.00 $1,633,230.00
Dell Marketing, L.P. 1 EA $1,740,870.00 $1,740,870.00
Virtucom, Inc. 1 EA $1,749,150.00 $1,749,150.00

24.1 (Year One (1) - Staff/Secondary All-In-One Computer - HP ProOne 600 G4 21.5 inch FHD Non-Touch All-in-One Business PC

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended  Supplier Notes
CDW Government LLC 690 EA $780.60  $538,614.00
AWARDED Reyna Enterprises Inc (CRC (Con690 EA $789.00  $544,410.00
Dell Marketing, L.P. 690 EA $841.00  $580,290.00
Virtucom, Inc. 690 EA $845.00 $583,050.00

24.2 |Year Two (2) - Staff/Secondary All-In-One Computer - HP ProOne 600 G4 21.5 inch FHD Non-Touch All-in-One Business PC

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended  Supplier Notes
CDW Government LLC 690 EA $780.60  $538,614.00
AWARDED Reyna Enterprises Inc (CRC (Con690 EA $789.00  $544,410.00
Dell Marketing, L.P. 690 EA $841.00  $580,290.00
Virtucom, Inc. 690 EA $845.00 $583,050.00

24.3 |Year Three (3) - Staff/Secondary All-In-One Computer - HP ProOne 600 G4 21.5 inch FHD Non-Touch All-in-One Business PC

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended  Supplier Notes
CDW Government LLC 690 EA $780.60  $538,614.00
AWARDED Reyna Enterprises Inc (CRC (Con690 EA $789.00  $544,410.00
Dell Marketing, L.P. 690 EA $841.00  $580,290.00
Virtucom, Inc. 690 EA $845.00 $583,050.00

25 |One Year Guaranteed Purchase - Item # 3 - CTE Computer Lab - Z2 Mini System for High-End Applications - HP ProOne 600 G4 21.5 inch FHD Non-Touch All-in-One

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended  Supplier Notes
CDW Government LLC 300 EA $1,275.60  $382,680.00
Dell Marketing, L.P. 300 EA $1,454.00 $436,200.00
AWARDED Reyna Enterprises Inc (CRC (Con300 EA $1,479.00  $443,700.00
Virtucom, Inc. 300 EA $1,559.00  $467,700.00
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO L.S.D.

REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS (RFP'S) FOR COMPUTERS, LAPTOPS, SERVERS,
MICROSOFT LICENSING AND FINANCIAL SOLUTION # 18-19-070

RFP OPENING: JULY 1, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

VENDORS
Dell CDWG CRC om

1 - ES Desktop All in One S 790.00 | $ 745.60 | $ 732.00 | $ 767.95
2 - Secondary/Staff Desktop All in One S 841.00 | S 780.60 | $ 789.00 | $ 831.00
3-72 w/27 in monitor 3 1,454.00 | $ 1,275.60 | $ 1,479.00 | $ 1,559.00
4 - Stream Pro 11 G5 (Winbook) S 294.00 | $ 261.10 | S 279.00 | $ 287.00
5 - Stream Probook 360 (Winbook) S 360.00 | $ 335.10 | $ 379.00 | S 385.00
6 - Chromebook x360 11 G2 S 429.00 [ $ 326.90 | $ 399.00 | $ 451.00
7 - Chromebook 11G7 (clamshell) S 332.00 | S 269.90 | S 269.00 | S 294.00
8 - Probook 450 15inch (Teacher) S 834.01 (S 813.50 | S 795.00 | $ 798.00
9 - Probook 840R non-Touch S 766.01 | S 765.50 | $ 849.00 | $ 856.00
10 - Probook 840R Touch S 865.01 [ $ 878.50 | $ 899.00 | $ 919.00
11 - HP Elite X2 1012 G2 3 1,405.00 | $ 1,593.50 | $ 1,572.00 | $ 1,540.00
12 - HP Elite X360 1030 G2 S 875.00 | NO BID S 1,156.00 | $ 1,177.00
13 - 27 inch monitor S 160.00 | S 135.00 | $ 209.00 | $ 152.00
14 - Intelligent charging cart Winbooks S 1,136.00 | S 689.00 | $ 1,379.00 | $ 2,774.00
15 - Intelligent charging cart Chromebk S 1,136.00 | S 689.00 | $ 1,379.00 | $ 1,335.00
16 - Microsoft Licensing NO BID S 181,194.00 | $ 1,379.00 | $ 1,335.00
17 - Campus Server DL380 Gen 10 2U - LOW S 4,045.21 | NO BID S 6,500.00

18 - Campus server DL380 Gen 10 - MID S 5,900.66 | NO BID S 10,925.00

19 - Campus server DL580 Gen 10 - HIGH S 12,941.55 | NO BID S 20,500.00

20 - Video recording server (DL380 Gen10) S 5,841.06 | NO BID S 12,900.00

21 - Finance options (EXCLUDED) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

22 - Finance options (EXCLUDED) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

23 - 3yr purchase of Item 1

$ 1,777,500.00

$ 1,677,600.00

$ 1,647,000.00

S 1,727,887.50

24 - 3yr purchase of Item 2

$ 1,740,870.00

$ 1,615,842.00

$ 1,633,230.00

$ 1,720,170.00

25 - CTE Purchase of Item 3 S 436,200.00 | S 382,680.00 | S 443,700.00 [ S  467,700.00

laptops price ranking $ 474503 [ENENGEEOR] s 527100 5 5290.00

Chromebooks and winbooks price ranking $ 1,415.00 $ 1,193.00 $ 1,326.00 $ 1,417.00

Computers price ranking $ 3,085.00 ' $ 2,801.80 $ 3,000.00 $ 3,157.95

Servers price ranking $ 28,72848 $ - $ -
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO |.S.D.
REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS (RFP'S) FOR COMPUTERS, LAPTOPS, SERVERS,
MICROSOFT LICENSING AND FINANCIAL SOLUTION # 18-19-070
RFP OPENING: JULY 1, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

VENDORS
Item Dell CDWG CRC Virtucom
1 - ES Desktop All in One S 790.00 $ 745.60 'S 732.00 $ 767.95
2 - Secondary/Staff Desktop All in One S 841.00 | $ 780.60 $ 789.00 $ 831.00
3 -72 w/27 in monitor S 1,454.00 $ 1,275.60 $ 1,479.00 $ 1,559.00

We are going to purchase 750 of Item 1 for Elementary every

year over the next 3 yrs $ 592,500.00 $ 559,200.00 $ 549,000.00 $ 575,962.50
We are going to purchase 690 of Item 2 for Secondary $ 580,290.00 S 538,614.00 $ 544,410.00 $ 573,390.00
We are going to purchase 300 of Item 3 for CTE S 436,200.00 S 382,680.00 $ 443,700.00 S 467,700.00
Total Purchase of Items 1 and 2 $ 1,172,790.00 $ 1,097,814.00 $ 1,093,410.00 $ 1,149,352.50
Total Purchase of Item 3 $ 436,200.00 $ 382,680.00 $ 443,700.00 $ 467,700.00

*** We do not buy many of item 3. Based on last year's data, we only purchased 130 of this type of item
CTE will be making a 1 time purchase of item 3.
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO |.S.D.

REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS (RFP'S) FOR COMPUTERS, LAPTOPS, SERVERS,
MICROSOFT LICENSING AND FINANCIAL SOLUTION # 18-19-070

RFP OPENING: JULY 1, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

VENDORS

Item Dell CDWG CRC Virtucom

4 - Stream Pro 11 G5 (Winbook) S 29400 $ 261.10 $ 279.00 S 287.00
5 - Stream Probook 360 (Winbook) $ 360.00 $ 335.10 $ 379.00 S 385.00
6 - Chromebook x360 11 G2 S 429.00 S 32690 $ 399.00 S 451.00
7 - Chromebook 11G7 (clamshell) $ 33200 $§ 26990 S 269.00 S 294.00
14 - Intelligent charging cart Winbooks $1,136.00 | $ 689.00 | $1,379.00 | $2,774.00
15 - Intelligent charging cart Chromebk $1,136.00 | $ 689.00 [ $1,379.00 | $1,335.00

$ 3,687.00 $ 2,571.00 $ 4,084.00 $ 5,526.00

Total for all items
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO |.S.D.

REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS (RFP'S) FOR COMPUTERS, LAPTOPS, SERVERS,
MICROSOFT LICENSING AND FINANCIAL SOLUTION # 18-19-070

RFP OPENING: JULY 1, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

VENDORS
Item Dell CDWG CRC Virtucom
8 - Probook 450 15inch (Teacher) S 83401 $ 81350 S 795.00 $ 798.00
9 - Probook 840R non-Touch S 766.01 S 765.50 S 849.00 $ 856.00
10 - Probook 840R Touch S 865.01 S 87850 S 899.00 $ 919.00
11 - HP Elite X2 1012 G2 S 1,405.00 $ 1,593.50 $ 1,572.00 $ 1,540.00
12 - HP Elite X360 1030 G2 S 875.00 NOBID $ 1,156.00 $ 1,177.00

Total for all items

CDWG did not bid on all items

Dell did not agree to several of our
standard terms and conditions

$ 4,745.03 S 4,051.00 $ 5,271.00 $ 5,290.00
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO |.S.D.
REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS (RFP'S) FOR COMPUTERS, LAPTOPS, SERVERS,
MICROSOFT LICENSING AND FINANCIAL SOLUTION # 18-19-070

RFP OPENING: JULY 1, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

VENDORS
Item Dell CDWG CRC Virtucom
17 - Campus Server DL380 Gen 10 2U - LOW S 4,045.21 | NOBID | $ 6,500.00 | NO BID
18 - Campus server DL380 Gen 10 - MID S 5,900.66 | NOBID | $ 10,925.00 | NO BID
19 - Campus server DL580 Gen 10 - HIGH S 12,941.55 | NOBID | $ 20,500.00 | NO BID
20 - Video recording server (DL380 Gen10) S 5,841.06 | NOBID | $ 12,900.00 | NO BID
Total for all items $ 28,728.48 $ 50,825.00
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO |.S.D.
REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS (RFP'S) FOR COMPUTERS, LAPTOPS, SERVERS,
MICROSOFT LICENSING AND FINANCIAL SOLUTION # 18-19-070
RFP OPENING: JULY 1, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

VENDORS
Item Dell CDWG CRC Virtucom
16 - Microsoft Licensing $ 1,136.00 $ 181,194.00 $ 1,379.00 $ 1,335.00

Dell, CRC and Virtucom bid the wrong item. They did not look at all the associated attributes for
this item.
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS (RFP'S) FOR COMPUTERS, LAPTOPS, SERVERS,
MICROSOFT LICENSING AND FINANCIAL SOLUTION # 18-19-070
RFP OPENING: JULY 1, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

2019-2020 PSJA Computer RFP Rubric

Desktops & Monitor Winbooks, Chromebooks, Carts Laptops Servers
Iltems1-3,13 Items 4 -7, 14, 15 Items 8 - 12 Items 17 - 20
PTS|Criteria Dell| CDWG | CRC| Virtucom | Dell| CDWG | CRC| Virtucom |Dell| CDWG | CRC| Virtucom | Dell | CDWG | CRC| Virtucom
3 year on-site warranty on all Computers,
Laptops, and Servers to include all parts. Onsite | |15 | 19| 10 [ 10| 10 | 10 10 0| 10 |10 10 10| n8 | 10 NB
service repairs,and Service One partner
10 |designation.
Same day response time/24 hour resolution 10 10 {10 10 [10| 10 [10] 10 [10]| 10 |10|] 10 10 N8 [ 10| N8B
o time on all computers and laptops/ tablets.
Local pa-rts c‘iepot with hot swappable units 0 25 5 5 0 25 5 5 0 25 5 5 0 NB 5 NB
5 |located in Hidalgo County.
Experience and Reputation of Vendor with
. TR . 5 5 5 5 5 5 5 5 5 5 5 5 5 NB 5 NB
5 |projects similar in scope and size
A+ certified technicians/manufacturer certified
technicians (HP, Dell, etc...). HP Local Warranty | 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 NB 10 NB
10 |Authorized
10 |Classroom functionality and durability 10 5 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 NB 10 NB
Vendor will set up and make operational all
units within two (2) days of delivery to the 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 NB 10 NB
10 [campus.
Vendor must pay for all warranty shipping going | 15 | 10| 10 [ 10] 10 |10 10 10| 10 |10 10 10| n8 | 10 NB
10 [to and from vendor.
Once a P.0. has been received by the vendor,
delivery time of new computers, notebooks, and| 0 10 10 10 0 10 10 10 0 10 10 10 0 NB 10 NB
™ servers must be within twenty (20) working days
20 |Price 5 20 15 10 10 20 15 5 20 5 15 10 20 NB 0 NB
70 925]95| 90 75/ 98 |95 85 85 825|95| 90 |85| NB 80 NB
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Participation Summary - As of 08/01/2019

Participant Name

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO |.S.D.

REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS (RFP'S) FOR COMPUTERS, LAPTOPS, SERVERS,

MICROSOFT LICENSING AND FINANCIAL SOLUTION # 18-19-070

Response Date Response Status

Virtucom, Inc. 07/01/2019
Dell Marketing, L.P. 07/01/2019
Reyna Enterprises Inc (CRC (Compu 07/01/2019
CDW Government LLC 07/01/2019
AMSYS Innovative Solutions LLC

Artcom Communications (Artcom A

Dell EMC

Southern Computer Warehouse, Ini07/01/2019
Encore Data Products, Inc. (Burgess 06/26/2019

DreamBox Learning, Inc. 06/26/2019
n2y LLC 06/20/2019
dba Stenhouse Publishers and dba ¢06/20/2019
TEACHER DIRECT (TDSA, LLC) 06/19/2019
Insight Public Sector (Sawyers) 06/17/2019
Caldarella's Restaurant Supply 06/13/2019

Southern Accounting Systems, Inc (:06/12/2019
Youthlight, Inc. 06/07/2019
Mastery Education (Peoples Educat 06/05/2019
Audio Visual Aids (Audio Visual Aids 06/04/2019
M&A Technology (M&A Technology 06/04/2019
D. Wilson Construction (D. Wilson € 06/04/2019
CEV Multimedia, Ltd. 06/03/2019
Silicon Mountain Memory (WayTec 06/03/2019
ACCO Brands USA LLC (ACCO Brand 06/03/2019
NRSI, Inc. (National Reading Styles | 06/03/2019
MIDWEST TECHNOLOGY PRODUCT¢ 06/03/2019
Adorama Inc.

CIELO OFFICE PRODUCTS

Deltek

Greenwood Office Outfitters

HP Financial Services (Hewlett Pack

JANGA Technology LLC

Jostens, Inc.

Melhart Music Center

Mercer Technologies Firm

MIND Research Institute

monique richie

Softchoice Corporation

Waterford Research Institute

1.50 Cleaners lic Dba fat cat signs

970 5 COMPUTER

AV Pro, Inc.

ABC Custom Advertising (Marketing

ACE Data Recovery (ACE Data Grou|
Achieve3000, Inc.

ACP Direct (Affordable Computer Pi

Advanced Communications & Cablii

Aeries Software

AGC Education Inc.

AISYS Consulting, LLC

Alamo Music Center

Alamo Photo Center

All American Poly

AllPlayers Network Inc. (Rank One ¢

ALPHA CUSTOM SHIRTS

Altex Electronic's Ltd.

AndyMark, Inc.

Applied Industrial Technologies

ASAP Printing Solutions (O'Conn LL(
AssetGenie, Inc. DBA AGiRepair anc

AT&T Corp

aves audio visual systems, inc.

Batts Audio, Video & Lighting

Beneftifocus

Best Buy For Business (Best Buy Sto

Beyond Technology (W.M. Corp.)

BridgeNet Communications, LLC

bulb, Inc.

Butler Business Products

C&H Distributors, LLC

CASO Document Management

Cindy Sandoval

Circle Industries Inc.

Clary Business Machines (Sufian Mt

Submitted
Submitted
Submitted
Submitted
Unsubmitted
Unsubmitted
Unsubmitted
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed

RFP OPENING: JULY 1, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

Contact
Tim Prince
Aaron Rodriguez

Mike Smith
Deidra Sutton

Julia Stewart
Jeff Burgess
Lori Hahn
Jennifer Stout
Jennifer J. Selby
JOSH BOX

Tessa Caldarella
Julie Pruett

Sandra C. McCarthy
Barbara Dexter
Ron George

Donna Shepard
Norma Lerma

Karen Crowell, Controller

Ann Monticello
Customer Care
Bob Foley
ARLENE KENNEDY

DAVID BARRERA
Source Management
Robert Rosalez

Paul Hermann
Andrea Anguiano
Carlos Trejo

Jim Melhart

Garrett Mercer

Juan Arango

Jackie Alldredge
samuel avila
RICHARD RAAB
Heather Winkelman
Martha J Miller
Andrey Vasilyev
Erin Rush

Vanessa Morris
Kent Taylor

Nagwa Demian
Elizabeth Lopez
Brian Parks
Guadalupe Rocha

Brian Mann

Sean O' Connor
Tina Covalesky
Hector Orellana
ANGIE GOMEZ
AJ Meadows

Jessea Bowe
David Hughey
Stacy Duke

William Rose

Picture Perfect
Joel Hilliard

City
Peachtree Corners
Round Rock
McAllen
Vernon Hills
Houston
San Antonio
Round Rock
Marietta
Lafayette
Bellevue
Huron
Portsmouth
BIRMINGHAM
Tempe

EL PASO
Tuscumbia
Chapin
Saddle Brook
San Antonio
Carrolton
McAllen
Lubbock
Fenton
Dallas
Syosset
SIOUX CITY
NEW YORK
MCALLEN
Herndon
Fort Worth
Berkeley Heights
Pharr
Chicago
Mcallen
Gary

Irvine

pharr
Chicago
Sandy
mcallen
Jacksonville Beach
DeSoto
McAllen
Dallas
Lakewood
Dallas
Georgetown
Plano
PITTSBURGH
McAllen

San Antonio
Alamo
Piscataway
Sanger
edinburg
San Antonio
Kokomo
Pharr
McAllen
Greensburg
McAllen
SUGAR LAND
Denison
Charleston
Richfield
Centennial
Donna
Lafayette
Houston
Chicago

San Antonio
Pharr
Houston
San Diego
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State Invitation Type

GA
X
X
IL
LS
X
X
GA
co
WA
OH
NH
AL
AZ
X
AL
Ne
NJ
LS
X
X
X
MO
X
NY
1A
NY
X
VA
X
NJ
X
IL
X
IN
CA
X
IL
uTt
X
FL
X
X
WA
NJ
X
X
X
PA
X
LS
X
NJ
X
X
X
IN
X
LS
PA
X
X
LS
Ne
MN
co
X
co
X
IL
LS
X
LS
CA

Invitation Date

Automatic

Automatic
Automatic
Automatic

Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic

Automatic
Automatic

Automatic
Automatic
Automatic

Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic

Automatic
Automatic

Automatic
Automatic

Automatic

Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic

06/03/2019

06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019

06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019

06/03/2019
06/03/2019

06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019

06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019

06/03/2019
06/03/2019

06/03/2019
06/03/2019

06/03/2019

06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019
06/03/2019

Owner

Scott MacDonald, President

Michael Dell
Gaudencio Reyna
Michael Kransny



PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO |.S.D.
REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS (RFP'S) FOR COMPUTERS, LAPTOPS, SERVERS,
MICROSOFT LICENSING AND FINANCIAL SOLUTION # 18-19-070
RFP OPENING: JULY 1, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

Participation Summary - As of 08/01/2019

Participant Name Response Date Response Status Contact City State Invitation Type Invitation Date
Coast To Coast Computer Products, Miranda Horowitz Simi Valley CA  Automatic 06/03/2019
Cogent Communications, Inc. Baltimore MD  Automatic 06/03/2019
Communications ETC (Valeric, LLC) McAllen TX  Automatic 06/03/2019
Connections Education Pearson Onl Columbia MD  Automatic 06/03/2019
ConstructConnect Cincinnati OH  Automatic 06/03/2019
Construction Journal LLC Pamela Exton Stuart FL Automatic 06/03/2019
Copy Graphics Inc. David Valdez McAllen TX  Automatic 06/03/2019
Core Business Solutions/ UBEO Conr Baldomero Gonzalez Pharr TX  Automatic 06/03/2019
CRW Consulting, LLC Jeffrey W. Harris Tulsa OK  Automatic 06/03/2019
Cytek Media Systems, Inc. Steve Patton Topeka KS Automatic 06/03/2019
Decisin Tree Inc. Brent Lawson El Paso TX  Automatic 06/03/2019
Devin Distributing & Packaging Inc. Sandra Salinas Palmhurst TX  Automatic 06/03/2019
Discount Two-Way Radio Corporati Stoyan Varbanov Compton CA  Automatic 06/03/2019
DocuNav Solutions (VP Imaging, Inc Shannon Fellows Frisco X Automatic 06/03/2019
DocuWare Corporation Cory Giovanella New Windsor NY  Automatic 06/03/2019
Don Johnston Incorporated Baylee Royal Volo IL Automatic 06/03/2019
Double M laser products inc. Houston TX  Automatic 06/03/2019
Econ Group, LLC Gilbert Enriquez Edinburg TX  Automatic 06/03/2019
ECS Learning Systems (Asteria Educ Shawndell Byers Bulverde TX  Automatic 06/03/2019
Ed Tech Soft, Inc. Vinita Bakhshi Duluth GA  Automatic 06/03/2019
edu Business Solutions, Inc. Jordan Matanane San Diego CA  Automatic 06/03/2019
Education 2000 (Douglas E. Pennek. Marissa Pennekamp Houston TX  Automatic 06/03/2019
Education Advanced, Inc. Tyler TX  Automatic 06/03/2019
Eduphoria! Incorporated Plano TX  Automatic 06/03/2019
EDUPROJECT ELL, LLC Julie Kaiser Plano > Automatic 06/03/2019
Fitness Finders Inc Ann Brown JACKSON Ml Automatic 06/03/2019
Flaghouse Inc John Holt Hasbrouck Heights NJ Automatic 06/03/2019
Follett School Solutions, Inc. Sarah Eisenhauer McHenry IL Automatic 06/03/2019
Foremost Telecommunications Cor| Lawrence Halcomb Dallas X Automatic 06/03/2019
Full Compass (Full Compass System Brian Kaphingst Madison WI  Automatic 06/03/2019
Govmation Enterprise Solutions Dwaylyn Holland McKinney TX  Automatic 06/03/2019
GradeCam LLC Debbie Delaney Livermore CA  Automatic 06/03/2019
Harvest Technology Group Alpharetta GA  Automatic 06/03/2019
Hatch, Inc Sales Operations Winston-Salem NC  Automatic 06/03/2019
Hermes Trading Co., Inc. dba Herme Eduardo Zamorano Jr. Pharr X Automatic 06/03/2019
High End Advertising Mariano Nunez Mission X Automatic 06/03/2019
Hiperware Labs Inc Amey Laud Vancouver WA  Automatic 06/03/2019
Holzberg Communications, INc. Andy Holzberg Totowa NJ Automatic 06/03/2019
Hoonuit, LLC Carrie Hannigan Little Falls MN  Automatic 06/03/2019
Howard Technology Solutions (How Rebecca Dearman Birmingham AL Automatic 06/03/2019
Hunt's Photo & Video (W.B. Hunt Ci Roger Treadwell Melrose MA  Automatic 06/03/2019
Independent Living Aids LLC Karin Danza Buffalo NY  Automatic 06/03/2019
Infinite Campus, Inc. Blaine MN  Automatic 06/03/2019
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNOVA McAllen > Automatic 06/03/2019
Insight Darak Weaver McAllen, TX  Automatic 06/03/2019
Intech Southwest Services san antonio X Automatic 06/03/2019
Istation (Imagination Station, Inc.) Monika Flood Dallas TX  Automatic 06/03/2019
IT RECYCLING GROUP Kay Ramon GEORGETOWN TX  Automatic 06/03/2019
ITSLEARNING INC Newton MA  Automatic 06/03/2019
IXL Learning, Inc. Nektaria Klouvidakis San Mateo CA  Automatic 06/03/2019
J.W. Pepper & Son, Inc. Luana Marler Richland Hills X Automatic 06/03/2019
Junior Library Guild (MT LIBRARY SE Joni Anderson Carol Stream IL Automatic 06/03/2019
LD Products, Inc. Diana Athey Long Beach CA  Automatic 06/03/2019
Learning Services International Inc Donna Villena Springfield OR  Automatic 06/03/2019
Lesson Planet (Education Planet Inc Lori O'Connell Santa Barbara CA  Automatic 06/03/2019
Lexine Inc Frank Martinez McAllen TX  Automatic 06/03/2019
Library Video Company d/b/a SAFA West Conshohocken PA  Automatic 06/03/2019
Lightspeed Technologies, Inc. Melissa Williams Tualatin OR  Automatic 06/03/2019
Limitless Office Products Mita Guha RICHARDSON X Automatic 06/03/2019
Little Giants Learning Center Alamo TX  Automatic 06/03/2019
Logical Front Adrian villalba Villalba SANDY UT  Automatic 06/03/2019
Macie Publishing Company Mendham NJ Automatic 06/03/2019
Manning Navcomp Inc Michael Wells Austin X Automatic 06/03/2019
maxi aids angela giglio farmingdfale NY  Automatic 06/03/2019
Medicaid Finance & Consulting Sen Michael Gonzalez Houston X Automatic 06/03/2019
MobyMax John Jennings PITTSBURGH PA  Automatic 06/03/2019
Netsync Network Solutions Xavier Trevino McAllen X Automatic 06/03/2019
Nystrom Education; The Center for Culver City CA  Automatic 06/03/2019
Office Depot, Inc Nadia Garza La Feria TX  Automatic 06/03/2019
OMA INDUSTRIES, LLC Lucia Valdez HARLINGEN TX  Automatic 06/03/2019
Otter Graphics Inc. Robert Vincent Oxnard CA  Automatic 06/03/2019
PCMG, Inc. Elanie Bungay Los Angeles CA  Automatic 06/03/2019
PCPC Direct Frank Parent Houston TX  Automatic 06/03/2019
Perez Technologies Mario Perez Mission X Automatic 06/03/2019
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO |.S.D.
REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS (RFP'S) FOR COMPUTERS, LAPTOPS, SERVERS,
MICROSOFT LICENSING AND FINANCIAL SOLUTION # 18-19-070
RFP OPENING: JULY 1, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

Participation Summary - As of 08/01/2019

Participant Name Response Date Response Status Contact City State Invitation Type Invitation Date
Performance Scoring Michael Terneus Farmers Branch X Automatic 06/03/2019
Phynyx Fire & Security ROY OLIVAREZ San Juan TX  Automatic 06/03/2019
Picnic Education (MT LIBRARY SERV Angela Christianson Carol Stream IL Automatic 06/03/2019
Precision Micrographics & Imaging jerry collins Austin TX  Automatic 06/03/2019
Prime Systems HOUSTON TX  Automatic 06/03/2019
ProComputing Corporation Michael McKinstry Grapevine X Automatic 06/03/2019
Public Consulting Group Inc Maureen Farrell Boston MA  Automatic 06/03/2019
PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS (PYR/ CANDY ESTES TAMPA FL Automatic 06/03/2019
Renaissance Learning Wisconsin Rapids Wi Automatic 06/03/2019
Romeo Music Julie Romeo COPPELL TX  Automatic 06/03/2019
Romo Contractors, LLC Romo Contractors LLC Laredo > Automatic 06/03/2019
Samsclub 8250 Carlos Garcia mcallen TX  Automatic 06/03/2019
SATORI DISPLAY (ANA C TOBIAS DB, ANA TOBIAS MCALLEN X Automatic 06/03/2019
Scantron Corporation Michelle Nira Eagan MN  Automatic 06/03/2019
Scholastic Inc. Representative Jefferson City MO  Automatic 06/03/2019
School Datebooks (SDI Innovations) Cole Cooper Lafayette IN Automatic 06/03/2019
School Outfitters Cincinnati OH  Automatic 06/03/2019
School Specialty, Inc. Accounts Receivable Greenville WI  Automatic 06/03/2019
SHI international Austin TX  Automatic 06/03/2019
Skyward, Inc Darcy Grabski Stevens Point WI  Automatic 06/03/2019
Smartcom Telephone, LLC. Robert Sanchez McAllen X Automatic 06/03/2019
SmartSchool Sytems David Walling Kingwood TX  Automatic 06/03/2019
Solid IT Networks, Inc Staci Giddings Dallas TX  Automatic 06/03/2019
Solix, Inc Parsippany NJ Automatic 06/03/2019
SRC Solutions, Inc. Center Valley PA  Automatic 06/03/2019
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder Enterp McAllen TX  Automatic 06/03/2019
Teaching Systems, Inc. Kim Savage Arlington X Automatic 06/03/2019
TekVisions, Inc. Elizabeth Blythe TEMECULA CA  Automatic 06/03/2019
The Library Store, Inc. Shayla Hill TREMONT IL Automatic 06/03/2019
The Supply Room Inc Crystal Valachi Oxford AL Automatic 06/03/2019
Total Seminars, LLC. Kathy Yale Houston TX  Automatic 06/03/2019
TouchMath Acquisition LLC Nancy Lawrence Colorado Springs CO  Automatic 06/03/2019
Troxell Communications, Inc. Trenton Brackley Phoenix AZ Automatic 06/03/2019
VCRNOW (Visual Candy Resources | Jeff Andersen Red Oak X Automatic 06/03/2019
Vertex Marketing Dr. Sue Bayer Stafford TX  Automatic 06/03/2019
Videotex Systems, Inc. Dika Causevic Dallas X Automatic 06/03/2019
Vivacity Tech PBC Tanya Maloley Saint Paul MN  Automatic 06/03/2019
VTX1 Companies (VTX Communicat Linda Garza Raymondville TX  Automatic 06/03/2019
WalkerCom, Inc. Ray Saldivar Pearland TX  Automatic 06/03/2019
Walmart Inc Bentonvile AR Automatic 06/03/2019
Worldgate (Worldgate, LLC) Reston VA  Automatic 06/03/2019
Xerox Corporation/XRX Business Co Jaime Huerta Mcallen TX  Automatic 06/03/2019
YellowFolder, LLC Jill McKay Carrollton TX  Automatic 06/03/2019
Zonar Systems Christian Jacobsen Seattle WA  Automatic 06/03/2019
Zones,LLC Asad ljaz Auburn WA  Automatic 06/03/2019
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