

**PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
 CHARTER BUS SERVICES BID # 18-19-075
 BID OPENING: JULY 23, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.**

| | | | |
|--------------------------|----------------------------|---------------------|--|
| Event Number | # 18-19-075 | Organization | PSJA ISD Ebids |
| Event Title | CHARTER BUS SERVICES | Workgroup | Purchasing |
| Event Description | | Event Owner | Emily Garza |
| Event Type | Bid | Email | emily.garza@psjaisd.us |
| Issue Date | 6/20/2019 05:54:14 PM (CT) | Phone | |
| Close Date | 7/23/2019 02:30:00 PM (CT) | Fax | |

| Responding Supplier | City | State | Response Submitted | Lines Responded | Response Total |
|---------------------------------|-------------|-------|----------------------------|-----------------|----------------|
| Star Shuttle, Inc. | San Antonio | TX | 7/22/2019 01:12:18 PM (CT) | 15 | \$1,074.25 |
| Escamilla Tour Buses LLC | McAllen | TX | 7/1/2019 10:05:37 AM (CT) | 2 | \$1,153.90 |
| DISCOVERY CHARTER BUSES,LLC | MCALLEN | TX | 7/23/2019 09:47:34 AM (CT) | 14 | \$1,569.00 |
| All Valley Charters, LLC | MCALLEN | TX | 7/23/2019 02:28:05 PM (CT) | 10 | \$6,612.50 |
| Kerrville Bus/Coach USA (Kerrvi | SAN ANTONIO | TX | 7/2/2019 04:08:37 PM (CT) | 30 | \$8,519.00 |
| OK TOURS, LLC (OK TOURS LLC) | SAN ANTONIO | TX | 7/20/2019 01:33:32 PM (CT) | 12 | \$11,400.00 |
| Cougar Bus Lines Ltd. | Laredo | TX | 7/22/2019 03:39:23 PM (CT) | 23 | \$14,922.75 |

RECOMMENDATION: That the Board of Education award Charter Bus Services Bid # 18-19-075 to the lowest bidders indicated below:

| <u>ITEMS:</u> | <u>BIDDERS:</u> | <u>TOTALS:</u> |
|---------------|------------------------------|--------------------------------|
| Charter Buses | All Valley Charters, LLC | Purchased on "as needed basis" |
| Charter Buses | Cougar Bus Lines Ltd. | Purchased on "as needed basis" |
| Charter Buses | Discovery Charter Buses, LLC | Purchased on "as needed basis" |
| Charter Buses | Escamilla Tour Buses LLC | Purchased on "as needed basis" |
| Charter Buses | Kerrville Bus / Coach USA | Purchased on "as needed basis" |
| Charter Buses | OK Tours, LLC | Purchased on "as needed basis" |
| Charter Buses | Star Shuttle, Inc. | Purchased on "as needed basis" |

Emily Garza, Director of Purchasing

Charge Budgeted Account Numbers: Various budgeted account numbers district-wide

Seventy nine (79) invitations were emailed to vendors
 Five (5) Vendors viewed Bid Specifications
 Eight (8) Submitted Bid
 Four (4) No Bid

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
 CHARTER BUS SERVICES BID # 18-19-075
 BID OPENING: JULY 23, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

| Line # | Description | QTY | UOM | All Valley Charters, LLC | | Cougar Bus Lines Ltd. | | DISCOVERY CHARTER BUSES, LLC | | Escamilla Tour Buses LLC | |
|--------|---|-----|-----|---|------------|---|-------------|--|------------|--|------------|
| | | | | Total Price | \$6,612.50 | Total Price | \$14,922.75 | Total Price | \$1,569.00 | Total Price | \$1,153.90 |
| | | | | Unit | Extended | Unit | Extended | Unit | Extended | Unit | Extended |
| 1 | Group A - Minimum 58 Seat Charter Bus | 1 | EA | | | | | | | | |
| 1.1 | Hourly Rate | 1 | EA | | | | | | | | |
| 1.2 | Daily Rate - between minimum hour for Hourly Rate and up to 24 hours. | 1 | EA | | | | | | | | |
| 1.3 | Mileage Rate | 1 | EA | | | | | | | | |
| 2 | Group B - Minimum 57 Seat Charter Bus | 1 | EA | | | | | | | | |
| 2.1 | Hourly Rate | 1 | EA | | | | | | | | |
| 2.2 | Daily Rate - between minimum hour for Hourly Rate and up to 24 hours. | 1 | EA | | | | | | | | |
| 2.3 | Mileage Rate | 1 | EA | | | | | | | | |
| 3 | Group C - Minimum 56 Seat Charter Bus | 1 | EA | \$1,954.25 | \$1,954.25 | \$2,003.25 | \$2,003.25 | | | \$1,153.90 | \$1,153.90 |
| 3.1 | Hourly Rate | 1 | EA | \$200.00 | | \$150.00 | | | | | |
| 3.2 | Daily Rate - between minimum hour for Hourly Rate and up to 24 hours. | 1 | EA | \$1,750.00 | | \$1,850.00 | | | | \$1,150.00 | |
| 3.3 | Mileage Rate Minimum hours per trip: Indicate when mileage rate charge will apply: | 1 | EA | \$4.25 4 Rates are calculated by miles, hours or days, whichever is greater | | \$3.25 Please see attached deviations page. | | | | \$3.90 8 Will apply when it exceeds the daily rate | |
| 4 | Group D - Minimum 55 Seat Charter Bus | 1 | EA | \$1,954.25 | \$1,954.25 | \$2,003.25 | \$2,003.25 | | | | |
| 4.1 | Hourly Rate | 1 | EA | \$200.00 | | \$150.00 | | | | | |
| 4.2 | Daily Rate - between minimum hour for Hourly Rate and up to 24 hours. | 1 | EA | \$1,750.00 | | \$1,850.00 | | | | | |
| 4.3 | Mileage Rate Minimum hours per trip: Indicate when mileage rate charge will apply: | 1 | EA | \$4.25 4 Rates are calculated by miles, hours or days, whichever is greater | | \$3.25 Please see attached deviations page. | | | | | |
| 5 | Group E - Minimum 54 Seat Charter Bus | 1 | EA | | | \$2,003.25 | \$2,003.25 | \$203.50 | \$203.50 | | |
| 5.1 | Hourly Rate Supplier Notes: | 1 | EA | | | \$150.00 | | \$100.00 Mas \$100.00/hora extra | | | |
| 5.2 | Daily Rate - between minimum hour for Hourly Rate and up to 24 hours. | 1 | EA | | | \$1,850.00 | | \$100.00 | | | |
| 5.3 | Mileage Rate Supplier Notes: Minimum hours per trip: Indicate when mileage rate charge will apply: | 1 | EA | | | \$3.25 Please see attached deviations page. | | \$3.50 Minimo de 200 millas 6 Con mas de 100 millas | | | |
| 6 | Group F - Minimum 53 Seat Charter Bus | 1 | EA | | | \$2,003.25 | \$2,003.25 | \$203.50 | \$203.50 | | |
| 6.1 | Hourly Rate Supplier Notes: | 1 | EA | | | \$150.00 | | \$100.00 Mas \$100.00 hr. extra | | | |
| 6.2 | Daily Rate - between minimum hour for Hourly Rate and up to 24 hours. | 1 | EA | | | \$1,850.00 | | \$100.00 | | | |
| 6.3 | Mileage Rate Minimum hours per trip: Indicate when mileage rate charge will apply: Supplier Notes: | 1 | EA | | | \$3.25 Please see attached deviations page. | | \$3.50 6 Con mas de 100 millas Minimo de 200 millas | | | |
| 7 | Group G - Minimum 52 Seat Charter Bus | 1 | EA | | | \$2,003.25 | \$2,003.25 | \$203.50 | \$203.50 | | |
| 7.1 | Hourly Rate Supplier Notes: | 1 | EA | | | \$150.00 | | \$100.00 Mas \$100.00 hora extras | | | |
| 7.2 | Daily Rate - between minimum hour for Hourly Rate and up to 24 hours. | 1 | EA | | | \$1,850.00 | | \$100.00 | | | |
| 7.3 | Mileage Rate Supplier Notes: Minimum hours per trip: Indicate when mileage rate charge will apply: | 1 | EA | | | \$3.25 Please see attached deviations page. | | \$3.50 Minimo de 200 millas 6 Con mas de 100 millas | | | |

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
 CHARTER BUS SERVICES BID # 18-19-075
 BID OPENING: JULY 23, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

| Line # | Description | QTY | UOM | All Valley Charters, LLC | | Cougar Bus Lines Ltd. | | DISCOVERY CHARTER BUSES, LLC | | Escamilla Tour Buses LLC | |
|--------|---|-----|-----|--------------------------|-------------------------------------|-----------------------|--------------------------------------|------------------------------|------------|--------------------------|------------|
| | | | | Total Price | \$6,612.50 | Total Price | \$14,922.75 | Total Price | \$1,569.00 | Total Price | \$1,153.90 |
| | | | | Unit | Extended | Unit | Extended | Unit | Extended | Unit | Extended |
| 8 | Group H - Minimum 50 Seat Charter Bus | 1 | EA | | | \$2,003.25 | \$2,003.25 | \$203.50 | \$203.50 | | |
| 8.1 | Hourly Rate | 1 | EA | | | \$150.00 | | \$100.00 | | | |
| | Supplier Notes: | | | | | | | Mas \$100.00 hora extras | | | |
| 8.2 | Daily Rate - between minimum hour for Hourly Rate and up to 24 hours. | 1 | EA | | | \$1,850.00 | | \$100.00 | | | |
| 8.3 | Mileage Rate | 1 | EA | | | \$3.25 | | \$3.50 | | | |
| | Supplier Notes: | | | | | | | Minimo de 200 millas | | | |
| | Minimum hours per trip: | | | | | | | 6 | | | |
| | Indicate when mileage rate charge will apply: | | | | | | Please see attached deviations page. | Con mas de 100 millas | | | |
| 9 | Group I - Minimum 47 Seat Charter Bus | 1 | EA | \$1,904.00 | \$1,904.00 | \$2,003.25 | \$2,003.25 | | | | |
| | Supplier Notes: | | | | | | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 9.1 | Hourly Rate | 1 | EA | \$175.00 | | \$150.00 | | | | | |
| 9.2 | Daily Rate - between minimum hour for Hourly Rate and up to 24 hours. | 1 | EA | \$1,725.00 | | \$1,850.00 | | | | | |
| 9.3 | Mileage Rate | 1 | EA | \$4.00 | | \$3.25 | | | | | |
| | Minimum hours per trip: | | | | | | | | | | |
| | Indicate when mileage rate charge will apply: | | | | | | Please see attached deviations page. | | | | |
| 10 | Group I - Minimum 47 Seat Charter Bus | 1 | EA | \$800.00 | \$800.00 | \$900.00 | \$900.00 | \$755.00 | \$755.00 | | |
| | Supplier Notes: | | | | | | | | | | |
| 10.1 | Second driver fee (Driver Relief Rate) | 1 | EA | \$800.00 | | <u>\$250.00</u> | | | | | |
| | Supplier Notes: | | | | | | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 10.2 | Overnight Rate - any trip over 24 hours | 1 | EA | | | <u>\$650.00</u> | | \$750.00 | | | |
| 10.3 | Cancellation Fee | 1 | EA | | | | | | | | |
| 10.4 | Fuel Surcharge - if applicable. | 1 | EA | | | | | <u>\$5.00</u> | | | |
| | Supplier Notes: | | | | | | | | | | |
| | Indicate when a second driver fee would apply: | | | | When trip exceeds the 15 hour rule. | | Please see attached deviations page. | Trips over 15 hrs/ day | | | |

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
CHARTER BUS SERVICES BID # 18-19-075
BID OPENING: JULY 23, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

| Line # | Description | QTY | UOM | Kerrville Bus/Coach USA (Kerrville Bus) | | OK TOURS, LLC (OK TOURS LLC) | | Star Shuttle, Inc. | |
|--------|--|-----|-----|--|--|---------------------------------|--|---------------------|------------------------|
| | | | | Total Price Unit | \$8,519.00 Extended | Total Price Unit | \$11,400.00 Extended | Total Price Unit | \$1,074.25 Extended |
| 1 | Group A - Minimum 58 Seat Charter Bus | 1 | EA | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | | | | |
| 1.1 | Hourly Rate | 1 | EA | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | | | | |
| 1.2 | Daily Rate - between minimum hour for Hourly Rate and up to 24 hours. | 1 | EA | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | | | | |
| 1.3 | Mileage Rate | 1 | EA | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | | | | |
| 2 | Group B - Minimum 57 Seat Charter Bus | 1 | EA | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | | | | |
| 2.1 | Hourly Rate | 1 | EA | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | | | | |
| 2.2 | Daily Rate - between minimum hour for Hourly Rate and up to 24 hours. | 1 | EA | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | | | | |
| 2.3 | Mileage Rate | 1 | EA | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | | | | |
| 3 | Group C - Minimum 56 Seat Charter Bus | 1 | EA | \$3,579.50 | \$3,579.50 | \$1,900.00 | \$1,900.00 | \$117.75 | \$117.75 |
| 3.1 | Hourly Rate | 1 | EA | \$275.00 | | \$150.00 | | \$114.00 | |
| 3.2 | Daily Rate - between minimum hour for Hourly Rate and up to 24 hours. | 1 | EA | \$3,300.00 | | \$1,750.00 | | | |
| 3.3 | Mileage Rate Minimum hours per trip: Indicate when mileage rate charge will apply: | 1 | EA | \$4.50 | 12 When charter total estimate exceeds service hours and travel miles are greater | \$3.75 | 12 All trips require a two day minimum as they are dispatched from San Antonio, | \$3.75 | |
| 4 | Group D - Minimum 55 Seat Charter Bus | 1 | EA | \$3,579.50 | \$3,579.50 | \$1,900.00 | \$1,900.00 | \$117.75 | \$117.75 |
| 4.1 | Hourly Rate | 1 | EA | \$275.00 | | \$150.00 | | \$114.00 | |
| 4.2 | Daily Rate - between minimum hour for Hourly Rate and up to 24 hours. | 1 | EA | \$3,300.00 | | \$1,750.00 | | | |
| 4.3 | Mileage Rate Minimum hours per trip: Indicate when mileage rate charge will apply: | 1 | EA | \$4.50 | 12 When charter total estimate exceeds service hours and travel miles are greater | \$3.75 | 12 All trips require a two day minimum as they are dispatched from San Antonio, | \$3.75 | |
| 5 | Group E - Minimum 54 Seat Charter Bus | 1 | EA | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | \$1,900.00 | \$1,900.00 | \$117.75 | \$117.75 |
| 5.1 | Hourly Rate Supplier Notes: | 1 | EA | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | \$150.00 | | \$114.00 | |
| 5.2 | Daily Rate - between minimum hour for Hourly Rate and up to 24 hours. | 1 | EA | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | \$1,750.00 | | | |
| 5.3 | Mileage Rate Supplier Notes: Minimum hours per trip: Indicate when mileage rate charge will apply: | 1 | EA | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | \$3.75 | 12 All trips require a two day minimum as they are dispatched from San Antonio, | \$3.75 | |
| 6 | Group F - Minimum 53 Seat Charter Bus | 1 | EA | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | \$1,900.00 | \$1,900.00 | \$117.75 | \$117.75 |
| 6.1 | Hourly Rate Supplier Notes: | 1 | EA | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | \$150.00 | | \$114.00 | |
| 6.2 | Daily Rate - between minimum hour for Hourly Rate and up to 24 hours. | 1 | EA | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | \$1,750.00 | | | |
| 6.3 | Mileage Rate Minimum hours per trip: Indicate when mileage rate charge will apply: Supplier Notes: | 1 | EA | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | \$3.75 | 12 All trips require a two day minimum as they are dispatched from San Antonio, | \$3.75 | |
| 7 | Group G - Minimum 52 Seat Charter Bus | 1 | EA | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | \$1,900.00 | \$1,900.00 | \$117.75 | \$117.75 |
| 7.1 | Hourly Rate Supplier Notes: | 1 | EA | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | \$150.00 | | \$114.00 | |
| 7.2 | Daily Rate - between minimum hour for Hourly Rate and up to 24 hours. | 1 | EA | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | \$1,750.00 | | | |
| 7.3 | Mileage Rate Supplier Notes: Minimum hours per trip: Indicate when mileage rate charge will apply: | 1 | EA | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | \$3.75 | 12 All trips require a two day minimum as they are dispatched from San Antonio, | \$3.75 | |

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
 CHARTER BUS SERVICES BID # 18-19-075
 BID OPENING: JULY 23, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

| Line # | Description | QTY | UOM | Kerrville Bus/Coach USA (Kerrville Bus) | | OK TOURS, LLC (OK TOURS LLC) | | Star Shuttle, Inc. | |
|--------|--|-----|-----|--|------------|--|-------------|---|------------|
| | | | | Total Price | \$8,519.00 | Total Price | \$11,400.00 | Total Price | \$1,074.25 |
| | | | | Unit | Extended | Unit | Extended | Unit | Extended |
| 8 | Group H - Minimum 50 Seat Charter Bus | 1 | EA | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | \$1,900.00 | \$1,900.00 | \$117.75 | \$117.75 |
| 8.1 | Hourly Rate | 1 | EA | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | \$150.00 | | \$114.00 | |
| | Supplier Notes: | | | | | | | | |
| 8.2 | Daily Rate - between minimum hour for Hourly Rate and up to 24 hours. | 1 | EA | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | \$1,750.00 | | | |
| 8.3 | Mileage Rate | 1 | EA | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | | | \$3.75 | |
| | Supplier Notes: Minimum hours per trip: Indicate when mileage rate charge will apply: | | | | | 12 All trips require a two day minimum as they are | | | |
| 9 | Group I - Minimum 47 Seat Charter Bus | 1 | EA | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | | | \$117.75 | \$117.75 |
| | Supplier Notes: | | | | | | | | |
| 9.1 | Hourly Rate | 1 | EA | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | | | \$114.00 | |
| 9.2 | Daily Rate - between minimum hour for Hourly Rate and up to 24 hours. | 1 | EA | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | | | | |
| 9.3 | Mileage Rate | 1 | EA | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | | | \$3.75 | |
| | Supplier Notes: Minimum hours per trip: Indicate when mileage rate charge will apply: | | | | | | | | |
| 10 | Group I - Minimum 47 Seat Charter Bus | 1 | EA | \$1,360.00 | \$1,360.00 | | | \$250.00 | \$250.00 |
| 10.1 | Second driver fee (Driver Relief Rate) | 1 | EA | \$500.00 | | | | \$250.00 | |
| | Supplier Notes: | | | | | | | | |
| 10.2 | Overnight Rate - any trip over 24 hours | 1 | EA | | | | | | |
| 10.3 | Cancellation Fee | 1 | EA | \$850.00 | | | | | |
| 10.4 | Fuel Surcharge - if applicable. | 1 | EA | \$10.00 | | | | | |
| | Supplier Notes: Indicate when a second driver fee would apply: | | | \$0.10 | | | | | |
| | | | | When total driving hours exceed 10 hours, on-duty hours exceed 15 and/or total | | | | When Driver exceeds 10 hrs driving / 15 hours of service | |

**PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
 CHARTER BUS SERVICES BID # 18-19-075
 BID OPENING: JULY 23, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.**

| Att # | Attribute Name | All Valley Charters, LLC | Cougar Bus Lines Ltd. | DISCOVERY CHARTER BUSES,LLC | Escamilla Tour Buses LLC | Kerrville Bus/Coach USA (Kerrville Bus) | OK TOURS, LLC (OK TOURS LLC) | Star Shuttle, Inc. |
|-------|--|--------------------------|-----------------------|------------------------------|--------------------------|---|------------------------------|--------------------|
| 60 | Business/Company Owner Name Please provide complete name of the business/ company owner responding to the bid/proposal. | Dwight Yoder | Ricardo Rodriguez Jr. | Heidi Y. Cepeda de Escamilla | Hector Escamilla | Kerrville Bus/Coach USA | Ana M. Sarmiento | Star Shuttle, Inc. |
| 61 | Date of Establishment | May 7, 2015 | 03/2002 | 2015 | 01/04/08 | 07/15/1929 | 10/20/1993 | 2/13/1992 |
| 62 | CERTIFICATIONS AND REQUESTED DOCUMENTATION The following is to be used as a check list for the Bidder for submission of the bid response. | | | | | | | |
| 63 | Proof of compliance with all Federal, including the Federal Motor Carrier Safety Regulations (FMCSR) and State Regulations. | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes |
| 64 | Licensing from the Interstate Commerce Commission (ICC) and United States Department of Transportation (USDOT) | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes |
| 65 | Current Department of Transportation MCS 90B, Endorsement for motor Carrier Policies of Insurance for Public Liability | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes |
| 66 | Company policy documentation outlining program requirements, statement of compliance with (FMCSR) concerning drug testing, and proof of enforcement. | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes |
| 67 | The selection criteria and approval of bus drivers. | | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes |
| 68 | Emergency Road Service Contingency Plan. | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes |
| 69 | List of equipment (by make, model, year and mileage) that will be used in performance of services, and the number of buses that are available. | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes |
| 70 | Brief description of preventative maintenance program and verification of compliance with (FMCSR) concerning motor vehicle maintenance. | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes |
| 71 | Proof of Business Automobile Liability Insurance (Each Person, Each Occurrence) - Bodily Injury - 5 million dollars combined single limit / in the aggregate. | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes |
| 72 | Proof of Property Damage Insurance (Each Occurrence) - 5 million dollars combined single limit / in the aggregate. | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes |
| 73 | Proof of Workman's Compensation Employer's Liability Insurance (Statutory Limits) - Five hundred thousand each accident, five hundred thousand policy limit and five hundred thousand each employee. | Yes | Yes | No | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes |
| 74 | Must provide Texas Department of Motor Vehicles TxDMV Certificate Number, US DOT Number and Certificate Status. | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes |

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
CHARTER BUS SERVICES BID # 18-19-075
BID OPENING: JULY 23, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

| Att # | Attribute Name | All Valley Charters, LLC | Cougar Bus Lines Ltd. | DISCOVERY CHARTER BUSES,LLC | Escamilla Tour Buses LLC | Kerrville Bus/Coach USA (Kerrville Bus) | OK TOURS, LLC (OK TOURS LLC) | Star Shuttle, Inc. |
|-------|--|---|--|---|--------------------------------------|---|--|-------------------------------|
| 75 | VENDOR REFERENCES The Bidder is to submit three (3) references that have contracted with their company to provide like products and/or services. It is recommended that the Vendor show school districts or other local government organizations equal to PSJA ISD in size and structure, if possible. Note: Failure to supply complete reference information may be grounds for bid disqualification. References provided will be checked at the sole discretion of the District. Final evaluation results will be determined based on the information provided by the references and will be in the best interest of the District. | | | | | | | |
| 76 | Company Name | Texas State technical College - Harlingen | Laredo Independent School District | Mission Veterans Memorial High School | Shands Brooks Travel | | South San I.S.D. | Please see Technical Proposal |
| 77 | Contact | Dalia Jackson - Perez | Carmen Diaz- Secretary of Athletic Director | Iris A. Falcon | Minerva Lopez | | Rosey Sandoval | |
| 78 | Business Address | 1902 N Loop 499, Harlingen, TX 78550 | 2002 San Bernardo Ave. - Laredo, TX 78040 | 700 E 2 Mile Line, Mission, TX 78574 | 730 W. Nolana #100, McAllen TX 78504 | | 5622 Ray Ellison Dr. San Antonio, TX 78242 | |
| 79 | Phone Number: | (956) 364-4502 | (956) 273-1223 | (956) 323-3100 | (956) 687-7202 | | (210) 977-7390 | |
| 80 | Fax Number: | | | (956) 323-8215 | (956) 687-2210 | | (210) 977-7394 | |
| 81 | Email Address: | dejackson-perez@tstc.edu | cdiaz@laredoisd.org | IAFalc11@mcisd.org | m.lopez@yahoo.com | | rsandova@southsanisd.net | |
| 82 | Company Name | ST. Mary's School | United Independent School District | San Benito High School | Los Fresnos High School | | United I.S.D. | Please see Technical Proposal |
| 83 | Contact | Anna Lindsey | Belinda Trevino- Athletic Department Secretary | Mr. Dayri Mendoza | Carlos Marquez | | Elizabeth Conde | |
| 84 | Business Address | 1300 Los Ebanso, Brownsville, TX 78520 | 5208 Santa Claudia - Laredo, TX 78046 | 450 S Oscar Williams Rd, San Benito, TX 78586 | PO Box 309, Los Fresnos TX 78566 | | 3501 E. Sanders Laredo, TX 78043 | |
| 85 | Phone Number: | (956) 546-1805 | (956) 473-7100 | (956) 361-6500 | (956) 367-3720 | | (956) 473-7919 | |
| 86 | Fax Number: | (956) 546-0787 | | (956) 361-6473 | (956) 233-3720 | | (956) 473-7950 | |
| 87 | Email Address: | alindsey@cdobcs.org | btrevino@uisd.net | DMendoza@sbcsid.net | cmarquez@lfcisd.net | | econde@uisd.net | |
| 88 | Company Name | Weslaco High School | Eagle Pass Independent School District | Milam Elementary | Ringgold Middle School | | North East I.S.D. | Please see Technical Proposal |
| 89 | Contact | Deanna Muniz | Raymundo Herrera- Purchasing Assistant | Patricia Garcia | Adelia Guerrero | | Terri Armstrong | |
| 90 | Business Address | 1005 W. Pike | 1420 Edison Rd. - Eagle Pass, TX 78852 | 3800 N. Main St McAllen, TX 78501 | Fort Ringgold, Rio Grande TX 78582 | | 8961 Tesoro Dr. San Antonio, TX 78217 | |
| 91 | Phone Number: | (956) 969-6856 | (830) 773-5181 x1063 | (956) 971-4333 | (956) 263-8918 | (210) 226-7371 | (210) 356-6901 | |
| 92 | Fax Number: | (956) 969-2315 | | (956) 972-5649 | (956) 716-6807 | (210) 299-1237 | | |
| 93 | Email Address: | | rherrera@eaglepassisd.net | pgarcia@mcalleisd.net | | gloria.butler@coachusa.com | tarmst3@neisd.net | |

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
CHARTER BUS SERVICES BID # 18-19-075
BID OPENING: JULY 23, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

| Responding Supplier | Signature Full Name | Signature Email | Supplier Notes |
|---|-----------------------------|-----------------------------------|-----------------------|
| Star Shuttle, Inc. | Martha Patterson | martha.wyers@starshuttle.com | |
| Escamilla Tour Buses LLC | Hector Escamilla | e-escamilla@sbcglobal.net | |
| DISCOVERY CHARTER BUSES,LLC | HEIDI Y CEPEDA DE ESCAMILLA | hcepeda@discoverycharterbuses.com | Fax # 956-797-6300 |
| All Valley Charters, LLC | Laurie Cofey | allvalleycharters@hotmail.com | |
| Kerrville Bus/Coach USA (Kerrville Bus) | Gloria Butler | gloria.butler@coachusa.com | |
| OK TOURS, LLC (OK TOURS LLC) | Marcos Sarmiento | service@oktours.com | |
| Cougar Bus Lines Ltd. | Ricardo Rodriguez Jr. | info@cougarbuslines.com | |

**PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
CHARTER BUS SERVICES BID # 18-19-075
BID OPENING: JULY 23, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.**

Participation Summary - As of 08/15/2019

| Participant Name | Response Date | Response Status | Contact | City | State | Invitation Type | Invitation Date | Owner |
|--|---------------|-----------------|------------------------------|-------------------|-------|-----------------|-----------------|------------------------------|
| All Valley Charters, LLC | 07/23/2019 | Submitted | Laurie Coffey | MCALLEN | TX | Manual | 06/24/2019 | Dwight Yoder |
| DISCOVERY CHARTER BUSES,LLC | 07/23/2019 | Submitted | Heidi Y. Cepeda de Escamilla | MCALLEN | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | Heidi Y. Cepeda de Escamilla |
| Cougar Bus Lines Ltd. | 07/22/2019 | Submitted | Ricardo Rodriguez Jr. | Laredo | TX | Manual | 06/24/2019 | Ricardo Rodriguez Jr. |
| Star Shuttle, Inc. | 07/22/2019 | Submitted | Melanie Camarillo | San Antonio | TX | | | John Walker |
| OK TOURS, LLC (OK TOURS LLC) | 07/20/2019 | Submitted | Marcos Sarmiento | SAN ANTONIO | TX | Manual | 06/24/2019 | Ana M. Sarmiento |
| Kerrville Bus/Coach USA (Kerrville Bus) | 07/02/2019 | Submitted | Gloria Butler | SAN ANTONIO | TX | Manual | 06/24/2019 | Rich Funkey |
| Escamilla Tour Buses LLC | 07/01/2019 | Submitted | Hector Escamilla | McAllen | TX | Manual | 06/24/2019 | Hector Escamilla |
| Writer | 06/21/2019 | Submitted | David Rice | Austin | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Creative Bus Sales | | Viewed | Steve Allen | Irving | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Deltek | | Viewed | Source Management | Herndon | VA | | | |
| Mercer Technologies Firm | | Viewed | Garrett Mercer | Gary | IN | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Perform America-Texas, LLC. | | Viewed | Chris Martin | Spring | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Radio Engineering Industries, Inc. (REI) | | Viewed | | Omaha | NE | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Event & Suppliers Inc. | 07/22/2019 | No Bid | Roberto Lagos | Hidalgo | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Champion Awards and Apparel | 07/11/2019 | No Bid | Juan Valdez | Weslaco | TX | | | |
| Youthlight, Inc. | 06/27/2019 | No Bid | Sandra C. McCarthy | Chapin | SC | | | |
| Trinity3 Technology | 06/21/2019 | No Bid | Kendell Rickman | Saint Paul | MN | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| All American Poly | | | | Piscataway | NJ | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| ALPHA CUSTOM SHIRTS | | | | edinburg | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Baiza and Associates Consulting, LLC | | | Melinda Baiza | Austin | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Bocci Engineering | | | Simone Williams | Houston | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Boswell Elliff Ford (L.T. Boswell Ford) | | | Robert Garcia | San Benito | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Brewster's Guacamaya Enterprises | | | Frank Brewster III | Mission | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| BURGESS FABRICS & UPHOLSTERY SUPPLIES | | | Daniel D Polewski | McAllen | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Burton Companies (Burton Companies, LLC) | | | Scott Vaughan | Weslaco | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| CHRE / Cindy Hopkins Real Estate | | | CYNTHIA HOPKINS | Harlingen | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| ConstructConnect | | | | Cincinnati | OH | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Construction Journal LLC | | | Pamela Exton | Stuart | FL | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Dannenbaum Engineering Co | | | Mirna Santana | McAllen | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Devin Distributing & Packaging Inc. | | | Sandra Salinas | Palmhurst | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Doggett Freightliner | | | Robert Burk | Pharr | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| ECOEFFECT | | | Alejandro Alanis | McAllen | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Econ Group, LLC | | | Gilbert Enriquez | Edinburg | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Elsa Auto & Truck Parts | | | Lupe Garza | Elsa | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| EXPRESS TRAVEL (EXPRESS CRUISE & TOURS | | | sofia DelToro | McAllen | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Floral Park Consulting LLC | | | | Floral Park | NY | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Franklin Covey Client Sales Inc. | | | Tom Osborn | Salt Lake City | UT | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Gallagher (Gallagher Benefit Service, Inc.) | | | | San Antonio | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Go With Jo! Travel (Go With Jo! Inc.) | | | Jonathan Kantun | Harlingen | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| GRANDE VALLEY BUILDERS,INC | | | MANUEL PEREZ | MCALLEN | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Guzman & Muñoz Engineering and Surveying | | | Jose L. Muñoz | Mercedes | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| HAZELDEN PUBLISHING (HAZELDEN BETTY F | | | HELEN ALSAID | CENTER CITY | MN | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Heavy Duty Bus Parts Inc | | | Molly Jannett | Willis | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Heinemann (Greenwood Publishing LLC) | | | Lori Lampert | Portsmouth | NH | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Hi-LoContractor LLC | | | Edmundo Carreon | Elsa | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| HP Financial Services (Hewlett Packard Finar | | | Paul Hermann | Berkeley Heights | NJ | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Hunt & Woodruff Construction Co LLC | | | Keith F. Hunt | Laguna Vista | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Insight | | | Darak Weaver | McAllen, | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Kyrish Truck Center (Santex Truck Center) | | | Kelly Jennings | San Antonio | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Library Video Company d/b/a SAFARI Monta | | | | West Conshohocken | PA | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Little Giants Learning Center | | | | Alamo | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Longhorn Bus Sales | | | Marcos Gutierrez | Houston | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Lowman Consulting LLC | | | John Lowman | Sachse | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Lydia Savedra Consulting | | | Lydia Savedra | McAllen | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Maxim Healthcare Services | | | | Tacoma | WA | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Moore Medical LLC | | | Devlin Hugh | Chicago | IL | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| MSB Consulting | | | | Austin | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Newkirk & Newkirk, Inc. | | | Pierre Newkirk | McAllen | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Ortegon Insurance Agency LLC | | | Yvonne M. Ortegon | Weslaco | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Pediatric Urgent Care | | | Brian White | Fort Worth | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Puro Aseguro Inc | | | Melba Figueroa | Pharr | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Rebecca Sanchez | | | Rebecca Sanchez | San Juan | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Red Charter Buses LLC | | | Andres Ortiz | brownsville | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Renaissance Learning | | | | Wisconsin Rapids | WI | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| RGV GUARDIAN ENTERPRISES LLC DBA DERT | | | Rick Romo | PHARR | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| RGVCM Group, Consultants & Managers (R | | | Jose A. Lopez | Edinburg | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Romo Contractors, LLC | | | Romo Contractors LLC | Laredo | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Rush Bus Centers | | | Randy McWhirter | Selma | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| RUSH TRUCK CENTER, PHARR (Rush Truck Ce | | | Mario M. Trevino | Pharr | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Say and Tell Therapy, LLC | | | | San Juan | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Schindler Elevator Corporation | | | | Corpus Christi | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Southern Tire Mart, LLC | | | Richard Conwill | Columbia | MS | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| SPIKES FORD (SPIKES MOTOR COMPANY) | | | MICHAEL RAMIREZ | MISSION | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| SRC Solutions, Inc. | | | | Center Valley | PA | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| SUMMIT SPORTSWEAR INC | | | | LEAGUE CITY | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Sylvan Learning, LLC | | | | Hunt Valley | MD | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| TCG Group Holdings (TCG Group Holdings, LI | | | | AUSTIN | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| The Certified Welding and Testing Co. | | | Richard DePue | Springville | NY | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| The College Board | | | | Austin | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Thomas Bus Gulf Coast (Thomas Bus Gulf Co | | | Harry Hughes | Houston | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Trinity Review Services, Inc | | | Johnny L. Rogers | Desoto | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Vertex Marketing | | | Dr. Sue Bayer | Stafford | TX | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |
| Virtucom, Inc. | | | Tim Prince | Peachtree Corners | GA | Automatic | 06/20/2019 | |