

**PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
 FIRE ALARM INSPECTIONS DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 18-19-073
 BID OPENING: JULY 30, 2019 @ 3:30 P.M.**

Bid Request Number	# 18-19-073 Addendum 2	Organization	PSJA ISD Ebids
Title	Fire Alarm Inspections District-Wide	Bid Creator	Emily Garza
Description		Email	emily.garza@psjaisd.us
Bid Type	Bid	Phone	
Issue Date	6/20/2019 04:50:08 PM (CT)	Fax	
Close Date	7/30/2019 03:30:00 PM (CT)		

Awarded Suppliers

Name	City	State	Classifications	Lines Awarded	Award Total	Award Reason
Superior Alarms	McAllen	TX		3	\$21,450.00	

Recommendation: That the Board of Education award the Fire Alarm Inspections District-Wide Bid # 18-19-073 to the lowest bidder as indicated below:

<u>ITEM:</u>	<u>BIDDER:</u>	<u>TOTAL:</u>
1, 2 and 3	Superior Alarms	\$21,450.00
	TOTAL:	\$21,450.00

Emily Garza, Director of Purchasing

Charge Budgeted Account Numbers: 199-51-936-9990MO-6299-00

Ninety One (91) invitations were emailed to vendors
 Nine (9) Vendors viewed Bid Specifications
 Six (6) Submitted Bid
 One (1) Unsubmitted Bid
 Four (4) No Bid

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
 FIRE ALARM INSPECTIONS DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 18-19-073
 BID OPENING: JULY 30, 2019 @ 3:30 P.M.

Line	Qty	UOM	Description	Award Response	Award Quantity	Awarded Supplier	Award Reason
1	1	EA	All City of Pharr Inspections per Ordinance No. O-2010-18	\$11,797.50	1	Superior Alarms	Low bidder price was for one location.
2	1	EA	All City of San Juan Inspections	\$5,362.50	1	Superior Alarms	Low bidder price was for one location.
3	1	EA	All City of Alamo Inspections.	\$4,290.00	1	Superior Alarms	Low bidder price was for one location.

**PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
 FIRE ALARM INSPECTIONS DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 18-19-073
 BID OPENING: JULY 30, 2019 @ 3:30 P.M.**

1	All City of Pharr Inspections per Ordinance No. O-2010-18					
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes
	Artcom Communications (Artco	1	EA	\$800.00	\$800.00	
AWARDED	Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En	1	EA	\$11,797.50	\$11,797.50	This is for 33 City of Pharr inspections per Campus Listing in Fire Alarm 18-19-073 Specifications, Ordinance, Attachmt A,B.
	ABSOLUTE Services (LMH & LM	1	EA	\$22,000.00	\$22,000.00	
	Safeguard Fire & Security	1	EA	\$28,050.00	\$28,050.00	
	Protech Security Systems (Prot	1	EA	\$30,500.00	\$30,500.00	
	TCR- The Best Alarm INC	1	EA	\$44,845.00	\$44,845.00	

2	All City of San Juan Inspections					
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes
	Artcom Communications (Artco	1	EA	\$800.00	\$800.00	
AWARDED	Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En	1	EA	\$5,362.50	\$5,362.50	This is for 15 City of San Juan inspections per Campus Listing in Fire Alarm 18-19-073 Specifications, Ordinance, Attachmt A,B.
	Safeguard Fire & Security	1	EA	\$6,375.00	\$6,375.00	
	ABSOLUTE Services (LMH & LM	1	EA	\$9,000.00	\$9,000.00	
	Protech Security Systems (Prot	1	EA	\$15,000.00	\$15,000.00	
	TCR- The Best Alarm INC	1	EA	\$20,975.00	\$20,975.00	

3	All City of Alamo Inspections.					
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes
	Artcom Communications (Artco	1	EA	\$800.00	\$800.00	
AWARDED	Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En	1	EA	\$4,290.00	\$4,290.00	This is for 12 City of Alamo inspections per Campus Listing in Fire Alarm 18-19-073 Specifications, Ordinance, Attachmt A,B.
	Safeguard Fire & Security	1	EA	\$5,525.00	\$5,525.00	
	ABSOLUTE Services (LMH & LM	1	EA	\$9,000.00	\$9,000.00	
	Protech Security Systems (Prot	1	EA	\$10,000.00	\$10,000.00	
	TCR- The Best Alarm INC	1	EA	\$16,580.00	\$16,580.00	

**PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
FIRE ALARM INSPECTIONS DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 18-19-073
BID OPENING: JULY 30, 2019 @ 3:30 P.M.**

Participation Summary - As of 08/16/2019

Participant Name	Response Date	Response Status	Contact	City	State	Invitation Type	Invitation Date	Invite Email	Owner
ABSOLUTE Services (LMH & LMH, LLC)	07/30/2019	Submitted	Larry Helgeson	McAllen	TX	Manual	06/20/2019	asmcallen1@aol.com	Larry M. Helgenson
Protech Security Systems (Protech Integration Systems, Safeguard Fire & Security)	07/30/2019	Submitted	Larry Rodriguez	Mercedes	TX				Lorenzo & Diana Rodriguez
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder Enterprises, Incorporated)	07/30/2019	Submitted	Daniel Backhaus	Mission	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	daniel@safeguardrgv.com	Jesse Rodriguez
TCR- The Best Alarm INC	07/29/2019	Submitted		McAllen	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	m.garcia@superioralarms.com	Alan Yoder
Artcom Communications (Artcom Associates)	07/25/2019	Submitted		Laredo	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	tcrcomm@sbcglobal.net	Martin Resendez
JOHNSON CONTROLS FIRE PROTECTION	06/28/2019	Submitted		San Antonio	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	ben@artcomtx.com	Lori Ann Flores
Champion Awards and Apparel		Unsubmitted	Heather Foster	ROUND ROCK	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	heather.foster@jci.com	
D. Wilson Construction (D. Wilson Construction Company)	07/11/2019	No Bid	Juan Valdez	Weslaco	TX				
Youthlight, Inc.	07/01/2019	No Bid	Norma Lerma	McAllen	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	normal@dwilsonconstruction.com	
Unipak Corp.	06/27/2019	No Bid	Sandra C. McCarthy	Chapin	SC				
Circle Industries Inc.	06/20/2019	No Bid		BROOKLYN	NY	Automatic	06/20/2019	customer@unipakcorp.net	
ConstructConnect		Viewed	Joel Hilliard	Houston	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	jhilliard@circleind.com	
Construction Journal LLC		Viewed		Cincinnati	OH	Automatic	06/20/2019	content@constructconnect.com	
Deltek		Viewed	Pamela Exton	Stuart	FL	Automatic	06/20/2019	bids@constructionjournal.com	
Dodge Data & Analytics		Viewed	Source Management	Herndon	VA				
First Line Fire Protection		Viewed		HAMILTON	NJ				
gargon power services llc (Juan Garcia)		Viewed	Daniel Huerta	San Juan	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	Firstlinefirepro@sbcglobal.net	
GEM Engineers & Contractors (Gonzalez Engineering & Vanguard IT Solutions LLC)		Viewed	Juan Garcia	san juan	TX				
1st FP McAllen, LLC		Viewed	Hugo Gonzalez	EDINBURG, TX	TX				
5 Star GC Construction LLC		Viewed	Pedro Sandoval	brownsville	TX				
Adept Facilities & Design, Inc.		Viewed	Becca Davis	San Antonio	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	pete@1stfpservices.com	
Advanced Communications & Cabling		Viewed	Peyton Oakley	Mission	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	peyton@5stargc.com	
All American Poly		Viewed		Harlingen	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	Dsm.afd@gmail.com	
Alliance Specialized Systems		Viewed	Kent Taylor	Georgetown	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	kenttaylor@ac-c.net	
ALPHA CUSTOM SHIRTS		Viewed		Piscataway	NJ	Automatic	06/20/2019	zeke@allampoly.com	
ASAP Printing Solutions (O'Conn LLC)		Viewed	Yadira Velasco	Pharr	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	ederueda@alliance-fire.com	
BM Benchmark Construction, LLC		Viewed		edinburg	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	rave96792@yahoo.com	
BOB RODRIGUEZ CONSTRUCTION, LLC		Viewed	Sean O' Connor	McAllen	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	soconnor@asapprintingsolutions.com	
Bocci Engineering		Viewed		McAllen	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	gboghs@yahoo.com	
Buffalo Construction LLC.		Viewed	TONY RODRIGUEZ	San Juan	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	tonyrod19@yahoo.com	
C&H Distributors, LLC		Viewed	Simone Williams	Houston	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	lianne.lami@bocciengineering.com	
Castcon Construction Co., LLC		Viewed	FRED GUERRA	WESLACO	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	buffaloconstruction@rgv.rr.com	
Castle Enterprises		Viewed	William Rose	Chicago	IL	Automatic	06/20/2019	governmentsales@chdistgov.com	
Celso Gonzalez Construction		Viewed	Robert Castaneda, Jr.	Mission	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	bc@castconconstruction.com	
Centennial Contractors Enterprises		Viewed	Yvonne Gonzalez	Monte Alto	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	Yvonne.CastleEnterprises@gmail.com	
Centennial Contractors Enterprises, Inc.		Viewed	Celso Gonzalez	Mission	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	cg@cgc-inc.com	
Center Stone Services		Viewed	Rebecca Hollies	Reston	VA	Automatic	06/20/2019	rhollies@cce-inc.com	
Construction Bid Source (Plan Room)		Viewed	Rebecca Hollies	Reston	VA	Automatic	06/20/2019	rhollies@cce-inc.com	
Continental Refrigeration		Viewed		Weslaco	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	ftirado.css@gmail.com	
Core Business Solutions/ UBEO Company (UBEO LCC)		Viewed	Andres Canales Jr.	Edinburg	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	pgibson@constructionbidsource.com	
Devin Distributing & Packaging Inc.		Viewed	Baldomero Gonzalez	Pharr	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	contref7@aol.com	
Discount Two-Way Radio Corporation		Viewed	Sandra Salinas	Palmhurst	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	publicsector@cbs-tx.com	
ECOEFFECT		Viewed	Stoyan Varbanov	Compton	CA	Automatic	06/20/2019	asalinas@devindpi.com	
Econ Group, LLC		Viewed	Alejandro Alanis	McAllen	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	govsales@dtwr.com	
F J W		Viewed	Gilbert Enriquez	Edinburg	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	alex@ecoeffectedesignbuild.com	
G&G Contractors (RG Enterprises, LLC)		Viewed	Jeanne Baker	McAllen	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	jenriquez@econgroup.us	
GALLS, LLC		Viewed		Edinb	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	jbaker@broaddusconstruction.com	
General contractor/Construction (Davila Construction Inc)		Viewed		Chicago	IL	Automatic	06/20/2019	irma.gandgcontractors@gmail.com	
Gerlach Builders LLC dba WIL-CON		Viewed	Tommy Canul	Pharr	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	brewer-tiffany@galls.com	
GNH Company, LLC		Viewed	Airika Stevens	Edinburg	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	tommy@davilaconstruction.com	
Go UnderGround		Viewed	Javier Hernandez	Alamo	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	airika@wil-con.com	
GRANDE VALLEY BUILDERS,INC		Viewed		harlingen	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	jhernandez@gnhcompany.com	
Hi-LoContractor LLC		Viewed	MANUEL PEREZ	MCALLEN	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	goexcavate@yahoo.com	
Holchemont, Ltd.		Viewed	Edmundo Carreon	Elsa	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	mpgvb@aol.com	
Holzberg Communications, Inc.		Viewed	Annette Carmona	McAllen	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	hilocontractor2018@gmail.com	
Home Design Center (V&L ENTERPRISES, LLC)		Viewed	Andy Holzberg	Totowa	NJ	Automatic	06/20/2019	a.carmona@holchemont.com	
Hunt & Woodruff Construction Co LLC		Viewed	Victor Cantu	McAllen	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	holzberg@juno.com	
Insight		Viewed	Keith F. Hunt	Laguna Vista	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	hdcrgv@gmail.com	
J Pena Construction Ltd		Viewed	Darak Weaver	McAllen,	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	javier.huntwoodruff@gmail.com	
Lexine Inc		Viewed	Jose Pena	McAllen	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	darak.weaver@insight.com	
Little Giants Learning Center		Viewed	Frank Martinez	McAllen	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	ids@jpenaconstruction.com	
Mid Valley Paving, Inc.		Viewed		Alamo	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	anna@lexinegroup.com	
MJR EDUCATIONAL SUPPLIES		Viewed	William R. Mize	MERCEDES	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	littlegiantsalamo@gmail.com	
Mobile Crane & Rigging, LLC		Viewed		Houston	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	billmize@midvalleypaving.com	
Moore Medical LLC		Viewed	Marty Leal	Pharr	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	merrydas@hotmail.com	
Mor-Wil, L.L.C		Viewed	Devlin Hugh	Chicago	IL	Automatic	06/20/2019	marty@mobilecraneservices.com	
Netsync Network Solutions		Viewed	Albert Garza III	Mission	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	government.bids@mckesson.com	
Noble Texas Builders		Viewed	Xavier Trevino	McAllen	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	albert.garza03@yahoo.com	
OMA INDUSTRIES, LLC		Viewed		La Feria	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	xtrevino@netsyncnetwork.com	
Peacock General Contractor		Viewed	Lucia Valdez	HARLINGEN	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	jose.castro@nobletx.net	
Performance Safety Group I, LP		Viewed	Kerry McBride	Harlingen	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	luciavaldez@omaindustries.com	
Phynx Fire & Security		Viewed	Drew Allrich	St. Louis	MO	Automatic	06/20/2019	kkmcbride@hotmail.com	
Protegis Fire & Safety LLC (Protegis Holdings, LLC)		Viewed	ROY OLIVAREZ	San Juan	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	GOVT@PSGgear.com	
RCA Building Materials Inc.		Viewed	Naticia Porche	LOUISVILLE	KY	Automatic	06/20/2019	rolivarez@phynxfire.com	
REFCO (R E Friedrichs Company)		Viewed	Gustavo Rea	Pharr	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	nporche@protegis.com	
RENOWORKS, LLC		Viewed	Vicki Delgado	McAllen	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	rcabuildingm@yahoo.com	
RGVCM Group, Consultants & Managers (RGVCM Group)		Viewed		Edinburg	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	connor@refco.ws	
Rigney Construction, LLC		Viewed	Jose A. Lopez	Edinburg	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	renoworksfs@gmail.com	
Rio Grande Valley Chapter Associated General Contractors, LLC		Viewed	John Rigney	Edinburg	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	jal@rgvcmgroup.com	
saenz brothers construction		Viewed	Perry A. Vaughn	Harlingen	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	rigneyconstruction@gmail.com	
SCOGGINS CONSTRUCTION CO., INC.		Viewed	Romo Contractors LLC	Laredo	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	sanjuana@rgvagc.org	
SERVICE SHADE SHOP (YBARRA GROUP, INC)		Viewed	Fernando Saenz	Laredo	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	sara@romocontractors.com	
SHI international		Viewed	Jeffrey Scoggins	Donna	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	saenzbrothers@yahoo.com	
Spoor Engineering Consultants, Inc. (Spoor)		Viewed		Harlingen	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	saenzbrothers@yahoo.com	
Strongline Security & Fire (Luis Alfonso Grimaldo DBA SI)		Viewed		SAN ANTONIO	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	jeff@scogginsconstruction.com	
Synergy Builders of Texas		Viewed		Austin	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	SERVICESHAD@MSN.COM	
Texas First Rentals LLC (BD HOLT CO)		Viewed		McAllen	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	valerie_soja@shi.com	
		Viewed		McAllen	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	sec@spooreng.com	
		Viewed		San Juan	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	stronglinesnf@gmail.com	
		Viewed	Dagoberto Perez Jr	Edinburg	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	estimating@synergybuildersoftexas.com	
		Viewed		Dallas	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	angela.graf@holtcat.com	

**PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
 FIRE ALARM INSPECTIONS DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 18-19-073
 BID OPENING: JULY 30, 2019 @ 3:30 P.M.**

Participation Summary - As of 08/16/2019

<u>Participant Name</u>	<u>Response Date</u>	<u>Response Status</u>	<u>Contact</u>	<u>City</u>	<u>State</u>	<u>Invitation Type</u>	<u>Invitation Date</u>	<u>Invite Email</u>	<u>Owner</u>
Tri-Gen Construction L.L.C.			Sara Alicia Orta	McAllen	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	trigensara@gmail.com	
UNIVERSAL FIRE SYSTEMS			HENRY CHAVES JR	WESLACO	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	henry@universalfiresystems.com	
ValTex (Figuroa & Sons, Inc.)			Felipe Lopez	McAllen	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	flopez@valtexinc.com	
VCI Builders, Inc.			Joe Arredondo	MISSION	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	joe@vcibuilders.com	
Venser Contractors LLC				Ediburg	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	jvrvento@aol.com	
Vertex Marketing			Dr. Sue Bayer	Stafford	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	vertexmarketingtx@gmail.com	
Virtual Builders Exchange			Jeannette Olguin	SAN ANTONIO	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	jeannette@virtualbx.com	
Visceral Illumination Code LLC (VISCERAL ILLUMINATION)				Edinburg	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	brandy@vicsight.com	
WINDSHIELDS XPRESS (JUAN CARLOS ISASI)			JUAN CARLOS ISASI	PHARR	TX	Automatic	06/20/2019	windshieldsxpress@yahoo.com	

External Invitations

<u>Invite Email</u>	<u>Auto Approve</u>	<u>Invitation Date</u>	<u>Status</u>	<u>Status Date</u>
odette@alliedfireprotection.com	Yes	06/20/2019	Invitation Sent	06/20/2019
ld@totalprotection.com	Yes	06/20/2019	Invitation Sent	06/20/2019
lswift@knightsecurity.com	Yes	06/20/2019	Invitation Sent	06/20/2019
buyboard@superioralarms.com	Yes	06/20/2019	Invitation Sent	06/20/2019
dotry@txfireinc.com	Yes	06/20/2019	Invitation Sent	06/20/2019
annette.thompson@jci.com	Yes	06/20/2019	Invitation Sent	06/20/2019
chris@alliedsecuritylinks.com	Yes	06/20/2019	Invitation Sent	06/20/2019
ben@artcomtx.com	Yes	06/20/2019	Invitation Sent	06/20/2019
wgandy@silsonfire.com	Yes	06/20/2019	Invitation Sent	06/20/2019
bdunn@myshield.org	Yes	06/20/2019	Invitation Sent	06/20/2019
sales@sts360.com	Yes	06/20/2019	Invitation Sent	06/20/2019
ernests@jpmcomm.com	Yes	06/20/2019	Invitation Sent	06/20/2019
cekonomakis@blti.com	Yes	06/20/2019	Invitation Sent	06/20/2019
dee@trianglecomputer.com	Yes	06/20/2019	Invitation Sent	06/20/2019
bborders@entechsales.com	Yes	06/20/2019	Invitation Sent	06/20/2019