PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO 1.S.D.
SECURITY CAMERAS AND RELATED MATERIALS BID # 18-19-062
BID OPENING: MAY 6, 2019 @ 3:00 P.M.

Bid Request Number # 18-19-062 Organization PSJA ISD Ebids

Title SECURITY CAMERAS AND RELATED MATERIALS Bid Creator Monique Richie

Description Email monique.richie@psjaisd.us

Bid Type Bid Phone

Issue Date 4/17/2019 01:26:59 PM (CT) Fax

Close Date 5/6/2019 03:00:00 PM (CT)

Awarded Suppliers

[Name [City |State |Classifications Lines Awarded Award Total Award Reason

Netsync Network Solutions McAllen X 26 $19,388.95

Visceral Illumination Code LLC Edinburg X 3 $243,525.00

RECOMMENDATION: That the Board of Education award the Security Cameras and Related Materials Bid # 18-19-062 to the lowest bidder as indicated below:
ITEMS SUPPLIES: TOTAL:

3,5,6,7,8,9,10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, Netwync Network Solutions $19,388.95

16,17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24, 25,
26, 27,28 and 29

1,2and 4 Visceral Illumination Code LLC $243,525.00

TOTAL: $262,913.95

Emily Garza, Director of Purchasing

Account Number: Various accounts district-wide

Nineteen (19) Vendors viewed Bid Specifications
Seven (7) Submitted Bid

Five (5) Vendors NO BID

Zero (0) Non-responsive/Non-conforming
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO 1.5.D.

SECURITY CAMERAS AND RELATED MATERIALS BID # 18-19-062

BID OPENING: MAY 6, 2019 @ 3:00 P.M.

|Line Qty UOM Description

|Award Response | Award Qty | Awarded Supplier

Award Reason
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EA
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EA
EA

EA
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EA
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Interior Cameras for Elementary Schools

Exterior Cameras for Elementary Schools

2N Helios - Access Control

Security Cameras for Collegiate Academies

Network Drop

Milestone License

Camera Installation

Axis P3227-LV

Axis P3227-LVE

Axis T94T01D Pendant Kit

Axis T91E61 Wall Mount

Axis P3717-PLE (Hallway Intersection - multiple
lenses)

Axis T94N01D Pendant Kit (for Axis P3717-PLE)

Axis T91B51 Ceiling Mount (for Axis P3717-PLE)

Axis P1448-LE (High Resolution Entrances and

reception area)
Axis Q6125-LE PTZ (Infrared)

Axis T91L61 Wall and Pole Mount (for Axis Q6125-

LE PTZ infrared)
Axis T8134 60 W Midspan (for Axis Q6125-LE PTZ
infrared)

Axis P5635-E Mk Il PTZ (with audio)

Axis T91L61 Wall and Pole Mount

2N IP Force - 2 buttons & HD camera (card reader
ready) & 10W speaker (Part # 01340-001)

2N IP Card Reader 125 kHz (suitable for 2N IP Force

$104,375.00 1

$56,500.00 1

$9,139.20 1 Netsync Network Solutions

$82,650.00 1

only) it includes Wiegand interface, 2 logical inputs,

1 relay, 1 active output and tamper switch (Part #
01344-001)
2N IP Intercom Security Relay (Part # 01386-001)

2N IP Base (Part #01357-001)

2N IP Base 125 KHz card Reader (Part # 01358-001)

2N IP Base Backplate (Part# 01360-01)
Altronics Power Supply

Door Strike

Installation of all components

$185.50 1 Netsync Network Solutions
$275.30 1 Netsync Network Solutions
$117.45 1 Netsync Network Solutions
$550.50 1 Netsync Network Solutions
$636.00 1 Netsync Network Solutions
$35.70 1 Netsync Network Solutions
$27.80 1 Netsync Network Solutions
$952.00 1 Netsync Network Solutions
$72.30 1 Netsync Network Solutions
$85.90 1 Netsync Network Solutions
$670.60 1 Netsync Network Solutions
$2,114.70 1 Netsync Network Solutions
$71.10 1 Netsync Network Solutions
$107.00 1 Netsync Network Solutions
$1,411.70 1 Netsync Network Solutions
$71.10 1 Netsync Network Solutions
$968.70 1 Netsync Network Solutions
$95.90 1 Netsync Network Solutions
$82.90 1 Netsync Network Solutions
$490.30 1 Netsync Network Solutions
$67.90 1 Netsync Network Solutions
$45.60 1 Netsync Network Solutions
$103.60 1 Netsync Network Solutions
$416.20 1 Netsync Network Solutions
$594.00 1 Netsync Network Solutions
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Visceral Illumination Code LLC The low bidder Lexine Inc. was asked for clarification on their

proposal and they did not respond by the district's established
deadline.

Visceral Illumination Code LLC The low bidder Lexine Inc. was asked for clarification on their

proposal and they did not respond by the district's established
deadline.
BridgeNet Communications did not bid on all items or the installation.

Visceral lllumination Code LLC The low bidder Lexine Inc. was asked for clarification on their

proposal and they did not respond by the district's established
deadline.

Netsync had the lowest price on major items in this grouping and the
sub-items need to be awarded to the same vendor for facilitation of
installation and warranty on the whole systems.

Netsync had the lowest price on major items in this grouping and the
sub-items need to be awarded to the same vendor for facilitation of
installation and warranty on the whole systems.

Netsync had the lowest price on major items in this grouping and the
sub-items need to be awarded to the same vendor for facilitation of
installation and warranty on the whole systems.

Netsync had the lowest price on major items in this grouping and the
sub-items need to be awarded to the same vendor for facilitation of
installation and warranty on the whole systems.

Netsync had the lowest price on major items in this grouping and the
sub-items need to be awarded to the same vendor for facilitation of
installation and warranty on the whole systems.

Netsync had the lowest price on major items in this grouping and the
sub-items need to be awarded to the same vendor for facilitation of
installation and warranty on the whole systems.

Netsync had the lowest price on major items in this grouping and the
sub-items need to be awarded to the same vendor for facilitation of
installation and warranty on the whole systems.

Netsync had the lowest price on major items in this grouping and the
sub-items need to be awarded to the same vendor for facilitation of
installation and warranty on the whole systems.

Netsync had the lowest price on major items in this grouping and the
sub-items need to be awarded to the same vendor for facilitation of
installation and warranty on the whole systems.

Netsync had the lowest price on major items in this grouping and the
sub-items need to be awarded to the same vendor for facilitation of
installation and warranty on the whole systems.

Netsync had the lowest price on major items in this grouping and the
sub-items need to be awarded to the same vendor for facilitation of
installation and warranty on the whole systems.



PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
SECURITY CAMERAS AND RELATED MATERIALS BID # 18-19-062
BID OPENING: MAY 6, 2019 @ 3:00 P.M.

| 1 |Interior Cameras for Elementary Schools

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Lexine Inc 1 EA $69,371.25 $69,371.25
Visceral lllumination Code LLC (1 EA $104,375.00 $104,375.00
Netsync Network Solutions 1 EA $141,093.75 $141,093.75
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 1 EA $148,825.00 $148,825.00 Data Network including POE Switches with
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 1 EA $160,117.50 $160,117.50
BridgeNet Communications, LL( 1 EA $169,388.75 $169,388.75
Xtreme Security & Alarm 1 EA $210,250.00 $210,250.00
| 1.1 |Mi|estone License
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Visceral lllumination Code LLC (125  EA $35.00 $4,375.00
Lexine Inc 125 EA $135.00 $16,875.00
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 125 EA $241.20 $30,150.00 Milestone Part #XPCODL. This is device lice
Netsync Network Solutions 125 EA $275.30 $34,412.50
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 125 EA $335.00 $41,875.00
BridgeNet Communications, LL1 125  EA $337.53 $42,191.25
Xtreme Security & Alarm 125 EA $361.00 $45,125.00
| 1.2 |Network Drop
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Visceral lllumination Code LLC (125  EA $75.00 $9,375.00
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 125 EA $175.00 $21,875.00
Lexine Inc 125 EA $175.00 $21,875.00
BridgeNet Communications, LL1 125  EA $185.00 $23,125.00
Netsync Network Solutions 125 EA $185.50 $23,187.50
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 125 EA $206.74 $25,842.50 Includes CAT6 Plenum Cable, Jacks, 5' Patc
Xtreme Security & Alarm 125 EA $408.00 $51,000.00
[ 1.3 [Axis P3227-Lv
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Lexine Inc 125 EA $69.97 $8,746.25
Netsync Network Solutions 125 EA $550.50 $68,812.50
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 125 EA $654.88 $81,860.00 Axis Model #P3227-LVMounted on ceiling
Visceral lllumination Code LLC (125  EA $670.00 $83,750.00
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 125 EA $695.94 $86,992.50
Xtreme Security & Alarm 125 EA $733.00 $91,625.00
BridgeNet Communications, LLI125  EA $767.58 $95,947.50
| 1.4 |Installation
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Visceral lllumination Code LLC (125  EA $55.00 $6,875.00
BridgeNet Communications, LL1125  EA $65.00 $8,125.00
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 125 EA $75.00 $9,375.00
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 125 EA $87.78 $10,972.50 Includes installation for items 1.1 - 1.4
Netsync Network Solutions 125 EA $117.45 $14,681.25
Lexine Inc 125 EA $175.00 $21,875.00
Xtreme Security & Alarm 125 EA $180.00 $22,500.00
| 2 |Exterior Cameras for Elementary Schools
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Lexine Inc 1 EA $29,650.00 $29,650.00
Visceral lllumination Code LLC (1 EA $56,500.00 $56,500.00
Netsync Network Solutions 1 EA $63,887.50 $63,887.50
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 1 EA $70,091.00 $70,091.00 Data Network including POE Switches with
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 1 EA $77,229.50 $77,229.50
BridgeNet Communications, LL( 1 EA $79,002.50 $79,002.50
Xtreme Security & Alarm 1 EA $94,050.00 $94,050.00
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SECURITY CAMERAS AND RELATED MATERIALS BID # 18-19-062

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.

BID OPENING: MAY 6, 2019 @ 3:00 P.M.

| 2.1 |Mi|estone License

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Visceral lllumination Code LLC ( 50 EA $35.00 $1,750.00
Lexine Inc 50 EA $135.00 $6,750.00
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 50 EA $241.20 $12,060.00 Milestone Part #XPCODL. This is device lice
Netsync Network Solutions 50 EA $275.30 $13,765.00
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 50 EA $335.00 $16,750.00
BridgeNet Communications, LLI 50 EA $337.53 $16,876.50
Xtreme Security & Alarm 50 EA $361.00 $18,050.00
| 2.2 |Network Drop
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Visceral lllumination Code LLC ( 50 EA $75.00 $3,750.00
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 50 EA $175.00 $8,750.00
Lexine Inc 50 EA $175.00 $8,750.00
BridgeNet Communications, LLI 50 EA $185.00 $9,250.00
Netsync Network Solutions 50 EA $185.50 $9,275.00
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 50 EA $207.13 $10,356.50 Includes CAT6 Plenum Cable, Jacks, 5' Patc
Xtreme Security & Alarm 50 EA $408.00 $20,400.00
| 2.3 [Axis P3227-LVE
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Lexine Inc 50 EA $59.00 $2,950.00
Netsync Network Solutions 50 EA $636.00 $31,800.00
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 50 EA $755.76 $37,788.00 Axis Model #P3227-LVE
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 50 EA $799.15 $39,957.50
Xtreme Security & Alarm 50 EA $847.00 $42,350.00
BridgeNet Communications, LL( 50 EA $885.82 $44,291.00
Visceral lllumination Code LLC ( 50 EA $890.00 $44,500.00
| 2.4 [Axis T94T01D Pendant Kit
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Netsync Network Solutions 50 EA $35.70 $1,785.00
Visceral lllumination Code LLC ( 50 EA $40.00 $2,000.00
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 50 EA $41.19 $2,059.50 Axis Model #T94T01D
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 50 EA $44.40 $2,220.00
Xtreme Security & Alarm 50 EA $48.00 $2,400.00
BridgeNet Communications, LL( 50 EA $48.28 $2,414.00
Lexine Inc 50 EA $49.00 $2,450.00
[ 2.5 [Axis T91E61 Wall Mount
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Lexine Inc 50 EA No Bid
Netsync Network Solutions 50 EA $27.80 $1,390.00
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 50 EA $32.79 $1,639.50 Axis Model #T91E61
Visceral lllumination Code LLC ( 50 EA $35.00 $1,750.00
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 50 EA $36.04 $1,802.00
Xtreme Security & Alarm 50 EA $37.00 $1,850.00
BridgeNet Communications, LLI 50 EA $38.42 $1,921.00
| 2.6 |Insta|lation
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Visceral lllumination Code LLC (50 EA $55.00 $2,750.00
BridgeNet Communications, LLI 50 EA $85.00 $4,250.00
Netsync Network Solutions 50 EA $117.45 $5,872.50
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 50 EA $123.75 $6,187.50 Includes installation for items 2.1- 2.6
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 50 EA $155.00 $7,750.00
Lexine Inc 50 EA $175.00 $8,750.00
Xtreme Security & Alarm 50 EA $180.00 $9,000.00
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
SECURITY CAMERAS AND RELATED MATERIALS BID # 18-19-062
BID OPENING: MAY 6, 2019 @ 3:00 P.M.

| 3 |2N Helios - Access Control

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
BridgeNet Communications, LL( 1 EA $7,607.56 $7,607.56

Netsync Network Solutions 1 EA $9,139.20 $9,139.20

INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 1 EA $9,401.28 $9,401.28

Lexine Inc 1 EA $11,138.04 $11,138.04

Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 1 EA $11,234.72 $11,234.72 Data Network including POE Switches with

Visceral lllumination Code LLC (1 EA $11,660.00 $11,660.00

Xtreme Security & Alarm 1 EA $12,748.00 $12,748.00

| 3.1 |2N IP Force - 2 buttons & HD camera (card reader ready) & 10W speaker (Part # 01340-001)

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Netsync Network Solutions 4 EA $968.70 $3,874.80

Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 4 EA $1,194.53 $4,778.12 2N Part #01340-001

INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 4 EA $1,207.20 $4,828.80

Visceral lllumination Code LLC (4 EA $1,230.00 $4,920.00

BridgeNet Communications, LL(4 EA $1,295.72 $5,182.88

Lexine Inc 4 EA $1,315.00 $5,260.00

Xtreme Security & Alarm 4 EA $1,368.00 $5,472.00

| 3.2 |Network Drop

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Visceral lllumination Code LLC (4 EA $55.00 $220.00
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 4 EA $175.00 $700.00
Lexine Inc 4 EA $175.00 $700.00
BridgeNet Communications, LL( 4 EA $185.00 $740.00
Netsync Network Solutions 4 EA $185.50 $742.00
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 4 EA $208.11 $832.44 Includes CAT6 Plenum Cable, Jacks, 5' Patc
Xtreme Security & Alarm 4 EA $408.00 $1,632.00
33 2N IP Card Reader 125 kHz (suitable for 2N IP Force only) it includes Wiegand interface, 2 logical inputs, 1 relay, 1 active output and tamper switch (Part
#01344-001)
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Netsync Network Solutions 4 EA $95.90 $383.60
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 4 EA $115.37 $461.48 2N Part #01344-001
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 4 EA $117.35 $469.40
BridgeNet Communications, LL( 4 EA $125.14 $500.56
Lexine Inc 4 EA $127.00 $508.00
Xtreme Security & Alarm 4 EA $133.00 $532.00
Visceral lllumination Code LLC (4 EA $135.00 $540.00

[ 3.4 [2N 1P Intercom Security Relay (Part # 01386-001)

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Netsync Network Solutions 4 EA $82.90 $331.60

Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 4 EA $99.92 $399.68 2N Part #01386-001

INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 4 EA $101.64 $406.56

BridgeNet Communications, LL( 4 EA $108.38 $433.52

Xtreme Security & Alarm 4 EA $115.00 $460.00

Visceral lllumination Code LLC (4 EA $115.00 $460.00

Lexine Inc 4 EA $158.81 $635.24

| 3.5 |AItronics Power Supply

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Xtreme Security & Alarm 4 EA $92.00 $368.00

Netsync Network Solutions 4 EA $103.60 $414.40

Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 4 EA $105.72 $422.88 Altronix Part #AL-176UL

Visceral lllumination Code LLC (4 EA $130.00 $520.00

BridgeNet Communications, LL(4 EA $187.65 $750.60

INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 4 EA $311.13 $1,244.52

Lexine Inc 4 EA $706.70 $2,826.80
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SECURITY CAMERAS AND RELATED MATERIALS BID # 18-19-062

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.

BID OPENING: MAY 6, 2019 @ 3:00 P.M.

| 3.6 |Door Strike

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
BridgeNet Communications, LL(4 EA No Bid
Lexine Inc 4 EA $127.00 $508.00
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 4 EA $158.00 $632.00
Netsync Network Solutions 4 EA $416.20 $1,664.80
Visceral lllumination Code LLC (4 EA $500.00 $2,000.00
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 4 EA $507.40 $2,029.60 Von Duprin Part #6300-S024-EB
Xtreme Security & Alarm 4 EA $591.00 $2,364.00
| 3.7 |Insta|lation of all components
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
BridgeNet Communications, LL(4 EA No Bid
Lexine Inc 4 EA $175.00 $700.00
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 4 EA $280.00 $1,120.00
Netsync Network Solutions 4 EA $432.00 $1,728.00
Xtreme Security & Alarm 4 EA $480.00 $1,920.00
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 4 EA $577.63 $2,310.52 Includes installation of items 3.1 - 3.7
Visceral lllumination Code LLC (4 EA $750.00 $3,000.00
| 4 |Security Cameras for Collegiate Academies
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Lexine Inc 1 EA $37,162.32 $37,162.32
Visceral lllumination Code LLC (1 EA $82,650.00 $82,650.00
Netsync Network Solutions 1 EA $94,327.50 $94,327.50
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 1 EA $100,348.58 $100,348.58 Data Network including POE Switches with
BridgeNet Communications, LL( 1 EA $117,778.06 $117,778.06
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 1 EA $118,457.06 $118,457.06
Xtreme Security & Alarm 1 EA $127,318.00 $127,318.00
| 4.1 |Mi|estone License
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Visceral lllumination Code LLC (94 EA $35.00 $3,290.00
Lexine Inc 94 EA $135.00 $12,690.00
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 94 EA $241.20 $22,672.80 Milestone Part #XPCODL. This is device lice
Netsync Network Solutions 94 EA $275.30 $25,878.20
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 94 EA $335.00 $31,490.00
BridgeNet Communications, LL( 94 EA $337.53 $31,727.82
Xtreme Security & Alarm 94 EA $361.00 $33,934.00
| 4.2 [Axis P3227-LVE
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Lexine Inc 38 EA $59.00 $2,242.00
Netsync Network Solutions 38 EA $636.00 $24,168.00
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 38 EA $755.76 $28,718.88 Axis Model #P3227-LVE
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 38 EA $799.15 $30,367.70
Xtreme Security & Alarm 38 EA $847.00 $32,186.00
BridgeNet Communications, LLI 38 EA $885.82 $33,661.16
Visceral lllumination Code LLC (38 EA $890.00 $33,820.00
| 4.3 [AXIS T94T01D Pendant Kit
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Netsync Network Solutions 38 EA $35.70 $1,356.60
Visceral lllumination Code LLC ( 38 EA $40.00 $1,520.00
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 38 EA $41.19 $1,565.22 Axis Part #T94T01D
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 38 EA $44.40 $1,687.20
Xtreme Security & Alarm 38 EA $48.00 $1,824.00
BridgeNet Communications, LLI 38 EA $48.28 $1,834.64
Lexine Inc 38 EA $49.00 $1,862.00
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
SECURITY CAMERAS AND RELATED MATERIALS BID # 18-19-062
BID OPENING: MAY 6, 2019 @ 3:00 P.M.

| 4.4 |AXIS T91E61 Wall Mount

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Lexine Inc 38 EA No Bid
Netsync Network Solutions 38 EA $27.80 $1,056.40
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 38 EA $32.79 $1,246.02 Axis Part #T91E61
Visceral lllumination Code LLC (38 EA $35.00 $1,330.00
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 38 EA $36.04 $1,369.52
Xtreme Security & Alarm 38 EA $37.00 $1,406.00
BridgeNet Communications, LLI 38 EA $38.42 $1,459.96
| 4.5 [Axis P3227-LV
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Lexine Inc 56 EA $69.97 $3,918.32
Netsync Network Solutions 56 EA $550.50 $30,828.00
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 56 EA $654.88 $36,673.28 Axis Part #P3227-LV. Mounted on ceiling g
Visceral lllumination Code LLC (56 EA $670.00 $37,520.00
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 56 EA $695.94 $38,972.64
Xtreme Security & Alarm 56 EA $733.00 $41,048.00
BridgeNet Communications, LLI 56 EA $767.58 $42,984.48
| 4.6 |Insta|lation
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Visceral lllumination Code LLC ( 94 EA $55.00 $5,170.00
BridgeNet Communications, LL 94 EA $65.00 $6,110.00
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 94 EA $100.77 $9,472.38 Includes installation of items 4.1 - 4.6. Iten
Netsync Network Solutions 94 EA $117.45 $11,040.30
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 94 EA $155.00 $14,570.00
Lexine Inc 94 EA $175.00 $16,450.00
Xtreme Security & Alarm 94 EA $180.00 $16,920.00
| 5 |Network Drop
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Visceral lllumination Code LLC (1 EA $55.00 $55.00
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 1 EA $175.00 $175.00
Lexine Inc 1 EA $175.00 $175.00
BridgeNet Communications, LL( 1 EA $185.00 $185.00
Netsync Network Solutions 1 EA $185.50 $185.50
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 1 EA $212.98 $212.98 Includes CAT6 Plenum Cable, Jacks, 5' Patc
Xtreme Security & Alarm 1 EA $408.00 $408.00
| 6 |Mi|estone License
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Visceral lllumination Code LLC (1 EA $35.00 $35.00
Lexine Inc 1 EA $135.00 $135.00
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 1 EA $157.84 $157.84
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 1 EA $241.20 $241.20 Milestone Part #XPCODLThis is device licer
Netsync Network Solutions 1 EA $275.30 $275.30
BridgeNet Communications, LL( 1 EA $337.53 $337.53
Xtreme Security & Alarm 1 EA $361.00 $361.00
| 7 |Camera Installation
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes / Alternate Description  Manufacturer Manuf Num
BridgeNet Communications, LL( 1 EA $65.00 $65.00
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 1 EA $75.00 $75.00 Does not include camera mounts or cable
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 1 EA $75.00 $75.00
Netsync Network Solutions 1 EA $117.45 $117.45
Visceral lllumination Code LLC (1 EA $120.00 $120.00
i[ALT1] INNOVAERA INC DBASU 1 EA $155.00 $155.00 The above price is for an indoor camera bt
Lexine Inc 1 EA $175.00 $175.00
Xtreme Security & Alarm 1 EA $180.00 $180.00
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
SECURITY CAMERAS AND RELATED MATERIALS BID # 18-19-062
BID OPENING: MAY 6, 2019 @ 3:00 P.M.

| 8 |Axis P3227-Lv

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Lexine Inc 1 EA $69.97 $69.97
Netsync Network Solutions 1 EA $550.50 $550.50
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 1 EA $654.88 $654.88 Axis Part #P3227-LVNo installation include
Visceral lllumination Code LLC (1 EA $670.00 $670.00
BridgeNet Communications, LL( 1 EA $689.80 $689.80
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 1 EA $695.94 $695.94
Xtreme Security & Alarm 1 EA $733.00 $733.00
| 9 [Axis P3227-LVE
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Lexine Inc 1 EA $59.00 $59.00
Netsync Network Solutions 1 EA $636.00 $636.00
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 1 EA $755.76 $755.76 Axis Part #P3227-LVENo installation includ
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 1 EA $799.15 $799.15
Xtreme Security & Alarm 1 EA $847.00 $847.00
BridgeNet Communications, LL( 1 EA $885.82 $885.82
Visceral lllumination Code LLC (1 EA $890.00 $890.00
| 10 [Axis T94T01D Pendant Kit
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Netsync Network Solutions 1 EA $35.70 $35.70
Visceral lllumination Code LLC (1 EA $40.00 $40.00
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 1 EA $41.19 $41.19 Axis T94TO1DNo installation included.
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 1 EA $44.40 $44.40
Xtreme Security & Alarm 1 EA $48.00 $48.00
BridgeNet Communications, LL( 1 EA $48.28 $48.28
Lexine Inc 1 EA $49.00 $49.00
[ 11 [Axis T91E61 Wall Mount
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Lexine Inc 1 EA No Bid
Netsync Network Solutions 1 EA $27.80 $27.80
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 1 EA $32.79 $32.79 Axis Part #T91E61No installation included.
Visceral lllumination Code LLC (1 EA $35.00 $35.00
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 1 EA $36.04 $36.04
Xtreme Security & Alarm 1 EA $37.00 $37.00
BridgeNet Communications, LL( 1 EA $38.42 $38.42
| 12 |Axis P3717-PLE (Hallway Intersection - multiple lenses)
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Netsync Network Solutions 1 EA $952.00 $952.00
Visceral lllumination Code LLC (1 EA $1,050.00 $1,050.00
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 1 EA $1,134.05 $1,134.05 Axis Part #P3717-PLENo installation includ
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 1 EA $1,199.00 $1,199.00
BridgeNet Communications, LL( 1 EA $1,329.22 $1,329.22
Lexine Inc 1 EA $1,349.00 $1,349.00
Xtreme Security & Alarm 1 EA $1,414.00 $1,414.00
| 13 [Axis T94N01D Pendant Kit (for Axis P3717-PLE)
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Xtreme Security & Alarm 1 EA $48.00 $48.00
Netsync Network Solutions 1 EA $72.30 $72.30
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 1 EA $74.82 $74.82 Axis Part #T94N01DNo installation include
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 1 EA $80.40 $80.40
BridgeNet Communications, LL( 1 EA $87.70 $87.70
Lexine Inc 1 EA $89.00 $89.00
Visceral lllumination Code LLC (1 EA $200.00 $200.00
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
SECURITY CAMERAS AND RELATED MATERIALS BID # 18-19-062
BID OPENING: MAY 6, 2019 @ 3:00 P.M.

| 14 |Axis T91B51 Ceiling Mount (for Axis P3717-PLE)

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Netsync Network Solutions 1 EA $85.90 $85.90
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 1 EA $99.54 $99.54
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 1 EA $100.04 $100.04 Axis Part #T91B51No installation included.
BridgeNet Communications, LL( 1 EA $117.25 $117.25
Lexine Inc 1 EA $119.00 $119.00
Visceral lllumination Code LLC (1 EA $120.00 $120.00
Xtreme Security & Alarm 1 EA $125.00 $125.00
| 15 |Axis P1448-LE (High Resolution Entrances and reception area)
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Netsync Network Solutions 1 EA $670.60 $670.60
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 1 EA $797.78 $797.78 Axis Part #P1448-LENo installation include
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 1 EA $843.60 $843.60
BridgeNet Communications, LL( 1 EA $935.08 $935.08
Lexine Inc 1 EA $949.00 $949.00
Xtreme Security & Alarm 1 EA $995.00 $995.00
Visceral lllumination Code LLC (1 EA $1,200.00 $1,200.00
| 16 [Axis Q6125-LE PTZ (Infrared)
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Lexine Inc 1 EA No Bid
Netsync Network Solutions 1 EA $2,114.70 $2,114.70
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 1 EA $2,521.15 $2,521.15 Axis Part #Q6125-LE PTZNo installation inc
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 1 EA $2,665.80 $2,665.80
BridgeNet Communications, LL( 1 EA $2,955.03 $2,955.03
Xtreme Security & Alarm 1 EA $3,143.00 $3,143.00
Visceral lllumination Code LLC (1 EA $3,200.00 $3,200.00
| 17 [Axis T91L61 Wall and Pole Mount (for Axis Q6125-LE PTZ infrared)
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Lexine Inc 1 EA No Bid
Netsync Network Solutions 1 EA $71.10 $71.10
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 1 EA $83.23 $83.23 Axis Part #T91L61No installation included.
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 1 EA $90.00 $90.00
BridgeNet Communications, LL( 1 EA $97.54 $97.54
Xtreme Security & Alarm 1 EA $104.00 $104.00
Visceral lllumination Code LLC (1 EA $110.00 $110.00
| 18 [Axis T8134 60 W Midspan (for Axis Q6125-LE PTZ infrared)
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Lexine Inc 1 EA $22.00 $22.00
Netsync Network Solutions 1 EA $107.00 $107.00
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 1 EA $125.27 $125.27 Axis Part #T8134No installation included.
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 1 EA $134.40 $134.40
BridgeNet Communications, LL( 1 EA $146.82 $146.82
Xtreme Security & Alarm 1 EA $157.00 $157.00
Visceral lllumination Code LLC (1 EA $160.00 $160.00
[ 19 |Axis P5635-E Mk Il PTZ (with audio)
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Lexine Inc 1 EA No Bid
Netsync Network Solutions 1 EA $1,411.70 $1,411.70
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 1 EA $1,680.48 $1,680.48 Axis Part #P5635-E MKII PTZNo installatior
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 1 EA $1,776.71 $1,776.71
BridgeNet Communications, LL( 1 EA $1,969.69 $1,969.69
Xtreme Security & Alarm 1 EA $2,095.00 $2,095.00
Visceral lllumination Code LLC (1 EA $2,100.00 $2,100.00
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
SECURITY CAMERAS AND RELATED MATERIALS BID # 18-19-062
BID OPENING: MAY 6, 2019 @ 3:00 P.M.

| 20 |Axis T91L61 Wall and Pole Mount

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Lexine Inc 1 EA No Bid

Netsync Network Solutions 1 EA $71.10 $71.10

Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 1 EA $83.23 $83.23 Axis Part #T91L61No installation included.

INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 1 EA $90.00 $90.00

BridgeNet Communications, LL( 1 EA $97.54 $97.54

Xtreme Security & Alarm 1 EA $104.00 $104.00

Visceral lllumination Code LLC (1 EA $110.00 $110.00

| 21 |2N IP Force - 2 buttons & HD camera (card reader ready) & 10W speaker (Part # 01340-001)

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Visceral lllumination Code LLC (1 EA $135.00 $135.00

Netsync Network Solutions 1 EA $968.70 $968.70

BridgeNet Communications, LL( 1 EA $1,164.43 $1,164.43

Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 1 EA $1,194.53 $1,194.53 2N Part #01340-001See Item #29

INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 1 EA $1,207.20 $1,207.20

Lexine Inc 1 EA $1,315.00 $1,315.00

Xtreme Security & Alarm 1 EA $1,368.00 $1,368.00

22

2N IP Card Reader 125 kHz (suitable for 2N IP Force only) it includes Wiegand interface, 2 logical inputs, 1 relay, 1 active output and tamper switch (Part
#01344-001)

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Netsync Network Solutions 1 EA $95.90 $95.90

Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 1 EA $115.37 $115.37 2N Part #01344-001See Item #29

INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 1 EA $117.35 $117.35

BridgeNet Communications, LL( 1 EA $125.14 $125.14

Lexine Inc 1 EA $127.00 $127.00

Xtreme Security & Alarm 1 EA $133.00 $133.00

Visceral lllumination Code LLC (1 EA $1,230.00 $1,230.00

| 23 |2N IP Intercom Security Relay (Part # 01386-001)

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Netsync Network Solutions 1 EA $82.90 $82.90

Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 1 EA $99.92 $99.92 2N Part #01386-001See item #29

INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 1 EA $101.64 $101.64

BridgeNet Communications, LL( 1 EA $108.38 $108.38

Xtreme Security & Alarm 1 EA $115.00 $115.00

Visceral lllumination Code LLC (1 EA $115.00 $115.00

Lexine Inc 1 EA $158.81 $158.81

[ 24 [2N 1P Base (Part # 01357-001)

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Netsync Network Solutions 1 EA $490.30 $490.30

INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 1 EA $614.46 $614.46

Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 1 EA $650.89 $650.89 2N Part #01357-001See Item #29

BridgeNet Communications, LL( 1 EA $655.25 $655.25

Lexine Inc 1 EA $665.00 $665.00

Xtreme Security & Alarm 1 EA $693.00 $693.00

Visceral lllumination Code LLC (1 EA $734.00 $734.00

[ 25 [2N IP Base 125 KHz card Reader (Part # 01358-001)

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Netsync Network Solutions 1 EA $67.90 $67.90
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 1 EA $83.16 $83.16
BridgeNet Communications, LL( 1 EA $88.68 $88.68
Lexine Inc 1 EA $90.00 $90.00
Xtreme Security & Alarm 1 EA $95.00 $95.00
Visceral lllumination Code LLC (1 EA $100.00 $100.00
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 1 EA $103.50 $103.50 2N Part #01358-001See Item 29
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SECURITY CAMERAS AND RELATED MATERIALS BID # 18-19-062
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| 26 |2N IP Base Backplate (Part # 01360-01)

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Lexine Inc 1 EA No Bid
Netsync Network Solutions 1 EA $45.60 $45.60
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 1 EA $55.44 $55.44
BridgeNet Communications, LL( 1 EA $59.12 $59.12
Xtreme Security & Alarm 1 EA $64.00 $64.00
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 1 EA $69.00 $69.00 2N Part #01360-001See ltem 29
Visceral lllumination Code LLC (1 EA $70.00 $70.00
| 27 |AItronics Power Supply
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Xtreme Security & Alarm 1 EA $92.00 $92.00
Netsync Network Solutions 1 EA $103.60 $103.60
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 1 EA $105.72 $105.72 Altronix Part #AL-176ULSee Item #29
Visceral lllumination Code LLC (1 EA $130.00 $130.00
BridgeNet Communications, LL( 1 EA $187.65 $187.65
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 1 EA $311.13 $311.13
Lexine Inc 1 EA $706.70 $706.70
| 28 |Door Strike
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
BridgeNet Communications, LL( 1 EA No Bid
Lexine Inc 1 EA $127.00 $127.00
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 1 EA $158.00 $158.00
Xtreme Security & Alarm 1 EA $376.00 $376.00
Netsync Network Solutions 1 EA $416.20 $416.20
Visceral lllumination Code LLC (1 EA $500.00 $500.00
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 1 EA $507.40 $507.40 Von Duprin Part #6300-S024-EBSee Item #
| 29 |Insta|lation of all components
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes / Alternate Description  Manufacturer Manuf Num
BridgeNet Communications, LL( 1 EA No Bid
i[ALT2] INNOVAERA INC DBASU 1 EA $2.50 $2.50 Conduit cost is not included in price but th
Xtreme Security & Alarm 1 EA $120.00 $120.00
Lexine Inc 1 EA $175.00 $175.00
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNO 1 EA $280.00 $280.00
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder En 1 EA $520.00 $520.00 Installation of items 21-28.
Netsync Network Solutions 1 EA $594.00 $594.00
§[ALT1] INNOVAERA INC DBASU 1 EA $780.00 $780.00 Scissor Lift Rental. If a scissor lift is require
Visceral lllumination Code LLC (1 EA $1,250.00 $1,250.00
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