
Bid Request Number 
Title 
Bid Type 
Issue Date 
Close Date 

!Name
La mac 

# 18-19-067 

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D. 
WAREHOUSE SCHOOL SUPPLIES AND PRINTSHOP MATERIALS BID# 18-19-067 

BID OPENING: JUNE 3, 2019 

Warehouse School Supplies and Printshop Materials Bid 
Bid 

Organization 
Bid Creator 
Email 

5/17/2019 05:17:08 PM (CT) 
6/3/2019 03 :30:00 PM (CT) 

Phone 
Fax 

ORIGINALLY AWARDED BY THE BOARD OF EDUCATION -AUGUST 19, 2019 
!city !state !classifications Lines Awarded Award Total
MCALLEN TX 20 $55,546.08 

PSJA ISO Ebids 
Emily Garza 
emlly.garz.a@psjalsd.us 

Award Reason 

The awarded vendor, Lamac, bid alternate low quality materials that did not meet the specifications established by the property management department 
for the best value to the district. 

THIS IS NOW THE RECOMMENDATION OF THE PROPERTY MANAGEMENT DEPARTMENT: 
I Name !City !state !classifications Lines Awarded Award Total
PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS TAMPA FL 18 $91,051.64 
National Art & School Supplies Inc. Rahway NJ 2 $12,848.64 

Award Reason 

RECOMMENDATION: That the Board of Education rescind and re-award Item# 42, 43, 44, 46, 68, 69, 70, 71, 79, 80, 84, 85, 87, 99, 101, 102, 119, 121, 125 and 131 of 
the Warehouse School Supplies and Printshop Materials Bid# 18-19-067 to the next lowest bidders. 

Account Number: 199-131100 

Three hundred eighty two (382) invitations were emailed to vendors 
Thirty nine (39) Vendors viewed Bid Specification 
Seventeen (17) Submitted Bid 
Five (5) Unsubmitted Bid 
Forty one (41) Vendors NO BID 
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.

WAREHOUSE SCHOOL SUPPLIES AND PRINTSHOP MATERIALS BID # 18-19-067

BID OPENING: JUNE 3, 2019

Line Qty UOM
Description

Manufacturer Manuf. 

Number

Award 

Response

Award 

Quantity

Award 

Total

Awarded Supplier Award Reason

42 10000 box Colored Pencils. long, 12 count, assorted colors (red, red orange, orange, yellow, yellow 

green, green, sky blue, blue, purple, black, brown and white). AS SPECIFIED / NO 

DEVIATIONS

Crayola 6840124044 $0.88 10000 $8,800.00 Lamac Rescind Award

43 4000 box Crayons. 8 count, assorted colors (red, yellow, green, blue, brown, black, orange and 

purple).  AS SPECIFIED / NO DEVIATIONS
Crayola 5230082010 $0.24 4000 $960.00 Lamac Rescind Award

44 1500 box Crayons. 8 count, jumbo, assorted classic colors.  AS SPECIFIED / NO DEVIATIONS Crayola 520389 $0.88 1500 $1,320.00 Lamac Rescind Award
46 5000 box Crayons. 24 count, assorted classic colors.  AS SPECIFIED / NO DEVIATIONS Crayola 5230243020 $0.62 5000 $3,100.00 Lamac Rescind Award
68 6048 ea Permanent Marker, BLACK, Fine Point, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATION Sharpie 30001EA $0.19 6048 $1,149.12 Lamac Rescind Award

69 6048 ea Permanent Marker, BLUE, Fine Point, AS SPECIFIED/NO 

DEVIATION

Sharpie 30063 $0.19 6048 $1,149.12 Lamac Rescind Award

70 6048 ea Permanent Marker, GREEN, Fine Point, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATION Sharpie 30034 $0.19 6048 $1,149.12 Lamac Rescind Award
71 6048 ea Permanent Marker, RED, Fine Point, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATION Sharpie 30052 $0.19 6048 $1,149.12 Lamac Rescind Award
79 8064 ea Permanent Marker, Mark-A-Lot, BLACK, Large Desk-Style, chisel point, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATIONSAvery 08888 $0.28 8064 $2,257.92 Lamac Rescind Award
80 6048 ea Highlighter, YELLOW, chisel point, transparent, fluorescent, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATIONS Avery 24000 $0.25 6048 $1,512.00 Lamac Rescind Award

for the best value to the district.4000 set Dry Erase Markers, ASSORTED (Black, Blue Red and Green), chisel point, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATIONSEXPO 80074 $1.00 4000 $4,000.00 Lamac Rescind Award
85 1800 ea Dry Erase Eraser, 2" x 5" for easy hand-size grip, fully washable, black, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATIONS.Expo 81505 $1.00 1800 $1,800.00 Lamac Rescind Award
87 200 sets Wet Erase Fine Tip Markers, Assorted Colors (2 black, red, blue and green), Pack of 5, AS 

SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATIONS
EXPO/Sanford 16675 $1.00 200 $200.00 Lamac Rescind Award

99 20000 dz #2 Wood Pencil, 12 per box, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATIONS Ticonderoga 13882 $0.83 20000 $16,600.00 Lamac Rescind Award
101 900 ea Manual Pencil Sharpener, silver, aluminum/steel, wall or table mountable, 8-hole pencil 

selector, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATIONS
X-ACTO KS 1031 $1.00 900 $900.00 Lamac Rescind Award

102 900 ea Manual Pencil Sharpener, silver, aluminum/steel, wall or table mountable, for standard sized 

pencils, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATIONS.
X-ACTO L 1041 $1.00 900 $900.00 Lamac Rescind Award

119 6000 ea Scissors, Blunt Tip, 5", AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATIONS. Fiskars 194160 $0.50 6000 $3,000.00 Lamac Rescind Award
121 1008 ea Stapler, BLACK, full strip staple, all metal, rubber base, two choice anvil, reinforced head, 

opens for tacking, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATIONS
Swingline 747 $3.20 1008 $3,225.60 Lamac Rescind Award

125 4224 rolls Clear Tape, 3/4" x 1296",  12 rolls per pack, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATIONS 3M 810K12 $0.42 4224 $1,774.08 Lamac Rescind Award
131 600 ea Tape Dispenser, BLACK, for 1/2" and 3/4" tape, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATIONS. 3M C38 $1.00 600 $600.00 Lamac Rescind Award

42 10000 box Colored Pencils. long, 12 count, assorted colors (red, red orange, orange, yellow, yellow 

green, green, sky blue, blue, purple, black, brown and white). AS SPECIFIED / NO 

DEVIATIONS

Crayola 6840124044 $1.04 10000 $10,400.00 PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS Award

43 4000 box Crayons. 8 count, assorted colors (red, yellow, green, blue, brown, black, orange and 

purple).  AS SPECIFIED / NO DEVIATIONS
Crayola 5230082010 $0.25 4000 $1,000.00 PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS Award

44 1500 box Crayons. 8 count, jumbo, assorted classic colors.  AS SPECIFIED / NO DEVIATIONS Crayola 520389 $1.03 1500 $1,545.00 PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS Award
46 5000 box Crayons. 24 count, assorted classic colors.  AS SPECIFIED / NO DEVIATIONS Crayola 5230243020 $0.67 5000 $3,350.00 PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS Award
68 6048 ea Permanent Marker, BLACK, Fine Point, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATION Sharpie 30001EA $0.45 6048 $2,721.60 PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS Award
69 6048 ea Permanent Marker, BLUE, Fine Point, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATION Sharpie 30063 $0.45 6048 $2,721.60 PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS Award
70 6048 ea Permanent Marker, GREEN, Fine Point, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATION Sharpie 30034 $0.45 6048 $2,721.60 PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS Award
71 6048 ea Permanent Marker, RED, Fine Point, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATION Sharpie 30052 $0.45 6048 $2,721.60 PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS Award
79 8064 ea Permanent Marker, Mark-A-Lot, BLACK, Large Desk-Style, chisel point, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATIONSAvery 08888 $0.38 8064 $3,064.32 PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS Award
80 6048 ea Highlighter, YELLOW, chisel point, transparent, fluorescent, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATIONS Avery 24000 $0.29 6048 $1,753.92 PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS Award

84 4000 set Dry Erase Markers, ASSORTED (Black, Blue Red and Green), chisel point, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATIONSEXPO 80074 $2.69 4000 $10,760.00 PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS Award
85 1800 ea Dry Erase Eraser, 2" x 5" for easy hand-size grip, fully washable, black, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATIONS.Expo 81505 $1.39 1800 $2,502.00 PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS Award
87 200 sets Wet Erase Fine Tip Markers, Assorted Colors (2 black, red, blue and green), Pack of 5, AS 

SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATIONS
EXPO/Sanford 16675 $2.69 200 $538.00 PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS Award

99 20000 dz #2 Wood Pencil, 12 per box, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATIONS Ticonderoga 13882 $1.35 20000 $27,000.00 PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS Award
101 900 ea Manual Pencil Sharpener, silver, aluminum/steel, wall or table mountable, 8-hole pencil 

selector, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATIONS
X-ACTO KS 1031 $6.95 900 $6,255.00 PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS Award

102 900 ea Manual Pencil Sharpener, silver, aluminum/steel, wall or table mountable, for standard sized 

pencils, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATIONS.
X-ACTO L 1041 $8.49 900 $7,641.00 PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS Award

119 6000 ea Scissors, Blunt Tip, 5", AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATIONS. Fiskars 194160 $0.51 6000 $3,060.00 PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS Award
121 1008 ea Stapler, BLACK, full strip staple, all metal, rubber base, two choice anvil, reinforced head, 

opens for tacking, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATIONS
Swingline 747 $6.88 1008 $6,935.04 National Art & School Supplies Inc. Award

125 4224 rolls Clear Tape, 3/4" x 1296",  12 rolls per pack, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATIONS 3M 810K12 $1.40 4224 $5,913.60 National Art & School Supplies Inc. Low Bid Justified
131 600 ea Tape Dispenser, BLACK, for 1/2" and 3/4" tape, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATIONS. 3M C38 $2.16 600 $1,296.00 PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS Award

* JUSTIFICATION - Pyramid School Products bid an alternate product instead of the specified / no deviations item the District requested which is the best value for the District.

ORIGINALLY AWARDED BY THE BOARD OF EDUCATION - AUGUST 19, 2019

THIS IS NOW THE RECOMMENDATION OF THE PROPERTY MANAGEMENT DEPARTMENT:
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.

WAREHOUSE SCHOOL SUPPLIES AND PRINTSHOP MATERIALS BID # 18-19-067

BID OPENING: JUNE 3, 2019

42

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

Youthlight, Inc. 10000 box No Bid Crayola 6840124044

TEACHER DIRECT (TDSA, LLC) 10000 box No Bid Crayola 6840124044

Southwest Binding & Laminating (Southwest Plastic Binding Co.) 10000 box No Bid Crayola 6840124044

Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 10000 box No Bid Crayola 6840124044
RESCIND Lamac (Trey Gonzalez) 10000 box $0.88 $8,800.00 Crayola 6840124044

AWARD PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS (PYRAMID PAPER COMPANY) 10000 box $1.04 $10,400.00
48 SETS PER CASE - CRAYOLA MINIMUM 

IS $550.00 IN FULL CASES
Crayola 6840124044

School Specialty, Inc. 10000 box $1.06 $10,600.00 SSI # 160-1456 Crayola 6840124044

National Art & School Supplies Inc. 10000 box $1.08 $10,800.00 Crayola 6840124044

Asel Art Supply 10000 box $1.47 $14,700.00 Crayola 6840124044

Gateway Printing 10000 box $1.60 $16,000.00 Correct vendor #CYO684012Please allow 7 to 10 business days. Crayola 6840124044

Ray's Business Products 10000 box $1.60 $16,000.00 Crayola 6840124044

Cascade School Supplies 10000 box $1.64 $16,400.00 Crayola 6840124044

Quill LLC 10000 box $1.85 $18,500.00 Crayola, Quill item #684012Crayola Colored Pencils, 12/Box Crayola 6840124044

Greenwood Office Outfitters 10000 box $2.06 $20,600.00 Crayola 6840124044

43 Crayons. 8 count, assorted colors (red, yellow, green, blue, 

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 4000 box No Bid Crayola 5230082010

Youthlight, Inc. 4000 box No Bid Crayola 5230082010

School Specialty, Inc. 4000 box No Bid Crayola 5230082010

Southwest Binding & Laminating (Southwest Plastic Binding Co.) 4000 box No Bid Crayola 5230082010

Quill LLC 4000 box No Bid Crayola 5230082010
RESCIND Lamac (Trey Gonzalez) 4000 box $0.24 $960.00 Crayola 5230082010

AWARD PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS (PYRAMID PAPER COMPANY) 4000 box $0.25 $1,000.00
288 SETS PER CASE - CRAYOLA MINIMUM IS $550.00 IN FULL 

CASE Crayola 5230082010

National Art & School Supplies Inc. 4000 box $0.39 $1,560.00 Crayola 5230082010

Asel Art Supply 4000 box $0.50 $2,000.00 Crayola 5230082010

Ray's Business Products 4000 box $0.53 $2,120.00 Crayola 5230082010

Gateway Printing 4000 box $0.55 $2,200.00 Correct vendor #CYO523008Please allow 7 to 10 business days. Crayola 5230082010

TEACHER DIRECT (TDSA, LLC) 4000 box $0.65 $2,600.00 Crayola 5230082010

Cascade School Supplies 4000 box $0.67 $2,680.00 Crayola 5230082010

Greenwood Office Outfitters 4000 box $0.70 $2,800.00 Crayola 5230082010

44 Crayons. 8 count, jumbo, assorted classic colors. AS 

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

Youthlight, Inc. 1500 box No Bid Crayola 520389

Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 1500 box No Bid Crayola 520389

Southwest Binding & Laminating (Southwest Plastic Binding Co.) 1500 box No Bid Crayola 520389
RESCIND Lamac (Trey Gonzalez) 1500 box $0.88 $1,320.00 Crayola 520389

AWARD PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS (PYRAMID PAPER COMPANY) 1500 box $1.03 $1,545.00
144 SET PER CASE - CRAYOLA MINIMUM IS $550.00 IN FULL 

CASESQUOTING LARGE CRAYONS #52-0080 NOT JUMBO Crayola 520389

National Art & School Supplies Inc. 1500 box $1.75 $2,625.00 Crayola 520389

Asel Art Supply 1500 box $2.05 $3,075.00 Crayola 520389

Ray's Business Products 1500 box $2.20 $3,300.00 Crayola 520389

Gateway Printing 1500 box $2.25 $3,375.00 Please allow 7 to 10 business days. Crayola 520389

Cascade School Supplies 1500 box $2.30 $3,450.00 Crayola 520389

School Specialty, Inc. 1500 box $2.33 $3,495.00 SSI # 008418 Crayola 520389

Quill LLC 1500 box $2.66 $3,990.00
Crayola, Quill item #641602 Binney & Smith So Big Crayola 

Crayons, 8-Colors, Assorted
Crayola 520389

TEACHER DIRECT (TDSA, LLC) 1500 box $2.83 $4,245.00 Crayola 520389

Greenwood Office Outfitters 1500 box $2.89 $4,335.00 Crayola 520389

46
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5000 box No Bid Crayola 5230243020
Youthlight, Inc. 5000 box No Bid Crayola 5230243020
School Specialty, Inc. 5000 box No Bid Crayola 5230243020
Southwest Binding & Laminating (Southwest Plastic Binding Co.) 5000 box No Bid Crayola 5230243020
Quill LLC 5000 box No Bid Crayola 5230243020

RESCIND Lamac (Trey Gonzalez) 5000 box $0.62 $3,100.00 Crayola 5230243020

AWARD PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS (PYRAMID PAPER COMPANY) 5000 box $0.67 $3,350.00
144 SETS PER CASE - CRAYOLA MINIMUM IS $550.00 IN FULL 

CASES Crayola 5230243020

National Art & School Supplies Inc. 5000 box $1.04 $5,200.00 Crayola 5230243020
Asel Art Supply 5000 box $1.24 $6,200.00 Crayola 5230243020
Ray's Business Products 5000 box $1.33 $6,650.00 Crayola 5230243020
Gateway Printing 5000 box $1.36 $6,800.00 Correct vendor #CYO523024Please allow 7 to 10 business days. Crayola 5230243020
Cascade School Supplies 5000 box $1.39 $6,950.00 Crayola 5230243020
TEACHER DIRECT (TDSA, LLC) 5000 box $1.69 $8,450.00 Crayola 5230243020
Greenwood Office Outfitters 5000 box $1.74 $8,700.00 Crayola 5230243020

Colored Pencils. long, 12 count, assorted colors (red, red orange, orange, yellow, yellow green, green, sky blue, blue, purple, black, brown and white). AS SPECIFIED / NO 

Crayons. 24 count, assorted classic colors. AS SPECIFIED / NO DEVIATIONS
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.

WAREHOUSE SCHOOL SUPPLIES AND PRINTSHOP MATERIALS BID # 18-19-067

BID OPENING: JUNE 3, 2019

68

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 6048 ea No Bid Sharpie 30001EA

Youthlight, Inc. 6048 ea No Bid Sharpie 30001EA

Southwest Binding & Laminating (Southwest Plastic Binding Co.) 6048 ea No Bid Sharpie 30001EA

Asel Art Supply 6048 ea No Bid Sharpie 30001EA

RESCIND Lamac (Trey Gonzalez) 6048 ea $0.19 $1,149.12
the price is for piece but i sold per blist of 4 in different colors 

black blue red and green
Sharpie 30001EA

AWARD PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS (PYRAMID PAPER COMPANY) 6048 ea $0.45 $2,721.60 Sharpie 30001EA

National Art & School Supplies Inc. 6048 ea $0.49 $2,963.52 Sharpie 30001EA

Cascade School Supplies 6048 ea $0.55 $3,326.40 Sharpie 30001EA

School Specialty, Inc. 6048 ea $0.68 $4,112.64 SSI # 059391 Sharpie 30001EA

CIELO OFFICE PRODUCTS 6048 ea $0.68 $4,112.64 Sharpie 30001EA

Ray's Business Products 6048 ea $0.68 $4,112.64 Sharpie 30001EA

Gateway Printing 6048 ea $0.70 $4,233.60
Please allow 7 to 10 business days.(must be ordered by the 

dozen) Sharpie 30001EA

Quill LLC 6048 ea $0.76 $4,596.48
Sharpie, Quill item #SAN30001Sharpie Permanent Marker, Fine 

Point, Black (30001)
Sharpie 30001EA

Greenwood Office Outfitters 6048 ea $0.90 $5,443.20 Sharpie 30001EA

TEACHER DIRECT (TDSA, LLC) 6048 ea $0.93 $5,624.64 Sharpie 30001EA

69

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

Youthlight, Inc. 6048 ea No Bid Sharpie 30063

Asel Art Supply 6048 ea No Bid Sharpie 30063

Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 6048 ea No Bid Sharpie 30063

School Specialty, Inc. 6048 ea No Bid Sharpie 30063

Southwest Binding & Laminating (Southwest Plastic Binding Co.) 6048 ea No Bid Sharpie 30063

TEACHER DIRECT (TDSA, LLC) 6048 ea No Bid Sharpie 30063

Quill LLC 6048 ea No Bid Sharpie 30063

RESCIND Lamac (Trey Gonzalez) 6048 ea $0.19 $1,149.12
the price is for piece but i sold per blist of 4 in different colors 

black blue red and green Sharpie 30063

AWARD PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS (PYRAMID PAPER COMPANY) 6048 ea $0.45 $2,721.60 AS SPECIFIED -  STOCK NUMBER IS 30003 Sharpie 30063

National Art & School Supplies Inc. 6048 ea $0.50 $3,024.00 Sharpie 30063

Cascade School Supplies 6048 ea $0.55 $3,326.40 Sharpie 30063

Ray's Business Products 6048 ea $0.68 $4,112.64 Sharpie 30063

Gateway Printing 6048 ea $0.70 $4,233.60
Please allow 7 to 10 business days.(must be ordered by the 

dozen) Sharpie 30063

Greenwood Office Outfitters 6048 ea $0.90 $5,443.20 Sharpie 30063

CIELO OFFICE PRODUCTS 6048 ea $30,063.00 $181,821,024.00 Sharpie 30063

70

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 6048 ea No Bid Sharpie 30034

Youthlight, Inc. 6048 ea No Bid Sharpie 30034

TEACHER DIRECT (TDSA, LLC) 6048 ea No Bid Sharpie 30034

Asel Art Supply 6048 ea No Bid Sharpie 30034

Southwest Binding & Laminating (Southwest Plastic Binding Co.) 6048 ea No Bid Sharpie 30034

Quill LLC 6048 ea No Bid Sharpie 30034

School Specialty, Inc. 6048 ea No Bid Sharpie 30034

RESCIND Lamac (Trey Gonzalez) 6048 ea $0.19 $1,149.12
the price is for piece but i sold per blist of 4 in different colors 

black blue red and green Sharpie 30034

AWARD PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS (PYRAMID PAPER COMPANY) 6048 ea $0.45 $2,721.60 AS SPECIFIED - STOCK NUMBER 30004 Sharpie 30034

National Art & School Supplies Inc. 6048 ea $0.50 $3,024.00 Sharpie 30034

Cascade School Supplies 6048 ea $0.55 $3,326.40 Sharpie 30034

Ray's Business Products 6048 ea $0.68 $4,112.64 Sharpie 30034

Gateway Printing 6048 ea $0.70 $4,233.60
Please allow 7 to 10 business days.(must be ordered by the 

dozen) Sharpie 30034

Greenwood Office Outfitters 6048 ea $0.90 $5,443.20 Sharpie 30034

71

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 6048 ea No Bid Sharpie 30052

Youthlight, Inc. 6048 ea No Bid Sharpie 30052

TEACHER DIRECT (TDSA, LLC) 6048 ea No Bid Sharpie 30052

Asel Art Supply 6048 ea No Bid Sharpie 30052

Southwest Binding & Laminating (Southwest Plastic Binding Co.) 6048 ea No Bid Sharpie 30052

Quill LLC 6048 ea No Bid Sharpie 30052

School Specialty, Inc. 6048 ea No Bid Sharpie 30052

RESCIND Lamac (Trey Gonzalez) 6048 ea $0.19 $1,149.12
the price is for piece but i sold per blist of 4 in different colors 

black blue red and green Sharpie 30052

AWARD PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS (PYRAMID PAPER COMPANY) 6048 ea $0.45 $2,721.60 AS SPECIFIED - STOCK NUMBER 30002 Sharpie 30052

National Art & School Supplies Inc. 6048 ea $0.50 $3,024.00 Sharpie 30052

Cascade School Supplies 6048 ea $0.55 $3,326.40 Sharpie 30052

Ray's Business Products 6048 ea $0.68 $4,112.64 Sharpie 30052

Gateway Printing 6048 ea $0.70 $4,233.60
Please allow 7 to 10 business days.(must be ordered by the 

dozen) Sharpie 30052

Greenwood Office Outfitters 6048 ea $0.90 $5,443.20 Sharpie 30052

Permanent Marker, BLACK, Fine Point, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATION

Permanent Marker, BLUE, Fine Point, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATION

Permanent Marker, GREEN, Fine Point, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATION

Permanent Marker, RED, Fine Point, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATION
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.

WAREHOUSE SCHOOL SUPPLIES AND PRINTSHOP MATERIALS BID # 18-19-067

BID OPENING: JUNE 3, 2019

79

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

Asel Art Supply 8064 ea No Bid Avery 08888

Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 8064 ea No Bid Avery 08888

School Specialty, Inc. 8064 ea No Bid Avery 08888

Southwest Binding & Laminating (Southwest Plastic Binding Co.) 8064 ea No Bid Avery 08888

Youthlight, Inc. 8064 ea No Bid Avery 08888

TEACHER DIRECT (TDSA, LLC) 8064 ea No Bid Avery 08888
RESCIND Lamac (Trey Gonzalez) 8064 ea $0.28 $2,257.92 Avery 08888

AWARD PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS (PYRAMID PAPER COMPANY) 8064 ea $0.38 $3,064.32 144 PER CASE - AVERY MINIMUM IS $850.00 IN FULL CASES Avery 08888

National Art & School Supplies Inc. 8064 ea $0.41 $3,306.24 Avery 08888

Ray's Business Products 8064 ea $0.49 $3,951.36 Avery 08888

Cascade School Supplies 8064 ea $0.50 $4,032.00 Avery 08888

Gateway Printing 8064 ea $0.50 $4,032.00 Please allow 7 to 10 business days.Must be ordered by the dozen Avery 08888

Greenwood Office Outfitters 8064 ea $0.64 $5,160.96 Avery 08888

Quill LLC 8064 ea $0.99 $7,983.36
Avery, Quill item #AVE08888 Marks-A-Lot Permanent Marker, 

Chisel Point, Black (08888) Avery 08888

80

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

Asel Art Supply 6048 ea No Bid Avery 24000

Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 6048 ea No Bid Avery 24000

Youthlight, Inc. 6048 ea No Bid Avery 24000

Southwest Binding & Laminating (Southwest Plastic Binding Co.) 6048 ea No Bid Avery 24000

Quill LLC 6048 ea No Bid Avery 24000

School Specialty, Inc. 6048 ea No Bid Avery 24000
RESCIND Lamac (Trey Gonzalez) 6048 ea $0.25 $1,512.00 Avery 24000

AWARD PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS (PYRAMID PAPER COMPANY) 6048 ea $0.29 $1,753.92 144 PER CASE - AVERY MINIMUM IS $850.00 IN FULL CASES Avery 24000

National Art & School Supplies Inc. 6048 ea $0.31 $1,874.88 Avery 24000

Ray's Business Products 6048 ea $0.37 $2,237.76 Avery 24000

Gateway Printing 6048 ea $0.38 $2,298.24 Please allow 7 to 10 business days.Must be ordered by the dozen Avery 24000

Cascade School Supplies 6048 ea $0.41 $2,479.68 Avery 24000

Greenwood Office Outfitters 6048 ea $0.49 $2,963.52 Avery 24000

TEACHER DIRECT (TDSA, LLC) 6048 ea $0.51 $3,084.48 Avery 24000

84

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 4000 set No Bid EXPO 80074

Youthlight, Inc. 4000 set No Bid EXPO 80074

Southwest Binding & Laminating (Southwest Plastic Binding Co.) 4000 set No Bid EXPO 80074

Asel Art Supply 4000 set No Bid EXPO 80074
RESCIND Lamac (Trey Gonzalez) 4000 set $1.00 $4,000.00 EXPO 80074
AWARD PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS (PYRAMID PAPER COMPANY) 4000 set $2.69 $10,760.00 EXPO 80074

National Art & School Supplies Inc. 4000 set $2.70 $10,800.00 EXPO 80074

Cascade School Supplies 4000 set $3.16 $12,640.00 EXPO 80074

Quill LLC 4000 set $3.43 $13,720.00
Expo, Quill item #80074Q Expo Dry Erase Markers, Chisel Point, 

Assorted, 4/Pack (80074) EXPO 80074

School Specialty, Inc. 4000 set $3.66 $14,640.00 SSI # 175136 EXPO 80074

Ray's Business Products 4000 set $3.73 $14,920.00 EXPO 80074

Gateway Printing 4000 set $3.82 $15,280.00 Please allow 7 to 10 business days. EXPO 80074

Greenwood Office Outfitters 4000 set $4.90 $19,600.00 EXPO 80074

TEACHER DIRECT (TDSA, LLC) 4000 set $5.59 $22,360.00 EXPO 80074

85

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 1800 ea No Bid Expo 81505

Youthlight, Inc. 1800 ea No Bid Expo 81505

Southwest Binding & Laminating (Southwest Plastic Binding Co.) 1800 ea No Bid Expo 81505

Asel Art Supply 1800 ea No Bid Expo 81505
RESCIND Lamac (Trey Gonzalez) 1800 ea $1.00 $1,800.00 Expo 81505
AWARD PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS (PYRAMID PAPER COMPANY) 1800 ea $1.39 $2,502.00 Expo 81505

National Art & School Supplies Inc. 1800 ea $1.45 $2,610.00 Expo 81505

School Specialty, Inc. 1800 ea $1.50 $2,700.00 SSI # 076878 Expo 81505

Quill LLC 1800 ea $1.66 $2,988.00 Expo, Quill item #81505Expo Block Eraser (81505) Expo 81505

Cascade School Supplies 1800 ea $1.79 $3,222.00 Expo 81505

Ray's Business Products 1800 ea $1.99 $3,582.00 Expo 81505

Gateway Printing 1800 ea $2.04 $3,672.00 Please allow 7 to 10 business days. Expo 81505

Greenwood Office Outfitters 1800 ea $2.62 $4,716.00 Expo 81505

TEACHER DIRECT (TDSA, LLC) 1800 ea $2.93 $5,274.00 Expo 81505

Highlighter, YELLOW, chisel point, transparent, fluorescent, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATIONS

Permanent Marker, Mark-A-Lot, BLACK, Large Desk-Style, chisel point, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATIONS

Dry Erase Markers, ASSORTED (Black, Blue Red and Green), chisel point, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATIONS

Dry Erase Eraser, 2" x 5" for easy hand-size grip, fully washable, black, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATIONS.
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87

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 200 sets No Bid EXPO/Sanford 16675

Youthlight, Inc. 200 sets No Bid EXPO/Sanford 16675

Southwest Binding & Laminating (Southwest Plastic Binding Co.) 200 sets No Bid EXPO/Sanford 16675

Quill LLC 200 sets No Bid EXPO/Sanford 16675

School Specialty, Inc. 200 sets No Bid EXPO/Sanford 16675

Asel Art Supply 200 sets No Bid EXPO/Sanford 16675

Cascade School Supplies 200 sets No Bid EXPO/Sanford 16675

TEACHER DIRECT (TDSA, LLC) 200 sets No Bid EXPO/Sanford 16675

RESCIND Lamac (Trey Gonzalez) 200 sets $1.00 $200.00 this package bring 6 markers 3 black, 1 red, 1 blue and 1 green EXPO/Sanford 16675

AWARD PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS (PYRAMID PAPER COMPANY) 200 sets $2.69 $538.00 SANFORD 16074 - PACKAGE OF 4 EXPO/Sanford 16675

Ray's Business Products 200 sets $4.89 $978.00 EXPO/Sanford 16675

Gateway Printing 200 sets $5.00 $1,000.00 Please allow 7 to 10 business days. EXPO/Sanford 16675

Greenwood Office Outfitters 200 sets $6.44 $1,288.00 EXPO/Sanford 16675

99

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

Youthlight, Inc. 20000 dz No Bid Ticonderoga 13882

Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 20000 dz No Bid Ticonderoga 13882

Southwest Binding & Laminating (Southwest Plastic Binding Co.) 20000 dz No Bid Ticonderoga 13882
RESCIND Lamac (Trey Gonzalez) 20000 dz $0.83 $16,600.00 Ticonderoga 13882
AWARD PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS (PYRAMID PAPER COMPANY) 20000 dz $1.35 $27,000.00 Ticonderoga 13882

Cascade School Supplies 20000 dz $1.44 $28,800.00 Ticonderoga 13882

School Specialty, Inc. 20000 dz $1.50 $30,000.00 SSI # 017646 Ticonderoga 13882

Quill LLC 20000 dz $1.55 $31,000.00 Ticonderoga, Quill item #13882 Ticonderoga 13882

Asel Art Supply 20000 dz $1.67 $33,400.00 Ticonderoga 13882

Ray's Business Products 20000 dz $1.75 $35,000.00 Ticonderoga 13882

Gateway Printing 20000 dz $1.79 $35,800.00 Please allow 7 to 10 business days Ticonderoga 13882

CIELO OFFICE PRODUCTS 20000 dz $1.81 $36,200.00 Ticonderoga 13882

Greenwood Office Outfitters 20000 dz $2.30 $46,000.00 Ticonderoga 13882

TEACHER DIRECT (TDSA, LLC) 20000 dz $2.45 $49,000.00 Ticonderoga 13882

101

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 900 ea No Bid X-ACTO KS 1031

Youthlight, Inc. 900 ea No Bid X-ACTO KS 1031

Southwest Binding & Laminating (Southwest Plastic Binding Co.) 900 ea No Bid X-ACTO KS 1031

Asel Art Supply 900 ea No Bid X-ACTO KS 1031
RESCIND Lamac (Trey Gonzalez) 900 ea $1.00 $900.00 X-ACTO KS 1031
AWARD PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS (PYRAMID PAPER COMPANY) 900 ea $6.95 $6,255.00 X-ACTO KS 1031

School Specialty, Inc. 900 ea $7.83 $7,047.00 SSI # 380144 X-ACTO KS 1031

Cascade School Supplies 900 ea $7.90 $7,110.00 X-ACTO KS 1031

Quill LLC 900 ea $8.96 $8,064.00
X-Acto, Quill item #1031 X-ACTO KS Manual Pencil Sharpener, 

Black/Silver (1031) X-ACTO KS 1031

Gateway Printing 900 ea $9.69 $8,721.00 Correct vendor #EIP1031LMRPlease allow 7 to 10 business days X-ACTO KS 1031

Ray's Business Products 900 ea $9.69 $8,721.00 X-ACTO KS 1031

TEACHER DIRECT (TDSA, LLC) 900 ea $11.29 $10,161.00 X-ACTO KS 1031

Greenwood Office Outfitters 900 ea $12.47 $11,223.00 X-ACTO KS 1031

102

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

Youthlight, Inc. 900 ea No Bid X-ACTO L 1041

TEACHER DIRECT (TDSA, LLC) 900 ea No Bid X-ACTO L 1041

Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 900 ea No Bid X-ACTO L 1041

Southwest Binding & Laminating (Southwest Plastic Binding Co.) 900 ea No Bid X-ACTO L 1041

Asel Art Supply 900 ea No Bid X-ACTO L 1041
RESCIND Lamac (Trey Gonzalez) 900 ea $1.00 $900.00 X-ACTO L 1041
AWARD PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS (PYRAMID PAPER COMPANY) 900 ea $8.49 $7,641.00 X-ACTO L 1041

School Specialty, Inc. 900 ea $8.85 $7,965.00 SSI # 380147 X-ACTO L 1041

Cascade School Supplies 900 ea $9.08 $8,172.00 X-ACTO L 1041

Quill LLC 900 ea $10.28 $9,252.00 X-Acto, Quill item #1041X-ACTO L Manual Pencil Sharpener, Silver X-ACTO L 1041

Ray's Business Products 900 ea $11.13 $10,017.00 X-ACTO L 1041

Gateway Printing 900 ea $11.14 $10,026.00 Please allow 7 to 10 business days X-ACTO L 1041

Greenwood Office Outfitters 900 ea $14.33 $12,897.00 X-ACTO L 1041

#2 Wood Pencil, 12 per box, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATIONS

Manual Pencil Sharpener, silver, aluminum/steel, wall or table mountable, 8-hole pencil selector, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATIONS

Manual Pencil Sharpener, silver, aluminum/steel, wall or table mountable, for standard sized pencils, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATIONS.

Wet Erase Fine Tip Markers, Assorted Colors (2 black, red, blue and green), Pack of 5, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATIONS
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119

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

Youthlight, Inc. 6000 ea No Bid Fiskars 194160

Asel Art Supply 6000 ea No Bid Fiskars 194160

Quill LLC 6000 ea No Bid Fiskars 194160

Greenwood Office Outfitters 6000 ea No Bid Fiskars 194160

School Specialty, Inc. 6000 ea No Bid Fiskars 194160

Southwest Binding & Laminating (Southwest Plastic Binding Co.) 6000 ea No Bid Fiskars 194160

TEACHER DIRECT (TDSA, LLC) 6000 ea No Bid Fiskars 194160

Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 6000 ea No Bid Fiskars 194160
RESCIND Lamac (Trey Gonzalez) 6000 ea $0.50 $3,000.00 Fiskars 194160
AWARD PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS (PYRAMID PAPER COMPANY) 6000 ea $0.51 $3,060.00 FISKARS #153520 Fiskars 194160

National Art & School Supplies Inc. 6000 ea $1.34 $8,040.00 Fiskars 194160

Cascade School Supplies 6000 ea $1.51 $9,060.00 Fiskars 194160

Gateway Printing 6000 ea $1.56 $9,360.00 Please allow 7 to 10 business days Fiskars 194160

Ray's Business Products 6000 ea $1.56 $9,360.00 Fiskars 194160

CIELO OFFICE PRODUCTS 6000 ea $2.42 $14,520.00 Fiskars 194160

121

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

Youthlight, Inc. 1008 ea No Bid Swingline 747

TEACHER DIRECT (TDSA, LLC) 1008 ea No Bid Swingline 747

Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 1008 ea No Bid Swingline 747

Southwest Binding & Laminating (Southwest Plastic Binding Co.) 1008 ea No Bid Swingline 747

Asel Art Supply 1008 ea No Bid Swingline 747
RESCIND Lamac (Trey Gonzalez) 1008 ea $3.20 $3,225.60 Swingline 747
AWARD National Art & School Supplies Inc. 1008 ea $6.88 $6,935.04 Swingline 747

PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS (PYRAMID PAPER COMPANY) 1008 ea $7.19 $7,247.52 Swingline 747

Quill LLC 1008 ea $11.69 $11,783.52
Swingline, Quill item #74701 Swingline 747 Classic Metal Stapler, 

20 Sheet Capacity, Black (74701) Swingline 747

Cascade School Supplies 1008 ea $12.00 $12,096.00 Swingline 747

Ray's Business Products 1008 ea $12.01 $12,106.08 Swingline 747

Gateway Printing 1008 ea $12.02 $12,116.16 Correct vendor #SWI74701Please allow 7 to 10 business days Swingline 747

School Specialty, Inc. 1008 ea $12.49 $12,589.92 SSI # 061149 Swingline 747

Greenwood Office Outfitters 1008 ea $15.46 $15,583.68 Swingline 747

125

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 4224 rolls No Bid 3M 810K12

Youthlight, Inc. 4224 rolls No Bid 3M 810K12

TEACHER DIRECT (TDSA, LLC) 4224 rolls No Bid 3M 810K12

Southwest Binding & Laminating (Southwest Plastic Binding Co.) 4224 rolls No Bid 3M 810K12

Quill LLC 4224 rolls No Bid 3M 810K12

School Specialty, Inc. 4224 rolls No Bid 3M 810K12
RESCIND Lamac (Trey Gonzalez) 4224 rolls $0.42 $1,774.08 3M 810K12

See Justification PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS (PYRAMID PAPER COMPANY) 4224 rolls $0.54 $2,280.96
3M HIGHLAND 6200B  144/CASE FILL CASES ONLY - 3M 

MINIMUM IS $600.00 IN FULL CASES 3M 810K12

LOW BID 

JUSTIFIED
National Art & School Supplies Inc. 4224 rolls $1.40 $5,913.60 3M 810K12

Gateway Printing 4224 rolls $1.83 $7,729.92
Please allow 7 to 10 business daysMust be ordered by pack of 

12rolls.Please allow 7 to 10 business days 3M 810K12

Cascade School Supplies 4224 rolls $2.24 $9,461.76 Sold per Roll 3M 810K12

Ray's Business Products 4224 rolls $2.30 $9,715.20 3M 810K12

Greenwood Office Outfitters 4224 rolls $2.36 $9,968.64 3M 810K12
* JUSTIFICATION - Pyramid School Products bid an alternate product instead of the specified / no deviations item the District requested which is the best value for the District.

131

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num

TEACHER DIRECT (TDSA, LLC) 600 ea No Bid 3M C38

Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 600 ea No Bid 3M C38

Southwest Binding & Laminating (Southwest Plastic Binding Co.) 600 ea No Bid 3M C38

Youthlight, Inc. 600 ea No Bid 3M C38
RESCIND Lamac (Trey Gonzalez) 600 ea $1.00 $600.00 3M C38

AWARD PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS (PYRAMID PAPER COMPANY) 600 ea $2.16 $1,296.00 12/CASE - 3M MINIMUM IS $600.00 IN FULL CASES 3M C38

Cascade School Supplies 600 ea $2.38 $1,428.00 3M C38

Ray's Business Products 600 ea $2.40 $1,440.00 3M C38

Gateway Printing 600 ea $2.40 $1,440.00 Correct vendor #MMMC38BKPlease allow 7 to 10 business days 3M C38

School Specialty, Inc. 600 ea $2.50 $1,500.00 SSI # 023127 3M C38

Greenwood Office Outfitters 600 ea $3.09 $1,854.00 3M C38

Quill LLC 600 ea $3.65 $2,190.00
3M Scotch, Quill item #817196 Scotch Desktop Tape Dispenser, 

Black (C-38) 3M C38

Clear Tape, 3/4" x 1296", 12 rolls per pack, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATIONS

Tape Dispenser, BLACK, for 1/2" and 3/4" tape, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATIONS.

Scissors, Blunt Tip, 5", AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATIONS.

Stapler, BLACK, full strip staple, all metal, rubber base, two choice anvil, reinforced head, opens for tacking, AS SPECIFIED/NO DEVIATIONS
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