

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
TRASH CAN LINERS FOR USE DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 18-19-046
BID OPENING: APRIL 8, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

Bid Request Number # 18-19-046 Addendum 1
Title Trash Can Liners For Use District-Wide
Description
Bid Type Bid
Issue Date 3/22/2019 11:38:22 AM (CT)
Close Date 4/8/2019 02:30:00 PM (CT)

Organization PSJA ISD Ebids
Bid Creator Emily Garza
Email emily.garza@psjaisd.us
Phone
Fax

Awarded Suppliers

Name	City	State	Classifications	Lines Awarded	Award Total	Award Reason
Unipak Corp.	BROOKLYN	NY		2	\$128,520.00	
Western BRW -Bosworth Pape Dallas		TX		1	\$2,472.00	

RECOMMENDATION: That the Board of Education award Trash Can Liners For Use District-Wide # 18-19-046 to the lowest bidder as indicated below:

<u>ITEMS</u>	<u>SUPPLIERS</u>	<u>TOTAL</u>
2 and 3	Unipak Corp.	\$128,520.00
1	Western BRW - Bosworth Papers	\$2,472.00
	TOTAL:	\$130,992.00

Emily Garza, Director of Purchasing

Account Number: 199-131100

Thirteen (13) Vendors Viewed Bid Specification
 Sixteen (16) Submitted Bid
 Three (3) Vendors NO BID
 Zero (0) Non-responsive/Non-conforming

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
TRASH CAN LINERS FOR USE DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 18-19-046
BID OPENING: APRIL 8, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

Line	Quantity	UOM	Description	Manufacturer	Manuf. Number	Award Response	Award Quantity	Awarded Supplier	Award Reason
1	300	CS	24" x 24" Mic 6, or Equal. 50 Bags per Roll / 20 Rolls per Case. Net Lbs 9.1	Interplast Group	EC242406N	\$8.24	300	Western BRW - Bosworth Papers	
2	8000	CS	33" x 39" .80 Mil or Equal. 25 Bags per Roll / 6 Rolls per Case. Net Lbs 9.9	Interplast Group	WSL3339XHW	\$8.64	8000	Unipak Corp.	Interboro samples were flimsy and ripped easily when compared to the samples from Unipak Corp.
3	6000	CS	38" x 58" .80 MIL or Equal. 25 Bags per Roll / 4 Rolls per case. Net Lbs 11.3	Interplast Group	WSL3858XHW	\$9.90	6000	Unipak Corp.	Interboro samples were flimsy and ripped easily when compared to the samples from Unipak Corp.

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
TRASH CAN LINERS FOR USE DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 18-19-046
BID OPENING: APRIL 8, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

1	24" x 24" Mic 6, or Equal. 50 Bags per Roll / 20 Rolls per Case. Net Lbs 9.1							
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes / Alternate Description	Manufacturer	Manuf Num	
Advanced Blending, Inc. DBA: LAsT Group Enterprises	300	CS	No Bid			Interplast Group	EC242406N	
Quill LLC	300	CS	No Bid			Interplast Group	EC242406N	
Western BRW - Bosworth Papers (JP Gould)	300	CS	\$8.24	\$2,472.00	Part # H242406N	Interplast Group	EC242406N	
[ALT1] Safeway Supply Inc (Hunte)	300	CS	\$8.59	\$2,577.00	Duraplus 2424HT34. 24x24 6Mic Natural	Duraplus	2424HT34	
[ALT1] Advanced Blending, Inc. DBA: LAsT Group Enterprises	300	CS	\$8.89	\$2,667.00	24" x 24" Mic 6, or Equal. 50 Bags per Roll / 20 Rolls per Case. Net Lbs 9.1; Quoting Pinnacle Plastics #H242406N (Equal to listed specifications)	Pinnacle Plastics	H242406N	
Unipak Corp.	300	CS	\$8.90	\$2,670.00	WE ARE BIDDING EXACTLY AS SPEC'D: UNIPAK BRAND: UPC242406	Interplast Group	EC242406N	
MH ENTERPRISES	300	CS	\$9.69	\$2,907.00	**THESE ARE INTEPLAST BAGS NO ABSOLUTELY SUBSTITUIONS**Orders must in in full pallet quantities (80 cs) Min order per PO/order is 6 Pallets this can be of any SKU#/Manufacturer# combination on this BID (EC242406N - WSL3339XHW-WSL3339XHW)	Interplast Group	EC242406N	
CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORP.	300	CS	\$9.75	\$2,925.00	Central Poly #CP2424N6	Interplast Group	EC242406N	
Interboro Packaging Corp.	300	CS	\$9.82	\$2,946.00		Interplast Group	EC242406N	
[ALT1] PROFESSIONAL POLISH, INC.	300	CS	\$10.37	\$3,111.00	High Density Polyethylene (HDPE) Natural	Interplast Group	CP242406N	
[ALT1] Gateway Printing	300	CS	\$10.54	\$3,162.00	Quoting alternate item:7-10 Gallon / width 24" Length 24" / Bag gauge 6 (mic) / Color natural/black / Case count 1000 / Rolls/Bags 20/50 / Max dry load 15lbs /**Please allow 14 lead time after receipt of order**	Napco	NAPNR242406N/K	
[ALT1] CC Distributors, Inc.	300	CS	\$11.12	\$3,336.00	24" x 24" Mic 6 50 Bags per Roll / Case pack 1000	Republic Bag Co	N242406CR	
Limitless Office Products	300	CS	\$11.17	\$3,351.00	NO RETURN ORDER	Interplast Group	EC242406N	
Yanitor Paper and Supplies, LLC	300	CS	\$11.54	\$3,462.00	Price per case	Interplast Group	EC242406N	
[ALT1] Hillyard, Texas	300	CS	\$12.00	\$3,600.00	24"x 24" 6Mic Natural 100bags per roll / 10 rolls per case	Berry Liners	LH24246N	
Performance Safety Group I, LP	300	CS	\$13.00	\$3,900.00		Interplast Group	EC242406N	
[ALT1] Performance Safety Group I, LP	300	CS	\$13.00	\$3,900.00	24" x 24", 6 Mic, 50 Bags per Roll / 20 Rolls per Case	Pitt Plastics	MR24249MC	
[ALT1] Quill LLC	300	CS	\$18.40	\$5,520.00	Quill Item # BID-814902Brighton Professional™ 24x24 8-10 Gallon Trash Bags, High Density, Light Duty, 20/50 Bags/Box, Natural ColorDescriptionCollect office trash quickly and efficiently with these Brighton Professional high-density trash bags. Keep your office cleaning supply closet stocked with these trash bags. Made with high-strength resin for extra durability and hold, these bags are built to hold up to 10 gallons of trash, making them perfect for everyday office, warehouse or depot garbage and debris. With a star-sealed bottom to prevent leaks, these Brighton Professional trash bags are ideal for both dry and wet trash. Ideal for all trash applications, including heavy industrial trash Medium strength - great for kitchen trash and throughout the workplace The 10 gal. capacity is perfect for the kitchen or throughout the house Clear color for viewing contents and preventing theft Sold as 1000 trash bags per box High density for excellent lifting strength and good puncture resistance Star Seal for the best leak prevention 0.24 mil. thickness	Brighton Professional	HD242406R	
[ALT1] MAVICH	300	CS	\$19.55	\$5,865.00	7 to 10 gal. Light Trash Bags, Clear, Coreless Roll of 1000, Thickness 6 micron	Tough Guy	4KN28	

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
TRASH CAN LINERS FOR USE DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 18-19-046
BID OPENING: APRIL 8, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

2	33" x 39" .80 Mil or Equal. 25 Bags per Roll / 6 Rolls per Case. Net Lbs 9.9							
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes / Alternate Description	Manufacturer	Manuf Num	
Quill LLC	8000	CS	No Bid			Interplast Group	WSL3339XHW	
Advanced Blending, Inc.	8000	CS	No Bid			Interplast Group	WSL3339XHW	
DBA: LAsT Group Enterprises								
[ALT5] Interboro Packaging Corp.	8000	CS	\$7.48	\$59,840.00	Interplast INT-3339-X-Hvy As Per Sample #2C - Black	Manufactured in Texas	Interplast/Capital/Glopak	
[ALT4] Interboro Packaging Corp.	8000	CS	\$7.84	\$62,720.00	INT-3339-X-Hvy As Per Sample #2C	Manufactured in Texas	Interplast/Capital/Glopak	
Unipak Corp.	8000	CS	\$8.64	\$69,120.00	UPC 3339XHW AS PER USUAL, WE ARE CURRENT SUPPLIER	Interplast Group	WSL3339XHW	
[ALT3] Interboro Packaging Corp.	8000	CS	\$8.68	\$69,440.00	Interplast INT-3339-XH As Per Sample #2B - Black	Manufactured in Texas	Interplast/Capital/Glopak	
[ALT2] Interboro Packaging Corp.	8000	CS	\$8.82	\$70,560.00	Interplast INT-3339-XH As Per Sample #2B	Manufactured in Texas	Interplast/Capital/Glopak	
Performance Safety Group I, LP	8000	CS	\$9.15	\$73,200.00		Interplast Group	WSL3339XHW	
[ALT1] Performance Safety Group I, LP	8000	CS	\$9.15	\$73,200.00	33" x 39", .80 Mil, 25 Bags per Roll / 6 Rolls per Case	PSG	LLDWT-3339-150	
Western BRW -	8000	CS	\$9.17	\$73,360.00	Part # L3339.8W	Interplast Group	WSL3339XHW	
Bosworth Papers (JP Gould)								
[ALT1] Advanced Blending, Inc. DBA: LAsT Group Enterprises	8000	CS	\$9.24	\$73,920.00	33" x 39", .80 Mil or Equal. 25 Bags per Roll / 6 Rolls per Case. Net Lbs 9.9; Quoting Pinnacle Plastics #L3339.8W (Equal to listed specifications)	Pinnacle Plastics	L3339.8W	
[ALT1] Safeway Supply Inc (Hunte)	8000	CS	\$9.74	\$77,920.00	Duraplast 3339LW20. 33x39 .8Mil White	Duraplast	3339LW20	
CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORP.	8000	CS	\$9.80	\$78,400.00	Central Poly #CP3339WH	Interplast Group	WSL3339XHW	
MH ENTERPRISES	8000	CS	\$9.96	\$79,680.00	**THESE ARE INTEPLAST BAGS NO ABSOLUTELY SUBSTITUIONS**Orders must in in full pallet quantities (64 cs) Min order per PO/order is 6 Pallets this can be of any SKU#/Manufacturer# combination on this BID (EC242406N - WSL3339XHW-WSL3339XHW)	Interplast Group	WSL3339XHW	
[ALT1] Interboro Packaging Corp.	8000	CS	\$10.48	\$83,840.00	Interplast INT-3339-XXH As Per Sample #2A - Black	Manufactured in Texas	Interplast/Capital/Glopak	
Limitless Office Products	8000	CS	\$10.80	\$86,400.00	NO RETURN ORDER	Interplast Group	WSL3339XHW	
Interboro Packaging Corp.	8000	CS	\$10.82	\$86,560.00	Interplast INT-3339-XXH As Per Sample #2AManufactured in Texas Interplast/Capital	Interplast Group	WSL3339XHW	
[ALT1] CC Distributors, Inc.	8000	CS	\$11.05	\$88,400.00	33" x 39" Xtr Hvy 150 pack / White	Republic Bag Co	CRXH39W	
[ALT1] Gateway Printing	8000	CS	\$11.07	\$88,560.00	Quoting Alternate item:33 Gallon / width 33" length 39" / Bag gauge 0.8 (mil) / Color white / Case count 150 / Rolls/Bags 6/25 / Max dry load 55lbs**Please allow 14 lead time after receipt of order**	Napco	Custom	
Yanitor Paper and Supplies, LLC	8000	CS	\$11.40	\$91,200.00	Price per case	Interplast Group	WSL3339XHW	
[ALT1] PROFESSIONAL POLISH, INC.	8000	CS	\$13.27	\$106,160.00	White LLDPE Can Liner Grade: Extra Heavy	Interplast Group	LLDPE3339080	
[ALT1] Hillyard, Texas	8000	CS	\$13.51	\$108,080.00	33" X 40" .79Mil White 25 bags per roll / 6 rolls per case	Berry Liners	LX334020w	
[ALT1] MAVICH	8000	CS	\$29.10	\$232,800.00	33 gal. Extra Heavy Trash Bags, White, Coreless Roll of 150Thickness 1.00 mil	Tough Guy	31DK49	

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
TRASH CAN LINERS FOR USE DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 18-19-046
BID OPENING: APRIL 8, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

3	38" x 58" .80 MIL or Equal. 25 Bags per Roll / 4 Rolls per case. Net Lbs 11.3							
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes / Alternate Description	Manufacturer	Manuf Num	
Quill LLC	6000	CS	No Bid			Interplast Group	WSL3858XHW	
Advanced Blending, Inc.	6000	CS	No Bid			Interplast Group	WSL3858XHW	
DBA: LAsT Group Enterprises								
[ALT5] Interboro Packaging Corp.	6000	CS	\$9.18	\$55,080.00	INT-3858-X-Hvy As Per Sample #3C - Black	Manufactured in Texas	Interplast/Capital/Glopak	
[ALT4] Interboro Packaging Corp.	6000	CS	\$9.34	\$56,040.00	INT-3858-X-Hvy As Per Sample #3C	Manufactured in Texas	Interplast/Capital/Glopak	
Unipak Corp.	6000	CS	\$9.90	\$59,400.00	UPC 3858XHW AS PER USUSAL,WE ARE CURRENT SUPPLIER	Interplast Group	WSL3858XHW	
Performance Safety Group I, LP	6000	CS	\$10.25	\$61,500.00		Interplast Group	WSL3858XHW	
Western BRW - Bosworth Papers (JP Gould)	6000	CS	\$10.25	\$61,500.00	Part 3 I3858.8W	Interplast Group	WSL3858XHW	
[ALT1] Performance Safety Group I, LP	6000	CS	\$10.25	\$61,500.00	38" x 58" .80 Mil, 25 Bags per Roll / 4 Rolls per case	PSG	LLDWT-3858-100	
[ALT3] Interboro Packaging Corp.	6000	CS	\$10.48	\$62,880.00	INT-3858-XH As Per Sample #3B - Black	Manufactured in Texas	Interplast/Capital/Glopak	
CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORP.	6000	CS	\$10.50	\$63,000.00	Central Poly #CP3858WH	Interplast Group	WSL3858XHW	
[ALT1] Advanced Blending, Inc. DBA: LAsT Group Enterprises	6000	CS	\$10.53	\$63,180.00	38" x 58" .80 MIL or Equal. 25 Bags per Roll / 4 Rolls per case. Net Lbs 11.3; Quoting Pinnacle Plastics #L3858.8W (Equal to listed specifications)	Pinnacle Plastics	L3858.8W	
[ALT2] Interboro Packaging Corp.	6000	CS	\$10.84	\$65,040.00	INT-3858-XH As Per Sample #3B	Manufactured in Texas	Interplast/Capital/Glopak	
[ALT1] Safeway Supply Inc (Hunte)	6000	CS	\$10.91	\$65,460.00	Duraplus 3858LW20. 38x58 .8Mil White	Duraplus	3858LW20	
MH ENTERPRISES	6000	CS	\$11.46	\$68,760.00	**THESE ARE INTEPLAST BAGS NO ABSOLUTELY SUBTIUIONS**Orders must in in full pallet quantities (64 cs) Min order per PO/order is 6 Pallets this can be of any SKU#/Manufacturer combination on this BID (EC242406N - WSL3339XHW-WSL3339XHW)	Interplast Group	WSL3858XHW	
[ALT1] Interboro Packaging Corp.	6000	CS	\$11.72	\$70,320.00	INT-3858-XXH As Per Sample #3A - Black	Manufactured in Texas	Interplast/Capital/Glopak	
Interboro Packaging Corp.	6000	CS	\$11.98	\$71,880.00	INT-3858-XXH As Per Sample #3AManufactured in Texas Interplast/Capital/Glopak	Interplast Group	WSL3858XHW	
Limitless Office Products	6000	CS	\$12.47	\$74,820.00	NO RETURN ORDER	Interplast Group	WSL3858XHW	
[ALT1] CC Distributors, Inc.	6000	CS	\$12.61	\$75,660.00	38" x 58" Xtr Hvy 100 pack / White	Republic Bag Co	CRXH60W	
[ALT1] Gateway Printing	6000	CS	\$12.63	\$75,780.00	Quoting alternate item:60 Gallon / width 38" length 58" / Bag gauge 0.8 (mil) / Color white / Case count 100 / Rolls/Bags 4/25 / Max dry load 55lbs **Please allow 14 lead time after receipt of order**	Napco	Custom	
Yanitor Paper and Supplies, LLC	6000	CS	\$13.00	\$78,000.00	Price per case	Interplast Group	WSL3858XHW	
[ALT1] Hillyard, Texas	6000	CS	\$15.01	\$90,060.00	38" X 58" .79Mil White 20 bags per roll / 5 rolls per case	Berry Liners	LX386020W	
[ALT1] PROFESSIONAL POLISH, INC.	6000	CS	\$15.15	\$90,900.00	White LLDPE Can Liner Grade: Extra Heavy	Interplast Group	LLDPE3858080	
[ALT1] MAVICH	6000	CS	\$39.75	\$238,500.00	60 gal. Extra Heavy Trash Bags, White, Coreless Roll of 100Thickness 1.00 mil	Tough Guy	31DK52	