
PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.

ULTRASOUND MACHINE FOR CATE DEPARTMENT BID # 18-19-045

BID OPENING: MARCH 6, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes Description

Lynn Medical 4 EA 24,625.00$      98,500.00$      LOW BID JUSTIFIED

Medco Supply Company (Performance Health)4 EA No Bid No Bid

MedCorp LLC 4 EA 20,950.00$       83,800.00$       SEE JUSTIFICATION

*Lynn Medical was the lowest bid submitted.

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes Description

Lynn Medical 3 EA 0.00$                0.00$                Included in total, not sold seperately LOW BID

Medco Supply Company (Performance Health)3 EA No Bid No Bid

MedCorp LLC 3 EA 2,500.00$         7,500.00$         

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes Description

Lynn Medical 2 EA 0.00$                0.00$                Included in total, not sold seperately LOW BID

Medco Supply Company (Performance Health)2 EA No Bid No Bid

MedCorp LLC 2 EA 2,500.00$         5,000.00$         

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes Description

Lynn Medical 2 EA 0.00$                0.00$                Included in total, not sold seperately LOW BID

Medco Supply Company (Performance Health)2 EA No Bid No Bid

MedCorp LLC 2 EA 2,500.00$         5,000.00$         

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes Description

Lynn Medical 4 EA 0.00$                0.00$                Included in total, not sold seperately LOW BID

Medco Supply Company (Performance Health)4 EA 12.90$               51.60$               Each and not 4 in a Case. Includes Dispenser. Chattanooga Brand

MedCorp LLC 4 EA 55.70$               222.80$            

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes Description

Lynn Medical 4 EA 0.00$                0.00$                Included in total, not sold seperately LOW BID

Medco Supply Company (Performance Health)4 EA 7.77$                 31.08$               Each and not 12 in a Case

MedCorp LLC 4 EA 96.00$               384.00$            

RECOMMENDATION:  That the Board of Education award Ultrasound Machine for CATE Department Bid # 18-19-045 to the lowest bidder indicated below:

TOTAL(S):

98,500.00$                                               

98,500.00$                               

Emily Garza / Director of Purchasing

Charged Budgeted Account Number: 484-11-832-99 LVN-6639-00

Seventeen (17) vendors were sent email invitations to bid.

Ten (10) vendors viewed bid specifications

Three (3) vendors submitted bid

Four (4) vendors NO BID

TOTAL:

1, 2, 3, 4, 5 and 6

1.  GE Healthcare Logiq F8 Ultrasound Machine or equal / GE Helathcare / LOGIQ F8

2.  Convex Array Probe (2D Curved Array) / GE / 4C-RS

3.  Linear Array Probe / GE / L6-12-RS

4.  Phased Array Probe / GE / 3SC-RS

5.  Ultrasound Gel / AccuGel

6.  Disinfecting Towelettes / Metrex / CaviWipes

BIDDER(S):ITEM(S):

Lynn Medical
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ADMINISTRATIVELY APPROVED / MARCH 8, 2019


