

PHARR-SAN JUAN-ALAMO I.S.D.
**DRILL TEAM UNIFORMS FOR PSJA HIGH SCHOOL, PSJA NORTH HIGH SCHOOL,
 PSJA MEMORIAL HIGH SCHOOL AND PSJA SOUTHWEST HIGH SCHOOL BID # 18-19-033**
BID OPENING: FEBRUARY 11, 2019 @ 4:00 P.M.

1. PSJA High School - Drill Team Uniform

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	44	Uniforms	\$789.96	\$34,758.24	LOW BID
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	44	Uniforms	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	44	Uniforms	No Bid	No Bid	

1.1 Jacket-Rangerette Style (Line & Officers)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$115.00	\$115.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

1.2 Crystal Button for Jacket (Line & Officers)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	8	EA	\$5.62	\$44.96	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	8	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	8	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

1.3 Sequin Short Sleeve Top (Line & Officers)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$95.00	\$95.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

1.4 Sequin Skirt – Semi-circle (Line & Officers)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$90.00	\$90.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

1.5 Sequin Skirt (style #1) – Slim Style (Line & Officers)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$90.00	\$90.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

1.6 Sequin Skirt (style #2) – Slim Style (Line & Officers)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$90.00	\$90.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

1.7 White and Dark Maroon Neck Scarf (Line & Officers)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$6.00	\$6.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

PHARR-SAN JUAN-ALAMO I.S.D.
 DRILL TEAM UNIFORMS FOR PSJA HIGH SCHOOL, PSJA NORTH HIGH SCHOOL,
 PSJA MEMORIAL HIGH SCHOOL AND PSJA SOUTHWEST HIGH SCHOOL BID # 18-19-033
 BID OPENING: FEBRUARY 11, 2019 @ 4:00 P.M.

1.8 Pink Neck Scarf (Line & Officers)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$6.00	\$6.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

1.9 Leather Belts (Line & Officers)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$60.00	\$60.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

1.10 Leather Wrist Gauntlets (Line and Officers)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$60.00	\$60.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

1.11 Superstretch Sleeveless Top (Line & Officers)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$70.00	\$70.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

1.12 Superstretch Briefs (Line & Officers)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$18.00	\$18.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

1.13 Single Layer Petticoat (Line & Officers):

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$45.00	\$45.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

2. PSJA High School - Drill Team Uniform

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	Uniform	\$386.20	\$386.20	LOW BID
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	Uniform	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	Uniform	No Bid	No Bid	

2.1 Male Jacket – Rangerette Style

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$100.00	\$100.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

PHARR-SAN JUAN-ALAMO I.S.D.
**DRILL TEAM UNIFORMS FOR PSJA HIGH SCHOOL, PSJA NORTH HIGH SCHOOL,
 PSJA MEMORIAL HIGH SCHOOL AND PSJA SOUTHWEST HIGH SCHOOL BID # 18-19-033**
BID OPENING: FEBRUARY 11, 2019 @ 4:00 P.M.

2.2 Male Crystal Buttons for Jacket

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	10	EA	\$5.62	\$56.20	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	10	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	10	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

2.3 Male Sequin Short Sleeve Top (style #1)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$95.00	\$95.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

2.4 Male Sequin Short Sleeve Top (style #2)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$65.00	\$65.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

2.5 Male Pants

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$70.00	\$70.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

3. PSJA North High School - Drill Team Uniform

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	60	Uniforms	\$698.00	\$41,880.00	LOW BID
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	60	Uniforms	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	60	Uniforms	No Bid	No Bid	

3.1 Sequin Design Vest (Line & Officers)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$115.00	\$115.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

3.2 Petticoat Skirt with Sequin Design (Line & Officers)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$115.00	\$115.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

3.3 Ruffle with Sequin (Line & Officers)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$30.00	\$30.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

PHARR-SAN JUAN-ALAMO I.S.D.
**DRILL TEAM UNIFORMS FOR PSJA HIGH SCHOOL, PSJA NORTH HIGH SCHOOL,
 PSJA MEMORIAL HIGH SCHOOL AND PSJA SOUTHWEST HIGH SCHOOL BID # 18-19-033**
BID OPENING: FEBRUARY 11, 2019 @ 4:00 P.M.

3.4 Sleeveless Top with Collar (Line & Officers)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$40.00	\$40.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

3.5 Plain Superstretch Briefs (Line & Officers)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$18.00	\$18.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

3.6 Sequin Bolero Jacket (Line & Officers)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$125.00	\$125.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

3.7 All Sequin Skirt (Line & Officers)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$100.00	\$100.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

3.8 Leather Belts (Line & Officers)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$40.00	\$40.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

3.9 Leather Wrist Gauntlets (Line & Officers)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$40.00	\$40.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

3.10 Double Layer Petticoat (Line and Officers)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$75.00	\$75.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

4. PSJA Memorial High School - Drill Team Uniform

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	45	EA	\$768.00	\$34,560.00	LOW BID
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	45	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	45	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

PHARR-SAN JUAN-ALAMO I.S.D.
DRILL TEAM UNIFORMS FOR PSJA HIGH SCHOOL, PSJA NORTH HIGH SCHOOL,
PSJA MEMORIAL HIGH SCHOOL AND PSJA SOUTHWEST HIGH SCHOOL BID # 18-19-033
BID OPENING: FEBRUARY 11, 2019 @ 4:00 P.M.

4.1 Sequin Jacket – Rangerette Style (Line & Officers)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$150.00	\$150.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

4.2 Sequin Overlay (Line & Officers)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$100.00	\$100.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

4.3 Sequin Short Sleeve Top (Line & Officers)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$115.00	\$115.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

4.4 Sequin Skirt – Semi-circle (Line & Officers)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$90.00	\$90.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

4.5 Sequin Skirt – Slim Style (Line & Officers)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$100.00	\$100.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

4.6 Leather Belts (Line & Officers)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$45.00	\$45.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

4.7 Leather Wrist Gauntlets (Line and Officers)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$45.00	\$45.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

4.8 Superstretch Sleeveless Top (Line & Officers)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$40.00	\$40.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

PHARR-SAN JUAN-ALAMO I.S.D.
**DRILL TEAM UNIFORMS FOR PSJA HIGH SCHOOL, PSJA NORTH HIGH SCHOOL,
 PSJA MEMORIAL HIGH SCHOOL AND PSJA SOUTHWEST HIGH SCHOOL BID # 18-19-033**
BID OPENING: FEBRUARY 11, 2019 @ 4:00 P.M.

4.9 Superstretch Briefs (Line & Officers)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$18.00	\$18.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

4.10 Double Layer Petticoat (Line & Officers)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$65.00	\$65.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

5. PSJA Southwest High School - Drill Team Uniform

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	45	Uniforms	\$690.00	\$31,050.00	LOW BID
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	45	Uniforms	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	45	Uniforms	No Bid	No Bid	

5.1 Sequin Design Vest (Line & Officers)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$115.00	\$115.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

5.2 Petticoat Skirt with Sequin Design (Line & Officers)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$100.00	\$100.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

5.3 Long Sleeve Blouse with Collar (Line & Officers)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$75.00	\$75.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

5.4 All Sequin Western Style Jacket (Line & Officers)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$170.00	\$170.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

5.5 Skirt with Sequin at Hem (Line & Officers)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$85.00	\$85.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

PHARR-SAN JUAN-ALAMO I.S.D.
DRILL TEAM UNIFORMS FOR PSJA HIGH SCHOOL, PSJA NORTH HIGH SCHOOL,
PSJA MEMORIAL HIGH SCHOOL AND PSJA SOUTHWEST HIGH SCHOOL BID # 18-19-033
BID OPENING: FEBRUARY 11, 2019 @ 4:00 P.M.

5.6 Navy Sequin Belt (Line & Officers):

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$50.00	\$50.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

5.7 Silver Sequin Belt (Line & Officers):

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$50.00	\$50.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

5.8 Single Layer Petticoat (Line & Officers)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Description
Cheers Etc., Inc.	1	EA	\$45.00	\$45.00	
Inzer Advance Designs Inc	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	
Oates Specialties LLC	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	

RECOMMENDATION: That the Board of Education award Drill Team Uniforms for PSJA High School, PSJA North High School, PSJA Memorial High School and PSJA Southwest High School Bid # 18-19-033 to the lowest bidder as indicated below:

<u>ITEM:</u>	<u>SUPPLIER:</u>	<u>TOTAL:</u>
1, 2, 3, 4 and 5	Cheers Etc., Inc.	\$142,634.44
	TOTAL:	\$142,634.44

Emily Garza, Director of Purchasing

Account Number:

One hundred thirty (130) Bidders received invitations to bid
 Thirty-seven (37) vendors viewed Bid Specifications
 Three (3) Vendors submitted Bid
 Fifteen (15) Vendors NO BID