

**PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.**  
**FIRE ALARM INSTALLATION AND REPAIR SERVICES DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 18-19-023**  
**BID OPENING: FEBRUARY 21, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.**

<b>Bid Request Number</b>	# 18-19-023 Addendum 1	<b>Organization</b>	PSJA ISD Ebids
<b>Title</b>	FIRE ALARM INSTALLATION AND REPAIR SERVICES DISTRICT-WIDE	<b>Bid Creator</b>	Graciela Ortiz
<b>Description</b>		<b>Email</b>	graciela.ortiz@psjaisd.us
<b>Bid Type</b>	Bid	<b>Phone</b>	
<b>Issue Date</b>	2/1/2019 11:27:19 AM (CT)	<b>Fax</b>	
<b>Close Date</b>	2/21/2019 02:30:00 PM (CT)		

Awarded Suppliers

Name	City	State	Classifications	Lines Awarded	Award Total	Award Reason
Safeguard Fire & Security	Mission	TX		6	\$210.00	Primary
Superior Alarms	McAllen	TX		10	\$220.00	Secondary

RECOMMENDATION: That the Board of Education award Fire Alarm Installation and Repair Services District-Wide Bid # 18-19-023 to the lowest bidders as indicated below:

<u>ITEMS</u>	<u>SUPPLIERS</u>	<u>TOTAL</u>
1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 6, 7, 8, 9 and 10	Safeguard Fire & Security	Purchased on "as needed" basis
1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 6, 7, 8, 9 and 10	Superior Alarms	Purchased on "as needed" basis

\_\_\_\_\_  
Emily Garza, Director of Purchasing

Account Number: 199-51-936-9990MO-6299-00

Fifteen (15) Vendors viewed Bid Specifications  
Five (5) Submitted Bid  
Five (5) Vendors NO BID  
Zero (0) Non-responsive/Non-conforming

**PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.**  
**FIRE ALARM INSTALLATION AND REPAIR SERVICES DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 18-19-023**  
**BID OPENING: FEBRUARY 21, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.**

Line	Qty	UOM	Description	Manuf. Number	Award Response	Award Quantity	Awarded Supplier	Award Reason
1	1	EA	Hourly Labor Charge-Straight Time		\$50.00	1	Safeguard Fire & Security	Primary
2	1	EA	Hourly Labor Charge-Overtime: (Including after 5:00p.m.) We		\$70.00	1	Safeguard Fire & Security	Primary
3	1	EA	Hourly Labor Charge-Extra Man Straight Time		\$30.00	1	Safeguard Fire & Security	Primary
4	1	EA	Hourly Labor Charge-Extra Man Overtime: (Including after 5:(		\$45.00	1	Safeguard Fire & Security	Primary
5	1	EA	Service Calls Charge (if any)		\$0.00	1	Safeguard Fire & Security	Primary
10	1	EA	Parts-Cost Plus (%)		\$15.00	1	Safeguard Fire & Security	Primary
1	1	EA	Hourly Labor Charge-Straight Time		\$60.00	1	Superior Alarms	Secondary
2	1	EA	Hourly Labor Charge-Overtime: (Including after 5:00p.m.) We		\$70.00	1	Superior Alarms	Secondary
3	1	EA	Hourly Labor Charge-Extra Man Straight Time		\$25.00	1	Superior Alarms	Secondary
4	1	EA	Hourly Labor Charge-Extra Man Overtime: (Including after 5:(		\$35.00	1	Superior Alarms	Secondary
5	1	EA	Service Calls Charge (if any)		\$0.00	1	Superior Alarms	Secondary
6	1	EA	Parts-Current Mfg. Jobber Price		\$0.00	1	Superior Alarms	Secondary
7	1	EA	Parts-Current Mfg. Jobber Price Less		\$0.00	1	Superior Alarms	Secondary
8	1	EA	Parts-Shelf Price (Discount % or 0%)		\$0.00	1	Superior Alarms	Secondary
9	1	EA	Parts-Catalog Price Discount (%)		\$30.00	1	Superior Alarms	Secondary
10	1	EA	Parts-Cost Plus (%)		\$0.00	1	Superior Alarms	Secondary

**PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.**  
**FIRE ALARM INSTALLATION AND REPAIR SERVICES DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 18-19-023**  
**BID OPENING: FEBRUARY 21, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.**

<b>1 Hourly Labor Charge-Straight Time</b>								
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manuf	Manuf Num
Primary	Safeguard Fire & Security	1	EA	\$50.00	\$50.00			
	Strongline Security & Fire (Luis 1		EA	\$55.00	\$55.00			
Secondary	Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder E1	1	EA	\$60.00	\$60.00			
	ABSOLUTE Services (LMH & L 1		EA	\$75.00	\$75.00	Per hour.		
	JOHNSON CONTROLS FIRE F 1		EA	\$75.00	\$75.00			
<b>2 Hourly Labor Charge-Overtime: (Including after 5:00p.m.) Weekends and Holidays</b>								
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manuf	Manuf Num
	Strongline Security & Fire (Luis 1		EA	\$65.00	\$65.00			
Primary	Safeguard Fire & Security	1	EA	\$70.00	\$70.00			
Secondary	Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder E1	1	EA	\$70.00	\$70.00			
	ABSOLUTE Services (LMH & L 1		EA	\$95.00	\$95.00	Per hour.		
	JOHNSON CONTROLS FIRE F 1		EA	\$112.00	\$112.00			
<b>3 Hourly Labor Charge-Extra Man Straight Time</b>								
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manuf	Manuf Num
Secondary	Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder E1	1	EA	\$25.00	\$25.00			
	Strongline Security & Fire (Luis 1		EA	\$30.00	\$30.00			
Primary	Safeguard Fire & Security	1	EA	\$30.00	\$30.00			
	ABSOLUTE Services (LMH & L 1		EA	\$35.00	\$35.00	Per hour.		
	JOHNSON CONTROLS FIRE F 1		EA	\$55.00	\$55.00			
<b>4 Hourly Labor Charge-Extra Man Overtime: (Including after 5:00p.m.) Weekends and Holidays</b>								
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manuf	Manuf Num
Secondary	Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder E1	1	EA	\$35.00	\$35.00			
	Strongline Security & Fire (Luis 1		EA	\$40.00	\$40.00			
Primary	Safeguard Fire & Security	1	EA	\$45.00	\$45.00			
	ABSOLUTE Services (LMH & L 1		EA	\$55.00	\$55.00	Per hour.		
	JOHNSON CONTROLS FIRE F 1		EA	\$142.00	\$142.00			
<b>5 Service Calls Charge (if any)</b>								
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manuf	Manuf Num
	ABSOLUTE Services (LMH & L 1		EA	\$0.00	\$0.00			
Primary	Safeguard Fire & Security	1	EA	\$0.00	\$0.00			
Secondary	Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder E1	1	EA	\$0.00	\$0.00			
	Strongline Security & Fire (Luis 1		EA	\$55.00	\$55.00			
	JOHNSON CONTROLS FIRE F 1		EA	\$90.00	\$90.00			
<b>6 Parts-Current Mfg. Jobber Price</b>								
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manuf	Manuf Num
	Strongline Security & Fire (Luis 1		EA	No Bid				
Secondary	Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder E1	1	EA	\$0.00	\$0.00	See Item 9		
Primary	Safeguard Fire & Security	1	EA	No Bid				
<b>7 Parts-Current Mfg. Jobber Price Less</b>								
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manuf	Manuf Num
	Strongline Security & Fire (Luis 1		EA	No Bid				
Secondary	Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder E1	1	EA	\$0.00	\$0.00	See Item 9		
Primary	Safeguard Fire & Security	1	EA	No Bid				
<b>8 Parts-Shelf Price (Discount % or 0%)</b>								
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manuf	Manuf Num
Secondary	Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder E1	1	EA	\$0.00	\$0.00	See Item 9		
	ABSOLUTE Services (LMH & L 1		EA	\$0.00	\$0.00			
Primary	Safeguard Fire & Security	1	EA	No Bid				
	Strongline Security & Fire (Luis 1		EA	No Bid				
	JOHNSON CONTROLS FIRE F 1		EA	\$10.00	\$10.00			
<b>9 Parts-Catalog Price Discount (%)</b>								
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manuf	Manuf Num
	ABSOLUTE Services (LMH & L 1		EA	\$0.00	\$0.00			
Primary	Safeguard Fire & Security	1	EA	No Bid				
	Strongline Security & Fire (Luis 1		EA	No Bid				
	JOHNSON CONTROLS FIRE F 1		EA	\$10.00	\$10.00			
Secondary	Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder E1	1	EA	\$30.00	\$30.00	Off of our parts list, up to 30% discount.		

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.  
 FIRE ALARM INSTALLATION AND REPAIR SERVICES DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 18-19-023  
 BID OPENING: FEBRUARY 21, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

10	Parts-Cost Plus (%)							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manuf	Manuf Num
Secondary	Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder E1	1	EA	\$0.00	\$0.00	See Item 9		
	JOHNSON CONTROLS FIRE F 1		EA	\$10.00	\$10.00			
Primary	Safeguard Fire & Security	1	EA	\$15.00	\$15.00			
	ABSOLUTE Services (LMH & L 1		EA	\$25.00	\$25.00			