1. Bus. 11R22.5 (No Deviations)

PHARR-SAN JUAN-ALAMO 1.S.D.
TIRES FOR MAINTENANCE AND TRANSPORTATION VEHICLES BID # 18-19-021
BID OPENING: JANUARY 8, 2019 @ 2:30 p.m.

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 150 EA | S 200.00 | $ 30,000.00 Hankook AH12 Hancook LOW BID
LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC (LuisN 150 EA S 299.00 | $ 44,850.00 Hancook
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 150 EA | S 240.00 | $ 36,000.00 Hancook
T&W Tire 150 EA S 250.00 [ $ 37,500.00 Hancook
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company (150 EA No Bid No Bid Hancook
2. Bus. 255/70 R22.5 (No Deviations

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 30 EA S 229.00 [ $ 6,870.00 Hankook AH37 Hancook TIE
LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC (LuisN 30 EA S 339.75 [ $ 10,192.50 Hancook
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 30 EA S 265.00 [ $ 7,950.00 Hancook
T&W Tire 30 EA S 229.00 | $ 6,870.00 Hancook TIE/AWARDED
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company (30 EA No Bid No Bid Hancook
3. Truck. LT265/70 R17 10 Ply or equal.

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 30 EA S 13437 | S 4,031.10 General Grabber HD Firestone
LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC (LuisN 30 EA S 181.50 | $ 5,445.00 Firestone
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 30 EA | $ 136.00 | $ 4,080.00 Firestone
T&W Tire 30 EA | S 14030 | S  4,209.00 Firestone
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 30 EA S 127.37 | $ 3,821.10 | Goodyear Wrangler Trailrunner AT, 742661681 Firestone LOW BID
4. Aero Lift. 8-14.5 12 Ply or equal.

Supplier QTY | uOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 2 EA | $ 51.75 | $ 103.50 Zeemax Deestone LOW BID
LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC (LuisN 2 EA S 8475 | $ 169.50 Deestone
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 2 EA S 67.28 | $ 134.56 Zeemax 7001H1431 Deestone
T&W Tire 2 EA S 64.00 | S 128.00 Deestone
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company | 2 EA No Bid No Bid Deestone
5. Backhoe. 19.5L-24 or equal.

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 2 EA | S 339.75 S 679.50 Deestone D314 Goodyear LOW BID
[ALT1] LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC| 2 EA | S 469.75 | $ 939.50 DEESTONE IND R-4D314 TL Goodyear
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 2 EA | S 534.00 [ $ 1,068.00 Firestone Goodyear
[ALT1] T&W Tire 2 EA | S 395.00 | $ 790.00 19.5124 12 ply #200439-33 Galaxie
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company | 2 EA | S 542.02 [ $ 1,084.04 | Goodyear American Backhoe, F12, 206098004 Goodyear
6. Backhoe. 11L-16 or equal.

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 4 EA | S 101.75 | S 407.00 Deestone D412 Lande
[ALT1] LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC| 4 EA | S 155.75 | $ 623.00 DEESTONE D412 F-3TL Lande
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 4 EA | S 99.00 | $ 396.00 Regency 378372 Lande LOW BID
T&W Tire 4 EA [$ 11000 $  440.00 Lande
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company (| 4 EA No Bid No Bid Lande
7. Badboy. 13x6.50-6/4.50 or equal.

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 4 EA | S 1050 | S 42.00 Deestone D837 Carlisle LOW BID
LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC (LuisN 4 EA | S 2950 | $ 118.00 Carlisle
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 4 EA | S 1213 | S 48.52 OTR Engineering T13656011 Carlisle
T&W Tire 4 EA | S 25.00 | $ 100.00 Carlisle
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company (| 4 EA No Bid No Bid Carlisle
8. Badboy. 26x12.00-12NHS or equal.

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 4 EA | S 45.75 S 183.00 Deestone D265 Maxxis LOW BID
[ALT1] LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC| 4 EA | S 199.00 | $ 796.00 CARLISLE Maxxis
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 4 EA S 7167 | $ 286.68 Hi Run WD1144 Maxxis
T&W Tire 4 EA | S 98.00 | $  392.00 Maxxis
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company (| 4 EA No Bid No Bid Maxxis
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9. Bobcat, 12-16.5 TL or equal.

PHARR-SAN JUAN-ALAMO 1.S.D.
TIRES FOR MAINTENANCE AND TRANSPORTATION VEHICLES BID # 18-19-021
BID OPENING: JANUARY 8, 2019 @ 2:30 p.m.

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 4 EA | S 100.00 | $  400.00 Deestone D311 Carlisle LOW BID
LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC (Luis M 4 EA S 249.25 | $ 997.00 Carlisle
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 4 EA | S 132.00 | $ 528.00 Regency 378712 Carlisle
T&W Tire 4 EA S 194.00 | $ 776.00 Carlisle
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company (| 4 EA | S 167.23 | $ 668.92 |Goodyear American Skid Steer, SSL-2A, 206116014 Carlisle
10. Cutter, 21x7-12 16 ply severe duty tire or equal.

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 4 EA S 155.00 [ S 620.00 Traks TT airplane recap
LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC (Luis | 4 EA S 185.75 | S 743.00 LOW BID
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 4 EA No Bid No Bid
T&W Tire 4 EA No Bid No Bid
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company (| 4 EA No Bid No Bid
*Hesselbein Tire Southwest bid a recap tire.
11. Gator, 22x9.50-10 NHS or equal.

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 4 EA | S 68.00 | S 272.00 Carlisle Turf Tracks Carlisle TIE
LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC (LuisN 4 EA S 102.00 | $ 408.00 Carlisle
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 4 EA | S 90.79 | $ 363.16 Carlisle CA5793N1 Carlisle
T&W Tire 4 EA S 68.00 | $ 272.00 Carlisle TIE/AWARDED
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company | 4 EA No Bid No Bid Carlisle
12. Gator. 24x10.50x10 or equal.

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 4 EA S 90.00 | $ 360.00 Carlisle all trail Carlisle TIE
LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC (LuisN 4 EA S 114.00 | $ 456.00 Carlisle
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 4 EA | S 103.56 | $ 414.24 Carlisle CA55A3N9 Carlisle
T&W Tire 4 EA S 90.00 | $ 360.00 Carlisle TIE/AWARDED
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company | 4 EA No Bid No Bid Carlisle
13. Gator. AT22.5x10.00-8 or equal.

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 4 EA | S 73.00 | $  292.00 Carlisle field trax Carlisle LOW BID
LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC (Luis N 4 EA S 99.25 [ $ 397.00 Carlisle
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 4 EA | S 82.84 | S 331.36 Carlisle CA5883B9 Carlisle
T&W Tire 4 EA S 78.95 [ $ 315.80 Carlisle
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company (| 4 EA No Bid No Bid Carlisle
14. Gator. AT25x13-9 or equal.

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 4 EA | S 93.00 | $ 372.00 Carlisle HD field trax Carlisle
[ALT1] LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC] 4 EA S 88.25 [ $ 353.00 DEESTONE DIRTDRAGON D943 ATVTL Carlisle
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 4 EA | S 105.76 | S 423.04 Carlisle CA588394 Carlisle
T&W Tire 4 EA S 87.95| $ 351.80 Carlisle LOW BID
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company | 4 EA No Bid No Bid Carlisle
15. Gator. 26x12-12 or equal.

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 4 EA | S 89.25|$  357.00 Carlisle Trac CS Carlisle LOW BID
LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC (Luis N 4 EA S 177.00 | S 708.00 Carlisle
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 4 EA | S 13091 | $ 523.64 Carlisle CA523361 Carlisle
T&W Tire 4 EA S 12695 | $ 507.80 Carlisle
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company (| 4 EA No Bid No Bid Carlisle
16. Gator. AT26x9-12 or equal.

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 4 EA | S 81.00 | $  324.00 Carlisle Versa Trail Carlisle LOW BID
LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC (Luis M 4 EA S 112.25| S 449.00 Carlisle
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 4 EA | S 94.09 | $ 376.36 Carlisle CA6D0272 Carlisle
T&W Tire 4 EA S 82.95( S 331.80 Carlisle
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company (| 4 EA No Bid No Bid Carlisle
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17. Gator. AT22.5x10-8 or equal.

PHARR-SAN JUAN-ALAMO 1.S.D.
TIRES FOR MAINTENANCE AND TRANSPORTATION VEHICLES BID # 18-19-021
BID OPENING: JANUARY 8, 2019 @ 2:30 p.m.

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 4 EA | S 73.00 | $ 292.00 Carlisle Field Trax Carlisle LOW BID
LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC (Luis M 4 EA S 99.25 [ $ 397.00 Carlisle
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 4 EA | S 82.84 | S 331.36 Carlisle CA5883B9 Carlisle
T&W Tire 4 EA S 76.95 [ S 307.80 Carlisle
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company | 4 EA No Bid No Bid Carlisle
18. Gator. 25x12-9 Turf or equal.

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 4 EA | S 73.00 | $ 292.00 Carlisle Turf Trac RS Carlisle LOW BID
LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC (Luis N 4 EA S 108.00 | $ 432.00 Carlisle
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 4 EA S 76.17 | S 304.68 Carlisle CAS0D3T7 Carlisle
T&W Tire 4 EA S 85.95 | S 343.80 Carlisle
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company (| 4 EA No Bid No Bid Carlisle
19. Golf Cart. 23x10.50-12 Turf or equal.

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 12 EA | S 3850 | $  462.00 Deestone D265 Carlisle LOW BID
LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC (LuisN 12 EA | S 11250 | $ 1,350.00 Carlisle
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 12 EA S 42021 $ 504.24 Hi Run WD1044 Carlisle
T&W Tire 12 EA S 7095 | $ 851.40 Carlisle
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company (| 12 EA No Bid No Bid Carlisle
20. Golf Cart. 18x8.50-8 Turf or equal.

Supplier QTY | uOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 20 EA | $ 2225 | $ 445.00 Deestone D265 Carlisle LOW BID
LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC (LuisN 20 EA S 90.75 [ $ 1,815.00 Carlisle
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 20 EA S 20.67 | $ 413.40 Hi Run WD1133 Carlisle
T&W Tire 20 EA S 3695 | $ 739.00 Carlisle
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company (| 20 EA No Bid No Bid Carlisle
21. Golf Cart. 15x6.50-8 Turf or equal.

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 4 EA | $ 30.75 | S 123.00 Carlisle Turf Master Carlisle LOW BID
LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC (LuisN 4 EA | S 5475 | $ 219.00 Carlisle
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 4 EA S 38.60 | $ 154.40 Carlisle 5112531 Carlisle
T&W Tire 4 EA S 31.95( S 127.80 Carlisle
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company (| 4 EA No Bid No Bid Carlisle
22. Golf Mower. 18x9.50-8 Smooth or equal.

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 2 EA S 2350 S 47.00 Deestone Carlisle
LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC (LuisN 2 EA | S 75.50 | S 151.00 Carlisle
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 2 EA | S 2087 S 41.74 OTR Engineering T189508008 Carlisle LOW BID
T&W Tire 2 EA | S 4195 | S 83.90 Carlisle
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company | 2 EA No Bid No Bid Carlisle
23. Passenger Vehicle. P225/60R16 Speed Rating H or equal.

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 4 EA | S 7499 | S 299.96 General Altimax RT43 Firestone LOW BID
[ALT1] LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC| 4 EA S 103.75 | $ 415.00 FALKEN SINCERA SN20 A/S Firestone
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 4 EA S 76.00 | $ 304.00 Firestone
T&W Tire 4 EA | S 8453 | S 338.12 Firestone
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company (| 4 EA | S 107.44 | S 429.76 | Goodyear Eagle RSA Police Pursuit, 732354500 Firestone
24. Passenger Vehicle. P235/55 R17 Speed Rating H or equal.

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 8 EA S 98.70 [ $ 789.60 General Altimax RT43 Firestone
[ALT1] LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC| 8 EA | S 170.25 | $ 1,362.00 CONTINENTAL Firestone
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 8 EA | S 98.00 | S 784.00 Firestone
T&W Tire 8 EA | $ 90.85 [ $  726.80 Firestone LOW BID
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company | 8 EA | S 119.00 | $ 952.00 | Goodyear Eagle RSA Police Pursuit, 732297500 Firestone
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25. Riding Mower. 24x12.00-12 NHS or equal.

PHARR-SAN JUAN-ALAMO 1.S.D.
TIRES FOR MAINTENANCE AND TRANSPORTATION VEHICLES BID # 18-19-021
BID OPENING: JANUARY 8, 2019 @ 2:30 p.m.

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 4 EA | S 4200 | $ 168.00 Deestone D265 Carlisle LOW BID
LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC (Luis M 4 EA S 101.75 | S 407.00 Carlisle
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 4 EA | S 49.92 [ $  199.68 OTR Engineering 7241212004 Carlisle
T&W Tire 4 EA S 83.95( S 335.80 Carlisle
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company (| 4 EA No Bid No Bid Carlisle
26. Riding Mower. 16x6.50-8 or equal.

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 50 EA | S 17.25 [ S 862.50 Deestone D265 Deestone
LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC (LuisN 50 EA S 4225 1S 2,112.50 Deestone
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 50 EA 3 16.03 | $ 801.50 Hi Run WD1100 Deestone LOW BID
T&W Tire 50 EA S 26.95 [ $ 1,347.50 Deestone
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company (50 EA No Bid No Bid Deestone
27. Riding Mower. 18x8.50-8 or equal.

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 10 EA | S 21.25 | S 212.50 Deestone D265 Deestone
LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC (LuisN 10 EA S 4525 | $ 452.50 Deestone
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 10 EA S 20.67 | $ 206.70 Hi Run WD1133 Deestone LOW BID
T&W Tire 10 EA | S 2395 | $ 239.50 Deestone
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company (| 10 EA No Bid No Bid Deestone
28. Riding Mower. 23x10.50-12 NHS or equal.

Supplier QTY | uOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 4 EA | $ 38.50 | $ 154.00 Deestone D265 Titan LOW BID
[ALT1] LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC| 4 EA | S 111.50 | $ 446.00 CARLISLE Titan
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 4 EA | S 42.02 | $ 168.08 Hi Run WD1044 Titan
T&W Tire 4 EA No Bid No Bid Titan
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company (| 4 EA No Bid No Bid Titan
29. Sweeper. P205/75 R14 or equal.

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 2 EA | S 45.00 | S 90.00 Vercelli 787 Hankook LOW BID
[ALT1] LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC| 2 EA | S 8250 | $ 165.00 NEXEN N'PRIZ AH5 WW Hankook
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 2 EA S 5460 | $ 109.20 Vercelli VC003 Hankook
T&W Tire 2 EA | S 49.95| S 99.90 Hankook
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company (2 EA No Bid No Bid Hankook
30. Tractor. 25x8.50-14 NHS or equal.

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 2 EA S 97.00 | $ 194.00 Calisle Trac Chief Carlisle
LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC (LuisN 2 EA | S 116.25 | $ 232.50 Carlisle
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 2 EA S 9892 [ S 197.84 Galaxy GAL102103 Carlisle
T&W Tire 2 EA | $ 95.95 | $ 191.90 Carlisle LOW BID
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company (| 2 EA No Bid No Bid Carlisle
31. Tractor. 14.9-24 Farm or equal

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 2 EA | S 262.50 | $ 525.00 Crop Mac R1 Carlisle LOW BID
[ALT1] LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC 2 EA S 41775 | $ 835.50 ALLIANCE FARM PRO 324 R1TT Carlisle
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 2 EA | S 366.00 | $ 732.00 Firestone 365061 Carlisle
T&W Tire 2 EA No Bid No Bid Carlisle
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company (| 2 EA No Bid No Bid Carlisle
32. Tractor. 15x6.00-6 Turf or equal.

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 4 EA S 13.25 | $ 53.00 Deestone D265 Carlisle
LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC (LuisN 4 EA | S 53.75 | $ 215.00 Carlisle
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 4 EA | S 11.73 | $ 46.92 Hi Run WD1036 Carlisle LOW BID
T&W Tire 4 EA | S 19.95 | $ 79.80 Carlisle
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company (| 4 EA No Bid No Bid Carlisle
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33. Tractor. 27x8.50-15 NHS or equal.

PHARR-SAN JUAN-ALAMO 1.S.D.
TIRES FOR MAINTENANCE AND TRANSPORTATION VEHICLES BID # 18-19-021
BID OPENING: JANUARY 8, 2019 @ 2:30 p.m.

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 2 EA | S 59.75| S 119.50 Deestone D304 Carlisle LOW BID
[ALT1] LEGR Wheels Tires and More LL(C 2 EA S 133.00 | $ 266.00 BKT Carlisle
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 2 EA | S 7248 | S 144.96 Deestone 6102 Carlisle
T&W Tire 2 EA No Bid No Bid Carlisle
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company | 2 EA No Bid No Bid Carlisle
34. Tractor. 14.9-28 or equal.

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 2 EA | S 279.50 | S 559.00 Crop Max R1 Firestone LOW BID
LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC (Luis N 2 EA S 485.75 | $ 971.50 Firestone
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 2 EA S 397.00 | $ 794.00 Firestone
T&W Tire 2 EA No Bid No Bid Firestone
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company | 2 EA No Bid No Bid Firestone
35. Tractor. 18.4-30 or equal.

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 2 EA |$ 437.75|S$  875.50 Alliance Farm Pro Goodyear LOW BID
[ALT1] LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC| 2 EA | S 749.00 [ $ 1,498.00 FIRESTONE SAT 11 23 R-1 T/L Goodyear
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 2 EA | $ 574.00 [ $ 1,148.00 Firestone 372626 Goodyear
T&W Tire 2 EA No Bid No Bid Goodyear
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company | 2 EA No Bid No Bid Goodyear
36. Tractor. 41x14.00-20 NHS or equal.

Supplier QTY | uOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 2 EA | S 309.00 | $ 618.00 Carlisle Multi Trac CS R-3 Titan LOW BID
LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC (LuisN 2 EA | S 450.00 | $ 900.00 Titan
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 2 EA No Bid No Bid Titan
T&W Tire 2 EA No Bid No Bid Titan
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company (| 2 EA No Bid No Bid Titan
37. Tractor. 13.6-16 R3 or equal.

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 2 EA | S 173.25 | S 346.50 Crop Master Turf Titan LOW BID
[ALT1] LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC| 2 EA | S 33950 | $ 679.00 CARLISLE Titan
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 2 EA | S 312.00 | $ 624.00 Firestone 345210 Titan
T&W Tire 2 EA No Bid No Bid Titan
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company (2 EA No Bid No Bid Titan
38. Trailer. 7.50-16 or equal.

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 24 EA | S 65.00 | S 1,560.00 Zeemax 10 ply Carlisle LOW BID
LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC (LuisN 24 EA | S 12550 | $ 3,012.00 Carlisle
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 24 EA S 7457 [ $ 1,789.68 Taskmaster SF225D16F Carlisle
T&W Tire 24 EA $85.95( $  2,062.80 Carlisle
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company (| 24 EA No Bid No Bid Carlisle
39. Trailer. ST225/75 R15 6 Ply or equal.

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 20 EA | S 26.75 S 935.00 Zeemax Carlisle LOW BID
LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC (LuisN 20 EA S 91.50 [ $ 1,830.00 Carlisle
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 20 EA | S 5213 | $ 1,042.60 Zenna GL1172052253 Carlisle
T&W Tire 20 EA S 60.95 | $ 1,219.00 Carlisle
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company (20 EA S 8493 (S 1,698.60 Goodyear Endurance ST, £10, 724857519 Carlisle
40. Trencher. 26x12.00-12 Lug or equal.

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 2 EA | S 69.00 | $ 138.00 Deestone D408 Carlisle LOW BID
LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC (LuisN 2 EA | S 200.00 [ $  400.00 Carlisle
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 2 EA S 9295 | $ 185.90 Deestone DS5336 Carlisle
T&W Tire 2 EA $110.95| §  221.90 Carlisle
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company | 2 EA No Bid No Bid Carlisle
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41. Truck. 245/75R22.5 14 Ply or eq

sal.

PHARR-SAN JUAN-ALAMO 1.S.D.
TIRES FOR MAINTENANCE AND TRANSPORTATION VEHICLES BID # 18-19-021
BID OPENING: JANUARY 8, 2019 @ 2:30 p.m.

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 4 EA | S 22550 | $  902.00 Sumitomo ST718 Bridgestone LOW BID
[ALT1] LEGR Wheels Tires and More LL(C 4 EA S 31850 [ $ 1,274.00 TOYO M154 PREM REGIONAL AP Bridgestone
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 4 EA | S 328.00 [ $ 1,312.00 Bridgestone
T&W Tire 4 EA No Bid No Bid Bridgestone
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company | 4 EA | S 337.03 [ $ 1,348.12 Goodyear Endurance RSA, G14, 756168674 Bridgestone
42. Truck. LT235/75 R15 6 Ply or equal.

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 8 EA | S 109.16 | $ 873.28 General Grabber ATX Firestone
[ALT1] LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC 8 EA S 164.25 | S 1,314.00 YOKOHAMA GEOLANDER A/T Firestone
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 8 EA S 100.00 | $ 800.00 Firestone LOW BID
T&W Tire 8 EA No Bid No Bid Firestone
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company | 8 EA | S 12047 | $ 963.76 Goodyear Wrangler HT E100, 744826802 Firestone
43. Truck. LT265/75 R16 10 Ply or

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 8 EA | S 12471 | $ 997.68 General Grabber HD Firestone
LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC (LuisN 8 EA | S 185.75 | $ 1,486.00 Firestone
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 8 EA | $ 128.00 | $ 1,024.00 Firestone
T&W Tire 8 EA | S 12895 | $ 1,031.60 Firestone
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 8 EA | $ 11736 | $ 938.88 [Goodyear Wrangler Trailrunner AT, E10, 74274668 Firestone LOW BID
44. Truck. LT215/85 R16 10 Ply or equal.

Supplier QTY | uOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 4 EA | S 103.44 | $ 413.76 General Grabber HD Firestone LOW BID
LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC (LuisN 4 EA | $ 17000| $  680.00 Firestone
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 4 EA | $ 104.00 | S 416.00 Firestone
T&W Tire 4 EA | S 119.95 | $ 479.80 Firestone
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company (| 4 EA | $ 11453 | S 458.12 |Goodyear Wrangler Trailrunner AT, E10, 742517681 Firestone
45. Truck. LT245/75 R16 10 Ply or equal.

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 24 EA | S 109.16 [ $ 2,619.84 General Grabber HD Firestone LOW BID
LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC (LuisN 24 EA | S 178.25| S 4,278.00 Firestone
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 24 EA | S 111.00 | $ 2,664.00 Firestone
T&W Tire 24 EA | S 13895 | $ 3,334.80 Firestone
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company | 24 EA | S 110.69 | S 2,656.56 [Goodyear Wrangler Trailrunner AT, E10, 742103681 Firestone
46. Truck. LT245/70 R17 10 Ply or equal.

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 12 EA | S 11732 [ $ 1,407.84 General Grabber HD Firestone LOW BID
LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC (LuisN 12 EA | S 187.50 | $ 2,250.00 Firestone
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 12 EA | S 122.00 | $ 1,464.00 Firestone
T&W Tire 12 EA | S 15395 | $ 1,847.40 Firestone
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company (12 EA | S 128.01 | $ 1,536.12 | Goodyear Wrangler Trailrunner AT, E10,74212681 Firestone
47. Truck. LT275/65 R18 10 Ply or equal.

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 8 EA | S 14596 | S 1,167.68 General Grabber HTS60 Firestone
[ALT1] LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC 8 EA S 208.50 [ $ 1,668.00 TOYO OPEN COUNTRY H/T BSW Firestone
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 8 EA | S 148.00 | S 1,184.00 Firestone
T&W Tire 8 EA | S 139.95 [ $ 1,119.60 Firestone LOW BID
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company | 8 EA | S 159.00 | $ 1,272.00 |Goodyear Wrangler Trailrunner AT, E10,742954680) Firestone
48. Passenger Vehicle. P205/60 R16 or equal.

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 6 EA | S 7040 | $ 422.40 General Altimax RT43 Firestone LOW BID
[ALT1] LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC| 6 EA | S 105.00 | $ 630.00 TOYO TIRES EXTENSA A/S BLK Firestone
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 6 EA S 72.00 | $ 432.00 Firestone
T&W Tire 6 EA | S 72.95| S 437.70 Firestone
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company | 6 EA S 73.16 | $ 438.96 Goodyear Eagle LS, 706586492 Firestone
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PHARR-SAN JUAN-ALAMO 1.S.D.
TIRES FOR MAINTENANCE AND TRANSPORTATION VEHICLES BID # 18-19-021
BID OPENING: JANUARY 8, 2019 @ 2:30 p.m.

49, Light Truck. HP SUV All Season.

Supplier QTY | UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest 6 EA | S 11590 | S 695.40 General Gmax Justice Firestone LOW BID
LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC (LuisN 6 EA S 44350 | S 2,661.00 Firestone
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 6 EA | S 123.00 | $ 738.00 Firestone
[ALT1] T&W Tire 6 EA S 12166 | $ 729.96 p265/60R17 #88590 BF Goodrich Advantage T/A
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company (Good 6 EA | S 129.28 | S 775.68 Goodyear Eagle RSA Police, 732301500 Firestone
Recommendation: That the Board of Education award Tires for Maintenance and Transportation Vehicles Bid # 18-19-021 to the lowest bidder as indicated below:
Item(s): Bidder(s): Total(s):
1,4,5,7,8,9,13,15,16, 17,18, 19, 20, 21, Hesselbein Tire Southwest S 46,844.70
23, 25, 28, 29, 31, 33, 34, 35, 36, 37, 38, 39,
40, 41, 44, 45, 46, 48, and 49
10 LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC (Luis Martinez) S 743.00
6,22, 26,27,32 and 42 Southern Tire Mart, LLC S 2,292.86
2,11,12,14,24,30and 47 T&W Tire S 9,892.10
3and 43 The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company S 4,759.98
TOTAL: $ 64,532.64
Emily Garza, Director of Purchasing
Charged Budgeted Account Numbers: 199-131301
Ten (10) Vendors viewed bid specifications
Five (5) Vendors submitted Bid
Five (5) NO BID
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