

PHARR-SAN JUAN-ALAMO I.S.D.
TIRES FOR MAINTENANCE AND TRANSPORTATION VEHICLES BID # 18-19-021
BID OPENING: JANUARY 8, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

AS ORIGINALLY AWARDED BY THE BOARD OF EDUCATION - FEBRUARY 19, 2019

1. Bus. 11R22.5 (No Deviations)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes / Alternate Description	Mfgr	Manuf Num	Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest	150	EA	\$ 200.00	\$ 30,000.00	Hankook AH12	Hankook		LOW BID
LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC (Luis Martin	150	EA	\$ 299.00	\$ 44,850.00		Hankook		
Southern Tire Mart, LLC	150	EA	\$ 240.00	\$ 36,000.00		Hankook		
T&W Tire	150	EA	\$ 250.00	\$ 37,500.00		Hankook		
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company (Good	150	EA	No Bid	No Bid		Hankook		

THIS IS NOW THE RECOMMENDATION OF PROPERTY MANAGEMENT DEPARTMENT:

1. Bus. 11R22.5 (No Deviations)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes / Alternate Description	Mfgr	Manuf Num	Description
Hesselbein Tire Southwest	150	EA	\$ 200.00	\$ 30,000.00	Hankook AH12	Hankook		SEE JUSTIFICATION
LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC (Luis Martin	150	EA	\$ 299.00	\$ 44,850.00		Hankook		
Southern Tire Mart, LLC	150	EA	\$ 240.00	\$ 36,000.00		Hankook		SEE JUSTIFICATION
T&W Tire	150	EA	\$ 250.00	\$ 37,500.00		Hankook		LOW BID JUSTIFIED
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company (Good	150	EA	No Bid	No Bid		Hankook		

**Hesselbein Tire Southwest is unable to supply the specified tire and the second lowest bidder Southern Tire Mart, LLC is unable to honor the price that was bid.

Recommendation: That the Board of Education rescind and reaward Item #1 of the Tires for Maintenance and Transportation Vehicles Bid # 18-19-021 to the lowest bidder as indicated below:

RESCIND:	BIDDER	TOTAL
1	Hesselbein Tire Southwest	\$ 30,000.00
RE-AWARD:		
1	T & W Tire	\$ 37,500.00

Emily Garza / Director of Purchasing

Charge budgeted account number: # 199-131301

Ten (10) Vendors viewed bid specifications
 Five (5) Vendors submitted Bid
 Five (5) NO BID