

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
FLOOR WAX AND STRIPPER FOR CENTRAL SUPPLY WAREHOUSE BID # 18-19-006
BID OPENING: OCTOBER 29, 2018 @ 3:00 P.M.

1 Finish 101, Acrylic Polymer Low Maintenance Floor Finish, or equal. 12,000 Gallons in 5 Gallon Pails						
Supplier	QTY	Price	Extended	Manufacturer	Manuf Num	Award
A-1 Vacuum Center, Inc. [ALT1]	2400	\$46.50	\$111,600.00	Simoniz Wet-Look-Plus	CS0750XXX	SEE JUSTIFICATION
CC Distributors, Inc. [ALT1]	2400	\$118,632.00	\$118,632.00	CarrollClean	68019	SEE JUSTIFICATION
Eagle Brush & Chemical, Inc.	2400	No Bid	No Bid	Betco	69605-00	
Eagle Brush & Chemical, Inc. [ALT1]	2400	\$50.25	\$120,600.00	Eagle Brush & Chemical	14-113	SEE JUSTIFICATION
Rio Paper & Supply, LLC	2400	\$51.99	\$124,776.00	Betco	69605-00	LOW BID JUSTIFIED
Rio Paper & Supply, LLC [ALT1]	2400	\$51.99	\$124,776.00	Buckeye International	5131-5000, Clarion 25	

*A-1 Vacuum Center Inc. [ALT1] was non-responsive within the 5 days required to provide a sample of their floor finish. CC Distributors, Inc. [Alt1] sample when applied had no shine at all when compared to the other samples. Eagle Brush & Chemical, Inc. [ALT1] sample turned yellow and had a dull look when applied.

2 Very aggressive no-rinse floor stripper or equal. 5000 Gallons in 5 gallon pails.						
Supplier	QTY	Price	Extended	Manufacturer	Manuf Num	Award
A-1 Vacuum Center, Inc. [ALT1]	1000	\$28.50	\$28,500.00	Simoniz Release	R3025XXX	SEE JUSTIFICATION
CC Distributors, Inc. [ALT1]	1000	\$29,890.00	\$29,890.00	CarrollClean	31019	LOW BID JUSTIFIED
Eagle Brush & Chemical, Inc.	1000	No Bid	No Bid	AX-IT Plus BETCO	15405-00	
Eagle Brush & Chemical, Inc. [ALT1]	1000	\$35.00	\$35,000.00	Eagle Brush & Chemical, Inc.	12-193S	
Rio Paper & Supply, LLC	1000	\$31.05	\$31,050.00	AX-IT Plus BETCO	15405-00	
Rio Paper & Supply, LLC [ALT1]	1000	\$46.17	\$46,170.00	Buckeye International	5035-500, SWAT NA	
Rio Paper & Supply, LLC [ALT2]	1000	\$43.35	\$43,350.00	NCL	1058-21, Bare Bones	

*A-1 Vacuum Center, Inc. [ALT1] was non-responsive within the 5 days required to provide a sample of their floor stripper.

Recommendation: That the Board of Education award Floor Wax and Stripper for Central Supply Warehouse Bid # 18-19-006 to the lowest bidders indicated below:

<u>ITEM(S):</u>	<u>BIDDER(S):</u>	<u>TOTALS:</u>
2	CC Distributors, Inc. [ALT1] (Corpus Christi, TX)	\$29,890.00
1	Rio Paper & Supply, LLC (Pharr, TX)	\$124,776.00
	Grand Total-	\$154,666.00

 Larry Doeppenschmidt / Director of Purchasing

 Emily Garza / Director of Purchasing

Charge Various Budgeted Account Numbers District-Wide

Five (5) vendors viewed bid specifications

Four (4) vendors submitted bid

One (1) vendor NO BID