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DCHS Career Fair For NWGA Businesses

The 4th Annual Davis PTO Father-Daughter Event

https://alliancefordade.com/careerfair-registration/
https://www.facebook.com/davisjackets/photos/pcb.1668988056776987/1668984940110632/
https://runsignup.com/Race/GA/Trenton/BlueRibbonGlowRun
https://ga50000081.schoolwires.net/Page/2#calendar1/20220328/month


The Davis Elementary PTO sponsored the fourth annual Father-Daughter Dance on Saturday,
March 19th. Principal Charity Barton stated that "it was a magical night" for the kids. Davis
Elementary would also like to thank the DCHS students for participating and earning
community service hours. To see more photos of the event, click HERE or click the image
above.

DES Media Center Bookmark Designers

https://www.facebook.com/davisjackets/photos/pcb.1668988056776987/1668984940110632/


As part of Read Across America Week, students participated in a bookmark contest. They
designed a bookmark on the theme of reading, and the winners received a free book! We even
selected more than one winner in a few grades! Not pictured at this time are: 3rd-grade
winner, Adalyn Oliver; and another 5th-grade winner, Mason Smith.

DMS 8th Grade Parent Meeting Coming Soon

MARK YOUR CALENDARS! Dade Middle School will be hosting a parent meeting for 8th-grade
parents on Thursday, March 31, 2022 at 6:00PM in the DMS Cafeteria. If you have questions
about this meeting, please contact Ms. Beeler at DMS.



Dade Elementary To Host Parent Workshop

Dade Elementary School will host a parent workshop on March 29th from 6PM - 7PM. The
workshop is open to ALL DCS Families and the workshop will focus on techniques and
strategies to utilize in difficult situations. Please RSVP by emailing Ms. Deidre Stewart or feel
free to give her a call at 423-490-5491.

mailto:deidrestewart@dadecs.org


Dade & Davis Elementary Pre-K Registration

Dade and Davis Elementary Schools are now accepting registration applications for Pre-K. Also,
if your student did not attend Pre-K this year, now is the time to begin the registration process
for Kindergarten. If you would like more information, please contact the front office at either
one of the schools. The contact number for Dade Elementary is 706-657-8253 and the contact
number for Davis Elementary is 706-657-6300

Meet DCS Social Worker - Ms. Kristin Barrett

Blue Ribbon Glow Run Event Registration



March Calendar Of Events



For up-to-date events, please be sure to check the district calendar as scheduled events may
change or new events may be added. Click HERE to view the monthly calendar of events.

The Dade County Board of Education will hold its regular-scheduled meeting Monday, March
28, 2022, at 5:00PM. The meeting will be held at the Dade County Board of Education building
located at 52 Tradition Lane Trenton, GA. 30752. For a listing of the Dade County Board of
Education's monthly meetings, please click HERE.

 ​  ​
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