



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT
BROWNSVILLE
 INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Board Meeting August 1, 2023

RFP # 24-010 Graduation & Honor Award District-Wide

1 DIPLOMAS INSERTS - DIPLOMA INSERTS 8 1/2 X11". PANORAMIC WITH SCHOOL CREST WITH TWO FOIL COLOR. VELLUM BRISTLE #80, ONE INK COLOR.(BLACK).COLOR,OFF-WHITE OR WHITE. RAISED LETTERING.SCHOOL NAME(5 SCHOOLS). SCHOOL CAMPUS DESIGN. NAME OF STUDENT. EACH INDIVIDUAL CAMPUS WILL PLACE THEIR OWN ORDERS ON AN AS NEEDED BASIS. Note to Vendor: You must participate on all line items 1 thru 6.

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Recommendation
Herff Jones Graduation Center	1	EACH	\$3.95	Recommended

2 DIPLOMAS COVERS - PLATES FOR DIPLOMAS COVERS. EACH INDIVIDUAL CAMPUS WILL PLACE THEIR OWN ORDERS ON AN AS NEEDED BASIS. . Note to Vendor: You must participate on all line items 1 thru 6.

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Recommendation
Herff Jones Graduation Center	1	EACH	\$0.00	Recommended

3 COVERS, DIPLOMA - COVER, PADDED. COVER TO BE OF ONE COLOR FOIL W/GOLD OR SILVER LETTERING WITH NAME OF SCHOOL. INSIDE COVER TO HAVE ETCHING OF SCHOOL. DIPLOMA SIZE TO BE 9 X13" . COST OF PRINT PLATE TO BE INCLUDED IN BID PRICE. EACH INDIVIDUAL CAMPUS WILL PLACE THEIR OWN ORDERS ON AN AS NEEDED BASIS.. Note to Vendor: You must participate on all line items 1 thru 6.

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Recommendation
Herff Jones Graduation Center	1	EACH	\$6.95	Recommended

4 DIPLOMAS - FACSIMILE SIGNATURES. (ALL HIGH SCHOOLS). EACH INDIVIDUAL CAMPUS WILL PLACE THEIR OWN ORDERS ON AN AS NEEDED BASIS.. Note to Vendor: You must participate on all line items 1 thru 6.

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Recommendation
Herff Jones Graduation Center	1	EACH	\$0.00	Recommended



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT
BROWNSVILLE
 INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Board Meeting August 1, 2023

RFP # 24-010 Graduation & Honor Award District-Wide

5 **DIPLOMAS - ETCHING DESIGN FOR DIPLOMAS. (ALL HIGH SCHOOLS). EACH INDIVIDUAL CAMPUS WILL PLACE THEIR OWN ORDERS ON AN AS NEEDED BASIS.. Note to Vendor: You must participate on all line items 1 thru 6.**

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Recommendation
Herff Jones Graduation Center	1	EACH	\$0.00	Recommended

6 **DIPLOMA ENVELOPE - ENVELOPES FOR DIPLOMAS. 10-1/2 X 7-1/2, ONE COLOR INK.COLOR, OFF-WHITE OR WHITE.. Note to Vendor: You must participate on all line items 1 thru 6.**

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Recommendation
Herff Jones Graduation Center	1	EACH	\$0.00	Recommended

7 **CORDS - HONOR CORDS. ONE COLOR - THICK CORD. THE QUANTITIES BEING REQUESTED ON THIS ITEM IS AN ESTIMATION ONLY. EACH INDIVIDUAL CAMPUS WILL PLACE THEIR OWN ORDERS ON AN AS NEEDED BASIS.**

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Recommendation
LUGRA INC (SPECIALTY ADVERTISERS)	1	EACH	\$3.39	1st Vendor of Choice
Herff Jones Graduation Center	1	EACH	\$3.50	2nd Vendor of Choice
Trevino's Digital Photography, Inc	1	EACH	\$3.75	3rd Vendor of Choice

8 **CORDS - HONOR CORDS. TWO COLOR WOVEN TOGETHER - THICK CORD. EACH INDIVIDUAL CAMPUS WILL PLACE THEIR OWN ORDERS ON AN AS NEEDED BASIS.**

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Recommendation
Lamac	1	EACH	\$1.85	1st Vendor of Choice
Trevino's Digital Photography, Inc	1	EACH	\$3.75	2nd Vendor of Choice
LUGRA INC (SPECIALTY ADVERTISERS)	1	EACH	\$3.79	3rd Vendor of Choice

9 **CORDS - HONOR CORDS. TWO SEPARATE COLOR CORDS - THICK CORD. EACH INDIVIDUAL CAMPUS WILL PLACE THEIR OWN ORDERS ON AN AS NEEDED BASIS.**

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Recommendation
Lamac	1	EACH	\$3.35	1st Vendor of Choice
Jostens, Inc.	1	EACH	\$3.95	2nd Vendor of Choice
LUGRA INC (SPECIALTY ADVERTISERS)	1	EACH	\$3.95	3rd Vendor of Choice



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT
BROWNSVILLE
 INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Board Meeting August 1, 2023

RFP # 24-010 Graduation & Honor Award District-Wide

10 CORDS - HONOR CORDS. THREE COLOR - (AMERICANA) THICK CORD. EACH INDIVIDUAL CAMPUS WILL PLACE THEIR OWN ORDERS ON AN AS NEEDED BASIS.

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Recommendation
Lamac	1	EACH	\$3.35	1st Vendor of Choice
Jostens, Inc.	1	EACH	\$3.95	2nd Vendor of Choice
LUGRA INC (SPECIALTY ADVERTISERS)	1	EACH	\$4.49	3rd Vendor of Choice

11 MEDALS - OLYMPIAD GOLD PLATED MEDAL WITH LETTER B (IN SCHOOL COLOR) WITH NECK RIBBON IN SAME COLOR. ENGRAVE ON BACK; NAME OF THE SCHOOL (SPACE) 19XX- ENGRAVE ONE (1) EACH: VALEDICTORIAN, SALUTATORIAN, HONOR 3RD PLACE. BID PRICE MUST INCLUDE CHARGE OF DIE/ART ON CUSTOM MEDALS. EACH INDIVIDUAL CAMPUS WILL PLACE THEIR OWN ORDERS ON AN AS NEEDED BASIS.

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Recommendation
Lamac	1	EACH	\$2.50	1st Vendor of Choice
Texas Music Festivals Enterprise, Inc.	1	EACH	\$4.50	2nd Vendor of Choice
Jostens, Inc.	1	EACH	\$8.00	3rd eVendor of Choice

12 MEDALS - TOP 5% CUSTOM MEDALS - GOLD PLATED FOR 12TH GRADE. SIZE 12 OR 1- 1/2 INDIAMETER. MEDAL WITH NAME OF HIGH SCHOOL AROUND OUTER EDGE WITH SCHOLARSHIP PANEL ATTACHED IN CENTER OF MEDAL. MEDAL WILL HAVE AN ATTACHED KEY RING; COST IS INCLUDED IN MEDAL PRICE. BID PRICE MUST INCLUDE CHARGE OF DIE/ART ON CUSTOM MEDALS. EACH INDIVIDUAL CAMPUS WILL PLACE THEIR OWN ORDERS ON AN AS NEEDED BASIS.

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Recommendation
Texas Music Festivals Enterprise, Inc.	1	EACH	\$4.50	1st Vendor of Choice
Lamac	1	EACH	\$6.00	2nd Vendor of Choice
Gradzilla of New Mexico	1	EACH	\$7.50	3rd Vendor of Choice



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT
BROWNSVILLE
 INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Board Meeting August 1, 2023
RFP # 24-010 Graduation & Honor Award District-Wide

13 MEDALS - TOP 5% CUSTOM MEDALS - SILVER TONE FOR 11TH GRADE. SIZE 12 OR 1- 1/2 INDIAMETER. MEDAL WITH NAME OF HIGH SCHOOL AROUND OUTER EDGE WITH SCHOLARSHIP PANEL ATTACHED IN CENTER OF MEDAL. MEDAL WILL HAVE AN ATTACHED KEY RING; COST IS INCLUDED IN MEDAL PRICE. BID PRICE MUST INCLUDE CHARGE OF DIE/ART ON CUSTOM MEDALS. EACH INDIVIDUAL CAMPUS WILL PLACE THEIR OWN ORDERS ON AN AS NEEDED BASIS.

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Recommendation
Lamac	1	EACH	\$4.50	1st Vendor of Choice
Texas Music Festivals Enterprise, Inc.	1	EACH	\$4.50	2nd Vendor of Choice
Gradzilla of New Mexico	1	EACH	\$7.50	3rd Vendor of Choice

14 MEDALS - TOP 5% CUSTOM MEDALS - BRONZE FOR 10TH GRADE. SIZE 12 OR 1-1/2 INDIAMETER. MEDAL WITH NAME OF HIGH SCHOOL AROUND OUTER EDGE WITH SCHOLARSHIP PANEL ATTACHED IN CENTER OF MEDAL. MEDAL WILL HAVE AN ATTACHED KEY RING; COST IS INCLUDED IN MEDAL PRICE. BID PRICE MUST INCLUDE CHARGE OF DIE/ART ON CUSTOM MEDALS. EACH INDIVIDUAL CAMPUS WILL PLACE THEIR OWN ORDER.

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Recommendation
Lamac	1	EACH	\$4.25	1st Vendor of Choice
Texas Music Festivals Enterprise, Inc.	1	EACH	\$4.50	2nd Vendor of Choice
Gradzilla of New Mexico	1	EACH	\$7.50	3rd Vendor of Choice

15 MEDALS - TOP 5% CUSTOM MEDALS - BRONZART FOR 9TH GRADE. SIZE 12 OR 1-1/2 IN DIAMETER. MEDAL WITH NAME OF HIGH SCHOOL AROUND OUTER EDGE WITH SCHOLARSHIP PANEL ATTACHED INCENTER OF MEDAL. MEDAL WILL HAVE AN ATTACHED KEY RING; COST IS INCLUDED IN MEDAL PRICE. BID PRICE MUST INCLUDE CHARGE OF DIE/ART ON CUSTOM MEDALS. EACH INDIVIDUAL CAMPUS WILL PLACE THEIR OWN ORDERS ON AN AS NEEDED BASIS.

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Recommendation
Lamac	1	EACH	\$4.25	1st Vendor of Choice
Texas Music Festivals Enterprise, Inc.	1	EACH	\$4.50	2nd Vendor of Choice
Gradzilla of New Mexico	1	EACH	\$7.50	3rd Vendor of Choice



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT
BROWNSVILLE
 INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Board Meeting August 1, 2023
RFP # 24-010 Graduation & Honor Award District-Wide

16 **MEDALS - TOP 10% SMALL CUSTOM BRONZE MEDALIST WITH LETTER B (IN SCHOOL COLOR). COLOR OF SCHOOL ON EACH SIDE PANEL OF MEDALS. SIZE TO BE 9 OR 1-1/8" IN DIAMETER. SCHOLAR SHIP PANEL IS TO BE PLACED IN THE CENTER OF EACH MEDAL. BID PRICE MUST INCLUDE CHARGE OF DIE/ART ON CUSTOM MEDALS. EACH INDIVIDUAL CAMPUS WILL PLACE THEIR OWN ORDERS ON AN AS NEEDED BASIS. EACH INDIVIDUAL CAMPUS WILL PLACE THEIR OWN ORDERS ON AN AS NEEDED BASIS.**

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Recommendation
Lamac	1	EACH	\$4.25	1st Vendor of Choice
Texas Music Festivals Enterprise, Inc.	1	EACH	\$4.50	2nd Vendor of Choice
Gradzilla of New Mexico	1	EACH	\$7.50	3rd Vendor of Choice

17 **PLAQUES - PLAQUE FOR VALEDICTORIAN/SALUTATORIANS. EACH PLAQUE TO HAVE A WALNUT FINISH, A CHOICE OF BACKING PLATE COLOR AND A FULL COVER PLATE THAT ALLOWS US TO DESIGN OUR OWN PLAQUE WITH WORDING, ARTWORK, AND LOGO. 1 COLOR IMPRINTED LETTERING & LOGO 8 X 10".**

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Recommendation
[ALT1] Herff Jones Graduation Center	1	EACH	\$1.00	1st Vendor of Choice
LUGRA INC (SPECIALTY ADVERTISERS)	1	EACH	\$24.99	2nd Vendor of Choice
Jostens, Inc.	1	EACH	\$25.00	3rd Vendor of Choice

18 **PLAQUES - PLAQUE FOR VALEDICTORIAN/SALUTATORIANS. EACH PLAQUE TO HAVE A WALNUT FINISH, A CHOICE OF BACKING PLATE COLOR AND A FULL COVER PLATE THAT ALLOWS US TO DESIGN OUR OWN PLAQUE WITH WORDING, ARTWORK, AND LOGO. 1 COLOR SUBLIMATED OR ENGRAVED LETTERING AND LOGO 8 X 10".**

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Supplier Notes / Alternate Description
Herff Jones Graduation Center	1	EACH	\$1.00	1st Vendor of Choice
LUGRA INC (SPECIALTY ADVERTISERS)	1	EACH	\$20.00	2nd Vendor of Choice
Jostens, Inc.	1	EACH	\$25.00	3rd Vendor of Choice



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT
BROWNSVILLE
 INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Board Meeting August 1, 2023
RFP # 24-010 Graduation & Honor Award District-Wide

JACKETS - JACKET, STUDENT AWARD AND UIL JACKETS, RAGLAN SLEEVE STYLE, 24 OZ. WOOL BODY WITH NAUGALITE SLEEVES, DOUBLE WELT POCKET TRIM, COLOR SNAP FRONT, MIXED KNIT TRIM, BRYON COLLAR, FULL LINING, SILVER GRAY BODY LINING, WITH QUILTED LINING IN SLEEVES, KNIT WAIST-BAND AND KNIT CUFF WITH 1/2 STRIPES-"LETTER" TO BE 6 INCHES, "3-D" COLOR CHENILLE SHADED IN" COLOR" FELT BACKGROUND(6" DIMEN.I. LETTER). EMBROIDERED INDICATING ORGANIZATION, NAME OF SCHOOL AND SERVICE BARS. HOWE NO.302 VS STYLE OR EQUAL, FELT NAME W/STUDENT'S NAME SEWN IN ONE OF THE POCKETS. DO NOT WANT THE "ECONOMY" CHENILLE LETTER. NOTE: MEASUREMENT OF STUDENTS MUST BE INCLUDED IN BID PRICE. DELIVERY DATE MUST BE NO LATER THAN 8 WEEKS AFTER PURCHASE ORDER IS PLACED. SAMPLE MUST BE INCLUDED WITH BID. TRIMMINGS INCLUDE NAME OF SCHOOL, INSERTS, WAIST BANDS, CUFFS, AND SERVICE BARS. EACH INDIVIDUAL CAMPUS WILL PLACE THEIR OWN ORDERS ON AN AS NEEDED BASIS. BODY COLORS: SEAL BROWN,SCARLETRED, ROYAL BLUE, BLACK AND KELLY GREEN AND OTHER COLORS INDICATED BY THE CAMPUS. SLEEVE TRIMMINGS: LIGHT GOLD, GOLD, WHITE, BLACK/RED/SILVER AND GREEN/WHITE AND OTHER COLORS INDICATED BY THE CAMPUS. BID MUST INCLUDE TEAM PLAY OFF SUCCESS, FOOTBALL, BASKETBALL, BASEBALL, ETC., PATCH ON SLEEVE.(EXAMPLE)-32-5ABI-DISTRICT CHAMPIONS, ETC. ONLY FOR PLAY OFF TEAMS. NO INDIVIDUAL SUCH AS ALL DISTRICT JERSEY NO.,ETC.

19

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Recommendation
MECA Sportswear (Meca Sportswear, Inc.)	1	EACH	\$30.00	1st Vendor of Choice
Herrf Jones Graduation Center	1	EACH	\$40.00	2nd Vendor of Choice
Jostens, Inc.	1	EACH	\$45.00	3rd Vendor of Choice
LUGRA INC (SPECIALTY ADVERTISERS)	1	EACH	\$228.95	
Gradzilla of New Mexico	1	EACH	\$350.00	
Valley Trophy Service Co. (Lou D. Gracia)	1	EACH	No Bid	
GOLE SPORTS	1	EACH	No Bid	
GT GoldSports	1	EACH	No Bid	
Trevino's Digital Photography, Inc	1	EACH	No Bid	
Lamac	1	EACH	No Bid	
Texas Music Festivals Enterprise, Inc.	1	EACH	No Bid	
Sign Solution (Har-Luz Inc)	1	EACH	No Bid	



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT
BROWNSVILLE
 INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Board Meeting August 1, 2023
RFP # 24-010 Graduation & Honor Award District-Wide

20 JACKET - PLEASE REFER TO ITEM #19. SAME DESCRIPTION AS ITEM #19 EXCEPT JACKET SHOULD BE QUOTED WITHOUT (PLEASE DO NOT INCLUDE) PLAY OFF SUCCESS PATCH ON SLEEVE. EXAMPLE - 32-5A BI-DISTRICT CHAMPIONS, ETC. SHOULD NOT BE INCLUDED WITH YOUR PRICE.

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Recommendation
Meca Sportswear (Meca Sportswear, Inc.)	1	EA	\$30.00	1st Vendor of Choice
Herff Jones Graduation Center	1	EA	\$40.00	2nd Vendor of Choice
Jostens, Inc.	1	EA	\$45.00	3rd Vendor of Choice

21 CAPS - LOW PROFILE WASHED COTTON TWILL CAP 100% WASHED COTTON TWILL FABRIC, PIGMENT DYE, GARMENT WASHED, 6 PANEL UNSTRUCTURED DESIGN, SELF-FABRIC COTTON SWEATBAND, SELF-FABRIC STRAP W/BRASS BUCKLE & SEWN SLOT. ONE SIZE FITS ALL. EMBROIDERED OF SCHOOLS LOGO DESIGN ON FRONT.

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Recommendation
LUGRA INC (SPECIALTY ADVERTISERS) Graduation Center	1	EACH	\$7.85	1st Vendor of Choice
Sign Solution (Har-Luz Inc)	1	EACH	\$8.00	2nd Vendor of Choice
	1	EACH	\$9.80	3rd Vendor of Choice

22 PURCHASE OF GOWN UNIT - TO INCLUDE GOWN, CAP, AND TASSEL (TREASURE REGALIA) 100% ACETATE, A LIGHTWEIGHT, BREATHABLE FABRIC FEATURING A HIGH LUSTER FINISH. (PRICE PER EACH).

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Recommendation
Herff Jones Graduation Center	1	UNIT	\$32.00	Recommended



Board Meeting August 1, 2023
RFP # 24-010 Graduation & Honor Award District-Wide

23 PURCHASE OF GOWN UNIT - TO INCLUDE GOWN, CAP, AND TASSEL (BEST DESIGNED GOWN) 100% POLYESTER WHICH MEANS IT IS COOL, LIGHTWEIGHT AND HAS A SMOOTH MATTE FINISH. THE FABRIC IS TIGHTLY WOVEN TO ELIMINATE TRANSPARENCY AND IS VIRTUALLY WRINKLE-RESISTANT. THE TAPERED GOWN SHOULDERS GIVE A PERFECT FIT LOOK, NOT A SQUARE OR BOXY. (PRICE PER EACH).

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Recommendation
Herff Jones Graduation Center	1	UNIT	\$32.00	Recommended

24 Parents Percentage Discount: Purchase of Student Graduation Packet (includes Gown/Cap/Tassel)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	% Discount	Recommendation
GT GoldSports	1	EA	20.0%	Recommended
Herff Jones Graduation Center	1	EA	15.0%	Recommended
LUGRA INC (SPECIALTY ADVERTISERS)	1	EA	8.0%	Recommended
The Grafik Spot, Lic.	1	EA	5.0%	Recommended
Sign Solution (Har-Luz Inc)	1	EA	2.0%	Recommended
Gradzilla of New Mexico	1	EA	1.0%	Recommended
Graduation Center	1	EA	0.0%	Recommended
Jostens, Inc.	1	EA	0.0%	Recommended

25 Parents Percentage Discount: Rental of Student Graduation Packet (includes Gown/Cap/Tassel)

Supplier	QTY	UOM	% Discount	Recommendation
GT GoldSports	1	EA	20.0%	Recommended
Herff Jones Graduation Center	1	EA	15.0%	Recommended
The Grafik Spot, Lic.	1	EA	5.0%	Recommended
Sign Solution (Har-Luz Inc)	1	EA	2.0%	Recommended
Jostens, Inc.	1	EA	0.0%	Recommended
Graduation Center	1	EA	0.0%	Recommended



Board Meeting August 1, 2023
RFP # 24-010 Graduation & Honor Award District-Wide

26	Percentage Discount on High School Graduation Services	Supplier	QTY	UOM	% Discount	Recommendation
		GT GoldSports	1	EA	65.0%	Recommended
		Herff Jones Graduation Center	1	EA	20.0%	Recommended
		Trevino's Digital Photography, Inc	1	EA	10.0%	Recommended
		Graduation Center	1	EA	10.0%	Recommended
		The Grafik Spot, Lic.	1	EA	5.0%	Recommended
		Big Chief Fireworks	1	EA	0.0%	Recommended
		Sign Solution (Har-Luz Inc)	1	EA	0.0%	Recommended
		Jostens, Inc.	1	EA	0.0%	Recommended

27	OTHER - PERCENTAGE % DISCOUNT INCLUDING ANY OTHER SIZE OF DIPLOMAS AND ON OTHER AWARDS FOR HONOR STUDENTS AND GRADATION ITEMS THAT WERE NOT LISTED ABOVE. DISCOUNT FROM YOUR LATEST CATALOG AND OR PRICE LIST.	Supplier	QTY	UOM	% Discount	Recommendation
		GT GoldSports	1		65.0%	Recommended
		Herff Jones Graduation Center	1		20.0%	Recommended
		Trevino's Digital Photography, Inc	1		15.0%	Recommended
		Graduation Center	1		10.0%	Recommended
		Lamac	1		10.0%	Recommended
		GOLE SPORTS	1		10.0%	Recommended
		LUGRA INC (SPECIALTY ADVERTISERS)	1		8.0%	Recommended
		The Grafik Spot, Lic.	1		5.0%	Recommended
		Sign Solution (Har-Luz Inc)	1		2.0%	Recommended
		Jostens, Inc.	1		0.0%	Recommended
		MECA Sportswear (Meca Sportswear, Inc.)	1		0.0%	Recommended
		Big Chief Fireworks	1		0.0%	Recommended