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7:06 p.m.                May 8, 2006 
 

OFFICIAL PROCEEDINGS 
 

 The Board of School Trustees of the Fort Wayne Community Schools met in regular session in 
the Lester L. Grile Administrative Center on Monday, January 9, 2006, at 7:06 p.m. President Geoff 
Paddock called the meeting to order with the following members in attendance: 
 
 Members present:  Geoff Paddock, Chairperson 
    Robert A. Armstrong 
    Carol J. Coen 

Stephen Corona 
Jon J. Olinger 

    Kurt A. Walborn 
 

Members absent:  Kweku Akan 
 
A motion was made by Robert A. Armstrong, seconded by Carol J. Coen, that the minutes of 

the regular meeting of the Board of School Trustees held April 24, 2006, be approved.  Roll Call:  Ayes, 
Robert A. Armstrong, Carol J. Coen, Stephen Corona, Kurt A. Walborn and Geoff Paddock; nays, 
none; abstention, Jon Olinger. 
 
 Dr. Wendy Robinson, superintendent, presented the following information and 
recommendations concerning awards and recognitions: 
 
RECOMMENDATION:  It is recommended that the Board recognize senior members of the 
Superintendent’s Student Advisory Council.  
  
RELATED INFORMATION:  The Superintendent’s Student Advisory Council was created in the 
2004 school year to increase communication between the Superintendent of Schools and students in the 
district. The council includes students from the district’s six high schools and Anthis Career Center.  
  
The council’s mission is to provide the superintendent with the student perspective and empower fellow 
students to improve the schools and community. They have participated in several activities this school 
year, including volunteering at Showcase 2006, Net Literacy Training, and Youth Day of Caring.  
 
The following senior members of this prestigious group were honored: 
 
Kayla Chandler, Elmhurst 
Contrell Conwell, North Side 
Stephanie Ditton, Anthis 
Antonio Hollis, Wayne 
Maryam Khan, Snider 
Caleb Schloss-Maxon, South Side  
Bri’anne Smith, Anthis 

Roll Call 
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RECOMMENDATION:  It is recommended that the Board recognize Elmhurst student Forrest 
Foellinger for his membership selection in to the National Society of High School Scholars (NSHSS). 
    
RELATED INFORMATION:  The Society recognizes academic excellence at the high school level 
and encourages members of the organization to apply their unique talents, vision, and potential for the 
betterment of themselves and the world. Currently, there are 150,000 society members, representing 
15,000 high schools in nearly 20 countries.  NSHSS advocates for scholarship opportunities for 
deserving young people and has awarded more than $100,000 in scholarships since its inception just 
two years ago.  The following individuals were recognized. 
 
Forrest Foellinger 
Barbara Gentry, principal 

 
RECOMMENDATION:  It is recommended that the Board recognize the Winter Guard from North 
Side and Wayne high schools for placing first and second, respectfully in the state competition.  
  
RELATED INFORMATION:  The Winter Guard at North Side and Wayne high schools competed in 
the Indiana High School Color Guard Associations Divisional Finals. North Side received first place in 
Class B competition.  Wayne placed second in Class AA.  Both Color Guards received a “Gold Rating “ 
signifying superior performance.  
  
The following individuals were recognized: 
  

NORTH SIDE HIGH SCHOOL 
1st place Class B 

   WAYNE HIGH SCHOOL  
      2nd place Class  AA 

Florence Baker  
Julia Drudy 
Robin Gingrich 
Tosha Golaszewski 
Molly Grasberger 
Stephanie Gydesen 
Jayme Harrold 
Katie Johnson 
 

Betti Hendrickson 
Caitlin McLeland 
Erika Mounsey 
Alysha Neumann 
Nicole Piepenbrink 
Jessica Sarrazin 
Camille Wilcoxson  
Kirsten Zimpelman 
 

Krista Allen Katie Roberson 
Sonja Brown Diana Vaughn 
Rachel Bullock Jessica Webb 
Brittany Evans  
Jenny Kuhn  
Kristi Neal 
Misti Neal 
Lindsay Reid 

Shane Hapner, instructor 
Larry Kenner, instructor 
Ed King, instructor 
Chuck DeFord, principal 
 

Jennifer Dunlap, instructor 
Brittany Satterthwaite, instructor 
Michael Satterthwaite, instructor 
Joselyn Whittaker, principal 

 
RECOMMENDATION:  It is recommended that the Board recognize members of the girls swim team 
at Snider High School for placing ninth in the state competition.  
   
RELATED INFORMATION:  The girls swim team placed ninth overall at the state finals. Several 
members of the team also placed in the top 10 in individual and relay competitions.  All of these girls 
were also named to the “All SAC-1st Team.” 
  
The following individuals were recognized: 
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Girls Swim Team – Ninth place overall  
Laura Baur – 
 7th place, 400 freestyle relay; 
10th place, 200 freestyle relay; 
12th place, 100 freestyle. 
 

Alexandra Peirce –  
6th place, 200 medley relay;  
7th place, 400 freestyle relay. 

Chelsea Larsen –  
6th place, 200 medley relay;  
7th place, 400 freestyle relay;  
9th place, 100 butterfly; 
15th place, 200 individual medley. 
 

Erica Smith –  
6th place, 200 medley relay; 
7th place, 100 butterfly; 
7th place, 400 freestyle relay; 
10th place, 200 freestyle relay 

Stephanie Parker –  
3rd place, 100 breaststroke;  
6th place, 200 medley relay; 
9th place, 200 individual medley; 
10th place, 200 freestyle relay 

 

 
Chris Knoblauch, head swim coach 
Mike Hawley, athletic director 
Steve Simmons, principal 

 
RECOMMENDATION:  It is recommended that the Board recognize the girls gymnastics team at 
Snider High School for placing seventh in the state competition.  
  
RELATED INFORMATION:  The Snider girls gymnastic team recorded their highest score for the 
season at the state meet and won 7th place.  In addition, one team member received the Indiana High 
School Athletic Association (IHSAA) Mental Attitude Award.   
  
The team has a 3.40 GPA and two gymnasts were selected to the Indiana Council of Gymnastics School 
Association (ICGSA) Academic All State Team.  
  
The following individuals were recognized: 
  
IHSAA Mental Attitude Award, State Beam Championship, and 2006 News Sentinel Gymnast of the 
Year - Jeanna Glick 
 
ICGSA Academic All State Team 
Tiffany Wine 
Justine Crothers 
 
Laura Hinton, assistant coach 
Kim Wine, assistant coach 
Linnea Fulkerson, head coach 
Mike Hawley, athletic director 
Steve Simmons, principal 

 
RECOMMENDATION:  It is recommended that the Board recognize Jeffrey Papiernik, a wrestler at 
Snider High School for placing fourth in his weight class at the state competition. 
   
RELATED INFORMATION:  Jeffrey Papiernik, a wrestler in weight class 135, placed fourth in the 
individual category of the state wrestling competition.  In addition, Jeffrey received the Indiana High 
School Athletic Association (IHSAA) Mental Attitude Award.  Jeffrey is the only wrestler in Snider’s 
history to qualify for state competition all 4 years. 
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The following individuals were recognized: 
 
IHSAA Mental Attitude Award and 4th Wrestling State Finals 
Jeffrey Papiernik, 4th place 
 
Mike Hawley, athletic director 
Steve Simmons, principal 

 
 Dr. Robinson presented the vouchers for the period ending April 26, 2006, with the 
recommendation the vouchers be approved.  A motion was made by Robert A. Armstrong, seconded by 
Kurt A. Walborn, that the vouchers appearing in the listing numbered 06-09 be approved without 
exception.  Roll Call:  Ayes, unanimous; nays, none. 
 
 Dr. Robinson presented the following recommendation concerning the Voyager Curriculum 
Materials: 
 
RECOMMENDATION:  It is recommended that the Board approve a contract with Voyager in the 
amount of $292,150 for reading intervention materials to be used during summer school at the 
elementary and middle school levels.  
  
RELATED INFORMATION:  Voyager Time Warp is a research-based reading intervention program 
designed to incorporate phonemic awareness, phonics, fluency, vocabulary, and comprehension.  These 
materials were previously recommended and approved for use in the Foellinger Summer Voyage grant 
application which was approved in October. 
  
Voyager is the sole source for purchasing their products.  Indiana law does not require a bid for sole 
source purchases.  This purchase is being funded through remediation grant money. 
 
This program addresses Strategy 1: We will ensure high levels of learning for all students 
 
 A motion was made by Carol J. Coen, seconded by Robert A. Armstrong, that the 
recommendation concerning the Voyager Curriculum Materials be approved.  Roll Call:  Ayes, 
unanimous; nays, none. 
  
 Dr. Robinson presented the following recommendation concerning the Bid Recommendation 
for Food Facility Equipment for Blackhawk Middle School and Northrop High School, P/B #9535: 
 
RECOMMENDATION:  It is recommended that an award be made to the lowest responsive and 
responsible bidder meeting specifications and quality standards. 
 
 Stafford-Smith, Incorporated, Indianapolis, IN  $168,698.65 
 
RELATED INFORMATION:  This bid is for the purchase of a combination of new and replacement 
equipment that will be used to serve meals at Blackhawk Middle School and Northrop High School.  
This is the first full change in the Northrop serving area since 1971.  Blackhawk has been operating 
with some second hand equipment for many years.  Both projects bring the way we serve students up-
to-date.  The bid includes such items as milk coolers, hot food units, cold food units, cashier stands, and 
cook/hold units. 
 
These projects are being funded by Food Service fund. 
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Invitations to Bid were mailed to three prospective bidders with all three responding.   
 
Bids were received from the following: 
 
 C & T Design & Equipment, Indianapolis, IN  $192,779.99 
 Stafford-Smith, Incorporated, Indianapolis, IN  $168,698.65 
 Tinkel’s, Incorporated, Fort Wayne, IN   $189,406.00 
 
 A motion was made by Jon J. Olinger, seconded by Robert A. Armstrong, that the 
recommendation concerning the Bid Recommendation for Food Facility Equipment for Blackhawk 
Middle School and Northrop High School, P/B #9535 be approved.  Roll Call:  Ayes, unanimous; nays, 
none. 
  
 Dr. Robinson presented the following recommendation concerning the Bid Recommendation 
for Classroom Furniture, P/B #9495: 
 
RECOMMENDATION:  It is recommended that the Board approve awards to the lowest responsive 
and responsible bidders meeting specifications and quality standards:  
 

COMPANY LOCATION TOTAL 

Educational Furniture, LTD Muncie, IN $49,323.14 

Sharp School Services Hobart, IN $129,694.50 

 TOTAL $179,017.64 
 
RELATED INFORMATION:  This bid is for the partial replacement of classroom furniture at 31 
school locations, and for classroom furniture at Towles Montessori to support the implementation of the 
Montessori program.  The bid includes items such as student desks, student chairs, activity tables, and 
folding tables.  Items specifically for Towles include storage cabinets, drawer cabinets, tote-tray carts, 
and book stands.  The new classroom furniture is scheduled for delivery and installation during the 
upcoming summer break. 
  
In the bid specifications, FWCS reserved the right to award the contract in whole or in part, by item or 
group of items, where such action serves the best interest of FWCS. 
  
This bid is being funded by the Capital Projects Fund and is within budget. 
  
Bids were mailed to six prospective bidders with all six responding.  Lee Company, Incorporated, Terre 
Haute, IN and School Specialty, Incorporated, Greenville, WI submitted “No Bid” responses. 
 
The following bids were submitted and awarded based on product groupings: 
 

 Business 
Furniture 

Educational 
Furniture J W Associates Sharp School 

Services 
Desks/Chairs 
 No Bid $110,118.91 $134,010.21 $104,843.50 

Activity Tables 
 No Bid $24,839.61 No Bid $20,531.00 

Folding Tables $4,710.00 Did not meet 
specifications $4,523.46 $4,320.00 

Fleetwood 
Cabinetry (Towles) No Bid $49,323.14 $60,668.85 $51,477.95 
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 A motion was made by Jon J. Olinger, seconded by Kurt A. Walborn, that the recommendation 
concerning the Bid Recommendation for Classroom Furniture, P/B #9495 be approved.  Roll Call:  
Ayes, unanimous; nays, none. 
  
 Dr. Robinson presented the following recommendation concerning the Purchase of Property – 
South Side High School: 
  
RECOMMENDATION:  It is recommended that the Board authorize the purchase of the following 
property located near South Side High School:  
  

Address Appraisal #1 Appraisal #2 Purchase Price 
3405 S. Clinton St. $6,750 $7,250 $7,000 
 
RELATED INFORMATION:  The current school site is significantly below the state minimum 
acreage recommendation.  Funds are within budget.  Purchases of properties in this block will allow 
flexibility for the school to expand parking lots or playing fields.  Purchase price of the property is the 
average of the two appraisals. 
 
 A motion was made by Stephen Corona, seconded by Carol J. Coen, that the recommendation 
concerning the Purchase of Property – South Side High School be approved.  Roll Call:  Ayes, 
unanimous; nays, none. 
  
 Dr. Robinson presented the following recommendation concerning the Purchase of Property – 
North Side High School: 
 
RECOMMENDATION:  It is recommended that the Board authorize the purchase of the following 
property located near North Side High School: 

 
Address Appraisal #1 Appraisal #2 Purchase Price 

533 Nettie Ave. $60,000 $65,000 $62,500 
    

RELATED INFORMATION:  The purchase of this property is part of the purchase plan for the site.  
Purchase of this property will provide flexibility in the future at the North Side High School site.  The 
current school site is below the state minimum acreage recommendation.   The owner has agreed to a 
purchase price that is the average of the two appraisals.  This purchase is funded from the Capital 
Projects Fund.   
 
 A motion was made by Carol J. Coen, seconded by Kurt A. Walborn, that the recommendation 
concerning the Purchase of Property – North Side High School be approved.  Roll Call:  Ayes, 
unanimous; nays, none. 
  
 Dr. Robinson presented the following recommendation concerning the Purchase of Property – 
Waynedale School: 
 
RECOMMENDATION:  It is recommended that the Board authorize the purchase of property located 
near Waynedale School. 
  

Address Appraisal #1 Appraisal #2 Purchase Price 
7105 Elzey St. $49,000 $59,500 $48,000 

 
RELATED INFORMATION:  The purchase of this property is part of the purchase plan for this site.  
Purchase of this property will provide flexibility in the future at Waynedale School.  The current school 
site is below the state minimum acreage recommendation.  The owner has agreed to a purchase price 
that is less than the average of the two appraisals.  This purchase is funded from the Capital Projects 
Fund. 
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 A motion was made by Carol J. Coen, seconded by Kurt A. Walborn, that the recommendation 
concerning the Purchase of Property – Waynedale School be approved.  Roll Call:  Ayes, unanimous; 
nays, none. 
  
 Dr. Robinson presented the following recommendation concerning the Grile Data Center 
Project: 
 
RECOMMENDATION:  It is recommended that the Board approve the following construction 
contract for electrical work at the Grile Administrative Center: 
  
L-A Electric 
Base Bid................................................................................................................. $111,603 
Alternate 1 ..........................................................................................................       16,937 
TOTAL CONTRACT............................................................................................ $128,540 
  
RELATED INFORMATION:  This project consists of installation of an uninterruptible power system 
and a generator for the computer data system.  This installation will provide the assurance that 
important information will not be lost in the event of power failure.   This recommendation is within the 
project budget, which is funded from the Capital Projects Fund.  Project specifications require the work 
to be completed by August 15, 2006. 
 
Project Grile Data Center Project   
Architect SCO Engineering, LLC   
Bid Date April 27, 2006   
     
CONTRACTOR Engineered 

Systems, Inc. 
JACE 

Electric, 
Inc. 

L-A 
Electric 

Service Electric 
of Allen 

County, Inc. 

     
BASE BID $171,000 $133,000 $111,603  $150,850 
     
ALTERNATE 1     
Provide and install CMU and 
finish brick wall around new 
genset 12,500 16,800 16,937 18,350 
     
RECOMMENDATION $183,500 $149,800 $128,540  $169,200 

 
 A motion was made by Robert A. Armstrong, seconded by Carol J. Coen, that the 
recommendation concerning the Grile Data Center Project be approved.  Roll Call:  Ayes, unanimous; 
nays, none. 
  
 Dr. Robinson presented the following recommendation concerning the Student Basic Accident 
Insurance and Athletic Insurance, RFP #9482: 
 
RECOMMENDATION:  It is recommended that the Board approve a two-year contract with Student 
Assurance Services, Inc. of Stillwater, Minnesota, to provide group medical coverage for all middle and 
high school athletes participating in interscholastic sports.   
  

Student 
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Athletic 
Insurance, 
RFP #9482 
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RELATED INFORMATION:  Request for proposals were sent to six student insurance agencies.  
Responses were received from four.  Student Assurance Services, our current agency, specializes in 
providing medical insurance to educational institutions including over 1,600 public school districts. 
 
The premium is $140,208 per year; however, if the loss ratio exceeds 70% for the 2006-2007 school 
year, the 2007-2008 premium will increase to $153,508. 
 
Premium costs for the athletic insurance for grades 6-12 will be as follows: 

1. Middle School: $20.00 per student.  An increase of $1.00 from last year. 
2. High School: $42.00 per student.  An increase of $1.00 from last year. 
  

The athletic insurance will continue as a requirement for each student participating in athletics.   
 
Families with two or more senior high children will receive a discount of $10.00 per child.  All student 
insurance is supplemental to other policies held by parents. 
  
Premium costs for the basic student accident insurance will be as follows: 

1. Optional School-Time Coverage - $10.00 per student. 
2. Optional Full-Time Coverage - $59.00 per student. 
3. Optional Extended Dental - $6.00 per student 

 
The spreadsheet below provides a comparison of student athletic insurance rates for the responding 
providers. 
 

Fort Wayne Community Schools 
Student Athletic Insurance Quotes for 2006/2007 & 2007/2008 

3/27/2006 
    
Insurance Agency Underwriter Total for Corporation Coverage 

  2006/2007 
$25,000 Maximum per 
Claim HS 

Student Assurance 
Services Inc.  
Stillwater, MN 

Security Life 
Insurance 
Company of 
America 

$133,000 Athletics Policy   
$7,208 Catastrophic Policy 
$140,208 Total 
2007/2008 
Same as 06/07 unless loss 
ratio exceeds 70%, then 10% 
increase 

$5,000,000 Max per Claim 
MS 
Will pay claims less than 
$25 
regardless of other 
coverage.  If over $25, then 
coverage is secondary. 
Usual and Customary 
Some Limitations Apply 

  2006/2007 
$25,000 Maximum per 
Claim HS 

K&K Insurance 
Group, Inc. 
Fort Wayne, IN 

Hartford Life Ins. 
Co. 

$146,500 Athletics Policy 
 Didn't provide Catastrophic 
Policy 
2007/2008 
Same as 06/07 

No Deductible 
Usual & Customary 
Charges 
Some Limitations Apply 
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2006/2007 

$25,000 Maximum per 
Claim HS 

Bollinger 
Insurance 
Short Hills, NJ 

Monumental Life 
Ins. Co. 

$150,000 Athletics Policy 
 $3,488 Catastrophic Policy 
$153,488 Total 
2007/2008 
Same as 06/07  

$5,000,000 Max per Claim 
MS 
No Deductible 
Usual & Customary 
Charges 
Some Limitations Apply 
 

  2006/2007 
$25,000 Maximum per 
Claim HS 

Student Athletic 
Protection Inc. 
Kalamazoo, MI 

Guarantee Trust 
Life 
Ins. Co. 

$184,645 Athletics Policy & 
Catastrophic Policy 
2007/2008 
No Quote 

$5,000,000 Max per Claim 
MS 
No Deductible 
Usual & Customary 
Charges 
Some Limitations Apply 

Student Resources 
St. Petersburg, FL 

 No Response  

    
The Maksin 
Group 
Lapeer, MI 

 No Response  

 
 A motion was made by Robert A. Armstrong, seconded by Kurt A. Walborn, that the 
recommendation concerning the Student Basic Accident Insurance and Athletic Insurance, RFP #9482 
be approved.  Roll Call:  Ayes, unanimous; nays, none. 
 
Dr. Robinson presented the following recommendation concerning the McKinney-Vento Transportation 
Grant: 
 
RECOMMENDATION:  It is recommended that the Board approve the application for and acceptance 
of the McKinney-Vento transportation grant that would provide transportation for homeless children 
and youth to their school of origin. 
  
RELATED INFORMATION:  Through the McKinney-Vento Homeless Assistance Act of 1987, as 
amended by the No Child Left Behind Act of 2001, federal funds are available to each state to support 
programs that meet the needs of homeless children and youth.  The Indiana Department of Education 
has identified transportation funding as a critical need for the state’s school corporations.  As a result, 
grants will be made available to school corporations for the provision of transportation services to 
homeless children and youth to their schools of origin. 
 
Grants will be available in the amount of $10,000; up to eight corporations may receive this funding.  
First preference will be given to school corporations that do NOT receive other McKinney-Vento 
funding.  Awards will be made based on the demonstrated needs of the school corporation and on a 
first-come, first-served basis for the period of April 1, 2006, to March 31, 2007. 
 
This competitive grant written by Director of Transportation Lynn Hower supports FWCS Strategy #1: 
We will ensure high levels of learning for all students. 
 
 A motion was made by Jon J. Olinger, seconded by Robert A. Armstrong, that the 
recommendation concerning the McKinney-Vento Transportation Grant be approved.  Roll Call:  Ayes, 
unanimous; nays, none. 
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Dr. Robinson presented the following recommendation concerning the personnel report: 
 
C   POSITION CHANGED 
L   LEAVE 

N   NEW POSITION 
R   REPLACEMENT 

T   TEMPORARY POSITION 

   
0010   GENERAL 0219   KNIGHT FOUNDATION 0525   K-2 SPECIAL EDUCATION  
0015   RACIAL BALANCE 0270   SUMMER CLUBHOUSE 0526   SPECIAL EDUCATION  FUND 
0035   CAPITAL PROJECTS FUND 0311   DRIVER EDUCATION 0527   SILVER GRANT 
0041   TRANSPORTATION 0320   CONTINUING EDUCATION 0543   PRESCHOOL SPECIAL ED - FEDERAL 
0060   PRESCHOOL SPECIAL ED 0321   STATE GRANTS 0555   ADULT BASIC EDUCATION 
0080   FOOD SERVICE 0371    NON-ENGLISH SPEAKING 

PROGRAM 
0593    CLASS SIZE REDUCTION 

0090   TEXTBOOK RENTAL 0390    WAREHOUSE 0600   VOCATIONAL EDUCATION  FEDERAL 
0110   SELF FD WKR’S COMP 0400   FEDERAL PROGRAMS 0626    PERKINS GRANT 
0140   CAREER CENTER 0413   COMPREHENSIVE SCHOOL 

REFORM 
0646    MEDICAID REIMBURSEMENT 

0190    ALTERNATIVE  ED GRANT 0416   SCHOOL INPROVEMENT 0662    MAGNET GRANT 
0192    SAFE HAVEN 0417   TITLE I 0684   TITLE II 
0210    DONATIONS FUND 0420   TITLE V 0688   TITLE III 
0213   WALLACE READER’S DIGEST 0492    I READ GRANT 0694   READING FIRST 
0215   EDUCATION IMPROVEMENT 0511   STEWART B. HOMELESS ASST. 0808   GIFTED & TALENTED 
  0814   REFUGEE CHILDREN SCHOOL IMPACT 

GRANT 
 

ADMINISTRATOR(S) RECOMMENDED FOR 
RETIREMENT/RESIGNATION/TERMINATION/DECEASED 

 
NAME ASSIGNMENT STATUS FUND EFFECTIVE 
Zent, 
Jennifer L. 

Special Education/Psychologist Resign 0010 06-30-06 

 
TEACHER(S) RECOMMENDED FOR  

RETIREMENT/RESIGNATION/TERMINATION/DECEASED 
 

NAME ASSIGNMENT STATUS FUND EFFECTIVE 
Ashton, 
Barry A. 
 

Northrop/Performing Arts Retire 0010 06-02-06 

Baughman, 
Sarah E. 
 

Harrison Hill/Music Retire 0010 06-02-06 

Little, 
Janice L. 
 

Franke Park/Grade 1 Retire 0010 06-30-06 

Sapp, 
James D. 
 

Northwood/Instrumental Music Retire 0010 06-02-06 

Starnes, 
Rochelle A. 
 

Wayne/Vocal Music (0.67) Resign 0010 06-02-06 

Tuckey, 
Mindy M. 

Northcrest/Leave of Absence Resign 0010 04-21-06 

 

Personnel 
Report 
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TEACHERS(S) RECOMMENDED FOR EMPLOYMENT 
Employment is contingent upon satisfactory completion of all pre-employment requirements. 

 
NAME COLLEGE EXP FROM  TO STATUS FUND EFFECTIVE 
Bubb, 
Carolyn A. 

Indiana 
University 

Fort Wayne 
BS 

 

0.00 Certified Sub Snider/French 
German 

R 0010 04-28-06 

Cunningham, 
Kendra R. 

Taylor 
University 

BS 
 

1.0 New Towles/Level 6-9 C 0010 08-18-06 

Hansen, 
Erin B. 
 

Transylvania 
BS 

1.0 Certified Sub Towles/Level 6-9 C 0010 08-18-06 

Matney, 
Tianna L. 

Indiana  
University 

Bloomington 
BS 

 

0.0 New Bunche/Level 3-6 C 0010/ 
0015 

 

08-18-06 

Patterson, 
Jason L. 

Indiana 
University 

Bloomington 
BS 

 

0.0 New Elmhurst/Physics R 0010 08-18-06 

Starkey, 
Rebecca M. 

Ball State 
BS 

 

1.0 New Bunche/Level 3-6 C 0010 08-18-06 

Sutherland, 
Benjamen J. 

Manchester 
BS 

 
 

0.0 New Towles/ 
Level 12-15 

C 0010 
 

08-18-06 

Wolf, 
Julie A. 

Indiana 
University 

Fort Wayne 
BS 

0.0 Certified Sub Bunche/Level 3-6 C 0010/ 
0015 

08-18-06 

 
 

TEACHER(S) RECOMMENDED FOR BOARD ACTION 
 

NAME FROM TO STATUS FUND  EFFECTIVE 
Bishop, 
Mary K. 
 

Bunche/Music (0.60) + 
Pleasant Center/Music (0.40) 

Towles/Music (1.0) R 0010 08-18-06 

Fisher, 
Cynthia L. 
 

Bunche/Multi-Age Towles/Level 6-9 C 0010 08-18-06 

Fisher, 
Jeanine K. 
 

Bunche/Art (0.60) Towles/Art (1.0) R 0010 08-18-06 

Harper, 
Karen M. 
 

Bunche/Multi-Age Towles/Level 6-9 C 0010 08-18-06 
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Hartman, 
Deborah A. 
 

Price/Grade 5 Towles/Level 9-12 C 0010 08-18-06 

Hesting, 
Chad M. 
 

Adams/Grade 5 Towles/Level 9-12 C 0010 08-18-06 

Jackson, 
Elka N. 
 

Geyer/Basic Skills Towles/Level 12-15 C 0010 08-18-06 

Kaiser, 
Donna G. 
 

Bunche/Multi-Age Towles/Level 6-9 C 0010 08-18-06 

Keifer, 
Renae L. 
 

Bunche/Multi-Age Towles/Level 6-9 C 0010 08-18-06 

Lucas, 
Katherine S. 
 

Kekionga/Montessori  
Grade 6 

Towles/Level 12-15 C 0010 08-18-06 

McClung, 
Leslie R. 

Fairfield/Reading Recovery + 
Reading Recovery Team 
Leader 
 

Bunche/Level 3-6 C 0010/ 
0015 

08-18-06 

McCrory, 
Mark C. 
 

Bunche/Multi-Age Towles/Level 9-12 C 0010 08-18-06 

McMahan, 
Edith W. 
 

Bunche/Montessori Resource Towles/Montessori 
Resource 

C 0015 08-18-06 

McMurray, 
Kimberly I. 
 

Northcrest/Grade 3 Towles/Level 6-9 C 0010 08-18-06 

Quinones, 
Vincent 
 

Kekionga/Physical Education Towles/Physical Education R 0010 08-18-06 

Rang, 
Andrew S. 
 

Geyer/Physical Education South Side/Physical 
Education 

R 0010 08-18-06 

Regueiro-
Sanchez, 
Maria E. 
 

Lindley/Grade 2/3 Spanish Towles/Spanish C 0010 08-18-06 

Robbins, 
Rita E. 
 

Geyer/Media Towles/Media R 0010 08-18-06 

Ruman, 
Betty L. 
 

Lincoln/Kindergarten (0.50) 
 

Bunche/Level 3-6 (1.0) 
 

C 
 
 

0010/ 
0015 

 

08-18-06 
 
 

Shaidnagle, 
Barbara K. 
 

Bunche/Multi-Age Towles/Level 9-12 C 0010 08-18-06 

Staak, 
Sharon A. 

Bunche/Pre-School (0015) + 
Kindergarten (0010) 
 

Bunche/Montessori 
Resource 

R 0015 08-18-06 
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Taulbee, 
Theresa A. 

Bunche/Reading Recovery 
(.50) + Haley/Reading 
Recovery (0.50) 

Haley/Reading Recovery 
(0.50) + Towles/Reading 
Recovery (0.50) 
 

C 0215/ 
0015 

08-18-06 

Turriff, 
Cynthia A. 

Bunche/LD/MIMD (0.50) + 
Maplewood/LD/MIMD 
(0.50) 

Maplewood/LD/MIMD 
(0.50) + Towles/LD/MIMD 
(0.50) 
 

C 0010 08-18-06 

Wallace, 
Theresa M. 
 

Price/Grade 5 Towles/Level 9-12 C 0010 08-18-06 

York, 
Bridget W. 
 

Kekionga/Montessori  
Grade 7/8 

Towles/Level 12-15 C 0010 08-18-06 

CERTIFIED PERSONNEL RECOMMENDED FOR ADDITIONAL ASSIGNMENT(S) 
FOR THE 2006-2007 SCHOOL YEAR 

 
 Cheviron, Michael G. 
 
SUBSTITUTE(S) RECOMMENDED FOR CERTIFIED SUBSTITUTE POSITION(S) 
Employment is contingent upon satisfactory completion of all pre-employment requirements. 
 
Adeosun, Francisca  Harting, Loretta K.  Shade, Shelly D. 
Benge, Angeliki N.  Hayden, Edward J.  Webb, Molly D. 
Grinstead, Christopher W.  Nelson, Andrea M.  
 

CLASSIFIED PERSONNEL RECOMMENDED FOR 
RETIREMENT/RESIGNATION/TERMINATION/END OF ASSIGNMENT 

 
NAME ASSIGNMENT STATUS FUND EFFECTIVE 
Abraham, 
Joy M. 
 

Career Education/School Assistant Resign 0140 04-25-06 

Bruner, 
Debra S. 
 

Miami/Cafeteria Manager, Temp 
 

Resign 0080 04-28-06 

Coker, 
Linda K. 
 

Transportation/Sick Leave Resign 0041 03-31-06 

Ealing, 
Moreen J. 
 

Northrop/Special Ed School Assistant Resign 0010 04-27-06 

Flotow, 
Gordon E. 
 

Lakeside/Night Custodian 
 

Retire 0010 06-01-06 

Jackson, 
Debra L. 
 

School Asst-Sub + Special Ed Asst- Sub + 
Clerical-Sub + Food Service-Sub (0080) 
 

Terminate 0010/ 
0080 

05-01-06 

Kinder, 
Jodie L. 

School Asst-Sub + Special Ed Asst- Sub + 
Clerical-Sub + Food Service-Sub (0080) 
 

Terminate 0010/ 
0080 

04-17-06 

Moord, 
Sherri L. 

School Asst-Sub + Special Ed Asst- Sub + 
Clerical-Sub + Food Service-Sub (0080) 
 

Resign 0010/ 
0080 

04-17-06 
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Moore, 
Linda S. 

School Asst-Sub + Special Ed Asst- Sub + 
Clerical-Sub + Food Service-Sub (0080) 
 

Terminate 0010/ 
0080 

04-17-06 

Olivas, 
Noemi M. 

School Asst-Sub + Special Ed Asst- Sub + 
Clerical-Sub + Food Service-Sub (0080) 
 

Resign 0010/ 
0080 

04-21-06 

Panning, 
Wayne F. 
 

School Asst-Sub + Special Ed Asst- Sub + 
Clerical-Sub + Food Service-Sub (0080) 
 

Terminate 0010/ 
0080 

04-17-06 

Quessenberry, 
Lori K. 
 

School Asst-Sub + Special Ed Asst- Sub + 
Clerical-Sub + Food Service-Sub (0080) 
 

Terminate 0010/ 
0080 

04-17-06 

Russell, 
Thelma L. 
 

Jefferson/Administrative Asst – Hourly Retire 0010 06-09-06 

Shuler, 
Karen L. 
 

School Asst-Sub + Special Ed Asst- Sub + 
Clerical-Sub + Food Service-Sub (0080) 
 

Terminate 0010/ 
0080 

04-17-06 

Skarie, 
Lisa R. 
 

School Asst-Sub + Special Ed Asst- Sub + 
Clerical-Sub + Food Service-Sub (0080) 
 

Terminate 0010/ 
0080 

04-17-06 

Thompson, 
Joseph L. 
 

Custodian Sub Terminate 0010 04-26-06 

Trent, 
William W. 
 

Transportation/Bus Technician Retire 0041 06-02-06 

Vasquez, 
Annalicia A. 
 

School Asst-Sub + Special Ed Asst- Sub + 
Clerical-Sub + Food Service-Sub (0080) 
 

Terminate 0010/ 
0080 

04-17-06 

Weisenbruger, 
Judy L. 
 

School Asst-Sub + Special Ed Asst- Sub + 
Clerical-Sub + Food Service-Sub (0080) 
 

Terminate 0010/ 
0080 

04-17-06 

Weller, 
Joan C. 
 

Media Processing/52 Week Secretary Retire 0010 05-31-06 

CLASSIFIED PERSONNEL RECOMMENDED FOR EMPLOYMENT 
Employment is contingent upon satisfactory completion of all pre-employment requirements. 

 
NAME FROM TO STATUS FUND EFFECTIVE 
Allen, 
Kevin L. 

New Transportation/Bus Driver-
Sub + Bus Driver Special 
Ed-Sub 
 

R 0041 04-19-06 

Breese,  
David L. 

New Transportation/Bus 
Technician 
 

R 0041 05-09-06 

Brundige, 
Patricia M. 
 

New North Side/Cafeteria Asst. R 0080 04-17-06 

Byrd, 
Sonya L. 
 

New Security Guard Substitute R 0010 04-12-06 

Derrick, 
Anthony L. 

New Transportation/Bus Driver-
Sub + Bus Driver Special 
Ed-Sub 

R 0041 04-20-06 
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French, 
Willie 

School Asst-Sub + Special 
Ed Asst- Sub + Clerical-Sub 
+ Food Service-Sub (0080) 
 

Career Education/School 
Asst Spec Ed (0010) + 
School Asst Spec Ed (0041) 
 

R 0010/ 
0041 

04-17-06 

Fuller, 
Jeanetta D. 

New School Asst-Sub + Special 
Ed Asst- Sub + Clerical-Sub 
+ Food Service-Sub (0080) 
 

R 0010/ 
0080 

04-17-06 

Ketzenberger, 
Kelley M. 

New School Asst-Sub + Special 
Ed Asst- Sub + Clerical-Sub 
+ Food Service-Sub (0080) 
 

R 0010/ 
0080 

03-03-06 

Roach, 
Peggy A. 

New School Asst-Sub + Special 
Ed Asst- Sub + Clerical-Sub 
+ Food Service-Sub (0080) 
 

R 0010/ 
0080 

04-17-06 

Stanley, 
Temeka N. 

Memorial Park/Cafeteria 
Asst, Temp + School Asst-
Sub + Special Ed Asst- Sub 
+ Clerical-Sub + Food 
Service-Sub (0080) 
 

Memorial Park/Cafeteria 
Asst (0080) + School Asst-
Sub + Special Ed Asst- Sub 
+ Clerical-Sub + Food 
Service-Sub (0080) 
 

R 0080/ 
0010/ 
0080 

04-26-06 

Young, 
Terrence J. 

New Transportation/Bus Driver-
Sub + Bus Driver Special 
Ed-Sub 
 

R 0041 04-12-06 

CLASSIFIED PERSONNEL RECOMMENDED FOR BOARD ACTION 
 

NAME FROM TO STATUS FUND EFFECTIVE 
Adams, 
Larranne S. 
 

Shawnee/School Asst Special 
Ed 

Washington/School Asst R 0010 04-17-06 

Bell, 
Maggie 
 

Food & Nutrition 
Services/Sick Leave 

Food & Nutrition 
Services/Cafeteria Asst 

R 0080 04-26-06 

Boling, 
Barbara S. 

School Asst-Sub + Special 
Ed Asst- Sub + Clerical-Sub 
+ Food Service-Sub (0080) 
 

Lakeside/Cafeteria Asst, 
Temp (0080) + School Asst-
Sub + Special Ed Asst- Sub + 
Clerical-Sub + Food Service-
Sub (0080) 
 

T 0080 04-17-06 
to 

06-02-06 

Brown, 
Elizabeth V. 

School Asst-Sub + Special 
Ed Asst- Sub + Clerical-Sub 
+ Food Service-Sub (0080) 
 

Scott/Special Program Asst 
(0417) + School Asst-Sub + 
Special Ed Asst- Sub + 
Clerical-Sub + Food Service-
Sub (0080) 
 

T 0417 04-18-06 
to 

06-02-06 

Brown, 
Kevin R. 

Harrison Hill/School Asst 
(0010/0080) + Breakfast 
Program Aide (0080) 
 

Harrison Hill/School Asst 
(0010/0080) 

R 0010/ 
0080 

04-03-06 

Campbell, 
Tiffany A. 
 

Young/Sick Leave Young/School Asst R 0015 04-17-06 
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Costello, 
Jason M. 

Certified Sub Miami/Administrative Aide-
Hourly, Temp 

T 0010 04-24-06 
to 

06-09-06 
 

Epple, 
Renee L. 

Holland/Primetime Asst Holland/Leave of Absence L 0010 04-03-06 
to 

08-18-06 

Fagg, 
Mary P. 

Waynedale/School Asst 
(0010/0080) +  School Asst-
Sub + Special Ed Asst- Sub + 
Clerical-Sub + Food Service-
Sub (0080) 

 

Waynedale/Primetime Asst, 
Temp + School Asst, Temp 
(0041) + School Asst-Sub + 
Special Ed Asst- Sub + 
Clerical-Sub + Food Service-
Sub (0080) 
 

T 0010/ 
0041 

04-27-06 
To 

06-01-06 

Green, 
Patricia I. 
 

Haley/Night Custodian Haley/Family Medical Leave L 0010 05-02-06 
to 

06-13-06 
Greer, 
Charles 

Wayne/Sick Leave Wayne/Sick Leave, extended L 0010 04-19-06 
to 

04-18-07 
 

Henderson, 
James A. 

School Asst-Sub + Special 
Ed Asst- Sub + Clerical-Sub 
+ Food Service-Sub (0080) 
 

Scott/Special Program Asst 
(0417) + School Asst-Sub + 
Special Ed Asst- Sub + 
Clerical-Sub + Food Service-
Sub (0080) 
 

T 0417 04-21-06 
to 

06-02-06 

Jordan, 
Dorothy J. 
 

Food Service Center/ 
Cafeteria Asst 

North Side/Cook, Temp T 0080 05-04-06 
to 

06-02-06 
Ketzenberger, 
Kelley M. 

School Asst-Sub + Special 
Ed Asst- Sub + Clerical-Sub 
+ Food Service-Sub (0080) 
 

South Side/Cafeteria Asst, 
Temp (0080) + School Asst-
Sub + Special Ed Asst- Sub + 
Clerical-Sub + Food Service-
Sub (0080) 
 

T 0080 03-27-06 
to 

04-27-06 

Ketzler,  
Cindy A. 

School Asst-Sub + Special 
Ed Asst- Sub + Clerical-Sub 
+ Food Service-Sub (0080) 
 

Wayne/42 Week Secretary, 
Temp (0010) + School Asst-
Sub + Special Ed Asst- Sub + 
Clerical-Sub + Food Service-
Sub (0080) 
 

T 0010 03-13-06 
to 

06-09-06 

Kumfer, 
Nancy J. 

School Asst-Sub + Special 
Ed Asst- Sub + Clerical-Sub 
+ Food Service-Sub (0080) 
 

Harrison Hill/Primetime Asst, 
Temp (0010) + School Asst, 
Temp (0041) + School Asst-
Sub + Special Ed Asst- Sub + 
Clerical-Sub + Food Service-
Sub (0080) 
 

T 0010/ 
0041 

03-29-06 
to 

06-01-06 

Mattern, 
Carol J. 
 

Northcrest/School Asst  Northcrest/Sick Leave L 0015 04-17-06 
to 

08-18-06 
Merriweather, 
Dorris W. 

Anthis Career Center/Family 
Medical Leave 

Anthis Career Center/Part-
time Custodian (0.63) 
 

R 0010 04-14-06 
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Ott, 
Jeanne A. 

North Side/Assistant 
Cafeteria Manager 

Miami/Cafeteria Manager, 
Temp 

T 0080 05-01-06 
to 

06-02-06 

Reust, 
Eleanor A. 

Wayne/42 Week Secretary Wayne/Family Medical 
Leave 

L 0010 03-10-06 
to 

03-21-06 

Reust, 
Eleanor A. 

Wayne/Family Medical 
Leave 

Wayne/Sick Leave L 0010 03-22-06 
to 

06-09-06 

Robinson, 
Tawanna P. 

Harrison Hill/School Asst 
(0010/0080) + School Asst-
Sub + Special Ed Asst- Sub + 
Clerical-Sub + Food Service-
Sub (0080) 
 

Harrison Hill/School Asst 
(0010/0080) + Breakfast 
Program Aide (0080) + 
School Asst-Sub + Special Ed 
Asst- Sub + Clerical-Sub + 
Food Service-Sub (0080) 
 

R 0080 04-26-06 

Sims,  
Nadine L. 

Wayne/School Asst Special 
Ed + School Asst 

Wayne/School Asst Special 
Ed, Temp + School Asst 
Special Ed, Temp 
 

T 0010 04-10-06 
to 

06-01-06 

Steinke, 
Leigh A. 

North Side/Cook North Side/Assistant 
Cafeteria Manager, Temp 

T 0080 05-05-06 
to 

06-02-06 

Stephens, 
Gregory G. 

Certified Sub Miami, Administrative Aide-
Hourly, Temp 

T 0010 04-24-06 
to 

06-09-06 

Thomas, 
Harvest B. 

Jefferson/Part-time Custodian 
(0.63) 

Jefferson/Family Medical 
Leave 

L 0010 04-25-06 
to 

07-19-06 

Tucker, 
Kelly J. 

Holland/School Asst Special 
Ed (0010) + School Asst 
Special Ed (0041) 

Holland/Sick Leave L 0010/ 
0041 

04-18-06 
to 

04-21-06 

Washington, 
Rose M. 

School Asst-Sub + Special 
Ed Asst- Sub + Clerical-Sub 
+ Food Service-Sub (0080) 
 

Maplewood/School Asst 
Special Ed, Temp (0010) + 
School Asst Special Ed, 
Temp (00410) + School Asst-
Sub + Special Ed Asst- Sub + 
Clerical-Sub + Food Service-
Sub (0080) 
 

T 0010/ 
0041 

03-22-06 
to 

06-01-06 

Wattley, 
Gertrude J. 

School Asst-Sub + Special 
Ed Asst- Sub + Clerical-Sub 
+ Food Service-Sub (0080) 
 

North Side/Cafeteria Asst, 
Temp (0080) + School Asst-
Sub + Special Ed Asst- Sub + 
Clerical-Sub + Food Service-
Sub (0080) 
 

T 0080 04-17-06 
to 

05-05-06 

CLASSIFIED PERSONNEL RECOMMENDED FOR TEMPORARY ASSIGNMENT (S) 

Scott, James R. Underwood, Clarence  
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 A motion was made by Jon J. Olinger, seconded by Stephen Corona, that the personnel report 
be approved.  Roll Call:  Ayes, unanimous; nays, none. 

 
Jon Olinger asked everyone to be alert and watchful during the next few weeks when school 

will be ending and children will be out in the neighborhoods. 
   
Superintendent Robinson commented on the annual retirement dinner scheduled for tomorrow 

and her appreciation for those who have done so much for the students in our district.  Dr. Robinson 
also commented on the FWCS planning for a possible flu pandemic.  

 
The next regular meeting of the Board is scheduled for Monday, May 22, 2006, at 7:00 p.m. in 

the Lester L. Grile Administrative Center. 
 
 Documents to be signed by members of the Board were the Regular Board Meeting Minutes 
from April 24, 2006, Payroll Certification, and Voucher List. 
 
 There being no further business, upon a motion by Robert A. Armstrong, seconded by Kurt A. 
Walborn, the meeting was adjourned at 7:50 p.m. 

Comments 

Comments 

Next 
Meeting 

Signatures 

Adjournment 

Personnel 
Report 
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