

**THE KENTON COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
COPY PAPER BID TABULATION
2023-2024**

#	Commodity Code	Estimated Quantity	Item Description	UOM	FEDERAL SUPPLY		LIBERTY PAPER		STAMAR		STERLING PAPER CO.		TOTAL OFFICE SOURCE		VERITIV	
					Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total
COPY PAPER																
1	PAP-10000	80	Xerographic Paper for Copy Machines, Duplicators, Ink Jet Printers & Laser Printers, 8 1/2" x 11", 20#, No. 4 Sulphite, Cutting Tolerance Plus/Minus 1/64", Long Grain, Moisture Proof Outside Wrap, White, 500 sheets/ream, 10 reams/case, 40 cases/skid	skid	1,660.00	132,800.00	1,584.00	126,720.00	1,878.00	150,240.00	1,490.80	119,264.00	1,590.00	127,200.00	NO BID	NO BID
2	PAP-10050	2	Xerographic Paper for Copy Machines, Duplicators, Ink Jet Printers & Laser Printers, 8 1/2" x 14" (Legal Size), 20#, No. 4 Sulphite, Cutting Tolerance Plus/Minus 1/64", Long Grain, Moisture Proof Outside Wrap, White, 500 sheets/ream, 10 reams/case	carton	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	63.00	126.00	67.70	135.40	NO BID	NO BID
3	PAP-10100	2	Xerographic Paper for Copy Machines, Duplicators, Ink Jet Printers & Laser Printers, 8 1/2" x 11", 20#, No. 4 Sulphite, Cutting Tolerance Plus/Minus 1/64", Long Grain, Moisture Proof Outside Wrap, 3-hole punch, 20#, White, 500 sheets/ream, 10 reams/carton	carton	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	51.00	102.00	59.00	118.00	NO BID	NO BID
4	PAP-10150	5	Xerographic Paper for Copy Machines, Duplicators, Ink Jet Printers & Laser Printers, 11" x 17" (Ledger Size), No. 4 Sulphite, Cutting Tolerance Plus/Minus 1/64", Long Grain, Moisture Proof Outside Wrap, 20#, White, 500 sheets/ream, 5 reams/carton	carton	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	47.00	235.00	59.00	295.00	NO BID	NO BID
5	PAP-10450	10	Xerographic Paper, 8 1/2" x 11", 20#, for Copy Machines, Duplicators, Ink Jet Printers & Laser Printers, No. 4 Sulphite, Cutting Tolerance Plus/Minus 1/64", Long Grain, Moisture Proof Outside Wrap, Blue, 500 sheets/ream, 10 reams/carton	carton	79.56	795.60	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	51.20	512.00	69.75	697.50	NO BID	NO BID
6	PAP-10350	6	Xerographic Paper, 8 1/2" x 11", 20#, for Copy Machines, Duplicators, Ink Jet Printers & Laser Printers, No. 4 Sulphite, Cutting Tolerance Plus/Minus 1/64", Long Grain, Moisture Proof Outside Wrap, Gold (Goldenrod), 500 sheets/ream, 10 reams/carton	carton	79.56	477.36	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	51.20	307.20	69.75	418.50	NO BID	NO BID
7	PAP-10375	3	Xerographic Paper, 8 1/2" x 11", 20#, for Copy Machines, Duplicators, Ink Jet Printers & Laser Printers, No. 4 Sulphite, Cutting Tolerance Plus/Minus 1/64", Long Grain, Moisture Proof Outside Wrap, Gray, 500 sheets/ream, 10 reams/carton	carton	79.56	238.68	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	51.20	153.60	69.75	209.25	NO BID	NO BID
8	PAP-10400	10	Xerographic Paper, 8 1/2" x 11", 20#, for Copy Machines, Duplicators, Ink Jet Printers & Laser Printers, No. 4 Sulphite, Cutting Tolerance Plus/Minus 1/64", Long Grain, Moisture Proof Outside Wrap, Green, 500 sheets/ream, 10 reams/carton	carton	79.56	795.60	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	51.20	512.00	69.75	697.50	NO BID	NO BID
9	PAP-10500	6	Xerographic Paper, 8 1/2" x 11", 20#, for Copy Machines, Duplicators, Ink Jet Printers & Laser Printers, No. 4 Sulphite, Cutting Tolerance Plus/Minus 1/64", Long Grain, Moisture Proof Outside Wrap, Pink, 500 sheets/ream, 10 reams/carton	carton	79.56	477.36	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	51.20	307.20	69.75	418.50	NO BID	NO BID
10	PAP-10600	7	Xerographic Paper, 8 1/2" x 11", 20#, for Copy Machines, Duplicators, Ink Jet Printers & Laser Printers, No. 4 Sulphite, Cutting Tolerance Plus/Minus 1/64", Long Grain, Moisture Proof Outside Wrap, Orchid (Purple), 500 sheets/ream, 10 reams/carton	carton	79.56	556.92	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	51.20	358.40	69.75	488.25	NO BID	NO BID
11	PAP-10700	5	Xerographic Paper, 8 1/2" x 11", 20#, for Copy Machines, Duplicators, Ink Jet Printers & Laser Printers, No. 4 Sulphite, Cutting Tolerance Plus/Minus 1/64", Long Grain, Moisture Proof Outside Wrap, Cherry (Red), 500 sheets/ream, 10 reams/carton	carton	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	106.07	530.35	189.00	945.00	NO BID	NO BID
12	PAP-10750	5	Xerographic Paper, 8 1/2" x 11", 20#, for Copy Machines, Duplicators, Ink Jet Printers & Laser Printers, No. 4 Sulphite, Cutting Tolerance Plus/Minus 1/64", Long Grain, Moisture Proof Outside Wrap, Orange (Pumkin) - (Salmon is not allowable), 500 sheets/ream, 10 reams/carton	carton	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	59.00	295.00	69.75	348.75	NO BID	NO BID

**THE KENTON COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
COPY PAPER BID TABULATION
2023-2024**

#	Commodity Code	Estimated Quantity	Item Description	UOM	FEDERAL SUPPLY		LIBERTY PAPER		STAMAR		STERLING PAPER CO.		TOTAL OFFICE SOURCE		VERITIV	
					Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total
13	PAP-10300	7	Xerographic Paper, 8 1/2" x 11", for Copy Machines, Duplicators, Ink Jet Printers & Laser Printers, No. 4 Sulphite, Cutting Tolerance Plus/Minus 1/64", Long Grain, Moisture Proof Outside Wrap, 20#, Yellow (Canary), 500 sheets/ream, 10 reams/carton	carton	79.56	556.92	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	51.20	358.40	69.75	488.25	NO BID	NO BID
14	PAP-10000	1	Truck load of PAP-10000, 21 skids/40 cases per skid	truck load		33,810.00		29,106.00		39,438.00		29,652.00		33,390.00		31,264.80
Totals						<u>170,508.44</u>		<u>155,826.00</u>		<u>189,678.00</u>		<u>152,713.15</u>		<u>165,849.90</u>		<u>31,264.80</u>

Recommended as lowest and/or best evaluated bid-Sterling Paper Co.

*Notes: The estimated quantities column does not constitute an order. It is meant to be an estimate of past usage only.
Orders shall be placed on an as needed basis only.
ODP Business Solutions and Quill were not included in the tabulation due to being deemed non-compliant for exceptions listed.*