

**KENTON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION
BUS FLUIDS 2023-2024**

COMMODITY CODE	ITEM	APOLLO OIL			CLARKE POWER SERVICES			VALOR OIL, LLC			NOTES
		BRAND	COST	UOM	BRAND	COST	UOM	BRAND	COST	UOM	
FLU-10000	Engine Oil – 15W-40	SHELL	\$9.49	GALLON	PHILLIPS	\$10.86	GALLON	DURAFLOW	\$11.16	GALLON	
FLU-10025	Automatic Transmission Fluid Allison TES-295	VALVOLINE	\$ 25.99	GALLON	ALLISON/BP	\$ 22.50	GALLON	DURADRIVE HD	\$ 36.11	GALLON	
FLU-10020	Automatic Transmission Fluid Allison TES-389-SPEC	NO BID		GALLON	PHILLIPS	\$ 12.28	GALLON	PC D3M	\$ 14.34	GALLON	
FLU-10030	Power Steering Fluid	NO BID		QUART	O'REILLY'S	\$ 4.53	QUART	STARFIRE	\$ 3.18	QUART	
FLU-10110	Antifreeze – Fully Formulated Glycol Base Engine Coolant – PURPLE ONLY	SHELL	\$ 379.99	55 GALLON	VALVOLINE	\$ 418.75	55 GALLON	DURAFLOW	\$ 507.38	55 GALLON	
FLU-10065	Gear Oil – Synthetic 75W-140	NO BID		120 POUND	PHILLIPS	\$2,167.16	120 POUND	DURAFLOW	\$ 550.92	120 POUND	
FLU-10060	Gear Oil – 85W-140	NO BID		120 POUND	PHILLIPS	\$ 246.82	120 POUND	DELOGEAR	\$ 340.48	120 POUND	
FLU-10070	Chassis Grease	SHELL	\$1,999.99	400 POUND	NO BID		400 POUND	PC PRECISION XL	\$1,577.94	400 POUND	
FLU-10080	Windshield Washer Solvent Concentrate	NO BID		55 GALLON	NO BID		55 GALLON	NO BID		55 GALLON	NO BID
FLU-10085	Windshield Washer Solvent Pre-mix	NO BID		55 GALLON	OAP WIP	\$ 147.73	55 GALLON	DURAFLOW	\$ 112.75	55 GALLON	
FLU-10100	Diesel Exhaust Fluid	MUSKET	\$ 2.19	GALLON	OLD WORLD BRAND	\$ 2.75	GALLON	BLUE SKY	\$ 1.54	GALLON	
STORE DISCOUNT:		0%			0%			0%			

Recommendation: Award the Bus Fluids Bid to Apollo Oil, Clarke Power Services, and Valor Oil, LLC, as indicated in the highlighted sections.