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1. 7:00 p.m. Call to Order by the Board President and Reading of the Sunshine Statement: 

 

“Pursuant to Section 5 of the Open Public Meetings Act, notice of this meeting was advertised as 

directed by resolution adopted January 4, 2022. Notice of this meeting was published in the Asbury Park 

Press newspaper  and sent to the Municipal Clerk, Red Bank Borough, within 7 days per code. 

 

At the commencement of the meetings, the Board is expected to immediately convene an executive 

session and expects to resume the public portion of its meeting upon its return from executive session. 

Members of the public will be able to participate in the meeting as per the agenda. 

 

Fire exits are located in the direction indicated. In case of fire, you will be signaled by a bell and/or 

public address system. If so alerted, please move in a calm and orderly fashion to the nearest exit. 

 

Need for Remote: Notice is hereby given that future meetings of the Red Bank Borough Board of 

Education may need to be held virtually. Visit www.rbb.k12.nj.us for access information and/or location 

changes. 

 

The Red Bank Borough Board of Education shall allow members of the public to make public comment 

by audio, or by audio and video, if the remote public meeting is held over both audio and video, during 

the meeting. In advance of the remote public meeting, the Board shall allow public comments to be 

submitted to the Business Administrator by electronic mail using publiccomment@rbb.k12.nj.us and in 

written form sent to Red Bank Board of Education, 76 Branch Avenue, Red Bank, NJ 07701. Public 

comments submitted by 4:00 PM the Monday before the remote public meeting through electronic mail 

or by written letter shall be read aloud and addressed during the remote public meeting in a manner 

audible to all meeting participants and the public. The Board imposes a five minute time limit on 

individual comments with the same limits placed on the reading of written comments. Bylaw 0164.6 

found on the District website has more details on Remote Public Board Meetings. 

 

 

 

 

BOARD OF EDUCATION MEETING SCHEDULE 

7:00 PM – Red Bank Primary School Cafeteria 

 Bold Indicates Virtual 

 

January 4, 2022 Reorganization 

January 18, 2022 

February 8, 2022 

March 15, 2022 

April 26, 2022 Public Budget Hearing 

May 10, 2022 

June 14, 2022 

July 12, 2022 Retreat (5:00 PM) 

August 9, 2022 

August 23, 2022 

September 13, 2022 

October 11, 2022 

November 8, 2022 

December 13, 2022 

January 3, 2023 Reorganization 

  

https://www.rbb.k12.nj.us/
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2. ROLL CALL 

PRESENT: Laura Camargo (arrived 7:09 PM), Ben Forest, Jennifer Garcia (arrived 7:01 PM), Dom 

Kalorin, Erik Perry, Ann Roseman, Dr. Frederick Stone, Suzanne Viscomi (arrived 7:01 PM) 

ALSO PRESENT: Jared Rumage, Superintendent; Eileen Gorga, Business Administrator/Board 

Secretary; Jonathan Busch, Esq. 

ABSENT: Pamela McArthur 

 

3. FLAG SALUTE 

 Mr. Kalorin led the Salute to the Flag. 

 

4. EXECUTIVE SESSION - NONE 

  

 5.  SUPERINTENDENT’S REPORT 

Dr. Rumage presented the following items: 

 

a. March 2022 Student Attendance Report 

 

GRADES % ATTENDANCE 

Preschool-Grade 3 95.3 

Grades 4-8 96.0 

 

b. March 2022 Enrollment Report 

 

SITE 3F 4F KF 01 02 03 04 05 06 07 08 TOTAL 

RBMS       115 131 117 128 154 645 

RBPS 11 5 127 115 121 124      503 

UMC 30 32          62 

FBC 20 22          42 

AHS 15 14          29 

MDCC 19 16          35 

YMCA 15 20          35 

TOTAL 110 109 127 115 121 124 115 131 117 128 154 1351 

OOD     1  1 3  1 2 8 

 

c. March 2022 Suspension Report 

 

GRADE 

1 

GRADE 

2 

GRADE 

3 

GRADE 

4 

GRADE 

5 

GRADE 

6 

GRADE 

7 

GRADE 

8 
TOTAL 

0 0 0 0 0 4 4 17 25 

  

d. March 2022 Harassment, Intimidation and Bullying Report 
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CASE # OF STUDENTS # OF VICTIMS STATUS 

    

 

 e.   March 2022 Bus Evacuation Drills 

  

DATE 

OF 

DRILL 

TIME 

DRILL 

CONDUCTE

D 

SCHOOL/BUILDIN

G 

LOCATION 

OF DRILL 

ROUTES 

INCLUDED 

IN DRILL 

PRINCIPAL OR 

SUPERVISOR 

ASSIGNED TO 

SUPERVISE 

DRILL 

03/30/22 8:53 AM 
Monmouth Reform 

Temple 

Parking lot 

near side door 
RB-TF2 Mrs. Donahue 

  

f.    Safe Return Update 

 

g.  Public Budget Hearing 2022-2023 School Year 

     Dr. Rumage presented the 2022-23 School Year Budget  

 

A. Board of Education Discussion 

- Ms. Viscomi thanked the Superintendent and the BA for having a strategic plan during 

these difficult times and that our children deserve every opportunity to succeed. Ms. 

Viscomi elaborated that every year tough decisions are made and that she is very proud 

of this budget, thanking everyone involved with developing it. 

- Mr. Forest commented on all the work that went into the budget and is proud of the 

district and glad the budget gap is closing. Mr. Forest stated he is proud to vote yes for 

this budget. 

 

  B. Public Comment on the Budget - None 

 

7. COMMITTEE REPORTS 

• Community Relations Committee – Mrs. Garcia reviewed the March 6th meeting topics which 

included PreK and bilingual videos, NJDOE award, ice cream wars, Red Bank Classic 5K run/walk 

scheduled for June 18, Preschool Family Fun Day scheduled for Saturday April 30th, International 

Day, Spring Concert, and a May 4th recognition for Dr. Rumage being held at the Count Basie. 

• Curriculum Committee – Ms. Roseman shared the April 12 meeting topics including the high school 

placement presentation by the school guidance counselors. Red Bank has many 8th grade students 

placed in public and private advanced programs. 

 

8. PRESIDENT’S REPORT - NONE 

 

9. HEARING OF THE PUBLIC - NONE 

Bylaw #0167 reads . . . “Any individual deciding to speak shall state their name and address. All 

comments will be directed to the Chair. Speakers shall be limited to one (1) turn of five (5) minutes with 

a total public participation not exceeding 60 minutes.” 

 

 



Red Bank Board of Education Meeting - April 26, 2022 
 

Page 5 

10. STATEMENT TO THE PUBLIC 

It may appear to members of our audience that the Board of Education takes action with very little 

comment and in many cases a unanimous vote. Almost without exception, before a matter is placed on 

the agenda at a public meeting, the matter is thoroughly reviewed by the Superintendent and, when 

necessary, other school district administrators. If the Superintendent is satisfied that the matter is ready 

to be presented to the Board of Education, and if the circumstances permit, it is then referred to the 

appropriate committee of the Board of Education. The members of the Board committee work with the 

Administration and the Superintendent to assure its understanding of the matter. When the Board 

committee and the Superintendent are satisfied that it may be presented to the Board of Education, the 

matter is placed on the agenda at a public meeting. 

 

11. ACTION AGENDA 

 Mrs. Garcia motioned, seconded by Ms. Roseman to approve the following items: 

 

COMMUNITY RELATIONS - 1000 

BE IT RESOLVED by the RED BANK BOROUGH BOARD OF EDUCATION that upon the 

recommendation of the Superintendent the following COMMUNITY RELATIONS resolution(s) are 

approved as indicated: 

NONE  

 

COMPLIANCE – 2000 

BE IT RESOLVED by the RED BANK BOROUGH BOARD OF EDUCATION that upon the 

recommendation of the Superintendent the following COMPLIANCE resolution(s) are approved as 

indicated: 

 

2008. That the Board approves the March 2022 Suspension Report as submitted by the Superintendent. 

 

2009. That the Board approves the March 2022 Harassment, Intimidation and Bullying Report as 

submitted by the Superintendent. 

 

2010. That the Board approves the March 2022 Bus Evacuation Drills Report as submitted by the 

Superintendent. 

 

BUSINESS – 3000 

BE IT RESOLVED by the RED BANK BOROUGH BOARD OF EDUCATION that upon the 

recommendation of the Superintendent the following FINANCE resolution(s) are approved as indicated: 

 

3057.  APPROVAL OF BOARD MINUTES 

That the Board approves the minutes from the March 15, 2022 Regular Session Meeting of the 

Board of Education. 

3058.   BILLS PAYMENT 

To authorize the payment of final bills for March 2022 in the amount of $3,471,249.98 and for 

bills as of April 2022 in the amount of $1,071,689.56. 

 

3059.   APPROVAL OF SECRETARY/TREASURER’S REPORT 

Pursuant to 18A:6-59 to approve the February 2022 Report of the Treasurer and the February 

2022 Report of the Secretary as being in balance for the month. 
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3060.   BUDGET TRANSFERS 

To ratify any budget transfers effective February 2022 per the transfer report.  

 

3061. CANCELED CHECKS 

That the Board approves the cancellation of the following list to replace with a food store gift 

cards: 

MS STUDENT ACTIVITY ACCOUNT 

 

CHECK NO. AMOUNT CHECK DATE 

3628 $20.00 06/12/2020 

3630 $20.00 06/12/2020 

3633 $20.00 06/12/2020 

3651 $40.00 06/12/2020 

3684 $40.00 06/12/2020 

3686 $40.00 06/12/2020 

3720 $20.00 06/30/2020 

 

3062.   ADOPTION OF THE 2022-2023 SCHOOL YEAR BUDGET AND TAX LEVY 

WHEREAS, the Red Bank Board of Education adopted a tentative budget on March 15, 2022 to 

be submitted to the Executive County Superintendent of Schools for approval, and 

 

WHEREAS, the tentative budget was approved by the Executive County Superintendent of 

Schools on March 29, 2022; and 

 

WHEREAS, the tentative budget was advertised in the legal section of the Asbury Park Press on 

April 6, 2022; and 

 

WHEREAS, the tentative budget was presented to the public on April 26, 2022; and 

 

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED that the budget be adopted for the 2022-2023 school 

year using the 2022-2023 state aid figures and that the Secretary to the Board of Education be 

authorized to submit the following adopted budget to the Executive County Superintendent of 

Schools in accordance with the statutory deadline: 

 

 General Fund Special Revenue Debt Service TOTAL 

2022-2023 

Total Expenditures 

 

$28,670,664 

 

$7,961,324 

 

$471,750 

 

$37,103,738 

Less:  

Anticipated Revenues 

 

$9,784,022 

 

$7,961,324 

 

$160,396 

 

$17,905,742 

Taxes to be Raised $18,886,642 $0 $311,354 $19,197,996 
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3063. IMPLEMENTATION OF THE 2022-2023 SCHOOL YEAR BUDGET 

That the Board authorizes the Superintendent and the Business Administrator/ Board Secretary to 

implement the 2022-2023 budget pursuant to local and state policies. 

  

3064.  TAX LEVY CERTIFICATION FORM A 

RESOLVED, that the amount required for school purposes in the school district of Red Bank 

Borough, County of Monmouth for the 2022-2023 school year is $19,197, 996 and is required to 

be levied for local school district purposes. 

  

3065.  ADOPTION OF THE TAX LEVY SCHEDULE 

Recommend the Board of Education adopt the tax levy schedule for the 2022-2023 school year 

and authorizes the Business Administrator to submit the schedule to the Municipal Clerk for the 

collection of the local school district taxes for school district purposes.      

 

GENERAL FUND 

July 2022 $1,573,886.83  January 2023 $1,573,886.83 

August 2022 $1,573,886.83 February 2023 $1,573,886.83 

September 2022 $1,573,886.83 March 2023 $1,573,886.83 

October 2022 $1,573,886.83 April 2023 $1,573,886.83 

November 2022 $1,573,886.83 May 2023 $1,573,886.83 

December 2022 $1,573,886.83 June 2023 $1,573,886.87 

  Total: $18,886,642.00 

DEBT SERVICE   

 July 1, 2022 $155,677   

December 1, 2022 $155,677   

Total:  $311,354   

 

3066. TRAVEL AND RELATED EXPENSE REIMBURSEMENTS 

WHEREAS, the Red Bank Borough Board of Education recognizes school staff and Board 

members will incur travel expenses related to and within the scope of their current 

responsibilities and for travel that promotes the delivery of instruction or furthers the efficient 

operation of the school district; and 

WHEREAS, N.J.A.C. 6A:23A-7.3 et seq. requires Board members to receive approval of these 

expenses by a majority of the full voting membership of the Board and staff members to receive 

prior approval of these expenses by the Superintendent of Schools and a majority of the full voting 

membership of the Board; and 

WHEREAS, the Red Bank Borough Board of Education established $75,000 as the maximum 

travel amount for the current school year and has expended $ 3,040.02 as of this date; now 
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THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, the Board of Education approves travel and related expense 

reimbursements in accordance with N.J.A.C. 6A:23A-7.3, to a maximum expenditure of $75,000 

for the 2022-2023 school year.   

3067. TRANSPORTATION AWARD - EXTENDED SCHOOL YEAR 

To award Student Transportation Services contracts for the 2022-2023 extended school year 

program as follows: Bid packages were properly advertised on March 30, 2022; Bid opening was 

Tuesday, April 12, 2022 at 10:00 a.m. Bid specifications were provided to: Durham School 

Service, First Student, Jay’s Bus Service, Luz Transport, MV Transit, Presidential Trans, Road to 

Success, and Seman Tov. The Board awards the routes based on the lowest per diem bid (not the 

bulk bid discount) as it is the least expensive option. Bid Results Below: 

 

ROUTES 
JAY’S BUS 

SERVICE 

LUZ 

TRANSPORT 

SEMAN 

TOV 
AWARDED TO: 

H0319 per Diem 
no bid $380.00 $375.00 

Not awarded – quote for ESY 

and rebid for school year 

H0319 Aide no bid $100.00 $60.00 
Not awarded – quote for ESY 

and rebid for school year 

ADJ +/- no bid $1.90 $0.01   

CSESY12 per 

Diem 
no bid no bid $320.00 Seman Tov 

CSESY12 Aide no bid no bid $60.00 Seman Tov 

ADJ +/- no bid no bid $0.01   

RBESY1 per Diem no bid no bid $375.00 Seman Tov 

RBESY1 Aide no bid no bid $60.00 Seman Tov 

ADJ +/- no bid no bid $0.01   

RBESY2 per Diem no bid no bid $375.00 Seman Tov 

RBESY2 Aide no bid no bid $60.00 Seman Tov 

ADJ +/- no bid no bid $0.01   

RBESY3 per Diem $249.00 no bid $600.00 Jay’s Bus Service 

RBESY3 Aide $100.00 no bid $50.00 Jay’s Bus Service 

ADJ +/- $0.01 no bid $0.01   

RBESY4 per Diem $249.00 no bid $600.00 Jay’s Bus Service 

RBESY4 Aide $100.00 no bid $50.00 Jay’s Bus Service 

ADJ +/- $0.01 no bid $0.01   

RBESY5 per Diem $249.00 no bid $600.00 Jay’s Bus Service 

RBESY5 Aide $100.00 no bid $50.00 Jay’s Bus Service 

ADJ +/- $0.01 no bid $0.01   

RBESY6 per Diem $249.00 no bid $600.00 Jay’s Bus Service 

RBESY6 Aide $100.00 no bid $50.00 Jay’s Bus Service 
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ADJ +/- $0.01 no bid $0.01   

RBESY7 per Diem $249.00 no bid $600.00 Jay’s Bus Service 

RBESY7 Aide $100.00 no bid $50.00 Jay’s Bus Service 

ADJ +/- $0.01 no bid $0.01   

 

3068. TRAVEL 

 

NAME DATE/TIME 
LOCATIO

N 
COST THEME ACCOUNT # 

Maura 

Harrington 

6/21/22 - 6/24/22 

10:00 AM - 5:00 

PM 

Virtual $850.00 
Teachers College 

Writing Institute 
20-275-200-500-MS2-F22 

Amendment 

for 

Eileen Gorga 

6/7/22 - 6/10/22 

7:30 AM - 5:00 PM 

Atlantic City, 

NJ 

$112.00 

Added 

Hotel 

Fees 

2022 NJASBO 

Conference 
11-000-251-890-000 

Christopher 

Murray 

5/18/22 

9:00 AM - 3:00 PM 

New 

Providence, 

NJ 

$194.60 HIB Law Update 11-000-221-500-001 

Rosalie 

Trudell 

5/18/22 

9:00 AM - 3:00 PM 

New 

Providence, 

NJ 

$194.60 HIB Law Update 11-000-221-500-001 

Alyssa May 
5/24/22 

9:00 AM - 3:00 PM 
Howell, NJ $319.21 

Fundations Level 

K 
20-275-200-500-PS1-F22 

Brittany 

Mirrione 

5/24/22 

9:00 AM - 3:00 PM 
Howell, NJ $308.50 

Fundations Level 

K 
11-000-221-500-004 

Miranda 

Black 

5/24/22 

9:00 AM - 3:00 PM 
Howell, NJ $313.89 

Fundations Level 

K 
11-000-221-500-004 

Colleen 

Flaherty 

5/25/22 

9:00 AM - 3:00 PM 
Howell, NJ $320.61 

Fundations Level 

1 
11-000-221-500-004 

Chelsea 

Foster 

5/25/22 

9:00 AM - 3:00 PM 
Howell, NJ $320.61 

Fundations Level 

1 
11-000-221-500-004 

Kristine 

Guzman 

5/25/22 

9:00 AM - 3:00 PM 
Howell, NJ $320.12 

Fundations Level 

1 
20-275-200-500-PS1-F22 

Michelle 

Saldida 

6/7/22 

9:00 AM - 3:00 PM 
Howell, NJ $320.61 

Fundations Level 

2 
11-000-221-500-004 

Kelly Hogan 
6/7/22 

9:00 AM - 3:00 PM 
Howell, NJ $320.61 

Fundations Level 

2 
11-000-221-500-004 

Erinn Bunge 
6/8/22 

9:00 AM - 3:00 PM 
Freehold, NJ $316.06 

Fundations Level 

3 
20-245-200-500-PS1-F22 
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Isabella Sessa 
6/8/22 

9:00 AM - 3:00 PM 
Freehold, NJ $314.17 

Fundations Level 

3 

20-275-200-500-PS1-F22 

20-245-200-500-PS1-F22 

Kate Mills 
6/8/22 

9:00 AM - 3:00 PM 
Freehold, NJ $316.06 

Fundations Level 

3 
20-275-200-500-PS1-F22 

 

3069. NON PUBLIC IDEA-B SERVICES 

That the Board approves a revocable ten year agreement for Non Public IDEA-B Services 

between Monmouth Ocean Educational Services Commission and the Red Bank Borough BOE 

for the 2022-2032 school years, per Attachment A. 

 

 3070. EXTENSION OF THE 2019-2022 COMPREHENSIVE EQUITY PLAN (CEP) 

That the Board approves the Statement of Assurance which extends CEP development  

and submission by one year until 2023 until the NJDOE considers amendments that might 

become effective in 2023.   

 

3071. TRANSPORTATION AWARD 

To award route CG0422 for the 2021-2022 school year to Luz Transport for transportation from 

Eatontown, NJ to Red Bank Middle & Primary School. Quotations were requested from Briggs, 

DAG Transport, Father N Son, Irving Raphael, Luz Transport, New Destination, R&D Transit, 

and School Bound. Luz Transport provided the sole response with a $385 per diem.  

 

 3072. DONATION 

  That the Board accepts with gratitude the generous donation from The Tacoholics Grill of 

$175.00 from the Family Night Fundraiser. 

 

3073. CONTRACT 

 That the Board approves an agreement with LearnWell Education to provide instruction (not 

to exceed 2 hours per day) to one Red Bank student from April 5 through May 5, 2022 at a 

cost of $49.50 per hour. Account # 11-150-100-320-000  

 

3074. CONTRACT 

 That the Board approves Monmouth Ocean Educational Services Commission (MOESC) to 

complete a full bilingual Child Study Team evaluation for one RBMS student at the rate of 

$650.00 per evaluation prior to June 30, 2022. Account #11-000-219-390-003 

 

3075. CONTRACT 

 That the Board approves Monmouth Ocean Educational Services Commission (MOESC) to 

complete Educational (LDTC) Child Study Team evaluations (not to exceed a maximum of 15 

evaluations) at the rate of $375.00 per evaluation prior to June 30, 2022. Account 

#11-000-219-390-003 

 

3076. TRANSPORTATION AWARD - ESY 2022 HAWKSWOOD 

 To award route H0316 for the 2022 extended school year at Hawkswood School to School 

Bound. Quotations were requested from: Father N Son, Luz Transport, New Destination,  

St. George, and School Bound. School Bound provided the lowest response with a cost of $300 

per diem and $60 for aide (if needed). 
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PERSONNEL – 4000 

BE IT RESOLVED by the RED BANK BOROUGH BOARD OF EDUCATION that upon the 

recommendation of the Superintendent, the following PERSONNEL resolution(s) are approved as 

indicated: 

 

4044. That the Board approves an amendment to Resolution 4201, 4202, 4203 and 4204 (Approved 

at the November 9, 2001 Board of Education Meeting) to include payment from ESSER II 

(Account #20-483-200-100-000). 

 

4045. That the Board approves an amendment to Resolution 4201 (Approved at the November 9, 

2001 Board of Education Meeting) to include Instructional Assistants at the stipulated 

contractual rate of $22.00 per hour.  

 

4046. That the Board accepts the resignation of Angela Carney, Middle School Secretary, effective 

May 10, 2022.   

 

4047. That the Board approves the following staff members’ participation and their compensation 

for Curriculum Revisions due to the implementation of updated New Jersey Student 

Learning Standards for September 2022 from April 27 - June 30, 2022 at the negotiated 

contractual rate of $35.00 per hour. Account 11-000-221-110-001 & 11-000-221-110-002. 

 

Literacy (15 Hours Per Grade) 

Kate Mills - Grade K   Chelsea Foster - Grade 1 

Lauren Ricca - Grade 2  Niki Ikeda & Tiffany Fetter - Grade 3 

Shannon Meyers - Grade 4  Samantha Arauz - Grade 5 

 

Math (15 Hours Per Grade) 

Erika Goldman - Grade K  Nicole Siano - Grade 1 

Jackie Rivera - Grade 2  Niki Ikeda & Tiffany Fetter - Grade 3 

Amber LoCascio - Grade 4  Marianne Ivanicki - Grade 5 

Gabrielle Coco - Grade 6  Kimberly Sherman - Grade 7 

Kathy Kansky - Grade 8 

 

Science (20 Hours Per Grade) 

George Platis & Miranda Black - Grade K Beth Moran & Yezebel Manaloto - Grade 1 

Jackie Rivera & Lauren Ricca - Grade 2 Samantha Avignone & Ginette Domena - Grade 3 

Christina Grimaldi - Grade 4   Marianne Ivanicki & Lauren Kaiser - Grade 5 

Laura Gioia - Grade 6    Kristen Maiello - Grade 7 

Rene Studer-Halbach - Grade 8 

 

Social Studies (20 Hours Per Grade)   

George Platis & Miranda Black - Grade K Colleen Flaherty & Krista Portelli - Grade 1 

Jackie Rivera & Lauren Ricca - Grade 2 Samantha Avignone & Ginette Domena - Grade 3 

John Adranovitz - Grade 4   Samantha Arauz & Lauren Kaiser - Grade 5 

Kevin Cuddihy & Ashley Navalany - Grades 6-8 

 

Specials (20 Hours Per School) 

Andrew Sousa - Spanish Grades 4-8 Andrew Sousa - Spanish Grades K-3 
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Queenie Li - Chinese Grades 4-8  Carol Boehm - Music Grades K-3 

Holcombe Hurd - Music Grades 4-8  Rachel DeBari - Art Grades K-3 

Diana Archila - Art Grades 4-8 

Eric Schwarz - Computer Science and Design Thinking Grades 4-8 

 

Comprehensive Health & Physical Education (30 Hours Per School) 

Mary Pat Buckley & James Reuter - Grades K-3 

Patrick Hanson & Catherine Conte - Grades 4-8 

 

4048. That the Board approves an amendment of Resolution 4224 (Approved at the December 14, 

2021 Board of Education Meeting) for Alicia DeSanto to conduct compensatory Speech 

Language Services to be effective through April 26, 2022 (originally approved through 

January 30, 2022).  

 

4049. That the Board approves Alicia DeSanto to conduct compensatory Speech Language 

services not to exceed 30 total hours at a rate of $35.00 per hour, effective April 26, 2022 

through June 30, 2022. Account # 11-000-221-110-001  

 

4050. That the Board approves the following staff members’ participation and their compensation 

for the Extended School Year Program, effective July 11, 2022 through August 5, 2022, at the 

rate of $26.00 per hour for instructional assistants/bilingual office assistant, at the rate of 

$40.00 per hour for teachers, school counselors and nursing staff and at the rate of $45.00 

per hour for the Program Supervisor. Account #s Teachers/Nurse/Supervisor – 

13-422-100-101-003, IAs – 13-422-100-106-003 and School Counselor (Above negotiated 

rate through ESSER Grant Funds Account # 20-483-200-100-000.) 

 

NAME ASSIGNMENT DAYS/HOURS PER DAY 

Kristen Maiello 
Program Supervisor (80%) - Split with 

Kindergarten Transition Program 
M - F / up to 6.75 hours per day 

Martha Carvajal 
Bilingual Office Support (80%) - Split with 

Kindergarten Transition Program 
M - F / up to 6.75 hours per day 

Cathleen Reardon 
Nurse (80%) - Split with Kindergarten 

Transition Program 
M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

James Reuter Adaptive PE Teacher M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

Katie Latham PSD Teacher M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

Megan McGann MD Teacher M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

Vaanessaa Vazquez Primary LLD Teacher M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

Chelsea Foster Primary LLD Teacher M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

Krista Portelli Primary LLD Teacher M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

Lauren Ricca Primary LLD Teacher M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

Toni Merritt MS LLD/Resource Teacher M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

Carla Decker MS LLD/Resource Teacher M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 
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Kelly Moran MS LLD/Resource Teacher M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

Tiffany Fetter Teacher (Literacy Interventionist) M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

Christopher Murray School Counselor (SEL Services) Not to exceed 110 hours 

Rosalie Trudell School Counselor (SEL Services) Not to exceed 110 hours 

Alexandra Demarest Substitute Teacher/IA M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

John Adranovitz Substitute Teacher/IA M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

Beth Moran Substitute Teacher/IA M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

Ashley Navalany Substitute Teacher/IA M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

Janet Sharkey Substitute Teacher/IA M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

Jeanette Croken Substitute Nurse M - F / up to 5.5 hours per day 

Deborah Rochford Substitute Nurse M - F / up to 5.5 hours per day 

Jessica Jones Instructional Assistant/1:1 M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

Thomas Schroll Instructional Assistant/1:1 M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

Greta Walsh Instructional Assistant/1:1 M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

Caroline Dwyer Instructional Assistant/1:1 M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

Jermaine Johnson Instructional Assistant/1:1 M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

Jennifer Andres Instructional Assistant/1:1 M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

Elizabeth Gonzales Instructional Assistant/1:1 M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

Amy Leonard Instructional Assistant/1:1 M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

Scott McBride Instructional Assistant/1:1 M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

Maria Zuffanti Instructional Assistant/1:1 M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

Paula Collins Instructional Assistant/1:1 M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

Bridget Crudo Instructional Assistant/1:1 M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

Dayna Patterson Instructional Assistant/1:1 M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

Evelyn Rosenberg Instructional Assistant/1:1 M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

Jennifer Silverstein Instructional Assistant/1:1 M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

Megan Welch Instructional Assistant/1:1 M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

Janet Weston Instructional Assistant/1:1 M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

Belem Sanchez 

Oceguera 
Instructional Assistant/1:1 M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

Kristi Mendez Instructional Assistant/1:1 M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

Susan Gilday Instructional Assistant/1:1 M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

TBD Instructional Assistant/1:1 M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 
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TBD Instructional Assistant/1:1 M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

 

4051. That the Board approves all Extended School Year and Kindergarten Transition Summer 

Program staff members’ participation in an orientation session for the program prior to 

June 1, 2022 at the rate of $26.00 per hour for instructional assistants/bilingual office 

assistant, at the rate of $40.00 per hour for teachers, school counselors and nursing staff 

and at the rate of $45.00 per hour for the Program Supervisor. (Above negotiated rate 

through ESSER Grant Funds Account # 20-483-200-100-000.) 

 

POSITION NUMBER OF HOURS 

Program Supervisor 1.5 Hours 

Teachers/Substitutes/Nurse/School Counselors 1.5 Hours 

Bilingual Office Assistant 1.5 Hours 

Instructional Assistants/Classroom Support 30 minutes 

Instructional Assistants/Bus Aides 1 Hour 

 

4052. That the Board approves all Extended School Year Program Teachers and Alexandra 

Demarest a total of 6 hours per person for planning to be completed by June 30, 2022, at 

the rate of $40.00 per hour.  (Above negotiated rate through ESSER Grant Funds Account  

# 20-483-200-100-000.) 

 

4053. That the Board approves all Extended School Year Program certified Instructional 

Assistants as Substitute Teachers for to be compensated at the rate of $40.00 per hour 

on an as needed basis effective July 11, 2022 through August 5, 2022. Account 

#13-422-100-101-003 (Above negotiated rate through ESSER Grant Funds Account #  

20-483-200-100-000.) 

 

4054. That the Board approves the following staff members’ participation and their 

compensation for the Extended School Year Program as Bus Aides, effective July 11, 2022 

through August 5, 2022, at the rate of $18.00 per hour (as needed). Account 

#13-422-200-105-003 and #13-422-200-105-004. 

Thomas Schroll  Jermaine Johnson  Greta Walsh  

Christopher Murray  Caroline Dwyer  Belem Sanchez Oceguera 

JePiera Boykin 

 

 4055. That the Board approves all Extended School Year Program Teachers, Kindergarten 

Transition Summer Program Teachers and Instructional Assistants as Substitute Bus 

Aides to be compensated at the rate of $18.00 per hour on an as needed basis effective 

July 11, 2022 through August 5, 2022. Account #13-422-200-105-003 and  

#13-422-200-105-004. 

 

4056. That the Board approves the per diem rate for the following staff members as related 

services providers for the Extended School Year Program effective July 1, 2022 through 

August 30, 2022. Account #13-422-100-101-003 
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NAME ASSIGNMENT DAYS/HOURS PER DAY 
PER DIEM 

RATE 

Joanne Fiore School Psychologist Not to exceed 20 days (140 hours) $375.25 

Alexa Costantini LDTC Not to Exceed 12 days (84 hours) $365.25 

Josie Katz School Social Worker Not to Exceed 15 days (105 hours) $303.30 

Yadel Sosa-Leonor School Social Worker Not to Exceed 15 days (105 hours) $276.84 

Stephanie Spruce BCBA Not to Exceed 15 days (105 hours) $280.84 

 

4057. That the Board approves the following staff members to provide related services and 

evaluations as needed for the Extended School Year Program at the rate of $75.00 per 

hour, effective July 11, 2022 through August 5, 2022. Account #13- 422-100-101-003, 

ESSER Grant Funds 20-483-200-100-000. 

 

NAME ASSIGNMENT HOURS 

Alicia DeSanto Speech Therapist Not to Exceed 112 Hours 

Meghan Gilly Speech Therapist Not to Exceed 112 Hours 

Danielle Cotta Speech Therapist Not to Exceed 112 Hours 

Caroline McClelland Speech Therapist Not to Exceed 70 Hours 

Trisha Sugrue Occupational Therapist Not to Exceed 112 Hours 

Nancy Bilow Occupational Therapist Not to Exceed 112 Hours 

 

4058. That the Board approves the following staff members’ participation and their 

compensation for the Kindergarten Transition Summer Program, effective July 11, 2022 

through August 5, 2022, at the rate of $26.00 per hour for instructional 

assistants/classroom support/bilingual office assistant, at the rate of $40.00 per hour for 

teachers and nursing staff, and at the rate of $45.00 per hour for Program Supervisor. 

Account #s Teachers-20-218-200-110-P21, Nurse – 20-218-200-104-P21 and IAs – 

20-218-100-106-P21 and ESSER Grant Funds Account # 20-483-200-100-000.  (Above  

negotiated rate through ESSER Grant Funds.) 

 

NAME ASSIGNMENT DAYS/HOURS PER DAY 

Kristen Maiello 
Program Supervisor (20%) Split with 

ESY Program 
M - F / up to 6.75 hours per day 

Martha Carvajal 
Bilingual Office Support (20%) Split 

with ESY Program 
M - F / up to 6.75 hours per day 

Cathleen Reardon Nurse (20%) Split with ESY Program M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

George Platis Teacher M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

Shannon Lonergan Teacher M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 
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Miranda Black Teacher M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

Miranda VanUtrecht Teacher M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

Barbara Scamardella Instructional Assistant M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

JePiera Boykin Classroom Support Personnel M - F / up to 5.25 hours per day 

 

4059. That the Board approves all Extended School Year Program certified Instructional Assistants 

as Substitute Teachers for the Kindergarten Transition Summer Program to be compensated 

at the rate of $40.00 per hour on an as needed basis effective July 11, 2022 through August 

5, 2022. Account #13-422-100-101-003 & 004. (Above negotiated rate through ESSER Grant 

Funds.) 

 

4060. That the Board approves the following staff members for the Kindergarten Transition 

Summer Program development, not to exceed 6 hours each, to be completed by June 30, 

2022, at the rate of $40.00 per hour. Account #13-422-100-101-003. (Above negotiated rate 

through ESSER Grant Funds.) 

 

George Platis  Shannon Lonergan Miranda Black       Miranda VanUtrecht 

 

4061. That the Board accepts the resignation of Kevin Cuddihy, Middle School Social Studies 

Teacher, effective July 1, 2022.  

 

4062. That the Board approves the completion of the Superintendent’s Merit Goal Qualitative #1  

for the 2021-2022 school year.  

 

4063. That the Board approves the following as Guest Teachers for the 2021-2022 school year 

pending a positive criminal history clearance and completion of all personnel paperwork 

and requirements. 

  

  Danielle Totilo  Alexandria Schlaifer 

 

CURRICULUM AND INSTRUCTION 

BE IT RESOLVED by the RED BANK BOROUGH BOARD OF EDUCATION that upon the 

recommendation of the Superintendent, the following CURRICULUM & INSTRUCTION resolution(s) 

are approved as indicated: 

6006. That the Board approves the revised District Calendar for the 2021-2022 school year. 

  

 

6007. That the Red Bank Board of Education deems student participation in curriculum related field 

trips to be educationally beneficial. Pursuant to regulation 6A:23A-5(c)(1), the Board hereby 

approves the resolution. 

 

FUNDING 

SOURCE 
LOCATION 

PTO & Monmouth Museum, Lincroft, NJ (Kindergarten/ 
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CARES/ESSERII Ms. Vazquez & Ms. McGann) 

CARES/ESSERII Count Basie Theater (All Students Grades 4-8) 

Preschool Program Seven Presidents Beach, Long Branch, NJ (UMC) 

RBBEF Sandy Hook Gateway National Park (Grade 1) 

RBBEF & PTO Bayshore Waterfront Park, Port Monmouth, NJ (Grade 2) 

Preschool Program Longstreet Farm, Holmdel, NJ (FBC) 

PTO Sky Zone, Ocean Twp, NJ (Grade 3) 

Preschool Program Longstreet Farm, Holmdel, NJ (YMCA) 

 

BYLAWS, POLICIES, AND REGULATIONS OF THE BOARD – 9000 

BE IT RESOLVED by the RED BANK BOROUGH BOARD OF EDUCATION that upon the 

recommendation of the Superintendent the following BYLAWS OF THE BOARD resolution(s) are 

approved as indicated: 

 

9004. That the Board approves the following policies for second reading and adoption: 

 2415.05 Student Surveys, Analysis, Evaluations, Examinations, Testing, or Treatment 

 2431.4  Prevention and Treatment of Sports-Related Concussions and Head Injuries 

 2622  Student Assessment 

 3233  Political Activities 

 8465  Bias Crimes and Bias-Related Acts 

 9560  Administration of School Surveys 

 

9005. That the Board approves the following regulations for second reading and adoption: 

 2431.4  Prevention and Treatment of Sports-Related Concussions and Head Injuries 

 2622  Student Assessment 

 8465  Bias Crimes and Bias-Related Acts 

 

VOICE VOTE 

AYES: Laura Camargo, Ben Forest, Jennifer Garcia, Dom Kalorin, Erik Perry, Ann Roseman, Dr. 

Frederick Stone, Suzanne Viscomi  

NAYS: None   ABSTENTIONS: None   ABSENT: Pamela McArthur 

 

 

12. HEARING OF THE PUBLIC - NONE 

 

 

13. OLD BUSINESS - NONE 

 

 

14. NEW BUSINESS - NONE 
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15. ADJOURNMENT 

 At 7:30 pm, Dr. Stone motioned, seconded by Ms. Roseman to adjourn. 

 
VOICE VOTE  

AYES: Laura Camargo, Ben Forest, Jennifer Garcia, Dom Kalorin, Erik Perry, Ann Roseman,            

Dr. Frederick Stone, Suzanne Viscomi  

NAYS: None   ABSTENTIONS: None   ABSENT: Pamela McArthur  

 

 

 

Respectfully submitted, 

 

 

 

Eileen Gorga 

School Business Administrator/ 

Board Secretary 
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Dreaming BIGGER 2019-2024 

 

Goal 1: Maximize Student Growth 
Goal 2: Foster A Positive Organizational Culture & Climate 
Goal 3: Resource Management 
Goal 4: Data-Driven Decision Making 
Goal 5: Technology For Personalized Learning 

 

Dream BIG… We’ll Help You Get There! 
 

 
DISTRICT GOALS 

1. We will promote student growth by providing a safe, equitable, and stimulating learning 
environment that offers the proper balance of nurture and academic rigor with particular 
attention to the challenges engendered by the COVID-19 pandemic. 

 
2. Guided by data driven decision-making, we will promote shared leadership and 

instructional practices to ensure seamless transitions from grade to grade, Primary School 
to Middle School, and Red Bank Borough Public Schools to High School. 

 
3. Implement community school elements to promote equity and access that allows all students 

the opportunity to maximize their academic, athletic, artistic, and social potential. 
 

 
BOARD OF EDUCATION GOALS 

1. Advocate for and endorse a single public school district in the Borough of Red Bank. 
 

2. Advocate for full funding for the Red Bank Borough Public Schools District. 
 

3. Monitor the implementation of the Strategic Plan and goals of the Red Bank Borough Public 
School District and its Board of Education. 
 

4. Continue to strengthen engagement in the school community by providing support through 
the COVID-19 health crisis and its aftermath. 

  

https://www.rbb.k12.nj.us/Page/1222
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2022 BOE COMMITTEE SCHEDULE 
 

 
COMMUNITY 
RELATIONS 

CURRICULUM & 
INSTRUCTION POLICY 

FACILITIES & 
SAFETY FINANCE 

CHAIR Jennifer Garcia Ann Roseman Fred Stone Dominic Kalorin Suzanne Viscomi 

MEMBERS 

Jennifer Garcia 
Laura Camargo 

E. Pamela McArthur 
Suzanne Viscomi 

Ann Roseman 
Ben Forest 

Jennifer Garcia 
Fred Stone 

Fred Stone 
Ben Forest 

E. Pamela McArthur 
Erik Perry 

Dominic Kalorin 
Erik Perry 

Fred Stone 

Suzanne Viscomi 
Dominic Kalorin 
Ann Roseman 

Fred Stone 

TIME 7:00 PM 6:00 PM 6:00 PM 9:00 AM 6:30 PM 

LOCATION BOE Office BOE Office BOE Mtg 
Location 

BOE Office BOE Mtg 
Location 

MEETING 
DATES 

No Jan Meeting No Jan Meeting No Jan Meeting No Jan Meeting 01/18/22 

Canceled 02/22/22 Canceled 02/08/22 02/08/22 

03/29/22 Canceled 03/15/22 03/15/22 03/15/22 

No April Meeting 04/12/22 Canceled Canceled Canceled 

05/24/22 05/24/22 Canceled 05/10/22 Canceled 

06/21/22 06/21/22 06/14/22 06/14/22 06/14/22 

No July Meeting No July Meeting No July Meeting No July Meeting No July Meeting 

08/30/22 08/30/22 08/09/22 08/09/22 08/09/22 

09/27/22 09/27/22 09/13/22 09/13/22 09/13/22 

10/25/22 10/25/22 10/11/22 10/11/22 10/11/22 

11/29/22 11/29/22 11/08/22 11/08/22 11/08/22 

12/20/22 12/20/22 12/13/22 12/13/22 12/13/22 
 
Negotiations: Ann Roseman (Chair), Dominic Kalorin, Fred Stone (Meets as Needed) 
 
Residency: Ann Roseman, Fred Stone, Laura Camargo (Meets as Needed) 


