

**San Mateo-Foster City School District**  
RFP# 02-24

**GOLD STAR FOODS**

**DANIELSEN**

Category	Item Description	Reference Pack Size	Estim District Usage	Brand	Vendor #	Manufacturer #	USDA meal pattern contribution per serving (MMA/G/E/V)	Pack Size	Servings/ case	Price per Case	Equivalent cases # if other pack size	Extended Cost \$	Cost/ serving	Brand	Vendor #	Manufacturer #	USDA meal pattern contribution per serving (MMA/G/E/V)	Pack Size	Serving s/ case	Price per Case	Equivalent cases # if other pack size	Extended Cost \$	Cost/ serving	
<b>Category 1</b>	<b>Beverages-Shelf Stable</b>																							
F1-1	Juice, 100% Juice, 4oz (=1/2c red/orange vegetable) shelf stable List available flavors Reference brands: Suncup	40	700	SUNCUP	249261 - SUN SPLASH 240288 - PARADISE PUNCH 249315 - MANGO SPLASH	402700, 402800, 402900	SEE SPECIFICATION	40/4.23OZ	40	249261-\$10.33, 240288-\$10.11, 249315-\$10.11		\$7,077.00	<b>0.2528</b>	Suncup	Multiple	see attached list for flavors		40-4.23 oz	40	\$9.77		\$6,839.00	<b>0.2422</b>	
F1-2	Juice, 100% Juice, 4oz (1/2c fruit) shelf stable assorted flavors List available flavors Reference brands: Sun Cup	40	3,500	SUNCUP	248411 - CRAN RASP 239171 - APPLE 248410 - STRAW KIWI 249239 - FRUIT PUNCH 249257 - GRAPE 249258 - ORANGE TNG 249259 - VERY BERRY	402300, 400305, 402600, 400805, 400505, 402405, 402505	SEE SPECIFICATION	40/4.23OZ	40	\$ 8.480		\$29,680.00	<b>0.2120</b>	Suncup	Multiple	see attached list for flavors		40-4.23 oz	40	<b>\$7.90</b>		\$27,650.00	<b>0.1975</b>	
F1-3	Milk, Shelf Stable lowfat 1% 8oz Reference brand: Challenge Dairy, Gossner, Horizon	27	20	GOSSNER	203000	947130	SEE SPECIFICATION	27/8OZ	27	\$ 14.250		\$285.00	<b>0.5278</b>								No Bid			
F1-4	Milk, Shelf Stable Chocolate Nonfat 8oz Reference brand: Challenge Dairy, Gossner, Horizon	27	40	GOSSNER	203029	950010	SEE SPECIFICATION	27/8OZ	27	\$ 13.890		\$555.60	<b>0.5144</b>								No Bid			
F1-5	Milk, Soy Shelf Stable Organic (nutritional value equivalent to milk) 8oz, Vanilla Reference brand: Pearl	24	15	KIKKOMAN INTERNATIONAL	207889	6184	SEE SPECIFICATION	24/8OZ	24	\$ 20.800		\$312.00	<b>0.8667</b>	Pearl	7553	06184		24-8 oz	24	\$21.08		\$316.20	<b>.8783 Market</b>	
<b>Category 2</b>	<b>Bread Products= All bread products need to be WG Rich</b>																							
F2-1	Biscuit, 2" Honey WW "Heat & Serve", 1G Reference brand: Bridgford	105/1.25 oz	243	BRIDGFORD	133905	6293	SEE SPECIFICATION	105/1.25OZ	105	\$ 18.150		\$4,410.45	<b>0.1729</b>	Bridgford	-----	6293		105-1.25 oz	105	\$16.53		\$4,016.79	<b>.1574 Special Order</b>	
F2-2	Bread, English Muffin Sliced WG bulk 2G Reference brand: Thomas	6/12ct	153	PAPAPITA BAKERY	141316	F5861	SEE SPECIFICATION	144/3.5OZ	144	\$ 24.850		\$3,802.05	<b>0.1726</b>	Shannon's	1042	SB550		144-2 oz	144	\$27.99	77	\$2,141.24	<b>.1943</b>	
F2-3	Concha, WG 2G List assorted Flavors Reference brand: Lupitas	84	306	LUPITAS	133841 - VARIETY PACK 133842 - WHITE 133843 - PINK 133845 - CHOCOLATE 141185 - VARIETY BULK	1450, 1451, 1452, 1454, 1450B	SEE SPECIFICATION	84/2.25OZ	84	\$ 44.940		\$13,751.64	<b>0.5350</b>	Michael B's	Multiple	see attached list for flavors multiple		85-2.25 oz	85	\$48.53	<b>302</b>	\$14,675.47	<b>.5709</b>	
F2-4	Croissant, Sliced All Butter Flavored WG Round 2G, 3.75oz Reference: Bake Crafters, SaraLee, Pillsbury	60	55	BAKE CRAFTERS	TBD	3282	SEE SPECIFICATION	60/3.75OZ	60	\$ 47.560		\$2,615.80	<b>0.7927</b>	Bake Crafters	<b>600194 Margerine NOT AWARDED</b>	869	2G	150-2.2 oz	150	\$59.80	<b>22</b>	\$1,315.60	<b>.3986</b>	
F2-5	Croissant, Sliced All Butter Flavored WG Round 1.8 oz Reference brand: Bake Crafters, SaraLee, Pillsbury	144	130	BAKE CRAFTERS	TBD	783	SEE SPECIFICATION	144/1.8OZ	144	\$ 68.030		\$8,843.90	<b>0.4724</b>	Bake Crafters	600194	869	2G	150-2.2 oz	150	\$59.80	<b>125</b>	\$7,463.04	<b>.3986</b>	
F2-6	Bun, Hamburger, 4" WG, 2G Reference brand: Shannon's, Gold Star	144	200	GOLD STAR FOODS	112952	F2176	SEE SPECIFICATION	144CT	144	\$ 31.530		\$6,306.00	<b>0.2190</b>	Shannon's	5777	SB444		144-1.8 oz	144	\$33.91		\$6,782.00	<b>.2354</b>	
F2-7	Bun, Hamburger, 4" Gluten Free Reference brand: Udi	145	200	UDIS	140159	80644/565421	SEE SPECIFICATION	24/3.2OZ	24	\$ 30.210	<b>1208</b>	\$36,493.68	<b>1.2588</b>	Udi's	1987	80644		24-3.2 oz	24	\$29.66	<b>1208</b>	\$35,839.07	<b>1.2358</b>	
F2-8	Bun, Hotdog, 5" Reference brand: Shannon's, Gold Star	144	660	GOLD STAR FOODS	140052	F349	SEE SPECIFICATION	144CT	144	\$ 31.030		\$20,479.80	<b>0.2155</b>	Shannon's	5813	SB960		192-1.8 oz	192	\$47.93	<b>495</b>	\$23,725.35	<b>.2496</b>	
F2-9	Roll, Hoagie Soft 6" WG 2G Reference brand: Shannon's, Bake Crafter	120	36	GOLD STAR FOODS	112948	F4217	SEE SPECIFICATION	108CT	108	\$ 28.590	<b>40</b>	\$1,143.60	<b>0.2647</b>	Shannon's	6070	SB822		108-2.5 oz	108	\$37.36	<b>40</b>	\$1,494.40	<b>.3459</b>	
F2-10	Texas Toast, Garlic IW, WG, RF 1G Reference brand: Bake Crafters	120	225	BAKE CRAFTERS	134789	1616	SEE SPECIFICATION	120/1.31OZ	120	\$ 64.670		\$14,550.75	<b>0.5389</b>	Bake Crafters	1067	1616	1G	120-1.3 oz	120	\$64.72		\$14,562.00	<b>.5393</b>	
F2-11	Tortillas, Spinach, 10" WG 2G Reference Brand: Mi Rancho, La Tapatia, Aranda	50	90	MI RANCHO	TBD	101184	SEE SPECIFICATION	5/10CT	50	\$ 20.580		\$1,852.20	<b>0.4116</b>	La Tapatia	1334	883602		5-10 ct	50	\$19.21		\$1,728.90	<b>.3842</b>	
F2-12	Tortillas, WG, 10" WG 2G Reference brand: Mi Rancho, La Tapatia, Aranda	120	63	PAPAPITA BAKERY	144580	5582	SEE SPECIFICATION	10/12CT	120	\$ 19.300		\$1,215.90	<b>0.1608</b>	Aranda's	7492	7492		12-10 ct	120	\$23.85		\$1,502.55	<b>.1987</b>	

F2-13	Tortillas, 4.5" WG Reference brand: Mi Rancho, La Tapatia, Aranda	720	70	MI RANCHO	305566	100196	SEE SPECIFICATION	10/60CT	600	\$ 22.810	84	\$1,916.04	0.0380	Aranda's	6233	corn ACT1260		12-60 ct	720	\$31.93		\$2,235.10	0443
<b>Category 3</b>		<b>Cereals</b>																					
F3-1	Cereal, Bowpack, including reduced sugar equals 1G <b>Less than 6g sugar/dry oz</b> List available flavors Reference brand: Kellogg's, General Mills	96	120	KELLOGGS	203224	38000-78786	SEE SPECIFICATION	96/1OZ	96	\$ 32.320		\$3,878.40	0.3367	Malt O Meal	Multiple	see attached list for flavors Multiple		96-1 oz	96	\$20.85		\$2,502.00	2171
F3-2	Cereal, Bowpack, gluten free equals 2G List available flavors Reference brand: Kellogg's, General Mills Post Brands	48	3	GENERAL MILLS	248631 - CINN 251319 - BLUEBERRY 248632 -	14883, 17262, 14882	SEE SPECIFICATION	60/2OZ	60	\$ 32.130	3	\$96.39	0.5355	Malt O Meal	Multiple	see attached list for flavors Multiple		48-2 oz	48	\$20.85		\$62.55	4343
F3-3	Cereal, Bowpack, including reduced sugar & gluten free equals 2G List available flavors Reference brand: Kellogg's, General Mills Post Brands	48	4,090	GENERAL MILLS	248631 - CINN 251319 - BLUEBERRY 248632 - HONEY NUT CHEERIO	14883, 17262, 14882	SEE SPECIFICATION	60/2OZ	60	\$ 32.130	3272	\$105,129.36	0.5355	Malt O Meal	Multiple	see attached list for flavors Multiple		48-2 oz	48	\$20.85		\$85,276.50	4343
F3-4	Granola, Bulk Reference brand: Kellogg, Fieldstone	4/50oz	10	MALT O MEAL	201564	7485	SEE SPECIFICATION	4/50OZ	285	\$ 40.310		\$403.10	0.1414	Malt O Meal	5949	07485	.77 oz=1G	4-50 oz	260	\$41.22		\$412.20	1585
<b>Category 4</b>		<b>Snacks</b>																					
F4-1	Cereal Pieces with Cheddar flavoring, 1W WG 1GB, Smart Snack Compliant Reference brand: Simply Chex Cheddar	60	400	GENERAL MILLS	203130	31932	SEE SPECIFICATION	60/.92OZ	60	\$ 24.640		\$9,856.00	0.4107	General Mills	6258	31932		60-9.2 oz	60	\$24.82		\$9,928.00	4136
F4-2	Chips, Sunchips Harvest Cheddar, 1W 2G Reference brands: Frito-Lay Inc	60	118	SUN CHIPS	200778	44427	SEE SPECIFICATION	64/1.5OZ	64	\$ 36.560	111	\$4,058.16	0.5713	Sunchip	5394	444279		64-1.5 oz	64	\$35.78		\$4,222.04	5590
F4-3	Chips, Tortilla Round, Salted 1W 2G Reference brands: Warnock, La Tapatia, Snak King	80	360/290	LA VENCEDORA	209542	ELR2-150	SEE SPECIFICATION	150/2OZ	150	\$ 33.020	192	\$6,339.84	0.2201	Aranda's	5989	AC1002		100-2 oz	100	\$26.68	232	\$6,189.76	2268
F4-4	Crackers, Wheat 2G 1W WG 2G Back to Basics	100	65	BACK TO BASICS JNS	203356	37401	SEE SPECIFICATION	100/1.6OZ	100	\$ 38.680		\$2,514.20	0.3868							No Bid			
F4-5	Crackers, Cheez-It assorted flavors 1W WG 1G List available flavors	175	120	KELLOGGS	203137	24100-79263	SEE SPECIFICATION	175/.75OZ	175	\$ 40.920		\$4,910.40	0.2338	Cheez-it	6383	79263	1G	175-.75	175	\$41.82		\$5,018.40	2389
F4-6	Graham Crackers 1G Educational 1G Reference: Dick and Jane	120	225	DICK AND JANE	202873	SC8801	SEE SPECIFICATION	120/1OZ	120	\$ 26.700		\$6,007.50	0.2225	Dick & Jane	Multiple	Multiple	1G	120 ct	120	\$27.22		\$6,124.50	2268
F4-7	Graham Crackers, Bear Grahams 2 count WG 1G assorted flavors List available flavors Reference brand: MJM	300	10	MJM MARKETING	203017 - CHOCOLATE BEAR 203018 - APPLE CINN BEAR 203019 - VANILLA BEAR 203020 - STRAWBERRY WAFFLE 203321 - MAPPLE WAFFLE	402001, 403001, 404001, 405001, 408001	SEE SPECIFICATION	300/1OZ	300	\$ 51.140		\$511.40	0.1705	MJM	Multiple	see attached list for flavors Multiple	1G	300 ct	300	\$53.13		\$531.30	1771
F4-8	Honey Graham Crackers, 2 count 1W WG 1G Reference brand: Keebler	150	290	KEEBLER	201272	30100-38406	SEE SPECIFICATION	200/2CT	200	\$ 23.370	218	\$5,094.66	0.1169	Keebler	7,530	91822	1G	150-3 ct	150	\$26.06		\$7,557.40	1737
F4-9	Popcorn, 1oz smart snack, 1G List available flavors Reference: Indiana, Smart Food	48	509	INDIANA	210366	8435710084	SEE SPECIFICATION	48/1OZ	48	\$ 34.380		\$17,499.42	0.7163	Smart Food	6631	309004	white cheddar	72-.5 oz	72	\$27.07	678	\$9,185.66	3759
F4-10	Rice Krispie Treat, WG 0.78oz Reference brand: Kellogg	96	215	KELLOGGS	203316	38000-11052	SEE SPECIFICATION	80/1.41OZ	80	\$ 36.560	258	\$9,432.48	0.4570	Kellogg's	6565	11052		80-1.4 oz	80	\$37.37	258	\$9,641.46	4671
F4-11	Snack Mix 1G (oatmeal squares, pretzels, cheddar cheese popcorn, corn based mini snacks) 0.875oz. Reference: Quaker munchies munch mix	104	20	QUAKER	200728	36308	SEE SPECIFICATION	104/.875OZ	104	\$ 39.990		\$799.80	0.3845	Frito Lay	4847	363082		104 ct	104	\$39.13		\$782.60	3762
<b>Category 5</b>		<b>Dry Goods</b>																					
F5-1	BBQ Sauce, Mild, Bulk Reference Brand: T Marzetti	4/1G	20	MARZETTI COMPANY	TBD	83030	SEE SPECIFICATION	4/1GAL	1024	\$ 43.330		\$866.60	0.0423	Marzetti	1908	83030	servicing size=2 tbsp	4-1 gal	512	\$44.31		886	0865
F5-2	BBQ Sauce, Cups Reference Brand: Heinz, Taste Pleasers	100/1oz	20	TASTE PLEASER GOURMET	201864	7.16037E+12	SEE SPECIFICATION	100/1OZ	100	\$ 14.950		\$299.00	0.1495	Bulls-eye	1806	1958239709 00		100-1 oz	100	\$12.12		\$242.40	1212
F5-3	Chow Mein Noodles, WG Crispy 1W, Noodle Size 1.25"-1.75", 1G Reference Brand: Asian Food Solutions	140/.8 oz	5	ASIAN FOOD SOLUTIONS	208550	79201	SEE SPECIFICATION	140/.8OZ	140	\$ 45.520		\$227.60	0.3251	Asian Foods	-----	79201		140-8 oz	140	\$49.97		\$249.85	3569 Special Order
F5-4	Enchilada Sauce, Red Reference Brand: Las Palmas	6/10#	10	LAS PALMAS	202666	359374/11050	SEE SPECIFICATION	6/#10	288	\$ 37.250		\$372.50	0.1293	Las Palmas	6813	11050	servicing size=2.1 oz	6-#10	288	\$36.68		\$366.80	1273 Market
F5-5	Gravy, Sauce Turkey Reference: Campbell's	12/50 oz.	70	CAMPBELL'S	252596	10061	SEE SPECIFICATION	12/50OZ	288	\$ 44.760		\$3,133.20	0.1554	Campbell's	4702	10061	servicing size- 2.1 oz	12-50 oz	288	\$49.54		\$3,467.80	1720 Market
F5-6	Ketchup, 9 gm Packet Reference brand: Heinz, PPI, Americana, FlavorFresh, Diamond Crystal	1,000 case	520	KRAFT HEINZ FOODS CO	405304	130009848000	SEE SPECIFICATION	1000/9GR	1000	\$ 22.490		\$11,694.80	0.0225	Heinz	6266	1300098480 00		100-9 gm	1,000	\$22.50		\$11,700.00	0225
F5-7	Low Sodium Fruit Seasoning 1W packets Reference Brand: Tajin	1,000	80	TAJIN	209157	28805	SEE SPECIFICATION	1000/.035	1000	\$ 50.980		\$4,078.40	0.0510	Tajin	7206	28805		1000-.035 oz	1000	\$54.44		\$4,355.20	0544 Market
F5-8	Mayonnaise, 1 gallon Reference brand: Kraft	1 gallon	10	MAYONNAISE PREMIUM	248367	GB1030	SEE SPECIFICATION	4/1GAL	1024	\$ 47.610	3	\$142.83	0.0465	Chefs Pride	1537	77041	servicing size=1 tbsp	4-1 gal	1024	\$52.88	3	\$132.20	0516 Market

F5-9	Mayonnaise, 9 gm packet Reference brand PPI, Americana	200 case	65	PORTION PAC	201892	7.16037E+12	SEE SPECIFICATION	200/9GM	200	\$ 13.030		\$846.95	0.0652	PPI	4193	7160372157 000		200-9 gm	200	\$12.33		\$801.45	0.616
F5-10	Mustard, 4.5gm packet Reference brand: PPI, Americana	500 case	30	PORTION PAC	208281	7.16037E+11	SEE SPECIFICATION	500/5.5GM	500	\$ 13.140		\$394.20	0.0263	PPI	4492	7160370539 000		500-5.5 gm	500	\$12.46		\$373.80	0.249
F5-11	Oatmeal, Instant, IW Packets, Assorted Flavors List available Flavors Reference Brand: Quaker, Malt O Meal	48 case	20	QUAKER	202140	43665	SEE SPECIFICATION	48/1.5OZ	48	\$ 18.680		\$373.60	0.3892	Quaker	-----	maple brown sugar 43665		48-1.5 oz	48	\$18.69		\$373.80	9345 Special Order
F5-12	Pasta, Penne Dry Gluten Free Reference: Barilla	8/12oz	5	BARILLA	TBD	11509/630573	SEE SPECIFICATION	8/12OZ	48	\$ 25.830		\$129.15	0.5381	Barilla	-----	11509		8.12 oz	48	\$21.80		\$109.00	4541 Market
F5-13	Pasta, Penne Dry WG Reference: Barilla, Dakota Growers	20#	180	DAKOTA GROWERS	208157	548229/6738792010	SEE SPECIFICATION	2/10LB	320	\$ 23.240		\$4,183.20	0.0726	Barilla	2015	013339		1-20 lb	160	\$33.36		\$6,004.80	2085
F5-14	Pepper, Jalapeño Sliced Reference Brand: Packer	6/#10	3	DEL SOL	209918	DS00115	SEE SPECIFICATION	6/#10	288	\$ 29.390		\$88.17	0.1020	Packer Label	6934	H5572		6-#10	600	\$22.26		\$66.78	1113
F5-15	Pickle, Chips, Dill 1/8" thin crinkle cut, gallons Reference brand: Kruger, Homeade, Ctyfair, Heinz	4/1 gal	10	MRS KLEIN PICKLE	249294	65041	SEE SPECIFICATION	4/1GAL	1024	\$ 24.960		\$249.60	0.0244	Krugar	1615	KR11811		4-1 gal	-----	\$20.75		\$207.50	-----
F5-16	Olives, sliced Reference Brand: Choice, Del Destino	6/#10	2	JACKPOT	209849	OLIVE601	SEE SPECIFICATION	6/#10	288	\$ 47.640		\$95.28	0.1654	Ambrosia	2730	16914		6-#10	-----	\$43.12		\$86.24	-----
F5-17	Pineapple Chunks, Grade B in Juice USA Made Reference brand: Dole	6/#10	40	DOLE	248708	3890000468	SEE SPECIFICATION	6/#10	288	\$ 59.060		\$2,362.40	0.2051	Ambrosia	4912	19063		6-#10	127	\$38.89		\$1,555.60	3062
F5-18	Ranch Dressing, Ranch, 12 gm . equal or less than 7g fat per packet, not Fat Free Reference: Americana	200/case	300	PORTION PAC	201896	7.16037E+12	SEE SPECIFICATION	200/12GM	200	\$ 11.420		\$3,426.00	0.0571	PPI	4,497	not light or fat free 228100		200-12 gm	200	\$11.18		\$3,354.00	0.559
F5-19	Salad Dressing, Italian 12 gm packet equal or less than 7g fat per packet, not Fat Free Reference brand: PPI, Americana	200 case	50	FOUR IN ONE	TBD	1229	SEE SPECIFICATION	200/12GM	200	\$ 10.940		\$547.00	0.0547									No Bid	
F5-20	Cesar Dressing Reduced Fat Packet-1.5oz equal or less 13g fat (not fat free) Reference brand: Cardini's, T. Marzetti	60/1.5oz	152	MARZETTI COMPANY	209550	6025	SEE SPECIFICATION	60/1.5OZ	60	\$ 17.310		\$2,631.12	0.2885	Cardini's	1352	not light or fat free 06025		60-1.5 oz	60	\$17.320		\$2,632.64	2886
F5-21	Chipotle Ranch Dressing Reduced Fat Packet-1.5oz equal or less 13g fat (not fat free) Reference: Marzetti	60/1.5oz	36	MARZETTI COMPANY	208262	81299	SEE SPECIFICATION	60/1.5OZ	60	\$ 18.250		\$657.00	0.3042	Marzetti	7,578	no light or fat free 81299		60-1.5 oz	60	\$18.26		\$657.36	3043
F5-22	Ranch Dressing Reduced Fat Packet-1.5oz equal or less 13g fat (not fat free) Reference: Ken's	60/1.5oz	36	KENS FOODS	248719	KE0708A5	SEE SPECIFICATION	100/1.5OZ	100	\$ 27.210		\$979.56	0.2721	Marzetti	5,476	81978		60-1.5 oz	60	\$13.36		\$480.96	2226
F5-23	Salad Dressing, Asian Sesame, 60/1.5oz Reference: Ken's	60/1.5oz	20	MARZETTI COMPANY	201602	81290	SEE SPECIFICATION	60/1.5OZ	60	\$ 16.940		\$338.80	0.2823	Marzetti	5,469	81290		60-1.5 oz	60	\$16.95		\$339.00	2825
F5-24	Teriyaki Sauce, Reference: Nippon	6/4.9	228	NIPPON SHOKKEN	239365	3	SEE SPECIFICATION	6/4.9LB	744	\$ 43.020		\$9,808.56	0.0578	Nippon Shokken	7,167	0003		6-4.9#	-----	\$41.28		\$9,411.84	-----
<b>Category 6</b>	<b>Dairy Products</b>																						
F6-1	Cheese, Parmesan Shredded Reference brand: Arezzio, Messana, Rumiano	10# bag	50	LAND O LAKES	305433	356398/41750	SEE SPECIFICATION	6/2LB	181	\$ 59.650	42	\$2,505.30	0.3296	Lakeview	6510	605345		4-5 lb		\$68.60	25	\$1,715.00	-----
F6-2	Cream Cheese, Cup Plain 1 oz. Reference brand: Philadelphia, Raskas, Smithfield, Hahn, BBRLIMP	100 case	670	GREEN MOUNTAIN	300211	FG83405	SEE SPECIFICATION	100/1OZ	100	\$ 21.680		\$14,525.60	0.2168	Raskas	600314	13278		100-1 oz	100	\$21.93		\$14,693.10	2193 Market
F6-3	Yogurt, Tube Strawberry, 1M Reference brand: Yoplait	96 case	280	YOPLAIT	305575	49295	SEE SPECIFICATION	96/2OZ	96	\$ 32.460		\$9,088.80	0.3381	Yoplait	1953	49295		96-2 oz	96	\$30.70		\$8,596.00	3197
<b>Category 7</b>	<b>Lunch: Center of the Plate</b>																						
F7-1	Burger, Vegetarian , 2M/MA Reference brand: Morning Star	48 case	700	MORNINGSTAR	101426	381627/97712	SEE SPECIFICATION	48/3.5OZ	48	\$ 68.880		\$48,216.00	1.4350	Morningstar Farms	1890	10409	M/MA=2	48-2.5 oz	48	\$31.97		\$22,379.00	6660
F7-2	Dumplings, Chicken and Vegetarian, 2MMA/1G WG Reference brand: Schwan's	8/2.5lb case	490	SCHWANS FOOD SERVICE INC	141458	60585	SEE SPECIFICATION	8/2.5LB	8	\$ 61.150		\$29,963.50	7.6438	Schwan's	1995	60585	M/MA=2 2G	384-836 oz	64	\$60.53		\$29,659.70	9457
F7-3	Hot dog, Chicken or Beef 6", 2MMA Reference brand: Foster Farms, Millers	80 svgs	340	HOFFY	TBD	1222	SEE SPECIFICATION	2/5LB	50	\$ 14.550	544	\$7,915.20	0.2910	Miller's	3348	5268		80-2 oz	80	\$38.10		\$12,954.00	4762 Market
F7-4	Vegan Nuggets 2M reference brand: Rebellious Foods	50 svgs	570	REBELLIOUS	143995	KNFC212	SEE SPECIFICATION	2/5LB	106	\$ 43.920		\$25,034.40	0.4143	Rebellious	1854	KNFC212	M/MA=2	265-6 oz	53	\$42.50		\$24,225.00	8018
F7-5	Noodles, Chow Mein, Frozen WG Vegetarian, Pre-cooked Reference brand: AMOY, Ling's, Chef's Corner, Fortune	20#	50	CHEFS CORNER	134302	OFC-2192	SEE SPECIFICATION	6/5LB	918	\$ 68.010	33	\$2,244.33	2.2670	Yang's	6131	003016		14 lb	80	\$32.90	71	\$2,349.71	2,3500
F7-6	Pupusas, Cheese, Bulk 1MMA/2G Reference brand: Del Real	40	140	DEL REAL	305360	702	SEE SPECIFICATION	40/5.3OZ	40	\$ 46.950		\$6,573.00	1.1738	Del Real	-----	702		40-5.3 oz	40	\$47.62		\$6,666.80	1,1905 Special Order
F7-7	Rice, Vegetable Fried frozen WG Reference brand: Minh	6/5#	836	MINH	134447	69074	SEE SPECIFICATION	6/5# BAGS	168	\$ 52.830		\$44,165.88	0.3145	Minh	1037	69074	servicing size=5.9 oz	6-5.16 lb	167	\$51.75	836	\$43,263.00	3098
F7-8	Sandwich, Turkey and Cheese, Wedge, IW 2MMA/2G Reference brand: Tasty Brands	72	40	TASTY BRANDS	406082	70019	SEE SPECIFICATION	72/4.4OZ	72	\$ 86.550		\$3,462.00	1.2021	Tasty Brands	-----	70019	M/MA=2 2G	72-4.4 oz	72	\$85.61		\$3,424.40	1,1890 Special Order
Added	Egg Patties, Scrambled 3" Reference Brand: Michael Foods	120/1.5oz	184	Michael Foods		14616-70202-00		120/1.5oz	120	\$ 35.330		\$6,500.72	0.2944									No Bid	
F7-9	Sandwich, Soy Butter & Jelly IW 2M/2G Reference brand: Albie's	40 case	760	ALBIES FOODS	134543	607 1G NOT AWARDED	SEE SPECIFICATION	72/2.4OZ	72	\$ 60.100	423	\$25,422.30	0.8347	Albie's	7401	608	M/MA=2 2G	40-4.6 oz	40	\$47.80		\$36,328.00	1,1950
F7-10	Tamale, Chicken and Cheese, Bulk 2MMA/2G Reference Brand: Del Real	48	435	DEL REAL	138,967	783	SEE SPECIFICATION	48/6OZ	48	\$ 60.000		\$2,617.80	1.0994	Michael B's	-----	TAC32	M/MA=2 2G	75-5.5 oz	72	\$88.11	290	\$25,551.90	1,2237 Special
Added	Tamale, Chicken and Cheese, Bulk 2MMA/2G RED Sauce Reference Brand: Del Real	48	435	DEL REAL		767		48/5oz	48	\$ 52.770		\$22,954.95	1.0994	DEL REAL		767		48/5oz	48	\$52.86		\$25,551.90	1,1013
Added	Corn Dog LF Chicken WG IW Reference: Foster Farms	96/4oz	206	Foster Farms		94124		96/4oz	96	66.05		13606.3	0.6880	Foster Farms		94124		96/4oz	96	\$64.61		\$13,309.66	0.6730
<b>Category 8</b>	<b>Assorted Frozen &amp; Refrigerated Items</b>																						

F8-1	Ranch Dressing, Buttermilk Ranch Reference: T Marzetti	4/1gal	12	MARZETTI COMPANY	209561	80060	SEE SPECIFICATION	4/1GAL	1024	\$ 56.980		\$683.76	0.0556	Marzetti	7044	80060		4-1 gal	-----	\$57.61		\$691.32	-----
F8-2	Cesar Dressing, Bulk Reference brand: Cardini's, T. Marzetti	4/1gal	12	MARZETTI COMPANY	TBD	6007	SEE SPECIFICATION	4/1GAL	1024	\$ 68.420		\$821.04	0.0668	Marzetti	7031	80508		4-1 gal	-----	\$68.66		\$823.92	-----
F8-3	Egg Patties, Scrambled 3.5" Reference Brand: Papetti's	120/1.5oz	184	MICHAEL FOODS	406921	14616-70202-00	SEE SPECIFICATION	120/1.5OZ	120	\$ 35.310		\$6,497.04	0.2943	Papetti's	600292	30020		120-1.5 oz	120	\$34.65		\$6,375.60	2887 Market
<b>Category 10 Breakfast: Center of the plate</b>																							
F10-1	Bagel, Plain Frozen IW, WG Sliced 2G, Ovenable packaging List available flavors Reference brand: Tony Roberts	72 case	960	TONY ROBERTS	102558	19232	SEE SPECIFICATION	72/2.24OZ	72	\$ 26.450		\$25,392.00	0.3674	Western Bagel	7326	unsure about packaging 68874	2G	72-2.24 oz	72	\$22.10		\$21,216.00	3069
F10-2	Bread Slices, Banana, IW WG 2G, 4oz List available flavors Reference brand: Integrated	54	544	INTEGRATED	134413	GS9104	SEE SPECIFICATION	54/4OZ	54	\$ 55.020		\$29,930.88	1.0189	Integrated	-----	G59104	2G	54-4 oz	54	\$55.06		\$29,952.64	1,0196 Special order
F10-3	Breakfast Bar, Mini Twin Pack IW 2G Reference brand: Sky Blue Bakery	80 case	145	DAVES	133889	WG1001	SEE SPECIFICATION	72/2.65OZ	72	36.56	161	5886.16	0.5078	DAVES	133889	WG1001	2G	72/2.65OZ	72	\$34.92	161	\$5,622.12	0.485
F10-4	Breakfast Bars assorted flavors 2G List available flavors Reference brand: J & J, Benefit	48 case	2,542	J & J SNACK FOODS	113232 - OAT/CHOC 113235 - BAN/CHOC 134612 - FRENCH TOAST 113234 - APP/CINN 113233 - OAT/RSN 139395 - COCO CHIP	40401, 40402, 40404, 40403, 40400, 40406	SEE SPECIFICATION	48/2.5OZ	48			\$47,916.70	0.3927	J&J Benefit	Multiple	see attached list for flavors Multiple	2G	48.2.5 oz	48	\$19.11		\$48,577.62	3981
F10-5	French Toast Sticks (not mini), WG IW, 2 Sticks=2G Reference brand: Bake Crafters	88 case	135	BAKE CRAFTERS	113685	449	SEE SPECIFICATION	88/3OZ	88	\$ 58.470		\$7,893.45	0.6644	Bake Crafters	1715	449	2G	88-3 oz	88	\$59.16		\$7,986.60	6722
F10-6	Muffin, Blueberry, IW 3oz, 2G Reference brand: Elsas	60	255	ELSA'S BAKING COMPANY	113695	EB002	SEE SPECIFICATION	60/3.00OZ	60	\$ 41.300		\$10,531.50	0.6883	Dave's	6033	WG829	2G	60-3.15 oz	60	\$35.86		\$9,144.30	5976
F10-7	Muffin, Chocolate Chocolate Chip IW WG 2G Reference brand: Dave's Baking Co	60	255	DAVES	113419	WG825	SEE SPECIFICATION	60/3.15OZ	60	\$ 37.520		\$9,567.60	0.6253	Dave's	6037	WG845	2G	60-3.15 oz	60	\$35.86		\$9,144.30	.5976
F10-8	Pancake, Mini, Confetti flavored, IW Reference brand: Eggo	72	165	EGGO	140972	38000-18574	SEE SPECIFICATION	72/3.03OZ	72	\$ 34.360		\$5,669.40	0.4772	Eggo	7508	18574	2G	72-3.03 oz	72	\$34.00		\$5,610.00	4722
Replaced	<del>Roll, Cinnamon, IW WG, 2G Reference Brand: Sky Blue</del>	60	255	<del>SKY-BLUE FOODS</del>	<del>134675</del>	<del>SWB5175</del>	<del>SEE SPECIFICATION</del>	<del>75/2.25OZ</del>	<del>75</del>	<del>38</del>	<del>204</del>	<del>7,776</del>	<del>1</del>	<del>Super Bakery</del>	<del>7458</del>	<del>6070</del>	2G	<del>72-2.9 oz</del>	72	<del>\$36.06</del>	243	<del>\$7,662.75</del>	<del>5008</del>
ADDED	Rolls Mini Cinnis, IW, WG, 2G Reference: Pillsbury	72	219	Pillsbury		33686	2G	72/2.9oz	72	\$ 35.260		\$7,721.94	0.4897	Pillsbury		33686	2G	72/2.9oz	72	\$37.54		\$8,221.26	0.5214
F10-10	Toaster Pastry, 2 Count IW, assorted flavors, Smart Snack Compliant 2.5 GRAIN List available flavors Reference Brand: Kellogg's	72 case	40	KELLOGGS	201218, 201242, 201244, 201250	38000-19721, 38000-31032, 38000-31132, 38000-31832	SEE SPECIFICATION	72/2CT	72	\$ 38.260		\$1,530.40	0.5314	Kellogg's	Multiple	Multiple	2.5G	72-3.53 oz	72	\$41.12		\$1,644.80	5711
ADDED	Raspberry Breakfast Squares IW	60	330	20th Century		772a731W		60	60	\$ 38.320		\$12,645.60	0.6387									No Bid	
ADDED	Lemon Breakfast Squares IW	60	100	20th Century		772a732W		60	60	\$ 38.320		\$3,832.00	0.6387									No Bid	
F10-11	Waffle, Dutch WG 2G Reference brand: J&J Snack Foods	48	40	J & J SNACK FOODS	134761	4521	SEE SPECIFICATION	48/2.9OZ	48	\$ 28.200		\$1,128.00	0.5875	J&J	7034	4521	2G	48ct	48	\$25.68		\$1,027.20	5350
F10-12	Waffle, Belgium Vanilla IW Reference: Marson	72	165	MARSON FOODS	141476	S722VA	SEE SPECIFICATION	72/2.3OZ	72	\$ 35.560		\$5,867.40	0.4939									No Bid	
F10-13	Waffle, Maple mini, IW Reference: Eggo	72	165	EGGO	134285	38000-92315	SEE SPECIFICATION	72/2.65OZ	72	\$ 35.160		\$5,801.40	0.4883	Eggo	6394	92315	2G	72-2.65oz	72	\$34.63		\$5,713.95	4809
												<b>\$381,665.20</b>											
												<b>\$411,893.87</b>											

San Mateo-Foster City School District			IFS										P&R										GOLDSTAR										DANIELSEN									
RFP# 02-24			Reference Pack Size	Estim District Usage	Brand	Vendor #	Manufacturer #	Pack Size	Price per Case	Equivalent cases if other pack size	Extended Cost \$	Cost/unit	Brand	Vendor #	Manufacturer #	Pack Size	Price per Case	Equivalent cases if other pack size	Extended Cost \$	Cost/unit	Brand	Vendor #	Manufacturer #	Pack Size	Price per Case	Equivalent cases if other pack size	Extended Cost \$	Cost/unit	Brand	Vendor #	Manufacturer #	Pack Size	Price per Case	Equivalent cases if other pack size	Extended Cost \$	Cost/unit						
Category	Item Description	Quantity	Unit	Brand	Vendor #	Manufacturer #	Pack Size	Price per Case	Equivalent cases if other pack size	Extended Cost \$	Cost/unit	Brand	Vendor #	Manufacturer #	Pack Size	Price per Case	Equivalent cases if other pack size	Extended Cost \$	Cost/unit	Brand	Vendor #	Manufacturer #	Pack Size	Price per Case	Equivalent cases if other pack size	Extended Cost \$	Cost/unit	Brand	Vendor #	Manufacturer #	Pack Size	Price per Case	Equivalent cases if other pack size	Extended Cost \$	Cost/unit							
P1-1	Container, White Double Poly Paper Hot Food Container - 8 oz., Combo w/Lid Reference brand: Cheit	250 case	10	POKER	15-6984	15-9884	250	\$ 48.35	250	\$ 12,087.50	\$ 48.35	NO BID																														
P1-2	Cup, Paper Cold Drinking up Toz. Wax Reference brand: A&M #27000	2500 case	25	AMM	47-560	02CA01200040	800	\$ 46.88	65	\$ 2,449.20	\$ 37.82	NO BID																														
P1-3	Cup, Paper Cold Drinking up to 8oz. Reference brand: PaperDirect	800 case	20	AMM	47-560	02CA01200040	800	\$ 46.88	65	\$ 2,449.20	\$ 37.82	NO BID																														
P1-4	Napkins, Paper, Embossed, Brown # X 13 1/2" Rectycked paper Reference brand: James River #314 2 3/8" NAT, Tork Hygienic Paper Liner, 18" x 24"	10,000 case	10	PERVIA	10890	3930	4000	\$ 28.33	17	\$ 581.61	\$ 34.53	NO BID																														
P1-5	Reference brand: PaperDirect Patterson	1,000 case	20	PERVIA	10890	3930	4000	\$ 28.33	17	\$ 581.61	\$ 34.53	NO BID																														
P1-6	Brack Bag, Small Brown Paper #6 Reference brand: Packex P568	1,000 case	10	DAVID	88	8856	100	\$ 13.67	20	\$ 273.40	\$ 13.67	NO BID																														
P1-7	Tray, Food, #300 2.58 Red Plastic Reference brand: Southern Chemco, Hultamaki	2,020 case	200	SDP	30441	8763	100	\$ 23.17	5	\$ 4,637.47	\$ 23.17	NO BID																														
P1-8	Tray, Nested Paper Locked Corner, Printed Design 7" x 8.5" x 2" Reference brand: Golden State Golden West, La Plata Rock	900 case	3000	SDP	3038	7385	100	\$ 23.00	9	\$ 207.00	\$ 23.00	NO BID																														
P1-9	Tray, Paper Brown, 1 compartment shallow, overtable 6.825" x 5.125" x 1.58" Reference brand: Pressed Paperboard (PT108), Pacvic, Paper Tech, ParPack, PRW-PC5615	900 case	220	FACTV	PC5615	PC5615	900	\$ 49.99	396	\$ 19,796.74	\$ 49.99	NO BID																														
P1-10	Tray, Paper Brown, 2 compartment, overtable 6.825" x 5.125" x 1.582" Reference brand: Pressed Paperboard (PT400)	700 case	70	PAKER TECH	PT400	PT400	700	\$ 111.32	5	\$ 8,392.56	\$ 111.32	NO BID																														
P1-11	Wrap, Wax Paper, 1200' x 10" x 18"	12,000 case	30	PERVIA	20448	20448	4000	\$ 73.94	5	\$ 2,200.33	\$ 73.94	NO BID																														
P2-1	Bag, Sun Pan 27 x 37" Reference brand: Handbags	200 case	10	ELWAY	80972700	80972700	200	\$ 23.87	5	\$ 1,193.50	\$ 23.87	NO BID																														
P2-2	Bag, Utility Bag on a Roll, 18" x 24" Reference brand: Elway	1,000 case	20	ELWAY	80182400	80182400	250	\$ 9.38	5	\$ 387.50	\$ 9.38	NO BID																														
P2-3	Bag, White T-Shirt Bag Reference brand: COB-12722-14	1,000 case	10	NOBIS	2328	2328	1000	\$ 49.99	1	\$ 49.99	\$ 49.99	NO BID																														
P2-4	Container, Clear 1 Compartment 12oz, 8" x 8" Hinged Reference brand: Botix Box	250 case	40	DIRECT PACK	8N-88-88C	8N-88-88-CL	250	\$ 76.66	5	\$ 3,066.24	\$ 76.66	NO BID																														
P2-5	Container, Clear 1 Compartment 12oz, Del Hinged Reference brand: Clear 12oz	250 case	40	DIRECT PACK	8N-88-88C	8N-88-88-CL	250	\$ 76.66	5	\$ 3,066.24	\$ 76.66	NO BID																														
P2-6	Cup, Plastic Clear 12oz Reference brand: Clear 12oz, Sub TP12	1,000 case	15	ITS	15-4235	15-4235	1000	\$ 23.00	50	\$ 1,150.00	\$ 23.00	NO BID																														
P2-7	Cup, Plastic Clear portion 2oz Reference brand: Clear 2oz, Sub TP12	2,500 case	20	ITS	15-4235	15-4235	1000	\$ 23.00	50	\$ 1,150.00	\$ 23.00	NO BID																														
P2-8	Cup, Plastic Clear portion 4oz Reference brand: Clear 4oz, Sub TP12	2,500 case	20	ITS	15-4235	15-4235	1000	\$ 23.00	50	\$ 1,150.00	\$ 23.00	NO BID																														
P2-9	Cup, Polypropylene, Bulk, medium weight 16oz	1,000 case	20	NOBIS	2328	2328	1000	\$ 49.99	1	\$ 49.99	\$ 49.99	NO BID																														
P2-10	Film, PVC, Nonperforated 18" x 2,000' Roll Reference brand: AEP 384 VAP, VAP, VAP or equal	Roll	5	REYNOL	10388	10388	1	\$ 1,660	5	\$ 8,300.00	\$ 1,660	NO BID																														
P2-11	Film, PVC, Perforated 18" x 1,000' Roll Reference brand: Anchor II IS	Roll	5	REYNOL	10388	10388	1	\$ 1,660	5	\$ 8,300.00	\$ 1,660	NO BID																														
P2-12	Lid, Plastic Flat No Top (Hole 1/2" plastic clear cup above P2-1)	1,000 case	14	AMM	4-26275-9H	4-26275-9H	1000	\$ 21.66	5	\$ 108.30	\$ 21.66	NO BID																														
P2-13	Lid, Plastic Flat No Top (Hole 1/2" cup above P2-1)	2,500 case	20	ITS	15-4235	15-4235	1000	\$ 23.00	50	\$ 1,150.00	\$ 23.00	NO BID																														
P2-14	Lid, Plastic Flat No Top (Hole 1/2" cup above P2-1)	2,500 case	20	ITS	15-4235	15-4235	1000	\$ 23.00	50	\$ 1,150.00	\$ 23.00	NO BID																														
P2-15	Tray, Plastic, Clear, One Compartment 12 MIL Approximately 5 1/2" x 6 1/2" x 1 1/8"	1,000 case	65	DI	02561	02561	1000	\$ 18.51	5	\$ 925.50	\$ 18.51	NO BID																														
P2-16	Tray, Plastic, Clear, Two Compartment Deep 12 MIL Approximately 6 1/2" x 7 1/2" x 1 1/8"	1,000 case	47	DART	15073	15073	1000	\$ 19.00	5	\$ 950.00	\$ 19.00	NO BID																														
P2-17	Tray, Plastic, Clear, Two Compartment Deep 12 MIL Approximately 6 1/2" x 7 1/2" x 1 1/8"	1,000 case	47	DART	15073	15073	1000	\$ 19.00	5	\$ 950.00	\$ 19.00	NO BID																														
P3-1	Foil, Aluminum Shred Machine Popping 10 3/4" x 12" Reference brand: Wilfron 300, Alan, #1505, Each 3000	6,000 case	5	POKER	15721	15721	1000	\$ 45.83	5	\$ 274.95	\$ 45.83	NO BID																														
P3-2	Foil, Aluminum Roll 18" x 1000'	1 each	10	PERVIA	15-18000A	15-18000A	1	\$ 41.33	5	\$ 206.65	\$ 41.33	NO BID																														
P3-3	Foil, Aluminum Roll 24" x 2000'	1 each	10	POKER	4002	4002	1	\$ 7.89	20	\$ 157.80	\$ 7.89	NO BID																														
P3-4	Foil, Sandwich Bags, Plain Print 8x7 1/2x5.5 Reference brand: Bag Craft #15085	1,000 case	30	ASCANT	1056	1056	1000	\$ 49.00	5	\$ 245.00	\$ 49.00	NO BID																														
P3-5	Foil, Sandwich Bags, Plain Print 8x7 1/2x5.5 Reference brand: Brown Paper Frisco	1,000 case	30	BROWN PFG	1624	1624	1000	\$ 49.00	5	\$ 245.00	\$ 49.00	NO BID																														
P3-6	Foil, Sandwich Bags, Hamburger Print 8x7 1/2x5.5 Reference brand: Brown Paper Frisco	1,000 case	30	ASCANT	1056	1056	1000	\$ 49.00	5	\$ 245.00	\$ 49.00	NO BID																														
P3-7	Foil, Foil Wrap, Red Checked Print 10 1/2" x 14" Reference brand: Brown Paper Frisco	4,500 case	30	ASCANT	1064	1064	1000	\$ 30.44	5	\$ 1,369.50	\$ 30.44	NO BID																														
P3-8	Foil, Foil Wrap, Blue Design Print 10 1/2" x 14" Reference brand: Brown Paper Frisco	4,500 case	30	ASCANT	1064	1064	1000	\$ 30.44	5	\$ 1,369.50	\$ 30.44	NO BID																														
P3-9	Tray, Aluminum Foil Feeding Hot Dog, 30 Gauge, 2 Compartment, Shallow, Approximately 6 1/2" x 7 1/2" x 1 1/2", Capacity Pl. oz.: 7.95 G Reference brand: HFA-4100-30	1,000 case	100	HA	4100-30	4100-30	1000	\$ 141.25	5	\$ 7,062.50	\$ 141.25	NO BID																														
P4-1	Apron, Plastic, White with Tie, Disposable, 30" x 28" 0.084" thickness Reference brand: Norwesco, Norwesco, Each 100	1,000 case	5	HW	6527	2885-CASE	100	\$ 29.48	10	\$ 294.78	\$ 29.48	NO BID																														
P4-2	Glove, Disposable Vinyl powder free, 5-MIL thickness, Food Grade List available sizes Reference brand: Paper	10,000 case	45	NOBIS	6522	6522	1000	\$ 14.66	5	\$ 73.30	\$ 14.66	NO BID																														
P4-3	Mask, String 26" Black or Brown Reference brand: CEL-49504-26	10744 case	5	SMITH	10744	10744	1000	\$ 29.30	5	\$ 146.50	\$ 29.30	NO BID																														
P4-4	Open Mitts, Extra Heavy Duty Lined, 17" Reference brand: IMPACT, Connect One	1 each	15	WINCO	1888	086-17	1	\$ 2.33	5	\$ 11.65	\$ 2.33	NO BID																														
P4-5	Tap, Packaging Seal Clean 3ML, 241 1/2yd/Roll Reference brand: 30 Bags	36 rolls/case	5																																							