

**San Mateo-Foster City SD**

**RFP No. 01-23**

**Proposal Worksheet**

Award

**Instructions: Indicate Delivered Cost per case in yellow highlighted columns for each item or group. Indicate whether item meets Buy American Provision in marked columns.**

					Processed USDA Foods			Processed USDA Foods		
						Net Off Invoice	Fee for Service		Net Off Invoice	Fee for Service
					DANIELSEN			GOLDSTAR		
Manufacturer	Item Description	Commodity Item Manufacturer Code	Pack	Estimated Quantity	Value Pass Through (VPT) Method	Delivered Cost Per Case	Delivered Cost Per Case	Value Pass Through (VPT) Method	Delivered Cost Per Case	Delivered Cost Per Case
Super Co-Op Items					Net Off Invoice/ Fee for Service/ Rebate			Net Off Invoice/ Fee for Service/ Rebate		
Tyson	Bosco Breaded Cheese Sticks	1.70201E+11	144	414	fee for service		\$37.90	NOI	\$41.25	
Tyson	Chicken Meatballs (3pc per serving)	10197770328	160 ct	560	fee for service		\$26.19	NOI	\$28.20	
Don Lee Farms	BBQ Beef Rib Shaped Patty	CNQ512403	72	20	fee for service		\$49.62	NOI	\$67.22	
Tyson	Ball Park Loaded Cheeseburger Mini Twin Sandwich IW	10000055325	80	415	fee for service		\$73.19	NOI	\$82.00	
Bake Crafters	Rich, WG, Grilled Cheese, American & Mozzarella, LS, IW 108	6676	108	175	indirect discount	\$107.48		NOI	\$112.39	
Jennie-O Turkey Store Sales, LLC	Pre-Cooked Turkey Bacon (1 oz MT/MT ALT)	271106	12/50 ct	38			No Bid	NOI	\$97.79	
Jennie-O Turkey Store Sales, LLC	Patty Turkey Sausage FC	613203	160/1.02oz	138			No Bid	NOI	\$33.17	
JTM Provisions Company Inc.	Reduced Fat Alfredo Sauce	5722	6/5 LB	180			No Bid	NOI	\$63.00	
JTM Provisions Company Inc.	Whole Grain Rich Rotini w/ Italian Meat Sauce	CP5591	6/5 LB	495			No Bid	NOI	\$58.26	
JTM Provisions Company Inc.	Signature Macaroni and Cheese with Whole Grain 6/5# pouch	5758	6/5 LB	504			No Bid	NOI	\$56.53	
Land O Lakes	Cheddar Cheese, mild, shredded 4/5# bags	41749	4/5 LB	20			No Bid	NOI	\$23.28	
Land O Lakes	Mozzarella String Cheese, light, LMPS 168/1 oz.	59703	168	20			No Bid	NOI	\$21.69	
M.C.I. Foods, Inc. (Los Cabos)	BEAN, CHEDDAR CHEESE BUR IW 2/2	97576	96	90			No Bid	NOI	\$70.87	
MICHAEL B'S FOOD PRODUCTS	CHILE CHEESE FLAQUITO IW	FT020	80	10	indirect discount	\$96.60		NOI	\$88.96	
MICHAEL B'S FOOD PRODUCTS	Turkey Pastrami & Cheese Hoagie	BTC449	60/4.5oz	20	indirect discount	\$80.59		NOI	82.41	
MICHAEL B'S FOOD PRODUCTS	Beef & Cheese Chimichanga Foil Wrapped	TB614	80/5.16oz	10			No Bid	NOI	\$96.91	
Del Real	CHICKEN & CHEESE TAMALE	767	48	94			No Bid	COMMERCIAL ONLY		
Red Gold, LLC	Dipping Cups (Made with Sugar/ Enhanced Low Sodium) 16	REDNA2ZC168	168	135			No Bid	NOI	\$59.36	
Red Gold, LLC	Marinara Sauce	RPKNA99	6/10#	5			No Bid	NOI	\$39.24	

Manufacturer	Item Description	Commodity Item Manufacturer Code	Pack	Estimated Quantity	Value Pass Through (VPT) Method	Delivered Cost Per Case	Delivered Cost Per Case	Value Pass Through (VPT) Method	Delivered Cost Per Case	Delivered Cost Per Case
Red Gold, LLC	Nutritionally Enhanced Low Sodium Salsa	REDESC99	6/10#	10			No Bid	NOI	\$40.38	
Red Gold, LLC	Salsa Dipping Cups (Made with Sugar/ Enhanced Low Sodium) 168 / 3 oz Cups	REDESC2ZC168	168	70			No Bid	NOI	\$72.85	
Gold Kist	CN FC WG BRD CHICKEN Bites	7518	128/3.75oz svg/30lb	360			No Bid	NOI	\$87.26	
Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	BD 16" PRIMO PB CHS	68591	72	190	indirect discount	\$46.91		NOI	\$47.75	
Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	BD 16" PRIMO PB PEPP	68592	72	304	indirect discount	\$51.75		NOI	\$52.34	
Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	TN GLXY WG CHS 100% IW	78366	72	1330	indirect discount	\$44.14		NOI	\$45.11	
Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	BD Beef Pepperoni Pizza Pockets	55293	48	591	indirect discount	\$35.08		NOI	\$35.76	
<del>20th Century</del>	<del>Raspberry Breakfast Squares IW</del>	<del>772a731W</del>	<del>60</del>	<del>330</del>			No Bid	COMMERCIAL ONLY		
<del>20th Century</del>	<del>Lemon Breakfast Squares IW</del>	<del>772a732W</del>	<del>60</del>	<del>100</del>			No Bid	COMMERCIAL ONLY		
Bake Crafters	White Garlic Pizza Square 11x17 , 8cut	3699	72	100	indirect discount		No Bid	NOI	\$59.07	
Butterball	Turkey Medallions	89209	133 svgs	30			No Bid	NOI	\$89.09	
Tyson	Breaded Crispy Patties WG	10703040928	175	138	fee for service		\$61.73	NOI	\$67.39	
Tyson	ole Grain Kripsy N Krunchy Breaded Strip-Shaped Chicken Pat	003859-0928	4/8 LB	20	fee for service		\$58.44	NOI	\$63.87	
Tyson	FC CN Whole Grain Breaded Chicken Pattie Hot n Spicy	10703140928	175/3.0 oz	200	fee for service	175-3 oz	\$61.76	NOI	\$67.19	
McCain	Seasoned Homestyle Mash Makers	OIF03613	6/4lbs	315	indirect discount	\$29.62		NOI	\$32.18	
McCain	Crispy Bakeable Crinkle Fries	1000007470	6/5lbs	500	indirect discount	\$42.27		NOI	\$44.80	
McCain	Seasoned Thin Cut Fries 5/16"	MCX03610	6/5lbs	100	indirect discount	\$30.76		NOI	\$32.63	
McCain	Tater Tots Reduced Sodium	1000002789	6/5lbs	40	indirect discount	\$43.86		NOI	\$46.42	
<del>Foster Farms</del>	<del>Corn Dog LF Chicken WG IW</del>	<del>94124</del>	<del>96/4oz</del>	<del>206</del>			No Bid	COMMERCIAL ONLY		
Peterson Farms	Strawberry Banana Unsweetened Applesauce	ASA10015	96/4.5oz	480			No Bid	NOI	\$20.42	
<del>International Food Solutions</del>	<del>Chow Mein noodle with Vegetables</del>	<del>22101WG</del>	<del>6/5.8lbs</del>	<del>20</del>			No Bid	COMMERCIAL ONLY		
Integrated Food Service	Beef Taco Stick	C45019	50/4.6oz	594	net of invoice	\$40.42		FFS		\$40.85
Integrated Food Service	Spicy Grilled Cheese	704001	72/4.9oz	30	net of invoice	\$57.76		NOI	\$61.40	
Integrated Food Service	Three Cheese Corn Enchilada Bulk	809040	120/2.05oz	275	net of invoice	\$45.06		NOI	\$48.43	
MICHAEL B'S FOOD PRODUCTS	Egg Patty Patty Scrambled 3"	14616-70202-00	120/1.5oz	184	indirect discount		No Bid	COMMERCIAL ONLY		