

**ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS**

**Bid: IFB No. 23-59 Smart Board Installation at Four High Schools**

**Due: Thursday, June 8, 2023**

**Time: 2:00 pm (6th FL Conference Rm)**

<b>Vendor Name</b>	<b>Total Bid - All 4 Schools</b>	<b>Base Bid - Auburn</b>	<b>Base Bid - East</b>	<b>Base Bid - Guilford</b>	<b>Base Bid - Jefferson</b>	<b>Addendums Received*</b>	<b>Bid Bond Received*</b>	<b>Required Documentation</b>
Virtucom	\$26,320.00	\$4,512.00	\$3,760.00	\$9,776.00	\$8,252.00	Y	Y	Y
Amoserv	\$15,200.00	\$2,400.00	\$3,600.00	\$5,200.00	\$4,000.00	Y	Y	Y
AVI Systems	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Y	Y	Y

Bid Opening Official:

Dane Youngblood

Bid Recording Official:

Casey Ramas

\_\_\_\_\_

\_\_\_\_\_

**\*If Applicable**

**ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS**

**Bid: IFB No. 23-59 Smart Board Installation at Four High Schools**

**Due: Thursday, June 8, 2023**

**Time: 2:00 pm (6th FL Conference Rm)**

Vendor Name	Alt. No. A-1	Constance Lane	Cherry Valley	Eisenhower	Marshall M.S.	Washington	Unit Price No. 1	Addendums Received*	Bid Bond Received*	Required Documentation
Virtucom	\$156,416.00	\$21,808.00	\$22,560.00	\$42,864.00	\$23,312.00	\$22,560.00	\$752.00			
Amoserv	\$104,000.00	\$14,500.00	\$15,000.00	\$28,500.00	\$15,500.00	\$15,000.00	\$500.00			
AVI Systems	\$72,839.53	\$11,876.81	\$12,286.36	\$23,694.09	\$12,695.91	\$12,286.36	\$409.55			

Bid Opening Official: Dane Youngblood

Bid Recording Official: Casey Ramas

\_\_\_\_\_  
 \_\_\_\_\_

\*If Applicable