Bid Tabulation Sheet
Bid 4901- Bid Open

Roofing at various Sites

Golden Oak Pinkham Divisadero Veva Blunt
Contractor
Midstate Sheetmetal Inc. 221,269.00 217,426.00 179,700.00 86,350.00
J.F. George Enterprises Inc. 220,000.00 210,000.00 NO BID NO BID
Nations Roof 398,850.00 369,400.00 189,000.00 104,000.00
Best Contracting Services 324,350.00 318,725.00 286,350.00 138,755.00
Fresno Roofing NO BID NO BID 184,600.00 99,400.00




