



Board Meeting of May 2, 2023
 Bid # 23-100 Portable Building Relocation and Related Services District-Wide

1	COST TO MOVE, SINGLE PORTABLE, WITHIN CAMPUS. SIZE 24' X UP TO 40'.						
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price			
	Valdez Brother's House Movers	1	EA	\$2,000.00		1st vendor of choice	
	betancourt bros house movers leveling	1	EA	\$2,500.00		2nd vendor of choice	
2	COST TO MOVE, SINGLE PORTABLE, ACROSS THE DISTRICT. SIZE 24' X UP TO 40'.						
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price			
	Valdez Brother's House Movers	1	EA	\$3,500.00		1st vendor of choice	
	betancourt bros house movers leveling	1	EA	\$4,500.00		2nd vendor of choice	
3	COST TO MOVE, DOUBLE PORTABLE, WITHIN CAMPUS. SIZE 24' W X 40' -60' L.						
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price			
	Valdez Brother's House Movers	1	EA	\$4,100.00		1st vendor of choice	
	betancourt bros house movers leveling	1	EA	\$4,500.00		2nd vendor of choice	
4	COST TO MOVE, DOUBLE PORTABLE, ACROSS THE DISTRICT. SIZE 24'W X 40' -60' L.						
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price			
	Valdez Brother's House Movers	1	EA	\$5,500.00		1st vendor of choice	
	betancourt bros house movers leveling	1	EA	\$6,000.00		2nd vendor of choice	
5	COST TO MOVE PORTABLE, WITHIN CAMPUS BIGGER THAN 60'						
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price			
	betancourt bros house movers leveling	1	EA	No Bid			
	Valdez Brother's House Movers	1	EA	No Bid			
6	COST TO MOVE, PORTABLE ACROSS THE DISTRICT BIGGER THAN 60'.						
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price			
	betancourt bros house movers leveling	1	EA	No Bid			
	Valdez Brother's House Movers	1	EA	No Bid			
7	COST TO MOVE, MODULAR METAL BLDG, WITHIN THE CAMPUS.						
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price			
	Valdez Brother's House Movers	1	EA	\$4,800.00		1st vendor of choice	
	betancourt bros house movers leveling	1	EA	\$5,000.00		2nd vendor of choice	
8	COST TO MOVE, MODULAR METAL BLDG, ACROSS THE DISTRICT.						
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price			
	Valdez Brother's House Movers	1	EA	\$6,500.00		1st vendor of choice	
	betancourt bros house movers leveling	1	EA	\$7,000.00		2nd vendor of choice	



Board Meeting of May 2, 2023
 Bid # 23-100 Portable Building Relocation and Related Services District-Wide

9	COST TO ANCHOR, MODULAR METAL BLDG WITHIN CAMPUS.								
	Supplier		QTY	UOM	Price				
	Valdez Brother's House Movers		1	EA	\$70.00				1st vendor of choice
	betancourt bros house movers leveling		1	EA	\$80.00				2nd vendor of choice
10	COST TO MOVE, BARRACKS TYPE PORTABLE BLDG.								
	Supplier		QTY	UOM	Price				
	betancourt bros house movers leveling		1	EA	No Bid				
	Valdez Brother's House Movers		1	EA	No Bid				
11	COST TO CUT, BARRACKS TYPE PORTABLE BLDG IN SECTIONS.								
	Supplier		QTY	UOM	Price				
	betancourt bros house movers leveling		1	EA	No Bid				
	Valdez Brother's House Movers		1	EA	No Bid				
12	COST FOR LEVELING PORTABLE, SINGLE SIZE 24' X UP TO 40'.								
	Supplier		QTY	UOM	Price				
	Valdez Brother's House Movers		1	EA	\$1,500.00				1st vendor of choice
	betancourt bros house movers leveling		1	EA	\$3,500.00				2nd vendor of choice
13	COST FOR LEVELING PORTABLES, DOUBLE SIZE 24' W X 40' - 60' L.								
	Supplier		QTY	UOM	Price				
	Valdez Brother's House Movers		1	EA	\$3,000.00				1st vendor of choice
	betancourt bros house movers leveling		1	EA	\$5,000.00				2nd vendor of choice
14	COST FOR LEVELING PORTABLES, SIZE BIGGER THAN 60'								
	Supplier		QTY	UOM	Price				
	betancourt bros house movers leveling		1	EA	No Bid				
	Valdez Brother's House Movers		1	EA	\$4,500.00				Recommended
15	COST FOR LEVELING PORTABLES, STORAGE CONTAINER.								
	Supplier		QTY	UOM	Price				
	betancourt bros house movers leveling		1	EA	\$200.00				1st vendor of choice
	Valdez Brother's House Movers		1	EA	\$600.00				2nd vendor of choice
16	PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT FOR OTHER RELATED SERVICES								
	Supplier		QTY	UOM	Price				
	betancourt bros house movers leveling		1	EA	.0.0%				Recommended
	Valdez Brother's House Movers		1	EA	No Bid				