

	Unit Cost	Quantity	Extended		Unit Cost	Quantity	Extended		Unit Cost	Quantity	Extended		Unit Cost	Quantity	Extended
Gopher Mods				iDoc Device Repair				iFixYouri				iResQ* (minimum price - some may be more)			
Diagnostics (Chromebook)	\$0.00	280	\$0.00	Diagnostics (Chromebook)	\$0.00	280	\$0.00	Diagnostics (Chromebook)	\$0.00	280	\$0.00	Diagnostics (Chromebook)	\$0.00	280	\$0.00
Camera (Chromebook)	\$29.00	2	\$58.00	Camera (Chromebook)	\$32.00	2	\$64.00	Camera (Chromebook)	\$19.99	2	\$39.98	Camera (Chromebook)	\$29.00	2	\$58.00
Motherboard (Chromebook)	\$159.00	1	\$159.00	Motherboard (Chromebook)	\$189.00	1	\$189.00	Motherboard (Chromebook)	\$69.99	1	\$69.99	Motherboard (Chromebook)	\$149.00	1	\$149.00
LCD Back Cover (Chromebook)	\$55.00	1	\$55.00	LCD Back Cover (Chromebook)	\$55.00	1	\$55.00	LCD Back Cover (Chromebook)	\$69.99	1	\$69.99	LCD Back Cover (Chromebook)	\$69.00	1	\$69.00
Touchscreen (Chromebook)	\$139.00	81	\$11,259.00	Touchscreen (Chromebook)	\$165.00	81	\$13,365.00	Touchscreen (Chromebook)	\$159.99	81	\$12,959.19	Touchscreen (Chromebook)	\$179.00	81	\$14,499.00
Bottom Cover (Chromebook)	\$59.00	11	\$649.00	Bottom Cover (Chromebook)	\$30.00	11	\$330.00	Bottom Cover (Chromebook)	\$69.99	11	\$769.89	Bottom Cover (Chromebook)	\$49.00	11	\$539.00
Palmmrest/Keyboard (Chromebook)	\$59.00	49	\$2,891.00	Palmmrest/Keyboard (Chromebook)	\$80.00	49	\$3,920.00	Palmmrest/Keyboard (Chromebook)	\$79.99	49	\$3,919.51	Palmmrest/Keyboard (Chromebook)	\$39.00	49	\$4,851.00
Spine Cover (Chromebook)	\$19.00	12	\$228.00	Spine Cover (Chromebook)	\$18.00	12	\$216.00	Spine Cover (Chromebook)	\$34.99	12	\$419.88	Spine Cover (Chromebook)	\$29.00	12	\$348.00
Hinge (chromebook)	\$49.00	46	\$2,254.00	Hinge (chromebook)	\$38.00	46	\$1,748.00	Hinge (chromebook)	\$49.99	46	\$2,299.54	Hinge (chromebook)	\$29.00	46	\$1,334.00
Battery (Chromebook)	\$59.00	7	\$413.00	Battery (Chromebook)	\$64.00	7	\$448.00	Battery (Chromebook)	\$69.99	7	\$489.93	Battery (Chromebook)	\$69.00	7	\$483.00
Touchpad (Chromebook)	\$39.00	3	\$117.00	Touchpad (Chromebook)	\$35.00	3	\$105.00	Touchpad (Chromebook)	\$59.99	3	\$179.97	Touchpad (Chromebook)	\$69.00	3	\$207.00
Power/USB Daughterboard (Chromebook)	\$39.00	7	\$273.00	Power/USB Daughterboard (Chromebook)	\$49.00	7	\$343.00	Power/USB Daughterboard (Chromebook)	\$69.99	7	\$489.93	Power/USB Daughterboard (Chromebook)	\$49.00	7	\$343.00
<b>Total (Chromebook)</b>			<b>\$18,360.00</b>	<b>Total (Chromebook)</b>			<b>\$20,783.00</b>	<b>Total (Chromebook)</b>			<b>\$21,707.80</b>	<b>Total (Chromebook)</b>			<b>\$22,880.00</b>
Diagnostics (iPad)	\$0.00	1	\$0.00	Diagnostics (iPad)	\$0.00	1	\$0.00	Diagnostics (iPad)	\$0.00	1	\$0.00	Diagnostics (iPad)	\$0.00	1	\$0.00
Glass/Digitizer (iPad)	\$79.00	4	\$316.00	Glass/Digitizer (iPad)	\$54.00	4	\$216.00	Glass/Digitizer (iPad)	\$59.99	4	\$239.96	Glass/Digitizer (iPad)	\$79.00	4	\$316.00
LCD (iPad)	\$109.00	1	\$109.00	LCD (iPad)	\$90.00	1	\$90.00	LCD (iPad)	\$99.99	1	\$99.99	LCD (iPad)	\$99.00	1	\$99.00
Frame/Housing (iPad)	\$79.00	1	\$79.00	Frame/Housing (iPad)	\$100.00	1	\$100.00	Frame/Housing (iPad)	\$19.99	1	\$19.99	Frame/Housing (iPad)	\$189.00	1	\$189.00
Battery (iPad)	\$59.00	1	\$59.00	Battery (iPad)	\$36.00	1	\$36.00	Battery (iPad)	\$59.99	1	\$59.99	Battery (iPad)	\$79.00	1	\$79.00
Logic Board (iPad)	\$119.00	1	\$119.00	No Bid			\$0.00	Logic Board (iPad)	\$69.99	1	\$69.99	Logic Board (iPad)	\$119.00	1	\$119.00
Charging Port (iPad)	\$79.00	1	\$79.00	Charging Port (iPad)	\$6.00	1	\$6.00	Charging Port (iPad)	\$19.99	1	\$19.99	Charging Port (iPad)	\$39.00	1	\$39.00
Front/Back Camera (iPad)	\$59.00	1	\$59.00	Front/Back Camera (iPad)	\$6.00	1	\$6.00	Front/Back Camera (iPad)	\$19.99	1	\$19.99	Front/Back Camera (iPad)	\$29.00	1	\$29.00
Headphone Jack (iPad)	\$0.00	3	\$0.00	Headphone Jack (iPad)	\$18.00	3	\$54.00	Headphone Jack (iPad)	\$89.99	3	\$269.97	Headphone Jack (iPad)	\$29.00	3	\$87.00
Buttons/Toqgles/Speakers (iPad)	\$0.00	1	\$0.00	Buttons/Toqgles/Speakers (iPad)	\$6.00	1	\$6.00	Buttons/Toqgles/Speakers (iPad)	\$0.00	1	\$0.00	Buttons/Toqgles/Speakers (iPad)	\$29.00	1	\$29.00
<b>Total (iPad)</b>			<b>\$820.00</b>	<b>Total (iPad)</b>			<b>\$478.00</b>	<b>Total (iPad)</b>			<b>\$619.87</b>	<b>Total (iPad)</b>			<b>\$986.00</b>
Windows Laptops & Other Devices	\$39.00	3	\$117.00	Windows Laptops & Other Devices	\$20.00	3	\$60.00	Windows Laptops & Other Devices	\$30.00	3	\$90.00	Windows Laptops & Other Devices	\$42.50	3	\$127.50
<b>Grand Total</b>			<b>\$19,297.00</b>	<b>Grand Total</b>			<b>\$21,321.00</b>	<b>Grand Total</b>			<b>\$22,417.67</b>	<b>Grand Total</b>			<b>\$23,993.50</b>
	Unit Cost	Quantity	Extended		Unit Cost	Quantity	Extended		Unit Cost	Quantity	Extended		Unit Cost	Quantity	Extended
Lenovo* (minimum price - some may be more)				Ubreakifix				Upper Edge Technologies				Virtucom* (minimum price - some may be more)			
Diagnostics (Chromebook)	\$20.00	280	\$5,600.00	Diagnostics (Chromebook)	\$0.00	280	\$0.00	Diagnostics (Chromebook)	\$55.00	280	\$15,400.00	Diagnostics (Chromebook)	\$18.00	280	\$5,040.00
Camera (Chromebook)	\$69.00	2	\$138.00	Camera (Chromebook)	\$50.00	2	\$100.00	Camera (Chromebook)	\$19.95	2	\$39.90	Camera (Chromebook)	\$58.95	2	\$117.90
Motherboard (Chromebook)	\$170.00	1	\$170.00	Motherboard (Chromebook)	\$200.00	1	\$200.00	Motherboard (Chromebook)	\$159.95	1	\$159.95	Motherboard (Chromebook)	\$235.95	1	\$235.95
LCD Back Cover (Chromebook)	\$65.00	1	\$65.00	LCD Back Cover (Chromebook)	\$70.00	1	\$70.00	LCD Back Cover (Chromebook)	\$24.95	1	\$24.95	LCD Back Cover (Chromebook)	\$94.95	1	\$94.95
Touchscreen (Chromebook)	\$110.00	81	\$8,910.00	Touchscreen (Chromebook)	\$140.00	81	\$11,340.00	Touchscreen (Chromebook)	\$159.95	81	\$12,955.95	Touchscreen (Chromebook)	\$240.95	81	\$19,516.95
Bottom Cover (Chromebook)	\$63.00	11	\$693.00	Bottom Cover (Chromebook)	\$50.00	11	\$550.00	Bottom Cover (Chromebook)	\$14.95	11	\$164.45	Bottom Cover (Chromebook)	\$62.95	11	\$692.45
Palmmrest/Keyboard (Chromebook)	\$87.00	49	\$4,263.00	Palmmrest/Keyboard (Chromebook)	\$110.00	49	\$5,390.00	Palmmrest/Keyboard (Chromebook)	\$35.95	49	\$1,761.55	Palmmrest/Keyboard (Chromebook)	\$120.95	49	\$5,925.55
Spine Cover (Chromebook)	\$53.00	12	\$636.00	Spine Cover (Chromebook)	\$15.00	12	\$180.00	Spine Cover (Chromebook)	\$14.95	12	\$179.40	Spine Cover (Chromebook)	\$68.95	12	\$827.40
Hinge (chromebook)	\$63.00	46	\$2,898.00	Hinge (chromebook)	\$50.00	46	\$2,300.00	Hinge (chromebook)	\$14.95	46	\$687.70	Hinge (chromebook)	\$71.95	46	\$3,309.70
Battery (Chromebook)	\$92.00	7	\$644.00	Battery (Chromebook)	\$80.00	7	\$560.00	Battery (Chromebook)	\$24.95	7	\$174.65	Battery (Chromebook)	\$104.95	7	\$734.65
Touchpad (Chromebook)	\$61.00	3	\$183.00	Touchpad (Chromebook)	\$40.00	3	\$120.00	Touchpad (Chromebook)	\$14.95	3	\$44.85	Touchpad (Chromebook)	\$120.95	3	\$362.85
Power/USB Daughterboard (Chromebook)	\$80.00	7	\$560.00	Power/USB Daughterboard (Chromebook)	\$75.00	7	\$525.00	Power/USB Daughterboard (Chromebook)	\$16.95	7	\$118.65	Power/USB Daughterboard (Chromebook)	\$69.95	7	\$489.65
<b>Total (Chromebook)</b>			<b>\$24,760.00</b>	<b>Total (Chromebook)</b>			<b>\$21,335.00</b>	<b>Total (Chromebook)</b>			<b>\$31,712.00</b>	<b>Total (Chromebook)</b>			<b>\$37,339.00</b>
Diagnostics (iPad)	\$0.00	1	\$0.00	Diagnostics (iPad)	\$0.00	1	\$0.00	Diagnostics (iPad)	\$55.00	1	\$55.00	Diagnostics (iPad)	No Bid	1	No Bid
Glass/Digitizer (iPad)	\$75.00	4	\$300.00	Glass/Digitizer (iPad)	\$80.00	4	\$320.00	Glass/Digitizer (iPad)	\$99.95	4	\$399.80	Glass/Digitizer (iPad)	No Bid	4	No Bid
LCD (iPad)	\$125.00	1	\$125.00	LCD (iPad)	\$130.00	1	\$130.00	LCD (iPad)	\$225.95	1	\$225.95	LCD (iPad)	No Bid	1	No Bid
Frame/Housing (iPad)	\$25.00	1	\$25.00	Frame/Housing (iPad)	\$150.00	1	\$150.00	Frame/Housing (iPad)	\$35.95	1	\$35.95	Frame/Housing (iPad)	No Bid	1	No Bid
Battery (iPad)	\$75.00	1	\$75.00	Battery (iPad)	\$90.00	1	\$90.00	Battery (iPad)	\$55.95	1	\$55.95	Battery (iPad)	No Bid	1	No Bid
Logic Board (iPad)	\$125.00	1	\$125.00	Logic Board (iPad)	\$150.00	1	\$150.00	Logic Board (iPad)	\$225.95	1	\$225.95	Logic Board (iPad)	No Bid	1	No Bid
Charging Port (iPad)	\$75.00	1	\$75.00	Charging Port (iPad)	\$70.00	1	\$70.00	Charging Port (iPad)	\$19.95	1	\$19.95	Charging Port (iPad)	No Bid	1	No Bid
Front/Back Camera (iPad)	\$55.00	1	\$55.00	Front/Back Camera (iPad)	\$60.00	1	\$60.00	Front/Back Camera (iPad)	\$29.95	1	\$29.95	Front/Back Camera (iPad)	No Bid	1	No Bid
Headphone Jack (iPad)	\$55.00	3	\$165.00	Headphone Jack (iPad)	\$60.00	3	\$180.00	Headphone Jack (iPad)	\$19.95	3	\$59.85	Headphone Jack (iPad)	No Bid	3	No Bid
Buttons/Toqgles/Speakers (iPad)	\$55.00	1	\$55.00	Buttons/Toqgles/Speakers (iPad)	\$60.00	1	\$60.00	Buttons/Toqgles/Speakers (iPad)	\$19.95	1	\$19.95	Buttons/Toqgles/Speakers (iPad)	No Bid	1	No Bid
<b>Total (iPad)</b>			<b>\$1,000.00</b>	<b>Total (iPad)</b>			<b>\$1,210.00</b>	<b>Total (iPad)</b>			<b>\$1,128.30</b>	<b>Total (iPad)</b>			<b>No Bid</b>
Windows Laptops & Other Devices	\$50.00	3	\$150.00	Windows Laptops & Other Devices	\$40.00	3	\$120.00	Windows Laptops & Other Devices	\$55.00	3	\$165.00	Windows Laptops & Other Devices	\$58.00	3	\$174.00
<b>Grand Total</b>			<b>\$25,910.00</b>	<b>Grand Total</b>			<b>\$22,665.00</b>	<b>Grand Total</b>			<b>\$33,005.30</b>	<b>Grand Total</b>			<b>\$37,513.00</b>