Middletown Township Board of Education

Tabulation of Bid #2022-2023-1T

Finance-1

BUS COMPANIES ROUTE# ROUTE COST TOTALCOST | | INCREASE/ PER DIEM AIDE | TOTAL COST IS AIDE
WITHOUT AIDE  DECREASE cosT INCLUDING REQUIRED?
page-1 ADJUSTMENT COST AIDE IF REQUIRED
HELFRICH HSN-1 NO
SHAMROCK HSN-1 NO
LOORI HSN-1 NO
SEMAN-TOV HSN-1 300.00 300.00 0.01 100.00 300.00 NO
JAY'S BUS HSN-1 198.00 198.00 0.01 100.00 198.00 AWARD
GARAS TRANS HSN-1 750.00 750.00 2.00 100.00 750.00 NO |
D.AG. HSN-1 NO
HELFRICH HSN-2 NO
SHAMROCK HSN-2 275.00 275.00 1.25 60.00 275.00 NO
LOORI HSN-2 NO
SEMAN-TOV HSN-2 300.00 300.00 0.01 100.00 300.00 NO |
JAY'S BUS HSN-2 198.00 198.00 0.01 100.00 198.00 AWARD
GARAS TRANS HSN-2 730.00 730.00 2.00 100.00 730.00 NO |
D.AG. HSN-2 NO
HELFRICH HSN-4 NO
SHAMROCK HSN-4 187.00 187.00 1.25 60.00 187.00 AWARD |
LOORI HSN-4 NO |
SEMAN-TOV HSN-4 300.00 300.00 0.01 100.00 300.00 NO
JAY'S BUS HSN-4 298.00 298.00 0.01 100.00 298.00 NO
GARAS TRANS HSN-4 780.00 780.00 2.00 100.00 780.00 NO
D.AG. HSN-4 NO
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HELFRICH HSN-6 NO
SHAMROCK HSN-6 NO
LOORI HSN-6 252.00 252.00 1.00 80.00 252.00 NO
SEMAN-TOV HSN-6 201.00 201.00 0.01 100.00 201.00 AWARD |
JAY'S BUS HSN-6 298.00 298.00 0.00 100.00 298.00 NO .
GARAS TRANS HSN-6 NO
D.A.G. HSN-6 NO
HELFRICH HSN-7 NO
SHAMROCK HSN-7 NO
LOORI HSN-7 NO
SEMAN-TOV HSN-7 300.00 300.00 0.01 100.00 300.00 NO |
JAY'S BUS HSN-7 198.00 198.00 0.01 100.00 198.00 AWARD
GARAS TRANS HSN-7 NO .
D.A.G. HSN-7 NO
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HELFRICH HSN-8 NO
SHAMROCK HSN-8 NO
LOORI HSN-8 NO
SEMAN-TOV HSN-8 NO
JAY'S BUS HSN-8 198.00 198.00 0.01 100.00 198.00 AWARD
GARAS TRANS HSN-8 NO |
D.AG. HSN-8 NO
HELFRICH HSN-9 NO
SHAMROCK HSN-9 NO
LOORI HSN-9 NO
SEMAN-TOV HSN-9 NO
JAY'S BUS HSN-9 198.00 198.00 0.01 100.00 198.00 AWARD |
GARAS TRANS HSN-9 NO |
D.AG. HSN-9 NO
HELFRICH HSN-10 NO
SHAMROCK HSN-10 187.00 187.00 1.25 60.00 187.00 AWARD |
LOORI HSN-10 NO |
SEMAN-TOV HSN-10 NO
JAY'S BUS HSN-10 300.00 300.00 0.01 100.00 300.00 NO
GARAS TRANS HSN-10 NO
D.AG. HSN-10 NO
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HELFRICH HSN-13 NO
SHAMROCK HSN-13 NO
LOORI HSN-13 NO
SEMAN-TOV HSN-13 192.00 192.00 0.01 100.00 192.00 AWARD |
JAY'S BUS HSN-13 275.00 275.00 0.01 100.00 275.00 NO |
GARAS TRANS HSN-13 NO
D.AG. HSN-13 NO
HELFRICH HSN-15 NO
SHAMROCK HSN-15 NO
LOORI HSN-15 NO
SEMAN-TOV HSN-15 192.00 192.00 0.01 100.00 192.00 AWARD |
JAY'S BUS HSN-15 275.00 275.00 0.01 100.00 275.00 NO |
GARAS TRANS HSN-15 NO
D.AG. HSN-15 NO
HELFRICH HSS-1 NO
SHAMROCK HSS-1 187.00 187.00 1.25 60.00 187.00 AWARD |
LOORI HSS-1 NO |
SEMAN-TOV HSS-1 NO

JAY'S BUS HSS-1 350.00 350.00 0.01 100.00 350.00 NO
GARAS TRANS HSS-1 NO
D.AG. HSS-1 NO
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HELFRICH HSS-3 NO
SHAMROCK HSS-3 187.00 187.00 1.25 60.00 187.00 AWARD |
LOORI HSS-3 NO |
SEMAN-TOV HSS-3 NO
JAY'S BUS HSS-3 285.00 285.00 0.01 100.00 285.00 NO
GARAS TRANS HSS-3 NO
D.AG. HSS-3 NO
HELFRICH HSS-4 NO
SHAMROCK HSS-4 NO
LOORI HSS-4 194.49 194.49 1.00 80.00 19449 AWARD |
SEMAN-TOV HSS-4 NO |
JAY'S BUS HSS-4 290.00 290.00 0.01 100.00 290.00 NO
GARAS TRANS HSS-4 NO
D.AG. HSS-4 NO
HELFRICH HSS-5
SHAMROCK HSS-5 NO
LOORI HSS-5 NO
SEMAN-TOV HSS-5 NO |
JAY'S BUS HSS-5 198.00 198.00 0.01 100.00 198.00 AWARD
GARAS TRANS HSS-5 NO |
D.AG. HSS-5 NO

NO
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HELFRICH HSS-6 NO
SHAMROCK HSS-6 187.00 187.00 1.25 60.00 187.00 AWARD |
LOORI HSS-6 NO |
SEMAN-TOV HSS-6 NO
JAY'S BUS HSS-6 289.00 289.00 0.01 100.00 289.00 NO
GARAS TRANS HSS-6 NO
D.AG. HSS-6 NO
HELFRICH HSS-7 197.00 197.00 1.00 80.00 197.00 AWARD |
SHAMROCK HSS-7 NO |
LOORI HSS-7 NO
SEMAN-TOV HSS-7 NO
JAY'S BUS HSS-7 289.00 289.00 0.01 100.00 289.00 NO
GARAS TRANS HSS-7 NO
D.AG. HSS-7 NO
HELFRICH HSS-9 NO
SHAMROCK HSS-9 NO
LOORI HSS-9 NO
SEMAN-TOV HSS-9 300.00 300.00 0.01 100.00 300.00 NO |
JAY'S BUS HSS-9 198.00 198.00 0.01 100.00 198.00 AWARD
GARAS TRANS HSS-9 NO |
D.AG. HSS-9 NO




Middletown Township Board of Education

Tabulation of Bid #2022-2023-1T

Finance-1

BUS COMPANIES ROUTE# ROUTE COST TOTALCOST | | INCREASE/ PER DIEM AIDE | TOTAL COST IS AIDE
page 7 WITHOUT AIDE  DECREASE cosT INCLUDING REQUIRED?
ADJUSTMENT COST AIDE IF REQUIRED
HELFRICH HSS-10 NO
SHAMROCK HSS-10 275.00 275.00 1.25 60.00 275.00 NO
LOORI HSS-10 NO
SEMAN-TOV HSS-10 300.00 300.00 0.01 100.00 300.00 NO
JAY'S BUS HSS-10 198.00 198.00 0.01 100.00 198.00 AWARD
GARAS TRANS HSS-10 NO |
D.AG. HSS-10 NO
HELFRICH HSS-11 NO
SHAMROCK HSS-11 NO
LOORI HSS-11 NO
SEMAN-TOV HSS-11 NO
JAY'S BUS HSS-11 198.00 198.00 0.01 100.00 198.00 AWARD |
GARAS TRANS HSS-11 NO |
D.AG. HSS-11 NO
HELFRICH HSS-13 197.00 197.00 1.00 80.00 197.00 AWARD |
SHAMROCK HSS-13 NO |
LOORI HSS-13 NO
SEMAN-TOV HSS-13 NO
JAY'S BUS HSS-13 279.00 279.00 0.01 100.00 279.00 NO
GARAS TRANS HSS-13 NO
D.AG. HSS-13 NO
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HELFRICH HSS-14 197.00 197.00 1.00 80.00 197.00 AWARD |
SHAMROCK HSS-14 NO |
LOORI HSS-14 NO
SEMAN-TOV HSS-14 NO
JAY'S BUS HSS-14 300.00 300.00 0.01 100.00 300.00 NO
GARAS TRANS HSS-14 750.00 750.00 2.00 100.00 750.00 NO
D.AG. HSS-14 NO
HELFRICH HSS-16 NO
SHAMROCK HSS-16 NO
LOORI HSS-16 NO
SEMAN-TOV HSS-16 NO
JAY'S BUS HSS-16 198.00 198.00 0.01 100.00 198.00 AWARD |
GARAS TRANS HSS-16 NO |
D.AG. HSS-16 NO
HELFRICH -1
SHAMROCK -1 275.00 275.00 1.25 60.00 275.00 NO
LOORI T)-1 NO
SEMAN-TOV -1 290.00 290.00 0.01 100.00 290.00 NO |
JAY'S BUS TI-1 198.00 198.00 0.01 100.00 198.00 AWARD
GARAS TRANS -1 NO |
D.AG. T)-1 NO
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HELFRICH TJ-02

SHAMROCK TJ-02

LOORI TJ-02

SEMAN-TOV TJ-02 }

JAY'S BUS T1-02 198.00 198.00 0.01 100.00 198.00 AWARD

GARAS TRANS TJ-02 a

D.AG. TJ-02

HELFRICH T)-4

SHAMROCK T)-4

LOORI T)-4

SEMAN-TOV T)-4

JAY'S BUS TJ-04 198.00 198.00 0.01 100.00 198.00 AWARD |

GARAS TRANS T)-4 a

D.AG. T)-4

HELFRICH TJ-08

SHAMROCK TJ-08

LOORI TJ-08

SEMAN-TOV TJ-08 }

JAY'S BUS TJ-08 198.00 198.00 0.01 100.00 198.00 AWARD

GARAS TRANS TJ-08 a

D.AG. TJ-08
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HELFRICH T-11 197.00 197.00 1.00 80.00 197.00 AWARD |

SHAMROCK T-11 a

LOORI TJ-11

SEMAN-TOV TJ-11

JAY'S BUS TJ-11 289.00 289.00 0.01 100.00 289.00 NO

GARAS TRANS TJ-11

D.AG. TJ-11

HELFRICH TJ-12

SHAMROCK TJ-12

LOORI TJ-12

SEMAN-TOV TJ-12

JAY'S BUS TI-12 295.00 295.00 0.01 100.00 295.00 AWARD |

GARAS TRANS T)-12 a

D.AG. TJ-12

HELFRICH T)-14

SHAMROCK T)-14

LOORI T)-14

SEMAN-TOV T)-14 }

JAY'S BUS T-14 198.00 198.00 0.01 100.00 198.00 AWARD

GARAS TRANS T)-14 a

D.AG. T)-14
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HELFRICH TI-15 197.00 197.00 1.00 80.00 197.00 AWARD |

SHAMROCK TJ-15 a

LOORI TJ-15

SEMAN-TOV TJ-15 239.00 239.00 0.01 100.00 239.00

JAY'S BUS TJ-15 325.00 325.00 0.01 100.00 325.00

GARAS TRANS TJ-15

D.AG. TJ-15

HELFRICH TJ-17

SHAMROCK TJ-17

LOORI TI-17 194.49 194.49 1.00 80.00 19449 AWARD |

SEMAN-TOV TJ-17 276.00 276.00 0.01 100.00 276.00 .

JAY'S BUS TJ-17 315.00 315.00 0.01 100.00 315.00

GARAS TRANS TJ-17

D.AG. TJ-17

HELFRICH THJ-1

SHAMROCK THI-1 187.00 187.00 1.25 60.00 187.00 AWARD |

LOORI THJ-1 a

SEMAN-TOV THI-1

JAY'S BUS THJ-1 287.00 287.00 0.01 100.00 287.00

GARAS TRANS THI-1

D.AG. THJ-1
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HELFRICH THJ-2 NO
SHAMROCK THI-2 NO
LOORI THJ-2 NO
SEMAN-TOV THI-2 NO
JAY'S BUS THI-2 310.00 310.00 0.10 100.00 310.00 AWARD
GARAS TRANS THI-2 NO |
D.AG. THJ-2 NO
HELFRICH THI-3
SHAMROCK THI-3 187.00 187.00 1.25 60.00 187.00 AWARD |
LOORI THI-3 NO |
SEMAN-TOV THI-3 199.00 199.00 0.01 100.00 199.00 NO
JAY'S BUS THI-3 287.00 287.00 0.01 100.00 287.00 NO
GARAS TRANS THI-3 NO
D.AG. THI-3 NO
HELFRICH THI-6 NO
SHAMROCK TH-6 187.00 187.00 1.25 60.00 187.00 AWARD |
LOORI THI-6 NO |
SEMAN-TOV THI-6 NO
JAY'S BUS THI-6 298.00 298.00 0.01 100.00 298.00 NO
GARAS TRANS THI-6 NO
D.AG. THI-6 NO
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HELFRICH THJ-7 NO
SHAMROCK THJ-7 NO
LOORI THJ-7 NO
SEMAN-TOV THI-7 201.00 201.00 0.01 100.00 201.00 AWARD |
JAY'S BUS THJ-7 349.00 349.00 0.01 100.00 349.00 NO |
GARAS TRANS THJ-7 NO
D.AG. THJ-7 NO
HELFRICH BJ-4 NO
SHAMROCK BJ-4 275.00 275.00 1.25 60.00 275.00 NO
LOORI BJ-4 NO
SEMAN-TOV BJ-4 NO
JAY'S BUS BJ-4 198.00 198.00 0.01 100.00 198.00 AWARD |
GARAS TRANS BJ-4 NO |
D.AG. BJ-4 NO
HELFRICH BJ-8 NO
SHAMROCK BJ-8 NO
LOORI BJ-8 NO
SEMAN-TOV BJ-8 NO |
JAY'S BUS BJ-8 198.00 198.00 0.01 100.00 198.00 AWARD
GARAS TRANS BJ-8 NO |
D.AG. BJ-8 NO
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HELFRICH BJ-10 NO
SHAMROCK BJ-10 187.00 187.00 1.25 60.00 187.00 AWARD |
LOORI BJ-10 NO |
SEMAN-TOV BJ-10 NO
JAY'S BUS BJ-10 274.00 274.00 0.01 100.00 274.00 NO
GARAS TRANS BJ-10 NO
D.AG. BJ-10 NO
HELFRICH FE-3 NO
SHAMROCK FE-3 NO
LOORI FE-3 NO
SEMAN-TOV FE-3 NO |
JAY'S BUS FE-3 198.00 198.00 0.01 100.00 198.00 AWARD
GARAS TRANS FE-3 NO |
D.AG. FE-3 NO
HELFRICH FE-4 NO
SHAMROCK FE-4 NO
LOORI FE-4 NO
SEMAN-TOV FE-4 NO
JAY'S BUS FE-4 198.00 198.00 0.01 100.00 198.00 AWARD |
GARAS TRANS FE-4 NO |
D.A.G. FE-4 NO
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HELFRICH LE-2 NO
SHAMROCK LE-2 NO
LOORI LE-2 194.49 194.49 1.00 80.00 194.49 AWARD |
SEMAN-TOV LE-2 NO |
JAY'S BUS LE-2 279.00 279.00 0.01 100.00 279.00 NO
GARAS TRANS LE-2 910.00 910.00 2.00 90.00 910.00 NO
D.AG. LE-2 NO
HELFRICH LE-3 NO
SHAMROCK LE-3 187.00 187.00 1.25 60.00 187.00 AWARD |
LOORI LE-3 NO |
SEMAN-TOV LE-3 NO
JAY'S BUS LE-3 278.00 278.00 0.01 100.00 278.00 NO
GARAS TRANS LE-3 NO
D.AG. LE-3 NO
HELFRICH LI-2 NO
SHAMROCK LI-2 NO
LOORI LI-2 NO
SEMAN-TOV LI-2 NO |
JAY'S BUS LI-2 198.00 198.00 0.01 100.00 198.00 AWARD
GARAS TRANS LI-2 NO |
D.AG. LI-2 NO
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HELFRICH LI-4 NO
SHAMROCK LI-4 NO
LOORI LI-4 NO
SEMAN-TOV LI-4 NO
JAY'S BUS LI-4 198.00 198.00 0.01 100.00 198.00 AWARD
GARAS TRANS LI-4 NO |
D.AG. LI-4 NO
HELFRICH LI-5 NO
SHAMROCK LI-5 NO
LOORI LI-5 NO
SEMAN-TOV LI-5 NO
JAY'S BUS LI-5 198.00 198.00 0.01 100.00 198.00 AWARD |
GARAS TRANS LI-5 NO |
D.AG. LI-5 NO
HELFRICH LI-6 NO
SHAMROCK LI-6 NO
LOORI LI-6 NO
SEMAN-TOV LI-6 NO |
JAY'S BUS LI-6 198.00 198.00 0.01 100.00 198.00 AWARD
GARAS TRANS LI-6 NO |
D.AG. LI-6 NO
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HELFRICH LI-8 NO
SHAMROCK LI-8 NO
LOORI LI-8 NO
SEMAN-TOV LI-8 NO
JAY'S BUS LI-8 198.00 198.00 0.01 100.00 198.00 AWARD
GARAS TRANS LI-8 NO |
D.AG. LI-8 NO
HELFRICH LI-9 197.00 197.00 1.00 80.00 197.00 AWARD |
SHAMROCK LI-9 NO |
LOORI LI-9 NO
SEMAN-TOV LI-9 279.00 279.00 0.01 100.00 279.00 NO
JAY'S BUS LI-9 198.00 198.00 0.01 100.00 198.00 NO
GARAS TRANS LI-9 NO
D.AG. LI-9 NO
HELFRICH MVE-2 NO
SHAMROCK MVE-2 NO
LOORI MVE-2 252.00 252.00 1.00 80.00 252.00 NO
SEMAN-TOV MVE-2 201.00 201.00 0.01 100.00 201.00 AWARD |
JAY'S BUS MVE-2 310.00 310.00 0.01 100.00 310.00 NO |
GARAS TRANS MVE-2 NO
D.AG. MVE-2 NO
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HELFRICH MVE-3 NO
SHAMROCK MVE-3 187.00 187.00 1.25 60.00 187.00 AWARD |
LOORI MVE-3 NO |
SEMAN-TOV MVE-3 NO
JAY'S BUS MVE-3 400.00 400.00 0.01 100.00 400.00 NO
GARAS TRANS MVE-3 875.00 875.00 2.00 100.00 875.00 NO
D.AG. MVE-3 NO
HELFRICH MVE-4 NO
SHAMROCK MVE-4 NO
LOORI MVE-4 NO
SEMAN-TOV MVE-4 201.00 201.00 0.01 100.00 201.00 AWARD |
JAY'S BUS MVE-4 368.00 368.00 0.01 100.00 368.00 NO |
GARAS TRANS MVE-4 NO
D.AG. MVE-4 NO
HELFRICH MVE-5 NO
SHAMROCK MVE-5 NO
LOORI MVE-5 NO
SEMAN-TOV MVE-5 NO |
JAY'S BUS MVE-5 198.00 198.00 0.01 100.00 198.00 AWARD
GARAS TRANS MVE-5 NO |
D.AG. MVE-5 NO
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HELFRICH NM-2 NO
SHAMROCK NM-2 187.00 187.00 1.25 60.00 187.00 AWARD |
LOORI NM-2 NO |
SEMAN-TOV NM-2 NO

JAY'S BUS NM-2 300.00 300.00 0.01 100.00 300.00 NO
GARAS TRANS NM-2 NO
D.AG. NM-2 NO
HELFRICH NM-4 NO
SHAMROCK NM-4 187.00 187.00 1.25 60.00 187.00 AWARD |
LOORI NM-4 NO |
SEMAN-TOV NM-4 300.00 300.00 0.01 100.00 300.00 NO

JAY'S BUS NM-4 298.00 298.00 0.01 100.00 298.00 NO
GARAS TRANS NM-4 NO
D.AG. NM-4 NO
HELFRICH NE-1 NO
SHAMROCK NE-1 187.00 187.00 1.25 60.00 187.00 AWARD |
LOORI NE-1 NO |
SEMAN-TOV NE-1 300.00 300.00 0.01 100.00 300.00 NO

JAY'S BUS NE-1 279.00 279.00 0.01 100.00 279.00 NO
GARAS TRANS NE-1 NO
D.AG. NE-1 NO
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HELFRICH NE-2 NO
SHAMROCK NE-2 NO
LOORI NE-2 NO
SEMAN-TOV NE-2 NO
JAY'S BUS NE-2 198.00 198.00 0.01 100.00 198.00 AWARD
GARAS TRANS NE-2 NO |
D.AG. NE-2 NO
HELFRICH NE-3 NO
SHAMROCK NE-3 NO
LOORI NE-3 NO
SEMAN-TOV NE-3 NO
JAY'S BUS NE-3 198.00 198.00 0.01 100.00 198.00 AWARD |
GARAS TRANS NE-3 NO |
D.AG. NE-3 NO
HELFRICH NS-1 NO
SHAMROCK NS-1 187.00 187.00 1.25 60.00 187.00 AWARD |
LOORI NS-1 NO |
SEMAN-TOV NS-1 NO
JAY'S BUS NS-1 305.00 305.00 0.01 100.00 305.00 NO
GARAS TRANS NS-1 NO
D.AG. NS-1 NO
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HELFRICH NS-4 197.00 197.00 1.00 80.00 197.00 AWARD |
SHAMROCK NS-4 NO |
LOORI NS-4 NO
SEMAN-TOV NS-4 NO
JAY'S BUS NS-4 290.00 290.00 0.01 100.00 290.00 NO
GARAS TRANS NS-4 NO
D.AG. NS-4 NO
HELFRICH RPE-2 NO
SHAMROCK RPE-2 NO
LOORI RPE-2 NO
SEMAN-TOV RPE-2 NO
JAY'S BUS RPE-2 198.00 198.00 0.01 100.00 198.00 AWARD |
GARAS TRANS RPE-2 NO |
D.AG. RPE-2 NO
HELFRICH RPE-3 NO
SHAMROCK RPE-3 NO
LOORI RPE-3 NO
SEMAN-TOV RPE-3 300.00 300.00 0.01 100.00 300.00 NO |
JAY'S BUS RPE-3 198.00 198.00 0.01 100.00 198.00 AWARD
GARAS TRANS RPE-3 NO |
D.AG. RPE-3 NO
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HELFRICH MST-1 NO
SHAMROCK MST-1 325.00 325.00 1.25 60.00 325.00 AWARD |
LOORI MST-1 388.98 388.98 1.00 120.00 388.98 NO a
SEMAN-TOV MST-1 NO
JAY'S BUS MST-1 NO
GARAS TRANS MST-1 790.00 790.00 2.00 150.00 790.00 NO
D.AG. MST-1 NO
HELFRICH MST-2 NO
SHAMROCK MST-2 NO
LOORI MST-2 388.98 388.98 1.00 120.00 388.98 AWARD |
SEMAN-TOV MST-2 NO |
JAY'S BUS MST-2 NO
GARAS TRANS MST-2 740.00 740.00 2.00 150.00 740.00 NO
D.A.G. MST-2 NO
HELFRICH MST-3 NO
SHAMROCK MST-3 NO
LOORI MST-3 NO
SEMAN-TOV MST-3 NO
JAY'S BUS MST-3 NO
GARAS TRANS MST-3 639.00 639.00 2.00 100.00 639.00 NO
D.AG. MST-3 NO

reject above MST-3 bid based on NJ Statute 18A:18A-22a
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HELFRICH CHS-1 NO
SHAMROCK CHS-1 NO
LOORI CHS-1 NO
SEMAN-TOV CHS-1 395.00 395.00 0.01 100.00 395.00 AWARD |
JAY'S BUS CHS-1 NO |
GARAS TRANS CHS-1 590.00 590.00 2.00 100.00 590.00 NO
D.AG. CHS-1 NO
HELFRICH CHS-2 NO
SHAMROCK CHS-2 NO
LOORI CHS-2 NO
SEMAN-TOV CHS-2 395.00 395.00 0.01 100.00 395.00 AWARD
JAY'S BUS CHS-2 NO |
GARAS TRANS CHS-2 630.00 630.00 2.00 100.00 630.00 NO
D.AG. CHS-2 NO
HELFRICH CHS-3 NO
SHAMROCK CHS-3 NO
LOORI CHS-3 NO
SEMAN-TOV CHS-3 395.00 395.00 0.01 100.00 395.00 AWARD |
JAY'S BUS CHS-3 NO |
GARAS TRANS CHS-3 670.00 670.00 2.00 100.00 670.00 NO
D.AG. CHS-3 NO
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HELFRICH CBA-1 NO
SHAMROCK CBA-1 NO
LOORI CBA-1 NO
SEMAN-TOV CBA-1 315.00 315.00 0.01 100.00 315.00 AWARD |
JAY'S BUS CBA-1 NO |
GARAS TRANS CBA-1 NO
D.AG. CBA-1 NO
HELFRICH CBA-2 NO
SHAMROCK CBA-2 NO
LOORI CBA-2 NO
SEMAN-TOV CBA-2 315.00 315.00 0.01 100.00 315.00 AWARD
JAY'S BUS CBA-2 NO |
GARAS TRANS CBA-2 NO
D.AG. CBA-2 NO
HELFRICH CBA-3 NO
SHAMROCK CBA-3 NO
LOORI CBA-3 NO
SEMAN-TOV CBA-3 315.00 315.00 0.01 100.00 315.00 AWARD |
JAY'S BUS CBA-3 NO |
GARAS TRANS CBA-3 NO
D.AG. CBA-3 NO
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HELFRICH CBA-4 NO
SHAMROCK CBA-4 NO
LOORI CBA-4 NO
SEMAN-TOV CBA-4 NO
JAY'S BUS CBA-4 NO
GARAS TRANS CBA-4 790.00 790.00 2.00 100.00 790.00 NO
D.AG. CBA-4 NO
Reject above CBA-4 bid based on NJ Statute 18A:39-1
HELFRICH HC-1JHH = NO BID RECEIVED NO
SHAMROCK HC-1JHH | |NO BID RECEIVED NO
LOORI HC-1JHH = NO BID RECEIVED NO
SEMAN-TOV HC-1JHH | |NO BID RECEIVED NO
JAY'S BUS HC-1JHH = NO BID RECEIVED NO
GARAS TRANS HC-1JHH | |NO BID RECEIVED NO
D.A.G. HC-1JHH = NO BID RECEIVED NO
HELFRICH MD-2 NO
SHAMROCK MD-2 NO
LOORI MD-2 NO
SEMAN-TOV MD-2 NO
JAY'S BUS MD-2 NO
GARAS TRANS MD-2 870.00 870.00 2.00 100.00 870.00 NO
D.AG. MD-2 NO
Reject above MD-2 bid based on NJ Statute 18A:39-1
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HELFRICH MD-1JH  NO BID RECEIVED NO
SHAMROCK MD-1JH  NO BID RECEIVED NO
LOORI MD-1JH  NO BID RECEIVED NO
SEMAN-TOV MD-1JH  NO BID RECEIVED NO
JAY'S BUS MD-1JH  NO BID RECEIVED NO
GARAS TRANS MD-1JH  NO BID RECEIVED NO
D.AG. MD-1JH  NO BID RECEIVED NO
HELFRICH OH-1 NO |
SHAMROCK OH-1 280.00 280.00 1.25 60.00 280.00 AWARD
LOORI OH-1 NO |
SEMAN-TOV OH-1 NO
JAY'S BUS OH-1 NO
GARAS TRANS OH-1 NO
D.AG. OH-1 NO
HELFRICH TH-2  NO BID RECEIVED NO
SHAMROCK TH-2  NO BID RECEIVED NO
LOORI TH-2  NO BID RECEIVED NO
SEMAN-TOV TH-2  NO BID RECEIVED NO
JAY'S BUS TH-2  NO BID RECEIVED NO
GARAS TRANS TH-2  NO BID RECEIVED NO
D.AG. TH-2  NO BID RECEIVED NO
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HELFRICH TH-1) NO BID RECEIVED NO
SHAMROCK TH-1) NO BID RECEIVED NO
LOORI TH-1) NO BID RECEIVED NO
SEMAN-TOV TH-1) NO BID RECEIVED NO
JAY'S BUS TH-1) NO BID RECEIVED NO
GARAS TRANS TH-1) NO BID RECEIVED NO
D.A.G. TH-1) NO BID RECEIVED NO
HELFRICH SMS-1 NO
SHAMROCK SMS-1 NO
LOORI SMS-1 NO |
SEMAN-TOV SMS-1 300.00 300.00 0.01 100.00 300.00 AWARD
JAY'S BUS SMS-1 NO .
GARAS TRANS SMS-1 NO
D.A.G. SMS-1 NO
HELFRICH SMS-3 NO BID RECEIVED NO
SHAMROCK SMS-3 NO BID RECEIVED NO
LOORI SMS-3 NO BID RECEIVED NO
SEMAN-TOV SMS-3 NO BID RECEIVED NO
JAY'S BUS SMS-3 NO BID RECEIVED NO
GARAS TRANS SMS-3 NO BID RECEIVED NO
D.A.G. SMS-3 NO BID RECEIVED NO




Middletown Township Board of Education

Tabulation of Bid #2022-2023-1T

Finance-1

BUS COMPANIES ROUTE# ROUTE COST TOTALCOST | | INCREASE/ PER DIEM AIDE | TOTAL COST IS AIDE
page - 28 WITHOUT AIDE  DECREASE cosT INCLUDING REQUIRED?
ADJUSTMENT COST AIDE IF REQUIRED

HELFRICH SIV-4 216.50 216.50 1.00 80.00 216.50 AWARD |
SHAMROCK SIV-4 NO |
LOORI SIV-4 NO
SEMAN-TOV SIV-4 NO
JAY'S BUS SIV-4 NO
GARAS TRANS SIV-4 NO
D.AG. SIV-4 NO
HELFRICH RCD-1  NO BID RECEIVED NO
SHAMROCK RCD-1  NO BID RECEIVED NO
LOORI RCD-1  NO BID RECEIVED NO
SEMAN-TOV RCD-1  NO BID RECEIVED NO
JAY'S BUS RCD-1  NO BID RECEIVED NO
GARAS TRANS RCD-1  NO BID RECEIVED NO
D.AG. RCD-1  NO BID RECEIVED NO
HELFRICH RBC-1  NO BID RECEIVED NO
SHAMROCK RBC-1  NO BID RECEIVED NO
LOORI RBC-1  NO BID RECEIVED NO
SEMAN-TOV RBC-1  NO BID RECEIVED NO
JAY'S BUS RBC-1  NO BID RECEIVED NO
GARAS TRANS RBC-1  NO BID RECEIVED NO
D.AG. RBC-1  NO BID RECEIVED NO
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HELFRICH RBC-2 NO
SHAMROCK RBC-2 NO
LOORI RBC-2 NO n
SEMAN-TOV RBC-2 310.00 310.00 0.01 100.00 310.00 AWARD
JAY'S BUS RBC-2 NO a
GARAS TRANS RBC-2 NO
D.A.G. RBC-2 NO
HELFRICH RBC-3 NO BID RECEIVED NO
SHAMROCK RBC-3 NO BID RECEIVED NO
LOORI RBC-3 NO BID RECEIVED NO
SEMAN-TOV RBC-3 NO BID RECEIVED NO
JAY'S BUS RBC-3 NO BID RECEIVED NO
GARAS TRANS RBC-3 NO BID RECEIVED NO
D.AG. RBC-3 NO BID RECEIVED NO
HELFRICH RBC-4 NO BID RECEIVED NO
SHAMROCK RBC-4 NO BID RECEIVED NO
LOORI RBC-4 NO BID RECEIVED NO
SEMAN-TOV RBC-4 NO BID RECEIVED NO
JAY'S BUS RBC-4 NO BID RECEIVED NO
GARAS TRANS RBC-4 NO BID RECEIVED NO
D.A.G. RBC-4 NO BID RECEIVED NO
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HELFRICH RAN-1 NO BID RECEIVED NO
SHAMROCK RAN-1 NO BID RECEIVED NO
LOORI RAN-1 NO BID RECEIVED NO
SEMAN-TOV RAN-1 NO BID RECEIVED NO
JAY'S BUS RAN-1 NO BID RECEIVED NO
GARAS TRANS RAN-1 NO BID RECEIVED NO
D.A.G. RAN-1 NO BID RECEIVED NO




