



FRANK J. JABBIA
Superintendent

321 N. Theard St.
Covington, LA 70433
985.892.2276 • Fax 985.898.3267

PROJECT

Madisonville Elementary School, Driveway Access from Galatas Road
STPSB Project No. 1801

DATE

April 4, 2023 – 3:00 p.m.

BIDDER	LICENSE NO.	BASE BID	ALTERNATE NO. 1	ALTERNATE NO. 2
AB Gallardo, LLC	73235	\$1,162,648.00	\$81,743.00	\$55,300.00
Ashely Smith Construction, LLC	66433	NO BID		
Bernard Brothers, LLC	18052	NO BID		
C.D.W. Services, LLC	45228	NO BID		
Gulf States Services Group, LLC	64343	NO BID		
Hard Rock Construction, LLC	24901	NO BID		
"K" Construction, Inc.	19499	NO BID		
Kort's Construction Services, Inc.	49356	\$1,175,000.00	\$145,000.00	\$60,000.00
LA Contracting Enterprise, LLC	34263	\$1,072,000.00	\$119,000.00	\$88,000.00
RHA Construction LLC	73503	NO BID		
Richard Price Contracting Co., LLC	14807	NO BID		
Sienna Construction, LLC	43263	\$1,193,000.00	\$95,000.00	\$64,000.00
Steele-R Development	55757	NO BID		
Triumph Construction	46747	NO BID		
Warner Construction	60826	NO BID		

THIS LIST OF BIDS IS POSTED FOR INFORMATIONAL PURPOSES ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A DETERMINATION WHETHER THERE WILL BE AN AWARD OF A PROJECT TO A BIDDER, AND IS NOT DEMONSTRATIVE OF WHETHER A PARTICULAR BIDDER IS RESPONSIVE OR THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER IN ACCORDANCE WITH LAW. THE ST. TAMMANY PARISH SCHOOL BOARD RESERVES THE RIGHT TO REJECT OR REFUSE TO AWARD ANY OR ALL BIDS IN ACCORDANCE WITH LAW.