
LEARNER PROFILE
Our Mission:

To provide a safe 
environment in which all 
students reach their highest 
potential and graduate well 
prepared for success in 
post-secondary education, 
work and life.
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CRITICAL THINKER
AND PROBLEM
SOLVER

Investigates and 
considers information, 
and uses curiosity and 
imagination to identify 
and solve problems by 
creating new ideas or 
building upon existing 
ideas. Demonstrates 
resilience and 
perseverance when faced 
with challenges, adversity, 
and setbacks; seeing 
more than one way to 
solve a problem

I don’t give up  when 
learning is difficult and I 
embrace a growth 
mindset.

I connect ideas from the 
past to recognize and 
solve existing and 
potential problems.

I evaluate the accuracy, 
perspective, credibility 
and relevance of 
information through 
digital and other 
resources.

I explore different 
methods, tools and 
resources and use a 
deliberate design 
process for generating 
ideas, testing theories, 
creating innovative 
artifacts or solving 
authentic problems.

I use my knowledge from 
multiple subject areas 
and apply it to situations.

I can be imaginative and 
take risks while problem 
solving.

COLLABORATOR

Uses talents, abilities and 
knowledge to learn  from 
and inspire  the learning 
of others.  Can engage in 
discussion of opposing 
ideas to determine a 
solution and a course of 
action while working 
toward a common goal.

I can recognize my role 
in building trust and 
working with others to 
complete tasks and 
projects.

I learn from others and 
share my ideas to 
contribute to the 
learning of others.

I can work as part of a 
diverse team and value 
my teammates’ diverse 
perspectives and 
contributions discussing 
and debating ideas 
respectfully.
I collaborate efficiently 
and responsibly through 
the use of digital tools.

I follow through with my 
responsibilities and 
support the work of 
others  to meet the goals 
of the team.

COMMUNICATOR

Actively listens and 
shares ideas clearly and 
effectively, to diverse  
audiences and for a 
variety of purposes.  

I listen to and am 
respectful of differing 
viewpoints to inform my 
own, speaking up for 
myself and advocating 
for others.

I clearly present my 
ideas both verbally and 
in writing.

I adapt my 
communication to the 
needs of the audience.

I choose and control 
what I leave online for 
others to find.

I evaluate the 
effectiveness of my 
communication via 
feedback.

COMMUNITY
CONTRIBUTOR

Recognizes their role as a 
citizen of our community 
and country. Realizes the  
opportunities and 
responsibilities necessary 
to contribute to the 
community and world.

I make safe, legal and 
ethical choices when 
working with others.

I use digital tools 
responsibly.

I understand my rights 
and obligations as a 
community member and 
respect the rights and 
obligations of others. 

I view my community 
and world with 
compassion, respect, 
and empathy for myself 
and others, locally and 
globally.

I give back to my 
community through 
volunteering and 
charitable giving. 

I learn from other 
cultures and languages 
to enhance my 
knowledge and 
appreciation of my 
culture and the culture of 
others.

CULTIVATOR

Has the capacity to 
prepare for skills, 
aptitudes and future 
growth that are required 
for success after 
graduation.  Promotes or 
improves their growth 
through labor and 
attention.

I can apply financial and 
digital literacy and time 
management skills.

I seek to explore 
interests and activities 
to develop balance in 
work and life.

I strive to be physically 
and emotionally well and 
know how to help myself 
achieve both.

I can weigh the 
consequences of my 
choices and actions.

I am able to prioritize 
tasks, set personal 
goals, and take initiative 
to accomplish them.


