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Service Company
COMMERCIAL AND INDUSTRIAL HVAC

Company: Peterson Service Co. Hourly Service Fees

Description Rates Rate's per Hour | Minimum Hourly Rate per Visit Travel
IBAS Installation $155 5155 ]
IBAS Programming 5110 $110 S0
IBAS Engineering 5120 5120 S0
IBAS Project Management 5120 5120 S0
IBAS Design 5120 5120 S0
Commissioning $120 5120 S0
Customer Training $110 5110 SO
Lighting Labor 5155 $155

Troubleshooting $120 $120 SO
Demolition 5105 5105 50
HVAC Labor 5115 $115 S0
Cyber Security No Bid

integration Services 5120 5120 50
integrated Card Access 5120 $120 50
tntegrated IP Cameras 5120 $120 50

Operational Hours
Office Hours — Monday — Friday 8am —~ 5pm

After Hours, automated phone system dial 609-714-3699 x250. Leave a message and a Peterson Service
Co., employee will return the call.

Price Lists Attached
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Peterson

Service Company

Section B3.11 IBAS Hardware

A. Building Automation Servers, Controllers, Sensors and Field Components — Page 4
a. See Attached Price List with the Co-op Pricing.
b. For additional hardware/software required due to project scope a discount of 20% off of
Manufacturer’s List Price will apply.
B. HVAC Equipment including Boilers, Rooftop Units, Ductless Mini Splits, [AQ devices, etc. - Pg 10
a. See Attached Price list with the Co-op Pricing.
b. Panasonic Equipment is shown as List Pricing — this equipment will be offered to the
customer at a discount of 10% off of the shown Manufacturer’s List Price.
c. For additional equipment required due to project scope a discount of 10% off of
Manufacturer’s List Price will apply.
C. Chillers, Cooling Towers, and Associated Chilled Water Systems — Page 23
a, See Attached Price List with the Co-op Pricing
b. Foradditional equipment required due to project scope a discount of 10% off of
Manufacturer’s List Price will apply.
D. Lighting Controls & Fixtures and Associated Hardware
a. NoBid
E. Camera and Card Access Control Hardware — Page 24
a. See Attached Price list with the Co-op Pricing.
b. For additional hardware/software required due to project scope a discount of 20% off of
Manufacturer’s List Price will apply.
F. [P Camera System Hardware — Page 27
a. See Attached Panasonic Pricing List, no discount from List Price,
b. For additional equipment required due to project scope a discount of 10% off of
Manufacturer’s List Price will apply.
G. PA/Intercom System Hardware

a. NoBid
H. Integrated Door Hardware
a. NoBid

. Digital Displays and Mounting Hardware
a. No Bid
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Section B3.12 IBAS Software

A. End Systems {Desktop/Server), Tablets, Infrastructure, Storage, Security

a. NoBid
B. Camera and Card Access Software

a. Honeywell Software is embedded in the Hardware, see Hardware pricing — Page 24
C. Any Software as a Service

a. NoBid
D. Analytics Software for BAS/EMS

a. Honeywell Software is embedded in the Hardware, see Hardware pricing — Page 4
E. Cyber Security Software

a. NoBid

Section B3.13 IBAS Peripherals
A. IBAS Peripherals — Page 4

a. Refer to the Section B3.11A Price List
b. For additional hardware/software required due to project scope a discount of 20% off of

Manufacturer's List Price will apply.
Section B3.14 Integrated Security Systems - No Bid
Section B3.15 Professional Services — See Labor Rates — Page 1
Section B3.16 Network Security Services - No Bid

Section B3.17 Installation Services — See Labor Rates ~ Page 1

Section B3.18 Supplies/Miscellaneous — A discount of 20% off of Manufacturer’s List Price will apply.




Part # Description Sell Price

DEVICE-1 WEB-8000 Capacity Upgrade Pack {Initial - 1 Dev/50 P} 5244.00
DEVICE-10 WEB-8000Q Capacity Upgrade Pack {Initial - 10 Dev/SO0P) $1,368,00
DEVICE-25 WEB-8000 Capacity Upgrade Pack {Initial - 25 Dev/1250P) $1,816.00
DEVICE-50 WEB-8000 Capacity Upgrade Pack (Initial - 50 Dev/2500P) $3,564.00
DEVICE-UP-1 WEB-8000 Capacity Upgrade Pack (1 Dev/50 P) $272.00
DEVICE-UP-10 WEB-8000 Capacity Upgrade Pack {10 Dev/SO0P) $1,912.00
DEVICE-UP-25 WEB-8000 Capacity Upgrade Pack {25 Dev/1250F) $2,428.00
DEVICE-UP-50 WEB-8000 Capacity Upgrade Pack (50 Dev/2500P) $4,360,00
DR-AAMPUP-AX PUP Driver AX 54,740.00
DR-APUP PUP Driver N4 $3,237.00
DR-BAC-SRV-AX BACnet IP Server Driver over Ethernet $1,357.00
DR-CCN Carrier Comfort Network Driver (WEB-8000) $2,177.00
DR-LONDRIV-AX Lon Driver $556.00
DR-MDB-AX Modbus RTU/TCP $920.00
DR-MSTP-AX Bachet MSTP $920.00
DR-NS-BAC-500 Bacnet IP Addtl 500 pts 52,440,00
DR-NS-BAC-CLI BACnet IP Client Driver for AX Supervisor, 500 pts $5,505.00
DR-5-DB-CSV CSV Database Driver for Niagara 4 Supervisor $2,364.00
DR-S-DB-MYSQL MYSQL Database Driver for Niagara 4 Supervisor $2,364.00
DR-5-DB-ORCL QOracle 11G Datahase Driver for Niagara 4 Supervisor $2,364.00
DR-5-DB-SQL SQL Database Driver for Niagara 4 Supervisor $2,364.00
10-R-16 Remote 10 Exp Mod {WER-8000) $468.00
10-R-34 Remote 10 Exp Mod {WEB-8000} $1,040.00
JACE-8000-AX Enables WEB-8000 to run WEBs-AX [3.8U TBD) $992.00
MN7220A2007 Actuator $363,00
MN7220A2205 Actuator $480.00
MN7505A2001 Actuator 5217.00
MS7505A2030 Actuator $382.00
MS7505A2130 Actuator $464.00
MS7510A2008 Actuator $416.00
MS7510A2206 Actuator $510.00
MS7520A2007 Actuator $542.00
MS7520A2205 Actuator $624.00
MS8105A1030 Actuator 5262.00
MS8105A1130 Actuator $311.00
MS8110A1008 Actuator $313.00
MS8110A1206 Actuator 5396.00
NC-8005 Core WEB-8000 Licensing - 5 Devices / 250 Points $636.00
NC-8010 Core WEB-8000 Licensing - 10 Devices / 500 Points $1,104.00
NC-8025 Core WEB-8000 Licensing - 25 Devices / 1250 Points 51,560.00
NC-8100 Core WEB-8000 Licensing - 100 Devices / 5000 Points $4,608.00
NC-8200 Core WEB-8000 Licensing - 200 Devices / 10000 Peints 56,905.00
NPB-2X-R5485 Dual RS485 Card $468.00
NPB-8000-232 WEB-8000 RS$-232 Card {Single Port} $361.00
NPB-8000-2X-485 WEB-8000 RS-485 Card {Dual Port) $392.00
NPB-8000-LON WEB-8000 LON Card (Single Port) $392.00
NPB-BATTERY Replacement WEB-201/600 Battery $136.00
NPB-LON Lon Card $401.00
NPB-PWR-H DIN MOUNT 24V power supply $308.00
NPB-PWR-UN-H PWR supply for 700 $308.00
NPB-WPM-US Wall adapter{power supply) $72.00
NPM-128 Memory expansion for 201 $864.00
NPM-256MB Memory expansion for 300/600 $1,537.00
PIN-DEV-UP-1 ClPer 50 Upgrade - 1 Device / 50 Points $282.00
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PIN-DEV-UP-2 CiPer 50 Upgrade - 2 Devices / 100 Points $471.00
PIN-DEV-UP-10 CIPer 50 Upgrade - 10 Devices / 500 Points $1,957.00
PIN-DEV-UP-25 CiPer 50 Upgrade - 25 Devices / 1250 Points $2,484.00
PIN-DEV-UP-50 ClPer 50 Upgrade - 50 Devices / 2500 Points 54,132.00
PUB10125 1U/ 1AG/2D0O 5345.00
PUB10125-ILC 1 Ut/ 1 AD/ 2 DO - Individually Licensed $456.00
PUB40245 4 U/ 2A0/4D0 $480.00
PUB40245-{LC 4 Ul/ 2 AO/ 4 DO - Individually Licensed $590,00
PUB64335 6 Ul/ 4 DI/ 3 AO/ 8 DO $731.00
PUB6438S-ILC 6 Ul/ 4 DI/ 3 AQ/ 8 DO - Individually Licensed $922.00
PUBG4385R 6 Ul/ 4 DI/ 3 AO/ 8 DO - Relay Cutputs {DO) $790.00
PUBG433SR-ILC 6 U/ 4 DI/ 3 A0/ 8 DO - Individually Licensed w/Relay Out $1,017.00
PVBOOODAS 0 U/ 0 AQ/ 0 DO w/ Actuator $384.00
PVBOOOOAS-ILC 0 Ui/ 0 AQ/ 0 DO - Individually Licensed w/ Actuator $489.00
PVBA022A5 4 Ulf 2 AQ/ 2 DO w/Actuator $539,00
PVBA022AS-ILC 4 U/ 2 AQ/ 2 DO - individually Licensed w/ Actuator $700.00
PVB4024NS 4 Ul/ 2 AO/ 4 DO w/o Actuator 5479.00
PVB4024NS-ILC 4 Ul/ 2 AD/ 4 DO - Individually Licensed w/o Actuator $662.00
PVBG436AS 6 Ul/ 4 DI/ 3 AQ/ 6 DO w/Actuator $734.00
PVB6436AS-ILC 6 UI/ 4 DI/ 3 AD/ 6 DO - individually Licensed w/ Actuator $956.00
PVB6438NS & UI/ 4 DI/ 3 AD/ 8 DO w/o Actuator $720.00
PVBGE438NS-ILC 6 Ul/ 4 DI/ 3 AQ/ 8 DO - Individually Licensed w/fo Actuator $308.00
51012000 12U1 - Must use 6438SR $348.00
5104022 4U1/ 2 AD/ 2 DO - Must use 64385R $397.00
5106042 6U1/ 4 AD/ 2 DO - Must use 64385R $442.00
SMA-8005-1YR WEB- 8005 - 1 year maintenance. $100.00
SMA-8005-1YR-INIT Initial 18 Month Maintenance Agreement $100.00
SMA-8005-3YR WEB- 8005 - 3 year maintenance. $248.00
SMA-8005-5YR WEB- 8005 - 5 year maintenance, $320.00
SMA-8010-1YR WEB- 8010 - 1 year maintenance. $176.00
SMA-8010-1YR-INIT Initial 18 Month Maintenance Agreement 5176.00
SMA-8010-3YR WEB- 8010 - 3 year maintenance, 5432.00
SMA-8010-5YR WEB- 8010 - 5 year maintenance. $552,00
SMA-8025-1YR WEB- 8025 - 1 year maintenance, $248.00
SMIA-8025-1YR-INIT Initial 18 Month Maintenance Agreement $248.00
SMA-8025-3YR WEB- 8025 - 3 year maintenance. $608.00
SMA-8025-5YR WEB- 8025 - 5 year maintenance, $780.00
SMA-8100-1YR WEB- 8100 - 1 year maintenance. $736.00
SMA-8100-1YR-INIT injtial 18 Month Maintenance Agreement $736.00
SMA-8100-3YR WEB- 8100 - 3 year maintenance, 51,796.00
SMA-8100-5YR WEB- 8100 - 5 year maintenance. 52,305.00
SMA-8200-1YR WEB- 8200 -~ 1 year maintenance. $1,104.00
SMA-8200-1YR-INIT initial 18 Month Maintenance Agreement $1,104.00
SMA-8200-3YR WEB- 8200 - 3 year maintenance, $2,692.00
SMA-8200-5YR WEB- 8200 - 5 year maintenance. $3,453.00
SUP-0-SMA-1YR Supervisor 0, maintenance for 1 year 5173.00
SUP-0-SMA-INIT Supervisor 0, maintenance for 1 year $173.00
SUP-0-SMA-3YR Supervisor 0, maintenance for 3 year $421.00
SUP-0-SMA-S5YR Supervisor 0, maintenance for 5 year $537.00
SUP-1-SMA-1YR Supervisor 1, maintenance for 1 year $216.00
SUP-1-SMA-INIT Supervisor 1, maintenance for 1 year $216.00
SUP-1-5MA-3YR Supervisor 1, maintenance for 3 year 5532.00
SUP-1-SMA-5YR Supervisor 1, maintenance for 5 year $680.00
SUP-2-SMA-1YR Supervisor 2, maintenance for 1 year £260.00
SUP-2-SMA-INIT Supervisor 2, maintenance for 1 year 5260.00
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SUP-2-SMA-3YR Supervisor 2, maintenance for 3 year $632.00
SUP-2-SMA-5YR Supervisor 2, maintenance for 5 year 5812.00
SUP-3-SMA-1YR Supervisor 3, maintenance for 1 year $304.00
SUP-3-SMA-INIT Supervisor 3, maintenance for 1 year $304.00
SUP-3-SMA-3YR Supervisor 3, maintenance for 3 year $744.00
SUP-3-SMA-5YR Supervisor 3, maintenance for 5 year $952.00
SUP-10-SMA-1YR Supervisor 10, maintenance for 1 year $696.00
SUP-10-SMA-INIT Supervisor 10, malntenance for 1 year $696.00
SUP-10-SMA-3YR Supervisor 10, maintenance for 3 year $1,692.00
SUP-10-SMA-5YR Supervisor 10, maintenance for 5 year $2,172.00
SUP-100-SMA-1YR Supervisor 100, maintenance for 1 year $1,032.00
SUP-100-SMA-INIT Supervisor 100, maintenance for 1 year $1,032.00
SUP-100-SMA-3YR Supervisor 100, maintenance for 3 year $2,512.00
SUP-100-SMA-5YR Supervisor 100, maintenance for 5 year $3,220.00
SUP-UNL-SMA-1YR Supervisor UNL, malntenance for 1 year 52,112.00
SUP-UNL-SMA-3YR Supervisor UNL, maintenance for 3 year $5,148.00
SUP-UNL-SMA-5YR Supervisor UNL, maintenance for 5 year 56,600.00
SUP-UNL-SMA-INIT Supervisor UNL, maintenance for 1 year 52,112.00
SUP-DEVICE-10 Sup 10 field Dev pack. Std drivers incl $1,420.00
SUP-DEVICE-25 Sup 25 field Dev pack, std drivers incl $1,852.00
SUP-DEVICE-50 Sup 50 field Dev pack. std drivers Incl $3,708.00
SUP-DEVICE-100 Sup 100 field Dev pack. std drivers incl $5,624.00
SUP-DEVICE-200 Sup 200 field Dev pack. std drivers incl 58,436.00
SUP-UP-1 Adds one additional Niagara connection to Sup. $493.00
SUP-UP-100 Upgrades WEB-5-0 to 10-N4 to 100 Niagara conn. $6,860.00
SUP-UP-UNL Upgrades Sup 100 to unfimited Niagara connections. $6,800.00
1735081002 7-Day Programmable Thermostat $562.00
TR21 20k. Temp only, not on Sylk, 6-wire, uses input $35.00
TR21-H 20k. Temp. Humidity $235.00
TR22 20k, Temp. Setpoint adj $66.00
TR23 20k. Temp. Setpoint ad], Override 5101.00
TR23-H 20k. Temp. Humidity. Setpoint ad]. Override 5312.00
TR40 Mini 210, Temp., on Sylk 568.00
TR40-CO2 Mini Z10. Temp. CO2 5546,00
TR40-H Mini ZI0. Temp. Humidity $343.00
TR40-H-CO2 Mini 210, Temp. Humidty. CO2 $666.00
TR42* Mini ZIO, Temp. Display 5145.00
TR42-CO2 Mini ZI0. Temp. Display. CO2 $585.00
TR42-H Mini 210, Temp. Display. Humidity $381.00
TR42-H-CO2 Mini ZI0. Temp. Display. Humidity, CO2 $698.00
TR71 Z10. Temp. Display $222.00
TR71-H 210. Temp. Humidity. Display $433.00
TR75 ZI0 Plus. Temp. Display $311.00
TR75-H ZIO Plus. Temp. Humidity. Display $502.00
WEB-834 Base WEB-2000 w/34 Point I/0 Module (0 Dev/0 P} $1,801.00
WEB-8005 5 Dev/250 Pts $2,017.00
WEB-8010 10 Dev/500 Pts 52,484.00
WEB-8025 25 Dev/1,250 Pts $2,941.00
WEB-8100 100 Dev/5,000 Pts $5,988.00
WEB-8200 200 Dev/10,000 Pts $8,285.00
WEB-8000 WEB-8000 Hardware $1,380.00
WEB-EHSERIESNX26D CtPers0 Controller w/Display $1,719.00
WEB-EHSERIESNX26ND  |CIPer50 Controller w/o Display $1,500.00
WEB-5-0-N4 Sup w/o Niagara nc for managing 1P field devices only $1,073.00
WEB-5-1-N4 Sup with 1 Niagara network connection, $1,360.00
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WEB-5-2-Ng Sup with 2 Niagara network connections. $1,624,00
WEB-3-3-N4 Sup with 3 Niagara network connections. 51,904.00
WEB-5-10-N4 Sup with 10 Niagara network connections. $4,340,00
WEB-5-100-N4 Sup with 100 Niagara network connections. $6,440.00
WEB-S-UNL-N4 Sup with Unlimited Niagara network connections. $13,200.00
WEB-5-AX-100-0 Supervisor. Up to 100 $8,192.00
WEB-5-AX-3-0 Supervisor, Upto 3 $4,877.00
WEB-5-AX-UNL-O Supervisor, Unlimited $13,284.00
WPM-8000 WEB-8000 Wall Power Module $84.00
XF821A XL800 8Al Module (compatible w/Eagle-ClPer50) $470.00
XF822A XL800 8AO Module {compatible w/Eagle-CIPer50} $445.00
XFR822A XL80O 8AO Module {with Override) $649,00
XF823A XL800 12D1 Modute (compatible w/Eagle-ClPer50) $378.00
XF824A XL800 6D0 Module {compatible w/Eagle-CiPerS0) $324.00
XFR824A XL800 6DO Module {with Override) $530.00
XFR825A XL800 6D0O Module (Floating Actuator Output} $472.00
XFUB30A XL800 8/12/8/6 Module {compatible w/Eagle-CiPer50) $2,788.00
XSUg21-22 Terminal Socket for XF/XFR 821/822 $158.00
Xxsu823 Terminal Socket for XF823A $156.00
XsU824-25 Terminal Socket for XF/XFR 824/825 $164.00
F4-CGMO02090-0 7Ul 2Dl 4CO 2A0 3DO $828.00
F4-CVMO03050-0 3Ul 2C03D0O $546.00
FX-PCA2611-0 6Ul 2D1 4C0O 3DO 2A0 $1,011.00
FX-PCA2612-1 5U1 4D 4CO 5RO $1,033.00
FX-PCA4911-0 10Ul 6D1 5CO 4DO 4A0 $1,351.00
FX-PCG1611-1 201 1D1 4C0O 3D0O $583.00
FX-PCG1611-1ET 2U1 1Dl 4CO 3DO Extended Temps $641.00
FX-PCG1621-1 2U1 1Dl 4C0O 3BO 5948.00
EX-PCG2611-0 6U1 2D! 4C0O 3DO 2A0 5919.00
FX-PCG2611-0ET 6U1 2Dl 4CO 3D0O 2A0 Extended Temps $919.00
FX-PCG2621-0 6Ul 2DI 4C0O 3D0 2 AO $1,204.00
FX-PCV1615-1 3R 2D0 §503.00
FX-PCV1630-1 3 2C0 3D0 $573.00
FX-PCV1832-1 3Ul 2C0 3D0 5779.00
EX-PCX1711-0 4D} $381.00
FX-PCX2711-0 2Ul 2C0 2D0 $476.00
FX-PCX2721-0 Ul 2A0 $509.00
FX-PCX3711-0 4Ul 4CO 4D0O 5618.00
FX-PCX3721-0 16Dl $567.00
FX-PCX3731-0 8Di 800 562400
FX-PCX4711-0 6Ul 2Di 4CO 3DO $637.00
FX-SC8BASE-0O Base FX-80 Controller w/o Licensing $1,475.00
FX-SC8CLO0S5-0 5 Device Software $675.00
FX-SC8CLO10-0 10 Device Software $1,171.00
FX-SC8CLO25-0 25 Device Software $1,654.00
FX-SCBCL100-0 100 Device Software $4,885.00
FX-SC8CL200-0 200 Device Software $7,318.00
FX-5C8D005M1-0 5 Dev 1-Yr SMA Init/After $107.00
FX-5C8D005M3-0 5 Dev 3-Yr SMA Init/After 5264.00
FX-5C8D0O0O5M5-0 5 Dev 5-Yr SMA Init/After $347.00
FX-SC8D010M1-0 10 Dev 1-Yr SMA Init/After $196.00
FX-SC8D010M3-0 10 Dev 3-Yr SMA Init/After 5459.00
FX-SC8D010MS5-0 10 Dev 5-Yr SMA init/After $680.00
FX-sC8D025M1-0 25 Dev 1-Yr SMA Init/After $266.00
FX-SC8D025M3-0 25 Dev 3-Yr SMA Init/After $645,00
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FX-SC8D025M5-0 25 Dev 5-Yr SMA Init/After $967.00
FX-SC8D100M1-0 100 Dev 1-Yr SMA Init/After $791.00
FX-5C8D100M3-0 100 Dev 3-Yr SMA Init/After $1,936.00
FX-SC8D100MS5-0 100 Dev 5-Yr SMA Init/After $2,885.00
FX-5C8D200M1-0 200 Dev 1-Yr SMA Init/After $1,252.00
FX-SC8D200M3-0 200 Dev 3-Yr SMA Init/After $2,854.00
FX-SC8D200M5-0 200 Dev 5-Yr SMA Init/After $4,320.00
FX-SC8DL10-0 Capacity Upgrade 10 Dev (Initial) 51,451.00
FX-SC8DL25-0 Capacity Upgrade 25 Dev (Initial} $1,925.00
FX-5C8DL50-0 Capacity Upgrade 50 Dev {Initial) $3,778.00
FX-5C8DL10-6 Capacity Upgrade 10 Dev 52,028.00
FX-SC8DL25-6 Capacity Upgrade 25 Dev 52,574.00
FX-SC8DL50-6 Capacity Upgrade 50 Dev $4,622.00
FX-SCBLCCN-0 Carrier Comfort Network Init/After 52,307.00
FX-SCEXLON-0 LONWORKS Expanslon Card $446.00
FX-SC8XD485-0 Dual RS-485 Expansion Card $446.00
FX-5C8X232-0 RS-232 Expansion Card $408.00
FX-SC8LAX-0 AX 3.8 Downgrade Init/After 51,059.00
FX-SC8XPS-0 Wall Mount Power Supply 100-240 $93.00
FX-SLO0O-0 Sup with 0 N4 connections. $1,160.00
FX-SLO01-0 Sup with 1 N4 connection, $1,442.00
FX-SLO02-0 Sup with 2 N4 connections. $1,722.00
FX-5L003-0 Sup with 3 N4 connections, $2,019.00
FX-S5L010-0 Sup with 10 N4 connections. $4,600.00
FX-SL100-0 Sup with 100 N4 connections. $6,827.00
FX-SLUNL-0 Sup with UNL N4 Connections. $13,992.00
FX-SLUQO1-6 Adds 1 Addt'l N4 connection to Sup. $537.00
FX-SLU100-6 Upgr WEB-5-0 to 10-N4 to 100 N4 conn. $7,272.00
FX-SLUUNL-6 Upgr Sup 100 to UNL N4 connect. $7,208.00
FX-SLMYSQL-0 License enabling MYSQL DB support $2,507.00
FX-SLORCL-0 License enahling Oracle DB support $2,507.00
FX-5LSQL-0 License enabling SQL DB support $2,507.00
FX-SLCSV-0 License enabling CSV support $2,507.00
FX-SLOPCCL-0 License enabling OPC client support §791.00
FX-SLOCOM1-6 Supervisor 0, maintenance for 1 year $186.00
FX-SLO0OM3-6 Supervisor 0, maintenance for 3 year $452.00
FX-SLO0OMS5-6 Supervisor 0, maintenance for 5 year 5580.00
EX-SLOOLMI-6 Supervisor 1, maintenance for 1 year $230.00
FX-SEO01M3-6 Supervisor 1, maintenance for 3 year $564.00
FX-SLO01IM5-6 Supervisor 1, maintenance for 5 year $721.00
FX-SLO0ZMI1-6 Supervisor 2, maintenance for 1 year $276.00
FX-SL002M3-6 Supervisor 2, maintenance for 3 year $671.00
FX-SLO02M5-6 Supervisor 2, maintenance for 5 year $866.00
FX-SLO03M1-6 Supervisor 3, maintenance for 1 year $323.00
FX-SL0O03M3-6 Supervisor 3, maintenance for 3 year $789.00
FX-SLO03M5-6 Supervisor 3, maintenance for 5 year $1,105.00
FX-5L010M1-6 Supervisor 10, maintenance for 1 year $739.00
FX-SLOI0M3-6 Supervisor 10, maintenance for 3 year $1,794.00
FX-SLOIOMS5-6 Supervisar 10, maintenance for 5 year 52,516.00
FX-SL100M1-6 Supervisor 100, maintenance for 1 year $1,122.00
FX-SL100M3-6 Supervisor 100, maintenance for 3 year $2,664.00
FX-SL100M5-6 Supervisor 100, maintenance for 5 year $3,736.00
FX-SLUNLM1-6 Supervisor UNL, maintenance for 1 year $2,240,00
FX-SLUNLM3-6 Supervisor UNL, maintenance for 3 year $5,457,00

FX-SLUNLMS-6

Supervisor UNL, maintenance for 5 year

$6,996.00
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NS-BHR7103-0 NS-Space/Humidity $847.00
NS-BTF7002-0 NS-Space/Adjust/LCD - Warm/Cool StPt $232.00
NS-BTN7003-0 NS-SPACE 5180.00
NS-BTV7002-0 NS-Space/Adjust/LCD - Absolute StPt $203.00
NS-FTN7003-2 Flush Mount Space Temp $193.00
NS-WALLPLATE-O WALL PLATE 2X4 BOX $20.00
NSB8BHC240-0 T-H-CO2, White, Fixed Segm Disp w/o PIR $756.00
NSB8MHC240-0 T-H-CO2, White, Fixed Segm Disp w/PIR $833.00
NSBEBHN240-0 T-H, White, Fixed Segm Disp w/o PIR $501.00
NSBBMHN240-0 T-H, White, Fixed Segm Disp w/PIR $577.00
NSBBBHN140-0 T-H, White, W/C Adj Disp w/o PIR $472.00
NSB8BTC240-0 T-CO2, White, Fixed Segm Disp w/o PIR $5424.00
NSBSMTC240-0 T-CO2, White, Fixed Segm Disp w/PIR $500.00
NSBBBTN240-0 T, White, Fixed Segm Disp w/o PIR $168.00
NSBBMTN240-0 T, White, Fixed Segm Disp w/PIR 524400
NSB2BTN140-0 T, White, W/C Adj Disp w/o PIR $139.00
NSBBBNC040-0 €02, White, w/o Disp $339.00
NSB8BPN240-0 T-H (2%), White, Fixed Segm Disp w/o PIR 5687.00
AFB24-MFT Damper Actuator, 180 in-tb [20 Nm, Spring return 5656.00
AFB24-SR Damper Actuator, 180 in-lb {20 Nm)], Spring return $596,00
AFB24-5R-S Damper Actuator, 180 in-th {20 Nm], Spring return $688.00
AFRB24 Valve Actuator, Spring return, AC/DC 24 V, On/Off $519.00
AFRB24-SR Valve Actuator, Spring return, AC/DC 24 V, 2...10 V, mod $638.00
B207 Characterized Control Valve [CCV), 1/2", 2-way, Cv 0.3 $86.00
B207+LF24 US {€Cv), 1/2", 2-way, Cv 0.3 [Valve Actuator, Spring return $413.00
B207+LF24-SR US {CCv), 1/2", 2-way, Cv 0.3 |Valve Actuator, Spring return $532.00
B208 (ccv), 1/2", 2-way, Cv 0.46 $86.00
B208+LF24 US (€Cv), 1/2", 2-way, Cv 0.46 |Valve Actuator, Spring return 5413.00
B208+LF24-SR US {cCv), 1/2", 2-way, Cv 0.46 | Valve Actuator, Spring return $532.00
B307 (cev), 172", 3-way, Cv 0.3 $138.00
B307+LF24 US {CCV), 1/2", 3-way, Cv 0.3 [Valve Actuator, Spring return $483.00
B8307+LF24-5R US {CCV), 1/2", 3-way, Cv 0.3 | Valve Actuator, Spring return $616.00
8308 {ccv), 1/2", 3-way, Cv0.46 $138.00
B308+LF24 US (CCV), 1/2", 3-way, Cv 0.46 | Valve Actuator, Spring return $483.00
8308+LF24-5R US (€Cv), 1/2", 3-way, Cv 0.46 |Valve Actuator, Spring return $616.00
UGVL Retrofit valve linkageFor Universal Globe Valve $283.00
UGVL+LVB24-5R Retrofit Valve Actuator, Non fail-safe $638.00
UGVL+LVKB24-MFT Retrofit Valve Actuator, Electronic fail-safe $965.00
UGVL+LYKB24-SR Retrofit Valve Actuator, Electronic fail-safe $897.00
UGVLHLVKX24-MFT Retrofit Valve Actuator, Electronic fail-safe $869.00
UGVLHLVKX24-5R Retrofit Valve Actuator, Electronic fail-safe $897.00
UGVLHEVX24-MFT Retrofit Valve Actuator, Non fail-safe $701.00
UGVLHLVX24-SR Retrofit Valve Actuator, Non fail-safe $638.00
UGVL+5VB24-SR Retrofit Valve Actuator, Non fail-safe $736.00
UGVL+SVKB24-MFT Retrofit Valve Actuator, Electronic fail-safe $1,073.00
UGVL+SVKB24-5R Retrofit Valve Actuator, Electronic fail-safe $1,001.00
ZTH US Service Tool, with ZIP-USB function $704.00
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HVAC Equipment

Trane Air Handling Units
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UCCA - Base

Indoor Air Handlers
Size 3 6 8 10 12 14 17
CFM 1200 2400 3200 4000 4800 5600 6800
Sell Price | $ 4,871.00 | S 4,724.00] 6 5,129.00)5 5464.00}5 6,10400|$ 6,721.00]$ 6,600.00
Size 21 25 30
CFM 8400 10000 12000
Sell Price | 5 7,271.00 | S 7,933.00{ $ 8,781.00

Outdoor Air Handlers
Size 3 6 8 10 12 14 17
CFM 1200 2400 3200 4000 4800 5600 6800
Sell Price 1§ 14,609.00 | § 18,356.00 | § 24,140.00 | § 22,158.00 | S 23,948.00 | 5 23,090.00 | 5 22,914.00
Size 21 25 30
CFM 3400 10000 12000
Sell Price | § 25,801.00 | $ 29,395.00 | $ 29,523.00

Qutdoor Unit Options:

Economizer, Flat Filter, Standard Curb

1
i
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Trane Rooftop Units

Options Included
{Precendent & Voyager):

High efficiency, comparative econ, 2" Merv 13 hinged, donwflow, VAV, mod gas heat,
powered exhaust curb, air fi with zone sensor, through base gas electric, disconnect
and hail guard, return and supply smoke, CF< FF, and Condensate overflow, 55 DP.

Precedent Voyager 2
Tonnage |Sel Price Tonnage {Sell Price

3 S 9,855.00 12.5 $ 23,229.00
4 $ 9,638.00 15 $ 24,848.00
5 s 10,314.00 17.5 $ 27,833.00
6 S 12,399.00 20 $ 29,810.00
7.5 S 15,286.00 25 $ 32,670.00
8.5 $ 16,726.00

10 S 17,566.00

Eflex, HGRH, Low ambient, Modulating Gas Heat, Muitizone VAV, pre 2" merv 8, Merv

Options included (Ipak}): 14 Cartridge, comparative econ, trag and dcv, bacnet, zone sensar, humid sensor, air

fi w/display
IPAK
Tonnage |Sell Price
25 S 73,781.00
40 S 93,676.00
50 S 107,741.00
60 S 120,150.00
75 S 134,375.00 |***1200 MBH Heat

High capacity, modulating gas heat, high fault with disconnect, powered outlet, phase
monitor, VAV with VFD bypass, exhaust with statitrac, HE Throaway, comparative
econ with trag, ss with extended grease and fitler gauge, remote interface,

Options Included (Ipak 2):

IPAK 2
Tonnage |Sell Price
90} & 153,816.00
105{ § 157,426.00
115/ §  159,421.00
130/ § 168,611.00




DOAS Units
Smaller DOAS
Ton Cabinet Sell Price
4 B0O84 $ 57,835.00
Ton Cabinet Sell Price
8 G120 $ 72,343.00
Larger DOAS
Ton Cabinet Sell Price
10 D010 $ 75,449.00
15 D015 § 79,659.00
20 D020 $ 87,175.00
40 N040 $182,247.00
50 NO50 $ 183,863.00
60 NO60 $192,490.00
70 NO70 $ 225,555.00
80 NO80 $ 234,463.00

modulating damper for econ control
non fused disconnect with 115 outlet
wheel with vid for frost protection

iVierv 8

modulating damper for econ control

ECM supply

£CM return with B/R
supply return smoke

5 year compressor warranty

Page 12 of 41




Unit Ventilators
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Options included:

UC 400 with air fi, reheat coil {3 Row, 12 FPI), deluxe piping package, 1" Merv 8

Vertical reheat 1" MERV 8§, 21.25 deep endcovers with falseback I

Horizontal 4 Pipe UV Vertical UV

Size Sell Price Size Sell Price

750 S 6,485.00 750 S 6,594.00

1000 S 6,925.00 100 S5 6,966.00

1250 S 7,325.00 1250 S 7,364.00

1500 S 7,733.00 1500 5 8,229.00

2000 S 8,026.00

Fan Coils

Changeover, 2" Falseback, no disconnect, aluminum finned coil, deluxe piping
Options included package, uc400 air -fi, low limit and condensate overflow, key lock and 2" subbase
Blower Coil:  |BC have 2" MERVS, mixing box 4 pipe RH, Air-Fi UC400, DAS, piping package
Vertical Cabinet Horizontal Concealed Blower Coil
Size Sell Price Size Sell Price Size Sell Price
20 S 2,596.00 20 S 2,355.00 12 $ 3,966.00
30 S 2,649.00 30 S 2,355.00 18 S 4,136.00
40 S 2,743.00 40 S 2,506.00 24 S 4,453.00
60 $ 2,788.00 60 $ 2,556.00 36 $ 4,718.00
80 S 3,133.00 80 S 2,831.00 54 S 6,484.00
100 $ 3,296.00 100 $ 2,955.00 72 S 6,953.00
120 5 3,424.00 120 S 3,066.00 90 S 7,450.00
VAV Boxes

Options Included

VAV coacling only - Bacnet, UC210, air fi comms, wireless zone, foil faced, dts and transformer

VAV Cooling Only

Size Sell Price
4 S 909.00
5 5 809.00
6 S 909,00
8 S 926.00
10 S 944.00
12 S 963.00
14 S 993.00
16 s 1,011.00

Vav HW
Size Sell Price
4 S 974.00
5 $  974.00
6 5 974.00
8 S 991.00
10 $ 1,024.00
12 S 1,069.00
14 S 1,123.00
16 S 1,156.00

VAV Electric
Size Sell Price Kw
4 S 1,569.00 1
5 S 1,574.00 15
6 S 1,593.00 3
8 $ 1,598.00] 4
10 S 1,626.00 6
12 S 1,646.00 9
14 $ 1,700.00 9
16 $ 1,753.00 9

**SCR




VRF Systems

Page 14 of 41

Options Included:

All indoors quantities are 1 per ton of ODU size, cassettes with TAR-40, maxi blue pump,
architectural surround and bachet interface. When 20 tons or over central controller is used
with bacnet master in leau of bacnet interface. Outdoors have low ambient kits and 24"

stand
P-Series 1:1, cassettes, surrounds, TAR-40, maxi blue, and low ambient wind baffles with stand
Heat Pump Heat Recovery P Series
Tonnage Sell Price Tonnage Sell Price Tonnage Sell Price

6 S 29,668.00 6 $ 31,795.00 1 $ 3,979.00
8 S 35,851.00 8 S 40,415.00 2 $ 5,173.00
10 S 42,080.00 10 S 50,315.00 3 $ 7.046.00
12 S 49,538.00 12 $ 58,204.00
14 S  58,569.00 14 $ 69,840.00
16 S 66,064.00 16 $ 77,340.00
18 S 76,975.00 18 $ 90,345.00
20 S  82,371.00 20 $ 9598000
22 S  95,288.00 22 $ 105,778.00
24 $  101,478.00 24 $ 112,914.00
26 $ 107,668.00 26 $ 126,691.00
28 S  114,533.00 28 S 135,998.00
30 $  120,723.00 NA S -
32 S 127,503.00 32 $ 153,155.00
34 $ 135,455,00 NA 5 -
36 S 142,235.00 36 S 162,255.00




Aerco Boilers
Freight and Start Up included

Aerco BMK
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Size Sell Price

AM Series {Small Boilers)

1000 MBH 32,831.00

Size Sell Price

2000 MBH 48,048.00

399 MBH | $12,864.00

4000 MBH 90,035.00

Innovation (HW Heaters)

5000 MBH 101,330.00

Size Sell Price

$
$
3000 MBH| $  66,463.00
$
$
S

6000 MBH 116,069.00

1660 $ 34,530.00

1350 $ 43,020.00




Indoor Air Quality

Plasma Air

Size Sell Price

PAGOO S 594,00

https://www.plasma-air.com/

IVP Air
Model # Description: Sell Price
Vi Unit for Large Room $27,233.00
R1 Room Unit for Small Room | $12,054.00
T1 Personal Size Unit $2,214.00
NBDF Novel Biodefense Filter 54,018.00
NBDC Novel Biodefense Controller| $5,625.00

httos://ivpair.com/

Novaerus
Model Number Description Sell Price
Novaerus Defend 1050 Large Conference Rooms S 21,850.00
Novaerus NV200 NV 200 handles up to 200 sq.ft 5 2,336.00
Novaerus NV300 NV 900 handles up to 900 sa.ft. S 3,948.00
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HVAC Egquipment

Trane Air Cooled Scroll Chillers

High effic, comprehensive sound, Louvers, elastomeric isolators, low temp

Options:  |evap, wide ambient copper cond, terminal block, bacnet
Model CGAMIM
Tonnage |Sell Price
20 $29,654.00
30 $37,668.00
40 $46,525.00
52 $51,789.00
60 $57,400.00
70 $60,769.00
30 $69,003.00
90 $74,348.00
100 $82,618.00
110 $86,943.00
120 $91,578.00
130 $99,703.00
Trane Screw Chillers
High efficient, 513A, wide ambient or low, standard 2 pass cooling, variable
condenser fans, variable speed compressors, circuit breaker, Bacnet,
Options:  |isolators, louvers
Model RTAF
Tonnage |Sell Price
115 S 96,664.00
130 S 102,058.00
150 S 112,429.00
170 S 118,831.00
180 S 125,520.00
200 $  135,151.00
215 S 143,225.00
230 $  148,600.00
250 S 157,089.00
270 S 144,234.00
280 $  181,469.00
310 S 195,665.00
350 S 211,555.00
390 5 194,783.00
410 S 244,049.00
450 S  263,371.00
500 $ 277,211.00
520 S 255,388.00
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