

ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS							
Bid: IFB No. 23-15 HVAC Upgrades at Hillman, McIntosh, Gregory & Nashold Schools							
Due: Thursday, December 15, 2022							
Time: 2:00 pm (6th FL Conference Rm)							
Vendor Name	Base Bid 1 - Hillman	Base Bid 2 - McIntosh	Base Bid 3 -Gregory	Base Bid 4 -Nashold	Addenda Received*	Bid Bond Received*	Required Documentation
Helm Mechanical	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Y	Y	Y
Stenstrom	\$1,997,000.00	\$1,340,000.00	\$453,000.00	\$2,764,000.00	Y	Y	Y
Scandrol Construction Co.	\$2,161,357.00	\$1,467,673.00	\$592,465.00	\$2,715,441.00	Y	Y	Y
Sjostrom & Sons, Inc.	\$2,300,000.00	\$1,485,000.00	\$650,000.00	\$3,150,000.00	Y	Y	Y
Bid Opening Official:							
Bid Recording Official:							

ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS					
Bid: IFB No. 23-15 HVAC Upgrades at Hillman, McIntosh, Gregory & Nashold Schools					
Due: Thursday, December 15, 2022					
Time: 2:00 pm (6th FL Conference Rm)					
Vendor Name	Combination Bid	Breakdown/Individual Cost - Hillman	Breakdown/Individual Cost - McIntosh	Breakdown/Individual Cost -Gregory	Breakdown/Individual Cost -Nashold
Helm Mechanical	\$6,770,000.00	\$2,040,000.00	\$1,370,000.00	\$580,000.00	\$2,780,000.00
Stenstrom	\$6,490,000.00	\$1,997,000.00	\$1,340,000.00	\$453,000.00	\$2,764,000.00
Scandroli Construction Co.	\$6,936,936.00	\$2,161,357.00	\$1,467,673.00	\$592,465.00	\$2,715,441.00
Sjostrom & Sons, Inc.	\$7,585,000.00	\$2,300,000.00	\$1,485,000.00	\$650,000.00	\$3,150,000.00
Bid Opening Official:					
Bid Recording Official:					