b

GREENWICH PUBLIC SCHOOLS
MEAT, GROCERIES & DRY GQODS BID 2J §;-2&-REQUEST FORM

VENDOR NAME: #  thurston foods

For the Period From: Septmeber 1, 2022 Thru: June 30, 2023

APPROX.
VENDOR # ] ITEM NAME CASE PACK ALT. BRAND MOS. USAGE {TEM # PRICE
I SIZE f PACK
MEAT / FISH / POULTRY / ENTREE
......... 3 0938 AVOCADO GUACAMOLE -CS 12H#ICS Simplot 20090 56.81
_____ “ BACON-PRECOOK / Farmland or Tyson 300/CS Farmiand / Cudahy 400 20100 72.73
m_"m"m_mm:BEEFuGROUND- 80/20 LB N Farms (6/5tb) ) 400 20251 127.84 4,26
....... 4 2386 BEEF.GROUND - Local, All Natural, Humanely Raised - Fresh or Frz. LB i 127.84 4.26
mm:“_f:gﬁgz_'BEEF-PAT]'Y—BDIZO-M# 40/4 0z/CS N Farms 40 20330 42,61
_______ 4 2SOOBEEF PATTY - Local, All Natural, Humanely Raised - Flat Frozen 4044 0z/CS Pineland 57.33
_________ 3 762QBEEF— SAND STEAKS Maid Rite (64/2.50z) a7 20521 51.28
. i LB 800 20800 8,71
132/3.750z. /C8 - 20 20760 i 116.88
352pc/CS o 425 20810 123.43
54/3.00z/CS 40 20850 48.60
60/3.5302/CS 140 20880 68.07
approx. 92/CS 100.18
4M1C#ICS Packer o 20770 98,35
o Tyson (96ct) B 46.85
60/8.502/C8 Tyson (60/80z) 21 105—" 34.71
96/3.50z/CS Tyson 21110 94.52
48/302./C8 53/60zTyson 60.90
10# BOX Tyson - 60 21200 65.82
2/58ICS - Brakebush 74 21670 54.82
2/5/ICS 21630
495PC./24LB/CS american bean ‘ ""89.50
53/3.6 OZ/CS 40/40z highliner i highlin 21710 28.20

1601 OZICS highliner 21740 29.20




) FRENCH TOAST STIX Cargil #40097
| FRZ SAUCE-ALFREDO (Roma)

FZN SAUCE-CRM PESTO
....................  LASAGHA- MEAT

VENDOR #
30845 LASAGNAVEGETABLE

ITEM NAME

......................

PEPPERON] / TURKEY
CHEESE BRD STK Bulk / Wild Mike's - 11001/17002

SOUP / GHILI CON CARNE / Kettle Cuisine

SOUP / CLAM CHOW / MANHAT / Kettie Cuisine

SOUP / CR. OF ASPARAGUS / Ketfle Cuisine
SOUP / CR OF BROCCOLI/ Kettle Cuisine
SOQUP / CREAM OF MUSHROOM / Kettle Cuisine

S0OUP / CR OF POTATO { Ketile Cuisine

SQUP / FRENCH ONION / Kettle Cuisine

SOUP / MINESTRONE [ Kettie Cuisine

10#/CS hummel uncured 4/53# 95.45

5I2HCS 108/1dozbake 180 21890 23.01

232 0ZICS JTM (6/51b) 30 21900 68.01

2032 0ZICS i Carla (2/320z) 21920 34.25

AIBHICS Stouffer 21980 85.56
CASE PACK ALT. BRAND/ SIZE {PACK  MOS. USAGE ITEM #

415.754ICS Stouffer (4/960z) 21990 71.03

144113 02JCS a0 22350 25.19

108CS 5 22410

108CS Jennie O (8/2.51b avg) - 120.60 6.03%

112168 tasty 144/20z 100 22420 73.85

20/20.402/CS rich 18170z 22575 38.28

72/5.4902/CS 40 22500 75.19

De iorios 58.41

2/5%/CS 22695 53.30

4128CS Carla 2/3Ib 22624

108GS 44.89

108CS Genoa o 22630 31.48

214775 02/10# CS - 150 22640 46,93

10#/CS 3B 22680 3239

2M1GAL Keftke 2/8% 22700 51.75

2HGAL 22730

2MGAL ketile 2/8# 50 ozr40 48.30

PHGAL kettle 2/6# 50 22740 52.80

2HGAL 36 22750

2MGAL 35 22780

2MGAL keflle 2/6# 35 22790 58.95

2HGAL 3-5 22810

2GAL 35 22820

21GAL Y

21 GAL 35 22850

211GAL 35 22880

2HGAL s 2mses

21GAL ketlle 2/6% 35 22890 48.85

2MGAL T35 22000




[ htenaton fowta

5 SOUP / PASTA FAGIOLI / Kettle Cuisine 2MGAL keitle 2/8# 3-5 22910 48.00
SOUP / SPLIT PEA W/HAM [ Kettie Cuisine 2M1GAL . 35 22020

________________ SOUP / TOM.GARD.VEG. / Kettle Cuisine 2HGAL 35 22940
T S0UP I TOM.TORTELLIN Kettle Guisine 2HGAL 35 22045
T soUP  VEGETABLE / Kettle Guisine 2MGAL s 22050
............. SOUP / VEGETABLE BEEF / Kettle Cuisine 2M1GAL 3-5 22860

2MGAL o (1710Ib) 50 23050 2494

210#/CS jennieo 4/5# 90 23130 £0.91

144113 02JCS 26.62

VENDOR # ITEM NAME CASE PACK ALT. BRAND | SIZE/ PACK MOS, USAGE ITEM # PRICE
FROZEN FRUIT & VEGETABLES

42332 ASIAN BLEND 12/2.541CS Chill (12/2"‘.)) 36.24

30# [ CS N Caro . .':3‘0200 55.23

122,541 CS Comer (12/21b) - 30.48

1202.5%1CS T Cormer (12/41b) 41.82

122,561 CS Chill (12/21b) 30.55

1212541 CS Chil s aoss0 30.87

B2 5#1CS o Simplot 10 36690 42 49

Gi2.5%#1CS Simplot 15 30630 41.29

41gal Real L (1/1gal} 43.80

argal Real L (1/1gal) 51.14

MIREPOIX 1/5# slo - 9.66

0 PEAS & GARROTS 1202541 CS Chill (12/21b) 30850 26.58

GIS# I CS 350 s0080 29.84

62541 CS 25 30900 37.28

6/5%1CS Simplot 150 31000 35.55

B/5# f CB 12 -31010 49.58"

AREICS e e e 29.55"

I0#ICS _ Bonfil . . 54,03

98904 ACA| PUREE (Tambor-Unsweetened) 60 /3.520z/CS sfoi6/4ct 62.45



DAIRY / CHEESES JUICE

29042 CHEESE / AMERICAN YEL / BLOCK

32706 FRUIT JUICE / ORANGE / Sun Cup
VENDOR # ITEM NAME
98614 STRING CHEESE

BAKED GOODS / FROZEN

40953 BAGEL/ FZN / WHITE WHOLE GRAIN/ Lenders

B/SHICS

4/5#/CS

6/5#ICS

LB

AISHICS

45//ICS

LB

LB

L8

415#ICS

12#CS

LB

LB

100/CS

8MB8CT/CS

5/5#1CS

70/4 DZICS

70/4021CS
CASE PACK

160/102/C8

6/320CZ/CB

6/320Z/C5

4814 0Z/CS

T21202.1CS
100/2.25/CS
240/1.502/CS
168/1.502/CASE
240/1.33 0z/CS
240f1.5 0z/CS

Great Lakes 25 40440 70.83
Bongard/Great Lakes 100 40160 51.76
Bongard (4/51b) 40165 51.87
Great Lakes 300 40170 3.48
Bengard/Great Lakes 40180 63.93
8/1.5#Bongard e i 5,94
Cucina (2/8lb} 49.55 3.10#
Cortona 300 40200 309
Bongard/Great Lakes 40210 69:é1.
Cucina 12 40230 45.9%
Mama {1/8lb avg) TTa20 ap250 3.98
Cortona 450 40260 3_22‘
110 40310 37.68
Michael {12/12ct) 40420 37.75
Deb El 40580 69.59
Ardmore 200 41020 10.93
Ardmore 165 41170 12.02
ALT. BRAND / SIZE { PACK MOS. USAGE ITEM # i
Land o Lake 168/i0z 40 42240 40.27
2 week lead time 50 42950 19.58
2 week lead time 50 42990 19.58
_____ 2 week lead time - i quote
150 70050 24.58
Pillsbury (120/2.250z) 70150 2701
224/1.35 euro 70500 49.25
Wenner (144/1.502) 70510 59.56

carnival 59.48

57.35 carn59.48

carnival 56.36

52.31 carn56.36



CROISSANTS / SLICED (Hadley Farms)
CROISSANTS / SLICED - WGR (Hadley Farms)

MLIFF BAT 7/ BLUE BERRY / Karps or David's
MUFF BAT f CHIP O PLENTY / Karps or David's

MUFF BAT / FRENCH TOAST / Karps or David's
MUFE BAT/ RAISIN BRAN / Karps or David's

PIE SHELLS / DEEPR DISH

PRETZELS / SOFT / FRZ / WGR / New York Pretzel

TORTILLA / FLOUR / 6" f Solis or Mission
TORTILLA 7 FLOUR / 10" / Soiis or Mission

DRY GOODS
ALMOND BUTTER
""""""""" 0 APPLESAUGE / ALL NATURAL
5085 APPLES / SLICED / ALL NATURAL
VENDOR # ITEM NAME

2605 ARTICHOKE HEARTS/MARINATED

0 BAKING SODA /12124
BAR / ZEE-ZEE/ GINNAMON CRISP 2.2 OZ.

320M1.0 02/C8

(384/10z) carnival 60.13

Thwnstor  Fots

55.81 carn60.13

320/1.0 02/CS (384/10z) 55.81
144/2 202/CS 15 70730 51.78'
144/2.202/CS 15 70730 53.90
50/1.25/CS Sara Lee 70790 18.50
5214.25 0ZICS Pillsbury 50 70840 52.26
6 DZ/CS o 70850 36.41
12/10/CS Kronos 70900 40.17
18# TUB davids 1 week lead time 2/8# 25 71010 36.36
18# TUB brill-1 week lead time 2/8# 300 71012 55.99
18# TUB }1 week lead time 80 71015 ) 61.05
18# TUB karp1 week lead time 2/8# 25 71020 i 57.75
18%# TUB Karps 1 week lead time 71080 60.17
18# TUB Davids (2/8Ib) 1 week lead time
18%# TUB Karps 1 week lead time 71050 47.65
20/C8 Chef P 71065 36.03
?/1.00z/CS
100/ 2.502 1 CS J&J (100/2.202) a5 71080 26.10
1241202/ CS 50 71620
12M12/CS (24/12¢t) 71620 40.82
12M2/CS - father sam 71630 30.56
24/12/CS 71670 35.98
6/12CT/CS (12M12ct) 71700 38,70
6/12/CS (8/12ct) 120 71600 34,59
emtolcs Sunsource B - 50100 38.89"
B#10/CS White House 50150 63.88
CASE PACK ALT, BRAND [ SIZE | PACK MOS. USAGE ;TEM P PRICE
6/3 KGICS neT Lt Packer 50160 48.83
54 BAG Packer 6/5# s0190 117.98
58 CTR 104 packer 4M0# 50201 101.31
12/281C8 Packer o sozs0 2307
52.56




1 BEANS / CANELINI / Low-Sodium / Furmano

....... PRI Y

2885 BEANS / GARBANZO f Low-Sodium / Furmano

6/10/CS
B810/CS
GH10/CS
Bf#10/CS
6/#10/CS
B6A10/CS
6#10/CS
GIGHICS
65#/CS
6/5%# C5

96 EA/CS
96 EA/CS
96 EA/CS
96 EA/CS
98 EA/CS
96 EA/CS
96 EA/CS
98 EA/CS
4BAGS/CS
1216.502/C8
B8410/CS
BIM#CS
213#CS
butk
25#1C8
24#11CS
2411C8
2/48 0ZICS
6i#10/CS
412, 25HCS

4 oz [ CAN
4/1 GALICS

52.56

- 52.56

50620 34.29

50630 3879

- 52020 34.06

- 50650 35.85
. 52020 34,60
50670 4B.87

N Sunsource 50700 31.82
50780 35.80

Continental Mills 50790 40.57

50795 .

G Mills 15 51140 27.45

G Mills 15 sus0 27.45
G Mills 15 51210 2745

Kellogg 15 54240 31.56

Kellogg 15 51280 31.56

Kellogg 15 51270 31.56

15 51320

T mmom (4/320z) a0 51330 21.23
(6/20.80z) 51450 44 66

Lachoy 51500 37.26

_5-1-570 18.43

B/1# frito B0 51650 17.25
51660 8060

Unipro o 26.65

Argo 52100 26.93

Ocean Spray 7410 18.11
Rubykist 52200 52.74

Fresh G (4/2.51b) 52250 28.86

52540 48.81




M%

_________ 17500 DRESSING / BLUE CHEESE / Cains 411 GAL [CS Kens 52550 88.71
17483 DRESSING / CREAMY CEASAR / Ker's 411 GAL ICS 52560 66.65
VENDOR # ITEM NAME CASE PACK ALT. BRAND | SIZE { PACK MOS. USAGE ITEM # PRICE
DRESSING / RANGH / Hidden Vallsy 411 GALICS 52570
80 DRESSING MIX / ITALIAN / Good Seasons 1206 OZICS (12/80z) 52580 57.55
18 PKGICS 52600 36,18
seAUCS T 52610 58.34
41 GALICS
4’1 GAUCS ---------
Qy Thurston 52741 . 2.02
225HBAGS G Milis 53000 28.47
2111#CS ™ 53180 71.41
211#CS 53190 66.51
121LTRICS N 53570 10.57
12/58ICS Highland 53590 49.07
1216ICS Highland 53600 52.37
81LSICS - 35.07
8/1LBICS h 39.09
5% UG Barkman saron 158.02
BA10/CS ror oo Agal 53900 3523
B10/CS Polaner 54000 51.45
10#/CS Packer 54100 21.42
02 JIMMIES / DARK GREEN / No Art Golor or Flavor 10#iCS Packer 54130 19.77
040 KETGHUP / TOMATO / HEINZ No HFG 6H0/CS o 54210 3336
T KETCHUP 1 TOMATO / No HFC BA10/CS )
________ 6160 LEMON JUICE / PLASTIC BOTTLE 12/QTICS 1 gal reallemon T 54300 43.80
_________ 14060 MAGARONI / BOWTIES 2HOHCS Zia (1/10lb) 54490 14.08
14000 MACARONI / ELEOWS 2HOBICS Zia 40 sas00 22.84
2M10#/CS Barilla ' 54530 25.43
204/CS ' Zia (2/101b) 54550 22.84
2011HCS Valdig 40 54600 2523
21108/CS Zia a0 54620 2284
108/CS Zia saga0 14.53
21108/CS Zia 21.88

4IGALICS 10 54850 73.70




MILK / SOY / SHELF STABLE / PLAIN / UNSWEETENED
MILK f ORGANIC / HORIZON

14180 NOCODLES [ EGG/ MEDIUM

...... TTPRT T

10460 OATS ! ROLLED

13685 OIL/ OLIVE / PURE
VENDOR #
18795 OLIVES /BLACK/ SLICED

ITEM NAME

9 PACKS/ BALSAMIC VINEGARETTE / Ken's
2 PACKS / DRSG / HONEY-MUSTARD / Ken's

21195 PACKS / MUST / YEL / HEINZ

........... brsatiraiss

21340 PACKS / PEPPER

PACKS f PURE MAPLE SYRUP / Natural / Dip Cup
5 PACKS / TACO SAUCE / Qrtega or Old ElPaso

12/4#1C8
BIS#ICS
1 QT
1/2 PINTS
A4GALICS
2/5#ICS
12142 OZ/ICS
12142 OZICS
671GAL./CB
43LTR/CS
CASE PACK
6MO#ICS
63#ICS
100/CS
200/CS
60/1.5/CS
60/1.5/CS
B80/1.5/C8
B0/1.5/C8
80/1.5/C8
60/1.5/C8
60/1.5 CZ/CS
200/Cs
1000 EA/CS
200 EA/CS
500 EAJCS
3000/CS
200 EA/CS
2000 EA/ICS
3/1000/CS
2000/CS
2000/CS
10011 .5 OZ/C8

200 CA/CS

Kraft 35 54870 17.76

Bay Valley 54880 140.40

Pearl (12/320z) 30.03

- (18/80z) 2467

Supreme 54960 14.?7'_

Zia 55000 23.47

Ralston 55040 69.51

MOM 55040 36.62

Laspag {6/960z) 12 57480 56.52

Sovena 12 57480 76.10
ALT.BRAND/SZE/PACK  MOS.USAGE ITEM # PRICE

Noeast 55080 45.34

- Nifda 55100 8294

(100/10z) dia crys 55160 17.44

10 55255 18.57

10 55260 19.41

o 55290 17.30

10 55310 1472

o 10 55315 20.52

10 55320 19.40

10 55330 18.24

o 55345 15.68

red gold 40 55380 23.91

(210/.3802) T T en ss420 20.47

T ssaso 13.44

Dixie 55650 1314

55570 11.88

dom 56650 18.72

Dixie (1/3000ct) 55660 10.14

55680 3638

55690 27.13

D Crys (100/10z) 200 es7a0 15.74

dic 200 ea 55750 10.31




21510 PACKS / TARTAR SAUCE

......... pevnsaianbati

2345 PEACHES / DICED / JUICE PACKED

0 PANCAKE BATTER/Aunt Jemima (Complete)
3 PAN COATING - Unipro or Vegelean
3 PAN COATING / BAKING - Unipro or Vegelean

20595 SALSA / THICK'N CHUNKY (Oriega)

VENDOR #
17586 SAUCE /BBQ/ No HFC

7 SPICE [ CHILI POWDER

ITEM NAME

200/CS Heinz 55760 14.09
6I5HICS gold - 55790 37.35
617 0ziCS Versa 55800 26.77
6MTozCS 26.77
BRH0/CS north not usa 30 55850 54.52
6/5% TUBICS Highland 56000 55.98
BRA0/CS furmano 56040 5276
12126 02/ CS Embasa 56250 57.99
4IGALICS - Packer 31.14
BH10/CS Heinz T se260 40.02
12146 02/CS B Rubykist 56390 45.90
6/410/CS 50 eeas0 45.61
6/3.54/CS T 8260z natural idaho 56500 60.44
6/10/CS Libby 57000 57.94

Ambros (2/5ib) 38.50
10#ICS Thomps 57090 22,09
25H/BAG Producers 25 57290 19.85
4/GAL/CS la victoria 57560 59.63

CASEPACK ALT.BRAND/SIZE/PACK  MOS. USAGE ITEM # PRICE

4IGALICS - Kens 57600 50,36
6/106 OZ BAG/CS 51420 77.95
4IGALCS 57650 59.36
4IGALICS Trappy " 57790 33.06
28 OZ/CTR Sriracha (12/280z) 57.33
4/GALICS Lachoy (1/1gal) 57600 i858
4/GALCS Myron (2/640z) 57840 42.19
AHGALICS Packer 57910 31.66
BH10/CS - Sunsource " 58000 39.92
48/1.5 0z/CS Dixie 58060 52.99
48/4 02/CS Diarnond 58070 24.80
12150 02/CS Campbell 58800 3344
24 OZICTR HM (1/200z) se0s0 11.78
12 0ZICTR HM (1/702) 59100 17.15
16 OZICTR HM 59200 4.80

Thossrtrn Pk



27246 SPICE / THYME
VENDOR # ITENM NAME
8583 BASE / MAJOR / BEEF / No MSG
8900 BASE / MAJOR / CHICKEN / No MSG

12345 SUGAR / LIGHT BROWN

22 :‘.:)ESUGAR I CRYSTAL / RED

......... TP

22953 SUGAR / CRYSTAL / GREEN

crndanrntnidndn

16 OZICTR
16 OZICTR
28 OZ/ICTR
16 GZ/ICTR
23 0ZICTR
16 OZICTR
16 QZICTR
28 QZICTR
16 OZ/ICTR
14 OZICTR
16 OZ/ICTR
20 OZICTR
24 OZICTR
16 OZ/ICTR
16 OZICTR
16 OZ/ICTR
16 OZICTR
12 OZICTR
16 OZ/ICTR
10 QZ/CTR
§ OZ/ICTR
16 OZ/ICTR
24/26 0z/CS
1213%#/C8
16 OZICTR
33 OZICTR
CASE PACK
BMH#HICS
BMHICS

6/3.5#/CS
B/3.5#CS
24]1#ICS
8#ICS
8RICS

HM 59250

HM 59300
spice mill (1/320z} 59350 17.14
HM 59380 6.30
HM (1/2502) 50450 8.61
FIM (11902) 59500 721
spice mill 59600 10.71
''''' spice mil (1/2002) 59630 12.53

HM (1/3.502)

HM (1/160z) 59550
B HM 59700 12.56
HM 59750 5.33
HM (1/50z) segs0 4.95
HM 53800 5.04
HM (1/100z) 59950 14,83
HM " Boooo 7.34
HM 60010 0.47
HM 60050 3.90
HM 50100 14.91
HM (1/120z) 60150 10.85
o HM (4/902) 60170 5.16
HM (1/60z) 60180 6.91
i Unipro 60200 1813
Cargil 60210 84.53
18oz spice mill 60260 8.52
HM (1H202) T 60300 10.45

ALT. BRANDSIZE/PACK  MOS. USAGE [TEM # PRICE
50350 28.06
- - T P
6/1ib) T 41.56
Foothill (12/280z) 60400

6/550z sugar foods 78.13
Domino (12/2) 60500 28
Spaitow 60510 20.14
Sparrow (1/51b) 60520 10.72




23863 SUN BUTTER

.............. peneaiss

TACO SHELLS / REGULAR WGR (Mission)
TEA / HERBAL (Bigelow)

0 VINEGAR / CIDER
0 VINEGAR / RED WINE

SNACKS
11247 CRACKERS/ GRAHAM

DISTILLED WATER
6759

VENDOR # ITEM NAME

/ Aeesajba

2411#ICS Domine (12/2Ib) 60550 28.11
50%/BG Demine s0800 40.61
2158#1CS o 60700 39.77
BIZ5/CS - tyson 60800 165?
6/28 PKT/CS o -&‘{}880 18.77
10100 PKTICS 60900 47.53ﬂ
6172 PKTICS 60910 41.20
B8A10/CB Hunts gwo0 58.08"
3M10/CS JHS T gt4t0
6/5#1CS - irice (64%10) 61120 75.67
4/50 0Z. /C5 MOM 61140 3973
B8HH10/ICS s1130 63‘20
25#/C8 NBC 61160 91.00
6/66.5 0zICS Starkist 4G 51200 71.59
6/66.5 02/CS Starkist - 90.91
4{GALICS Ambian (2/8liter) - 40.28
4{GALICS Supreme 10.17
4IGALICS Packer 61350 11.50
4/GALICE Packer 61400 9.66
BIARICS BDiamond —6-1‘5‘50 127.18
4/GAL/CS WIET LS Savor 29.57
150/3PK/CS Keebler 12 75180 19,32
500/2 PK/CS kebbler 75200 14.83
soozpRicS T 25 75220 51.48
SOOPKICS L —m—m——— 25 75240 51.48
10z. / PK (100/1.250z) 33.32
4GALCS Packer (6/1gal) 16.42
CASE PACK ALT. BRAND / SIZE { PACK MOS. USAGE ITEM # PRICE



...................... TORTILLA - BROWN RICE- Food For Life & per pack - (579 each)
98098 BUN GF - HAMBURGER- Pinnacle 24/2.4 0z {24/3.202) 2586
9951 ‘[ BUN GF - HOT DOG- Pinnacle 24124 0z 24.14
24/350z SOVt
12 oz Bag .
_ CHIX-THIGH/BONELESS/SKINLESS/ Organic AMGHICS _
..................... CHIX~ THIGH / Organie ‘
................... CHIX-QUARTERS / Organic 60/8.502/C8
":::m““mmjCHIX«DRUMSTICKS / Organic 56/3.502/CS
i TCH]X BREAST / BONELESS / SKINLESS / 6-80z / Organic 4HG# NAE fresh random gold o 254.10
:.Applegate Farm (Nitrate Free) Natural Breakfast Sausage
GOLEMAN NATURAL PRODUCTS
63250 NAE FC Breaded Chicken Breast Tender {13306) 4/518/C8 sfo 63250 nae proview e ‘14500
35932 NAE FC Breaded Gluten Free Tenderloins {13203) 10LB/CS Natural 2/5#
i NAE RTC Ground Turkey - 90/10 {30270} 4/8187/CS
NAE RTC Dark Meat Turkey Burgers (30176) 40/ 40z 1 CS -
NAE FC Diced Chicken Breast (27250) prsLBICS T e T
_______________ NAE FC Sous-Vide Style Drumsticks, Frozen (30275} 8/12ea./CS
"""" MNAE FC Beef Hot Dogs, 2 oz, {19655) B0 ea/CS . ~ .

16797 shelf stable milk
16799 shelf stable milk

¥ R U%P\}@XQQP& oot .



GREENWICH PUBLIC SCHOOLS

MEAT, GROCERIES & DRY GOODS BIBz387-2& REQUEST FORM

VENDOR NAME:

ePallet, Inc.

For the Period From: Septmeber 1, 2022 Thru: June 30, 2023

VENDOR # ITEM NAME

MEAT / FISH / POULTRY / ENTREE
AVOCADO GUACAMOLE -C8

. BACON-PRECQOK / Farmland or Tyson
BEEF-GROUND- 80/20

No Bid )
No Bid

{5042 BEEF-PATTY-80/20-44
NoBtd BEEF PATTY - Local, All Natural, Humanely Raised - Flat Frozen
NoBid  BEEF- SAND STEAKS
‘NoBid  BEEF-PRECOOKED-Triple M
NoBid  CHIX-NAE Breast Breaded- Tyson 70302-0928
‘NoBid  GHIX-NAE TENDER- Tyson #70332-0028
e A Gt B e T 50,0828
™" GHIX-NAE Breast Filet Tyson Red Label 38313-0928
. CHIX-NAE Breaded Drumsticks - Tyson 666010-0828
" CHIX-THIGH/BONELESS/SKINLESS/IQF-NAE
"~ CHIX - THIGH / 1QF- NAE
" CHIX-QUARTERS-IQF-NAE
 CHIX-DRUMSTICKS-IQF-NAE
" CHIX BREAST/BONELESS/SKINLESSAQF/ NAE
""" CHIX- DICED/ ALL WHITE/ 3/4 INCH- NAE
" CHIX - FAJITA / NAE
'EGG PLANT / CUTLET / NON-BREADED
™" FALAFEL / AMER. BEAN / MEDITERRANEAN STYLE / #1002-24
" FISH-POLLOCK FILET
" FISH-TRIDENT BAHA FISH STICK #418304

'BEEFwGROUND - Local, All Natural, Humanely Raised - Fresh or Frz,

CASE PACK

12/1#/CS
300/Cs

LB

LB

40/4 0z/CS
40/4 0z/CS

LB
132/3.7502./C8
352pc/CS

54 {300z/CS
60/3.5302/CS
approx. 92/CS
4HORCE

60/8.50z/CS
96/3.50z/C3
48/30z. /1 CS
104 BOX
2/58/CS

2/581C8
495PC./24LB/CS
53/3.6 OZICS
160/1 OZ/CS

APPROX.
ALT. BRAND MOS. USAGE ITEM # PRICE
I SEE | PACK
20090
400 20100
Branding fron 400 20251 $5.66/1b.
Branding Iron 40 20330 $5.35/b.
37 20521
600 20600
20 20760
425 20810
40 20850
140 20880
20770
21100
21110
60 21200
75 21670
21630
21710

21740




VENDOR #

No B_id_

..N.O Bid
i PEPPERONI/ PRE-SLICED Nitrale Free

N

ITEM NAME

FRANKFURTER - ALL BEEF 8/1 (Un-Cured Hummell Bros.)
FRENCH TOAST STIX Cargill #40097
FRZ SAUCE-ALFREDO (Roma)

FZN SAUCE-CRM PESTO

'LASAGNA- MEAT

ITEM NAME
LASAGNA-VEGETABLE
PANCAKES/Bake Crafters WG Buttermilk Bulk #1475

PEPPERONI/ TURKEY

CHEESE BRD STK Bulk / Wild Mike's - 11001/11002
PIZZA SHELLS / Wild Mike's 16"/8-cut - 00063

PIZZA | Wild Mike's 8-cut / 4 Cheese - 20311

"PIZZA / SHELLS - 6"

PORK / SMOKED / Kayem Product Code: 1534

" RAVIOLI SPINACH

SAUSAGE / ITALIAN CHICKEN / Longhi

.SAUSAGEI ITALIAN / MILD / 10#
SAUSAGE LINKS/ Jones All Natural Chicken Break 018657

SAUSAGE PATTIE 2 oz./ Jones All Natural 018750

" SOUP / BROCCOLI WICHEESE /Ketile Cuisine
SOUP / CHICKEN DUMPLING / Kettle Cuisine

SOUP / CHICKEN NOCDLE / Kettle Cuisine

™" SOUP / CHICKEN TORTILLA / Kettle Cuisine
SOUP / CHILI CON CARNE / Kettle Cuisine

SOUP / CLAM CHOW / MANHAT / Kettle Cuisine

" SOUP /N E CLAM CHOWDER / Kettle Cuisine
SOUP / CR. OF ASPARAGUS / Kettle Cuisine

SOUP / CR OF BROCCOLI / Ketile Cuisine

" SOUP / CREAM OF MUSHROOM/ Kettle Cuisine
SOUP / CR OF POTATO [/ Kettle Cuisine

SOUP / FRENCH ONION / Kettle Cuisine

" SOUP / GUMBO SAUSAGE / Ketlle Cuisine

SOUP / [TALIAN WEDDING / Kettle Cuisine

£ Jaflet —tne.

CASE PACK ALT. BRAND MOS. USAGE ITEM # PRICE

10#/C8

5/28#/CS 180 21880
2/320ZICS 30 214900
2132 0ZICS 21920
4/6#CS 21980

CASE PACK ALT, BRAND/ SIZE/PACK  MOS, USAGE ITEM # PRICE

4/5.75#/CS 21680
144/1.3 0zJCS 40 22350
10#ICS 5 22410
10#/CS

112/C8 100 22420
20/20.40z/CS 22575
72/5.490z/CS 40 22690
2/6#1C8 22605
4/2#/CS 22624
10#/CS

10#/CS 22630
214175 o2/10R C8 130 22640
10#/CS 35 22680
2MGAL 22700
2I1GAL 22730
2I1MGAL 50 22740
21GAL 50 22740
211GAL 3-5 22750
211GAL 3-5 22780
2M1GAL 35 22790
2MGAL 35 22810
2I1MGAL 3-5 22820
2HGAL 3-5 22840
2MGAL 35 22850
211GAL 35 22880
2MGAL 35 22885
2MGAL 35 22890




VENDOR # ITEM NAME
No Bid SOUP / MINESTRONE / Ketlle Cuisine
‘NoBd  SOUP/PASTA FAGIOLI/ Ketlle Cuisine
NoBid  SOUP/SPLIT PEA W/HAM/ Ketile Cuisine

SOUP / TOM.GARD.VEG. / Kettle Cuisine

" SOUP ) TOM.TORTELLIN /Kettle Cuisine

" SOUP / VEGETABLE / Kettle Cuisine

" SOUP / VEGETABLE BEEF / Ketile Cuisine

" TORTELLINI / CHEESE Pede Bros.

" TURKEY / GROUND / All Natural / Humanely Raised
" WAFFLES / Bake Crafters WG Gourmet Bulk #1453

VENDOR # ITEM NAME

FROZEN FRUIT & VEGETABLES

No Bid ASIAN BLEND
1007179199007 BLUEBERRIES / FROZEN
1007179824664 BROCCOLI/ FLORETS

‘No E BUTTERNUT SQUASH / MASHED
7 CAULIFLOWER / FLORETS
1007179187332 CORN / WHOLE KERNEL
1007179522768 EDAMAME
1007179677796 GRILLED PEPPERS & ONIONS
NoBid JUICE / LEMON

NoBid  JUICE/LIME
1071179035060 MIREFOIX

1007117918551 PEAS & CARROTS

"POT. / SWEET POT FRIES-Krinkle Cut / McCain
POTATO / TRIANGLES - Orida/McCain

" POTATO / WEDGE / SEASONED Redstone Macain
28 POTATO / SPUDSTERS - Simplat

7 POTATO/Tater Pals 1/2" Crickle Cuts 1007117922227

CASE PACK
21GAL
2MGAL
2M1GAL
2MGAL
2MGAL
2M1GAL
2MGAL
2MGAL
21108/ICS
144/1.3 02./C3

CASE PACK

12/2.5#/CS
30#/C8
12R2.5#1C8
12125#1C8
12/2.581CS
121258/ CS
6i2.5# 1 CS
6I2.5#1CS

12125%/C8
6/5%#/Cs
6/2.58/C8
6/5%1CS
6/5#71CS
4/5#1C8

€ ﬂz//c'f; Inc

ALT. BRAND MOS, USAGE ITEM# PRICE

3-5 22300

35 22910

3-5 22920

3-5 22940

3-5 22945

3-5 22950

35 22960

50 23050

a0 23130

ALT. BRAND / SIZE f PACK  MOS. USAGE ITEM# PRICE

Simplot 30200 $78.616
Simplot $56.141
Simplot $47.787
Simplot 50 30580 $63.010
Simplot 10 30590 $563.413
Simplot 15 30630 $52.979
Simpiot $47.089
Simplot 30850 $59.954
Simplot 350 30980 $61.721

25 30890

150 31000

12 31010
Simplot $56.668




£ fullel, #re -

VENDOR # ITEM NAME CASE PACK ALT. BRAND MOS. USAGE ITEM # PRICE
16071179199182 STRAWBERRIES / FROZEN 30#/C8 Simplot $93.884

No Bid ACAI| PUREE (Tambor-Unsweetened} 60/3.520z/CS

DAIRY / CHEESE! JUICE

No Bid CHEESE / AMERICAN YEL / BLOCK 6/5#/CS 25 40140

No Bid CHEESE / AMER / SLICED .50z f WHITE 4/5#CS 100 40160

" CHEESE / AMER / SLICED / LOW-FAT .50z / YELLOW 6/5H/CS 40165

CHEESE / CHEDDAR / BLK LB 300 40170
CHEESE / CHEDDAR / SHREDDED 4/5#CS 40180

" CHEESE / CHEDDAR / SLICING AIBHICS
CHEESE / COJITA LB

" CHEESE / FETA LB

CHEESE / MOZZ. / BLOCK (Pait-Skim}) LB 300 40200

" CHEESE / MOZZ f SHREDDED (Part-Skim) AfSHICS 40210

CHEESE / PARM & ROM GRAT 12M#ICS 12 40230
CHEESE / SWISS /12# LB 220 40250

" CHEESE / PROVOLONE # LB 450 40260
CRM CHEESE / PKS / Philly 100/CS 110 40310

" EGGS / HARD BOILED 8118 CT/CS 40420

EGGS / WHITES/LIQ 6/5#1/CS 40560
"""030301 FRUIT JUICE / APPLE / Sun Cup 70/4 OZICS SunCup 200 41020 $12.323
030100 FRUIT JUICE / ORANGE / Sun Cup 70/402/CS SunCup 165 41170 $13.098
VENDOR# ITEM NAME CASEPACK  ALT.BRAND/SIZE/PACK MOS. USAGE ITEM # PRICE

No Bid STRING CHEESE 160/10Z/C8 4G 42240

N YOGURT / STONEYFIELD / LOW-FAT / VANILLA 6/320Z/C8 50 42950

N YOGURT / STONEYFIELD / LOW-FAT / PLAIN 6/320Z/CS 50 42990
No Bid YOGURT / STONEYFIELD / ASSORTED 48/40Z/CS

BAKED GOODS / FROZEN

No Bid BAGEL / EZN / WHITE WHOLE GRAIN/ Lenders 72/202.1CS 150 70050
No Bid BISCUITS / 2.25 OZ 100/2.25/CS 70150

NoBd . PARBAKED / DINNER ROLL 240/ 50z/CS 70500



VENDOR # ITEM NAME

No Bid PAR BAKED / PETIT PAINS

‘NoBid  COOKIES / Sweet Discovery - Asst/ Otis Spunkmeyer
‘NoBid  COOKIES/Red Fat/ASSTWGR Ofis Spunkmeyer
NoBid  COOKIES/Red FaASSTWGR Ofis Spunkmeyer

N COOKIES/Delicious Essentials/Otis Spunlaneyer #55670, #55674
CROISSANTS / SLICED (Hadiey Farms)

CROISSANTS / SLICED - WGR (Hadley Farms)
" DANISH / MINI / VARIETY
" BOUGH ROLL CINN. LOAF / Karps
ENGLISH MUFFIN / THOMAS

PITA BREAD / ROUND / 7
MUFF BAT / BLUE BERRY / Karps or David's

MUFF BAT / CHIP O PLENTY / Karps or David's

id

19203 MUFF BAT / CORN [/ Karps or David's
9207 MUFF BAT / CRAN-NUT / Karps or David's
T MUFF BAT / FRENCH TOAST / Karps of David's
09 MUFF BAT / RAISIN BRAN / Karps or David's
" PIE SHELLS / DEEP DISH
" PRETZELS / SOFT / FRZ / WGR / New York Pretzel
" PRETZELS / SOFT / FRZ / WGR / New York Pretzel
TORTILLA / BROWN RICE
"TORTILLA / WHOLE GRIAN RICH / 6" (Mission)
" TORTILLA / WHOLE GRAIN RICH / 10" (Mission)
" TORTILLA / FLOUR / 6" / Solis or Mission
" TORTILLA / FLOUR / 10" / Solis or Mission
" TORTILLA FLOUR/ 12" Solis or Mission

DRY GOODS

No Bid ALMOND BUTTER

N APPLESAUCE / ALL NATURAL
'No Bid " APPLES / SLICED / ALL NATURAL
S -

ARTICHOKE HEARTSMARINATED

No Bid

CASE PACK
168/1,502/CASE
240/1.33 0z/CS
240/1.5 02/CS
320/1.0 0z/CS
320/1.0 0z/C8
1442 202/CS
144/2.20z/CS
50/1.25/CS
52/4.25 OZ/CS
6 DZ/CS
12/10/CS
18%# TUB
184 TUB
18# TUB
18# TUB
18# TUB
18# TUB
18# TUB
20/C8
?/1.00z/CS
100/ 2.50z / CS
12/120Z1CS
12M2/CS
1212/CS
24M2/CS
6/12CT/C8
6/12/CS

G/10/CS
6/#10/CS

CASE PACK
63 KGICS

= /ﬁ/fa; Foe

ALT. BRAND MOS. USAGE ITEM # PRICE

70510

15 70730

15 70730

70790

50 70840

70860

70500
David's 25 71010 $48.717
David's 300 71012 $48.717
David's &0 71015 48.7197
David's 25 71020 $48.717
David's 71030 $48.717
David's 71050 $48.717

71065

85 71080

50 71620

71620

71630

71670

71700

120 71600

50100

50150

ALT. BRAND 7 SIZE f PACK MOS. USAGE ITEM # PRICE
50160




5/5://6’/7 Fre

VENDOR # ITEM NAME CASE PAGK ALT. BRAND MOS. USAGE ITEM # PRICE
NoBid  BAKER'S COCOA 54 BAG 50190

'No Bid " BAKING POWDER 5% CTR 50201
NOBSd BAKING SODA / 12/2# 12/28/CS 50250

NoBid  BAR/JZEE-ZEE/CINNAMON CRISP 2.2 OZ.

'No Bid 'BAR / ZEE-ZEE | OATMEAL COCOA CHIP 2.2 0Z.

NoBid  BAR/ZEE-ZEE / BERRY APPLE CRISP CRISP 2.2 OZ.

NoBid  BEANS/BLACK!Low-Sadium / Furmano 61£10/CS 50620

‘NoBid  BEANS/CANELINI/ Low-Sodium / Furmano BI#10/CS 50630
‘NoBid  BEANS/GARBANZO / Low-Sodium / Furmano 6#10/CS 52020
"BEANS / KIDNEY/ Low-Sodium / Furmano 6/#10/CS 50650
""" BEANS / PINTO / Low Sodium / Furmano BH10/CS 52020
" BEANS / BAKED / BUSH'S / No-HFC 6/A10/CS 50670
" BEETS/VEG/CS 6#10/CS 50700
_ ' CAKE MiX / BROWNIE / Continental 6/5#/CS 50780
NoBd CAKE MIX | CHOCOLATE / Duncan Hines 6I5#/CS 50790
B OO M GHOCD e Dt o i
" CEREAL / BOWL / HONEY NUT CHERRIOS (WGR) 96 EA/CS 15 51140
" CEREAL / BOWL / CHEERIOS (WGR) 96 EAICS 15 51150
" CEREAL / BOWL / CORN FLAKES (WGR) 96 EA/CS 15 51210
" CEREAL / BOWL / KASHI HONEY SUNSHINE 96 EA/CS
""" CEREAL / BOWL / RAISIN BRAN (WGR) 96 EA/CS 15 51240
"~ CEREAL / BOWL / SPECIAL K (WGR) 96 EAICS 15 51260
™" CEREAL / BOWL / RICE KRIPY (WGR) 96 EAICS 15 51270
" CEREAL / BOWL / WHEATIES (WGR) 96 EAICS 15 51320
" CEREAL / BULK / RICE KRISPIES 4BAGS/CS 40 51330
" CHILI QUICK START MIX (Santiago) (All Natural) 12/16.502/CS 51450
" CHINESE NOODLES / CH MEIN 61#10/CS 51500
CHIPS / BULK / POTATO / Lays BHE/CS 51570
""" CHIPS / TORTILLA / WGR (Solis- Mexicasa Senaritos) 2/3H/CS 80 51650
" CHIPS / PITA / STACY'S / SEA SALT bulk

" CHOC. CHIPS / MINI / HERSH 254/ CS 51660
" COCONUT / SHREDDED / SWEETENED 24/#1/CS
" CORN STARCH 24/41/CS 52100
" CRAISING / BULK 2/48 0ZICS 74710




VENDOR # ITEM NAME
No Bid _ _ CRANBERRY SAUCE/ JEL/GS

NoBd  GROUTONS/SEASONED - WGR

':No B|d CROUTONS / SEASONED - ALL NATURAL

CURRY / RED / PASTE
DRESSING / BALSAMIC VINAIGRETTE Ken's

NoBid  DRESSING/BLUE CHEESE/ Cains
NeBid  DRESSING/ CREAMY CEASAR / Ken's
‘VENDOR # ITEM NAME
No Bld DRESSING / RANCH / Hidden Valley
NoBid  DRESSINGMX/ITALIAN / Good Seasons
NoBid  DRESSING MIX/RANCH/ Hidden Valley
No Bi Bld DRESSING / 1000 ISLAND / Ken's

" DRESSING / NEWMAN'S OWN / Ranch

" DRESS!NGI NEWMAN'S OWN / Creamy Caesar
" EXTRACT / VANILLA/ IMITAT

" FLOUR / ALL PURPOSE

" FROST. MIX / CREAMY FUDGE

" FROST. MIX / CREAMY WHITE

GINGERALE

" GRAVY / BROWN / LE GOUT (fow sodium)

" GRAVY / TURKEY / LE GOUT {low sodium)

" GRAVY / BROWN / MAJOR CHEF'S SUPERB
" GRAVY / TURKEY / MAJOR CHEF'S SUPERB
HONEY / 5# JUG

" JALAPENOS / SLICED

" JELLY / GRAPE / No HFC, Art Color of Flaver
" JIMMIES / RAINBOW / No Art Color or Flavor

" JIMMIES / DARK GREEN / No Art Color or Flavar
" KETCHUP 1 TOMATO / HEINZ No HFC
_KETCHUP / TOMATO / No HFC

LEMON JUICE / PLASTIC BOTTLE

"~ MACARONI/ BOWTIES

" MACARONI/ ELBOWS

" MACARONI / FETTUCINI

£ fé,//e%, Lre -

CASE PACK ALT. BRAND MOS. USAGE ITEM # PRICE
6#10/CS 52200
4/2.258(CS 52250
4 0z. / CAN
4/1 GAL/CS 52540
4/ 1 GAL/CS 52550
4/1GAL /CS 52560

CASE PACK ALT. BRAND /SIZE/ PACK  MOS. USAGE ITEM # PRICE
411 GALICS 62570
12/6 OZ/ICS 52580
18 PKG/CS 52600
411 GALICS 52610
411 GALICS
4/1 GALICS
QT 52741
2/258/BAGS 53000
2M1#/CS 53180
2M11#/CS 53190
12LTRICS 83570
12/5#/CS 53590
12/E5/CS 53600
8MLB/ICS
8/1LB/CS
S5# JUG 53701
B/#10/CS 53800
6/#10/CS 54000
10#/CS 54100
10#/CS 54130
6/#10/CS 54210
B/#10/CS
12/QTICS 54300
2/110#/CS 54430
2/108/CS 40 54500
2/108/CS 54530




VENDOR # ITEM NAME
No Bid MACARON!/ SHELL / MEDIUM
NoBuj MAGARGNI / SPAGHETT!
NOB]d MACARON! /PENNE

MACARONI / TRI-COLOR / ROTINI

"MACARGNI / ZITI CUT
MAYONNAISE / HELLMAN'S

" MARSHMELLOS / MINI

" MILK / DRY / NONFAT

" MILK / ORGANIC / HORIZON
MUSTARD / DELI STYLE

" NOODLES / EGG / MEDIUM
" OATS /ROLLED

'No Bid " OATS / ROLLED (Cerlified Gluten Free)
NoBid  OIL/SALAD Ol / NON-GMO

NoBid  OILJOLIVE/ PURE

VENDOR# [TEM NAME

No Bid OLIVES / BLACK / SLICED

NoBid  ONIONS / CHOPPED / DRIED
Nand PACKS / ALMOND BUTTER / Single Serv-Cup

PACKS /BBQ SAUCE / (Dip Cup) No HFC
PACKS/ BALSAMIC VINEGARETTE / Ken's
" PACKS / DRSG / HONEY-MUSTARD / Ker's
'PACKS / DRSG / CRMY ITALIAN / Ken's
PACKS / DRSG / ITALIAN-FF / Ken's
PACKS / DRSG / CAESAR / Ken's

" PACKS / DRSG / RNCH / L-CAL / Keris

" PACKS / DRSG / 1000 ISLAND / Ken's

" PACKS / JELLY / ASSORTED / Smuckers
PACKS / KETCHUP / No HFC

PACKS / MAYONNAISE / HELLMANS

" PACKS / MUST / YEL / HEINZ

PACKS / PEPPER

" PACKS / RELISH / HEINZ No HFC

MILK / SOY / SHELF STABLE / PLAIN / UNSWEETENED

Efalle], tre .

CASE PACK ALT. BRAND MOS. USAGE ITEM # PRICE
20#/CS 54550
2011#/CS 40 54600
2/108/CS 40 54620
10#/CS 54640
2110#CS
4/GAL/CS 30 54850
12/ 1#/CS 35 54870
B/5#/CS 54880
1QT.

1/2 PINTS

4/GALICS 54960
2/5#/CS 55000
12/42 OZ/CB 55040
12/42 QZICS 55040
6/1GAL/CS 12 57480
4/3LTR/CS 12 57480

CASE PACK ALT. BRAND/SIZE/PACK  MOS. USAGE ITEM# PRICE
6/108//CS 55050
6/3#/CS 55100
100/CS
200/C8 55160
60/1.5/CS 10 55255
60/1.5/C8 10 55260
60/1.5/CS 10 55290
60/1.5/CS 10 556310
60/1.5/C3 10 65315
60/1.5/C8 10 65320
60/1.5 QZ/CS 10 55330
200/CS 55345
1000 EA/CS 40 65380
200 EACS 60 55420
500 EAJCS 25 55480
3000/CS 55550
200 EACS 56570




VENDOR #

"W-201-15

S
A
S

7 PEPPERONCINI

No Bid
NoB[d
[\!‘oaid

ITEM NAME

PACKS / SUGAR / 2000
"PACKS / SALT
"PACKS / SPLENDA
"PACKS / EQUAL
. PACKS / SYRUP / Natural / Non HFC / Dip Cup
"PACKS / PURE MAPLE SYRUP / Natural / Dip Cup
" PACKS / TACO SAUCE / Ortega or Old ElPaso
"PACKS / TARTAR SAUCE
i PANCAKE BATTER/Aunt Jemima (Complete)
. FAN COATING - Unipro or Vegelean

) PAN COATING / BAKING - Unipro or Vegelean

PEACHES / DICED / JUICE PACKED
PEANUT BUTTER/CRMY-NO TRAN FAT

’ PEPPERS / ROASTED RED

PEPPERS/ CHIPOTLE WHOLE IN ADOBE

PICKLES / KOSHER SPEARS - No HFC
PINEAPPLE JUICE

PIZZA SAUCE - ANGELA MIA #38866 Fully Prepared

POTATO PEARLS No Art. Flavor or Color

PUMPKIN - CANNED

_QUINOA / BULK / WHITE
RAISINS / BULK
RICE / BROWN
SALSA / THICK'N CHUNKY (Ortega)
) ITEM NAME
SAUCE / BBQ / No HFC
" SAUCE / CHILLGARLIC / Gochujang
_ SAUCE/CHEDDAR CHEESE /RS/ Land O' Lakes 39340

" SAUGE! HONEY MUSTARD / Ken's Steakhouse
SAUCE/ HOT

SAUCE / SRIRACHA / SQUEEZE BOTTLE

SAUCE/ SOY (Low-Sodium)

SAUCE / TERRIYAKI / GAL (Low-Sodium)

AL

—
;‘

CASE PACK ALT. BRAND MOS. USAGE ITEM # PRICE
2000 EA/CS 55650
3/1000/CS 55660
2000/CS 55680
2000/CS 55690
100/1 .5 OZ/CS Elwood / Winston 200 56730 $13.817
200 EA/CS 56750
200/C3 55760
6/5#CS 55790
6/17 0z/CS 55800
6/17 0z/CS
6/#10/CS 30 55850
6/5# TUB/CS 56000
6/#10/CS 56040
12/26 OZ/CS 56250
4/GAL/ICS
6/#10/CS 56260
12146 0z/CS 56390
6/#10/CS 150 56450
6/3.58/CS 56500
SR0/CS 57000
10#C8 57090
25HBAG 25 57290
4/GALICS 57560

CASE PACK ALT. BRAND / SIZE/PACK  MOS, USAGE ITEM# PRICE
4/GAL/CS 57600
67106 OZBAG/CS 51420
HGALICS 57650
4/GALICS 57790
28 OZ/ICTR
4/GALICS 57800
AGALICS 57840

j—

e Y



VENDOR # ITEM NAME
No Bid SAUCE / WORCESTERSHIRE

‘NoBid  SAUERKRAUT/SHREDDED

‘NoBid  SHAKERS/PEPPER
™™ era s onr

" SOUP/ CANNED / TOMATO / All Natural

T SPICE / BASIL LEAVES

SPICE / BAY LEAVES

" SPICE / CHIL| POWDER

" SPICE / CINNAMON / GRD

SPICE / CLOVES / GROUND

" SPICE 1 CREAM OF TARTER

SPICE / CUMIN

" SPICE / GARLIC / GRANULATE
SPICE / GARLIC POWDER
SPICE / GINGER

SPICE / MUSTARD / DRIED

" SPICE / NUTMEG
SPICE / ONION POWDER

SPICE / OREGANO /CUT
SPICE / PAPRIKA

‘No Bid " SPICE | PARSLEY FLAKE

SPICE / PEPPER / BLACK

SPICE / PEPPER / CAYANNE
SPICE f PEPPER / RED FLAKE

" SPICE / PEPPER / WHITE

SPICE f POULTRY SEASON

" SPICE  ROSEMARY LEAVES
SPICE / SAGE
SPICE / SALT / 24/26

' SPICE f KOSHER SALT

SPICE / SESAME SEED
SPICE / THYME

& et L .

CASE PACK ALT, BRAND MOS, USAGE ITEM # PRICE
4/GALICS 57910
6/#10/CS 58000
48/1.5 0z/CS 58060
48/4 0z/CS 58070
12/50 0z/CS 58800
24 OZ/ICTR 58050
12 QZICTR 59100
16 OZ/CTR 59200
16 OZ/CTR 59250
16 OZ/ICTR 59300
29 OZ/ICTR 59350
16 OZ/CTR 59380
23 OZCTR 59450
16 OZ/CTR 59500
16 OZ/CTR 59600
28 OZ/CTR 59630
16 OZ/CTR
14 QZICTR 59650
16 OZICTR 59760
20 OZ/CTR 59750
24 OZ/ICTR 59850
16 OZ/CTR 59900
16 OZICTR 59950
16 QZ/CTR 60000
16 OZ/CTR 60010
12 O2/ICTR 60050
16 OZ/CTR 60100
10 QZ/ICTR 60150
6 QZ/CTR 60170
16 OZICTR 60190
24126 02/CS 60200
12/3#/C8 60210
16 OZICTR 60260
33 OZICTR 60300




E tller, T .

VENDOR # ITEM NAME CASE PACK ALT. BRAND MOS. USAGE ITEM # PRICE
VENDOR # ITEM NAME CASEPACK  ALT.BRAND/SIZE/PACK MOS. USAGE ITEM # PRICE
No Bid BASE / MAJOR / BEEF / No MSG BHRICS 60350
‘NoBid  BASE/MAJOR /CHICKEN / No MSG 6118/CS 60360
" BASE / MAJOR / VEGETABLE / No MSG
'STUFFING / OVEN f CHICKEN - WGR 6/3.54/CS 60400
" STUFFING 1 GVEN 7 CHICKEN - All Natural 6/3.54/CS
" SUGAR/ LIGHT BROWN 24118/CS 60500
" SUGAR / CRYSTAL / RED BHICS 60510
" SUGAR / CRYSTAL / GREEN 8H/CS 60520
" SUGAR 7 CONFECTIONER 24/1#/CS 60550
" SUGAR / GRANULATED 50%/BG 60600
" SUN BUTTER 215#/CS 60700
" TACO SHELLS / REGULAR WGR (Mission) 8/25/CS 60800
"TEA / HERBAL (Bigelow) 6/28 PKT/CS 60880
" TEABAGS/LIPTON 101100 PKT/CS 60900
" TEA BAGS / DECAF LIPTON 672 PKTICS 60910
" TOMATO PASTE / Non-GMO 6/#10/CS 61000
'TOPPING / STRAWBERRY 3#10/CS 61110
" TOPPING / BUTTERSCOTCH 6/5#/CS 61120
" TOPPING / GRANOLA / Al Natural / Nut-Free 4/50 OZ.1CS 61140
" TOPPING / HERS. CHOC SYRP 6/#10/CS 61130
TOPPING / OREQ CUMBS 25#/CS 61160
" TUNA / LIGHT IN WATER (NO SOY / DOLPHIN SAFE) 6/66.5 0Z/CS 40 61200
" TUNA £ WHITE INWATER (NO SOY / DOLPHIN SAFE) 6/66.5 02/CS
'VINEGAR / BALSAMIC 4/GALICS
" VINEGAR / CIDER HIGALICS
VINEGAR / RED WINE HGALICS 61350
" VINEGAR / WHITE 4/GALICS 61400
" WALNUTS / CHOPPED 6/4#/CS 61550
" WINE / MARSALA / COOKING 4/GALICS
SNACKS
No Bid CRACKERS/ GRAHAM 150/3PKICS 12 75180
NoBid  CRACKERS/SALTINES /WW 500/2 PKICS 75200




VENDOR # ITEM NAME
No Bid CRACKERS / CHOC BEAR / MJM Marketing
NoBid " CRACKERS / VANILLA BEAR / MJM Marketing
"Ri.c‘;"é.‘;gm"""“"""m"mm CRACKERS ! Annie's Organic / Bunny Grahams
O
‘Misc  DISTILLED WATER

VENDOR # ITEM NAME

No Bid TORTILLA - BROWN RICE- Food For Life
0 e TORTLEA BRGNP CE Fooc

No Bid
NoBd  BUN GF - HOT DOG- Pinnacle

'No Bi " BAGEL PLAIN GF - Pinnacle

| UDYs Au Natural Gluien Free Granola

CHIX-THIGH/BONELESS/SKINLESS/ Organic
" CHIX - THIGH / Organic
"CHIX-QUARTERS / Organic
" GHIX-DRUMSTICKS / Organic

COLEMAN NATURAL PRODUCTS
NAE FC Breaded Chicken Breast Tender (13306)
NAE FC Breaded Gluten Free Tenderloins (13203)

" NAE RTC Ground Turkey - 90/10 (30270)

" NAE RTC Dark Meat Turkey Burgers (30176)

" NAE FC Diced Chicken Breast (27250)

""" NAE FC Sous-Vide Style Drumsticks, Frozen (30275)
" NAE FC Besf Hot Dogs, 2 oz. (19655)

" CHIX BREAST / BONELESS / SKINLESS / 6-80z / Organic
Applegate Farm (Nitrate Free) Natural Breakfast Sausage

E f7llel] e

CASE PACK ALT. BRAND MOS. USAGE ITEM #
300/2PKICS 25 75220
300/2PKICS 25 75240
1oz. / PK
4{GALICS
CASE PACK ALT. BRAND / SIZE /PACK  MOS, USAGE ITEM# PRICE

6 per pack - {57g each}

24724 oz

24 /24 0z,

247350z,

12 0z Bag

4108/CS

60/8.502/CS

96/3.502/CS

4/5LB/CS

10LB/CS

4/35LB/CS

40/40z./CS

2/5LBJ/CS

8/12ea./CS

80 ea/CS




