

			Tekk Support		iFixYouri		Werx Repair Service		AGI REPAIR		iDoc	
LINE			UNIT		UNIT		UNIT		UNIT		UNIT	
ITEM	COMMODITY/SERVICE DESC	QTY	U/M	PRICE	U/M	PRICE	U/M	PRICE	U/M	PRICE	U/M	PRICE
1	Glass/Digitizer Replacement	1	EA	No Bid	EA	\$ 137.44	EA	\$ 69.99	EA	\$ 234.20	EA	\$ 110.00
2	Glass/Digitizer and LCD Replacement	1	EA	No Bid	EA	\$ 172.08	EA	\$ 99.99	EA	\$ 268.00	EA	\$ 235.00
3	Volume Control Repair	1	EA	No Bid	EA	\$ 9.99	EA	\$ 59.99	EA	\$ 62.00	EA	\$ 36.82
4	Water Damage Repair	1	EA	No Bid	EA	\$ 29.99	EA	\$ 69.99	EA	\$ 169.00	EA	\$ 92.64
5	Power Button Replacement	1	EA	No Bid	EA	\$ 9.99	EA	\$ 59.99	EA	\$ 63.00	EA	\$ 36.82
6	Battery Replacement	1	EA	No Bid	EA	\$ 41.81	EA	\$ 69.99	EA	\$ 94.00	EA	\$ 61.73
7	Head Phone Jack Assembly Replacement	1	EA	No Bid	EA	\$ 9.99	EA	\$ 59.99	EA	\$ 66.00	EA	\$ 37.73
8	Charging Port/Dock Connector Replacement	1	EA	No Bid	EA	\$ 9.99	EA	\$ 59.99	EA	\$ 83.00	EA	\$ 37.27
9	Back Plate/Back Cover Replacement	1	EA	No Bid	EA	\$ 19.99	EA	\$ -	EA	\$ -	EA	\$ 155.45
10	Home Button Replacement	1	EA	No Bid	EA	\$ 19.99	EA	\$ 49.99	EA	\$ 63.00	EA	\$ 24.09
11	Back Plate/Back Cover Repairs to Remove Dents and Scratches	1	EA	No Bid	EA	\$ 9.99	EA	\$ 49.99	EA	\$ 63.00	EA	\$ 73.64
12	Rear Camera	1	EA	No Bid	EA	\$ 19.99	EA	\$ 49.99	EA	\$ 59.00	EA	\$ 45.00
13	Front Camera	1	EA	No Bid	EA	\$ 19.99	EA	\$ 49.99	EA	\$ 59.00	EA	\$ 43.64
14	Labor Rate (Hourly) For No Issues Found	1	EA	\$ 85.00	EA	No Bid	EA	\$ 29.99	EA	No Bid	EA	\$ 12.00
15	Labor Rate (Hourly) For Beyond Repair	1	EA	\$ 85.00	EA	No Bid	EA	\$ 29.99	EA	No Bid	EA	\$ 12.00
16	Labor rate (Hourly) For Repairs Listed	1	EA	\$ 85.00	EA	No Bid	EA	\$ 29.99	EA	No Bid	EA	No Bid
Total						\$ 511.23		\$ 839.85				
NOTES			Labor could increase to \$150.00 an hour based on extent of repairs.		Vendor Supplied Pricing for each different iPad model. The figures above are the average.		These service prices donot include Air 2 and iPad Pro Series Glass/Digitizer and LCD Replacement. Prices for these devices are: between \$149.99 and \$449.99		Vendor Supplied Pricing for each different iPad model. The figures above are the average.		Vendor Supplied Pricing for each different iPad model. The figures above are the average.	