



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT  
**BROWNSVILLE**  
INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

**Board Meeting November 7, 2022**  
**Bid #23-042 Medical Supplies & Equipment District-Wide**

	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
<b>1</b>	<b>ALCOHOL PRE PADS - 2 PLY SMALL 200/BOX #68140 OR EQUAL</b>				
	Henry Schein Inc	300	BOX	\$1.35	Recommended
<b>2</b>	<b>APPLICATORS - 3 COTTON TIPPED, NON-STERILE 100/PKG OR EQUAL</b>				
	School Health Corp.	25	PKG	\$0.47	Recommended
<b>3</b>	<b>APPLICATORS - 6 COTTON TIPPED, NON-STERILE 100/PKG OR EQUAL</b>				
	SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC.	25	PKG	\$0.76	Recommended
<b>4</b>	<b>AUDIOMETER - PORTABLE AUDIOMETER, MAICO 25 WITH AC ADAPTOR AND CARRYING CASE</b>				
	School Health Corp.	1	EACH	\$897.40	Recommended
<b>5</b>	<b>BAGGIES - ZIPLOCK SANDWICH BAGS 100/BOX</b>				
	Henry Schein Inc	200	BOX	\$2.60	Recommended
<b>6</b>	<b>COTTON BALLS - NON-STERILE MEDIUM 500/BAGS AMER. FIBER #62733 OR EQUAL</b>				
	NAO Global Health	50	BAGS	\$1.89	Recommended
<b>7</b>	<b>GAUZE SQUARES - 2 X2" NON-STERILE, 12PLY 200/PKG</b>				
	Henry Schein Inc	10	PKG	\$1.29	Recommended
<b>8</b>	<b>GAUZE - 2 X2" STERILE GAUZE SPONGES 50/BOX</b>				
	Henry Schein Inc	50	BOX	\$1.10	Recommended



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT  
**BROWNSVILLE**  
INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

**Board Meeting November 7, 2022**  
**Bid #23-042 Medical Supplies & Equipment District-Wide**

<b>9</b>	<b>GAUZE - 3 X3"STERILE GAUZE SPONGES 50/BOX</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Henry Schein Inc	50	BOX	\$1.42	Recommended

  

<b>10</b>	<b>DRESSING - CONFORMING, 2 NON-STERILE 12/PK OR EQUAL</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Henry Schein Inc	50	PK	\$1.44	Recommended

  

<b>11</b>	<b>DRESSING - CONFORMING, 3 STRETCH BANDAGE ROLLS NON-STERILE 12/PK</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Henry Schein Inc	50	PK	\$1.65	Recommended

  

<b>12</b>	<b>DRESSING - CONFORMING 4 STRETCH BANDAGE ROLLS NON-STERILE 12/PK</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Henry Schein Inc	25	PK	\$2.14	Recommended

  

<b>13</b>	<b>DRESSING - 1 X3" ADHESIVE BANDAGE 100/BOX FABRIC BAND-AID OR EQUAL</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	4000	BOX	\$2.09	Recommended

  

<b>14</b>	<b>DRESSING - 3/8 X 11/2" JUNIOR ADHESIVE BANDAGE 100/BOX</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	250	BOX	\$1.96	Recommended

  

<b>15</b>	<b>DRESSING - 7/8 SPOT ADHESIVE BANDAGE 100/BOX SHEER BAND-AID OR EQUAL</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	100	BOX	\$1.12	Recommended



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT  
**BROWNSVILLE**  
INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

**Board Meeting November 7, 2022**  
**Bid #23-042 Medical Supplies & Equipment District-Wide**

<b>16</b>	<b>DRESSING - KNUCKLE COVER ADHESIVE BANDAGE 100/BOX FABRIC BAND-AID OR EQUAL</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	300	BOX	\$4.43	Recommended

  

<b>17</b>	<b>DRESSING - FINGER TIP ADHESIVE BANDAGE 100/BOX FABRIC BAND-AID OR EQUAL</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	300	BOX	\$3.10	Recommended

  

<b>18</b>	<b>DRESSING - EXTRA LARGE 2 X4 1/2" ADHESIVE BANDAGE 50/BOX FABRIC BAND-AID OR EQUAL</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	300	BOX	\$3.84	Recommended

  

<b>19</b>	<b>DRESSING - NON-ADHERING (TEFLO OR EQUAL) 2 X3" 50/BOX</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	30	BOX	\$6.08	Recommended

  

<b>20</b>	<b>DRESSING - NON-ADHERING DRESSING (TEFLO OR EQUAL) 3 X4" 50/BOX</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	50	BOX	\$7.50	Recommended

  

<b>21</b>	<b>DRESSING - ADAPTIC NON-ADHERING (STERILE) 3 X3" 50/BOX OR EQUAL</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Henry Schein Inc	6	BOX	\$27.75	Recommended

  

<b>22</b>	<b>DRESSING - BUTTERFLY CLOSURES SMALL 100/BOX OR EQUAL</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	6	BOX	\$2.22	Recommended



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT  
**BROWNSVILLE**  
INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

**Board Meeting November 7, 2022**  
**Bid #23-042 Medical Supplies & Equipment District-Wide**

<b>23 DRESSING - WOUND CLOSURE STRIPS 1/4 X3" 30/PKG STERISTRIP OR EQUAL</b>				
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	25	PKG	\$15.43	Recommended

  

<b>24 DRESSING - EYE PADS 50/BOX OR EQUAL</b>				
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Henry Schein Inc	6	BOX	\$4.53	Recommended

  

<b>25 BANDAGE - ELASTIC 2 X5YDS. 10/BOX OR EQUAL PRICE PER BOX ONLY</b>				
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Henry Schein Inc	75	BOX	\$2.56	Recommended

  

<b>26 BANDAGE - ELASTIC BANDAGE 3 X5 YDS. 10/BOX MBM OR EQUAL PRICE PER BOX ONLY</b>				
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Henry Schein Inc	100	BOX	\$3.21	Recommended

  

<b>27 BANDAGE - ELASTIC BANDAGE 4 x5 YDS. 10/BOX PRICE PER BOX ONLY</b>				
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Henry Schein Inc	75	BOX	\$8.82	Recommended

  

<b>28 BANDAGE - ELASTIC BANDAGE 6 X5 YDS. 10/BOX OR EQUAL PRICE PER BOX ONLY</b>				
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Henry Schein Inc	50	BOX	\$6.30	Recommended

  

<b>29 BANDAGE - CONFORM 6" STRETCH BANDAGE ROLLS NON-STERILE 12/PKG</b>				
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Henry Schein Inc	6	PKG	\$2.86	Recommended



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT  
**BROWNSVILLE**  
 INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

**Board Meeting November 7, 2022**  
**Bid #23-042 Medical Supplies & Equipment District-Wide**

<b>30</b>	<b>BANDAGE - SELF ADHERENT WRAP (COBAN) 2" 24/BOX 3M OR EQUAL</b>				
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
	School Health Corp.	6	EA	\$3.67	Recommended
<b>31</b>	<b>BANDAGE - SELF ADHERENT WRAP (COBAN) 3"</b>				
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
	Henry Schein Inc	6	EACH	\$1.93	Recommended
<b>32</b>	<b>WHEELCHAIR - 16 SEAT WIDTH WHEEL CHAIR WITH SWING-AWAY DETACHABLE ELEVATING LEGREST, FULL LENGTH PADDED ARMS, LATEX FREE, 300-350LBS. WEIGHT CAPACITY</b>				
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
	School Health Corp.	1	EACH	\$259.47	Recommended
<b>33</b>	<b>WHEELCHAIR - 18 SEAT WIDTH WHEEL CHAIR WITH SWING-AWAY DETACHABLE ELEVATING LEGREST, FULL LENGTH PADDED ARMS, LATEX FREE, 300-350LBS. WEIGHT CAPACITY</b>				
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
	School Health Corp.	1	EACH	\$252.84	Recommended
<b>34</b>	<b>WHEELCHAIR - 20 SEAT WIDTH WHEEL CHAIR WITH SWING-AWAY DETACHABLE ELEVATING LEGREST, FULL LENGTH PADDED ARMS, LATEX FREE, 300-350LBS. WEIGHT CAPACITY</b>				
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
	SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC.	1	EACH	\$362.70	Recommended
<b>35</b>	<b>WHEELCHAIR - 22 SEAT WIDTH WHEEL CHAIR WITH SWING-AWAY DETACHABLE ELEVATING LEGREST, FULL LENGTH PADDED ARMS, LATEX FREE 400LBS. WEIGHT CAPACITY</b>				
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
	SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC.	1	EACH	\$507.60	Recommended



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT  
**BROWNSVILLE**  
 INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

**Board Meeting November 7, 2022**  
**Bid #23-042 Medical Supplies & Equipment District-Wide**

<b>36</b>	<b>WHEELCHAIR - 24 SEAT WIDTH WHEEL CHAIR WITH SWING-AWAY DETACHABLE ELEVATING LEGREST, FULL LENGTH PADDED ARMS, LATEX FREE, 400LBS.WEIGHT CAPACITY</b>			
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>
	SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC.	1	EACH	\$516.60
				Recommended
<b>37</b>	<b>MASK - MOLDED SURGICAL MASKS, GLASS FREE FILTER, FLUID RESISTANT LATEX FREE (50 PER BOX)</b>			
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>
	School Health Corp.	50	BOX	\$13.44
				Recommended
<b>38</b>	<b>GOGGLES - GOGGLES, LIGHT WEIGHT, NON-FOGGING, VENTILATED GOGGLES, COMFORTABLE BAND FOR SECURE FIT, LATEX FREE</b>			
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>
	School Health Corp.	1	EACH	\$2.95
				Recommended
<b>39</b>	<b>SHIELD - FACES SHIELD PROCEDURE MASK, LATEX FREE (25 PER BAG)</b>			
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>
	SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC.	25	BAG	\$34.65
				Recommended
<b>40</b>	<b>SHARPS - SHARPS DROP CONE/SHUTTLE</b>			
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>
	SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC.	6	EACH	\$3.59
				Recommended
<b>41</b>	<b>SHARPS CONTAINER - 1 GALLON SHARPS CONTAINER OR EQUAL</b>			
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>
	SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC.	1	EACH	\$4.49
				Recommended
<b>42</b>	<b>SHARPS CONTAINER - 1 GALLON SHARPS CONTAINER PROVIDING TEMPORARY AND PERMANENT CLOSURE</b>			
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>
	School Health Corp.	1	EACH	\$7.46
				Recommended



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT  
**BROWNSVILLE**  
INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

**Board Meeting November 7, 2022**  
**Bid #23-042 Medical Supplies & Equipment District-Wide**

<b>43</b>	<b>SHARPS CONTAINER - 2 GALLON SHARPS CONTAINER OR EQUAL</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Henry Schein Inc	1	EACH	\$4.31	Recommended

  

<b>44</b>	<b>SHARPS CONTAINER - 2 GALLON SHARPS CONTAINER PROVIDING TEMPORARY AND PERMANENT CLOSURE</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	1	EA	\$11.86	Recommended

  

<b>45</b>	<b>SOLUTION - SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% 500 ML FOR WOUND CARE MUST BE BOTTLE</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Henry Schein Inc	50	BOTTLES	\$4.98	Recommended

  

<b>46</b>	<b>SOLUTION - STERILE WATER 500 ML. B BRAUN FOR WOUND CARE OR EQUAL MUST BE BOTTLE</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Henry Schein Inc	50	BOTTLES	\$5.13	Recommended

  

<b>47</b>	<b>THERMOMETER - REPLACEMENT ORAL PROBE FOR SURE TEMP THERMOMETER 679</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	6	EACH	\$95.21	Recommended

  

<b>48</b>	<b>THERMOMETER - REPLACEMENT ORAL PROBE FOR SURE TEMP THERMOMETER 690</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	6	EACH	\$95.21	Recommended

  

<b>49</b>	<b>THERMOMETER - BRAUN THERMOSCAN PRO 4000 OR EQUAL</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC.	9	EACH	\$224.10	Recommended



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT  
**BROWNSVILLE**  
INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

**Board Meeting November 7, 2022**  
**Bid #23-042 Medical Supplies & Equipment District-Wide**

<b>50</b>	<b>THERMOMETER - BRAUN THERMOSCAN PRO 6000 OR EQUAL</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	1	EA	\$255.55	Recommended

  

<b>51</b>	<b>THERMOMETER - W/A SURE TEMP PLUS MODEL 690 OR EQUAL</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC.	12	EACH	\$267.75	Recommended

  

<b>52</b>	<b>THERMOMETER - DIGITAL 60 SECOND READOUT AUTO SHUT OFF</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Henry Schein Inc	200	EACH	\$5.07	Recommended

  

<b>53</b>	<b>COVERS - THERMOMETER COVERS SHEATH FOR DIGITAL THERM. 500/BOX OR EQUAL</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	100	BOX	\$2.60	Recommended

  

<b>54</b>	<b>COVERS - THERMOMETER COVERS FOR BRAUN THERMOSCAN PRO 4000 800/CASE 4 BXS/CS OR EQUAL</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	30	CASE	\$60.36	Recommended

  

<b>55</b>	<b>COVERS - THERMOMETER COVERS FOR BRAUN THERMOSCAN PRO 6,000 800/CASE 4 BOXES/CS OR EQUAL</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	30	CASES	\$13.94	Recommended

  

<b>56</b>	<b>COVERS - THERMOMETER COVERS FOR W/A SURE TERMOMETER 4 BX/CASE</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	100	CASE	\$40.77	Recommended





AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT  
**BROWNSVILLE**  
INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

**Board Meeting November 7, 2022**  
**Bid #23-042 Medical Supplies & Equipment District-Wide**

<b>57</b>	<b>COLD PACKS - INSTANT COLD PACKS SMALL IN INDIVIDUAL BOX</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	300	EACH	\$0.94	Recommended

  

<b>58</b>	<b>COLD PACKS - COLD PACKS REUSABLE HOT/COLD SMALL (4X6) OR EQUAL</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	300	EACH	\$0.36	Recommended

  

<b>59</b>	<b>CLIPPER - NAIL CLIPPER</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	1	EA	\$0.60	Recommended

  

<b>60</b>	<b>COLD PACKS - COLD PACKS REUSABLE HOT/COLD LARGE (6X9) OR EQUAL</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	300	EACH	\$1.77	Recommended

  

<b>61</b>	<b>BASINS - EMESIS PLASTIC, DISPOSABLE OR EQUAL</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	100	EACH	\$2.56	Recommended

  

<b>62</b>	<b>BASINS - 1 QT. PLASTIC BASIN</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	12	EACH	\$14.31	Recommended

  

<b>63</b>	<b>BASINS - 5 QT. PLASTIC BASIN</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	12	EACH	\$15.09	Recommended



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT  
**BROWNSVILLE**  
INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

**Board Meeting November 7, 2022**  
**Bid #23-042 Medical Supplies & Equipment District-Wide**

<b>64</b>	<b>BATTERIES - AAA" DURACEL OR EQUAL PACK OF 24</b>				
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
	School Health Corp.	200	PACK	\$7.87	Recommended
<b>65</b>	<b>BATTERIES - AA" DURACEL OR EQUAL PACK OF 24</b>				
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
	School Health Corp.	400	PACK	\$9.00	Recommended
<b>66</b>	<b>BATTERIES - C" DURACEL OR EQUAL PACK OF 12</b>				
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
	School Health Corp.	200	PACK	\$11.99	Recommended
<b>67</b>	<b>BATTERIES - D" DURACEL OR EQUAL PACK OF 12</b>				
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
	School Health Corp.	100	PACK	\$11.94	Recommended
<b>68</b>	<b>BATTERIES - 9V DURACEL OR EQUAL PACK OF 12</b>				
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
	School Health Corp.	75	PACK	\$28.19	Recommended
<b>69</b>	<b>BATTERIES - W/A 3.5 VOLT OR EQUAL</b>				
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
	SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC.	4	EACH	\$44.95	Recommended
<b>70</b>	<b>BATTERIES - W/A RECHARGEABLE 3.5 VOLT OR EQUAL</b>				
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
	SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC.	4	EACH	\$44.95	Recommended
<b>71</b>	<b>BATTERIES - 3V DL2032 DURACELL OR EQUAL MEDICAL BATTERY</b>				
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
	School Health Corp.	1	EA	\$1.78	Recommended



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT  
**BROWNSVILLE**  
INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

**Board Meeting November 7, 2022**  
**Bid #23-042 Medical Supplies & Equipment District-Wide**

<b>72</b>	<b>DEPRESSORS - TONGUE DEPRESSORS, JUNIOR SIZE, 500/BOX OR EQUAL</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Henry Schein Inc	100	BOX	\$6.88	Recommended

  

<b>73</b>	<b>BLANKET - LINENS BLANKET, THERMAL, WHITE, 66 X90" WASHABLE OR EQUAL</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Henry Schein Inc	25	EACH	\$14.45	Recommended

  

<b>74</b>	<b>CLOTHS - DRY WASH CLOTHS DISPOSABLE 50/PKG OR EQUAL</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	50	PKG	\$3.03	Recommended

  

<b>75</b>	<b>TAPE CLOTH - TAPE CLOTH JJ ZONAS POROUS CLOTH TAPE OR EQUAL 1/2 INCH 12/BOX</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Henry Schein Inc	50	BOX	\$23.92	Recommended

  

<b>76</b>	<b>TAPE CLOTH - TAPE CLOTH JJ ZONAS POROUS CLOTH TAPE OR EQUAL 1 INCH 12/BOX</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	

  

<b>77</b>	<b>TOWELS - EXAMINATION POLYBACK TOWELS 500/CASE OR EQUAL</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Henry Schein Inc	6	CASE	\$21.86	Recommended

  

<b>78</b>	<b>TOWELS - LINENS BATH TOWELS, WHITE 20 X40"</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC.	50	EACH	\$3.87	Recommended

  

<b>79</b>	<b>LICE COMB - METAL LICE COMBS</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC.	20	EACH	\$3.59	Recommended



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT  
**BROWNSVILLE**  
 INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

**Board Meeting November 7, 2022**

**Bid #23-042 Medical Supplies & Equipment District-Wide**

**80 LICE COMB - LICEMEISTER LICE COMB THAT INCLUDES EDUCATIONAL CRITTER CARD AND CLEANING**

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	
Unipak Corp.	25	PACKAGE	No Bid	No Bid Received
Henry Schein Inc	25	PACKAGE	No Bid	No Bid Received
ALERT SERVICES INC	25	PACKAGE	No Bid	No Bid Received
McKesson Medical-Surgical Government Solutions LLC	25	PACKAGE	No Bid	No Bid Received
B&E Medical Supply and Equipment, LLC	25	PACKAGE	No Bid	No Bid Received
NAO Global Health	25	PACKAGE	No Bid	No Bid Received
School Health Corp.	25	PACKAGE	No Bid	No Bid Received
Zamsinc	25	PACKAGE	No Bid	No Bid Received
MacGill & Co. (William V. MacGill & Co.)	25	PACKAGE	No Bid	No Bid Received
Medicaleshop Inc	25	PACKAGE	No Bid	No Bid Received
MAVICH	25	PACKAGE	No Bid	No Bid Received
Pocket Nurse (Pocket Nurse Enterprises, Inc.)	25	PACKAGE	No Bid	No Bid Received
Uweport LLC	25	PACKAGE	No Bid	No Bid Received
Mercedes Scientific (Mercedes Medical)	25	PACKAGE	No Bid	No Bid Received
School Specialty LLC	25	PACKAGE	No Bid	No Bid Received
BUYER'S POINT LLC	25	PACKAGE	No Bid	No Bid Received

**81 LICE STICKS - HEADING SCREENING STICKS, DISPOSABLE WOODEN SCALP EXAMINATION STICKS**

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	
School Health Corp.	1000	PACKAGE	\$2.78	Recommended

**82 URINAL - MALE PLASTIC URINAL, GRADUATED LATEX FREE**

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	
[ALT1] McKesson Medical-Surgical Government Solutions LLC	1	EACH	\$0.73	Recommended



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT  
**BROWNSVILLE**  
INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

**Board Meeting November 7, 2022**  
**Bid #23-042 Medical Supplies & Equipment District-Wide**

<b>83</b>	<b>URINAL - FEMALE PLASTIC URINAL, GRADUATED, LATEX FREE</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
NAO Global Health	1	EACH	\$4.51	Recommended

  

<b>84</b>	<b>TABLE PAPER - EXAMINATION TABLE PAPER 21 X225'WHITE SMOOTH 12/CASE #68276 OR EQUAL</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
[ALT1] McKesson Medical-Surgical Government Solutions LLC	8	CASE	\$34.80	Recommended

  

<b>85</b>	<b>BANDAGE - BANDAGE TRIANGULAR/SLING W/2 SAFETY PINS OR EQUAL</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	150	EACH	\$0.56	Recommended

  

<b>86</b>	<b>BLOWDRYER - BLOWDRYER HANDHELD HAIRDRYER 1500 WATTS</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Texas Medical Technology Inc	25	EACH	\$22.10	Recommended

  

<b>87</b>	<b>CUTTER - RING CUTTER WITH BLADE OR EQUAL</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Henry Schein Inc	25	EACH	\$15.91	Recommended

  

<b>88</b>	<b>CUTTER- COMBINATION PILL CUTTER/CRUSHER</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	10	EA	\$6.72	Recommended

  

<b>89</b>	<b>SANITIZER - INSTANT HAND SANITIZER 8 OZ. MUST INCLUDE PUMP PURELL OR EQUAL</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Henry Schein Inc	120	EACH	\$3.08	Recommended



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT  
**BROWNSVILLE**  
INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

**Board Meeting November 7, 2022**  
**Bid #23-042 Medical Supplies & Equipment District-Wide**

<b>90</b>	<b>OXYGEN MASK - ADULT O2-MEDIUM CONCENTRATION MASK WITH TUBING BF MEDIUM OR EQUAL</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Henry Schein Inc	25	EACH	\$1.12	Recommended

  

<b>91</b>	<b>OXYGEN MASK - PEDIATRIC MEDIUM CONCENTRATION MASK W/TUBING BF MED. OR EQUAL</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Texas Medical Technology Inc	12	EACH	\$7.95	Recommended

  

<b>92</b>	<b>OXYGEN - LIFE SOFTPAC OXYGEN TANK, 6 LPM (FIXED) FLOW RATE</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Texas Medical Technology Inc	1	EA	\$374.40	Recommended

  

<b>93</b>	<b>CUPS - DRINKING 5 OZ. FLAT BOTTOM PLASTIC DRINKING CUPS 100 PER SLEEVE 5 SLEEVES PER CASE</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	50	CASE	\$34.55	Recommended

  

<b>94</b>	<b>CUPS - MEDICINE PLASTIC 1 OZ. GRADUATED 100/SLEEVE 5 SLEEVES/CASE OR EQUAL</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	10	CASE	\$8.80	Recommended

  

<b>95</b>	<b>CUPS - DRINKING PAPER 1 OZ CUPS SOUFFLE 100/BOX</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC.	100	BOX	\$4.58	Recommended

  

<b>96</b>	<b>CUP CONES 4 1/4 oz. 1 CASE WITH 5,000 PER CASE</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	1	CASE	\$126.46	Recommended



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT  
**BROWNSVILLE**  
INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

**Board Meeting November 7, 2022**  
**Bid #23-042 Medical Supplies & Equipment District-Wide**

<b>97</b>	<b>STADI-O-METER - STADI-O-METER TO MEASURE 30 TO 84" WALL MOUNT OR EQUAL</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC.	10	EACH	\$116.10	Recommended

  

<b>98</b>	<b>CREAM - FIRST AID BURN CREAM PACKETS 144 CT/BOX OR EQUAL 2 YEAR LIFETIME PRIOR TO EXPIRATION</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC.	500	EACH	\$13.40	Recommended

  

<b>99</b>	<b>WIPES - AUDIO DISINFECTANT WIPES FOR AUDIOMETER EARPHONES NO ALCOHOL 200/CONTAINER OR EQUAL</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	60	EACH	\$6.90	Recommended

  

<b>100</b>	<b>WIPES - SANI-CLOTH GERMICIDAL CLOTHS 160/CANISTER</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Henry Schein Inc	300	EA	\$6.10	Recommended

  

<b>101</b>	<b>WIPES - BABY NON-TOXIC 80/TUB</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Henry Schein Inc	500	EA	\$2.51	Recommended

  

<b>102</b>	<b>HEATING PADS - MOIST-DRY HEAT 3 SETTING, REMOVABLE WASHABLE COVER</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	24	EACH	\$24.17	Recommended

  

<b>103</b>	<b>SCREEN - PRIVACY SCREEN - 3 PANEL</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC.	6	EACH	\$161.10	Recommended



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT  
**BROWNSVILLE**  
INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

**Board Meeting November 7, 2022**  
**Bid #23-042 Medical Supplies & Equipment District-Wide**

<b>104</b>	<b>SUCTION - DEVIL BISS SUCTION UNIT WITH ADJUSTABLE FLOW REGULATOR, EASY TO READ GAUGE</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
MacGill & Co. (William V. MacGill & Co.)	1	EACH	\$308.75	Recommended

  

<b>105</b>	<b>SUCTION - DEVIL BISS YANKAUER SUCTION DEVICE WITH TUBING LATEX FREE</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
MacGill & Co. (William V. MacGill & Co.)	1	EACH	\$3.03	Recommended

  

<b>106</b>	<b>SUCTION - DEVIL BISS REPLACEMENT FILTER</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
MacGill & Co. (William V. MacGill & Co.)	1	EACH	\$6.89	Recommended

  

<b>107</b>	<b>SUCTION - DEVIL BISS SUCTION TUBING 3/6X6' LATEX FREE</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
MacGill & Co. (William V. MacGill & Co.)	1	EACH	\$1.66	Recommended

  

<b>108</b>	<b>MASKS - SURGICAL MASKS WITH EAR LOOP DESIGN 50/BOX</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	12	BOX	\$13.44	Recommended

  

<b>109</b>	<b>GLOVES - EXAMINATION VINYL POWDER FREE 100/BOX VARIOUS SIZES / HEALTH CARE PRODUCT</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Henry Schein Inc	800	BOX	\$5.45	Recommended

  

<b>110</b>	<b>GLOVES - STERILE VINYL PROCEDURE GLOVES POWDER FREE VARIOUS SIZES / HEALTH CARE PRODUCT</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Unipak Corp.	6	BOX	\$20.00	Recommended





AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT  
**BROWNSVILLE**  
INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

**Board Meeting November 7, 2022**  
**Bid #23-042 Medical Supplies & Equipment District-Wide**

<b>111</b>	<b>SPECULA - KLENSPEC OTOSCOPE DISPOSABLE ADULT 4 MM 850/BAG #W/A OR EQUAL</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Henry Schein Inc	20	BAG	\$37.65	Recommended

  

<b>112</b>	<b>SPECULA - KLNEENSPEC PEDIATRIC 2.5 MM 850/BAG #W/A OR EQUAL</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Henry Schein Inc	15	BOX	\$37.65	Recommended

  

<b>113</b>	<b>SPECULA - OTOSCOPE DISPOSABLE FOR PICCOLIGHT CHILD 2.5MM 100/BOX</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC.	25	BOX	\$8.50	Recommended

  

<b>114</b>	<b>SPECULA - OTOSCOPE DISPOSABLE FOR PICCOLIGHT ADULT 4MM 100/BOX</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC.	8	BOX	\$8.50	Recommended

  

<b>115</b>	<b>ILLUMINATOR - OTOSCOPE/THROAT ILLUMINATOR W/A 2.5V HALOGEN COMPLETE SET W/A OR EQUAL</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	12	EACH	\$235.21	Recommended

  

<b>116</b>	<b>STETHOSCOPE - DUAL HEAD OR EQUAL</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Henry Schein Inc	12	EACH	\$3.77	Recommended

  

<b>117</b>	<b>STETHOSCOPE - SPRAGUE RAPPAPORT OR EQUAL</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
B&E Medical Supply and Equipment, LLC	12	EACH	\$6.95	Recommended



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT  
**BROWNSVILLE**  
INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

**Board Meeting November 7, 2022**  
**Bid #23-042 Medical Supplies & Equipment District-Wide**

<b>118</b>	<b>PETROLEUM - JELLY (VASELINE) 1 OZ. TUBE</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Henry Schein Inc	150	EACH	\$0.96	Recommended

  

<b>119</b>	<b>TAPE - TRANSPORE CLEAR SURGICAL TAPE, 1/2 X10 YARDS (24ROLLS/BOX) LATEX-FREE HYPO ALLERGENIC</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Henry Schein Inc	1	BOX	\$12.51	Recommended

  

<b>120</b>	<b>TAPE - TRANSPORE CLEAR SURGICAL TAPE, 1 X10 YARDS (24ROLLS/BOX) LATEX-FREE HYPO ALLERGENIC</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Henry Schein Inc	1	BOX	\$12.51	Recommended

  

<b>121</b>	<b>EYEWASH - 4 OZ. EYEWASH WITH STERILE IRRIGATION (ISOTONIC BUFFERED) SOLUTION MUST HAVE STERILE SCREW OFF TOP</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	1	BOTTLE	\$2.36	Recommended

  

<b>122</b>	<b>KIT - EYE GLASS REPAIR KIT</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	200	EACH	\$1.28	Recommended

  

<b>123</b>	<b>CONTACTS SOLUTION - 4 OZ. BAUSCH &amp; LOMB. RENU MULTIPLUS CONTACT LENS SOLUTION</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	1	BOTTLE	\$5.47	Recommended

  

<b>124</b>	<b>CONTACTS CASE - CONTACT LENS CASES (2/PKG)</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Henry Schein Inc	1	PACKAGE	\$1.46	Recommended

  

<b>125</b>	<b>SPLINT - PROTECTO ROLLS 20 FT X 3/4 OR EQUAL</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC.	25	BOX	\$15.20	Recommended



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT  
**BROWNSVILLE**  
 INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Board Meeting November 7, 2022

Bid #23-042 Medical Supplies & Equipment District-Wide

<b>126</b>	<b>SPLINT - 9 SOFT SHELL ARM SPLINTS, SKIN SURFACE COVERED WITH ABSORBENT TERRY CLOTH OUTER SURFACES WITH VELCRO-FRIENDLY MATERIAL</b>			
------------	--	--	--	--

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	
Henry Schein Inc	1	EACH	\$17.88	Recommended

<b>127</b>	<b>SPLINT - 12 SOFT SHELL ARM SPLINTS, SKIN SURGACE COVERED WITH ABSORBENT TERRY CLOTH OUTER SURFACE WITH VELCRO-FRIENDLY MATERIAL</b>			
------------	--	--	--	--

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	
Henry Schein Inc	1	EACH	\$18.13	Recommended

<b>128</b>	<b>SPLINT - REUSABLE PADDED ARM SPLINT-CHILD SIZE</b>			
------------	---	--	--	--

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	
MacGill & Co. (William V. MacGill & Co.)	6	EA	\$1.89	Recommended

<b>129</b>	<b>SPLINT - REUSABLE PADDED ARM SPLINT - ADULT SIZE</b>			
------------	---	--	--	--

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	
MacGill & Co. (William V. MacGill & Co.)	6	EA	\$2.27	Recommended

<b>130</b>	<b>SPLINTER FORCEP - SPLINTER FORCEP 1/2 WITH FINE POINT</b>			
------------	--	--	--	--

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	
School Health Corp.	100	EACH	\$1.46	Recommended

<b>131</b>	<b>ARM SLING - ARM SLING WITH ADJUSTABLE SLIDING BUCKLE VARIOUS SIZES LATEX FREE</b>			
------------	--	--	--	--

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	
Henry Schein Inc	1	EACH	\$5.72	Recommended

<b>132</b>	<b>SCISSORS - BANDAGE STAINLESS STEEL 5 1/2"</b>			
------------	--	--	--	--

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	
School Health Corp.	30	EA	\$1.25	Recommended



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT  
**BROWNSVILLE**  
INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

**Board Meeting November 7, 2022**  
**Bid #23-042 Medical Supplies & Equipment District-Wide**

<b>133</b>	<b>SCISSORS - OPERATING SHARP/SHARP 5 1/2"</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC.	30	EA	\$2.47	Recommended

  

<b>134</b>	<b>SCISSORS - OPERATING SHARP/BLUNT 5 1/2"</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	30	EA	\$2.26	Recommended

  

<b>135</b>	<b>PINS - ASSORTED SAFETY PINS 50/PK</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	250	PKG	\$2.84	Recommended

  

<b>136</b>	<b>SUNDRY JARS - PLASTIC SET OF 5 NOT LABELED</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Henry Schein Inc	6	SETS	\$25.19	Recommended

  

<b>137</b>	<b>PEN LIGHTS - DISPOSABLE PEN LIGHTS 6/PKG</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Henry Schein Inc	200	PKG	\$4.87	Recommended

  

<b>138</b>	<b>SOAP-DIAL ANTIBACTERIAL LIQUID SOAP OR EQUAL 7 1/2 OZ W/PUMP</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Henry Schein Inc	500	EA	\$3.40	Recommended

  

<b>139</b>	<b>KIT - BIO-HAZARD (UNIVERSAL PRECAUTIONS) CLEAN-UP KIT</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC.	200	EA	\$2.24	Recommended



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT  
**BROWNSVILLE**  
INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

**Board Meeting November 7, 2022**  
**Bid #23-042 Medical Supplies & Equipment District-Wide**

<b>140</b>	<b>SCALE - DIGITAL PROFESSIONAL HEALTH-O-METER OR EQUAL, WITH WALL DISPLAY WT. TO 400 LB AUTOZECO, AUTO OFF</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC.	12	EA	\$206.10	Recommended

  

<b>141</b>	<b>SCALE - DIGITAL FLOOR SCALE, 400 LB. CAPACITY HEALTOMETER OR EQUAL</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Henry Schein Inc	12	EA	\$50.58	Recommended

  

<b>142</b>	<b>SCALE - BOLDSTEP DIAL FLOOR SCALE 330 LB CAPACITY HEALTHOMETER OR EQUAL</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC.	12	EA	\$87.75	Recommended

  

<b>143</b>	<b>HALOGEN BULB - 2.5V REPLACEMENT FOR PICCO LIGHT OTOSCOPE</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	12	EA	\$30.99	Recommended

  

<b>144</b>	<b>STADIOMETER - SECA PORTABLE STADIOMETER</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Henry Schein Inc	12	EA	\$170.36	Recommended

  

<b>145</b>	<b>OXIMETER - PULSE OXIMETER WITH LED DISPLAY, BATTERY STATUS INDICATOR, INCLUDE BATTERIES AND PROTECTIVE CASE</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	1	EA	\$42.04	Recommended

  

<b>146</b>	<b>OTOSCOPE - OTOSCOPE/THROAT ILLUMINATOR 3.5V HALOGEN RECHARGEABLE BATTERY</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Texas Medical Technology Inc	6	EA	\$45.64	Recommended



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT  
**BROWNSVILLE**  
INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

**Board Meeting November 7, 2022**  
**Bid #23-042 Medical Supplies & Equipment District-Wide**

<b>147</b>	<b>OTOSCOPE - POCKET MODEL FIBER-OPTIC LED OTOSCOPE, POWERED BY 2AA BATTERIES WITH CASE</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC.	1	EA	\$66.60	Recommended

  

<b>148</b>	<b>OCCLUDER - DISPOSABLE OCCLUDER (500 X PKG.)</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
MacGill & Co. (William V. MacGill & Co.)	1	EA	\$23.70	Recommended

  

<b>149</b>	<b>INHALANTS - AMMONIA INHALANTS 12/BOX #1309720 OR EQUAL</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
[ALT1] McKesson Medical-Surgical Government Solutions LLC	12	BX/10	\$2.00	Recommended

  

<b>150</b>	<b>AED - CHILD PADS FOR POWERHEAT G3 AED 2/PKG 2 YEAR LIFETIME PRIOR TO EXPIRATION</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	6	PKG	\$101.17	Recommended

  

<b>151</b>	<b>AED - ADULT PADS FOR POWERHEAT G3 AED 2/PKG 2 YEAR LIFETIME PRIOR EXPIRATION</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	6	PKG	\$34.31	Recommended

  

<b>152</b>	<b>B/P AUTOMATIC BLOOD PRESSURE UNIT FOR THE ARM-WELCH ALLYN, OMRON OR EQUAL LIFE SOURCE</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
School Health Corp.	6	EA	\$100.63	Recommended

  

<b>153</b>	<b>METER - SCOLIOMETER</b>			
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Price</b>	
Henry Schein Inc	6	EA	\$44.24	Recommended



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT  
**BROWNSVILLE**  
 INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

**Board Meeting November 7, 2022**  
**Bid #23-042 Medical Supplies & Equipment District-Wide**

**154 CPR - CRP MICROSHIELD**

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	
School Health Corp.	6	EA	\$6.67	Recommended

**155 CPR - CPR REUSCITATION MASK, MASK CAN BE USED ON ADULTS AND CHILDREN, SOFT CASE, INCLUDES GLOVES AND ANTISEPTIC WIPE, LATEX FREE**

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	
School Health Corp.	1	EA	\$6.66	Recommended

**156 BATTERY - AED BATTERY FOR CARDIAC SCIENCE POWERHEART G3 4 YEAR LIFETIME PRIOR TO EXPIRATION**

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	
School Health Corp.	6	EA	\$334.57	Recommended

**157 TOOTHBRUSH - ECONOMY TOOTHBRUSHES CHILD 100/PK**

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	
SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC.	6	PKG	\$17.52	Recommended

**158 TOOTH BOX - TOOTH BOX, TREASURE CHEST (144 X PKG.)**

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	
SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC.	144	PKG	\$8.95	Recommended

**159 LUNG BAG - FACE SHIELD LUNG BAG 50/BOX 2/50 PKG PER BOX**

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	
Texas Medical Technology Inc	50	PKG	\$130.44	Recommended

**160 BP KIT - CHILD ANEROID SPHYGMOMANOMETER NYLON WITH ZIPPERED CARRYING CASE LATEX FREE**

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	
Henry Schein Inc	1	EA	\$17.08	Recommended



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT  
**BROWNSVILLE**  
 INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

**Board Meeting November 7, 2022**

**Bid #23-042 Medical Supplies & Equipment District-Wide**

**161 BP KIT - ADULT ANEROID SPHYGMOMANOMETER NYLON WITH ZIPPERED CARRYING CASE LATEX FREE**

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	
Henry Schein Inc	1	EA	\$17.08	Recommended

**162 BP KIT - LARGE ADULT ANEROID SPHYGMOMANOMETER NYLON WITH ZIPPERED CARRYING CASE LATEX FREE**

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	
Henry Schein Inc	1	EA	\$20.71	Recommended

**163 REFRIGERATOR - MAGIC CHEF 4.4 CUBIC FOOT REFRIGERATOR/FREEZER STAINLESS STEEL LOOK**

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	
School Health Corp.	1	EA	\$388.27	Recommended

**164 PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT - PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT ON OTHER MEDICAL AND HEALTH SUPPLIES AND MATERIALS THAT WERE NOT LISTED ABOVE.**

Supplier	QTY	UOM	% Discount	
School Specialty LLC	1	PERCENTAGE	35.0%	Recommended
Mercedes Scientific (Mercedes Medical)	1	PERCENTAGE	25.0%	Recommended
McKesson Medical-Surgical Government Solutions LLC	1	PERCENTAGE	20.0%	Recommended
ALERT SERVICES INC	1	PERCENTAGE	20.0%	Recommended
Henry Schein Inc	1	PERCENTAGE	18.0%	Recommended
Pocket Nurse (Pocket Nurse Enterprises, Inc.)	1	PERCENTAGE	15.0%	Recommended
Unipak Corp.	1	PERCENTAGE	15.0%	Recommended
School Health Corp.	1	PERCENTAGE	13.0%	Recommended
B&E Medical Supply and Equipment, LLC	1	PERCENTAGE	10.0%	Recommended
SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC.	1	PERCENTAGE	10.0%	Recommended
NAO Global Health	1	PERCENTAGE	10.0%	Recommended
MacGill & Co. (William V. MacGill & Co.)	1	PERCENTAGE	5.0%	Recommended
Texas Medical Technology Inc	1	PERCENTAGE	2.0%	Recommended
Zamsinc	1	PERCENTAGE	1.0%	Recommended
MAVICH	1	PERCENTAGE	0.0%	Recommended





AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT  
**BROWNSVILLE**  
 INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

**Board Meeting November 7, 2022**  
**Bid #23-042 Medical Supplies & Equipment District-Wide**

**165 PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT - PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT ON MEDICAL AND HEALTH EDUCATIONAL AND TRAINING VIDEOS.**

Supplier	QTY	UOM	% Discount	
McKesson Medical-Surgical Government Solutions LLC	1	PERCENTAGE	20.0%	Recommended
School Health Corp.	1	PERCENTAGE	13.0%	Recommended
NAO Global Health	1	PERCENTAGE	10.0%	Recommended
SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC.	1	PERCENTAGE	10.0%	Recommended
MacGill & Co. (William V. MacGill & Co.)	1	PERCENTAGE	5.0%	Recommended
Texas Medical Technology Inc	1	PERCENTAGE	2.0%	Recommended
Zamsinc	1	PERCENTAGE	1.0%	Recommended
ALERT SERVICES INC	1	PERCENTAGE	0.0%	Recommended

**166 PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT - PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT ON MEDICAL AND HEALTH EDUCATIONAL AND TRAINING BOOKS INCLUDING SOURCE BOOKS, REFERENCE MATERIALS AND CHARTS, NURSE PLAN RECORD NOTEBOOKS, HANDBOOKS, ETC.**

Supplier	QTY	UOM	% Discount	
McKesson Medical-Surgical Government Solutions LLC	1	PERCENTAGE	20.0%	Recommended
School Health Corp.	1	PERCENTAGE	13.0%	Recommended
NAO Global Health	1	PERCENTAGE	10.0%	Recommended
SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC.	1	PERCENTAGE	10.0%	Recommended
MacGill & Co. (William V. MacGill & Co.)	1	PERCENTAGE	5.0%	Recommended
Texas Medical Technology Inc	1	PERCENTAGE	2.0%	Recommended
Zamsinc	1	PERCENTAGE	1.0%	Recommended
ALERT SERVICES INC	1	PERCENTAGE	0.0%	Recommended



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT  
**BROWNSVILLE**  
INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

**Board Meeting November 7, 2022**  
**Bid #23-042 Medical Supplies & Equipment District-Wide**

**167 PERCENT DISCOUNT ON OTHER MEDICAL AND HEALTH SUPPLIES AND MATERIALS THAT WERE NOT LISTED ABOVE (EDUCATIONAL AND TRAINING VIDEOS, BOOKS INCLUDING SOURCE BOOKS, REFERENCE MATERIALS AND CHARTS, NURSE PLAN RECORD NOTEBOOKS, HANDBOOKS, RESUSCI CPR MANIKINS, LIFE SUPPORT ACCESSORIES)**

<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>% Discount</b>	
McKesson Medical-Surgical Government Solutions LLC	1	PERCENTAGE	20.0%	Recommended
Pocket Nurse (Pocket Nurse Enterprises, Inc.)	1	PERCENTAGE	15.0%	Recommended
School Health Corp.	1	PERCENTAGE	13.0%	Recommended
NAO Global Health	1	PERCENTAGE	10.0%	Recommended
SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC.	1	PERCENTAGE	10.0%	Recommended
MacGill & Co. (William V. MacGill & Co.)	1	PERCENTAGE	5.0%	Recommended
Texas Medical Technology Inc	1	PERCENTAGE	2.0%	Recommended
Medicaleshop Inc	1	PERCENTAGE	1.0%	Recommended
Zamsinc	1	PERCENTAGE	1.0%	Recommended
ALERT SERVICES INC	1	PERCENTAGE	0.0%	Recommended