

#21-020-10-22
Renewal #1: 11/1/22-10/31/23

| | Company Name | Required Quote # | Hardback, Pre-Bound, Paperback Books | Catalog | E-Books |
|----|--|------------------|--------------------------------------|-----------------|---------|
| 1 | ABDO Publishing Company MUST USE OPAL BOOZ | N/A | | Approved Vendor | |
| 2 | Barnes & Nobles Booksellers | 21-020-10-22 | Secondary | Approved Vendor | |
| 3 | Bound to Stay Bound | | Primary | Approved Vendor | Primary |
| 4 | Capstone Publishers (Coughlan Companies LLC) | | | Approved Vendor | |
| 5 | Cengage Learning Inc. | 21-020-10-22 | | Approved Vendor | |
| 6 | Children's Plus Inc | | | Approved Vendor | |
| 7 | Complete Book & Media Supply LLC | | | Approved Vendor | |
| 8 | Delaney Educaitional Enterprises | | | Approved Vendor | |
| 9 | Demco, Inc. | C93000 | | Approved Vendor | |
| 10 | Follett School Solutions, Inc | | Primary | Approved Vendor | |
| 11 | Garrett Book Company | | | Approved Vendor | |
| 12 | Gumdrop Books (Central Programs, Inc) | 21-020-10-22 | | Approved Vendor | |
| 13 | Junior Library Guild (MT Library Services Inc) | | | Approved Vendor | |
| 14 | Keystone Books & Media | | | Approved Vendor | |
| 15 | Lakeshore Learning Material | 21-020-10-22 | | Approved Vendor | |
| 16 | Lerner Publishing Group | | | Approved Vendor | |
| 17 | The Library Store, Inc. | TX8264 | | Approved Vendor | |
| 18 | Mackin Educational Resources | SANANG | Secondary | Approved Vendor | Primary |
| 19 | Magazine Subscriptions PTP | | | Approved Vendor | |
| 20 | Meteor Education, LLC | 22 | | Approved Vendor | |
| 21 | Mitinet , Inc | | | Approved Vendor | |
| 22 | Opal Booz & Associates | | Primary | Approved Vendor | |
| 23 | OverDrive, Inc. | | | Approved Vendor | Primary |
| 24 | Perma-Bound Books (Hertzberg-New Method, Inc) | | Primary | Approved Vendor | |
| 25 | Rainbow Book Company | | | Approved Vendor | |
| 26 | Renaissance Learning Inc. | | | Approved Vendor | |
| 27 | Scholastic Library Publishing, Inc | | | Approved Vendor | |
| 28 | Steps to Literacy | | | Approved Vendor | |
| 29 | Teacher Store | | | Approved Vendor | |
| 30 | Textbook Warehouse | 21-020-10-22 | | Approved Vendor | |
| 31 | W.T. Cox Subscriptions | 21-020-10-23 | | Approved Vendor | |

#21-020-10-22

Renewal #1: 11/1/22-10/31/23

Vendor #

1

26188

2

0621

3

1787

4

26191

ABDO Publishing

Company
MUST USE OPAL BOOZBarnes & Nobles
BooksellersBound to Stay Bound
Books, Inc.Capstone Classroom
(Coughlan Companies
LLC)

COMPANY:

| | | | | |
|--|--|--|--|--|
| ADDRESS: | PO Box 398166 Minneapolis, MN 55439 | 2617 West Loop 250N Midland, TX 79705 | 1880 West Morton Jacksonville, IL 62650 | 1710 Roe Crest Drive North Mankato, MN 56003 |
| CONTACT NAME: | Joslyn Lillion | Jim L Oberbrockling | Lori Smith | Doug Smith |
| PHONE #: | (800) 800-1312 | (432) 682-8880 | (800) 637-6586 | (507) 385-8421 |
| FAX #: | (800) 862-3480 | (432) 682-8828 | (800) 747-2872 | (888) 262-0705 |
| E-MAIL: | bids@abdopublishing.com | crm2686@bn.com | sales@btsb.com | bids@capstonepub.com |
| WEB ADDRESS: | www.abdopublishing.com | www.bn.com | www.btsb.com | www.capstonepub.com |
| REQUIRED QUOTE #: | N/A | 21-020-10-22 | | |
| Books | 30% | 0-35% | 30% | 0% |
| Library Equipment | | | | |
| Library Furniture | | | | |
| Library Supplies | | | | |
| Periodicals | | | | |
| DVD's | | | | |
| Video's | | | | |
| CD's | | | | |
| Miscellaneous | | | | |
| DEVIATIONS: | none | none | none | none |
| Number of titles readily available in inventory: | | | 18,000 | 10,000 |
| Fill Rate: | 99% | 95.0% | 93.0% | 99.0% |
| Time of turn around from order: | 7-10 Business Days | 3-4 Weeks | 7-10 Working Days | 7-10 Working Days |
| Hardbacks | | | | |
| Class A Buckram binding discount: | N/A | N/A | 30% | N/A |
| Publisher Library binding discount: | 0% | n | No Bid | 25% |
| Publisher Trade binding discount: | N/A | 0-35% | No Bid | N/A |
| Paperback/Pre-Binds | | | | |
| Paperback discount: | N/A | 0-35% | 18% | 5-10% |
| Pre-bound Trade books discount: | N/A | N/A | No Bid | N/A |
| Pre-bound paperback discount: | N/A | N/A | No Bid | N/A |
| Is cataloging available for paperbacks? Y or N | N/A | No | Yes | No |
| Video/Media | | | | |
| eBooks discount: | 0% | 0-5% | No Bid | 25% |
| DVD discount: | N/A | 0-35% | No Bid | N/A |
| Video discount: | N/A | 0-35% | No Bid | N/A |
| Processing and Services | | | | |
| What is minimum order to get processing: | Attached Doc. | Services Not Available | No Minimum | No Minimum |
| Shelf ready processing & unattached price per title: | 350 Attached & Unattached | | No Charge | Attached |
| MARC records price per title: | 350 w/purchase over 350 | | No Charge | Attached |
| Security strips 3M tattletape price per title: | .3 unattached, .6 attached | | \$0.50 | \$0.79 |
| Electronic reviews available? Y or N | Yes | | Yes | Yes |
| AR Quizzes price per quiz: | N/A | | No Bid | N/A |
| Replacement Policy: | Attached Doc. | | | 100% Satisfaction |
| Customer Service Rep: | | | TT'Onna Jackson | 800-7474992 |
| Visitation Schedule: | call local rep | | As Needed | As Needed |
| Warranty of Guarantee on Merchandise: | 100% satisfaction | | Attached | No questions asked |
| Send Copy of Warranty: | Attached | | Attached | |

#21-020-10-22

Renewal #1: 11/1/22-10/31/23

Vendor #

5
10966
175457
215218
26192

| COMPANY: | Cengage Learning Inc. | Children's Plus Inc | Complete Book & Media Supply LLC | Delaney Educaitonal Enterprises |
|--|--|--|--|--|
| ADDRESS: | 27555 Drake Road Farmington Hills, MI 48331 | 1387 Dutch American Way Beecher, IL 60401 | 1200 Toro Grande Drive #200 Cedar Park, TX 78613 | PO Box 656 Peotone, IL 60468 |
| CONTACT NAME: | Lauren Thomson | John G. Walsh | Kendall Montiegel | Dominic Garza |
| PHONE #: | (512) 229-1906 | (800) 230-1279 | (512) 616-0400 | 800.788.5557 |
| FAX #: | N/A | 800896721300% | (512) 616-0410 | 800.660.2199 |
| E-MAIL: | bidteam@cengage.com | bids@childrensplusinc.com | kendall@completebook.com | bids@deebooks.com |
| WEB ADDRESS: | WWW.gale.com/schools | www.hellocpi.com | | www.deebooks.com |
| REQUIRED QUOTE #: | 21-020-10-22 | | | |
| Books | 0-70% | 0-30% | 0-50% | 0-30% |
| Library Equipment | | | | |
| Library Furniture | | | | |
| Library Supplies | | | | |
| Periodicals | | | 0-50% | |
| DVD's | | | 0-50% | |
| Video's | | | 0-50% | |
| CD's | | | 0-50% | |
| Miscellaneous | | | | |
| DEVIATIONS: | none | none | none | none |
| Number of titles readily available in inventory: | 15,500 | 300,000 | 3,000 | 300,000 |
| Fill Rate: | 99.0% | 99.0% | 97.0% | 99.0% |
| Time of turn around from order: | 5-10 Days | 28 Days | 5-14 Working Days | 28 Days |
| Hardbacks | | | | |
| Class A Buckram binding discount: | 0% | 0-30% | 0-50% | 0-30% |
| Publisher Library binding discount: | 0% | 0-30% | 0-50% | 0-30% |
| Publisher Trade binding discount: | 0% | 0-30% | 0-50% | 0-30% |
| Paperback/Pre-Binds | | | | |
| Paperback discount: | 0-70% | 0-30% | 0-50% | 0-30% |
| Pre-bound Trade books discount: | 0% | 0-30% | 0-50% | 0-30% |
| Pre-bound paperback discount: | 0% | 0-30% | 0-50% | 0-30% |
| Is cataloging available for paperbacks? Y or N | Yes | Yes | No | Yes |
| Video/Media | | | | |
| eBooks discount: | 0-70% | 0-30% | 0-10% | 0-30% |
| DVD discount: | N/A | N/A | 0-30% | N/A |
| Video discount: | N/A | N/A | 0-30% | N/A |
| Processing and Services | | | Not Available | |
| What is minimum order to get processing: | None | N/A | | N/A |
| Shelf ready processing & unattached price per title: | No Charge | 0 | | 0 |
| MARC records price per title: | No Charge | 0 w/purchase over 350 | | \$0.00 |
| Security strips 3M tattletape price per title: | No Charge | 0.5 | | \$0.50 |
| Electronic reviews available? Y or N | Yes | Yes | | Yes |
| AR Quizzes price per quiz: | N/A | No | | No |
| Replacement Policy: | 30 days on error or incorrect% | 100% Satisfaction | | 100% Satisfaction |
| Customer Service Rep: | Lindsay Smith | Call Customer Service | | Call Customer Service |
| Visitation Schedule: | TBD | As Needed | | Upon Request |
| Warranty of Guarantee on Merchandise: | Enclosed | 100% Satisfaction | | 100% Satisfaction |
| Send Copy of Warranty: | Enclosed | | | |

#21-020-10-22

Renewal #1: 11/1/22-10/31/23

Vendor #

9

0646

10

27300

11

26193

12

13481

| COMPANY: | Demco, Inc. | Follett Content Solutions, LLC | Garrett Book Company | Gumdrop Books (Central Programs, Inc) |
|--|--|--|--|--|
| ADDRESS: | 4810 Forest Run Rd. Madison, WI 53704 | 1340 Ridgeview Drive McHenry, IL 60050 | 130 E 13th Street Ada, OK 74820 | P.O. Box 505 Bethany, MO 64424 |
| CONTACT NAME: | Kristopher L. Snow | Naomi Bates | Cheryl York | Nancy Crovetti |
| PHONE #: | (866) 558-9068 | (877) 899-8550 ext 46425 | 800.654.9366 | 800.821.7199 |
| FAX #: | (888) 320-0288 | (800) 852-5458 | 888.525.1560 | 866.321.7199 |
| E-MAIL: | orders@demco.com | fssorders@follettlearning.com | cheryl.york@garrettbooks.com | wecare@gumdropbooks.com |
| WEB ADDRESS: | | www.titlewave.com | www.garrettbooks.com | www.gumdropbooks.com |
| REQUIRED QUOTE #: | C93000 | | | 21-020-10-22 |
| Books | | 0% | 30% FROM PUBLISHERS | 0-70% |
| Library Equipment | 14% | | | |
| Library Furniture | 5% | | | |
| Library Supplies | 14% | | | |
| Periodicals | | | | |
| DVD's | | 0% | | |
| Video's | | 0% | | |
| CD's | | 0% | | |
| Miscellaneous | | 0% | | |
| DEVIATIONS: | \$75 Min order | none | none | none |
| Number of titles readily available in inventory: | | 10,342,290 | | 500,000 |
| Fill Rate: | | | 97.0% | 96.0% |
| Time of turn around from order: | | Upon Ordering | 30 Days | 10-15 Business Days |
| Hardbacks | No Bid | | | |
| Class A Buckram binding discount: | | N/A | No Bid | No Bid |
| Publisher Library binding discount: | | 0% | 30% | 0-70% off list price |
| Publisher Trade binding discount: | | 0% | No Bid | 0-70% off list price |
| Paperback/Pre-Binds | No Bid | | No Bid | |
| Paperback discount: | | 0% | | 0-40% |
| Pre-bound Trade books discount: | | 0% | | No Bid |
| Pre-bound paperback discount: | | 0% | | No Bid |
| Is cataloging available for paperbacks? Y or N | | Yes | | Yes |
| Video/Media | No Bid | | No Bid | |
| eBooks discount: | | 0% | | 0-70% |
| DVD discount: | | 0% | | No Bid |
| Video discount: | | 0% | | No Bid |
| Processing and Services | | | | |
| What is minimum order to get processing: | | N/A | No Minimum | No Minimum |
| Shelf ready processing & unattached price per title: | | Attached .69 Unattached .89 | .65 Attached, .45 Unattached | Price List attached |
| MARC records price per title: | | \$0.11 | No Charge | Free |
| Security strips 3M tattletape price per title: | | \$0.59 | .4 attached .2 Unattached | .96 attached, .38 unattached |
| Electronic reviews available? Y or N | | Yes | No Charge | Yes |
| AR Quizzes price per quiz: | | N/A | Not Available | No Bid |
| Replacement Policy: | | Replace or Credit | Replace at no charge for 2 yrs. | Replace, refund, or correct |
| Customer Service Rep: | | Pam Blake 888-511-5114 X48015 | Cheryl York | Lori Nashan |
| Visitation Schedule: | | As Requested | By appt | As Needed |
| Warranty of Guarantee on Merchandise: | | Std Manufactures warranty | N/A | 4 years after order date |
| Send Copy of Warranty: | | N/A | N/A | N/A |

#21-020-10-22

Renewal #1: 11/1/22-10/31/23

Vendor #

13
1641914
2630815
2732616
2480**Junior Library Guild (MT
Library Services Inc)****Keystone Books & Media****Lakeshore Learning Material****Lerner Publishing Group**

| | | | | |
|--|--|--|--|--|
| COMPANY: | Junior Library Guild (MT Library Services Inc) | Keystone Books & Media | Lakeshore Learning Material | Lerner Publishing Group |
| ADDRESS: | 7858 Industrial Parkway Plain City, OH 43064 | PO Box 95 Steger, IL 60475 | 2695 E. Dominguez Street Carson, CA 90895 | 241 First Avenue N Minneapolis, MN 55401 |
| CONTACT NAME: | Angela Christianson | Sadie Witvoet | Rafael Muro | Anna Matthews |
| PHONE #: | 800.325.9558 ext 7276 | (866) 231-7780 | (800) 421-5354 | 800.328.4929 ext 344 |
| FAX #: | 800.827.3080 | (888) 581-4850 | (310) 537-7990 | 800.332.1132 |
| E-MAIL: | customerservice@juniorlibraryguild.com | cs@keystonebooksmedia.com | biddept@lakeshorelearning.com | salesadmin@lernerbooks.com |
| WEB ADDRESS: | www.juniorlibraryguild.com | www.keystonebooksmedia.com | www.lakeshorelearning.com | www.lernerbooks.com |
| REQUIRED QUOTE #: | 21-020-10-22 | | | |
| Books | Prediscounted 75% | 0-30% | 5% | 25% |
| Library Equipment | | | 5% | |
| Library Furniture | | | 5% | |
| Library Supplies | | | 5% | |
| Periodicals | Prediscounted 75% | | | |
| DVD's | | | | |
| Video's | | | | |
| CD's | | | | |
| Miscellaneous | Prediscounted 75% | | 5% | 25% |
| DEVIATIONS: | none | none | Attached | None |
| Number of titles readily available in inventory: | | 300,000 | 700 | 3500+ |
| Fill Rate: | | 99.0% | 99.0% | 95.0% |
| Time of turn around from order: | | 28 Days | 48 hours | 1-2 Weeks |
| Hardbacks | | | | |
| Class A Buckram binding discount: | | 0-30% | N/A | N/A |
| Publisher Library binding discount: | | 0-30% | N/A | 25% |
| Publisher Trade binding discount: | | 0-30% | N/A | 25% |
| Paperback/Pre-Binds | | | | |
| Paperback discount: | | 0-30% | N/A | 0% |
| Pre-bound Trade books discount: | | 0-30% | N/A | N/A |
| Pre-bound paperback discount: | | 0-30% | N/A | N/A |
| Is cataloging available for paperbacks? Y or N | | | N/A | Yes |
| Video/Media | | | | |
| eBooks discount: | | 0-30% | N/A | 25% |
| DVD discount: | | N/A | N/A | N/A |
| Video discount: | | N/A | N/A | N/A |
| Processing and Services | | | | |
| What is minimum order to get processing: | | N/A | None | None |
| Shelf ready processing & unattached price per title: | | 0 | N/A | .95 Attached, .85 Detached |
| MARC records price per title: | | \$0.00 | N/A | 5 per order |
| Security strips 3M tattletape price per title: | | \$0.50 | N/A | .5 attached, .3 unattached |
| Electronic reviews available? Y or N | | Yes | N/A | Yes |
| AR Quizzes price per quiz: | | No | N/A | N/A |
| Replacement Policy: | | 100% Satisfaction | Attached | N/A |
| Customer Service Rep: | | Call Customer Service | Anthony McKee | 800-328-4929 |
| Visitation Schedule: | | Upon Request | As Needed | N/A |
| Warranty of Guarantee on Merchandise: | | 100% Satisfaction | | 60 Day return |
| Send Copy of Warranty: | | | Attached | N/A |

#21-020-10-22

Renewal #1: 11/1/22-10/31/23

Vendor #

17
123118
1822419
27528

| COMPANY: | The Library Store, Inc. | Mackin Educational Resources | Magazine Subscriptions PTP |
|--|--|--|--|
| ADDRESS: | 301 E. South St., PO Box 0964 Tremont, IL 61568 | 3505 County Road 42 West Burnsville, MN 55306 | 2707 Princeton Dr. Austin, TX 78741 |
| CONTACT NAME: | Shayla Hill | Grace Mundt | Melvin Clearman |
| PHONE #: | 8005487204x7235 | 800.245.9540 | (800) 733-5253 |
| FAX #: | (800) 320-7706 | 800.369.5490 | (512) 442-5253 |
| E-MAIL: | bids@librarystore.com | bids@mackin.com | mag_subscript.ptp@att.net |
| WEB ADDRESS: | thelibrarystore.com | www.mackin.com | www.magazinesptp.com |
| REQUIRED QUOTE #: | TX8264 | SANANG | |
| Books | 0-55% | 5-7% | |
| Library Equipment | | | |
| Library Furniture | 0-55% | | |
| Library Supplies | 0-55% | | |
| Periodicals | 0-55% | | 0-30% |
| DVD's | 0-55% | | |
| Video's | | | |
| CD's | 0-55% | | |
| Miscellaneous | 0-55% | | |
| DEVIATIONS: | none | none | none |
| Number of titles readily available in inventory: | | 5,000,000 | |
| Fill Rate: | | 98-100% | 100.0% |
| Time of turn around from order: | | 28-45 Days | 4-12 Weeks |
| Hardbacks | | | |
| Class A Buckram binding discount: | | No Bid | |
| Publisher Library binding discount: | | Additional 7% | |
| Publisher Trade binding discount: | | Additional 7% | |
| Paperback/Pre-Binds | | | |
| Paperback discount: | | Additional 7% | |
| Pre-bound Trade books discount: | | | |
| Pre-bound paperback discount: | | Additional 7% | |
| Is cataloging available for paperbacks? Y or N | | Yes | |
| Video/Media | | | |
| eBooks discount: | | Additional 5% | |
| DVD discount: | | No Bid | |
| Video discount: | | No Bid | |
| Processing and Services | | | |
| What is minimum order to get processing: | | None | |
| Shelf ready processing & unattached price per title: | | Free | |
| MARC records price per title: | | Free | |
| Security strips 3M tattletape price per title: | | \$0.49 | |
| Electronic reviews available? Y or N | | Yes | |
| AR Quizzes price per quiz: | | N/A | |
| Replacement Policy: | | Attached | Damaged issues replaced at no cost |
| Customer Service Rep: | | Vanessa Stenulson | Jennifer Flores |
| Visitation Schedule: | | As Needed | |
| Warranty of Guarantee on Merchandise: | | Attached | |
| Send Copy of Warranty: | | Attached | |

#21-020-10-22

Renewal #1: 11/1/22-10/31/23

Vendor #

20
2195721
1168222
1678023
26203

| COMPANY: | Meteor Education, LLC | Mitinet , Inc | Opal Booz & Associates | OverDrive, Inc. |
|--|--|--|--|--|
| ADDRESS: | 690 NE 23rd Ave Gainesville, FL 32609 | PO Box 505 Bethany, MO 64424 | 2333 Lynbrook Drive Abilene, TX 79606 | One OverDrive Way Cleveland, OH 44125 |
| CONTACT NAME: | Jennifer Lewis | Cindy Beerkircher | Candy Freiheit | Jack Darden |
| PHONE #: | (210) 382-5659 | (800) 824-6272 | (866) 737-7910 | (216) 573-6886 |
| FAX #: | (877) 373-0622 | (660) 425-3998 | (866) 652-3390 | (216) 573-6889 |
| E-MAIL: | jenlewis@meteorededucation.com | wecare@mitinet.com | thebookies@aol.com | jdarden@overdrive.com |
| WEB ADDRESS: | www.meteorededucation.com | www.mitinet.com | | www.overdrive.com |
| REQUIRED QUOTE #: | RFP #21-020-10-22 | | | |
| Books | | | 25% | 0% |
| Library Equipment | 5% | | | |
| Library Furniture | 5% | | | |
| Library Supplies | | | | |
| Periodicals | | | | |
| DVD's | | | | |
| Video's | | | | |
| CD's | | | | |
| Miscellaneous | 5% | 0% | | |
| DEVIATIONS: | None | none | none | none |
| Number of titles readily available in inventory: | N/A | N/A | | |
| Fill Rate: | N/A | 3 Business Days% | 99.0% | |
| Time of turn around from order: | N/A | | 30 days or less | |
| Hardbacks | | N/A | | |
| Class A Buckram binding discount: | N/A | | N/A | |
| Publisher Library binding discount: | N/A | | 25-30% | |
| Publisher Trade binding discount: | N/A | | 5% | |
| Paperback/Pre-Binds | | N/A | | |
| Paperback discount: | N/A | | 0% | |
| Pre-bound Trade books discount: | N/A | | 5% | |
| Pre-bound paperback discount: | N/A | | 5% | |
| Is cataloging available for paperbacks? Y or N | N/A | | Yes | |
| Video/Media | | N/A | | |
| eBooks discount: | N/A | | 25% | |
| DVD discount: | N/A | | N/A | |
| Video discount: | N/A | | N/A | |
| Processing and Services | | | | |
| What is minimum order to get processing: | >20K additional fees | | No Min | |
| Shelf ready processing & unattached price per title: | | | Free | |
| MARC records price per title: | | Withen Software | Free | |
| Security strips 3M tattletape price per title: | | | Free | |
| Electronic reviews available? Y or N | | | Yes | |
| AR Quizzes price per quiz: | | | N/A | |
| Replacement Policy: | | | Full Replacement | |
| Customer Service Rep: | Jennifer Lewis | | Candy Freineit | |
| Visitation Schedule: | As Needed | | Fall/ Spring | |
| Warranty of Guarantee on Merchandise: | | | Unconditional | |
| Send Copy of Warranty: | | | Yes | |

Perma-Bound Books**(Hertzberg-New Method, Inc) Rainbow Book Company****Renaissance Learning Inc.****COMPANY:**

| | | | |
|----------------------|--|--|--|
| ADDRESS: | 617 E. Vandalia Road Jacksonville, IL 62650 | PO Box 159 Crete, IL 60417 | 2911 Peach Street Wisconsin Rapids, WI 54495-8036 |
| CONTACT NAME: | Heather Cook | Michael Beechin | Debra C Schoenick |
| PHONE #: | (217) 243-5451 | 800.255.0965 | 800.338.4204 |
| FAX #: | 800.861.8143 | 800.827.5988 | 866.558.4056 |
| E-MAIL: | bids@perma-bound.com | sales@rainbowbookcompany.com | askproposals@renaissance.com |
| WEB ADDRESS: | www.perma-bound.com | www.rainbowbookcompany.com | www.renaissance.com |

REQUIRED QUOTE #:

| | | | |
|--|------------------|-------------------|--------------------------------|
| Books | 0-35% | 0-30% | 0% |
| Library Equipment | | | |
| Library Furniture | | | |
| Library Supplies | | | 0% |
| Periodicals | | | |
| DVD's | 0-35% | | |
| Video's | 0-35% | | |
| CD's | 0-35% | | |
| Miscellaneous | 0-35% | | 0% |
| DEVIATIONS: | none | None | Yes |
| Number of titles readily available in inventory: | | 300,000 | 13,000 |
| Fill Rate: | 93.0% | 99.0% | |
| Time of turn around from order: | Within 30 Days | 28 Days | |
| Hardbacks | | | No Bid |
| Class A Buckram binding discount: | No Buckbram | 0-30% | |
| Publisher Library binding discount: | 0% | 0-30% | |
| Publisher Trade binding discount: | 0% | 0-30% | |
| Paperback/Pre-Binds | | | No Bid |
| Paperback discount: | 0% | 0-30% | |
| Pre-bound Trade books discount: | 2% | 0-30% | |
| Pre-bound paperback discount: | 2% | 0-30% | |
| Is cataloging available for paperbacks? Y or N | Yes | Yes | |
| Video/Media | | | |
| eBooks discount: | 0% | 0-30% | 0% |
| DVD discount: | 0% | N/A | |
| Video discount: | 0% | N/A | |
| Processing and Services | | | |
| What is minimum order to get processing: | No Minimum | N/A | Minimums Vary |
| Shelf ready processing & unattached price per title: | Free | 0 | No Bid |
| MARC records price per title: | Free | \$0.00 | No Bid |
| Security strips 3M tattletape price per title: | 1.30 ea | \$0.50 | No Bid |
| Electronic reviews available? Y or N | Yes | Yes | No Bid |
| AR Quizzes price per quiz: | no | No | Included in Accelerated Reader |
| Replacement Policy: | Attached | 100% Satisfaction | Attached |
| Customer Service Rep: | Lex Anne Seifert | | Kimberly Cunningham |
| Visitation Schedule: | Upon Request | Upon Request | N/A |
| Warranty of Guarantee on Merchandise: | Attached | 100% Satisfaction | |
| Send Copy of Warranty: | Attached | | |

| COMPANY: | Scholastic Library Publishing, Inc | Steps to Literacy | Teacher Store |
|--|--|--|--|
| ADDRESS: | 557 Broadway New York, NY 10012 | PO Box 845576 Boston, MA 02284 | 310 North Chadbourne San Angelo, TX 76903 |
| CONTACT NAME: | Kathy Brown | Steve Dvorak | Dominic Santos |
| PHONE #: | 800.621.1115 | (800) 895-2804 | (325) 653-5778 |
| FAX #: | 203.797.3478 | (732) 560-8699 | (325) 659-2672 |
| E-MAIL: | KMBrown@scholastic.com | sales@stepstoliteracy.com | angeloschoolsupplies@hotmail.com |
| WEB ADDRESS: | www.scholastic.com/librarypublishing | stepstoliteracy.com | www.newilovetoteach.com |
| REQUIRED QUOTE #: | | | |
| Books | 0-40% | 25% | 10% |
| Library Equipment | | | |
| Library Furniture | | | |
| Library Supplies | | | |
| Periodicals | | | |
| DVD's | | | |
| Video's | | | |
| CD's | | | |
| Miscellaneous | | | |
| DEVIATIONS: | none | none | none |
| Number of titles readily available in inventory: | 750 | 7,500 | |
| Fill Rate: | 90.0% | 97.0% | 7-10 Days% |
| Time of turn around from order: | 10-14 Days | 7-10 Business Days | |
| Hardbacks | | | |
| Class A Buckram binding discount: | N/A | N/A | |
| Publisher Library binding discount: | 30% on selected titles | N/A | |
| Publisher Trade binding discount: | 40% on selected titles | 25% | |
| Paperback/Pre-Binds | | | |
| Paperback discount: | N/A | 25% | 10% |
| Pre-bound Trade books discount: | N/A | N/A | |
| Pre-bound paperback discount: | N/A | N/A | |
| Is cataloging available for paperbacks? Y or N | N/A | Yes | |
| Video/Media | | | |
| eBooks discount: | 0% | N/A | |
| DVD discount: | N/A | N/A | |
| Video discount: | N/A | N/A | |
| Processing and Services | | | |
| What is minimum order to get processing: | None | No Minimum | |
| Shelf ready processing & unattached price per title: | Free | N/A | |
| MARC records price per title: | Free | N/A | |
| Security strips 3M tattletape price per title: | Free | N/A | |
| Electronic reviews available? Y or N | Yes | No | |
| AR Quizzes price per quiz: | NO | N/A | |
| Replacement Policy: | Flexible | 30 Days | |
| Customer Service Rep: | Customer Service | Steve Dvorak | |
| Visitation Schedule: | As Needed | 8-5pm Mon-Fri. | |
| Warranty of Guarantee on Merchandise: | N/A | N/A | |
| Send Copy of Warranty: | | N/A | |

#21-020-10-22

Renewal #1: 11/1/22-10/31/23

Vendor #

30
2378631
0283

W.T. Cox

COMPANY: Textbook Warehouse, LLC Subscriptions

| | | |
|--|--|--|
| ADDRESS: | 936 Curie Dr Alpharetta, GA 30005 | 201 Village Road Shallotte, NC 28470 |
| CONTACT NAME: | Delores Knighting | Nancy Valley |
| PHONE #: | (800) 796-9152 | (800) 571-9554 |
| FAX #: | (800) 796-9154 | (877) 755-6274 |
| E-MAIL: | delores@tbwarehouse.com | nvalley@wtcox.com |
| WEB ADDRESS: | www.textbookwarehouse.com | www.wtcox.com |
| REQUIRED QUOTE #: | 21-020-10-22 | 21-020-10-23 |
| Books | 37% | |
| Library Equipment | | |
| Library Furniture | | |
| Library Supplies | | |
| Periodicals | | 23% |
| DVD's | | |
| Video's | | |
| CD's | | |
| Miscellaneous | | |
| DEVIATIONS: | none | none |
| Number of titles readily available in inventory: | 2000+ | 3,000 |
| Fill Rate: | 85.0% | 98.0% |
| Time of turn around from order: | 7-10 Days | 45 Days |
| Hardbacks | | N/A |
| Class A Buckram binding discount: | N/A | |
| Publisher Library binding discount: | N/A | |
| Publisher Trade binding discount: | 4.75 Each | |
| Paperback/Pre-Binds | | N/A |
| Paperback discount: | 37% | |
| Pre-bound Trade books discount: | 37% | |
| Pre-bound paperback discount: | 0% | |
| Is cataloging available for paperbacks? Y or N | No | |
| Video/Media | | N/A |
| eBooks discount: | 0% | |
| DVD discount: | 0% | |
| Video discount: | 0% | |
| Processing and Services | Do not provide this service | |
| What is minimum order to get processing: | | |
| Shelf ready processing & unattached price per title: | | |
| MARC records price per title: | | \$0.32 |
| Security strips 3M tattletape price per title: | | N/A |
| Electronic reviews available? Y or N | | No |
| AR Quizzes price per quiz: | | N/A |
| Replacement Policy: | | Contact Customer care |
| Customer Service Rep: | | Karen Cashman |
| Visitation Schedule: | | As Needed |
| Warranty of Guarantee on Merchandise: | | |
| Send Copy of Warranty: | | |