

COLORED PAPER AWARDED

NEW AWARD FOR WHITE

21-025-12-22 DUAL PURPOSE PAPER		COMPANY NAME	Lighthouse Office Supply (West Texas Lighthouse for the Blind)	School Specialty, LLC	Quill LLC (Staples Inc)
		ADDRESS	555 E 6th Street San Angelo, TX 76903	W6316 Design Drive Greenville, WI 54942	100 Schelter Road Lincolnshire, IL 60069
		CONTACT NAME	Joshua Glaze	Amy Fuss	Karrie Szalkowski
		PHONE #	325.653.4231	888.388.3224	800.634.4809
		FAX #	325.657.9367	800.675.1775	800.789.2016
		E-MAIL	<a href="mailto:jglaze@lighthousefortheblind.org">jglaze@lighthousefortheblind.org</a>	<a href="mailto:orders@schoolspecialty.com">orders@schoolspecialty.com</a>	<a href="mailto:bid@quill.com">bid@quill.com</a>
		WEB	<a href="http://www.lighthouseofficesupply.com">www.lighthouseofficesupply.com</a>	<a href="http://www.schoolspecialty.com">www.schoolspecialty.com</a>	<a href="http://www.quill.com">www.quill.com</a>
		REQUIRED QUOTE #		Q-132222	
		% DISCOUNT			
ITEM	DESCRIPTION	BRAND, PRODUCT CODE, REAM PRICE			
1	White dual purpose paper - 8 ½ x 11, 20 lb., virgin stock, 500 sheets/ream, 10 reams/carton – product to run equally well on high speed/volume & low speed/volume, front and back: Global; Domtar; GP Spectrum; Sparco PrintRight Paper Pro; Universal; LaserX; Xerox; or Approved Equal	Brand	4.35	No Bid	Quill
		Product Code	LOS-PAPER		720222 for per ream pricing 720222CT for case pricing
		Ream Price	4.35		4.33 ream 37.99 case
2	White dual purpose paper - 8 ½ x 14, 20 lb., virgin stock, 500 sheets/ream, 10 reams/carton – product to run equally well on high speed/volume & low speed/volume, front and back: Global; Domtar; GP Spectrum; Sparco PrintRight Paper Pro; Universal; LaserX; Xerox; or Approved Equal	Brand	Universal	No Bid	Quill
		Product Code	UNV24200		720223
		Ream Price	8.50		5.63
3	Colored dual purpose paper (Pastels) – 8 ½ X 11, 20 lb., virgin stock, 500 sheets/ream, 10 reams/carton – product to run equally well on high speed/volume & low speed/volume front and back: Domtar; GP Spectrum; Sparco PrintRight Paper Pro; Universal; LaserX; Xerox; or Approved Equal	Brand	No Bid	Domtar - Earthchoice	Astrobright
		Product Code			
		Ream Price		5.42	8.26-12.87
4	Bright multi-purpose paper (Neons) – 8 ½ x 11, 24 lb., virgin stock, 500 sheets/ream, 10 reams/carton – product to run equally well on high speed/volume & low speed/volume, front and back: Wausau; Pacon; Mohawk; Boise; or Approved Equal	Brand	No Bid	Neenah - Exact	Astrobright/ Wausau
		Product Code			
		Ream Price		9.55	8.99-10.53
<b>Bid Questionnaire</b>					
1	State your <i>Minimum</i> delivery quantity in reams.	White Paper	10	No Minimum	No Minimum
		Color Paper	No Minimum	No Minimum	No Minimum
2	This contract runs through December 31, 2022. Will your prices remain firm for this time period?  If No, State the term your prices will be FIRM	Yes _____	No	Yes	Yes
		_____	2 Months		
3	Prices quoted are F.O.B. San Angelo ISD campuses/departments:	Yes _____	Yes	Yes	Yes
<b>Scores</b>			<b>56</b>	<b>64</b>	<b>92</b>