
ART SUPPLIES BID 2368-22 PART A Dick Blick

WB 

Mason

DESCRIPTION: UNIT: Price Price

ALEENE'S TACKY GLUE 16OZ $5.20 NO BID

ART PASTE FOR PAPER MACHE EA $3.36 $2.48 

ASSORTED COLOR OAK TAG 18 X 24 (COMES IN LIGHTWEIGHT) PKG. 100 $17.08 

ASSORTED COLOR OAK TAG 24 X 36 (COMES IN LIGHTWEIGHT) PKG. 100 $36.00 

ASSORTED COLORS METALLIC FOIL PAPER 20" X 26" EACH $20.85 $27.52 

ASSORTED CORRUGATED COROBUFF SHEETS 12X16 PKG.12 $4.93 

CEMENT,RUBBER GALLON $25.19 

CHALKS, PASTELS ALPHACOLOR, FLUORESCENT BOX 12 $12.64 $9.36 

CHALKS, PASTELS ALPHACOLOR, SQUARE BOX 24 $12.10 $8.93 

CLASS PACK CONSTRUCTION PAPER CRAYONS PG 400 $34.48 

CLASS PACK CRAYOLA CRAYONS PKG. 800 $45.51 

CLASS PACK MR. SKETCH CHISLE TIP MARKERS LOW ODOR PKG. 192 $43.67 

CLASS PACK WATER SOLUABLE PORTFOLIO SERIES OIL PASTELS PKG. 300 $88.55 $64.73 

CRAY PAS 16 COLOR SET SET OF 16 $1.88 $1.70 

CRAYOLA CRAYONS (REGULAR SIZE) INDIVIDUAL COLORS IN BULK BLACK BOX 12 $1.34 

CRAYOLA CRAYONS (REGULAR SIZE) INDIVIDUAL COLORS IN BULK WHITE BOX 12 $1.34 

CRAYOLA GLUE - NO CLOG TOPS 4OZ EACH $0.87 

CRAYON FOR CLASSPACKS - BLACK dozen $1.34 

CRAYONS, FOR CONSTRUCTION PAPER 400 SET $34.48 

CRAYONS, LARGE WAX, COLORS BOX 16 $2.86 

CRAYONS, LARGE WAX, COLORS ANTIROLL BOX 8 $1.49 

CRAYONS, METALLIC BOX 16 $2.43 

CRAYONS, PORTFOLIO SERIES WATER SOLUBLE OIL PASTELS BOX 12 $2.98 

CRAYONS, SMALL WAX BOX8 $0.60 

CRAYONS, SMALL WAX BOX48 $2.85 
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CRAYONS, SMALL WAX LIFT LID BOX 24 $1.34 

DISPOSABLE PAINT/CRAFT CUPS 100/ST $7.45 $9.89 

EBONY PENCILS DZ $5.79 $5.83 

ERASERS, WHITE VINYL PK4 NO BID

FADELESS ASSORTED PAPER "DESIGNER ART PEPER" 12 X 18 PKG. 100 $12.70 

FELT, ASSORTED COLORS, 12 PIECE PKG.12 $5.47 

FOAM BOARD, SCRATCH PRINTING PLATE PKG.12 $9.07 

FOAM BORAD, CORE, WHITE 24"X36" PKG.10 $84.56 $54.84 

FOLIA COLOR CORRUGATED PAPER, PKG OF 10 – RAINBOW COLORS 10 X14” Pkg of 10
$7.54 $4.93 

FUNTACK, (1 OZ PACKAGE) EACH $1.11 

GESSO GALLON $20.23 $44.93 

GLAZE PENCILS 12/BX NO BID

GLOSS GLAZE GALLON $54.36 $36.82 

GLOSS SEALER GALLON $48.88 

GLUE DISAPPEARING PURPLE ALL PURPOSE STICKS Box of 60 $26.22 $22.29 

GLUE DISAPPEARING PURPLE ALL PURPOSE STICKS 60/BOX Box of 60 $26.22 $22.29 

GLUE STICKS, .24 OZ Pkg. 60 $0.52 $22.29 

GLUE WASHABLE SCHOOL GLUE, CLEAR 5 oz 

bottles $2.48 $2.95 

GLUE, (4 OZ)SQUEEZE BOTTLE GLUE ALL EACH $0.71 

GLUE, ELMERS GLUE ALL GALLON $17.33 

GLUE, STICK (.26 OZ.) CLEAR EACH $0.62 

GLUE, STICK (.26 OZ.) PURPLE EACH $0.18 

GLUE, STICK (1.23 OZ.) CLEAR EACH $1.64 

GLUE, STICK (1.23 OZ.) PURPLE EACH $0.54 

HYGLOS METALLIC FOIL PAPER PK $20.85 $27.52 

INK PEN HOLDERS SPEEDBALL STANDARD PEN HOLDER 6.5" LONG BLACK PLASTIC DZ $10.44 

MAKE-A-MASK – REUSABLE FACE FORMS Pkg of 10 NO BID

MANILLA OAK TAG 24 X 36 (HEAVYWEIGHT) PKG. 100 $24.31 

MARKERS, ODORLESS WATER BASE, BROAD FELT TIP SET 12 $6.15 

MARKERS, PERMANENT NONTOXIC, SHARPIE FINE POINT, BLACK EACH $0.95 $0.70 

MARKERS, SHARPIE ULTRA NONTOXIC FINE, BLACK DOZEN $11.88 $8.40 



MARKERS, SHARPIE ULTRA NONTOXIC FINE,BLUE DOZEN $11.88 $8.40 

MARKERS, SHARPIE ULTRA NONTOXIC FINE,RED DOZEN $11.88 $8.40 

MARKERS, WATERBASE CONE TIP, BOLD SET 8 $2.18 

MARKERS, WATERBASE CONE TIP, FLUORESCENT SET6 NO BID

MARKERS, WATERBASE CONE TIP, MULTICULTURAL SET 8 $2.91 

MARKERS, WATERBASE CONE TIP, TROPICAL SET 8 $2.91 

MARKERS, WATERBASE. FINE TIP SET 8 $2.18 

MOD PODGE GLOSS- LUSTRE GALLON $28.15 $39.72 

NEON FLUORESCENT PAPER (9X12 WAS ASKED FOR BUT I COULD ONLY FIND 12X18) 20 SHEETS $11.20 

NEWSBOARD 18"X24" 12/pk NO BID

NITRATE DISPOSABLE GLOVES MEDIUM PKG. 100 $7.73 $53.08 

NITRATE DISPOSABLE GLOVES SMALL PKG. 100 $7.73 $69.36 

PAINT, ACRYLIC, PERMANENT PORTFOLIO SERIES, BLUE BRILLIANT PINT $5.93 

PAINT, ACRYLIC, PERMANENT PORTFOLIO SERIES, IVORY BLACK PINT $5.93 

PAINT, ACRYLIC, PERMANENT PORTFOLIO SERIES, RED DEEP PINT $5.93 

PAINT, ACRYLIC, PERMANENT PORTFOLIO SERIES, WHITE TITANIUM PINT $5.93 

PAINT, ACRYLIC, PERMANENT PORTFOLIO SERIES, YELLOW BRILLIANT PINT $5.93 

PAINT, PRINTMAKING, AND COLLAGE TRAY, 11X9X1 Pkg. 250 $44.19 

PAINT, TEMPERA LIQUID, BLACK PINT $5.13 

PAINT, TEMPERA LIQUID, BLACK QUART $8.73 

PAINT, TEMPERA LIQUID, BLUE PINT $5.13 

PAINT, TEMPERA LIQUID, BLUE QUART $8.73 

PAINT, TEMPERA LIQUID, BLUE TURQUOISE PINT $5.13 

PAINT, TEMPERA LIQUID, BLUE TURQUOISE QUART $8.73 

PAINT, TEMPERA LIQUID, BROWN PINT $5.13 

PAINT, TEMPERA LIQUID, BROWN QUART $8.73 

PAINT, TEMPERA LIQUID, GOLD PINT $7.75 

PAINT, TEMPERA LIQUID, GREEN PINT $5.13 

PAINT, TEMPERA LIQUID, GREEN QUART $8.73 

PAINT, TEMPERA LIQUID, MAGENTA PINT $5.13 

PAINT, TEMPERA LIQUID, MAGENTA QUART $8.73 

PAINT, TEMPERA LIQUID, ORANGE QUART $8.73 

PAINT, TEMPERA LIQUID, PEACH GALLON $15.17 



PAINT, TEMPERA LIQUID, RED PINT $5.13 

PAINT, TEMPERA LIQUID, RED QUART $8.73 

PAINT, TEMPERA LIQUID, SILVER PINT $7.75 

PAINT, TEMPERA LIQUID, VIOLET QUART $8.73 

PAINT, TEMPERA LIQUID, WHITE PINT $5.13 

PAINT, TEMPERA LIQUID, WHITE QUART $8.73 

PAINT, TEMPERA LIQUID, YELLOW PINT $5.13 

PAINT, TEMPERA LIQUID, YELLOW QUART $8.73 

PAINT, TEMPRA PREMIER NOT WASHABLE PINT $5.13 

PAINT, WATERCOLOR WHOLE PAN REFILLS (RECTANGLE) BLUE EACH NO BID

PAINT, WATERCOLOR WHOLE PAN REFILLS (RECTANGLE) BROWN EACH $3.54 

PAINT, WATERCOLOR WHOLE PAN REFILLS (RECTANGLE) GREEN EACH NO BID

PAINT, WATERCOLOR WHOLE PAN REFILLS (RECTANGLE) ORANGE EACH $3.54 

PAINT, WATERCOLOR WHOLE PAN REFILLS (RECTANGLE) RED EACH NO BID

PAINT, WATERCOLOR WHOLE PAN REFILLS (RECTANGLE) VIOLET EACH $3.54 

PAINT, WATERCOLOR WHOLE PAN REFILLS (RECTANGLE) YELLOW EACH $3.54 

PAINT, WATERCOLORS, RECTANGULAR 1/2 PAN 16 COLORS BOX EACH $4.32 

PAINT, WATERCOLORS, RECTANGULAR 1/2 PAN 8 COLORS BOX EACH $1.68 

PASTEL PAPER PADS 18'X24' 400 SERIES PAD $13.41 $16.66 

PEN NIBS SPEEDBALL STANDARD POINT DIP DZ $9.44 

PEN TOUCH GOLD METALLIC MARKER FINE EACH $2.12 $1.84 

PEN TOUCH GOLD METALLIC MARKER MEDIUM EACH $2.12 $1.84 

PEN TOUCH SILVER METALLIC MARKER MEDIUM EACH $2.12 $1.84 

PEN TOUCH WHITE MARKER MEDIUM EACH $2.12 $1.84 

PENCILS, COLORED PRISMACOLOR PROFESSIONAL, ASSORTED BOX 12 $14.08 $10.51 

PENCILS, COLORED PRISMACOLOR PROFESSIONAL, ASSORTED BOX 24 $18.77 $26.50 

PENCILS, COLORED PRISMACOLOR PROFESSIONAL, ASSORTED BOX 48 $49.81 $43.40 

PENCILS, COLORED WATERCOLOR SET 12 $5.03 

PENCILS, COLORED, ASSORTED PORTFOLIO BOX 24 $2.99 

PRANG 16 COLOR WATER COLOR SETS WITH SQUARE INSERTS EACH $4.32 

PRANG WATER COLOR REFILLS (ALL INDIVIDUAL COLORS ARE SOLD SEPARATELY IN 

PKGS. OF 12) SQUARE PKG. 12 $2.82 

SCISSOR, 5" BLUNT TIP MODEL 9491 KIDS EACH $2.17 $1.38 



SCISSOR, 5" SHARP TIP MODEL SAFETY 7096 KIDS EACH $2.17 $1.38 

SCISSOR,9 1/2" MODEL #9441-7096 EACH $11.08 

SHARPENER, PENCIL H.D. #41 ELEC. 4 POSITION PKG $35.19 

SHARPIE ASSORTED COLORS FINE TIP 24/ST $20.34 $16.57 

SHARPIE EXTRA FINE BLACK EACH $0.70 

SHARPIE EXTRA ULTRA FINE BLACK EACH $0.99 $0.70 

SPONGES, CELLULOSE, LARGE EACH $2.42 

STAPLE GUN, TACKER, #101 EACH $29.32 

TAPE MASKING 1" X 60 YD EACH $14.67 $1.41 

TAPE MASKING 2" X 60 YD EACH $4.14 $2.84 

TAPE, 3M ALL PURPOSE MASKING TAPE 3/4" EACH $11.73 $1.06 

TAPE, BLUE PAINTERS FOR MULTI SURFACES 1" EACH $4.59 $3.32 

TAPE, CLEAR TRANSPARENT 1" CORE EACH $0.59 

TAPE, WALLSAVER REMOVABLE POSTER ROLL $4.67 

TONGUE DEPRESSORS 6" BOX 500 $7.02 

VALUE MASKING TAPE, 3"X 60 YARDS Each $6.33 

VINE CHARCOAL WINDSOR NEWTON MEDIUM VINE 12/BX $5.73 $7.56 

WATER COLOR PAPER (LOOSE SHEETS OR PADS) LARGER THAN 9 X 12 PK $10.66 

WATERCOLOR PAPER 12X18 SOFT PEBBLE 90 LB 500 SHEETS $172.36 $194.66 

WATERCOLOR PAPER 15"X22" 400 SERIES PAD $13.41 $18.97 

WATERCOLOR PAPER 18X24 100LB 100 SHEETS $72.93 $90.44 

WHITE ARTIST ERASERS 12/BX $3.24 

WHITE OAK TAG 24" X 36" (HEAVYWEIGHT) PKG. 100 $24.31 

WHITE UNCOATED PAPER PLATES, 9 INCH Pkg. 100 $2.55 

WHITE VELLUM PAPER 12" X 18" PKG. 100 6.93 8.82

WIRE FOR SCULPTURE (LT & FLEXIBILITY 14 GG 350 FT. COIL) COIL 9.79 29.84

927.5 $1,896.73 
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ART SUPPLIES PAPER BID # 2368-22 PART B Dick Blick WB Mason

DESCRIPTION: UNIT: Price Price

PAPER, FLAMELESS ART KRAFT 50 LB. BLACK ROLL $107.21

PAPER, FLAMELESS ART KRAFT 50 LB. BLUE ROLL $97.01

PAPER, FLAMELESS ART KRAFT 50 LB. BROWN ROLL $92.78

PAPER, FLAMELESS ART KRAFT 50 LB. GOLD ROLL $97.01

PAPER, FLAMELESS ART KRAFT 50 LB. GREEN ROLL $100.90

PAPER, FLAMELESS ART KRAFT 50 LB. ORANGE ROLL $111.72

PAPER, FLAMELESS ART KRAFT 50 LB. PURPLE ROLL $92.18

PAPER, FLAMELESS ART KRAFT 50 LB. RED ROLL $97.60

PAPER, FLAMELESS ART KRAFT 50 LB. WHITE ROLL $72.98

PAPER, FLAMELESS ART KRAFT 50 LB. YELLOW ROLL $93.38

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION ASSORTED 12 X 18 PKG.50 $3.32

PAPER CONSTRUCTION COOL ASSORTMENTS  12X18 Pkg. 50 $4.87

PAPER CONSTRUCTION HOT ASSORTMENTS  12X18 Pkg. 50 $6.26

PAPER CONSTRUCTION WARM ASSORTMENTS  12X18 Pkg. 50 $4.87

PAPER CONSTRUCTION BRIGHT ASSORTMENTS  12X18 Pkg. 50 $4.87

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION BLACK 12 X 18 PKG.50 $2.58

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION BLUE 12 X 18 PKG.50 $2.99

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION BLUE, SKY 12 X 18 PKG.50 $2.71

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION BROWN 12 X 18 PKG.50 $2.73

PAPER CONSTRUCTION 76 LBS WARM BROWN  12 X 18 Pkg. 50 $2.73

PAPER CONSTRUCTION GRAY 12X18 Pkg. 50 $2.88

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION GREEN, FESTIVE 12 X 18 PKG.50 $3.35

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION ORANGE 12X 18 PKG.50 $2.99

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION RED, FESTIVE 12 X 18 PKG.50 $2.86

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION TURQUOISE 12X18 PKG.50 $3.13

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION VIOLET 12 X 18 PKG.50 $3.00

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION WHITE 12 X 18 PKG.50 $2.65

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION YELLOW 12 X 18 PKG.50 $2.82

PAPER, MANILA CREAM 56 LB. 12 X 18 HEAVY WEIGHT PKG.500 $12.07

PAPER, OAK TAG, STRONG 150LBS. MANILA 12 X 18 HEAVY WEIGHT PKG.100 $6.01

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION MULTICULTURAL  12X18 Pkg. 50 $3.12

PAPER, SUNWORKS CONSTRUCTION 58 LB., 12 X18”, HOT PINK, 50 SHEETS/PACK Pkg. 50 $1.41

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION SLATE  12X18 Pkg. 50 $2.82

PACON TRU-RAY CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 76 LBS., 18 X24, LIGHT BROWN
50 sheets/ 

pack
NO BID

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION ASSORTED 18 X 24 PKG.50 $6.39

PAPER, MANILA CREAM 56 LB. 18 X 24 HEAVY WEIGHT PKG.500 $26.82

PAPER, OAK TAG, STRONG 150LBS. ASSORTED 18 X 24 HEAVY WEIGHT PKG.100 $17.08

PAPER, OAK TAG, STRONG 150LBS. MANILA 18 X 24 HEAVY WEIGHT PKG.100 $12.55



PAPER, OAK TAG, STRONG 150LBS. WHITE 18 X 24 HEAVY WEIGHT PKG.100 $12.55

PAPER, TISSUE ART 100 SHEETS, ASSORTED 20 X 30 PKG.100 $8.11

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION ASSORTED 24 X 36 PKG.50 $15.58

PAPER, OAK TAG, STRONG 150LBS. MANILA 24 X 36 HEAVY WEIGHT PKG.100 $24.31

PAPER, DRAWING SULPHITE WHITE, 80 LB., 12 X 18 HEAVY WEIGHT PKG.500 $28.67 $18.52

PAPER, DRAWING SULPHITE WHITE, 80 LB., 18 X 24 HEAVY WEIGHT PKG.500 $59.34 $37.22

PAPER, DRAWING SULPHITE WHITE, 80 LB., 24 X 36 HEAVY WEIGHT PKG.250 $87.72 $40.01

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION ASSORTED 9 X 12 PKG.50 $1.80

PAPER CONSTRUCTION  BRIGHT ASSORTMENTS  9X12 Pkg. 50 $1.77

PAPER CONSTRUCTION  COOL ASSORTMENTS  9X12 Pkg. 50 $2.55

PAPER CONSTRUCTION  WARM ASSORTMENTS  9X12 Pkg. 50 $2.55

PAPER CONSTRUCTION, HOT ASSORTMENTS  9X12 Pkg. 50 $3.71

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION BLACK 9 X 12 PKG.50 $1.42

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION BLUE 9 X 12 PKG.50 $1.67

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION BLUE, SKY 9 X 12 PKG.50 $1.54

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION BROWN, DARK 9 X 12 PKG.50 $1.55

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION GRAY   9X12 Pkg. 50 $1.63

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION GREEN, FESTIVE 9 X 12 PKG.50 $1.86

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION ORANGE 9 X 12 PKG.50 $1.68

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION PINK 9 X 12 PKG.50 $1.78

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION RED, FESTIVE 9 X 12 PKG.50 $1.57

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION VIOLET 9 X 12 PKG.50 $1.68

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION WHITE 9 X 12 PKG.50 $1.49

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION YELLOW 9 X 12 PKG.50 $1.55

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION MULTICULTURAL  9X12 Pkg. 50 $2.18

PAPER, MANILA CREAM 56 LB. 9 X 12 HEAVY WEIGHT PKG.500 $6.18

PAPER, CONSTRUCTION  SLATE  9X12 Pkg. 50 $1.55

PAPER, FACIAL TISSUE 160/2PLY WHITE 36 PER CASE CASE $44.71

PARISCRAFT, 20 LBS. 20LBS. $49.44

$175.73 $1,404.81
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ART SUPPLIES CLAY BID # 2368-22 PART C Dick Blick WB Mason

DESCRIPTION: UNIT: Price Price

Clay Type: Mass White, low fire with talc 50lbs No Bid

Teacher's Palette Glazes, TP-58 Brick Red Pint $12.19 No Bid

Teacher's Palette Glazes, TP-64 Carrot Pint $12.19 No Bid

Teacher’s Palette Glaze, TP-1 Coal Black Pint $12.19 No Bid

Teacher’s Palette Glaze, TP-11 Cotton Pint $12.19 No Bid

Teacher's Palette Glazes, TP-41 Frog Green Pint $12.19 No Bid

Teacher's Palette Glazes, TP-32 Fudge Pint $12.19 No Bid

Teacher's Palette Glazes, TP-51 Grape Pint $12.19 No Bid

Teacher's Palette Glazes, TP-60 Lemon Pint $12.19 No Bid

Teacher's Palette Glazes, TP-21 Midnight Blue Pint $12.19 No Bid

Amaco LG glazes K-6 class pack No. 1, set of 12 (includes one of each of the following LG-61 – Canary 

Yellow, LG-68 Vivid Orange, LG-59 Hot Red, LG-50 Maroon, LG-55 Purple, LG- 24 Light Blue, LG -21 Dark 

Blue, LG-40 Dark Green, LG-36 Freckled Brown, LG-14 Gray, LG-1 True Black, and LG-10 Clear Transparent)

12 pints

No Bid

Amaco LG glazes K-6 class pack No. 2, set of 12 ( includes one each of LG-63 Brilliant Yellow, LG-67 Fire 

Orange, LG-58 Brilliant Red, LG-50 Maroon, LG-55 Purple, LG-24 Light Blue, LG-21 Dark Blue, LG-42 Light 

Green, LG-48 Chrome Green, LG-36 Freckled Brown, LG-1 True Black, and LG-10 Clear Transparent).

12 pints

No Bid

TOTAL: $109.71 TOTAL:



ART SUPPLIES BID

Opening Date: June 16, 2022

Opening Time: 10:30 a.m

Bid # 2368-22

ART SUPPLIES INK BID 2368-22 PART D Dick Blick WB Mason

DESCRIPTION: UNIT: Price Price

Board Printing Plates, 6x9 Pkg. 30 No Bid

Water Soluble Block Printing Ink, Black 16 oz. 14.43 No Bid

Water Soluble Block Printing Ink, Blue 16 oz. 14.43 No Bid

Water Soluble Block Printing Ink, Brown 16 oz. 14.43 No Bid

Water Soluble Block Printing Ink, Green 16 oz. 14.43 No Bid

Water Soluble Block Printing Ink, Magenta 16 oz. 14.43 No Bid

Water Soluble Block Printing Ink, Orange 16 oz. 14.43 No Bid

Water Soluble Block Printing Ink, Red 16 oz. 14.43 No Bid

Water Soluble Block Printing Ink, Turquoise 16 oz. 14.43 No Bid

Water Soluble Block Printing Ink, Violet 16 oz. 14.43 No Bid

Water Soluble Block Printing Ink, White 16 oz. 14.43 No Bid

Water Soluble Block Printing Ink, Yellow 16 oz. 14.43 No Bid

158.73 No Bid


