

GROUP I - SMART SNACK APPROVED

2	Chocolate Crunch Bar, 3.5 oz, 24/Box 152570	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified												
	<table border="1" style="width: 100%; border-collapse: collapse;"> <thead> <tr style="background-color: #f2f2f2;"> <th style="width: 15%;">Supplier</th> <th style="width: 10%;">QTY</th> <th style="width: 10%;">UOM</th> <th style="width: 15%;">Unit Price</th> <th style="width: 15%;">Extended</th> <th style="width: 35%;">Supplier Notes</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr> <td>Hershey's Ice Cream</td> <td>1839</td> <td>BOX</td> <td>\$13.06</td> <td>\$24,017.34</td> <td>HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM BRAND, CHOCOLATE CRUNCH BAR, 2.75OZ, 36/BOX</td> </tr> </tbody> </table>	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Hershey's Ice Cream	1839	BOX	\$13.06	\$24,017.34	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM BRAND, CHOCOLATE CRUNCH BAR, 2.75OZ, 36/BOX		36	No
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes											
Hershey's Ice Cream	1839	BOX	\$13.06	\$24,017.34	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM BRAND, CHOCOLATE CRUNCH BAR, 2.75OZ, 36/BOX											
3	Strawberry Crunch Bar, 3.5 oz, 24/Box 152575	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified												
	<table border="1" style="width: 100%; border-collapse: collapse;"> <thead> <tr style="background-color: #f2f2f2;"> <th style="width: 15%;">Supplier</th> <th style="width: 10%;">QTY</th> <th style="width: 10%;">UOM</th> <th style="width: 15%;">Unit Price</th> <th style="width: 15%;">Extended</th> <th style="width: 35%;">Supplier Notes</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr> <td>Hershey's Ice Cream</td> <td>1720</td> <td>BOX</td> <td>\$13.06</td> <td>\$22,463.20</td> <td>HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM BRAND, STRAWBERRY CRUNCH BAR, 2.75OZ, 36/BOX</td> </tr> </tbody> </table>	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Hershey's Ice Cream	1720	BOX	\$13.06	\$22,463.20	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM BRAND, STRAWBERRY CRUNCH BAR, 2.75OZ, 36/BOX		36	No
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes											
Hershey's Ice Cream	1720	BOX	\$13.06	\$22,463.20	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM BRAND, STRAWBERRY CRUNCH BAR, 2.75OZ, 36/BOX											
4	Salted Caramel Brownie Crunch Bar, Reduced Fat 152577	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified												
	<table border="1" style="width: 100%; border-collapse: collapse;"> <thead> <tr style="background-color: #f2f2f2;"> <th style="width: 15%;">Supplier</th> <th style="width: 10%;">QTY</th> <th style="width: 10%;">UOM</th> <th style="width: 15%;">Unit Price</th> <th style="width: 15%;">Extended</th> <th style="width: 35%;">Supplier Notes</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr> <td>Hershey's Ice Cream</td> <td>828</td> <td>BOX</td> <td>\$13.06</td> <td>\$10,813.68</td> <td>2.75OZ, 36/BOX</td> </tr> </tbody> </table>	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Hershey's Ice Cream	828	BOX	\$13.06	\$10,813.68	2.75OZ, 36/BOX		36	Yes
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes											
Hershey's Ice Cream	828	BOX	\$13.06	\$10,813.68	2.75OZ, 36/BOX											
5	Strawberry Fruit Bar, 24/Box 152580	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified												
	<table border="1" style="width: 100%; border-collapse: collapse;"> <thead> <tr style="background-color: #f2f2f2;"> <th style="width: 15%;">Supplier</th> <th style="width: 10%;">QTY</th> <th style="width: 10%;">UOM</th> <th style="width: 15%;">Unit Price</th> <th style="width: 15%;">Extended</th> <th style="width: 35%;">Supplier Notes</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr> <td>Hershey's Ice Cream</td> <td>425</td> <td>BOX</td> <td>\$28.25</td> <td>\$12,006.25</td> <td></td> </tr> </tbody> </table>	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Hershey's Ice Cream	425	BOX	\$28.25	\$12,006.25			24	Yes
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes											
Hershey's Ice Cream	425	BOX	\$28.25	\$12,006.25												
6	Orange Blossom Bar, Low Fat, 24/Box 152583	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified												
	<table border="1" style="width: 100%; border-collapse: collapse;"> <thead> <tr style="background-color: #f2f2f2;"> <th style="width: 15%;">Supplier</th> <th style="width: 10%;">QTY</th> <th style="width: 10%;">UOM</th> <th style="width: 15%;">Unit Price</th> <th style="width: 15%;">Extended</th> <th style="width: 35%;">Supplier Notes</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr> <td>Hershey's Ice Cream</td> <td>954</td> <td>BOX</td> <td>\$11.43</td> <td>\$10,904.22</td> <td>ORANGE BLOSSOM BAR, LOW FAT, 36/BOX</td> </tr> </tbody> </table>	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Hershey's Ice Cream	954	BOX	\$11.43	\$10,904.22	ORANGE BLOSSOM BAR, LOW FAT, 36/BOX		36	No
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes											
Hershey's Ice Cream	954	BOX	\$11.43	\$10,904.22	ORANGE BLOSSOM BAR, LOW FAT, 36/BOX											
7	Polar Blast Fruit Juice Bar, 2.25 oz, 36/Box 152590	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified												
	<table border="1" style="width: 100%; border-collapse: collapse;"> <thead> <tr style="background-color: #f2f2f2;"> <th style="width: 15%;">Supplier</th> <th style="width: 10%;">QTY</th> <th style="width: 10%;">UOM</th> <th style="width: 15%;">Unit Price</th> <th style="width: 15%;">Extended</th> <th style="width: 35%;">Supplier Notes</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr> <td>Hershey's Ice Cream</td> <td>832</td> <td>BOX</td> <td>\$11.43</td> <td>\$9,509.76</td> <td></td> </tr> </tbody> </table>	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Hershey's Ice Cream	832	BOX	\$11.43	\$9,509.76			36	Yes
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes											
Hershey's Ice Cream	832	BOX	\$11.43	\$9,509.76												
8	Tropi-Kool Fruit Bars, 4 oz, All varieties, 24/Box 152595	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified												
	<table border="1" style="width: 100%; border-collapse: collapse;"> <thead> <tr style="background-color: #f2f2f2;"> <th style="width: 15%;">Supplier</th> <th style="width: 10%;">QTY</th> <th style="width: 10%;">UOM</th> <th style="width: 15%;">Unit Price</th> <th style="width: 15%;">Extended</th> <th style="width: 35%;">Supplier Notes</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr> <td>Hershey's Ice Cream</td> <td>128</td> <td>BOX</td> <td>\$28.25</td> <td>\$3,616.00</td> <td>VARIETIES MAVAILABLE: STRAWBERRY, MANGO</td> </tr> </tbody> </table>	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Hershey's Ice Cream	128	BOX	\$28.25	\$3,616.00	VARIETIES MAVAILABLE: STRAWBERRY, MANGO		24	Yes
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes											
Hershey's Ice Cream	128	BOX	\$28.25	\$3,616.00	VARIETIES MAVAILABLE: STRAWBERRY, MANGO											

Cooperative Ice Cream and Frozen Dessert WFL 2023-16 Bid

9	FrozFruit Chunky Strawberry Bar, 4 oz, 6/Box 152605						Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes			
	Hershey's Ice Cream	120	BOX	\$28.25	\$3,390.00	TROPICAL STRAWBERRY FRUIT BAR, 4OZ, 24/BOX	24		No
10	Fudgie Bar, 2.2 oz, 24/Box 152608						Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Hershey's Ice Cream	954	BOX	\$11.43	\$10,904.22	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM BRAND, FUDGE-O BAR, 2OZ, 36/BOX	36		No
11	Cookies 'N Cream Cone - Low Fat, 2 oz, 24/Box 152610						Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Hershey's Ice Cream	1464	BOX	\$13.88	\$20,320.32	COOKIES AND CREAM CONE, LOW FAT, 4OZ, 24/BOX	24		No
12	Crazy Cone - Low Fat, 2 oz, 24/Box 152615						Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Hershey's Ice Cream	1684	BOX	\$13.88	\$23,373.92	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM BRAND, CRAZY CONE, 4OZ, 24/BOX	24		No
13	Vanilla Ice Cream Sandwich - Reduced Fat, 3.5oz,24/Box 152620						Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Hershey's Ice Cream	1595	BOX	\$12.52	\$19,969.40	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM BRAND, RF VANILLA ICE CREAM SANDWICH, 4OZ, 24/BOX	24		No
14	Brownie Batter Ice Cream Sandwich, Reduced Fat, 24/Box 152621						Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Hershey's Ice Cream	915	BOX	\$12.52	\$11,455.80	4OZ SANDWICH	24		Yes
15	Mint Ice Cream Sandwich - Reduced Fat, 2.3 oz, 24/Box 152623 - NO AWARD						Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Hershey's Ice Cream	440	BOX	No Bid					

Cooperative Ice Cream and Frozen Dessert WFL 2023-16 Bid

Item Number	Description	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
16	Chocolate Ice Cream Sandwich - Reduced Fat, 4 oz, 24/Box 152625			
	Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes			
	Hershey's Ice Cream 740 BOX \$12.52 \$9,264.80 HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM BRAND, RF BROWNIE BATTER ICE CREAM SANDWICH, 4OZ, 24/BOX		24	No
17	Cookies Cream Ice Cream Sandwich - Reduced Fat, 2.3 oz, 24/Box 152627			
	Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes			
	Hershey's Ice Cream 645 BOX \$12.52 \$8,075.40 HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM BRAND, COOKIES AND CREAM ICE CREAM SANDWICH, 4OZ, 24/BOX		24	No
18	Mighty Mini Vanilla Ice Cream Sandwich, 2.5 oz, 48/Box 152630			
	Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes			
	Hershey's Ice Cream 280 BOX \$16.07 \$4,499.60		48	Yes
19	Juice Rush - Cherry Blue Raspberry, 4.4 oz cup, 100% Frozen Fruit Juice, 80/Case 152631			
	Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes			
	Hershey's Ice Cream 294 CASE \$27.22 \$8,002.68		80	Yes
20	Juice Rush - Lemon Orange, 4.4 oz cup, 100% Frozen Fruit Juice, 80/Case 152632 - NO AWARD			
	Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes			
	Hershey's Ice Cream 164 CASE No Bid			
21	Juice Rush - Strawberry Mango, 4.4 oz cup, 100% Frozen Fruit Juice, 80/Case 152633			
	Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes			
	Hershey's Ice Cream 148 CASE \$27.22 \$4,028.56		80	Yes
22	Sherbet, Lemon 4 oz Cups, 48/Box 152641			
	Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes			
	Hershey's Ice Cream 40 BOX \$8.29 \$331.60 SHERBET, LEMON, 4OZ, 24/BOX		24	No
23	Sherbet, Raspberry 4 oz Cups, 48/Box 152643			
	Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes			
	Hershey's Ice Cream 80 BOX \$8.29 \$663.20 SHERBET, RASPBERRY, 4OZ, 24/BOX		24	No

Cooperative Ice Cream and Frozen Dessert WFL 2023-16 Bid

24	Sherbet, Orange, 4 oz Cups, 48/Box 152645						Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
Supplier		QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes			
Hershey's Ice Cream		145	BOX	\$8.29	\$1,202.05	SHERBET, ORANGE, 40Z, 24/BOX	24		No
25	Low Fat Ice Cream, 4 oz Cups, Assorted Flavors, 24/Box 152650						Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
Supplier		QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes			
Hershey's Ice Cream		735	BOX	\$9.59	\$7,048.65	VANILLA YOGURT AND RASPBERRY YOGURT AVAILABLE			Yes
26	No Fat Yogurt, 4 oz Cups, 48/Box 152655						Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
Supplier		QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes			
Hershey's Ice Cream		110	BOX	\$9.59	\$1,054.90	NO FAT YOGURT, 4OZ CUPS, 24/BOX	24		No
27	No Fat Twister Cups, 3.75 oz, Assorted Flavors, 18/Box 152660						Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
Supplier		QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes			
Hershey's Ice Cream		1325	BOX	\$10.21	\$13,528.25	FLAVORS AVAILABLE: BIRTHDAY CAKE YOGURT, COTTON CANDY YOGURT, UNICORN HORN YOGURT, SOUR BLUE RASPBERRY ICE			Yes
28	Chocolate Sundae Dessert Cup - Low Fat, 3 oz, 40/Box 152661						Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
Supplier		QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes			
Hershey's Ice Cream		125	BOX	\$18.48	\$2,310.00	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM BRAND, CHOCOLATE SUNDAE LF DESSERT CUP, 3OZ, 48/CASE	48		No
29	Strawberry Sundae Dessert Cup - Low Fat, 3 oz, 40/Box 152662						Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
Supplier		QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes			
Hershey's Ice Cream		195	BOX	\$18.48	\$3,303.60	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM BRAND, STRAWBERRY SUNDAE LF DESSERT CUP, 3OZ, 48/CASE	48		No

Cooperative Ice Cream and Frozen Dessert WFL 2023-16 Bid

30	Dessert Cups, Low Fat, 3 oz, assorted flavors. Must specify flavor, 40/Case 152663					Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes			
Hershey's Ice Cream	124	Case	\$18.48	\$2,291.52	DESSERT CUPS, LOW FAT, 3OZ CUP, 48/CASE. FLAVORS AVAILABLE: ALL STAR SUNDAE, BIRTHDAY CAKE YOGURT, COTTON CANDY, CHOCOLATE, CHOCOLATE SUNDAE, VANILLA, STRAWBERRY SUNDAE	No		

Cooperative Ice Cream and Frozen Dessert WFL 2023-16 Bid

GROUP II - OTHER MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS

32	Fudgie Bar - No Sugar Added, 2.5 oz, 24/Box - GROUP II 152555	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified												
	<table border="1" style="width: 100%; border-collapse: collapse;"> <thead> <tr> <th style="width: 15%;">Supplier</th> <th style="width: 10%;">QTY</th> <th style="width: 10%;">UOM</th> <th style="width: 10%;">Unit Price</th> <th style="width: 10%;">Extended</th> <th style="width: 45%;">Supplier Notes</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr> <td>Hershey's Ice Cream</td> <td>324</td> <td>BOX</td> <td>\$44.43</td> <td>\$14,395.32</td> <td>HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM BRAND, FUDGE-0 BAR, 2OZ, 36/BOX, FAT FREE</td> </tr> </tbody> </table>	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Hershey's Ice Cream	324	BOX	\$44.43	\$14,395.32	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM BRAND, FUDGE-0 BAR, 2OZ, 36/BOX, FAT FREE		36	No
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes											
Hershey's Ice Cream	324	BOX	\$44.43	\$14,395.32	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM BRAND, FUDGE-0 BAR, 2OZ, 36/BOX, FAT FREE											
	<table border="1" style="width: 100%; border-collapse: collapse;"> <thead> <tr> <th style="width: 15%;">Supplier</th> <th style="width: 10%;">QTY</th> <th style="width: 10%;">UOM</th> <th style="width: 10%;">Unit Price</th> <th style="width: 10%;">Extended</th> <th style="width: 45%;">Supplier Notes</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr> <td>Hershey's Ice Cream</td> <td>131</td> <td>BOX</td> <td>\$11.43</td> <td>\$1,497.33</td> <td>HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM BRAND, FUDGE-0 BAR, 2OZ, 36/BOX</td> </tr> </tbody> </table>	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Hershey's Ice Cream	131	BOX	\$11.43	\$1,497.33	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM BRAND, FUDGE-0 BAR, 2OZ, 36/BOX		36	No
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes											
Hershey's Ice Cream	131	BOX	\$11.43	\$1,497.33	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM BRAND, FUDGE-0 BAR, 2OZ, 36/BOX											
	<table border="1" style="width: 100%; border-collapse: collapse;"> <thead> <tr> <th style="width: 15%;">Supplier</th> <th style="width: 10%;">QTY</th> <th style="width: 10%;">UOM</th> <th style="width: 10%;">Unit Price</th> <th style="width: 10%;">Extended</th> <th style="width: 45%;">Supplier Notes</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr> <td>Hershey's Ice Cream</td> <td>70</td> <td>BOX</td> <td>\$11.43</td> <td>\$800.10</td> <td>HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM BRAND, ORANGE BLOSSOM BAR, 2.5OZ, 36/BOX</td> </tr> </tbody> </table>	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Hershey's Ice Cream	70	BOX	\$11.43	\$800.10	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM BRAND, ORANGE BLOSSOM BAR, 2.5OZ, 36/BOX		36	No
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes											
Hershey's Ice Cream	70	BOX	\$11.43	\$800.10	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM BRAND, ORANGE BLOSSOM BAR, 2.5OZ, 36/BOX											
	<table border="1" style="width: 100%; border-collapse: collapse;"> <thead> <tr> <th style="width: 15%;">Supplier</th> <th style="width: 10%;">QTY</th> <th style="width: 10%;">UOM</th> <th style="width: 10%;">Unit Price</th> <th style="width: 10%;">Extended</th> <th style="width: 45%;">Supplier Notes</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr> <td>Hershey's Ice Cream</td> <td>174</td> <td>BOX</td> <td>\$13.06</td> <td>\$2,272.44</td> <td>HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM BRAND, SALTED CARAMEL COOKIES AND CREAM BAR, 2.75OZ, 36/BOX</td> </tr> </tbody> </table>	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Hershey's Ice Cream	174	BOX	\$13.06	\$2,272.44	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM BRAND, SALTED CARAMEL COOKIES AND CREAM BAR, 2.75OZ, 36/BOX		36	No
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes											
Hershey's Ice Cream	174	BOX	\$13.06	\$2,272.44	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM BRAND, SALTED CARAMEL COOKIES AND CREAM BAR, 2.75OZ, 36/BOX											
	<table border="1" style="width: 100%; border-collapse: collapse;"> <thead> <tr> <th style="width: 15%;">Supplier</th> <th style="width: 10%;">QTY</th> <th style="width: 10%;">UOM</th> <th style="width: 10%;">Unit Price</th> <th style="width: 10%;">Extended</th> <th style="width: 45%;">Supplier Notes</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr> <td>Hershey's Ice Cream</td> <td>70</td> <td>BOX</td> <td>\$11.43</td> <td>\$800.10</td> <td>HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM BRAND, ORANGE BLOSSOM BAR, 2.5OZ, 36/BOX</td> </tr> </tbody> </table>	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Hershey's Ice Cream	70	BOX	\$11.43	\$800.10	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM BRAND, ORANGE BLOSSOM BAR, 2.5OZ, 36/BOX		36	No
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes											
Hershey's Ice Cream	70	BOX	\$11.43	\$800.10	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM BRAND, ORANGE BLOSSOM BAR, 2.5OZ, 36/BOX											
	<table border="1" style="width: 100%; border-collapse: collapse;"> <thead> <tr> <th style="width: 15%;">Supplier</th> <th style="width: 10%;">QTY</th> <th style="width: 10%;">UOM</th> <th style="width: 10%;">Unit Price</th> <th style="width: 10%;">Extended</th> <th style="width: 45%;">Supplier Notes</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr> <td>Hershey's Ice Cream</td> <td>70</td> <td>BOX</td> <td>\$15.79</td> <td>\$1,105.30</td> <td>HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM BRAND, 3OZ CUPS, 48/BOX. FLAVORS AVAILABLE: BIRTHDAY CAKE YOGURT, COTTON CANDY YOGURT, LF CHOCOLATE, LF CHOCOLATE SUNDAE, LF STRAWBERRY SUNDAE</td> </tr> </tbody> </table>	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Hershey's Ice Cream	70	BOX	\$15.79	\$1,105.30	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM BRAND, 3OZ CUPS, 48/BOX. FLAVORS AVAILABLE: BIRTHDAY CAKE YOGURT, COTTON CANDY YOGURT, LF CHOCOLATE, LF CHOCOLATE SUNDAE, LF STRAWBERRY SUNDAE		48	No
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes											
Hershey's Ice Cream	70	BOX	\$15.79	\$1,105.30	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM BRAND, 3OZ CUPS, 48/BOX. FLAVORS AVAILABLE: BIRTHDAY CAKE YOGURT, COTTON CANDY YOGURT, LF CHOCOLATE, LF CHOCOLATE SUNDAE, LF STRAWBERRY SUNDAE											

Cooperative Ice Cream and Frozen Dessert WFL 2023-16 Bid

38	Plastic Cups - Low Fat, 3 oz, Assorted Flavors, 24/Box - GROUP II 152640						Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes			
	Hershey's Ice Cream	245	BOX	\$15.79	\$3,868.55	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM BRAND, 3OZ CUPS, 48/BOX. FLAVORS AVAILABLE: BIRTHDAY CAKE YOGURT, COTTON CANDY YOGURT, LF CHOCOLATE, LF CHOCOLATE SUNDAE, LF STRAWBERRY SUNDAE		48	No
39	Vanilla Ice Cream Cup, 4 oz, 48/Box - GROUP II 152646						Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Hershey's Ice Cream	74	BOX	\$8.64	\$639.36	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM BRAND, VANILLA ICE CREAM FOAM CUP, 4OZ, 24/CASE		24	No
40	Chocolate Ice Cream Cup, 4 oz, 48/Box - GROUP II 152647						Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Hershey's Ice Cream	74	BOX	\$8.64	\$639.36	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM BRAND, CHOCOLATE ICE CREAM FOAM CUP, 4OZ, 24/CASE		24	No
41	Strawberry Ice Cream Cup, 4 oz, 48/Box - GROUP II 152648						Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Hershey's Ice Cream	46	BOX	\$8.64	\$397.44	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM BRAND, STRAWBERRY ICE CREAM CUP, 4OZ, 24/BOX		24	No
42	Orange Sherbet Cup, 4 oz, 48/Box - GROUP II 152651						Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Hershey's Ice Cream	20	BOX	\$7.20	\$144.00	TALLY HO BRAND, ORANGE SHERBET FOAM CUP, 4OZ, 24/BOX		24	No
43	Raspberry Sherbet Cup, 4 oz, 48/Box - GROUP II 152652						Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Hershey's Ice Cream	20	BOX	\$8.29	\$165.80	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM BRAND, RASPBERRY SHERBET FOAM CUP, 4OZ, 24/CASE		24	No

Cooperative Ice Cream and Frozen Dessert WFL 2023-16 Bid

Item Number	Item Description	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
44	Lemon Sherbet Cup, 4 oz, 48/Box - GROUP II 152653			
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price
	Hershey's Ice Cream	20	BOX	\$8.29
	Extended			\$165.80
	Supplier Notes			HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM BRAND, LEMON sherbet FOAM CUP, 4OZ, 24/CASE
			24	No
45	Vanilla Ice Cream Bar, 3 oz, 24/Box - GROUP II 152665			
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price
	Hershey's Ice Cream	120	BOX	\$12.42
	Extended			\$1,490.40
	Supplier Notes			HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM BRAND, BANJO BAR, VANILLA ICE CREAM COATED IN CHOCOLATE ON A STICK, 2.5OZ, 36/BOX
			36	No
46	Peanut Butter Crunch Bar, 3 oz, 24/Box - GROUP II 152670			
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price
	Hershey's Ice Cream	50	BOX	\$33.96
	Extended			\$1,698.00
	Supplier Notes			CHOCOLATE ECLAIR, 4OZ, 24/BOX
			24	No
47	Snickers Ice Cream Bar, 3.33 oz, 48/Box - GROUP II 152675			
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price
	Hershey's Ice Cream	40	BOX	\$43.92
	Extended			\$1,756.80
	Supplier Notes			SNICKERS ICE CREAM BAR, 2.8OZ, 24/BOX
			24	No
48	Twix Ice Cream Bar, 3.2 oz, 48/Box - GROUP II 152680			
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price
	Hershey's Ice Cream	20	BOX	\$43.92
	Extended			\$878.40
	Supplier Notes			TWIX ICE CREAM BAR, 3OZ, 24/BOX
			24	No
49	Chocolate Marshmellow Cone, 2.6 oz, 48/Box - GROUP II 152685			
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price
	Hershey's Ice Cream	20	BOX	\$13.88
	Extended			\$277.60
	Supplier Notes			HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM BRAND, VANILLA CHOCOLATE TWIST CONE, 4OZ, 24/BOX
			24	No
50	Popsicle Scibblers, 2.7 oz, 24/Box - GROUP II 152690			
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price
	Hershey's Ice Cream	44	BOX	No Bid
	Extended			
	Supplier Notes			
51	Popsicle Firecracker Jr Pop, 1.5 oz, 24/Box - GROUP II 152695 - NO AWARD			
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price
	Hershey's Ice Cream	68	BOX	No Bid
	Extended			
	Supplier Notes			

Cooperative Ice Cream and Frozen Dessert WFL 2023-16 Bid

52	Sherbet Push-Up Pop, 2.75 oz, 24/Box - GROUP II 152700						Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes			
	Hershey's Ice Cream	54	BOX	\$13.88	\$749.52	SILLY TUBES-WILD MONSTER MELON, 2.75OZ, 24/BOX	24	No	
53	Party Sandwich, 2.85 oz, 24/Box- GROUP II 152705						Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes			
	Hershey's Ice Cream	40	BOX	\$16.07	\$642.80	MIGHTY MINI ICE CREAM SANDWICH, VANILLA ICE CREAM, CHOCOLATE WAFER, 2.5OZ, 48/BOX	48	No	
54	Vanilla Ice Cream, 3 Gallon Container - GROUP II 152710						Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes			
	Hershey's Ice Cream	20	EACH	\$26.50	\$530.00			Yes	
55	Chocolate Ice Cream, 3 Gallon Container - GROUP II 152715						Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes			
	Hershey's Ice Cream	4	EACH	\$26.50	\$106.00			Yes	