INTEROFFICE MEMORANDUM

TO: ELIO LONGO
FROM: NATALIE CARRIGNAN ?
’ .

SUBJECT:  BID RESULTS FOR BID #23-003-BOR q M )7(/

DATE: 7/8/2022

CcC: MARY YOUNGLING

Below are the bid results for bid #23-003-BOE for the purchase of replacement VoIP CISCQ

handsets. I recommend awarding the bid to Databit Inc. They were the lowest, responsible bidder

that bid on all items, Please contact me with any questions.
Vendor Item 1 Ext, Cost | Item 2 Ext. Cost | Item 3 Ext. Cost | Item 4 Ext. Cost | Item 5 Ext. Cost Total
Cymbal
Communications | % 89,30250 | § 2_9,587.50 S 5,176.50 $ 315.00 no bid | §124,381.50
DataBit 5 70,777.35 S 10,991.25 S 1,855.21 S 137.30 included | $ 83,761.11
Dexon 5 59,535.00 | §  20,925.00 S 3,383.00 S 295.00 nobid | $ 84,138.00
Focus Camera S 69,731.55 | §  23,244.75 S 4,028.00 | § 256.85 nobid | $ 97,262.15
Mola S 78,731.10 S 26,284.50 S 4,556.85 5 270.50 $109,842.95
MRA
International 5 57,273.30 | § 22,158.75 S 3,767.03 5 198.85 nobid | $ 83,397.93
YellowLight Inc blank- no bid blank- no bid blank- no bid blank- no bhid blank- no bid N/A




