

	Quantity	Hourly Rate	Est. Hours (Annual)	Extended Cost
22nd Century Technologies				
Certified Nursing Assistant	25	\$28.35	1218	\$863,257.50
Behavioral Therapist	4	\$27.30	1218	\$133,005.60
Registered Nurse	4	\$52.00	1218	\$253,344.00
Total				\$1,249,607.10
Delta-T Group Illinois				
Certified Nursing Assistant	25	\$24.00	1218	\$730,800.00
Behavioral Therapist	4	\$23.00	1218	\$112,056.00
Registered Nurse	4	\$51.00	1218	\$248,472.00
Total				\$1,091,328.00
Diskriter				
Certified Nursing Assistant	25	\$21.93	1218	\$667,768.50
Behavioral Therapist	4	\$31.68	1218	\$154,344.96
Registered Nurse	4	\$54.85	1218	\$267,229.20
Total				\$1,089,342.66
Lancesoft				
Certified Nursing Assistant	25	\$40.00	1218	\$1,218,000.00
Behavioral Therapist	4	\$35.00	1218	\$170,520.00
Registered Nurse	4	\$65.00	1218	\$316,680.00
Total				\$1,705,200.00
Maxim Healthcare				
Certified Nursing Assistant	25	\$28.00	1218	\$852,600.00
Behavioral Therapist	4	\$38.00	1218	\$185,136.00
Registered Nurse	4	\$62.00	1218	\$302,064.00
Total				\$1,339,800.00
Soliant				
Certified Nursing Assistant	25	\$35.00	1218	\$1,065,750.00
Behavioral Therapist	4	\$45.00	1218	\$219,240.00
Registered Nurse	4	\$65.00	1218	\$316,680.00
Total				\$1,601,670.00
StaffLink				
Certified Nursing Assistant	25	No Bid	1218	No Bid
Behavioral Therapist	4	No Bid	1218	No Bid
Registered Nurse	4	No Bid	1218	No Bid
Total				No Bid
Stepping Stones Group				
Certified Nursing Assistant	25	\$33.00	1218	\$1,004,850.00
Behavioral Therapist	4	\$35.00	1218	\$170,520.00
Registered Nurse	4	\$65.00	1218	\$316,680.00
Total				\$1,492,050.00
Sunbelt Staffing				
Certified Nursing Assistant	25	\$35.00	1218	\$1,065,750.00
Behavioral Therapist	4	\$47.00	1218	\$228,984.00

Registered Nurse	4	\$60.00	1218	\$292,320.00
Total				\$1,587,054.00

US Tech Solutions

Certified Nursing Assistant	25	\$22.40	1218	\$682,080.00
Behavioral Therapist	4	\$30.80	1218	\$150,057.60
Registered Nurse	4	\$44.80	1218	\$218,265.60
Total				\$1,050,403.20