Agenda Item Details

Meeting Nov 09, 2020 - REGULAR BOARD OF EDUCATION MEETING
Category 8. Summary Action Items - Business & Finance

Subject E. Bids #F2020-11 Glass Repair, Replace & Installation
Type Action {Consent)

Recommended Action  Authorization to Award Re-Bid #F2020-11-Glass Repair, Replace & Installation for the 2020-
2021 school year,

WHEREAS, the White Plains City School District on September 30, 2020 publicly advertised a re-bid for Glass
Repair, Replace and Installation for the 2020-2021 school year. The bids were required to be received by October

8, 2020;

AND WHEREAS, the bids were required to adhere to all applicable requirements of Article #9 of the Labor Laws,
Section 231 of the Executive Laws of the State of New York. Building Service rates will be determined annually on

July 1;

AND WHEREAS, on October 8, 2020, the White Plains City School District received one (1) bid. The lowest
responsible bidder for Glass Repair, Replace and Installation was White Plains Glass and Mirror, Inc. who
submitted a bid to provide these services at the rates attached;

THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the White Plains City School District hereby awards Re-Bid# F2020-11

Glass Repair, Replace & Installation to White Plains Glass and Mirror, Inc. and authorizes the Assistant
Superintendent for Business to enter inte a contract for the contract term July 1, 2020 -~ June 30, 2021.



RE-BID #F2020-11: GLASS REPAIR, REPLACEMENT AND INSTALLATION
VENDOR: WHITE PLAINS GLASS AND MIRROR, INC.

SERVICE RATE
Emergency Board Up Fee $350.00
Metal Window Latches NO BID
Labor for work not covered in contracthr) $155 PER HOUR/PER MAN
Saturday Installation 50%
Sunday Installation N/A

minimum Charge per call, if any

$250.00

ECHNICIAN RATES
Regular Hours Weekdays $ 155.00
Overtime Hours Weekdays % 195.00
Saturday Rate 3 195.00
Sunday Rate N/A
N/A

Holiday Rate

Regular Hours Weekdays NO BID
Overtime Hours Weekdays NO BID
Saturday Rate NO BID
Sunday Rate NO BID
Holiday Rate NO BID
Material Marlcup % 35%

ITEM # UNIT PRICE
Item #1A: O - 8 feet $13,00
- tem #1A: 8 feett $17.00
Item #1B: O - 8 feet $25,00
item #1B: 8 Teets $29.00
Item #1C: O - 8 feet $27.00
- ltem #1C: 8 festt $31.00
Item #1D: O - 8 feet $27.00
* ‘Hem #1D: 8 feet+: $31.00
Item #1E: O - 8 feet $29.00
| kem #1E: 8feet $33.00
Item #2A: 0 - B feet $16.00
© ltem #2A: 8 feet+ $18,00
Item #2B: 0 - 8 feet $20.00
- ltem #28: S feett | $22.00
Item #2C: 0 - 8 feet $18.00
ltem 20 B feets | $20.00
Item #38: 0 - 8 feet N/A
 ltem #3B-8 10 N/A
item #4A: 0 - 8 feet $30.00
Item #4A: 8 featt $34.00
ftem #4B: 0 - 8 feet $32.00
item #48: 8 feet+ $36.00
Itern #35A: 0 - B feet $30.00
“ltom #BA: S feett $34.00
Item #5B: 0 - 8 feet $30.00
. Item #58: 8 feet+ $34.00
ltem #5C: 0-8 feet $45.00
ltem #5C 8 feet. $49.00
ltem #6A: 0 - 8 feet $38.00
i jtam #EA S fepth $42.00
ltem #6E: 0 - 8 feet $40.00
£ ttem #6B: 8 feett $44.00
ltem #6C: O - 8 feet $40.00
. ltem #BC: 8 feets $44.00
Item #60; 0 - 8 feet $38.00
_ ltem #6D: 8 feets . $42.00
ltem #6E: 0 - 8 feet 544,00
[ ltem #6E: 8 feetw $48.00
Item #6F. O - 8 feet $40,00
. ltem #BF: 8 fest+ $44.00
Iltem #7A Q-8 ft ND BID
oM #TA 8 Teets NO BID
Item #7B 0-8 feet ND BID
em #7B 8 Test v NO BID
ftern #8A <150 s0.1ft N/A
ftem #8A  105sq. ft - 3000sq ft N/A
ftem #8A > 3000sqft N/A
item #8B <150sq. {t N/A
llem #8B 105 sq, £ -3000 sgft NO BID
Hem #8B > 3000sqft NO BID




