
POCATELLO/CHUBBUCK 
SCHOOL DISTRICT No. 25 

Bannock County 
 

MEMORANDUM 
 
TO:  Dr. Douglas Howell, Superintendent 
 
FROM: Bart J. Reed, Director of Business Operations 
 
DATE: April 17, 2018 
 
RE: ASPHALT REMOVAL AND REPLACEMENT/ASPHALT OVERLAY 

AND ASPHALT SEAL COATING AT VARIOUS DISTRICT BUILDINGS 
 
On March 28, 2018, bids were opened for Asphalt Removal and Replacement/Asphalt Overlay 
and Asphalt Seal Coating at various District buildings.  Sixteen (16) vendors were invited to bid. 
Bids from seven (7) vendors were received as shown below. The lowest responsible overall bid 
for all projects is highlighted.  
 

Contractor 
 

Asphalt 
Maintenance 
Idaho Falls, 

ID 

 
Mickelsen 

Construction, 
Inc. 

 Blackfoot, 
ID 

 
DePatco 

Idaho 
Falls, ID   

 
Jack B 

Parson Co. 
Pocatello, 

ID 

 
Superior 
Asphalt, 

Inc. 
Pocatello, 

ID 

Imperial 
Asphalt 

Blackfoot, 
ID 

 
Klingler 
Asphalt 

Moreland, 
ID 

Project 1, 
Alameda  

$9,725.00 $14,175.00 No Bid $12,255.00 $15,542.00 $14,390.00 $12,545.00 

Project 2, 
Franklin 

No Bid $261,603.95 $373,666.85 $163,325.00 No Bid $223,000.00 No Bid 

Project 3, 
Gate City 

$11,275.00 $17,493.67 No Bid $11,325.00 $12,078.00 $13,890.00 $15,098.00 

Project 4, 
Tech Svc 
Center 

$3,000.00 $2,311.20 No Bid $1,895.00 $2,021.00 $3,000.00 $1,999.00 

Project 5, 
Tendoy 

No Bid $69,186.20 $81,100.53 $42,235.00 $89,559.00 $75,000.00 No Bid 

Project 6, 
Tyhee 

No Bid $51,790.30 $56,454.60 $39,925.00 $62,702.00 $53,000.00 No Bid 

Total 
Award 

 
$24,000.00 

 
$416,560.32 

 
$511,121.98 

 
$270,930.00 

 
$181,902.00 

 
$382,280.00 

 
$29,642.00 

 
 
Board Action  Requested: Motion to award Projects 2, 4, 5, and 6 to Jack B. Parson Co. for a 
total of $247,380.00 and Projects 1 and 3 to Asphalt Maintenance for a total of $21,000.00.  
These awards are the lowest responsible bid for each project.  The total for all six projects is 
$268,380.00 and is approximately $218,199.00 under the estimated budget of $486,579.00 for the 
2018-2019 Capital Improvement Program.  


