POCATELLO/CHUBBUCK
SCHOOL DISTRICT No. 25
Bannock County

MEMORANDUM
TO: Dr. Douglas Howell, Superintendent
FROM: Bart J. Reed, Director of Business Operations
DATE: March 14, 2017
RE: ASPHALT REMOVAL AND REPLACEMENT/ASPHALT OVERLAY

AND ASPHALT SEAL COATING AT VARIOUS DISTRICT BUILDINGS

On March 8, 2017, bids were opened for Asphalt Removal and Replacement/Asphalt Overlay
and Asphalt Seal Coating at various District buildings. Sixteen (16) vendors were invited to bid.
Bids from five (5) vendors were received as shown below. The lowest responsible overall bid for
all projects is highlighted.

Asphalt HK Harper Imperial Klingler
Maintenance | Contractors Const Asphalt Asphalt
Contractor Idaho Falls, Idaho Falls, Blackfoot, Blackfoot, Moreland,
ID ID ID ID ID
No Bid $9,195.60 $5,500.00 $4,390.00 $7,857.00
Project 1, Irving
$13,000.00 No Bid $10,800.00 $6,895.00 $16,423.90
Project 2, Irving
No Bid $11,508.00 $7,950.00 $6,375.00 | $11,340.00
Project 3, Lincoln
$12,500.00 No Bid $12,000.00 $8,895.00 $13,279.53
Project 4, Lincoln
Project 5, Tyhee No Bid $5,000.00 $3,900.00 $3,900.00 $4,600.00
Project 6, Ellis No Bid $19,848.00 $15,700.00 $12,500.00 $22,329.00
Project 7, Ellis $18.500.00 No Bid $15,522.00 $11,884.00 $13,941.90
Project 8, Gateway No Bid $1,947.00 $1,600.00 $1,200.00 $528.00
Project 9, Gateway $7,500.00 No Bid $5,880.00 $3,695.00 $5,023.65
Total Award $51,500.00 $47,498.60 $78,852.00 $59,734.00 $95,322.98

Board Action Requested: Motion to award Projects 1, 2, 3, 4,5,6,7 and 9 to Imperial Asphalt for
a total of $58,534.00 and Project 8 to Klingler Asphalt for a total of $528.00. These awards are
the lowest responsible bid for each project. The total for all nine projects is $59,062.00 and is
approximately $71,482.00 under the estimated budget of $130,544.00 for the 2017-2018 Capital
Improvement Program.
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