
 

  

 

 

 

 
   

 

   

 

  

 

  

  
 

  

 

  

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

  

  

  

 

     

  

 

 

 

      

  

 

  

 

     

   

 

  

 

     

   

 

 

 

      

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

   

  

   

  

 

POCATELLO/CHUBBUCK 

SCHOOL DISTRICT No. 25 

Bannock County 

MEMORANDUM 

TO: Dr. Douglas Howell, Superintendent 

FROM: Bart J. Reed, Director of Business Operations 

DATE: May 17, 2016 

RE: ASPHALT REMOVAL AND REPLACEMENT/ASPHALT OVERLAY 

AND ASPHALT SEAL COATING AT VARIOUS DISTRICT BUILDINGS 

On April 28, 2016, bids were opened for Asphalt Removal and Replacement/Asphalt Overlay 

and Asphalt Seal Coating at various District buildings.  Sixteen (16) vendors were invited to bid. 

Bids from six vendors were received as shown below. The lowest responsible overall bid for all 

projects is highlighted. 

Contractor 

Asphalt 

Maintenance 

Idaho Falls, 

ID 

DePatco 

St Anthony, 

ID 

Harper 

Const 

Blackfoot, 

ID 

Imperial 

Asphalt 

Blackfoot, 

ID 

Klingler 

Asphalt 

Moreland, 

ID 

Mickelsen 

Construction 

Blackfoot, 

ID 

Project 1, 

Highland 

No Bid $4,016.25 $2,950.00 $2,970.00 $4,216.25 $5,602.50 

Project 2, 

Highland 

$45,250.00 No Bid $75,600.00 $49,838.00 $52.419,74 $57,258.60 

Project 3, 

Alameda 

No Bid $33,548.25 $62,100.00 $62,856.00 Error $54,957.75 

Project 4, 

Jefferson 

No Bid $9,406.25 $8,100.00 $7,895.00 $9,876.56 $8,113.95 

Project 5, 

Jefferson 

$15,800.00 No Bid $20,400.00 $15,580.00 $11,889.38 $12,980.52 

Total 

Award $45,250 $33,548.25 $2,950.00 $7,895.00 $11,889.38 $0.00 

Board Action Requested: Motion to award Project 1 to Harper Construction; Project 2 to 

Asphalt Maintenance; Project 3 to DePatco; Project 4 to Imperial Asphalt and Project 5 to 

Klingler.  These awards are the lowest responsible bid for each project.  The total for all five 

projects is $101,532.63 and is approximately $26,310.37 under the estimated budget for the 

2016-2017 Capital Improvement Program. 

https://26,310.37
https://101,532.63

