

**KENTON COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT  
GYM FLOOR REFINISHING BID TABULATION**

Location	FLOOR CARE CONCEPTS			VICTORY GYM FLOORS		
	Clean & Burnish Price	Screen & Recoat Price	Sand, Paint, & Refinish Price	Clean & Burnish Price	Screen & Recoat Price	Sand, Paint, & Refinish Price
<b>WATER BASED MATERIAL:</b>						
Ft. Wright Elementary	\$ 888.00	\$ 2,662.20	\$ 13,311.00	\$ 1,055.70	\$ 2,662.20	\$ 10,353.00
R.C. Hinsdale Elementary	\$ 945.00	\$ 2,835.00	\$ 14,175.00	\$ 1,005.72	\$ 2,835.00	\$ 11,025.00
Kenton Elementary	\$ 555.00	\$ 1,665.00	\$ 8,325.00	\$ 627.30	\$ 1,660.50	\$ 6,457.50
Piner Elementary	\$ 888.00	\$ 2,662.20	\$ 13,311.00	\$ 1,005.72	\$ 2,662.20	\$ 10,353.00
River Ridge Elementary	\$ 1,470.00	\$ 4,410.00	\$ 22,050.00	\$ 1,666.00	\$ 4,410.00	\$ 17,150.00
Ryland Heights Elementary	\$ 835.00	\$ 2,495.00	\$ 12,474.00	\$ 942.48	\$ 2,494.80	\$ 9,702.00
Summit View Elementary	\$ 935.00	\$ 2,795.00	\$ 13,975.00	\$ 1,055.70	\$ 2,794.50	\$ 10,867.50
White's Tower Elementary	\$ 875.00	\$ 2,655.00	\$ 13,115.00	\$ 990.93	\$ 2,623.05	\$ 10,200.75
Summit View Middle	\$ 1,595.00	\$ 4,775.00	\$ 23,868.00	\$ 1,803.36	\$ 4,773.60	\$ 18,564.00
Turkey Foot Middle	\$ 1,270.00	\$ 3,810.00	\$ 19,050.00	\$ 1,439.22	\$ 3,809.70	\$ 14,815.50
Twenhofel Middle	\$ 1,515.00	\$ 4,545.00	\$ 22,725.00	\$ 1,592.90	\$ 4,216.50	\$ 16,397.50
Woodland Middle	\$ 1,150.00	\$ 3,375.00	\$ 16,875.00	\$ 1,275.00	\$ 3,375.00	\$ 13,125.00
Dixie Heights High	\$ 1,650.00	\$ 4,950.00	\$ 24,750.00	\$ 1,870.00	\$ 4,950.00	\$ 19,250.00
Scott High	\$ 1,425.00	\$ 4,275.00	\$ 21,375.00	\$ 1,615.00	\$ 4,275.00	\$ 16,625.00
Simon Kenton High	\$ 1,725.00	\$ 5,175.00	\$ 25,875.00	\$ 1,955.00	\$ 5,175.00	\$ 20,125.00
<b>Gym Floor Refinishing Totals</b>	<b>\$ 17,721.00</b>	<b>\$ 53,084.40</b>	<b>\$ 265,254.00</b>	<b>\$ 19,900.03</b>	<b>\$ 52,717.05</b>	<b>\$ 205,010.75</b>
<b>OIL BASED MATERIAL:</b>						
Ft. Wright Elementary	\$ 888.00	\$ 1,716.00	\$ 12,128.00	No Bid	\$ 1,538.16	\$ 8,578.20
R.C. Hinsdale Elementary	\$ 945.00	\$ 1,827.00	\$ 12,915.00	No Bid	\$ 1,638.02	\$ 9,135.00
Kenton Elementary	\$ 555.00	\$ 1,073.00	\$ 7,585.00	No Bid	\$ 959.40	\$ 5,350.50
Piner Elementary	\$ 888.00	\$ 1,716.00	\$ 12,128.00	No Bid	\$ 1,538.16	\$ 8,578.20
River Ridge Elementary	\$ 1,470.00	\$ 2,842.00	\$ 20,090.00	No Bid	\$ 2,548.00	\$ 14,210.00
Ryland Heights Elementary	\$ 835.00	\$ 1,608.00	\$ 11,365.00	No Bid	\$ 1,441.44	\$ 8,038.80
Summit View Elementary	\$ 935.00	\$ 1,801.00	\$ 12,731.00	No Bid	\$ 1,614.60	\$ 9,004.50
White's Tower Elementary	\$ 875.00	\$ 1,690.00	\$ 11,950.00	No Bid	\$ 1,515.54	\$ 8,452.05
Summit View Middle	\$ 1,595.00	\$ 3,076.00	\$ 21,747.00	No Bid	\$ 2,758.08	\$ 15,381.60
Turkey Foot Middle	\$ 1,270.00	\$ 2,456.00	\$ 17,355.00	No Bid	\$ 2,201.60	\$ 12,275.70
Twenhofel Middle	\$ 1,515.00	\$ 2,929.00	\$ 20,700.00	No Bid	\$ 2,436.20	\$ 13,586.50
Woodland Middle	\$ 1,150.00	\$ 2,175.00	\$ 15,375.00	No Bid	\$ 1,950.00	\$ 10,875.00
Dixie Heights High	\$ 1,650.00	\$ 3,190.00	\$ 22,550.00	No Bid	\$ 2,680.00	\$ 15,950.00
Scott High	\$ 1,425.00	\$ 2,755.00	\$ 19,475.00	No Bid	\$ 2,470.00	\$ 13,775.00
Simon Kenton High	\$ 1,725.00	\$ 3,335.00	\$ 23,575.00	No Bid	\$ 2,990.00	\$ 16,675.00
<b>Gym Floor Refinishing Totals</b>	<b>\$ 17,721.00</b>	<b>\$ 34,189.00</b>	<b>\$ 241,669.00</b>		<b>\$ 30,279.20</b>	<b>\$ 169,866.05</b>
Wood Repair		\$23.00/Sq. Ft.			\$30.00/Sq. Ft.	

- Recommended as the lowest and/or best evaluated bid.