

**22.07 Community Ed Program Guide Printing
 BID SUMMARY**

	Compton Press Ind.	Pioneer Group	Michigan Web Press	Indiana Printing & Publishing
40 Page Option	No Bid	\$ 8,718.00	\$ 8,641.60	\$ 15,953.00
48 Page Option	No Bid	\$ 9,771.00	\$ 9,494.76	\$ 17,123.00
56 Page Option	No Bid	\$ 11,283.00	\$ 10,682.76	\$ 18,264.00
64 Page Option	No Bid	\$ 12,262.00	\$ 11,673.20	\$ 19,444.00
72 Page Option	No Bid	\$ 13,545.00	\$ 12,860.76	\$ 22,089.00
80 Page Option	No Bid	\$ 14,524.00	\$ 13,868.80	\$ 23,259.00
Lead Time		8 days	8 days	8 days
Exceptions		Yes	No	No
Required Documents		Incomplete	Yes	Yes