

21.10 Orchestral Instruments

BID SUMMARY

	A&G Central Music	Brook Mays	K&S Music	Marshall Music Co.	Shar Products Co.
Violin, 4/4	\$ 451.05	\$ 371.00	\$ 395.00	\$ 399.00	No Bid
Viola, 15 inch	\$ 536.00	\$ 363.00	\$ 409.00	\$ 459.00	No Bid
Viola, 15.5 inch	\$ 536.00	\$ 363.00	\$ 409.00	\$ 459.00	No Bid
Cello, hybrid	\$ 962.00	\$ 680.00	No Bid	\$ 811.00	No Bid
Cello, fully carved	\$ 1,187.90	\$ 869.00	No Bid	\$ 1,311.00	No Bid
Bass, laminate 3/4	\$ 1,910.00	\$ 1,035.00	No Bid	\$ 1,494.00	\$ 2,077.00
Bass, hybrid 3/4	\$ 2,145.00	\$ 1,083.00	No Bid	\$ 1,844.00	\$ 2,437.00
Bass, hybrid w/ext 2/4	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2,934.00	\$ 3,537.00
Bass, 1/4 size for MS	\$ 1,910.00	\$ 1,035.00	No Bid	\$ 1,494.00	\$ 1,547.00
Harp	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Cases, hard sided	\$ 288.90	\$ 225.00	No Bid	\$ 199.00	No Bid