

CATALOG

August 1, 2021 – January 31, 2022

1	GROUP I - Offset 60# Long Grain - WHITE, 11" X 17", 60#, 2500/Ctn						
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer
	W.B. Mason Co., Inc.	1	CARTON	\$55.90	\$55.90		Husky or equivalent
2	GROUP I - Xerographic Paper - WHITE, 8 1/2" X 11", 24#, 96 Brightness, 5000/Ctn						
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer
	W.B. Mason Co., Inc.	652	CARTON	\$43.47	\$28,342.44	MASON SUPERSTAR	Imageprint or equivalent
3	GROUP I - Xerographic Paper - WHITE, 8 1/2" X 14", 20#, White Savin or equivalent, 5000/Ctn						
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer
	W.B. Mason Co., Inc.	530	CARTON	\$41.78	\$22,143.40	MASON FLAGSHIP	White Savin or equivalent
4	GROUP I - Xerographic Paper - WHITE, 8 1/2" X 11", 20#, White Savin or equivalent, 5000/Ctn. CASE SAMPLE REQUIRED						
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer
	W.B. Mason Co., Inc.	10379	CARTON	\$28.72	\$298,084.88	MASON FLAGSHIP	White Savin or equivalent
5	GROUP I - Xerographic Paper - WHITE, 8 1/2" X 11", 20#, White Savin or equivalent, 5000/Ctn, 3 Hole Punched						
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer
	W.B. Mason Co., Inc.	3	CARTON	\$32.72	\$98.16	MASON FLAGSHIP	White Savin or equivalent
6	GROUP I - Xerographic Paper - WHITE, 11" X 17", 20#, White Savin or equivalent, 2500/Ctn						
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer
	W.B. Mason Co., Inc.	160	CARTON	\$32.72	\$5,235.20	MASON FLAGSHIP	White Savin or equivalent
7	GROUP I - Xerographic Paper 24# - White, 11" X 17" Multiuse, 2500/Ctn, First Choice #003242						
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer
	W.B. Mason Co., Inc.	17	CARTON	\$48.44	\$823.48	BOISE POLARIS	

CATALOG

August 1, 2021 – January 31, 2022

8	GROUP I - Xerographic Paper 20# - WHITE, 8 1/2" X 11", Unwrapped (no paper wrapping), 2500/ctn						
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	
W.B. Mason Co., Inc.	80	CARTON	\$18.08	\$1,446.40		Boise Splox or equivalent	

9	GROUP I - Digital Color Copy Cover Stock, 8 1/2" x 11", 80 lb Photo WHITE 100 Brightness						
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	
W.B. Mason Co., Inc.	5	CASE	\$72.96	\$364.80			

10	GROUP I - Digital Color Copy Stock, 8 1/2" x 11", 28 lb						
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	
W.B. Mason Co., Inc.	1	CASE	\$64.96	\$64.96	HAMMERMILL COLOR COPY		

11	GROUP I - Digital Color Copy Stock, 11" x 17", 28 lb						
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	
W.B. Mason Co., Inc.	1	CASE	\$62.84	\$62.84	HAMMERMILL COLOR COPY		

12	GROUP I - Mohawk Color Copy 98 Bright White, 28 W 8.5" x 14" 17.8M, 3000/Ctn						
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	
W.B. Mason Co., Inc.	3	CARTON	\$65.76	\$197.28			

13	GROUP I - Color Copy Gloss Pure WHITE, Gloss, 80 Text, 8.5" x 11" L 15.74M, 500 Sheets, Acid Free						
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	
W.B. Mason Co., Inc.	5	REAM	\$15.16	\$75.80			

14	GROUP II - Xerographic Paper - Assorted Colors, 8 1/2" X 11", 20# Domtar or equivalent, 5000/Ctn						
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	
W.B. Mason Co., Inc.	1152	CARTON	\$42.00	\$48,384.00			

15	GROUP II - Xerographic Paper - Assorted Colors, 8 1/2" X 14", 20# Domtar or equivalent, 5000/Ctn						
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	
W.B. Mason Co., Inc.	305	CARTON	\$70.00	\$21,350.00			

CATALOG

August 1, 2021 – January 31, 2022

16	GROUP II - Xerographic Paper - Assorted Colors, 11" X 17", 20# Domtar or equivalent, 2500/Ctn					
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer
W.B. Mason Co., Inc.	6	CARTON	\$55.00	\$330.00		

17	GROUP II - Xerographic Paper - Assorted Colors, 11" X 17", 24# Domtar or equivalent, 2500/Ctn					
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer
W.B. Mason Co., Inc.	2	CARTON	\$62.00	\$124.00		

18	GROUP III - Xerographic Paper - Brights - Assorted Colors, 8 1/2" X 11", 20# BriteHue or equivalent, 5000/Ctn					
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer
			No Bid			

19	GROUP III - Xerographic Paper - Brights - Assorted Colors, 8 1/2" X 11", 24# BriteHue or equivalent, 5000/Ctn					
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer
Economy Products & Solutions	15	CARTON	\$98.39	\$1,475.85	8.5 X 11 60# DOMTAR EARTHCHOICE HOTS, 5000/CTN	

20	GROUP III - Xerographic Paper - Brights - Assorted Colors, 8 1/2" X 14", 20# BriteHue or equivalent, 5000/Ctn					
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer
			No Bid			

21	GROUP IV - Card Stock - Assorted Colors, 8 1/2" X 11", 90#, Fraser/Wausau or equivalent, 250 shts/pkg.; per pkg					
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer
Economy Products & Solutions	30	PACKAGE	\$8.37	\$251.10	8.5 X 11 90# DOMTAR EARTHCHOICE INDEX COLORS, 250/PKG	

22	GROUP IV - Card Stock - WHITE, 8 1/2" X 11", 90#, Fraser/Wausau or equivalent, 250 shts/pkg.; per pkg					
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer
Economy Products & Solutions	49	PACKAGE	\$8.02	\$392.98	8.5 X 11 90# WHITE DOMTAR EARTHCHOICE INDEX, 250/PKG	

23	GROUP IV - Card Stock - White, 11" x 17", 110#, 1M/Ctn, Earthchoice Index #0045281					
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer
Economy Products & Solutions	4	CARTON	\$80.11	\$320.44	11 X 17 110# WHITE DOMTAR EARTHCHOICE INDEX, 1000/CTN	

CATALOG

August 1, 2021 – January 31, 2022

24	GROUP IV - Card Stock - Various Colors, 8.5" X 11", 110#, 2M/Ctn, Earthchoice Index					
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer
Economy Products & Solutions	48	CARTON	\$69.43	\$3,332.64	8.5 X 11 110# DOMTAR EARTHCHOICE INDEX COLORS, 2000/CTN	
25	GROUP IV - Card Stock - White, 8.5" X 11", 110#, 2M/Ctn, Earthchoice Index 45275					
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer
Economy Products & Solutions	13	CARTON	\$75.59	\$982.67	8.5 X 11 110# WHITE DOMTAR EARTHCHOICE INDEX, 2000/CTN	
26	GROUP IV - Card/Cover Stock - Assorted Colors, 8 1/2" X 11", 67#, Springhill #2005995 or equivalent, 250 shts/pkg.; per pkg					
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer
Economy Products & Solutions	10	PACKAGE	\$7.52	\$75.20	8.5 X 11 67# DOMTAR EARTHCHOICE VELLUM BRISTAL COLORS, 250/PKG	
27	GROUP IV - Card/Cover Stock - Various Colors, 8.5" X 11", 2500/Ctn, Earthchoice Hots					
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer
Economy Products & Solutions	22	CARTON	\$99.17	\$2,181.74	8.5 X 11 65# DOMTAR EARTHCHOICE HOTS COVER 2500/CTN	
28	GROUP IV - Card/Cover Stock - Various Colors, 8.5" X 11", 250/Shts/Pkg per Pkg					
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer
Economy Products & Solutions	10	REAM	\$35.97	\$359.70	8.5 X 11 65# DOMTAR EARTHCHOICE OPAQUE COVER COLORS 250/PKG	
29	GROUP IV - Card/Cover Stock - WHITE, 8 1/2" X 11", 67#, Springhill #2005995 or equivalent, 250 shts/pkg.; per pkg					
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer
Economy Products & Solutions	18	PACKAGE	\$7.08	\$127.44	8.5 X 11 67# WHITE DOMTAR EARTHCHOICE VELLUM BRISTOL 250/PKG	

CATALOG

August 1, 2021 – January 31, 2022

30	GROUP V - 3 Part/Reverse Collated, 8 1/2" X 11", NCR/Uniform 20# Imation or equivalent, 5000/Ctn					
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer
Economy Products & Solutions	5	CARTON	\$143.73	\$718.65	8.5 X 11 3 PT UNIFORM 20 REVERSE, 5000/CTN	

31	GROUP VI - #18 Non-Perforated (along pin holes), 14 7/8" x 11", Continuous green bar stock, # 112, 2600/Ctn					
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer
Economy Products & Solutions	10	CARTON	\$125.84	\$1,258.40	PLUS FREIGHT, 14-7/8 X 11 18# 1/2" GREEN BAR COMPUTER PAPER, 3000/CTN	

32	GROUP VI - Laser Printer Paper - WHITE, 8 1/2" x 11", 24 Microprint Laser, 500 shts/ream, per ream					
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer
					No Bid	

33	GROUP VII - Parchment Paper - BLUE Color, 8 1/2" x 11", 24/60# Astroparche Text, 500 shts/ream, per ream					
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer
Economy Products & Solutions	10	REAM	\$23.00	\$230.00	PLUS FREIGHT, 8.5 X 11 60# NEW BLUESTONE SKYTONE TEXT 500/RM 0045747	

34	GROUP VII - Parchment Paper - NATURAL Color, 8 1/2" x 11", 24/60# Astroparche Text, 500 shts/ream, per ream					
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer
Economy Products & Solutions	9	REAM	\$23.00	\$207.00	PLUS FREIGHT, 8.5 X 11 60# NATURAL SKYTONE TEXT 500/RM 0045746	

35	GROUP VII - Parchment Paper - WHITE, 8 1/2" x 11", 24/60# Astroparche Text, 500 shts/ream, per ream					
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer
Economy Products & Solutions	7	REAM	\$23.00	\$161.00	PLUS FREIGHT, 8.5 X 11 60# NEW WHITE SKYTONE TEXT 500/RM 0045648	

CATALOG

August 1, 2021 – January 31, 2022

36	GROUP VII - Vellum 60# Text - Assorted Colors, 8 1/2" x 11", Color Exact Opaque, 500 shts/ream, per ream						
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	
Economy Products & Solutions	5	REAM	\$11.06	\$55.30	8.5 X 11 60# DOMTAR EARTHCHOICE OPAQUE COLORS 500/RM	Domtar Earthchoice or equivalent	

37	GROUP VII - Vellum 60# Text -- WHITE, 8 1/2" x 11", Color Exact Opaque, 500 shts/ream, per ream						
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	
Economy Products & Solutions	5	REAM	\$9.80	\$49.00	8.5 X 11 60# LYNX OPAQUE SMOOTH TEXT 500/RM 0038787	Domtar Earthchoice or equivalent	

38	GROUP VIII - #9 Envelope, 24#, 2500/Ctn						
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	
Economy Products & Solutions	35	BOX	\$12.80	\$448.00	# 24# WHITE WOVE REGULAR ENVELOPE 500/BOX	White Wove or equivalent	

39	GROUP VIII - #10 Envelopes; Rounded Flap, 24lb, 500/BX						
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	
Economy Products & Solutions	20	BOX	\$12.97	\$259.40	10 24# WHITE WOVE REGULAR ENVELOPES 500/BOX STANDARD COMMERCIAL ENVELOPE	White Wove or equivalent	

40	GROUP VIII - #10 Security Envelopes w/Window, V-Flap, 500/Box						
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	
Economy Products & Solutions	130	BOX	\$16.14	\$2,098.20	10 24# WHITE WOVE BLUE INSIDE TINT SECURITY WINDOW ENVELOPES - STANDARD COMMERCIAL FLAP 500/BOX 0050031	White Wove or equivalent	

CATALOG

August 1, 2021 – January 31, 2022

41	GROUP VIII - #10 Security Envelopes w/o Window, V-Flap, 500/Box						
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	
Economy Products & Solutions	80	BOX	\$14.15	\$1,132.00	10 24# WHITE WOVE BLACK TINT SECURITY REGULAR ENVELOPE 500/BOX STANDARD COMMERCIAL FLAP 0050030	White Wove or equivalent	

42	GROUP VIII - 6" x 9" 28# Brown Kraft Catalog Envelope Latex Flap, 500/Ctn						
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	
Economy Products & Solutions	5	CARTON	\$54.69	\$273.45	6 X 9 28# BROWN CRAFT CATALOG ENVELOPES LATEX FLAP 500/CTN		

43	GROUP VIII - 10" x 13" 28# Brown Kraft Catalog Envelope Latex Flap, 500/Ctn						
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	
Economy Products & Solutions	10	CARTON	\$92.36	\$923.60	10 X 13 28# BROWN KRAFT CATALOG ENVELOPE LATEX FLAP 500/CTN		

44	GROUP VIII - 9" x 12" Manila Catalog Envelopes, 500/Ctn						
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	
Economy Products & Solutions	15	CARTON	\$72.99	\$1,094.85	9 X 12 28# MANILA CATALOG ENVELOPE 500/CTN 0002984		

45	GROUP VIII - 9" x 12" White 28# Peel Seal Catalog Envelopes, 500/Ctn						
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	
Economy Products & Solutions	2	CARTON	\$52.72	\$105.44	9 X 12 28# WHITE WOVE CATALOG ENVELOPES PEEL & SEAL	White Wove or equivalent	

46	GROUP X - 65# Cover Paper; 8.5" x 11", Used for business cards, brochures, flyers, report covers, manuals, books,, and letterheads. Assorted Colors,						
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	
Economy Products & Solutions	1	CARTON	\$86.11	\$86.11	8.5 X 11 65# DOMTAR EARTHCHOICE OPAQUE COVER COLORS	Domtar Earthchoice or equivalent	

CATALOG

August 1, 2021 – January 31, 2022

47	GROUP XI - Perforated Laser Bond Sheets, 8 1/2" x 11", Bond Laser #3, Perfed horizontal 3 5/8 from bottom, 2500/Ctn						
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	
Economy Products & Solutions	10	CARTON	\$55.22	\$552.20	PLUS FREIGHT, 8.5 X 11 20# WHITE HORIZONTAL PERF AT 3-5/8" 2500/CTN	0048034	

51	Laser Printer Paper - WHITE, 8 1/2 x 11, 24 Microprint Laser, 500 shts/ream, per ream						
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	
No Bid							

52	Parchment Paper - BLUE Color, 8 1/2 x 11, 24/60# Astroparche Text, 500 shts/ream, per ream						
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	
Economy Products & Solutions	10	Ream	\$23.00	\$230.00	PLUS FREIGHT, 8.5 X 11 60# NEW BLUESTONE SKYTONE TEXT 500/RM	0045747	

53	Parchment Paper - NATURAL Color, 8 1/2 x 11, 24/60# Astroparche Text, 500 shts/ream, per ream						
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	
Economy Products & Solutions	9	Ream	\$26.00	\$234.00	PLUS FREIGHT, 8.5 X 11 60# NATURAL SKYTONE TEXT 500/RM	0045746	

54	Parchment Paper - WHITE, 8 1/2 x 11, 24/60# Astroparche Text, 500 shts/ream, per ream						
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	
Economy Products & Solutions	5	Ream	\$26.00	\$130.00	PLUS FREIGHT, 8.5 X 11 60# NEW WHITE SKYTONE TEXT 500/RM	0045648	

CATALOG

August 1, 2021 – January 31, 2022

56	Vellum 60# Text -- WHITE, 8 1/2 x 11, Color Exact Opaque, 500 shts/ream, per ream						
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	
Economy Products & Solutions	5	Ream	\$9.80	\$49.00	8.5 X 11 60# LYNX OPAQUE SMOOTH TEXT 500/RM 0038787	Domtar Earthchoice or equivalent	

58	#9 Envelope, 24#, 2500/Ctn						
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	
Economy Products & Solutions	25	BOX	\$11.89	\$297.25	9 24# WHITE WOVE REGULAR ENVELOPES 500/BOX 0002951	White Wove or equivalent	

61	#10 Security Envelopes w/Window, V-Flap, 500/Box						
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	
Economy Products & Solutions	25	BOX	\$17.08	\$427.00	10 24# WHITE WOVE BLACK INSIDE TINT SECURITY WINDOW ENVELOPE STANDARD COMMERCIAL FLAP 500/BOX 0050014	White Wove or equivalent	

78	20# 8.5 x 11 Multi-Use Paper - White, 30% Postconsumer content, 5000/Ctn						
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	
No Bid						Boise Aspen or equivalent	

87	24/60# Multi-Use Colored Paper- 8.5 x 11 Assorted Pack; 30% Recycled, Assorted Colors, 2500/Ctn						
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	
No Bid						Boise Fireworx or equivalent	