

Cooperative Ice Cream Frozen Desserts Catalog

WFL 2022-16

August 1, 2021 - July 31, 2022

<b>1</b>	<b>Chocolate Crunch Bar, 3.5 oz, 24/Box 152570</b>							
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes / Alternate Description</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b>	<b>Manufacturer #</b>
	[ALT1] Hershey's Ice Cream	1064	BOX	\$11.52	\$12,257.28	CHOCOLATE SCOOTER, 2.75 OZ, 36/BOX		
<b>2</b>	<b>Strawberry Crunch Bar, 3.5 oz, 24/Box 152575</b>							
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes / Alternate Description</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b>	<b>Manufacturer #</b>
	[ALT1] Hershey's Ice Cream	713	BOX	\$11.52	\$8,213.76	STRAWBERRY SCOOTER, 2.75 OZ, 36/BOX		
<b>3</b>	<b>Salted Caramel Brownie Crunch Bar, Reduced Fat 152577</b>							
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b>	<b>Manufacturer #</b>
	Hershey's Ice Cream	605	BOX	\$11.52	\$6,969.60			
<b>4</b>	<b>Strawberry Fruit Bar, 24/Box 152580</b>							
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b>	<b>Manufacturer #</b>
	Hershey's Ice Cream	290	BOX	\$26.16	\$7,586.40			
<b>5</b>	<b>Orange Blossom Bar, Low Fat, 24/Box 152583</b>							
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes / Alternate Description</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b>	<b>Manufacturer #</b>
	[ALT1] Hershey's Ice Cream	355	BOX	\$10.08	\$3,578.40	ORANGE BLOSSOM BAR, 2.5 OZ, 36/BOX		
<b>6</b>	<b>Polar Blast Fruit Juice Bar, 2.25 oz, 36/Box 152590</b>							
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b>	<b>Manufacturer #</b>
	Hershey's Ice Cream	327	BOX	\$10.08	\$3,296.16			
<b>7</b>	<b>Tropi-Kool Fruit Bars, 4 oz, All varieties, 24/Box 152595</b>							
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b>	<b>Manufacturer #</b>
	Hershey's Ice Cream	196	BOX	\$26.16	\$5,127.36			
<b>8</b>	<b>FrozFruit Chunky Strawberry Bar, 4 oz, 6/Box 152605</b>							
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes / Alternate Description</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b>	<b>Manufacturer #</b>
	[ALT1] Hershey's Ice Cream	35	BOX	\$26.16	\$915.60	TROPI-KOOL STRAWBERRY, 4 OZ, 24/BOX		
<b>9</b>	<b>Fudgie Bar, 2.2 oz, 24/Box 152608</b>							
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes / Alternate Description</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b>	<b>Manufacturer #</b>
	[ALT1] Hershey's Ice Cream	469	BOX	\$10.08	\$4,727.52	FUDGO BAR, 2 OZ, 36/BOX		
<b>10</b>	<b>Cookies 'N Cream Cone - Low Fat, 2 oz, 24/Box 152610</b>							
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes / Alternate Description</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b>	<b>Manufacturer #</b>
	[ALT1] Hershey's Ice Cream	759	BOX	\$12.24	\$9,290.16	COOKIES AND CREAM CONE, 4 OZ, 24/BOX		

Cooperative Ice Cream Frozen Desserts Catalog

WFL 2022-16

August 1, 2021 - July 31, 2022

<b>11 Crazy Cone - Low Fat, 2 oz, 24/Box 152615</b>							
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes / Alternate Description	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
[ALT1] Hershey's Ice Cream	674	BOX	\$12.24	\$8,249.76	CRAZY CONE, 4 OZ, 24/BOX		
<b>12 Vanilla Ice Cream Sandwich - Reduced Fat, 3.5oz,24/Box 152620</b>							
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes / Alternate Description	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
[ALT1] Hershey's Ice Cream	1181	BOX	\$11.04	\$13,038.24	REDUCED FAT ICE CREAM VANILLA SANDWICH, 4 OZ, 24/BOX		
<b>13 Brownie Batter Ice Cream Sandwish, Reduced Fat, 24/Box 152621</b>							
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
Hershey's Ice Cream	566	BOX	\$11.04	\$6,248.64			
<b>14 Mint Ice Cream Sandwich - Reduced Fat, 2.3 oz, 24/Box 152623</b>							
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes / Alternate Description	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
[ALT1] Hershey's Ice Cream	260	BOX	\$11.04	\$2,870.40	LLAMA PARTY ICE CREAM SANDWICH, 4 OZ, 24/BOX		
<b>15 Chocolate Ice Cream Sandwich - Reduced Fat, 4 oz, 24/Box 152625</b>							
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
Hershey's Ice Cream	587	BOX	\$11.04	\$6,480.48	BROWNIE BATTER ICE CREAM SANDWICH		
<b>16 Cookies Cream Ice Cream Sandwich - Reduced Fat, 2.3 oz, 24/Box 152627</b>							
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
Hershey's Ice Cream	366	BOX	\$11.04	\$4,040.64			
<b>17 Mighty Mini Vanilla Ice Cream Sandwich, 2.5 oz, 48/Box 152630</b>							
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
Hershey's Ice Cream	145	BOX	\$14.88	\$2,157.60			
<b>18 Juice Rush - Cherry Blue Raspberry, 4.4 oz cup, 100% Frozen Fruit Juice, 80/Case 152631</b>							
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
Hershey's Ice Cream	181	CASE	\$24.00	\$4,344.00			
<b>19 Juice Rush - Lemon Orange, 4.4 oz cup, 100% Frozen Fruit Juice, 80/Case 152632</b>							
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
Hershey's Ice Cream	143	CASE	\$24.00	\$3,432.00			

Cooperative Ice Cream Frozen Desserts Catalog

WFL 2022-16

August 1, 2021 - July 31, 2022

<b>20</b>	<b>Juice Rush - Strawberry Mango, 4.4 oz cup, 100% Frozen Fruit Juice, 80/Case 152633</b>							
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b>	<b>Manufacturer #</b>
	Hershey's Ice Cream	148	CASE	\$24.00	\$3,552.00	MANGO HEAT (REPLACED STARWBERRY MANGO)		
<b>21</b>	<b>Sherbet, Lemon 4 oz Cups, 48/Box 152641</b>							
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes / Alternate Description</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b>	<b>Manufacturer #</b>
	[ALT1] Hershey's Ice Cream	22	BOX	\$7.68	\$168.96	LEMON SHERBET 4 OZ CUPS, 24/BOX		
<b>22</b>	<b>Sherbet, Raspberry 4 oz Cups, 48/Box 152643</b>							
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes / Alternate Description</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b>	<b>Manufacturer #</b>
	[ALT1] Hershey's Ice Cream	38	BOX	\$7.68	\$291.84	RASPBERRY SHERBET 4 OZ CUPS, 24/BOX		
<b>23</b>	<b>Sherbet, Orange, 4 oz Cups, 48/Box 152645</b>							
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes / Alternate Description</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b>	<b>Manufacturer #</b>
	[ALT1] Hershey's Ice Cream	157	BOX	\$7.68	\$1,205.76	ORANGE SHERBET 4 OZ CUPS, 24/BOX		
<b>24</b>	<b>Low Fat Ice Cream, 4 oz Cups, Assorted Flavors, 24/Box 152650</b>							
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b>	<b>Manufacturer #</b>
	Hershey's Ice Cream	595	BOX	\$7.68	\$4,569.60			
<b>25</b>	<b>No Fat Yogurt, 4 oz Cups, 48/Box 152655</b>							
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes / Alternate Description</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b>	<b>Manufacturer #</b>
	[ALT1] Hershey's Ice Cream	165	BOX	\$8.88	\$1,465.20	YOGART, 4 OZ CUPS, 24/BOX		
<b>26</b>	<b>No Fat Twister Cups, 3.75 oz, Assorted Flavors, 18/Box 152660</b>							
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b>	<b>Manufacturer #</b>
	Hershey's Ice Cream	394	BOX	\$9.00	\$3,546.00			
<b>27</b>	<b>Chocolate Sundae Dessert Cup - Low Fat, 3 oz, 40/Box 152661</b>							
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes / Alternate Description</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b>	<b>Manufacturer #</b>
	[ALT1] Hershey's Ice Cream	215	BOX	\$13.92	\$2,992.80	CHOCOLATE SUNDAE DESSERT CUP, 3 OZ, 48/BOX		
<b>28</b>	<b>Strawberry Sundae Dessert Cup - Low Fat, 3 oz, 40/Box 152662</b>							
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b>	<b>Manufacturer #</b>
	Hershey's Ice Cream	155	BOX	\$13.92	\$2,157.60	48/BOX		
<b>29</b>	<b>Dessert Cups, Low Fat, 3 oz, assorted flavors. Must specify flavor, 40/Case 152663</b>							
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b>	<b>Manufacturer #</b>
	Hershey's Ice Cream	70	Case	\$13.92	\$974.40	48/BOX		

Cooperative Ice Cream Frozen Desserts Catalog

WFL 2022-16

August 1, 2021 - July 31, 2022

<b>30</b>	<b>Fudgie Bar - No Sugar Added, 2.5 oz, 24/Box - GROUP II 152555</b>						
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes / Alternate Description</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b> <b>Manufacturer #</b>
	[ALT1] Hershey's Ice Cream	116	BOX	\$10.08	\$1,169.28	FUDJO BAR 2 OZ, 36/BOX	
<b>31</b>	<b>Fudgie Bar (ABC) 2.5 oz, All Natural Flavors, 24/Box - GROUP II 152560</b>						
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes / Alternate Description</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b> <b>Manufacturer #</b>
	[ALT1] Hershey's Ice Cream	39	BOX	\$10.08	\$393.12	FUDJO BAR 2 OZ, 36/BOX	
<b>32</b>	<b>ABC Buddies Bars, 3 oz , All Varieties, 24/Box - GROUP II 152565</b>						
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes / Alternate Description</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b> <b>Manufacturer #</b>
	[ALT1] Hershey's Ice Cream	30	BOX	\$10.08	\$302.40	CARNIVAL COTTON CANDY FROZEN YOGART BAR, 2.5 OZ, 36/BOX	
<b>33</b>	<b>Cookies Cream Bar, 1.76 oz, Low Fat, Good Humor, 24/Box - GROUP II 152585</b>						
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes / Alternate Description</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b> <b>Manufacturer #</b>
	[ALT1] Hershey's Ice Cream	52	BOX	\$11.52	\$599.04	REDUCED FAT SALTED CARAMEL BROWNIE CRUNCH, 2.75 OZ, 36/BOX	
<b>34</b>	<b>Orange Dream Bar, 1.7 oz, Blue Ribbon Classics, 20/Box - GROUP II 152600</b>						
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes / Alternate Description</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b> <b>Manufacturer #</b>
	[ALT1] Hershey's Ice Cream	62	BOX	\$10.08	\$624.96	ORANGE BLOSSOM BAR, 2.5 OZ, 36/BOX	
<b>35</b>	<b>Foam Cups - Reduced Fat, 3 oz, Assorted Flavors, 32/Box - GROUP II 152635</b>						
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes / Alternate Description</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b> <b>Manufacturer #</b>
	[ALT1] Hershey's Ice Cream	100	BOX	\$8.88	\$888.00	REDUCED FAT/NO SUGAR FOAM CUPS, 4 OZ, 24/BOX	
<b>36</b>	<b>Plastic Cups - Low Fat, 3 oz, Assorted Flavors, 24/Box - GROUP II 152640</b>						
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes / Alternate Description</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b> <b>Manufacturer #</b>
	[ALT1] Hershey's Ice Cream	50	BOX	\$13.92	\$696.00	LOWFAT , 3 OZ, 48/BOX	
<b>37</b>	<b>Vanilla Ice Cream Cup, 4 oz, 48/Box - GROUP II 152646</b>						
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b> <b>Manufacturer #</b>
	Hershey's Ice Cream	116	BOX	\$7.68	\$890.88	24/BOX QUANTITY 232	
<b>38</b>	<b>Chocolate Ice Cream Cup, 4 oz, 48/Box - GROUP II 152647</b>						
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b> <b>Manufacturer #</b>
	Hershey's Ice Cream	116	BOX	\$7.68	\$890.88	24/BOX, QUANTITY 232	
<b>39</b>	<b>Strawberry Ice Cream Cup, 4 oz, 48/Box - GROUP II 152648</b>						
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b> <b>Manufacturer #</b>
	Hershey's Ice Cream	16	BOX	\$7.68	\$122.88	24/BOX, QUANTITY 32	

Cooperative Ice Cream Frozen Desserts Catalog

WFL 2022-16

August 1, 2021 - July 31, 2022

<b>40</b>	<b>Orange Sherbet Cup, 4 oz, 48/Box - GROUP II 152651</b>							
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b>	<b>Manufacturer #</b>
	Hershey's Ice Cream	32	BOX	\$7.68	\$245.76	24/BOX, QUANTITY 64		
<b>41</b>	<b>Raspberry Sherbet Cup, 4 oz, 48/Box - GROUP II 152652</b>							
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b>	<b>Manufacturer #</b>
	Hershey's Ice Cream	22	BOX	\$7.68	\$168.96	24/BOX, QUANTITY 44		
<b>42</b>	<b>Vanilla Ice Cream Bar, 3 oz, 24/Box - GROUP II 152665</b>							
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes / Alternate Description</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b>	<b>Manufacturer #</b>
	[ALT1] Hershey's Ice Cream	54	BOX			BANJO BAR CRUNCH (VANILLA ICE CREAM COATED IN CHOCOLATE), 2 OZ, 36/BOX		
<b>43</b>	<b>Peanut Butter Crunch Bar, 3 oz, 24/Box - GROUP II 152670</b>							
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b>	<b>Manufacturer #</b>
	Hershey's Ice Cream	25	BOX	No Bid				
<b>44</b>	<b>Snickers Ice Cream Bar, 3.33 oz, 48/Box - GROUP II 152675</b>							
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b>	<b>Manufacturer #</b>
	Hershey's Ice Cream	5	BOX	No Bid				
<b>45</b>	<b>Twix Ice Cream Bar, 3.2 oz, 48/Box - GROUP II 152680</b>							
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b>	<b>Manufacturer #</b>
	Hershey's Ice Cream	5	BOX	No Bid				
<b>46</b>	<b>Chocolate Marshmallow Cone, 2.6 oz, 48/Box - GROUP II 152685</b>							
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b>	<b>Manufacturer #</b>
	Hershey's Ice Cream	6	BOX	No Bid				
<b>47</b>	<b>Popsicle Scibblers, 2.7 oz, 24/Box - GROUP II 152690</b>							
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b>	<b>Manufacturer #</b>
	Hershey's Ice Cream	10	BOX	No Bid				
<b>48</b>	<b>Popsicle Firecracker Jr Pop, 1.5 oz, 24/Box - GROUP II 152695</b>							
	<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b>	<b>Manufacturer #</b>
	Hershey's Ice Cream	15	BOX	No Bid				

Cooperative Ice Cream Frozen Desserts Catalog

WFL 2022-16

August 1, 2021 - July 31, 2022

<b>49 Sherbet Push-Up Pop, 2.75 oz, 24/Box - GROUP II 152700</b>							
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b>	<b>Manufacturer #</b>
Hershey's Ice Cream	30	BOX	No Bid				

  

<b>50 Vanilla Ice Cream, 3 Gallon Container - GROUP II 152710</b>							
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b>	<b>Manufacturer #</b>
Hershey's Ice Cream	25	EACH	\$23.50	\$587.50			

  

<b>51 Chocolate Ice Cream, 3 Gallon Containe - GROUP II 152715</b>							
<b>Supplier</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended</b>	<b>Supplier Notes</b>	<b>Manufacturer</b>	<b>Manufacturer #</b>
Hershey's Ice Cream	16	EACH	\$23.50	\$376.00			