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Date:   December 15, 2020 
From:  Justin Attaway, Business Manager/CSBO 
Re:  Display Bid #2101 
 
Description 
An Invitation to Bid was published in the Chicago Tribune on November 4, 2020, posted on the District 
website, and distributed to 11 vendors. A total of ten responses were received at the public opening on 
November 20, 2020. Additionally, one bid was received after the bid opening and was returned to the 
vendor unopened. 
 
Analysis 
 
The full bid tab is attached to this recommendation. 
 
Recommendation 
It is recommended that the Board of Education award Bid 2101 – Displays to Midwest Computer 
Products, West Chicago, Illinois, at $146,779,65 based on being the lowest responsible, responsive 
bidder.  
 
Bid Documents are on file in the business office for review. 



 
 

 

Item 1:
LG 86" Television

Item 2:
LG 75" Television

Item 3:
LG 65" Television

Item 4:
LG 55" Television

Item 5:
LG 32" Television

Item 6:
Chief Large Mount

Item 7:
Chief Med. Mount

Item 8:
Delivery Total

Qty: 1 Qty: 46 Qty: 54 Qty: 9 Qty: 28 Qty: 131 Qty: 28

Aves Audio Visual Systems, Inc
Sugar Land, Texas No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $16,899.00 $3,612.00 $0.00 $20,511.00
B&H Photo Video
New York, New York $2,800.00 $71,300.00 $48,870.00 $6,615.00 $6,580.00 $10,643.75 $2,282.00 $0.00 $149,090.75
Tiles in Style LLC
Willowbrook, Illinois $4,355.40 $106,908.60 $63,903.60 $9,003.60 $9,086.56 $20,776.60 $3,757.60 $0.00 $217,791.96
PC Nation 
Northfield, Illinois $2,929.35 $74,979.08 $44,629.92 $6,376.23 $6,405.56 $12,020.56 $2,569.28 $0.00 $149,909.98
COTG
Bolingbrook, Illinois $2,980.04 $76,167.72 $45,473.40 $6,386.76 $6,495.72 $11,085.22 $2,369.36 $0.00 $150,958.22
Staples
Deerfield Beach, Florida $2,977.44 $76,090.44 $45,426.96 $6,380.28 $6,484.24 $12,658.53 $2,705.64 $10,065.00 $162,788.53
Abt Electronics
Glenview, Illinois $3,241.00 $81,788.00 $48,384.00 $6,930.00 $7,056.00 $12,314.00 $2,268.00 $0.00 $161,981.00
Chicago United Industries
Chicago, Illinois $3,652.98 $97,455.60 $53,099.28 $8,137.35 $8,119.16 $14,577.68 $2,816.24 $0.00 $187,858.29
Frequency AV Services 
Chicago, Illinois $2,957.77 $75,586.74 $45,128.34 $6,338.07 $6,441.12 $21,300.90 $2,535.12 $756.44 $161,044.50
Midwest Computer Products
West Chicago, Illinois $2,904.00 $73,922.00 $44,010.00 $6,223.50 $6,328.00 $10,853.35 $2,319.80 $219.00 $146,779.65


