
Contact: Craig Schmarr, Phone: 203-341-1296

Item 

# 
Description Specifications

Quantity 

Requested
ITEM AWARDED TO BASED ON BID PRICE

1 M.D. Stetson Transsend Green Seal Fl. Finish Fl. Finish  NO SUBSTITUTION

1400 Gallons      (5 

gallon containers 

only)

M.D. STETSON Spec. Item $18,480.00

2 Enhancer Spray Buff 12 Qt. 10 Cases W.B. MASON Lowest Cost $268.10

3 M.D. Stetson EPS Stripper Degreaser Green Seal  NO SUBSTITUTIONS 500 Cases M.D. STETSON Spec. Item $41,490.00

4 Dupal #58 Lotion Soap, Unscented Green Seal - 800 mil.-12 bx./cs.NO SUBSTITUTIONS 275 Cases DUMOCHER PAPER CO Tools for School $7,425.00

5 GoJo Lotion Soap Disp.- Push In Handle - White 80 Units SCHOOL SPECIALTY Lowest Cost $207.20

6 E Z Way Prod. Environ. Green Seal Appr. Ice Melt - NO SUBSTITUTIONS 350 Bags W.B. MASON Spec. Item $2,537.50

7 Gum Freeze Gum Remover 12/cs. Sample Requested 10 Cases
PYRAMID SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
Lowest Cost $237.50

8 Shazame Degreaser Bio Enzyme Cleaner Degreaser - NO SUBSTITUTIONS 10 Cases W.B. MASON Spec. Item $365.90

9
Vandalism Mark & Stain Remover, Removes 

Pencil

Marks, Inks, Spray Paint, Tape, etc. 6-22 oz./cs. Must have 3rd Party Green 

Seal or Eco Logo-4 cs.
4 Cases DUMOCHER PAPER CO Lowest Cost $172.00

10 NCL Foam Break - 4 gals. per case 10 cs. NO SUBSTITUTIONS 10 Cases BENMAN INDUSTRIES Spec. Item $402.80

11 Kabloohey Restroom Cleaner NO SUBSTITUTION 40 Cases M.D. STETSON Spec. Item $2,400.00

12 MDS 20 in. STETCO Stripping Pads, Emerald High Performance, NO SUBSTITUTIONS 75 Cases M.D. STETSON Spec. Item $3,450.00

13 Triple SSS Foam Disinfect. Cleaner - 12/cs. - 95 cs. NO SUBSTITUTIONS 95 Cases BENMAN INDUSTRIES Spec. Item $4,096.40

14 Triple SSS D C Plus Foam Disp. Cleaner NO SUBSTITUTIONS 60 Cases BENMAN INDUSTRIES Spec. Item $2,457.60

15 Twister Stone Care Grout Cleaner 4 gal./cs. NO SUBSTITUTIONS 20 Cases BENMAN INDUSTRIES Spec. Item $1,112.80

16 Split Non-Detergent Restroom Cleaner 4 gal. per case - 8 cs. 8 Cases
C&C JANITORIAL 

SUPPLY
Lowest Cost $454.08

17 Eco-G Floor Finish, Green Seal, 5 gal./cs. NO SUBSTITUTIONS 40 Cases
NEW ENGLAND 

MAINTENANCE DEPOT
Spec. Item $3,440.00

18 Smart San Healthcare Personal Hand Wash - Unscented SMA0019 -6 x 1 Case Liter Bottles Foam 40 Cases BENMAN INDUSTRIES Tools for School $4,600.00

19 Flexi Sheen Wax Conditioner 4 gal/cs. 5 Cases BENMAN INDUSTRIES Lowest Cost $245.00

20 Flexi Clean Rubber Floor Cleaner 4 gal./cs 5 Cases BENMAN INDUSTRIES Lowest Cost $190.00

21 WD40 - 802 Cans 4 Cases BENMAN INDUSTRIES Lowest Cost $208.80

22 Clorox Tilex Mildew Rem. 9 qt. Spray Bottles/cs. NO SUBSTITUTIONS 30 Cases BENMAN INDUSTRIES Spec. Item $1,017.00

23 M.D. Stetson PC 101 Neutral
Glass Cleaner Green Seal 4/cs. Equal or Better                              NO 

SUBSTITUTIONS
75 Cases M.D. STETSON Spec. Item $9,998.25

24 M.D. Stetson PC 103 Disinf. 256 HBV - 4/cs. NO SUBSTITUTIONS 50 Cases M.D. STETSON Spec. Item $5,555.00

25 Core Products Hydroxi Pro Cleaning Wipes - 35 Wipes per Tub 7x9 - 6/cs. 20 Cases SCHOOL SPECIALTY Lowest Cost $285.80
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Item 

# 
Description Specifications
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ITEM AWARDED TO BASED ON 

BID                

CASE PRICE

26 Triple SSS Multi Purpose Cleaning Wipes - 75 Wipes per Tub 8x12 - 6/cs. 25 Cases W.B. MASON Lowest Cost $595.50

27 M.D. Stetson PC 120 - Multi
SurfaceCleaner Green Seal 4 Per Case - Equal or Better                      NO 

SUBSTITUTION
90 Cases M.D. STETSON Spec. Item $11,997.90

28 M.D. Stetson Prozime #121 NO SUBSTITUTIONS 160 Cases M.D. STETSON Spec. Item $14,788.80

29 M.D. Stetson #108 Spray & Wipe NO SUBSTITUTIONS 160 Cases M.D. STETSON Spec. Item $40,246.40

30 Triple SSS Multi Surface Cleaning Wipes, 6 Tubs/cs., 5 Cases BENMAN INDUSTRIES Lowest Cost $125.40

TOTAL ITEMS: 30

Item 

# 
Description Specifications

Quantity 

Requested
ITEM AWARDED TO BASED ON 

BID                

CASE PRICE

1 N.E. Maint. Depot Eco Wet Mops Equal or Better NO SUBSTITUTIONS 95 Cases
NEW ENGLAND 

MAINTENANCE DEPOT
Spec. Item $7,980.00

2 Toilet Bowl Brushes Wood Handle 19' Length Sample Requested 50 Brushes HULLYARD INC. Lowest Cost $32.00

3 E-Z Way Flop Dust Mop System NO SUBSTITUTIONS 34 Pieces NO BID

4 Brooms Rubbermaid Lobby Dust 40 Units
CALICO INDUSTRIAL 

SUPPLY
Lowest Cost $101.60

5 Angled Brooms Upright Flagged Polystyrene 50 Units
CALICO INDUSTRIAL 

SUPPLY
Lowest Cost $177.60

6
Mop Bucket & Wringer, Marked "Wet Floor" 

on Casters
Rubbermaid or Equal 30 Units

CALICO INDUSTRIAL 

SUPPLY
Lowest Cost $1,033.20

7 Receptacle Liners #6140 Rubbermaid Waxed Paper 30 Cases
CENTRAL POLY-BAG 

CORP.
Lowest Cost $329.40

8 Washable Microfiber Dust Mops Nexstep #96078 60" x 5" , 6/cs 10 Cases
CENTRAL POLY-BAG 

CORP.
Lowest Cost $359.40

9 Washable Microfiber Dust Mops Nexstep #96076 48" x 5"  6 c/s 10 Cases
PYRAMID SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS
Lowest Cost $299.40

10 Washable Microfiber Dust Mops Nexstep #96072 24" x 5"  6 c/s 10 Cases
PYRAMID SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS
Lowest Cost $239.40

11 N. E. Maint. Depot Rough Fl. Wet Mops 12/cs - NO SUBSTITUTION 55 Cases
CALICO INDUSTRIAL 

SUPPLY
Spec. Item $5,940.00

TOTAL ITEMS: 11

Item 

# 
Description Specifications

Quantity 

Requested
ITEM AWARDED TO BASED ON 

BID                

CASE PRICE

1
Toilet Tissue 2 Ply, North River Green Seal 

Only
Seal, Jr. Jumbo Rolls, 12/cs. Eq. or Better 1500 Cases W.B. MASON Lowest Cost $20,025.00

2 North River Green Seal Roll Towels, Certified 9 x 11 L, 350 ft. 12/cs. - Eq. or Better, Sample Requested 1600 Cases W.B. MASON Lowest Cost $19,584.00

3 Facial Tissue - 100/bx., 30 bxs./cs.
Samples Req.- 200 Cases, Green Seal, Certified  Equal or Better 9.25 x 

8.25
200 Cases

CENTRAL POLY BAG 

CORP.
Lowest Cost $2,148.00

TOTAL ITEMS: 3
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Item 

# 
Description Specifications

Quantity 

Requested
ITEM AWARDED TO BASED ON 

BID                

CASE PRICE

1
Interplast Pitt  Plastics Performance HD Liners, HHC 

30x36, 13 Microns

20 -30 Gal., Heavy Strength, 500/pkg., No Box, Shrink Wrap Only, 20/25, 

Sample Required, NO SUBSTITUTIONS
1400 Cases

CENTRAL POLY-BAG 

CORP.
Spec. Item $31,640.00

2
Interplast Pitt Plastics Performance HD Liners,  

HR40xHC, 15 Microns

Extra Heavy,  250/pkg., 40 X 46 Size,  No Box, Shrink Wrap Only, 10/25, 

Sample Required, NO SUBSTITUTIONS
1200 Cases

CENTRAL POLY-BAG 

CORP.
Spec. Item $27,000.00

3
Interplast Pitt Plastics Performance HD Liners, Extra 

Heavy, HCxL6017, 15 Microns

60 Gal. 38 x 58, (black only), 200 pkg., 8/25  - , No Box, Shrink Wrap 

Only, Sample Required -NO SUBSTITUTIONS
150 Cases

CENTRAL POLY-BAG 

CORP.
Spec. Item $3,225.00

4 Bissell Back Pack Vacs - Big Green 10 qt.
w/Tool Kit and Attachments, Model 37491 - 16 un.                            NO 

SUBSTITUTIONS
16 Units K&S DISTRIBUTORS Spec. Item $4,016.00

5 Dust Cloths, 18 x 18, 200/cs. Yellow, Ft. Howard or Better - Sample Required - 150 cs. 150 Cases K&S DISTRIBUTORS Lowest Cost $1,782.00

6 Quest- The Magician Stain Removing Sponge, 24/cs. - 26 cs. 26 Cases W.B. MASON Lowest Cost $333.84

7 Extension Cords 50 ft. 50 ft. - 14/3 Guage 30 Units W.B. MASON Lowest Cost $466.20

8 Urinal Screens Non Para 12/cs. 100 Active Materials, To Contain Quats 30 Cases W.B. MASON Lowest Cost $257.70

9 3M or Eq. Scrubbing Pads 20 in. Blue - 20 cs. 30 Cases
PYRAMID SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS
Lowest Cost $347.70

10 3M 3600 Eraser Buff Pads 20 in.or Eq. 50 Cases W.B. MASON Lowest Cost $510.00

11 3M Red Speed Pads 20 in. or Eq. 50 Cases W.B. MASON Lowest Cost $510.00

12 3M Scrubbing Sponges or Better, Scotch Brite, 6 1/4x3 1/2x5/8 75 Cases K&S DISTRIBUTORS Lowest Cost $216.00

13 Cellulose Sponges 7 3/8x4x2x1/4 - Sample Required 2 Cases
CALICO INDUSTRIAL 

SUPPLY
Lowest Cost $57.88

14 Rubbermaid Lobby Dust Pan #2007 40 Units BENMAM INDUSTRIES Lowest Cost $179.20

15 Champ Wipes Work Horse
Wipes, Pop Up #8688, 9 1/4 x 16 1/4, 300 cs. - 225/bx./4 bxs/cs.            

NO SUBSTITUTIONS
300 Cases DUMOCHER PAPER CO. Spec. Item $13,647.00

16 Cloth Duct Tape 2" x 60 yds. 3 in Core - 5 rolls 5 Rolls
PYRAMID SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS
Lowest Cost $14.95

17 Unger Brute Scraper 30 Units K&S DISTRIBUTORS Lowest Cost $339.90

18 Fort James 9" Jumbo Bath Tissue Disp. #58250, Equal or Better 85 Units W.B. MASON Lowest Cost $773.50

19 Seco High Duster Extension Duster, or Equivalent 45 Units
PYRAMID SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS
Lowest Cost $224.55

20 Probe Back Pack Vacuum Bags, 20 cs. 20 Cases K&S DISTRIBUTORS Lowest Cost $142.00

21
Stainless Steel Clean & Polish Towel - Must 

have 3rd Party Green Seal or Eco Logo, 
S 40/Container,  60 Cases

C&C JANITORIAL 

SUPPLIES
Lowest Cost $1,828.80

22 18 in. Gym Floor Sanding Screens 80 Grit 10 Boxes
PYRAMID SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS
Lowest Cost $309.90

23 18 in. Gym Floor Sanding Screens 100 Grit, 10 bxs. 10 Boxes
PYRAMID SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS
Lowest Cost $299.90

24 18 in. Gym Floor Sanding Screens 120 Grit, 10 bxs. 4 Boxes BENMAN INDUSTRIES Lowest Cost $115.24

25 18 in. Gym Floor Sanding Screens 60 Grit, 4 bxs. 4 Boxes BENMAN INDUSTRIES Lowest Cost $172.72

26 Triple SSS Back Pack Vacs Speed Star 1000, 6 un., NO SUBSTITUTIONS 6 Units BENMAN INDUSTRIES Spec. Item $2,100.00

27 Triple SSS Filter Bags Speedstar 1000, 10 Packs Per Case 40 Cases I-RIC Lowest Cost $697.60

28 Rubbermaid Tilt Trucks 56 3/4"L x 28"W x 38 5/8"H, #9T17 1 Unit W.B. MASON Lowest Cost $341.49

29 Rubbermaid Brute Dolly RCP 2840-43 12 Units W.B. MASON Lowest Cost $215.76

30 M.D. Stetson HYDSP 4912 Wall Mount Dispenser, Equal or Better 12 Units NO BID

31 Rubbermaid Trolleys Pt. #3551-88 6 Units K&S DISTRIBUTORS Lowest Cost $230.49

32 Triple SSS Nex Gen Micro Fiber Carpet Bonnets 21 in., Reversible 6/cs 12 Cases I-RIC Lowest Cost $1,137.00

33 Triple SSS Micro Fiber Looped End Dust Mop Pads, 24" Slant Slip Blue 20 Cases BENMAN INDUSTRIES Lowest Cost $861.80

D. UTILY ITEMS
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Item 

# 
Description Specifications

Quantity 

Requested
ITEM AWARDED TO BASED ON 

BID                

CASE PRICE

34 Triple SSS High Duster Sleeves #89036/89037/, 89038 10 of each 10 Cases NO BID

35 Triple SSS Nex Gen Micro Fiber General Purpose Cleaning, Wipes #89028 250/cs 20 Cases
C&C JANITORIAL 

SUPPLIES
Lowest Cost $2,376.00

36 Triple SSS Nex Gen Micro Fiber Gen. Purp. Cleaning, Wipes #89031 250/cs 20 Cases
C&C JANITORIAL 

SUPPLIES
Lowest Cost $2,376.00

37 Triple SSS Nex Gen Micro Fiber Gen. Purp. Cleaning, Wipes #89031 250/cs 10 Cases
C&C JANITORIAL 

SUPPLIES
Lowest Cost $1,188.00

38 Triple SSS Micro Fiber Gloves #89040 Detail Gloves, 12/cs 2 Cases NO BID

39 Rubbermaid Regular Trash #2958 or Equal 40 Units
PYRAMID SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS
Lowest Cost $135.60

40 Rubbermaid Recycling Cont. #3536-06 4 Units W.B. MASON Lowest Cost $165.40

41 Rubbermaid Mobile Fence #9513 2 Units W.B. MASON Lowest Cost $821.90

42 KC16N Blue Microfiber Towels 16 x 16 270 gsm 50/pk 6 Cases W.B. MASON Lowest Cost $135.54

43 KC16R Blue Microfiber Towels 16 x 16 270 gsm 50/pk 6 Cases W.B. MASON Lowest Cost $135.54

44 Smart San Pop Up Wipes 160 Containers, 6/cs., 10 cs. 10 Cases BENMAN INDUSTRIES Lowest Cost $970.00

45 Sani cloth HP Wipes 6/cs.  NO SUBSTITUTIONS 10 Cases DUMOCHER PAPER CO. Tools for Schools $410.00

TOTAL ITEMS: 45

Item 

# 
Description Specifications

Quantity 

Requested
ITEM AWARDED TO BASED ON 

BID                

CASE PRICE

1 Cotton Boss Work Gloves Sample Requested 50 Pairs HULLYARD INC Lowest Cost $28.00

2 Neoprem Gloves Long Sleeve XL - Sample Required 20 Pairs
C&C JANITORIAL 

SUPPLIES
Lowest Cost $8.80

3 Latex, Extra Lg. Surgical Gloves, 1000 Count 100 Cases W.B. MASON Lowest Cost $1,840.00

4 Rubbermaid Plastic Yellow #6112-Eng./Span., Wet Floor Signs 5 Units
CALICO INDUSTRIAL 

SUPPLY
Lowest Cost $24.70

5 First Aid Kits, Indoor For Up To 25 People 3 Kits BENMAN INDUSTRIES Lowest Cost $35.91

6 Dust Masks North Safety Products, Disp. Non-Toxic #7140N95, 50/bx. 10 Boxes W.B. MASON Lowest Cost $28.20

7 Rubbermaid Site Safety Hanging Signs #9S15 6 Units
CALICO INDUSTRIAL 

SUPPLY
Lowest Cost $89.04

8
Unger Rubber Gloves, Window Washing 

Gloves
Ung. Gloves, 8 prs. 8 Pairs BENMAN INDUSTRIES Lowest Cost $2.64

TOTAL ITEMS: 8

 TOTAL ITEMS TO BID: 97

E. SAFETY EQUIPMENT

D. UTILY ITEMS (CONTINUATION)
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