INTEROFFICE MEMORANDUM

TO: ELIO LONGO
DIRECTOR OF SCHOOL BUSINESS OPERATIONS

FROM: CRAIG SCHMARR W

SUPERVISOR OF BUILDING OPERATIONS

£

z)"’ // -

SUBJECT: CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID RESULTS - BID #18-017-BOE
DATE: JUNE 22,2018

Bids for the Custodial Supplies Bid #18-017-BOE have been opened and the results are in the
attached spreadsheet. They reflect either the lowest bid or spec item.

Please advise if you approve.

WESTPORT PUBLIC SCHOOLS



Westport Public Schools

BID # _18-017-BOE CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES RESULTS AWARD LIST

OTA
Q
e PROD p ATIO 0 AWARDED TO BASED O D BID
. D
A. CHEMICAL SUPPLIES
1 Clorox Healthcare Hydrogen-Peroxide Cleaner disinfectant 32 fl. oz spray bottles 9 bottles per case NO SUBSTITUTION 30 Cases K&S DISTRIBUTORS LOWER PRICE 1,050.60
2 |Clorox Healthcare Hydrogen-Peroxide Cleaner disinfectant wipes, 155 wipes per bottle, 6 per case NO SUBSTITUTION 30 Cases K&S DISTRIBUTORS LOWER PRICE 1,049.40
NEW ENGLAND
3 | Tilex Mildew Rem. S Bottles 12 /cs. NO SUBSTITUTION 30C LOWER PRICE 960.00
orox Tilex Mildew Rem pray Bottles 12 /cs SUBSTITU ases MAINTENANCE DEPOT
4  |Core Products Hydroxi Pro Cleaning Wipes - 35 Wipes per Tub 7x9 - 6/cs. 10 Cases W.B. MASON LOWER PRICE 329.50
5 Dupal #58 Lotion Soap, Unscented Green Seal - 800 mil.-12 units./cs. NO SUBSTITUTION 300 Cases DUMOUCHEL PAPER CO. LOWER PRICE 8,385.00
NEW ENGLAND
6 Eco-G Floor Finish, G Seal, 5 gal. 2 SPEC. ITEM 1,760.00
o oor Finis reen Sea gal./cs NO SUBSTITUTION 0 Cases MAINTENANCE DEPOT
7 Environmelt Wise Solution Ice Melt 50 Ib bag - NO SUBSTITUTION 350 Bags DUMOUCHEL PAPER CO. LOWER PRICE 3,482.50
8 Flexi Clean Rubber Cleaner Intensive Rubber Cleaner and grease remover 4 gal./cs 5 cases M.D. STETSON CO. LOWER PRICE 165.00
9 Flexi Sheen Wax Rubber Wax and Conditioner to clean 4 gal/cs. 5 Cases K&S DISTRIBUTORS LOWER PRICE 240.75
10 |Golo Lotion Soap Dispenser Push In Handle - White 80 Units DUMOUCHEL PAPER CO. LOWER PRICE 240.00
11 |Gum Freeze Gum Remover 12/case. Sample Requested 10 cases PYRAMID SCHOOL LOWER PRICE 249.80
PRODUCTS

12 |Kablooey Restroom Cleaner Cleaner 4 gallon per case NO SUBSTITUTION 40 Cases K&S DISTRIBUTORS SPEC. ITEM 2,340.00
13 |M.D. Stetson EPS Stripper Degreaser Green Seal, 4gallons /case NO SUBSTITUTION 700 Cases M.D. STETSON CO. SPEC. ITEM 58,086.00
14 |M.D. Stetson PC 101 Neutral Glass Cleaner Green Seal 4/cs. Equal or Better NO SUBSTITUTION 85 Cases M.D. STETSON CO. SPEC. ITEM 11,671.35
15 [M.D. Stetson PC 103 Disinfectant 256 HBV1031- 4/cs. NO SUBSTITUTION 75 Cases M.D. STETSON CO. SPEC. ITEM 8,582.25




o PROD p ATIO 0 3 . AWARDED TO BASED O E D BID
A. CHEMICAL SUPPLIES ( CONTINUATION )

16 |M.D. Stetson PC 108 Spray & Wipe Cleaner NO SUBSTITUTION 130 Cases M.D. STETSON CO. SPEC. ITEM 33,670.00
17 [M.D. Stetson PC 120 Peroxide Multisurface Cleaner, Green seal 4 bottles per case NO SUBSTITUTION 50 Cases M.D. STETSON CO. SPEC. ITEM 6,865.50
18 |M.D. Stetson Prozime #121 Cleaner and Odor Eliminator, 2 units per case NO SUBSTITUTION 130 Cases M.D. STETSON CO. SPEC. ITEM 12,376.00
19 |M.D. Stetson Transcend Floor ‘ Finish Green seal, 5 gallon plastic container NO SUBSTITUTION 1400 Units M.D. STETSON CO. SPEC. ITEM 18,480.00
20 |Sani cloth HB Wipes Germicidal disposable wipe, SKU # Q08472 NO SUBSTITUTIONS 10 Cases DUMOUCHEL PAPER CO. LOWER PRICE 794.90
21 [Smart San Healthcare Personel Handwash Unscented SMA0019 1L, 6/cs 40 Cases C&(;Ll:l\:;(::lAL LOWER PRICE 2,115.20
22 |Smart San Pop Up Wipes 160 ct. canister, Ref # SMAWO0O06, 6 per case 10 Cases BENMAN INDUSTRIES LOWER PRICE 970.00
23 [Stainless Steel Cleaner & Polish Wipes Must have 3rd Party Green Seal or Eco Logo, 6 cans/case 30 Cases I-RIC CORP LOWER PRICE 1,726.20
24 |Triple SSS DC Plus Foam Disinfectant Cleaner Cleaner - 12/cs NO SUBSTITUTION 60 cases BENMAN INDUSTRIES LOWER PRICE 2,184.84
25 [Triple SSS Foam Disinfectant. Cleaner - 12/cs. NO SUBSTITUTION 95 Cases BENMAN INDUSTRIES SPEC. ITEM 3,723.99
26 |[Triple SSS Multi Purpose Disinfectant Cleaning Wipes - 75 Wipes per Tub 8x12 - 6/cs. 25 Cases BENMAN INDUSTRIES SPEC. ITEM 595.50
27 |Triple SSS Multi Surface Cleaning Wipes, 6 Tubs/cs., 5 Cases BENMAN INDUSTRIES SPEC. ITEM 138.42
28 |Triple SSS Turnaround Spray Buff Buff 12/1 Qt. NO SUBSTITUTION 5 Cases BENMAN INDUSTRIES SPEC. ITEM 178.48
29 {Twister Stone Care Grout Cleaner 4 gal./cs. NO SUBSTITUTION 10 Cases BENMAN INDUSTRIES SPEC. ITEM 546.40
30 [|vandalism Mark & Stain Remover Must have Green Seal or Eco Logo, 6-22 oz./cs. SAMPLE REQUIRED 4 cases NO BIDDERS

31 |wWD40 80 Oz. Cans - 12 Cans per case 4 cases C&CSJUA;\:;S:IAL LOWER PRICE 203.40

TOTAL ITEMS: 31




2 PROD p ATIO 0 AWARDED TO BASED O
0 »
B. BROOMS, MOPS AND BRUSHES
. PYRAMID SCHOOL

1 Angled Brooms Upright Flagged Polystyrene 50 Unit: LOWER PRICE 164.50
P geed Folysty nits PRODUCTS

2 |Brooms Rubbermaid Lobby Dust 40 Units PYRAMID SCHOOL LOWER PRICE 115.60
PRODUCTS

3 Eco wet mops New England Maintenance Depot, Equal or better NO SUBSTITUTION 95 Cases NEW ENGLAND LOWER PRICE 7,980.00

MAINTENANCE
4 Eco wet mops rough floor New England Maintenance Depot 12/cs NO SUBSTITUTION 55 Cases NEW ENGLAND LOWER PRICE 5,940.00
MAINTENANCE
. L
5 Flip Dust Mop System 34 Pieces C&C JANITORIA LOWER PRICE 4,656.30
SUPPLIES

6 Mop Bucket & Wringer, Marked "Wet Floor" on Casters Rubbermaid or Equal 30 Units BENMAN INDUSTRIES LOWER PRICE 1,023.20

7 Receptacle Liners #6140 Rubbermaid Waxed Paper 30 Cases W.B. MASON SPEC. ITEM 337.50

8 |Toilet Bowl Brushes Wood Handle 19' Length Sample Requested 50 Brushes PYRAMID SCHOOL LOWER PRICE 44.50
PRODUCTS

9 Washable Microfiber Dust Mops Nexstep #96078 60" x 5", 6/cs 10 Cases PYRAMID SCHOOL LOWER PRICE 357.60
PRODUCTS

10 |Washable Microfiber Dust Mops Nexstep #96076 48" x 5" 6 c/s 10 Cases PYRAMID SCHOOL LOWER PRICE 298.80
PRODUCTS

11 |{Washable Microfiber Dust Mops Nexstep #96074 48" x 5" 6 ¢/s 10 Cases PYRAMID SCHOOL LOWER PRICE 298.80
PRODUCTS

12 {Washable Microfiber Dust Mops Nexstep #96072 24" x 5" 6 c/s 10 Cases PYR:ngE:SOOL LOWER PRICE 238.80

TOTAL ITEMS: 12
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Q »
C. PAPER PRODUCTS

1 Facial Tissue, Green seal certified 100 tissues / bx, 30 boxes/case Equal or Better 7.9 x 7.1 in. SAMPLE REQUIRED 200 Cases W.B. MASON LOWER BID 2,138.00

2 Roll Towels, Advantage-Renature, Green seal certified |Ref # A1080, 8" x 350", 12 rolls per case, Equal or better SAMPLE REQUIRED 1600 Cases CENTRAL POLY SPEC. ITEM 19,584.00
3  [Toilet Tissue, North River, Green seal certified 2 ply Jumbo Rolls, 12/cs. Equal or better SAMPLE REQUIRED 1500 Cases K&S DISTRIBUTORS LOWER BID 19,065.00

TOTAL ITEMS: 3
Q
c PROD > ATIO O AWARDED TO BASED O BID PR
Q »
D. UTILY ITEMS
1 |3M 3600 Eraser Buff Pads 20in.or Eq. 50 Cases W.B. MASON LOWER BID 508.50
2 |3M 3600 Eraser Pads 27in.34x3 1/4x4 1/2 30 Cases NEW ENGLAND LOWER BID 780.00
MAINTENANCE
3 3M or Eq. Scrubbing Pads 20 in. Blue - 20 cs. 30 Cases W.B. MASON LOWER BID 305.10
4 3M Red Speed Pads 20in. or Eq. 50 Cases W.B. MASON LOWER BID 508.50
5 3M Scrubbing Sponges or Better, Scotch Brite, 6 1/4x3 1/2x5/8 75 Cases K&S DISTRIBUTORS LOWER BID 216.00
6 Bissell-Big Green, 10 Quart Backpack vacuum Model # 37491, with toolkit and attachments NO SUBSTITUTION 16 Units K&S DISTRIBUTORS LOWER BID 4,016.00
7 Cellulose Sponges 7 3/8x4x2x1/4 - Sample Required SAMPLE REQUIRED 2 Cases DUMOUCHEL PAPER LOWER BID 24.82
PYRAMID SCHOOL
8 |[Cloth Duct Tape 2" x 60 yds. Gray color, 3 inch core 5 LOWER BID 15.20
P y Y Rolls PRODUCTS ER

9  |Dust Cloths, 18 x 18, 200/cs. Yellow, Ft. Howard or Better - Sample Required 150 Cases K&S DISTRIBUTORS LOWER BID 3,564.00
10 |Emerald Hy-Pro Stripping Floor Pad MDS 20 in. STETCO NO SUBSTITUTION 100 Cases M.D. STETSON SPEC. ITEM 4,600.00
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D. UTILY ITEMS (CONTINUATION)
11  |Extension Cords 50 ft. 50 ft. - 14/3 Gauge 30 Units W.B. MASON LOWER BID 527.70
12 |Fort James 9" Jumbo Bath dispenser Bath Tissue Disp. #58250, Equal or Better 85 Units W.B. MASON LOWER BID 756.50
13 Irhlterplast Pitt Plastics Pe.rformance HD Liners, 30x36 |Heavy Strength, Sqo/pkg, No Box, Shrink Wrap Only, 20/25 rolls per NO SUBSTITUTION 1400 Cases CENTRAL POLY CORP. SPEC. ITEM 30,520.00
size, 20-30 gallons, 13 Microns case, Sample Required,ltem # HR20HHC
14 Ir.lterplast Pitt Plastics Performance HD Liners, 40x46 |[Extra Heavy, .250/pkg, No Box, Shrink Wrap Only, 10/25 rolls per case, NO SUBSTITUTION 1200 Cases M.D. STETSON SPEC. ITEM 26,340.00
size, 40-45 gallons, 15 Microns Sample Required, Item # HR40XHC
15 I?terplast Pitt Plast|cs. Performance HD Liners, 38x58 |Extra Heavy, .200 pkg, No Box, Shrink Wrap Only, 8/25 rolls per case, NO SUBSTITUTION 150 Cases M.D. STETSON SPEC. ITEM 3,165.00
size, 60 gallons, 15 Micron Sample Required, ltem # HR60XHK -Black Only
16 |M.D. Stetson HYDSP 4912 Wall Mount Dispenser, Equal or Better 12 Units NO BID NO BID
17 |Probe Back Pack vacuum bags Replacement Vacuum Bags, 10 bags/pack 10 Pkgs K&S DISTRIBUTORS LOWER BID 71.00
18 [Rubbermaid Brute Dolly 2640-43 Quiet dolly Ref # FG264043 Black 6 Units W.B. MASON LOWER BID 107.70
PYRAMID SCHOOL
i i LOWER BID 239.60
19 {Rubbermaid Lobby Dust Pan #2007 40 Units PRODUCTS
PYRAMID SCHOOL
i i i - [ LOWER BID 155.96
20 |Rubbermaid Recycling Container RCP #3536-06 Blue 4 Units PRODUCTS
21  [Rubbermaid Tilt Trucks 1/2 cubic yd. Measurements-56 3/4"L x 28"W x 38 5/8"H, Alternate #9717 1 Unit W.B. MASON LOWER BID 332.00
22 Rubbermaid Trolleys Ref #3551-88 Slim Jim 6 Units K&S DISTRIBUTORS LOWER BID 262.50
23 |Rubbermaid Wastebaskets 14 gt wastebasket, Ref. #2958 or Equal 40 Units W.B. MASON LOWER BID 131.20
C&C JANITORIAL
24 {Seco High Duster Extension Duster, or Equivalent 45 Units LOWER BID 247.50
SUPPLIES
25 |The Champ One Wipes Ref # 86884, Heavy DRC wipe, 3"x12" wiper, 225 wipes per box, 4 NO SUBSTITUTION 300 Cases W.B. MASON LOWER BID 13,275.00
boxes per case
PYRAMID SCHOOL
ici i i - LOWER BID 368.16
26 |The Magician Stain Removing from Quest Sponge, 24/cs. - 26 cs. 26 Cases PRODUCTS
27  (Triple SSS Back pack vacuum cleaner Speedster 1000H Commercial HEPA SKU# SSS 56009 NO SUBSTITUTION 3 Units BENMAN INDUSTRIES LOWER BID 1,050.00




SUPPLIES

e PROD p ATIO 0 AWARDED TO BASED O D PR
Q
D. UTILY ITEMS (CONTINUATION)

28 [Triple SSS Filter Bags Speedstar 1000, 10 Packs Per Case 10 Cases I-RIC CORP LOWER BID 211.30
29  |Triple SSS NexGen Microfiber Carpet Bonnets 21 inch, reversible 6 units per case, 12 Cases BENMAN INDUSTRIES LOWER BID 276.79
30 |Triple SSS NexGen Microfiber Cloths 16"x16" Cleaning Clothes Blue #89028 250/case 5 Cases BENMAN INDUSTRIES LOWER BID 117.22
31 [Triple SSS NexGen Microfiber Cloths 16"x16" Cleaning Clothes Green #89031 250/case 5 Cases BENMAN INDUSTRIES LOWER BID 117.22
32 [Triple SSS NexGen Microfiber Glove Detail Glove, White #89040 12/case 1 Case C&i:f:\::;g:ml' LOWER BID 2.75
33  [Triple SSS Nexgen Microfiber High Duster Sleeves Ref #89036/89037/89038 - 10 units per case 4 Cases NO BID NO BID

34 [Triple SSS NexGen Microfiber Mop Pads Looped End Dust Mop Pads, 24" Slant Slip Blue, 6 per case 10 Cases C&CSJUI:T;?:ML LOWER BID 909.00
35 |Unger Brute Scraper 4 inch blade 30 Units W.B. MASON LOWER BID 178.80
36 |Urinal Screens Deodorizer 100 Active Materials,to contain quats, 12 units per case 30 Cases W.B. MASON LOWER BID 245.70

TOTALITEMS: 36
s PROD p ATIO O . AWARDED TO BASED O D PR
Q
E. SAFETY EQUIPMENT

1 Cotton Boss Work Gloves Walloper Cotton Flannel SAMPLE REQUIRED 50 Pairs 1-RIC CORP. LOWER BID 16.92
2 Disposable Dust Masks North Safety Products Ref #7140N95, 50/bx. 10 Boxes BENMAN INDUSTRIES LOWER BID 27.50
3 [First Aid Kits , Indoor Emergency kit indoor for up to 25 people 3 Kits BENMAN INDUSTRIES LOWER BID 36.56
4 Neoprene Gloves Long Sleeve XL - Sample Required SAMPLE REQUIRED 20 Pairs C&CJANITORIAL LOWER BID 111.00




E. SAFETY EQUIPMENT (CONTINUATION)

A ARDED TO

C&C JANITORIAL

5 Rubbermaid Mobile Barrier Yell flexibl I 2 Uni LOWER BID 522.78
ellow, flexible panels Units SUPPLIES
6  |Rubbermaid Plastic Yellow #6112-Eng./Span., Wet Floor Signs 5 Units M.D. STETSON CO. LOWER BID 30.00
PYRAMID SCHOOL
7 Rubbermaid Site Safet Hanging Si Ref #9515 i LOWER BID 53.88
y anging Signs Re 6 Units PRODUCTS
8 Surgical Gloves 1000 Count, Latex gloves XL size 100 Cases APPCO PAPER SPEC. ITEM 1,999.00
9 Surgical Gloves 1000 Count, Vinyl, no powder XL size. 10 Cases W.B. MASON LOWER BID 186.90
10 |Unger Rubber Gloves, Window Washing Gloves Unger Gloves 8 pairs BENMAN INDUSTRIES SPEC. ITEM 22.16

TOTAL ITEMS:

10
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